

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	SRR	SUR	NOTES FROM LAST RACE	ASP	AVG	ASP	LAST FIVE										ERLY TOTL										COMMENTS													
									110	RX	SPD	R#	TDS	RT	S1	S2	SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	TDONE	TDTWO	TDCL0	P2F	P4F	PFN	SPEED	RATINGS	DSL	BRIS	P	CALL1		CALL2	MEDS	EQUIP	MLINE	CLS	TRK	DIS	CHNG	SPPNT	PWR	COMB	PACE	TOTL
11/3/17	DMR	1	7.0	3	3	LEADING	R>S	D>D	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 1-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH! Clear early.1st off 54 day layoff. Class 40 Finished 1 from post 1 TJW= 97	ERR	0	87	5	83	3	90	87	2.6	3.5	0.7	3.3	4.1	0.8	91	98	88	94,87,94,92,67	54	E	6	46.2	70.8	1	0	6.00	172	LRC	8.0	AO>N	20.0	133	104.9	189	277	Off rail str;held game/Vied;stalked;wkened/Speed;inside;cleared
			7.0	2	2	GOOD BYE	S>S	D>D	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 11-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH! Clear early. Class 50 Finished 1 from post 11 TJW= 101	89	1	94	10	94	10	93	85	2.1	2.2	1.0	2.1	2.2	1.0	97	102	89	96,94,103,98,97	29	E	8	21.9	44.4	1	0	8.00	186	PID	5.5	A>N	26.7	146	112.1	199	288	Steady urging/ Duel insd;drew off/ 2p; ridden out
			7.0	7	7	LOOSE ON	S>S	D>D	BTL horse. Class 0 Finished 5 from post 4 TJW= 72	92	1	93	10	91	5	85	90	3.9	3.8	1.0	5.4	4.1	1.3	92	94	97	96,93,102,92,94	28	E/P	4	23.1	45.9	1	0	3.50	213	KEE	6.0	G2>N	13.3	139	106.6	186	283	Shuffld trn;came again/4w upper; ran on/ 4-5w uppr; nailed
			7.0	6	6	MR. HINX	S>S	D>D	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 5-hole. Fast last race (17). Clear early. Class -5 Finished 2 from post 5 TJW= 77	96	3	90	10	96	5	95	91	3.6	3.3	1.1	2.7	2.4	1.1	94	104	102	107,98,97,86,86	27	E/P	5	22.1	45.1	1	0	3.00	208	SA	6.0	G1>N	16.7	143	108.0	198	300	Led btwn into lane/ Bid btwn;led;lost 3rd/ Drifted in str;held
			7.0	5	5	AMERICANIZ	S>S	D>D	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 2-hole.Uncharacteristic race? Clear early. Class 35 Finished 1 from post 2 TJW= 79	92	3	94	7	95	6	95	88	2.7	2.0	1.4	2.5	1.9	1.3	93	100	94	99,93,95,86,0	27	E/P	5	22.2	45.0	1	0	6.00	184	SA	6.5	AO>N	16.7	137	109.3	193	287	Fought back str;gameily/4wd into str;2nd best/Btwn;inside;held 2nd
			7.0	4	4	KOBE'S	S>S	D>D	Made big overall move (4). *Stretch gain (1.25). 1st off 69 day layoff. Class 0 Finished 6 from post 6 TJW= 58	96	7	97	10	97	10	83	94	9.4	4.5	2.1	9.4	4.5	2.1	73	78	113	96,93,94,94,93	69	S	0	24.3	46.7	1	0	8.00	230	DMR	7.0	G2>N	0.0	134	106.0	151	264	4wd into str;no rally/ Off bit slow;outkicked/4wd into str;gained 3d
			7.0	1	1	SILENT	S>S	D>D	Chased Pace.Uncharacteristic race? 1st off 69 day layoff. Class 0 Finished 3 from post 4 TJW= 75	98	5	97	8	97	7	90	90	6.2	2.4	2.6	6.3	2.5	2.5	83	91	105	99,94,101,102,98	69	P	2	23.1	45.9	1	BON	2.50	203	DMR	7.0	G2>N	6.7	140	110.5	174	279	Bobbled start;4wd str/3wd into str;no rally/4wd into lane;gameily

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	SRR	SUR	NOTES FROM LAST RACE	ASP	AVG	ASP	LAST FIVE											ERLY		TOTL	COMMENTS																					
									110	RX	SPD	R#	TDS	RT	S1	S2	SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	TDONE	TD TWO	TD CLO	P2F	P4F	PFN		SPEED	RATINGS	DSL	BRIS	P	CALL1	CALL2	MEDS	EQUIP	MLINE	CLS	TRK	DIS	CHNG	SPPNT	PWR	COMB	TOTL	PACE		
11/3/17	DMR	2	8.5	5	5	START	A	R>R T>T	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 9-hole. Slow last race (19). Class 10 Finished 10 from post 9 TJW= 41	85	6	85	10	85	6	95	74	2.4	4.5	0.5	2.3	3.8	0.6	100	107	38	66,93,89,85,96	20	E	8	45.8	71.4	1	0	15.00	184	SA	8.0	AO>A	17.4	119	98.3	207	245	Dueld 3wd;weakened/ Inside duel;wkend late/ Speed;inside;held game		
			8.5	8	8	ALL STAR		S>R D>T	Class 30 Finished 4 from post 1 TJW= 44	84	1	84	10	84	1	85	80	3.0	4.1	0.7	2.0	2.0	1.0	93	94	76	78,82,86,84,80	27	E/P	6	23.9	46.6	1	0	20.00	163	FNO	6.0	A>A	13.0	118	100.5	187	263	Saved ground; no rally/ Bid 3wd 1/2;4wd;wkened/ Bid;led 1/4;cleared		
			8.5	3	3	RECORD		R>R T>T	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 6-hole. Class 10 Finished 8 from post 6 TJW= 47	86	7	84	10	86	7	96	86	3.3	4.5	0.7	2.7	4.8	0.6	100	108	61	82,84,86,93,86	20	E	7	45.7	70.7	1	0	8.00	199	SA	8.0	AO>A	15.2	126	99.9	208	269	Bit washy;btwn;wkened/ Inside;lost 3rd late/ Waited 1/4;split 1/8		
			8.5	7	7	SOUTH		R>R T>T	Chased Pace. Made a big move early (4.87).Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH! Class 60 Finished 1 from post 5 TJW= 50	76	5	74	9	76	5	92	93	4.1	5.3	0.8	3.1	5.0	0.6	77	85	79	82,73,81,77,71	29	E/P	5	45.7	69.9	1	0	12.00	151	SA	8.0	C>A	10.9	118	98.3	162	241	Stalked;bid;gamely/ Bid 3w;rallied;driving/ Stalked btwn;no bid		
			8.5	1	1	MALIBU		R>R T>T	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 5-hole. Made big overall move (3). Class 35 Finished 1 from post 5 TJW= 42	82	3	75	6	82	3	81	105	5.4	4.8	1.1	3.6	2.1	1.7	79	69	98	82,81,82,63,81	14	E/P	4	48.0	72.1	1	0	12.00	166	SA	9.0	S>A	8.7	126	103.8	148	246	Btwn;inside;gamely/ 3wd into str;willingly/ Inside; caught wire		
			8.5	12	12	IRON ALEX		R>R T>T	Made big overall move (4). *Stretch gain (.25). Class 60 Finished 4 from post 5 TJW= 63	77	2	77	4	77	2	86	95	7.2	6.1	1.2	7.6	6.7	1.1	86	84	83	81,69,73,83,0	25	S	2	47.5	71.4	1	0	30.00	153	SA	8.0	C>A	4.3	111	93.5	170	253	Saved ground;outkicked/ Tight into str;no bid/ Squeezed after start		
			8.5	2	2	FRITZ		R>R T>T	Made big overall move (5). Made a big move early (4.75).BTL horse. Class 10 Finished 5 from post 5 TJW= 63	90	7	89	10	90	8	91	97	5.4	4.0	1.4	4.8	3.6	1.3	75	87	83	89,84,86,85,89	20	P	1	46.7	70.5	1	0	5.00	187	SA	8.0	AO>A	2.2	133	106.1	162	245	Off bit slow;outkicked/ Bobbled start;up 2nd/ Lost whip 1/16;willing		
			8.5	4	4	TEMPLE		R>R T>T	*Pressed Pace from 2-hole. Slow last race (89).Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH! 1st off 161 day layoff. Class 10 Finished 0 from post 2 TJW= 68	89	8	89	9	89	9	96	89	6.6	3.9	1.7	6.6	3.9	1.7				0,83,91,99,96	161	S	0	45.3	69.5	1	0	8.00	198	SA	8.0	AO>A	0.0	141	96.0	0	0	0	0	Pulled up; walked off/ 3wd 2nd turn;edged 3rd/ Came out str;edged 3rd
			8.5	6	6	SOGLIO		R>R T>T	Chased Pace. Made big overall move (4). *Stretch gain (1).BTL horse. Class 45 Finished 2 from post 1 TJW= 133	81	9	81	10	81	9	90	96	6.7	3.9	1.7	6.3	3.6	1.8	81	89	84	86,75,84,79,80	14	S	2	46.7	70.7	1	0	4.50	185	BEL	8.0	C>A	4.3	145	103.7	170	254	To 5p str away; closed/ Bum after st;3w turns/ Altered in; split late		
			8.5	11	11	RITZY A.		R>R T>T	Made big overall move (4). *Stretch gain (2.94).BTL horse. 2 races in one pattern. Class 12 Finished 2 from post 1 TJW= 60	87	7	87	9	87	7	93	96	7.1	3.8	1.9	7.2	4.2	1.7	83	85	82	85,88,94,84,84	12	S	0	46.7	70.1	1	0	3.50	194	SA	8.0	AO>A	0.0	137	104.9	168	250	5wd into str;rallied/ 4wd into str;rallied/ Chased; no rally		
			8.5	9	9	CHEEKABOOM		S>R T>T	Made big overall move (5). *Stretch gain (3.25). Class 10 Finished 4 from post 8 TJW= 74	78	4	80	9	78	4	90	61	7.5	4.0	1.9	7.9	5.3	1.5	79	81	96	85,88,85,84,85	29	P	0	23.5	44.9	1	0	5.00	180	SA	6.5	A>A	0.0	138	111.0	160	256	4wd into str;edged 3rd/ Came out 1/8;up late/ Off bit slow;rallied		
			8.5	10	10	LAZZAM		R>R D>T	1st off 42 day layoff. Class 50 Finished 3 from post 2 TJW= 57	85	6	87	7	85	6	84	95	7.8	3.3	2.4	7.9	3.1	2.5	77	85	101	94,88,86,84,80	42	S	0	48.2	72.0	1	0	15.00	148	LRC	8.0	R>A	0.0	131	104.0	162	263	4wd into str;held 3rd/ 3wd into str;rallied/ 5wd into str;rallied		

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	SRR	SUR	NOTES FROM LAST RACE	ASP	AVG	ASP	LAST FIVE										ERLY		TOTL	PACE		COMMENTS																		
									110	RX	SPD	R#	TDS	RT	S1	S2	SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	TDONE	TDTWO	TDCL0	P2F	P4F	PFN	SPEED		RATINGS	DSL	R	P	CALL1	CALL2	MEDS	EQUIP	MLINE	CLS	TRK	DIS	CHNG	SPPNT	PWR	COMB	TOTL	LAST
11/3/17	DMR	3	7.0	1	1	PRIME	S>S	D>D	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 8-hole.BTL horse. Clear early. Class -25 Finished 3 from post 8 TJW= 57	96	4	89	10	91	7	91	79	1.9	4.1	0.5	1.9	3.2	0.6	103	106	75	87,94,87,94,102	27	E	8	22.9	45.4	1	0	4.50	185	FNO	6.0	N>A	22.9	135	104.2	209	284	Bmpd 3/16s;brshd late/ Speed;inside;held 2nd/ Inside; lost 3rd late
			7.0	3	3	DONWORTH	R>S	D>D	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 6-hole. Slow last race (12). 1st off 34 day layoff. Class -30 Finished 7 from post 6 TJW= 54	ERR	0	94	10	ERR	0	89	67	3.6	5.4	0.7	ERR	ERR	ERR	92	107	51	82,72,101,93,95	34	E	1	47.2	73.2	1	BOFF	6.00	225	SA	9.0	G1>A	2.9	138	98.1	199	250	Bid btwn;rail str;wknd/ Angled in; gave way/ Stalked;bid;2nd best
			7.0	11	11	SIR SAMSON	S>S	D>D	*Stretch gain (1). Class 10 Finished 3 from post 4 TJW= 60	91	3	86	10	89	7	90	87	3.5	4.8	0.7	3.4	4.8	0.7	84	90	93	89,95,96,86,88	27	E	5	23.2	46.3	1	0	8.00	183	SA	6.5	A0>A	14.3	128	105.0	174	267	Off rail;edged foe 3rd/ 4wd duel;cleared/ Broke out;bump;2d best
			7.0	9	9	CHIEF OF	S>S	D>D	Slow last race (12). Class -25 Finished 7 from post 7 TJW= 45	92	1	89	10	91	5	86	79	4.5	5.7	0.8	5.8	5.2	1.1	94	96	73	77,81,92,95,99	27	E/P	1	23.9	46.3	1	0	20.00	215	FNO	6.0	N>A	2.9	127	100.8	190	263	3-4wide; no rally/ Chased3w; weakened/ Bmp st;4w;move;fade
			7.0	7	7	NEW KARMA	S>S	T>D	Made big overall move (3). Class 45 Finished 5 from post 2 TJW= 74	83	3	85	10	85	9	92	60	5.1	5.6	0.9	4.9	5.7	0.9	85	89	87	84,90,86,76,84	25	E/P	2	22.5	44.6	1	0	8.00	167	SA	6.5	C>A	5.7	127	110.2	174	261	Came out str;edged 3rd/ 4wd;bid 3wd;gamely/ Vied;stalked;edged 2nd
			7.0	4	4	BOY HOWDY	R>S	D>D	1st off 138 day layoff. Class 10 Finished 9 from post 3 TJW= 64	86	2	86	8	88	6	80	78	4.9	5.2	0.9	4.8	3.9	1.2	82	80	75	77,84,93,94,80	138	E/P	3	48.7	73.1	0	0	20.00	193	SA	8.0	A0>A	8.6	123	99.0	162	237	Stdied 4-1/2-1/2;wkend/ Chased 3wd;no rally/ Dueld 3wd;led;gamely
			7.0	2	2	CITY OF	S>S	D>D	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 5-hole. Class 10 Finished 2 from post 5 TJW= 57	97	1	96	3	96	3	96	87	2.2	2.2	1.0	2.2	2.2	1.0	90	101	92	97,105,85,0,0	27	E/P	5	22.2	44.9	1	0	3.50	174	SA	6.5	A0>A	14.3	137	107.3	191	283	3wd bid;led;outkicked/ Drifted in str;handily/ 4wd into str;bid rail
			7.0	12	12	MESA SKY	S>S	D>D	Class 10 Finished 5 from post 1 TJW= 79	79	2	82	7	84	5	92	78	4.9	4.7	1.0	6.4	4.8	1.3	89	93	75	78,92,80,99,89	12	S	3	22.8	46.5	1	0	8.00	181	SA	6.5	A0>A	8.6	128	103.7	182	257	Came out str;wkened/ Bid 3wd 1/4;led;clear/ Off bit slow;wkened
			7.0	8	8	PROUD	S>S	D>D	Flashed speed. 1st off 300 day layoff. Class 26 Finished 3 from post 1 TJW= 28	76	2	71	10	75	8	93	79	5.6	5.1	1.1	5.3	4.0	1.3	91	95	73	77,76,75,61,88	300	E/P	4	22.6	45.1	1	0	20.00	139	SUN	6.0	A>A	11.4	111	103.1	186	259	Came out; midly/ Dueld; prevailed/ 5-w; no match;2nd best
			7.0	5	5	MIDNIGHT	S>S	D>D	Made big overall move (4). *Stretch gain (1.5). 1st off 60 day layoff. Class 5 Finished 3 from post 3 TJW= 47	90	5	87	9	89	6	89	87	5.3	4.7	1.1	6.1	3.3	1.8	86	91	96	93,82,82,90,89	60	P	0	23.3	45.6	1	0	8.00	201	DMR	7.0	A0>A	0.0	128	102.7	177	273	5wd into str;up 3rd/ 3wd into str;edged 3rd/ Stalked inside;wkened
			7.0	6	6	CAMINO DE	R>S	D>D	*Stretch gain (4.25). Z pattern. Class 10 Finished 9 from post 4 TJW= 69	72	1	83	9	78	3	82	88	6.0	4.3	1.4	8.1	4.6	1.8	77	79	88	84,89,91,89,92	20	S	1	49.3	74.5	1	BON	20.00	168	SA	8.5	A0>A	2.9	127	97.6	156	244	3wd into str;wkened/ 4wd into str;rallied/ Came out str;gained 2d
			7.0	10	10	DABSTER	R>S	D>D	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 2-hole. Clear early.1st off 291 day layoff. Class 37 Finished 1 from post 2 TJW= 94	85	1	89	2	85	1	86	90	1.9	1.0	1.9	2.7	0.9	3.0	94	96	90	93,85,0,0,0	291	E/P	2	47.3	72.8	1	0	6.00	163	SA	8.0	S>A	5.7	130	103.1	190	280	Game btwn foes late/ Drifted out late;held/

#10 paid \$11.40

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	SRR	SUR	NOTES FROM LAST RACE	ASP	AVG	ASP	LAST FIVE										ERLY		TOTL	PACE		COMMENTS																		
									110	RX	SPD	R#	TDS	RT	S1	S2	SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	TDONE	TDTWO	TDCL0	P2F	P4F	PFN	SPEED		RATINGS	DSL	R	P	CALL1	CALL2	MEDS	EQUIP	MLINE	CLS	TRK	DIS	CHNG	SPPNT	PWR	COMB	TOTL	LAST
11/3/17	DMR	4	7.0	4	4	SHOW IT N	S>S	D>D	Flashed speed. Class 14 Finished 4 from post 3 TJW= 44	ERR	0	82	6	82	6	94	74	1.4	3.2	0.4	1.4	3.2	0.4	103	104	71	82,78,86,90,83	19	E/P	7	21.8	45.5	1	0	5.00	189	SA	6.0	N>N	20.0	130	102.4	207	278	Dueld btwn;weakened/ Btwn;inside;wkened/ 3wd into str;gamely
			7.0	5	5	SHARONA	S>S	D>D	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 3-hole. Clear early. Class 35 Finished 2 from post 3 TJW= 43	ERR	0	73	5	73	5	94	74	1.9	3.5	0.5	1.9	3.5	0.5	99	102	67	78,77,70,78,63	26	E	8	22.0	45.8	1	0	20.00	174	SA	6.0	A0>N	22.9	123	99.2	201	268	Dueld;clear;held 2nd/ Bit off rail;held/ Dueld btwn;edged 2nd
			7.0	3	3	ISMELUCKY	S>S	D>D	Chased Pace. Made big overall move (4). 1st off 48 day layoff. Class 0 Finished 1 from post 1 TJW= 77	86	1	83	3	83	3	89	81	1.6	1.6	1.0	1.6	1.6	1.0	92	95	82	86,82,80,0,0	48	P	3	22.1	45.7	1	0	2.50	181	LRC	6.5	N>N	8.6	131	106.8	187	269	Off bit slow;up late/ Bit off rail str;clear/ Off bit slow;3wd lane
			7.0	8	8	SPICED	S>S	D>D	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 4-hole. Clear early.1st off 65 day layoff. Class 0 Finished 1 from post 4 TJW= 59	ERR	0	81	4	81	4	92	81	2.7	2.3	1.2	2.7	2.3	1.2	99	104	82	91,79,77,76,0	65	E/P	6	22.0	45.6	1	0	5.00	177	DMR	6.0	N>N	17.1	130	106.9	203	285	3wd;2wd;clear rail str/ 3wd bid;led;held game/ 5wd;4wd;drift in str
			7.0	7	7	SMILING	S>S	D>D	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 9-hole. Fast last race (14).Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH! Clear early. Class 60 Finished 1 from post 9 TJW= 52	ERR	0	70	4	70	4	93	83	4.5	3.7	1.2	4.5	3.7	1.2	96	96	80	84,70,61,66,0	29	E/P	3	22.0	46.0	1	0	6.00	164	SA	6.0	S>N	8.6	124	101.9	192	272	Bid;led 1/4;cleared/ Broke out;bumped/ Came out str;no bid
			7.0	2	2	MAMA'S KID	S>S	D>D	Class 35 Finished 7 from post 2 TJW= 28	ERR	0	63	5	63	5	90	66	5.5	4.5	1.2	5.5	4.5	1.2	92	93	51	56,69,51,88,53	26	E	3	23.0	47.4	1	0	20.00	175	SA	6.0	A0>N	8.6	117	91.4	185	236	Bobbled bit start;rail/ 3wd to turn;rail lane/ Saved ground; weakened
			7.0	9	9	FAMILY	S>S	D>D	Class 35 Finished 6 from post 7 TJW= 77	ERR	0	77	4	77	4	90	73	5.9	4.8	1.2	5.9	4.8	1.2	94	94	64	68,88,75,76,0	26	E/P	2	22.9	47.0	1	BOFF	10.00	196	SA	6.0	A0>N	5.7	128	96.7	188	252	4wd into str;no rally/ Bobbled start;3wd str/ 4wd;3wd;no bid
			7.0	1	1	ONE FAST	R>S	T>D	Chased Pace. Made big overall move (4).BTL horse. Class 0 Finished 4 from post 10 TJW= 47	ERR	0	78	3	67	1	88	92	3.2	2.3	1.4	4.0	2.0	2.0	87	90	81	84,82,67,0,0	25	S	0	46.6	70.8	1	0	3.50	203	SA	8.0	N>N	0.0	128	104.8	177	258	4wd into str;bid btwn/ 5wd;4wd;rallied/ Off slow;4wd bid;game
			7.0	6	6	PULPIT	S>S	D>D	Flashed speed. Made big overall move (3). Class 35 Finished 1 from post 5 TJW= 51	ERR	0	77	3	77	3	90	81	6.5	2.7	2.4	6.5	2.7	2.4	94	94	80	81,84,67,0,0	26	P	3	22.8	46.4	1	0	6.00	173	SA	6.0	A0>N	8.6	127	103.2	188	268	3wd into str;rallied/ Bid 3wd;drift in lane/ Saved ground; no rally

#1 paid \$10.40. Pick 3 paid \$278

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	SRR	SUR	NOTES FROM LAST RACE	ASP	AVG	ASP	LAST FIVE					ERLY TOTL										COMMENTS																	
									110	RX	SPD	R#	TDS	RT	S1	S2	SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	TDONE	TDTWO	TDCL0	P2F	P4F	PFN	SPEED RATINGS		DSL	BRIS	P	CALL1	CALL2	MEDS	EQUIP	MLINE	CLS	TRK	DIS	CHNG	SPPNT	PWR	COMB	TOTL	PACE
11/3/17	DMR	5	14.0	2	2	INFOBEDAD	R>R D>D	1st off 40 day layoff. Class 35 Finished 5 from post 3 TJW= 52	ERR	0	87	10	86	7	89	86	3.5	6.3	0.6	5.1	5.7	0.9	84	91	85	90,91,86,77,89	40	E/P	5	47.1	71.6	1	BOFF	12.00	191	LRC	8.0	AO>G2	18.5	130	101.2	175	260	Btwn;rail;no response/ Inside;dueled;edged 3d/ Inside;2wd wire 3rd
		14.0	5	5		NOBLE NICK	R>R D>D	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 6-hole. 1st off 60 day layoff. Class 55 Finished 1 from post 6 TJW= 77	ERR	0	86	10	86	7	61	11	3.2	5.3	0.6	3.6	4.2	0.9	82	91	67	88,92,89,89,81	60	E/P	7	52.5	108.1	1	0	12.00	163	FER	13.0	N>G2	25.9	134	97.1	173	240	Stalked;bid 1/4;cleard/ Bid btwn 1/2;held 3rd/ Stlkd 3path; evenly
		14.0	3	3		DESTIN	R>R D>D	Class -5 Finished 5 from post 6 TJW= 87	ERR	0	96	10	96	10	80	46	3.5	3.7	0.9	3.5	3.7	0.9	83	86	73	92,97,96,91,99	27	E	5	48.6	73.6	1	0	5.00	223	BEL	10.0	G1>G2	18.5	145	101.8	169	242	Stumble st;most4w trns/ 3w 1st turn; gamely/ 3w run 7/16-1/4;flat
		14.0	1	1		ARCHANOVA	R>R D>D	Chased Pace.BTL horse. 1st off 33 day layoff. Class 0 Finished 3 from post 4 TJW= 54	108	1	91	10	93	8	51	1	5.0	5.0	1.0	3.7	4.2	0.9	79	84	86	99,108,86,86,97	33	E/P	5	49.7	99.8	1	0	4.00	199	BEL	13.0	N>G2	18.5	138	102.4	163	249	4w trip;bid 1/4-1/8p/ Inside turns;kept on/ Ran evenly throughout
		14.0	7	7		HARD ACES	R>R D>D	*Stretch gain (.75). 1st off 76 day layoff. Class -5 Finished 5 from post 4 TJW= 55	98	1	94	10	94	10	73	44	6.3	5.3	1.2	6.3	5.3	1.2	76	77	91	98,98,97,92,83	76	S	2	49.4	73.5	1	0	2.50	228	DMR	10.0	G1>G2	7.4	140	100.9	153	244	3wd into str;no rally/ 3wd bid;bump str;game/ 3wd into str;late 3rd
		14.0	8	8		DRESSED IN	R>R T>D	*Stretch gain (.5). 1st off 33 day layoff.2 races in one pattern. Class 0 Finished 8 from post 5 TJW= 29	ERR	0	82	10	93	1	75	46	7.6	6.1	1.2	10.0	8.0	1.3	69	68	90	88,93,8,88,99	33	P	0	49.4	73.9	1	0	8.00	220	SA	10.0	G2>G2	0.0	131	96.8	137	227	3wd into str;no rally/ Bobbled;steadied start/ 5wd str;gave way;eased
		14.0	4	4		ESTRECHADA	R>R T>D	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 6-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH! 1st off 62 day layoff. Class 6 Finished 4 from post 6 TJW= 66	67	1	89	7	78	2	57	-4	7.2	5.0	1.4	10.0	8.2	1.2	74	63	87	91,102,93,85,88	62	S	3	51.3	77.5	1	0	3.00	223	SAR	11.0	G3>G2	11.1	140	102.3	137	224	2-3w turns;chsd;wknd/ Tkn up 1st trn;rallied/ Ins;idle traffc fin1/8
		14.0	6	6		GROUND	R>R D>D	Made big overall move (7). *Stretch gain (8). Big late move (8). Very strong move! Take note! Class 35 Finished 4 from post 8 TJW= 70	ERR	0	87	9	87	9	77	98	8.4	4.7	1.8	8.4	4.7	1.8	61	61	109	90,82,94,87,85	20	S	0	50.4	74.3	1	0	8.00	167	SA	8.5	AO>G2	0.0	127	101.6	122	231	5wd into str;edged 3rd/ Inside;along for 3rd/ Off bit slow;4wd move

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	SRR	SUR	NOTES FROM LAST RACE	ASP	AVG	ASP	LAST FIVE					ERLY TOTL										COMMENTS																		
									110	RX	SPD	R#	TDS	RT	S1	S2	SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	TDONE	TDTWO	TDCL0	P2F	P4F	PFN	SPEED RATINGS		DSL	BRIS	P	CALL1	CALL2	MEDS	EQUIP	MLINE	CLS	TRK	DIS	CHNG	SPPNT	PWR	COMB	TOTL	PACE	PACE
11/3/17	DMR	6	8.0	2	2	HAPPILY	S>R T>T	1st off 33 day layoff. Class -1 Finished 1 from post 0 TJW= 9	ERR	0	ERR	0	ERR	0	57	-9	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	0,0,0,0,0	33	NA	0	0.0	0.0	FTL	0	4.50	ERR	CHY	8.0	G1>G1	0.0	92.3	0	0	/	/
		8.0	3	3		NOW YOU'RE	S>R T>T	1st off 34 day layoff. Class 0 Finished 4 from post 0 TJW= 0	ERR	0	ERR	0	ERR	0	57	42	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	0,0,0,0,0	34	NA	0	0.0	0.0	FTL	0	30.00	NKT	6.0	G1>G1	0.0	90.6	0	0	/	/	
		8.0	4	4		MADELINE	S>R T>T	1st off 34 day layoff. Class 0 Finished 3 from post 0 TJW= 0	ERR	0	ERR	0	ERR	0	57	42	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	0,0,0,0,0	34	NA	0	0.0	0.0	0	0	20.00	NKT	6.0	G1>G1	0.0	91.7	0	0	/	/	
		8.0	16	16		GOODTHINGS	S>R T>T	1st off 54 day layoff. Class 14 Finished 6 from post 0 TJW= 38	ERR	0	ERR	0	ERR	0	57	-9	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	0,0,0,0,0	54	NA	0	0.0	0.0	0	0	30.00	CGH	6.3	A>G1	0.0	86.8	0	0	/	/	
		8.0	13	13		JULIET	S>R T>T	1st off 35 day layoff. Class 5 Finished 1 from post 0 TJW= 13	ERR	0	ERR	0	ERR	0	57	42	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	0,0,0,0,0	35	NA	0	0.0	0.0	0	0	12.00	NKT	7.0	G2>G1	0.0	90.0	0	0	/	/	
		8.0	10	10		SEPTEMBER	R>R T>T	BTL horse. Class 0 Finished 2 from post 0 TJW= 29	ERR	0	ERR	0	ERR	0	57	42	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	0,0,0,0,0	21	NA	0	0.0	0.0	FTL	0	6.00	NKT	8.0	G1>G1	0.0	93.1	0	0	/	/	
		8.0	5	5		ULTIMA D	S>R T>T	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 9-hole. Clear early.1st off 58 day layoff. Class 5 Finished 1 from post 9 TJW= 79	ERR	0	78	4	ERR	0	77	81	1.2	2.9	0.4	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	0,0,0,0,0	58	E/P	8	25.8	51.1	1	0	12.00	183	KD	7.0	N>G1	24.2	144	98.0	198	271	3path turn; drew clear/ Hustled st; repelled/ 3-4w;determinedly
		8.0	12	12		DIXIE MOON	R>R T>T	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 3-hole. Clear early. Class 4 Finished 1 from post 3 TJW= 107	81	2	84	3	81	2	91	92	1.4	1.4	1.0	1.0	1.4	0.7	83	78	69	78,84,89,0,0	26	E/P	8	48.4	72.0	1	0	20.00	205	WO	8.5	N>G1	24.2	147	104.2	161	230	Shook clear str; held/ Set pace; held place/ Lugged in str;drv clr	
		8.0	6	6		ORBOLUTION	R>R T>T	1st off 33 day layoff. Class 10 Finished 3 from post 6 TJW= 87	83	3	78	5	83	3	75	106	3.9	2.9	1.3	4.2	1.9	2.2	78	79	94	87,79,82,69,72	33	P	4	49.8	73.8	1	0	20.00	193	BEL	8.5	G3>G1	12.1	153	106.2	157	251	Bumped st; out paced/ Bmpd early;inside trip/ To 2p 3/16; edged clr	
		8.0	1	1		BEST	R>R T>T	Made big overall move (6). 1st off 33 day layoff. Class 10 Finished 2 from post 8 TJW= 79	88	1	84	5	88	1	74	66	6.7	2.1	3.2	6.7	2.2	3.0	77	74	98	88,83,85,81,82	33	S	3	50.0	73.8	FTL	0	12.00	212	BEL	8.5	G3>G1	9.1	150	105.8	151	249	6w uppr; good energy/ 4pth trn; altered ins/ Ins;to 4p5/16;no match	
		8.0	14	14		MOON DASH	R>R T>T	Made big overall move (7). *Stretch gain (1.44).BTL horse. Class 5 Finished 2 from post 5 TJW= 75	87	1	81	2	87	1	86	96	4.8	1.4	3.4	6.7	1.7	3.9	88	89	89	87,75,0,0,0	25	E/P	4	47.0	71.0	1	0	15.00	184	SA	8.0	N>G1	12.1	141	107.9	177	266	6wd into str;gamely/ Stalked; bid; driving/	
		8.0	15	15		RETRO	R>R T>T	Made big overall move (4). *Stretch gain (2.5).BTL horse. Class 5 Finished 3 from post 4 TJW= 73	83	2	83	2	83	2	85	96	6.8	1.8	3.8	6.8	1.8	3.8	90	92	88	85,81,0,0,0	25	P	2	47.2	71.5	1	0	20.00	194	SA	8.0	N>G1	6.1	139	107.4	182	270	3wd into str;up 3rd/ 3wd into str;bid;up/	
		8.0	8	8		SIGNIFICAN	R>R T>T	Chased Pace. 1st off 33 day layoff. Class 10 Finished 1 from post 7 TJW= 94	85	2	85	2	85	2	76	66	4.4	1.1	4.0	4.4	1.1	4.0	82	82	96	89,80,0,0,0	33	P	4	49.6	73.7	1	0	8.00	196	BEL	8.5	G3>G1	12.1	152	107.8	164	260	4w upper; good kick/ Shut off foe7/8;clippd/	
		8.0	7	7		CAPLA	R>R T>T	Chased Pace. Made big overall move (6). Made a big move early (3.75). 1st off 47 day layoff.2 races in one pattern. Class 0 Finished 1 from post 7 TJW= 62	85	1	85	1	85	1	79	62	5.6	1.1	5.1	5.6	1.1	5.1	81	77	92	85,0,0,0,0	47	S	0	47.9	72.8	FTL	0	6.00	226	WO	8.0	G1>G1	0.0	145	107.0	158	250	Bmp st;found room 1/8/ /	
		8.0	9	9		FATALE	R>R T>T	Made big overall move (9). Class 5 Finished 1 from post 11 TJW= 70	87	1	87	1	87	1	87	96	5.0	0.8	6.3	5.0	0.8	6.3	86	89	88	87,0,0,0,0	25	S	0	46.9	71.0	1	0	15.00	221	SA	8.0	N>G1	0.0	148	107.4	175	263	Off slow;5wd into lane/ /	
		8.0	11	11		RUSHING	R>R T>T	Made big overall move (11). Made a big move early (3). Middle move (5.87). Very strong move! Take note! Class 10 Finished 1 from post 2 TJW= 91	89	2	89	2	89	2	73	101	6.2	0.8	7.8	6.2	0.8	7.8	84	84	91	91,87,0,0,0	23	S	0	50.0	74.5	1	0	3.50	194	KEE	8.5	G3>G1	0.0	159	104.8	168	259	Rolling;came in;cleard/ 5-6w upper; good kick/	

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	SRR	SUR	NOTES FROM LAST RACE	ASP 110	RX	AVG SPD	R#	ASP TDS	RT	S1	S2	SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	TDONE	TDTWO	TDCL0	P2F	P4F	PFN	LAST FIVE SPEED RATINGS					DSL	R	P	CALL1	CALL2	MEDS	EQUIP	MLINE	CLS	TRK	DIS	CHNG	SPPNT	PWR	COMB	ERLY TOTL PACE PACE		COMMENTS
																										100	90	80	70	60																TOTL	LAST	
11/3/17	DMR	7	8.0	7 7	CUPID	R>R	D>D	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 7-hole.BTL horse. 1st off 34 day layoff. Class 0 Finished 4 from post 7 TJW= 97	96	5	95	10	95	10	88	83	2.1	3.6	0.6	2.1	3.6	0.6	90	104	84	100,98,104,85,95	34	E/P	5	47.3	71.7	1	0	8.00	219	SA	9.0	G1>G1	9.4	149	108.8	194	278	Bid 3wd;btwn;lost 3rd/ Bumped start;3wd bid/ Led 3wd;ducked in 1/8				
			8.0	4 4	GATO DEL	R>R	D>D	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 6-hole. Clear early.1st off 40 day layoff. Class 12 Finished 3 from post 6 TJW= 75	96	2	93	5	95	3	79	81	1.7	2.9	0.6	1.7	2.5	0.7	84	89	86	93,91,100,97,83	40	E/P	8	47.5	71.5	1	BOFF	30.00	194	RP	9.0	G3>G1	15.1	139	106.3	173	259	Duel inside; faltered/ Vied;led 5/16;2nd best/ Stalked;bid;led;held				
			8.0	3 3	SHARP	R>R	D>D	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 5-hole. Clear early.1st off 41 day layoff. Class 5 Finished 1 from post 5 TJW= 104	106	6	105	9	106	6	89	91	1.5	1.8	0.8	1.5	1.5	1.0	88	95	102	106,109,107,0,113	41	E	8	46.5	70.2	1	0	4.50	225	BEL	8.0	G2>G1	15.1	153	114.8	183	285	In hand 2p; drew clear/ Drew off; ridden out/ 3w; vied with winner				
			8.0	9 9	BATTLE OF	R>R	D>D	Chased Pace. Made big overall move (3). 1st off 40 day layoff. Class 12 Finished 2 from post 3 TJW= 73	97	3	94	9	95	7	78	86	2.4	2.6	0.9	2.0	2.4	0.8	81	83	95	96,99,89,100,92	40	E/P	5	47.8	71.5	1	0	10.00	214	RP	9.0	G3>G1	9.4	143	107.8	164	259	In tight; 3w; led;hung/ Bid 3wd;led 1/4;clear/ Hesitated; steadied st				
			8.0	1 1	IRON FIST	R>R	D>D	Flashed speed. Made big overall move (3). 1st off 40 day layoff. Class 5 Finished 1 from post 2 TJW= 71	97	4	98	10	99	9	79	88	3.9	3.0	1.3	3.9	3.1	1.3	79	86	98	100,95,107,96,98	40	E/P	4	48.2	70.8	1	0	12.00	222	RP	9.0	N>G1	7.5	143	112.3	165	263	Stalked;widest 1/4;clr/ Fins strong for place/ Stalked; responded				
			8.0	2 2	GIANT	S>R	D>D	Class 0 Finished 5 from post 2 TJW= 63	91	5	94	10	91	5	92	84	3.8	2.8	1.4	3.4	3.0	1.1	90	98	87	91,105,99,98,99	27	E/P	5	22.6	46.0	1	0	12.00	185	SA	6.0	G1>G1	9.4	141	109.3	188	275	Fractious gate;wkened/ 6wd 3/8;4wd into str/ 3wd;4wd;willingly				
			8.0	8 8	ACCELERATE	R>R	D>D	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 3-hole.Uncharacteristic race? 1st off 76 day layoff. Class 0 Finished 3 from post 3 TJW= 60	101	8	100	10	100	10	83	44	4.3	3.0	1.4	4.3	3.0	1.4	87	92	85	105,111,93,103,100	76	E/P	6	47.4	71.6	1	0	3.50	218	DMR	10.0	G1>G1	11.3	152	111.5	179	264	Pressed pace;best rest/ Inside;clear;driving/ Chased; edged foe 3rd				
			8.0	6 6	MOR SPIRIT	R>R	D>D	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 9-hole. Fast last race (14).Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH! Clear early.1st off 146 day layoff. Class 0 Finished 1 from post 9 TJW= 97	103	7	100	10	101	9	94	96	4.5	2.8	1.6	4.2	2.7	1.6	93	107	105	114,107,103,101,98	146	E/P	8	46.1	70.1	1	0	3.00	227	BEL	8.0	G1>G1	15.1	157	116.4	200	305	Vie 4w;drive at 3/16p1/ Ins-2p1st;2p2nd;drwoff/ Pressed; drove clear				
			8.0	10 10	PRACTICAL	S>R	D>D	Made big overall move (6). 1st off 69 day layoff. Class 2 Finished 1 from post 1 TJW= 85	98	4	96	10	97	7	85	91	4.6	2.2	2.1	4.4	2.6	1.7	85	97	102	101,98,102,90,99	69	P	2	23.4	45.1	1	0	6.00	222	SAR	7.0	G1>G1	3.8	145	111.6	182	284	Ins trn;2p3/16;rallied/ Bumped st; waited 1/4/ Rated 2p; edged clear				
			8.0	5 5	AWESOME	R>R	D>D	Chased Pace. Made big overall move (5). 1st off 34 day layoff. Class 10 Finished 1 from post 4 TJW= 75	101	4	100	10	100	6	88	97	6.1	2.6	2.3	4.6	3.2	1.4	80	81	105	99,100,96,101,99	34	P	2	46.8	71.1	1	0	12.00	227	CD	8.0	G3>G1	3.8	146	112.7	161	266	Bid upper;edged clear/ 2w & btwn;cut corner/ Draft 3w turn;5w upper				



DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	SRR	SUR	NOTES FROM LAST RACE	ASP	AVG	ASP	LAST FIVE										ERLY TOTL		COMMENTS																				
									110	RX	SPD	R#	TDS	RT	S1	S2	SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	TDONE	TD TWO	TD CLO	P2F		P4F	PFN	SPEED	RATINGS	DSL	BRIS	P	CALL1	CALL2	MEDS	EQUIP	MLINE	CLS	TRK	DIS	CHNG	SPPNT	PWR	COMB	TOTL
11/3/17	DMR	9	9.0	7	7	PARADISE	R>R D>D	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 4-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH! Clear early.1st off 34 day layoff. Class 0 Finished 1 from post 4 TJW= 73	96	3	92	6	93	4	90	85	2.5	4.6	0.5	1.9	5.9	0.3	95	103	87	100,81,79,110,95	34	E/P	8	46.9	71.5	1	0	4.50	205	SA	8.5	G1>G1	21.6	144	104.2	198	285	Riddn out;in hand late/Stumbled start;wkened/Hounded to 1/4; caved
			9.0	8	8	ROMANTIC	R>R D>D	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 9-hole. Fast last race (14).Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH! Class 0 Finished 1 from post 9 TJW= 57	86	9	86	10	86	10	82	96	5.1	4.2	1.2	5.1	4.2	1.2	85	81	104	100,100,59,75,98	26	E/P	4	48.3	72.6	1	0	15.00	220	KEE	9.0	G1>G1	10.8	141	108.2	166	270	Took over 4w; cleared/ In tight 5/16;repelled/Stmble bad brk;3w trns
			9.0	3	3	MOPOTISM	R>R D>D	1st off 41 day layoff. Class 2 Finished 4 from post 5 TJW= 42	91	6	92	10	92	10	84	83	5.2	4.2	1.2	5.2	4.2	1.2	83	86	93	97,97,92,93,80	41	E/P	3	47.7	71.9	1	0	30.00	217	PRX	8.5	G1>G1	8.1	142	101.5	169	262	Ease out; no late kick/Fractus gate;4-5w/Sted5/8;5w1/4;rally
			9.0	1	1	CHAMPAGNE	R>R D>D	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 1-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH! Clear early.1st off 40 day layoff. Class 7 Finished 1 from post 1 TJW= 58	92	3	90	7	92	4	81	83	3.5	2.8	1.3	3.1	2.8	1.1	86	91	97	98,94,94,83,88	40	E/P	7	47.1	71.1	1	0	15.00	216	RP	8.5	N>G1	18.9	141	108.2	177	274	Gate-wire;widened mrgn/2wd;outkicked 2nd/Floated 7/8;3wd;drivng
			9.0	2	2	STELLAR	R>R D>D	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 3-hole.Uncharacteristic race? Clear early.1st off 96 day layoff. Class 0 Finished 1 from post 3 TJW= 60	101	7	100	10	100	10	77	94	4.4	2.4	1.8	4.4	2.4	1.8	91	92	110	105,101,94,102,107	96	E/P	8	48.5	73.4	1	0	2.50	229	DMR	8.5	G1>G1	21.6	147	110.1	183	293	Led into lane;gameily/Forced;bid;led;held/Switchd out3w;resolute
			9.0	5	5	ELATE	R>R D>D	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 1-hole. Made big overall move (3). Fast last race (12). 1st off 34 day layoff. Class 0 Finished 1 from post 1 TJW= 70	98	4	96	8	96	8	88	96	4.6	2.1	2.2	4.6	2.1	2.2	97	103	102	108,108,99,93,93	34	P	3	47.3	72.1	1	0	3.00	211	BEL	9.0	G1>G1	8.1	155	108.4	200	302	Blind switch; went clr/3-4w trns;strong drive/Ins to1/2;in tight lte
			9.0	6	6	FOREVER	R>R D>D	Made big overall move (3). 1st off 69 day layoff. Class 0 Finished 1 from post 3 TJW= 70	100	9	100	10	100	9	75	98	6.5	2.7	2.4	6.4	2.3	2.8	70	77	115	100,94,105,99,102	69	S	0	48.9	72.6	1	0	4.00	228	SAR	9.0	G1>G1	0.0	143	109.8	147	262	4w 2nd;7w;ridden out/Took over 5w; cleared/Ask 1/4;angl;brsh;bid
			9.0	4	4	ABEL	R>R D>D	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 10-hole. 1st off 41 day layoff. Class 2 Finished 2 from post 10 TJW= 97	99	6	94	10	97	8	86	82	5.1	2.0	2.6	4.9	1.6	3.1	73	88	92	99,99,103,102,97	41	E/P	4	47.3	71.4	1	0	4.00	210	PRX	8.5	G1>G1	10.8	155	106.6	161	253	Slo awk str; gun; weak/3w;middle move;game/Powerful bid 1/4;clear

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	SRR	SUR	NOTES FROM LAST RACE	ASP	AVG	ASP	LAST FIVE										ERLY TOTL		COMMENTS																			
									110	RX	SPD	R#	TDS	RT	S1	S2	SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	TDONE	TD TWO	TD CLO	P2F		P4F	PFN	SPEED	RATINGS	DSL	BRIS	P	CALL1	CALL2	MEDS	EQUIP	MLINE	CLS	TRK	DIS	CHNG	SPPNT	PWR	COMB
11/3/17	DMR 10	5.0	7	7	SNACK	S>S	T>T	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 2-hole. Fast last race (16). Clear early.1st off 55 day layoff. Class 45 Finished 1 from post 2 TJW= 92	74	5	71	8	74	5	93	-7	1.4	4.2	0.3	1.6	4.0	0.4	93	85	87,83,89,79,77	55	E	8	21.5	44.0	1	0	15.00	162	IND	5.0	AO>G3	13.1	134	109.8	93	178	Inside;held sway;drv/ Led inside;caught/ 3path turn; clrd; held
		5.0	3	3	INSTANT	R>S	T>T	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 9-hole.BTL horse. Clear early.1st off 33 day layoff. Class 32 Finished 6 from post 9 TJW= 47	95	1	90	2	95	1	93	87	1.7	3.9	0.4	2.2	1.1	2.0	97	107	71 84,95,0,0,0	33	E	4	45.2	69.6	1	0	15.00	179	SA	8.0	AO>G3	6.6	136	104.7	204	275	Inside;wkened late/ Dueled;drew clear/
		5.0	8	8	LITTLE	S>S	T>T	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 8-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH!BTL horse. Clear early.1st off 34 day layoff. Class 12 Finished 6 from post 8 TJW= 81	91	1	82	5	82	3	99	92	2.5	5.5	0.5	2.7	5.3	0.5	96	103	76 87,91,79,87,68	34	E	8	21.6	43.5	1	0	15.00	185	SA	6.5	N>G3	13.1	135	106.2	199	275	Bit off rail;wkened/ Bit off rail;held game/ Inside duel;weakened
		5.0	11	11	PAQUITA	S>S	T>T	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 6-hole. Clear early.1st off 48 day layoff. Class -5 Finished 4 from post 6 TJW= 49	90	4	87	10	88	9	92	87	2.5	5.2	0.5	2.5	5.2	0.5	102	110	72 87,75,91,78,92	48	E	7	22.5	44.7	1	0	20.00	213	LRL	6.0	N>G3	11.5	136	105.5	212	284	2wd bid; weakened/ Coaxed 4-3w; tired/ Coaxed 2p; wknd late
		5.0	5	5	VIGOR	S>S	T>T	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 2-hole. Clear early. Class 20 Finished 2 from post 2 TJW= 70	91	2	84	6	86	5	87	88	1.5	2.9	0.5	1.6	3.0	0.5	93	97	84 87,94,88,83,75	20	E/P	7	22.7	45.6	1	0	5.00	182	BEL	6.0	A>G3	11.5	145	107.7	190	274	Cut corner; 2nd best/ Ins trn;herd foe late/ 3p turn;eased up late
		5.0	2	2	BELVOIR	R>S	T>T	BTL horse. Class 10 Finished 3 from post 8 TJW= 77	95	1	89	10	93	3	96	93	2.7	4.5	0.6	2.6	2.6	1.0	85	92	84 95,95,92,90,89	27	E	5	45.9	69.1	1	0	4.00	209	SA	8.0	N>G3	8.2	145	109.2	177	261	Drifted in bit;edged/ Bit tight 1/16;held 2d/ Inside duel;held 2nd Dueled;weakened/ Came out str;rallied/ Inside;held gamely
		5.0	1	1	SO	S>S	T>T	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 10-hole. Clear early.1st off 399 day layoff. Class -1 Finished 7 from post 10 TJW= 66	93	1	85	9	92	5	98	93	2.3	3.4	0.7	2.1	2.5	0.8	96	103	82 91,93,94,91,89	399	E/P	7	21.5	43.3	1	0	6.00	190	SA	6.5	G3>G3	11.5	139	111.6	199	281	Dueled;weakened/ Came out str;rallied/ Inside;held gamely
		5.0	6	6	WHAT A TEN	S>S	D>T	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 8-hole. *Stretch gain (.25). Class 77 Finished 4 from post 8 TJW= 28	ERR	0	80	5	75	1	96	78	3.1	4.4	0.7	4.3	7.1	0.6	93	101	73 82,88,75,83,73	26	E	6	22.5	45.9	1	0	20.00	149	SA	6.5	C>G3	9.8	127	100.0	194	267	3wd into str;no rally/ Inside;clear;held/ 4wd into str;no rally
		5.0	10	10	STREET	R>S	D>T	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 3-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH! 1st off 70 day layoff. Class 10 Finished 4 from post 3 TJW= 53	ERR	0	89	10	ERR	0	86	78	3.6	3.9	0.9	ERR	ERR	ERR	88	84	77 85,88,97,97,92	70	P	1	47.3	72.2	1	0	8.00	191	DMR	8.0	N>G3	1.6	133	103.8	172	249	Inside;dueled;wkened/ Bid btwn;wkened late/ Drifted out str;clear
		5.0	4	4	FIRSTHAND	R>S	T>T	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 2-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH! Clear early.1st off 41 day layoff. Class -6 Finished 1 from post 2 TJW= 86	88	4	84	10	88	4	85	88	3.6	3.6	1.0	3.5	4.1	0.9	90	96	89 91,74,86,85,81	41	E/P	5	46.3	70.5	1	0	3.50	211	PRX	8.5	N>G3	8.2	145	109.7	186	275	Clear pace; held game/ Move in; drift out/ Vied outside; drew off
		5.0	9	9	LONG HOT	S>S	T>T	Chased Pace.Uncharacteristic race?BTL horse. Class -5 Finished 3 from post 4 TJW= 66	91	5	88	10	89	9	92	61	7.1	5.4	1.3	7.8	5.0	1.6	86	93	92 91,90,93,89,85	20	P	3	22.4	44.4	1	0	4.50	204	SA	6.5	N>G3	4.9	143	113.5	179	271	3wd str;led;edged 2nd/ Held up;dec nonstarter/ Rail bid;led past 1/8





DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	SRR	SUR	NOTES FROM LAST RACE	ASP	AVG	ASP	LAST FIVE											ERLY TOTL		COMMENTS																					
									110	RX	SPD	R#	TDS	RT	S1	S2	SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	TDONE	TD TWO	TD CLO	P2F	P4F		PFN	SPEED	RATINGS	DSL	BRIS	P	CALL1	CALL2	MEDS	EQUIP	MLINE	CLS	TRK	DIS	CHNG	SPPNT	PWR	COMB	TOTL	PACE	
11/4/17	DMR	2	7.0	6	6	BOOKIES	S>S	D>D	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 5-hole. Fast last race (18). Clear early.1st off 64 day layoff. Class 8 Finished 1 from post 5 TJW= 76	ERR	0	77	5	77	5	95	84	0.8	4.1	0.2	0.8	4.1	0.2	0.2	98	105	86	95,61,80,72,79	64	E	8	22.0	45.2	1	0	3.50	186	DMR	6.0	N>N	21.1	129	106.5	203	289	Dueled;clear;driving/ Off bit slow;inside/ Inside;dueled;clear
			7.0	4	4	LUCKY	S>S	D>D	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 6-hole. Fast last race (13). Clear early.1st off 44 day layoff. Class 103 Finished 1 from post 6 TJW= 28	ERR	0	59	7	59	7	85	85	2.8	5.4	0.5	2.8	5.4	0.5	84	81	84	72,55,41,62,58	44	E/P	6	22.9	46.7	1	0	20.00	146	LRC	5.5	M>N	15.8	110	98.3	165	249	Bid 3wd;dueled;prevail/ 6wd to turn;wkened/ Inside duel;weakened	
			7.0	3	3	CAMPAIGNER	S>S	D>D	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 5-hole. Class 68 Finished 1 from post 5 TJW= 56	81	1	76	4	76	4	91	84	2.6	3.5	0.7	2.6	3.5	0.7	91	88	84	81,74,71,79,0	21	E/P	7	22.6	46.0	1	0	8.00	163	SA	6.5	S>N	18.4	123	101.9	179	263	3wd;led into lane/ Dueled; 2nd best/ Off step slow;weakened	
			7.0	5	5	LUCKY	S>S	D>D	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 4-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH!BTL horse. Clear early. Class 63 Finished 2 from post 4 TJW= 65	ERR	0	72	4	74	3	91	81	4.2	4.8	0.9	3.5	3.5	1.0	98	98	76	81,67,91,50,0	13	E	5	22.3	45.4	1	0	10.00	165	GG	6.0	AO>N	13.2	123	101.8	196	272	Pace rail;dug in;svd2d/ 4-3w trip; no rally/ Dueled;clear;riddn out	
			7.0	7	7	MINISTERSD	S>S	D>D	1st off 64 day layoff. Class 8 Finished 6 from post 4 TJW= 69	ERR	0	77	2	77	2	90	75	5.3	4.1	1.3	5.3	4.1	1.3	92	96	68	73,80,0,0,0	64	E	4	22.9	46.6	1	0	20.00	195	DMR	6.0	N>N	10.5	120	98.2	188	256	Bit off rail;weakened/ Dueled;led;just held/ Prssd 2w;led; wknd/ Brk slw;green;4w rally/	
			7.0	2	2	NIGHT AT	R>S	D>D	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 4-hole. Clear early.1st off 35 day layoff. Class 23 Finished 2 from post 4 TJW= 64	ERR	0	77	2	69	1	81	82	3.8	1.9	2.0	4.4	1.1	4.0	84	80	89	84,69,0,0,0	35	E/P	0	48.5	73.0	1	0	3.00	177	OTP	8.3	N>N	0.0	125	100.4	164	253		
			7.0	1	1	SMOKEM	S>S	D>D	Made big overall move (4). *Stretch gain (1.37).BTL horse. 1st off 42 day layoff. Class 0 Finished 2 from post 7 TJW= 44	84	1	85	4	85	4	89	87	6.6	2.2	3.0	6.6	2.2	3.0	83	87	89	84,90,82,84,0	42	S	1	22.7	45.3	1	0	2.50	210	LRC	6.5	N>N	2.6	130	106.0	170	259	4wide;led 1/16; nailed/ 3wd;4wd;2nd best/ Off bit slow;rallied	



DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	SRR	SUR	NOTES FROM LAST RACE	ASP	AVG	ASP	LAST FIVE										ERLY TOTL		COMMENTS																				
									110	RX	SPD	R#	TDS	RT	S1	S2	SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	TDONE	TD TWO	TD CLO	P2F		P4F	PFN	SPEED	RATINGS	DSL	R	P	CALL1	CALL2	MEDS	EQUIP	MLINE	CLS	TRK	DIS	CHNG	SPPNT	PWR	COMB	TOTL
11/4/17	DMR	4	8.5	9	9	ALLURING	R>R D>D	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 2-hole. Clear early.1st off 35 day layoff. Class 0 Finished 2 from post 2 TJW= 84	86	1	89	2	86	1	87	75	1.1	1.7	0.6	1.3	2.5	0.5	96	105	68	86,92,0,0,0	35	E	6	46.8	72.4	1	0	6.00	196	SA	8.5	G1>G1	9.7	141	103.2	201	269	Speed;inside;held 2nd/ Inside;met bid;clear/
			8.5	5	5	BLONDE	R>R D>D	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 5-hole. Fast last race (13). Clear early.1st off 35 day layoff. Class 20 Finished 1 from post 5 TJW= 60	94	1	81	6	94	1	88	95	2.7	3.1	0.9	1.1	1.1	1.0	75	76	99	94,89,82,79,72	35	E/P	6	48.3	72.2	1	0	20.00	169	GP	8.0	N>G1	9.7	134	106.6	151	250	Bd3/4;clr3/16;rddn out/ Steadied;4wd;drew away/ Stedy outside bid lane
			8.5	13	13	SEPARATION	R>R D>D	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 4-hole. Fast last race (11). Class 0 Finished 1 from post 4 TJW= 93	104	1	93	3	104	1	92	89	2.2	2.2	1.0	3.0	1.0	3.0	96	105	89	104,78,96,0,0	27	E/P	7	47.2	71.9	1	0	4.00	209	BEL	8.0	G1>G1	11.3	148	107.0	201	290	3w vs duo turn;driving/ Ins turn;drift out str/ In hand 2p; went clear
			8.5	11	11	WONDER	R>R D>D	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 2-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH! Clear early. Class 10 Finished 1 from post 2 TJW= 72	90	1	85	3	90	1	76	96	3.0	2.5	1.2	2.5	2.5	1.0	85	81	95	90,83,82,0,0	28	E/P	6	49.9	73.9	1	0	8.00	213	WO	8.5	G3>G1	9.7	135	105.8	166	261	Widened;rdn out/ Bmp;stalk3w;missed plc/ Bid midstr;rdn out
			8.5	7	7	MOONSHINE	R>R D>D	Chased Pace. 1st off 35 day layoff. Class 0 Finished 1 from post 3 TJW= 76	90	1	91	3	90	1	87	78	1.7	1.3	1.3	2.5	1.3	1.9	93	99	73	90,90,92,0,0	35	E/P	7	46.8	72.1	1	0	3.50	206	SA	8.5	G1>G1	11.3	144	104.3	192	265	Bid;led;drift in str/ Angled in;held gamely/ Dueld;btwn turn;game
			8.5	8	8	PIEDI	R>R D>D	Chased Pace. *Stretch gain (1.5). 1st off 35 day layoff.2 races in one pattern. Class 0 Finished 3 from post 7 TJW= 54	86	1	87	4	86	1	85	77	4.3	2.7	1.6	3.8	3.8	1.0	90	96	71	86,90,90,83,0	35	P	5	47.2	73.0	1	0	15.00	194	SA	8.5	G1>G1	8.1	139	102.2	186	257	4wd 7/8;edged 2nd/ Willingly late;edged/ Bid;led 3wd late
			8.5	2	2	TELL YOUR	S>R D>D	Class 60 Finished 3 from post 4 TJW= 69	ERR	0	74	2	ERR	0	82	85	5.2	3.0	1.7	ERR	ERR	ERR	86	79	86	76,72,0,0,0	22	P	4	23.0	47.9	1	0	30.00	164	KEE	6.5	S>G1	6.5	116	102.8	165	251	Came 4w; finished well/ Rallied between horses/
			8.5	10	10	MAYA	R>R D>D	Class 0 Finished 3 from post 1 TJW= 71	90	1	85	3	90	1	89	80	5.7	2.9	2.0	5.0	3.0	1.7	94	103	70	90,83,81,0,0	27	P	3	47.7	73.3	1	BON	20.00	199	BEL	8.0	G1>G1	4.8	137	102.4	197	267	Ins;6p 1/8;got show/ 2w;ins bid 1/4-1/8p1/ Circled; ridden out
			8.5	12	12	CALEDONIA	R>R D>D	Made big overall move (5). Made a big move early (4). Class 0 Finished 2 from post 9 TJW= 74	100	1	95	2	100	1	90	88	3.2	1.6	2.0	4.0	2.0	2.0	86	94	86	100,89,0,0,0	27	P	4	47.6	72.3	1	0	15.00	201	BEL	8.0	G1>G1	6.5	140	105.1	180	266	2w;5w angle from 5/16/ Swerve in st;3w;6p1/8/
			8.5	4	4	GIO GAME	R>R D>D	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 4-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH! Clear early. Class 60 Finished 1 from post 4 TJW= 62	88	1	80	3	88	1	77	90	4.6	2.3		1.4	1.4	1.0	87	83	92	88,77,76,0,0	29	E/P	4	48.6	73.5	1	0	15.00	173	KEE	8.5	S>G1	6.5	129	104.0	170	262	Took over at will/ Ins trns;lckd room3/16/ Pinch;stdied brk;ins
			8.5	6	6	STAINLESS	R>R T>D	Made big overall move (11). Middle move (7.75). Class 10 Finished 2 from post 3 TJW= 87	ERR	0	81	4	ERR	0	69	101	7.9	2.6	3.0	ERR	ERR	ERR	81	82	91	87,70,79,87,0	24	S	3	50.7	74.9	1	0	20.00	204	KEE	8.5	G3>G1	4.8	129	98.5	163	254	Altered out 1/8;kpt on/ Fell to face start/ To 5p 5/16;6-7w 1/8
			8.5	1	1	HEAVENLY	R>R D>D	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 9-hole. Fast last race (11).Uncharacteristic race? Clear early. Class 0 Finished 1 from post 9 TJW= 70	91	1	80	3	91	1	74	90	5.3	1.7	3.1	2.0	1.0	2.0	90	90	95	91,74,76,0,0	29	E/P	3	48.6	73.8	1	0	4.50	191	KEE	8.5	G1>G1	4.8	133	104.4	180	275	Blew past 1/4;drew off/ Took over 3wd;drew off/ Steadied st;wide gain
			8.5	3	3	PRINCESS	R>R D>D	Made big overall move (5). Class 0 Finished 2 from post 1 TJW= 57	85	1	90	2	85	1	72	87	4.5	1.4	3.2	6.0	2.0	3.0	81	82	89	85,94,0,0,0	29	P	4	49.1	74.5	1	0	12.00	194	KEE	8.5	G1>G1	6.5	132	103.5	163	252	Bid str; no match/ Drove past; cleared/



DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	SRR	SUR	NOTES FROM LAST RACE	ASP	AVG	ASP	LAST FIVE										ERLY TOTL		COMMENTS																				
									110	RX	SPD	R#	TDS	RT	S1	S2	SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	TDONE	TD TWO	TD CLO	P2F		P4F	PFN	SPEED	RATINGS	DSL R	BRIS	P	CALL1	CALL2	MEDS	EQUIP	MLINE	CLS	TRK	DIS	CHNG	SPPNT	PWR	COMB	TOTL
11/4/17	DMR	6	7.0	6	6	PROPER	S>S D>D	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 1-hole. Clear early.1st off 42 day layoff. Class 20 Finished 1 from post 1 TJW= 77	ERR	0	90	10	94	8	91	84	1.7	4.1	0.4	2.0	2.5	0.8	95	99	96	99,96,80,91,73	42	E/P	6	22.1	45.2	1	0	30.00	204	TDN	6.0	N>G1	9.5	137	111.4	194	290	Muhc best; driving/ 3w;move turn;all out/ Hit gate;2w;faltered
			7.0	13	13	PRINCESS	S>S D>D	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 3-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH! Clear early. Class 10 Finished 2 from post 3 TJW= 72	88	5	88	7	89	6	97	86	2.1	4.5	0.5	2.0	3.5	0.6	95	104	89	97,94,85,82,96	27	E	8	22.3	45.4	1	0	20.00	205	SA	6.5	G3>G1	12.7	136	107.5	199	288	Inside trip;held 2nd/ Drift in;out str;held/ Inside duel;wknd late
			7.0	9	9	FINLEY'SLU	S>S D>D	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 4-hole. Made big overall move (3). Class 5 Finished 1 from post 4 TJW= 70	100	2	99	10	102	9	87	90	1.8	2.4	0.8	1.8	1.7	1.1	90	100	97	101,106,103,97,98	28	E/P	6	23.4	46.2	1	0	6.00	214	KEE	6.0	G2>G1	9.5	150	112.7	190	287	Bmpd st; drove clear/ 4w uppr; fought game/ 3path turn; drew clear
			7.0	8	8	CONSTELLAT	S>S D>D	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 4-hole. Clear early.1st off 83 day layoff. Class 10 Finished 2 from post 4 TJW= 94	97	4	94	10	94	10	89	85	3.0	3.2	0.9	3.0	3.2	0.9	90	97	96	97,96,96,86,97	83	E/P	7	22.6	45.3	1	0	15.00	220	DMR	6.5	G3>G1	11.1	138	111.0	187	283	Bid;led turn;2nd best/ Bit off rail;2nd best/ Came out st; drifted
			7.0	3	3	CURLIN'S	S>S D>D	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 5-hole. Clear early.1st off 34 day layoff. Class 30 Finished 1 from post 5 TJW= 81	95	7	95	10	95	7	92	88	3.8	3.5	1.1	4.2	3.2	1.3	94	100	92	97,83,106,82,86	34	E/P	4	22.7	45.2	1	0	20.00	221	GP	7.0	N>G1	6.3	144	110.7	194	286	Bid5/16; drew off/ Got out 3-4w 3/8; wknd/ Trackd3w;drv;pull awy
			7.0	2	2	PAULASSILV	S>S D>D	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 3-hole. Slow last race (13). 1st off 70 day layoff. Class 0 Finished 5 from post 3 TJW= 93	96	7	98	10	98	10	75	89	3.2	2.8	1.1	3.2	2.8	1.1	80	77	99	85,106,96,96,94	70	E/P	5	24.4	48.7	1	0	8.00	228	SAR	7.0	G1>G1	7.9	143	106.7	157	256	Tracked ins; empty/ 4-5w uppr; gamely/ Clear 1/8;lng drv 6pth
			7.0	1	1	CARINA MIA	S>S D>D	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 3-hole.BTL horse. 1st off 41 day layoff. Class 5 Finished 2 from post 3 TJW= 91	96	6	96	10	96	6	87	86	4.9	4.1	1.2	5.2	4.2	1.2	92	98	93	96,93,101,94,94	41	P	4	22.7	45.9	1	0	12.00	230	BEL	6.5	G2>G1	6.3	142	110.3	190	283	2-3w;btwn duo fin 1/8/ 3w upper; not enough/ Drafted 2p trn;bmp3/16
			7.0	7	7	BY THE	S>S D>D	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 4-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH! Clear early.1st off 70 day layoff. Class 0 Finished 1 from post 4 TJW= 59	98	8	99	10	99	9	76	94	3.5	2.7	1.3	3.7	2.7	1.4	83	80	110	95,105,97,105,97	70	E/P	4	24.1	47.8	1	0	12.00	227	SAR	7.0	G1>G1	6.3	140	109.9	163	273	Rated 2p; gamely/ 6w upper; rebuffed/ 4w upper; gamely
			7.0	5	5	BAR OF	R>S D>D	Class 0 Finished 6 from post 6 TJW= 72	94	1	94	10	94	1	79	88	5.7	4.3	1.3	1.7	1.7	1.0	81	75	88	87,94,93,91,90	27	P	2	49.0	73.9	1	0	30.00	225	KEE	9.0	G1>G1	3.2	143	104.5	156	244	Mild bid 5w; faltered/ Bumped; led; 2nd best/ Ins turns;hedge rally
			7.0	4	4	FINEST	S>S D>D	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 5-hole. 1st off 119 day layoff. Class 5 Finished 3 from post 5 TJW= 72	97	5	96	10	97	5	94	87	4.7	3.0	1.6	4.6	2.2	2.1	87	100	88	93,95,95,100,93	119	P	3	22.6	45.1	1	0	12.00	229	LRC	6.5	G2>G1	4.8	141	110.9	187	275	5wd into str;up 3rd/ Stalked;rail; weakened/ Long drv btw; missed
			7.0	10	10	HIGHWAY	S>S D>D	Chased Pace. Made big overall move (4). 1st off 41 day layoff. Class 5 Finished 1 from post 1 TJW= 40	97	4	93	10	97	4	86	87	4.3	2.6	1.7	5.0	1.8	2.8	88	95	97	96,95,95,97,100	41	P	2	23.0	46.1	1	0	15.00	223	BEL	6.5	G2>G1	3.2	140	110.3	183	280	2w;4w;vs duo fin 1/8/ Shied 2x str; gamely/ Ins to 1/4;4w upper
			7.0	11	11	UNIQUE	S>S D>D	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 4-hole. Class 10 Finished 1 from post 4 TJW= 76	98	3	98	6	95	4	96	91	3.7	2.0	1.9	4.4	2.0	2.2	92	101	99	102,104,106,93,99	27	E/P	6	22.5	45.3	1	0	1.80	201	SA	6.5	G3>G1	9.5	149	110.8	193	292	Off bit slow;3wd;clear/ In tight 7/8;gamely/ 3wd;clear;rail;handily
			7.0	12	12	SKYE	S>S D>D	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 3-hole. 1st off 83 day layoff. Class 10 Finished 1 from post 3 TJW= 64	91	7	93	10	93	8	88	88	5.2	2.4	2.2	5.5	2.4	2.3	89	94	102	99,100,93,94,100	83	E/P	5	22.9	45.6	1	0	5.00	201	DMR	6.5	G3>G1	7.9	141	112.4	183	285	Stalked;led past 1/16/ 4wd into str;led 1/8/ Came out str;willingly
			7.0	14	14	AMI'S MESA	S>S D>D	Chased Pace. Made big overall move (5). 1st off 47 day layoff.2 races in one pattern. Class 5 Finished 1 from post 6 TJW= 75	90	6	88	9	90	6	89	93	6.0	2.7	2.2	5.5	1.4	3.9	89	95	95	95,98,92,91,67	47	P	1	22.8	45.7	1	0	20.00	209	PID	6.5	G2>G1	1.6	147	113.7	184	279	Light urging/ Led upr str;ridden out/ Mdpck;2-3w;rallied str

#5 paid \$135.40

ERLY TOTL



DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	SRR	SUR	NOTES FROM LAST RACE	ASP	AVG	ASP	LAST FIVE													ERLY TOTL		COMMENTS																		
									110	RX	SPD	R#	TDS	RT	S1	S2	SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	TDONE	TD TWO	TD CLO	P2F	P4F	PFN	SPEED RATINGS		DSL	BRIS	P	CALL1	CALL2	MEDS	EQUIP	MLINE	CLS	TRK	DIS	CHNG	SPPNT	PWR	COMB	TOTL	PACE	
11/4/17	DMR	8	6.0	7	7	TAKAFUL	S>S	D>D	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 4-hole. Fast last race (15). 1st off 35 day layoff. Class 0 Finished 1 from post 4 TJW= 76	106	3	91	7	105	4	96	88	2.0	3.8	0.5	1.5	1.5	1.0	98	114	90	106,99,114,70,53	35	E/P	7	22.5	44.9	1	0	5.00	215	BEL	6.0	G1>G1	21.9	149	113.4	212	302	Pressed 4-3w; gamely/ 2path turn;headed 1/8/ Pace 2p; asked 3/16
			6.0	10	10	IMPERIAL	S>S	D>D	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 3-hole. Fast last race (15). 1st off 61 day layoff. Class 5 Finished 1 from post 3 TJW= 79	102	7	96	10	98	9	98	89	2.3	4.0	0.6	2.4	3.2	0.8	94	110	100	111,103,106,102,109	61	E/P	7	21.7	43.8	1	0	4.50	213	PRX	6.0	N>G1	21.9	152	119.5	204	304	Bid turn; under wraps/ Keen early;ins;drw off/ Rate 2w;ins prsr;drvg
			6.0	4	4	B SQUARED	S>S	T>D	Flashed speed. Made big overall move (3). Class 5 Finished 1 from post 6 TJW= 54	94	1	88	9	92	2	94	58	3.9	4.3	0.9	1.5	1.5	1.0	91	96	92	94,75,79,93,95	14	P	2	22.2	43.8	1	0	30.00	215	SA	6.5	N>G1	6.3	136	114.2	187	279	3wd into str;rallied/ Bump; press; gave way/ Swung out 7wi to lane
			6.0	2	2	DREFONG	S>S	D>D	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 10-hole. Clear early.1st off 70 day layoff. Class 0 Finished 1 from post 10 TJW= 97	99	5	101	7	101	7	87	93	1.9	1.9	1.0	1.9	1.9	1.0	94	101	105	106,0,109,105,103	70	E/P	5	22.9	45.6	1	0	2.50	200	SAR	7.0	G1>G1	15.6	156	116.5	195	300	Near ins trn;lite drive/ Duckd in gap;lost jock/ Bmp st;duel ins;drvng
			6.0	8	8	ROY H	S>S	D>D	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 6-hole. Fast last race (14). Class 0 Finished 1 from post 6 TJW= 78	98	7	95	10	98	7	94	93	3.5	3.1	1.1	2.7	3.1	0.9	92	102	106	109,99,111,105,94	28	E/P	5	22.3	45.0	1	0	3.50	204	SA	6.0	G1>G1	15.6	151	117.3	194	300	3wd into str;gamely/ Fanned 6wd into str/ 5w turn;bid 3/16;held
			6.0	1	1	CALCULATOR	S>S	D>D	Chased Pace. Made big overall move (6). Made a big move early (3.75). 1st off 70 day layoff. Class 5 Finished 2 from post 7 TJW= 79	92	1	93	10	100	4	91	92	6.7	4.7	1.4	6.3	3.1	2.0	79	94	107	103,89,96,92,86	70	S	0	22.8	45.1	1	0	20.00	218	DMR	7.0	G2>G1	0.0	140	113.9	173	280	Bid 3wd;led;2nd best/ Chased 3wd;up 3rd/ Came out str;rallied
			6.0	9	9	RANSOM THE	S>S	D>D	Class 0 Finished 4 from post 1 TJW= 76	102	4	95	10	102	5	93	89	5.1	3.3	1.5	5.0	2.6	1.9	90	99	98	100,101,103,104,101	28	P	2	22.6	45.8	1	0	12.00	209	SA	6.0	G1>G1	6.3	143	113.4	189	287	Saved ground; no rally/ Rail bid str;led;held/ Bid 3wd turn;gamely
			6.0	5	5	WHITMORE	S>S	D>D	Made big overall move (6). Class 5 Finished 1 from post 11 TJW= 52	101	8	97	10	101	8	87	90	5.8	3.6	1.6	5.4	1.9	2.8	92	98	98	99,99,101,104,102	29	S	0	22.8	45.8	1	0	15.00	221	KEE	6.0	G2>G1	0.0	146	113.3	190	288	Steadied 7/16;won nod/ Rail; mild gain/ 4w turn;9w 1/8;rally
			6.0	3	3	AMERICAN	S>S	D>D	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 5-hole. Made big overall move (4).BTL horse. 1st off 42 day layoff. Class 12 Finished 2 from post 5 TJW= 64	99	6	99	6	99	6	93	90	3.7	2.2	1.7	3.7	2.2	1.7	93	102	103	107,99,98,98,94	42	P	3	22.2	45.2	1	0	12.00	193	PRX	6.0	G3>G1	9.4	147	113.9	195	298	Step slow; wide; game/ 4wd;3wd;led;clear/ Bid 3wd;outkicked 3rd
			6.0	6	6	MIND YOUR	S>S	D>D	1st off 70 day layoff. Class 0 Finished 6 from post 6 TJW= 45	102	5	101	9	101	9	83	89	5.8	2.9	2.0	5.8	2.9	2.0	86	93	97	95,101,0,105,104	70	S	1	23.7	47.2	1	0	6.00	223	SAR	7.0	G1>G1	3.1	146	111.1	179	276	3w trn;4w upr;empty/ 3w;4w & asked 1/8p1/









