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10/26/2018  990 LA   1 GARRULOUS   8 8     5   9  180  67   15   73  ERR       15,70,75,64,60 1320,1100,880,1210,1 -18.75 4.60  5.20  5.80  55.51  0 55.95  1.60  24500  61.11   75 MARTINEZ   PAPAPRODRO  1.00  44.6  22.89  38.22  4 1320   22 SA     392    78   470 Bumped start;3wd;eased/Bpd brk;3wd 
                                                                                              430                                                                                                                                                                       into lane/Bpd both sides;crushd 
            990        TRIXIE      1 1     2   3   80  65   58   66   56        58,60,79,0,64 990,990,870,870,990    1.00 4.40  3.80  3.60  55.86  7 56.06  8.00   9500 105.12   79 RUSSELL C  GUILLEN    56.06  25.4  19.99  85.13  4  990   28 LA     235   135   369 Bp bth sides;angld out/Rail trip; 
                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                        up for 2nd/Inside; no rally 
            990        BABA BE     3 3     6   2   80  63   59   57   62       59,59,53,71,71 990,990,880,870,870   -1.00 3.20  3.60  3.80  55.40  3 55.57  4.50   9100 103.16   71 MCDAID     MENDOZA    56.15  88.3  20.56  82.60  5  990   28 LA     226   132   358 2wide; bested rest/3-4wd to str; up 
                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                        3rd/Vied inside;outfinishd 
            990        GAMEZAPPER  7 7     1   2   80  61   65   62   64       65,56,64,64,55 880,1100,990,1760,12   2.00 4.60  6.00  6.00  55.89  1 55.12  2.50  16200 110.34   65 SANCHEZ    DUNHAM     56.77  61.7  21.26  89.08  5  880   26 LA     295   141   436 Off slow;shiftd in brk/3-4wide to 
                                                                                              10                                                                                                                                                                        lane;faded/Bid outside;drew clear 
            990        REVA BELLA  2 2     2   5   80  58   61   57   60       61,58,53,56,61 880,990,990,990,990    0.50 3.80  3.40  4.20  55.91  6 55.94 15.00   7900 103.34   61 ARANA      NUNEZ      56.46  34.4  14.54  88.80  5  880   26 LA     204   132   336 Inside;drifted out trn/2wd; 3wide; 
                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                        weakened/Off bit slow;duel;wknd 
            990        LOVELY      4 4     4   6   80  57   47   57   57       47,63,61,59,56 990,990,990,990,990   -3.00 4.00  2.60  2.60  55.25  7 55.25 20.00   7300  97.04   63 HERNANDEZ  NUNEZ      55.30  46.6  17.27  79.77  5  990   48 LA     195   124   320 Off bit slow;no bid/Dueled; held 
                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                        off foe/Duel; led late; caught 
            990        JEWELOF     5 5     5   5   75  55   52   54   57       52,54,56,59,56 990,990,990,990,990    4.75 3.80  5.20  5.00  55.62  6 55.62 15.00  10000  96.91   59 ORDUNA-ROJ CASTANEDA  54.71  47.5  18.56  78.35  5  990   14 LA     219   124   343 Tracked; gave way/2-3wide; no 
                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                        factor/Stalked; rail; wknd 
            990        HEATHER'S   6 6     1   3   75  46   55   56   56       55,56,25,61,59 990,990,1320,1100,13   1.50 5.00  5.20  5.20  54.13  2 43.40  6.00  13375 104.48   61 BEDNAR     TREECE     54.91  73.7  19.27  85.21  5  990   14 LA     234   134   368 Angled out;outfinished/Speed; mild 
                                                                                              20                                                                                                                                                                        urging/Angled in;gave way 
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10/26/2018  880 LA   2 YANKEE      4 4     7   4   65  78   72   78   78       72,72,90,74,81 990,990,870,880,880   -2.00 3.40  2.20  3.00  57.16  4 57.13  2.50   8940 107.05   90 SANCHEZ    NUNEZ      57.93  71.3  19.56  87.49  5  990   82 ARP    330   169   499 4pth speed tired/Slow brk 7wd tired 
                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                        stu/2path no rally 
            880        SRIRACHA    1 1     5   2   90  78   73   75   64       73,69,83,92,71 880,880,870,870,990   -0.13 3.80  2.40  2.60  57.10  5 57.14  3.00   9400 110.06   92 PAYERAS    LUCAS      57.88  31.9  22.40  87.66  5  880   34 LA     338   173   511 4deep;clear trn;nailed/Chased; 2wd; 
                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                        held 2nd/Inside; no bid 
            880        SEATOSHINI  6 6     2   3  110  74   87   72  ERR       87,68,61,90,62 870,1210,990,870,110  -1.50 4.00  4.60  5.40  56.44  0 56.12  3.50  12400 111.90   90 OROZCO     NUNEZ      56.35  46.6  28.10  83.80  5  870  377 LA     378   176   555 Inside; checked 
                                                                                              0                                                                                                                                                                         1/4/Forced;bid;3wd;wknd/Stalked; 
                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                        4wd; faded 
            880        OMDURMAN    3 3     5   3   90  73   70   73  ERR       70,80,69,62,83 990,990,990,1210,121   0.25 3.40  3.20  3.20  57.29  0 56.79  2.00  10500 114.67   83 BEDNAR     RODRIGUEZ  58.37  72.4  23.70  90.97  5  990   20 LA     344   181   525 3wide; evenly late/Clear;drew 
                                                                                              0                                                                                                                                                                         off;rdn out/Vied 3deep; no match 
            880        STERLING    5 5     6   6  140  63   61   57   66       61,46,65,70,71 1210,1210,990,990,88  -6.00 3.40  4.80  4.40  56.84  2 56.38 15.00  10100  93.45   71 MARTIN     JANUARY    57.25  16.1  18.44  75.01  5 1210   33 LRC    315   147   462 Angled in;no bid;bled/Saved ground; 
                                                                                              0                                                                                                                                                                         gave way/Svd ground; no rally 
            880        MASTERS     2 2     5   5   85  63   60   57   68       60,63,47,71,73 990,880,990,870,880   -3.75 4.20  4.20  5.00  56.53  2 56.50 10.00   8900  97.76   73 MCDAID     CASTANEDA  57.34 100.3  20.41  77.35  5  990   19 LA     295   154   449 Pressed out; faded/In tight;chck 
                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                        into trn/Stumbled badly 
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10/26/2018  990 LA   3 GYPSY'S     1 1     1   7  150  68   73   73  ERR       73,77,68,43,81 1100,1210,1210,1320,   0.00 4.60  5.20  5.20  55.99  0 55.04  1.60  16600 116.27   81 HERNANDEZ  SALDANA    56.59  54.0  31.29  84.98  5 1100   33 LRC    386   169   555 Inside trip;no bid/Fought back rail 
                                                                                              1540                                                                                                                                                                      lane/3-4wd to str;no rally 
            990        RADIO       3 3     6   2   80  66   64   65   67       64,65,65,68,68 880,880,990,990,990    1.50 1.40  2.60  2.20  56.58  3 56.65  2.50  10200 107.88   68 PAYERAS    TREECE     56.87  51.8  21.40  86.48  5  880   19 LA     294   157   450 Angled in;out;rallied/Chased; 
                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                        bested rest/2wide; no bid 
            990        LOUDER      7 7     2   6   90  65   61   63   63       61,60,68,67,67 990,990,990,990,990    1.75 3.20  4.00  3.40  56.55  9 56.55 15.00   8200  98.69   68 ALLEN      JANUARY    56.97  37.3  16.99  81.70  5  990   20 LA     264   143   407 Svd ground; no menace/Angled out; 
                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                        no rally/Bp brk;angl in/out trn 
            990        BABY        4 4     3   1   80  65   70   66   65       70,65,64,64,63 990,990,990,990,990    0.00 1.80  2.00  2.00  56.37  5 56.37  2.50   9200 113.65   70 SANCHEZ    NUNEZ      57.05  71.3  22.56  91.09  5  990   28 LA     278   165   443 Brk in;bmpd;drew off/Bid 
                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                        upper;turnd back/Lugged out 
                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                        turn;gamely 
            990        DAYJUR      2 2     4   4   70  62   62   63  ERR       62,58,69,66,56 1100,1210,1100,1100,  -1.00 1.40  3.80  4.00  54.33  0 53.67  6.00   7800  99.21   69 ARAGON     EATON      56.05  51.7  19.00  80.21  5 1100   22 FNO    251   144   396 Pressed 3w; weakened/Stalked 3w; 
                                                                                              1210                                                                                                                                                                      gave way/Dueled;cleared;lasted 
            990        MILLIE      5 5     4   5  105  59   63   57  ERR       63,54,53,56,68 1320,880,1210,880,13  -0.50 3.60  6.00  5.00  55.15  0 54.65 15.00  12300  93.52   68 MCDAID     BRADVICA   58.52  84.4  23.17  70.35  5 1320   15 FNO    306   136   442 4w;eased in;gave way/3-4wide; no 
                                                                                              20                                                                                                                                                                        rally/Angled in; weakened 
            990        NAUGHTY     6 6     3   8  120  44   25   56   55       25,61,50,53,58 1210,990,990,990,121 -11.00 5.00  6.20  6.00  54.84  3 44.08 20.00   8625  59.06   61 ORDUNA-ROJ BRADVICA    1.00  31.6  10.01  49.05  5 1210   35 LRC    221    86   307 Saved ground; gave way/Brk 
                                                                                              0                                                                                                                                                                         out;bmpd;no rally/4wide 1/8; empty 
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10/26/2018  990 LA   4 PALACE      7 7     5   5  300  76   70   77  ERR       70,78,83,73,74 1320,1320,1320,1210,  -8.00 1.80  2.00  3.60  55.31  0 54.32  1.60  27400 125.84   83 HERNANDEZ  SALDANA    58.24  54.0  53.31  72.53  5 1320   26 SA     388   130   517 Came out str;wkened/Broke 
                                                                                              1320                                                                                                                                                                      out;bmp;outgamed/Inside;dueled;game 
                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                        ly 
            990        SHARP       9 9     5   5  100  74   81   77   74       81,76,75,72,67 870,1210,990,990,121   2.00 2.60  3.20  3.00  56.42  2 56.16  2.00  11900 108.31   81 MCDAID     VALLEJO    55.27 124.4  26.10  82.21  5  870   63 LA     239   111   350 Floated out turn/Off rail 
                                                                                              0                                                                                                                                                                         str;outkicked/Rallied; drew clear 
            990        SEA SECRET  3 3     5   1  100  70   73   69   65       73,70,65,73,69 880,990,990,990,990    0.00 1.00  1.40  1.80  57.22  6 57.26  5.00   8700 118.19   73 ARIAS SAUL CLARK      57.58  64.5  25.54  92.65  5  880   35 LA     202   122   323 Lugged out turn; held/3wide; 
                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                        willingly/Drftd out trn;outfnshd 
            990        MY EBONY    4 4     4   4  115  64   61   59   64       61,56,61,78,66 990,1210,1210,1100,9   1.00 2.60  3.40  3.80  56.20  7 55.76  8.00  11200 105.27   78 SANCHEZ    NUNEZ      55.94  71.3  24.13  81.14  5  990   13 LA     215   108   323 2w;bt off rail;no rlly/4wd into 
                                                                                              90                                                                                                                                                                        str;weakened/4wd into str;wkened 
            990        ROCKY'S     1 1     3   3   70  63   64   64   63        64,63,0,55,71 1100,990,1100,1540,1   1.00 3.40  4.75 22.80  54.54  1 54.45 20.00   7875 104.07   71 RUSSELL C  BAZE EARL  56.21   0.0  19.43  84.64  4 1100   22 FNO    182   107   289 3-4wide; no rally/Passed tired 
                                                                                              210                                                                                                                                                                       foes/Clipped heels 1st turn 
            990        COCO        5 5     2   3  100  62   62   61   61       62,56,64,66,63 990,1210,1210,1210,9   1.25 5.60  4.20  4.60  56.17  7 55.68 20.00  12300 102.63   66 ORDUNA-ROJ CASTANEDA  56.26  47.5  21.99  80.64  5  990   21 LA     222   106   327 Svd ground; gained 3rd/Bobbld 
                                                                                              90                                                                                                                                                                        brk;3deep;wknd/Btwn;inside;best 
                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                        rest 
            990        A CHEROKEE  8 8     3   2  100  62   66   64   58       66,61,64,56,61 990,990,990,990,990    2.00 1.60  2.20  2.00  55.87  8 55.87 12.00   8000 104.35   66 PAYERAS    BRADY      56.57  26.1  20.56  83.79  5  990   21 LA     181   107   289 Bit off rail;closd 
                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                        ins/Btwn;clear;held safely/Closed; 
                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                        not enough 
            990        MIRACLE     6 6     1   5  100  62   59   66   59       59,71,68,55,55 990,990,990,990,990    1.75 5.00  4.00  3.40  56.36  9 56.36 15.00   8700 108.27   71 OROZCO     ENRIQUEZ   56.00  38.0  22.99  85.28  5  990   21 LA     188   111   299 Hesitated;lggd out trn/Bp brk;angld 
                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                        out;clear/Turned back foe upper 
            990        DESIGNED    2 2     5   4  100  51   51   46   60       51,52,36,59,57 1100,1210,1210,880,1  -5.50 3.20  4.20  4.40  55.08  4 54.56 15.00  10300  94.54   59 BEDNAR     STORTZ     54.61  61.6  19.71  74.83  5 1100   12 FNO    184    97   281 3-4wd to lane; wknd/Dueled 3w; 
                                                                                              100                                                                                                                                                                       weakened/Tracked early;stopped 
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10/26/2018  870 LA   5 BILLY THE   4 4     2   2  150  76   76   76  ERR          76,12,0,0,0 1100,1210,0,0,0       -0.12 7.00  7.00  7.00  54.19  0 56.24  2.00  15000 121.06   76 MCDAID     JONES      57.07  93.2  31.71  89.35  1 1100   36 LRC    280   141   421 Dueled;led;edged btwn/Stdied 
                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                        strt;bump early/ 
            870        CHARMING    3 3     3   5  100  67   67   67   67           67,0,0,0,0 870,0,0,0,0           -2.50 3.00  2.00  5.00  54.73  1 54.73  3.50  10000 107.00   67 DE LA      GONZALEZ   54.73  16.1  23.39  83.61  1  870   13 LA     220   125   345 Chased; weakened// 
            870        MERGIE      6 6     4   2   70  66   59   68   71       59,67,77,76,49 990,870,870,870,1210  -0.25 4.40  4.60  4.80  55.58  4 55.28  5.00  10100 105.40   77 ARANA      PEREZ      56.87  26.3  18.99  86.41  5  990   19 LA     218   123   342 Inside; evenly late/2-3wide; 
                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                        improved/Svd grnd;angld out str 
            870        GOLDEN      8 8     5   5   70  61   60   62   67       60,66,60,68,50 990,870,1210,870,176   5.50 4.00  6.00  5.60  55.42  2 54.51 12.00  18800 105.39   68 RUSSELL C  NETTLES    56.21  13.8  18.27  87.12  5  990   13 LA     281   123   404 Svd ground; late rally/2wide; no 
                                                                                              0                                                                                                                                                                         menace/3wd into lane;wkened 
            870        GABBY LADY  5 5     6   6  170  60   60   60  ERR           60,0,0,0,0 1210,0,0,0,0          -4.75 9.00  6.00  6.00  55.83  0 54.67  8.00  17000  97.72   60 PAYERAS    ENRIQUEZ   56.90  32.0  25.59  72.13  1 1210  120 LRC    264   114   378 Bumped start;no bid// 
            870        CALI ROCKS  1 1     5   4  100  56   68   60   70        68,39,73,43,0 870,1100,870,1210,18   1.50 3.00  6.00 24.00  55.19  6 54.45 12.00  12250  98.90   73 MARTIN     GEORGIEV   54.82   0.0  16.10  82.80  4  870   13 LA     216   115   332 2wide; improved/Rail trip; 
                                                                                              70                                                                                                                                                                        weakened/Brk out;bpd;rail rally 
            870        FIRST       7 7     6   7  260  55   55   55  ERR           55,0,0,0,0 1320,0,0,0,0          -4.50 6.00  6.00  7.00  55.39  0 54.02 10.00  26000 116.73   55 RAMIREZ    LUCAS      58.96  26.1  44.46  72.27  1 1320  502 GG     329   136   466 No speed; gave way// 
            870        ANGRY       2 2     4   2   70  52   61   61  ERR       61,61,60,34,43 990,990,990,1760,110   0.00 4.60  5.40  5.20  56.02  0 55.04  4.00  10300 104.08   61 HARVEY B   DAVIS      57.51  26.1  19.41  84.67  5  990   20 LA     192   122   313 Inside; 2nd best/Angled out 
                                                                                              0                                                                                                                                                                         str;closed/Btwn;2wide;gained 2nd 
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10/26/2018  300 LA   6 CIR HOME    2 2     2   5   40  84   82   81   70       82,81,79,92,84 350,350,350,350,350   -0.25 4.40  3.60  3.60  56.54  1 58.46  4.00   9620 106.52   92 ROMAN      VICKERY    57.71  30.8  12.93  93.59  5  350   19 LA     272   125   397 Drifted in; evenly/Solid 
                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                        effort/Lost the nod game 2nd 
            300        FIREBAUGH   3 3     8   6   40  83   82   83   77       82,87,81,84,80 350,300,300,350,350    0.50 3.80  3.20  3.80  56.12  4 57.26  3.50  20787 108.47   87 CANALES    CLARK      57.65 108.8  14.79  93.68  5  350   19 LA     421   127   548 Knocked into rival/Dueled; game 
                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                        effort/Bobbled break 
            300        NOBODYSFAS  5 5     4   6   70  74   74   74   74           74,0,0,0,0 300,0,0,0,0           -0.25 4.00  6.00  6.00  55.94  1 55.94  6.00   6950 109.93   74 SANCHEZ R  JONES PAUL 55.94  57.5  19.57  90.36  1  300   28 LA     219   129   348 Broke out; no rally// 
            300        R VALIANT   6 6     2   3   70  74   79   74   74         79,75,68,0,0 300,330,300,0,0        0.00 4.33  4.67  4.00  55.81  2 56.14  4.00   7650 110.59   79 NICASIO    O'DELL     56.53 116.7  19.57  91.02  3  300   28 LA     229   129   358 Broke in; bumped 
                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                        start/Weakened/Drifted in; no rally 
            300        SHEZA       7 7     1   4   76  73   75   73   73         75,76,68,0,0 300,300,300,0,0       -0.25 3.67  4.00  4.00  56.08  3 56.08 15.00   7700 107.15   76 GASCA      SKEEN MARK 56.21   0.0  19.71  87.44  3  300   34 LA     228   125   353 Drifted out; evenly/Bumped brk; 
                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                        shifted in/Broke out; bumped 
            300        QUEEN K     4 4     2   2   76  68   77   74   74       77,70,74,49,70 300,330,350,350,300   -0.25 4.80  5.20  5.20  55.09  2 56.03  6.00   6810 104.92   77 RAMIREZ S  NUNEZ      56.36  22.4  17.57  87.35  5  300   34 LA     207   123   330 Bumped brk; held 2nd/Broke in; no 
                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                        factor/Lugged in early 
            300        VINCITORE   1 1     7   8   76  67   61   70   67       61,82,68,77,48 300,300,300,300,300   -0.25 4.20  4.20  4.40  55.29  5 55.29  6.00   6870 102.96   82 RANGEL     NUNEZ      54.64  22.4  18.57  84.39  5  300   34 LA     206   120   327 Veered in;bpd;lggd out/Bumped 
                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                        brk;outfinished/Veerd in brk;drftd 
                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                        out 
            300        JB GRAY     8 8     3   4   72  65   62   64   57        62,51,80,68,0 300,300,400,350,0      1.00 4.00  4.75  4.25  55.25  2 56.36  5.00   7936 103.96   80 AYALA      JONES PAUL 55.25  57.5  17.14  86.82  4  300   41 LA     217   122   339 Bumped; checked start/Pinballed 
                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                        break/No mishap 
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10/26/2018  330 LA   7 BABE CAN    4 4     3   2   80  85   86   86   81       86,82,89,85,82 330,350,330,300,300   -0.06 3.60  3.40  3.20  57.89  3 57.66  4.50   8100 113.83   89 RAMIREZ S  CASSELMAN  57.89   0.0  23.19  90.64  5  330   26 LA     265   148   413 Dueled; missed/Broke out; no 
                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                        bid/Broke in; bumped start 
            330        CM A        6 6     1   2   71  83   84   84   84       84,79,90,87,74 330,300,400,350,350    0.75 3.40  3.00  2.80  56.82  1 57.27  3.50   6656 114.54   90 ACEVES R   LOWE NICK  57.73  45.0  22.04  92.50  5  330   41 LA     241   149   390 Brushed brk; rallied/Bested 
                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                        rest/Lost footing break 
            330        FIRST BE    7 7     9   8   80  82   76   81  ERR       76,84,83,95,71 440,440,440,250,440   -1.50 4.20  5.20  5.60  57.74  0 58.83  1.80  25800 105.88   95 SANCHEZ R  JONES PAUL 59.91  57.5  19.91  85.97  5  440   68 RUI    506   137   643 No threat/Bump str/Weakened 
            330        AN ACT OF   2 2     3   6   78  81   75   80   82       75,82,84,84,82 300,330,300,300,300   -1.00 3.80  3.60  3.60  57.75  1 56.92 10.00   7877 105.95   84 ROMAN      GIVENS     56.17  42.4  20.71  85.24  5  300   26 LA     255   138   392 Bpd bth sides;steadied/Brk 
                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                        in;bp;shft in 1/16/Broke 
                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                        inward;bumped 
            330        FAITH AND   5 5     5   4   80  81   86   87   87       86,86,88,79,67 330,350,330,350,300    0.25 5.40  5.00  4.20  57.37  2 57.52  3.50   7645 113.57   88 AYALA      JONES PAUL 57.79  57.5  23.47  90.10  5  330   26 LA     252   147   399 Fractious; gamely/Off bit slow; 
                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                        rallied/Off slow;bothered brk 
            330        HOOKN UP N  3 3     4   3   80  77   86   77   86         86,78,67,0,0 330,300,300,0,0        0.00 5.00  4.33  3.33  57.20  1 56.52  6.00   8000 112.54   86 DE LA      GIVENS     57.79  42.4  20.90  91.64  3  330   26 LA     249   146   395 Finished well/No rally/Off slow; 
                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                        lost path 
            330        JML         1 1     1   6   80  69   67   71   67        67,71,74,62,0 330,300,300,300,300   -1.25 5.20  5.60  5.80  54.82  1 55.75 20.00   7794 103.84   74 GARCIA E   COOPER     56.03  50.0  19.19  84.65  4  330   26 LA     232   135   367 Broke in; lugged in/Bumped start; 
                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                        no rally/Weakened 
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10/26/2018  300 LA   8 UGE         4 4     3   2  116  85   89   85   79       89,80,85,84,85 300,300,300,330,300   -0.06 1.80  1.80  2.00  57.09  6 57.29  2.00   8662 123.80   89 AYALA      JONES PAUL 57.69  57.5  28.86  94.94  5  300   20 LA     287   152   439 Bumnpec/Lugged in; held/Bumped brk; 
                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                        clear 3rd 
            300        CHILDHOOD   7 7     2   4  118  84   84   84  ERR          84,84,0,0,0 330,330,0,0,0         -0.75 2.00  2.50  2.50  56.50  0 57.52  4.50   9913 120.39   84 BEDNAR     WILLOUGHBY 57.32  40.1  27.33  93.06  2  330   14 LA     304   148   452 Weakened late/Dueled; driving/ 
            300        SS HAPPY    6 6     3   3   40  83   83   82   80       83,83,80,70,98 350,300,350,350,300   -0.50 4.60  3.80  3.80  56.61  6 57.75 10.00  12925 104.92   98 ROMAN      VICKERY    57.65  30.8  14.07  90.85  5  350   19 LA     350   129   479 Bid; weakened/Threw head;off bit 
                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                        slw/Clean trip inside 
            300        FARMBOY     3 3     2   3  113  81   83   83   80       83,83,82,79,80 330,300,300,300,300    0.75 4.40  3.00  2.40  56.71  5 56.91  3.00   9165 120.87   83 DEALBA     JONES PAUL 57.32  57.5  27.76  93.11  5  330   42 LA     287   149   436 Drifted in early/Broke in; 2nd 
                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                        best/Came in;bpd bth sides 
            300        CAVA YEE    1 1     3   1   73  78   86   81   74       86,80,78,86,59 330,330,300,300,300    0.00 2.20  2.60  2.00  56.33  3 56.74  5.00   7531 116.30   86 DE LA      GONZALEZ   57.72  16.1  22.76  93.54  5  330   26 LA     257   143   400 Dueled; prevailed/Dug in 
                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                        late/Shifted out; best late 
            300        MOON ME     2 2     4   5  115  75   74   77   73        74,80,78,68,0 330,350,300,300,0     -2.00 4.25  3.75  3.75  55.88  2 56.61 10.00   7893 113.15   80 RAMIREZ S  CASSELMAN  56.56   0.0  24.04  89.11  4  330   26 LA     257   139   396 Weakened/Bumped both sides/Broke 
                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                        in; shifted out 
            300        BUDBREAK    5 5     1   6   89  75   81   77   83       81,77,73,59,84 300,300,350,330,350   -0.94 3.40  3.40  5.20  55.85  4 56.81  6.00   8010 113.74   84 GASCA      FLORES     56.75  25.0  23.57  90.17  5  300   41 LA     259   140   399 Brk out;bmpd;driftd in/Veered in; 
                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                        bumped brk/Bumped start; 1/16 
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