LAST TOTL
ASP AVG ASP THREE SECND PACE BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE CLASS SRR SUR 110 SPD R# TDS SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE P2F P4F PFN AVG MLINE CALL LAST ALL LAST TOTALS LAST RACE COMMENT
11/26/18 MNR 1 6.0 4 4 MOOVIN ON © S>SD>> 79 7910 79 3.0 2.4 1.25 94 93 74 77 3.00 54.7 261 330 320 650 Extended 3p; weakened;
6.0 11 GENERAL -5 S>S D> 74 7510 74 3.6 5.3 ©0.68 93 91 70 71 6.00 55.8 254 317 306 622 Through after half
6.0 2 2 HOLTZ -5 S>S D> 71 7110 71 4.6 3.5 1.33 87 85 86 75 2.50 55.3 258 308 322 629 Rallied; finished well
6.0 9 9 STORM WELL @ S>SD>D 68 69 106 69 3.5 6.0 0.59 97 96 69 70 12.00 55.0 262 298 314 612 Set pace; faltered;
6.0 10 10 SNIFFER 0 S>S D>D 67 67 10 67 6.0 4.7 1.29 79 81 82 68 30.00 54.6 242 289 297 587 Swung 6w; even finish
6.0 55 THIRTEEN 0 S>SD>D 64 66 106 64 6.5 4.8 1.36 63 54 91 66 12.00 56.9 208 290 267 557 Failed to respond
6.0 7 7 DETERMINED © S>S D>D 72 6510 69 3.9 5.9 0.66 86 84 54 67 6.00 53.4 224 294 275 569 Svd grnd; 3p turn
6.0 66 DO WHAT I @ S>S D>D 63 6510 64 6.3 5.5 1.16 81 81 78 68 20.00 57.1 240 289 299 588 Up gamely on rail
6.0 8 8 QUIETLY (4] S>S D>D 64 6510 65 4.3 4.7 0.93 99 70 73 10.00 54.7 169 296 287 583 Duel tol/4p;widen;ins
6.0 3 3 RICHIE 0 S>S D>D 65 6510 65 2.8 6.2 ©.45 96 95 67 63 5.00 56.6 258 291 313 603 Widened ins; faltered;
LAST TOTL
ASP AVG ASP THREE SECND PACE BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE CLASS SRR SUR 110 SPD R# TDS SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE P2F P4F PFN AVG MLINE CALL LAST ALL LAST TOTALS LAST RACE COMMENT
11/26/18 MNR 2 5.0 3 3  PRAYEROFPE © S>S D>b 61 57 10 56 4.5 6.4 ©.69 83 73 75 60 4.50 53.5 231 340 355 695 Evenly; hung mid tk
5.0 4 4 SHAKIN' -30 R>S T>D 58 55 6 58 5.4 7.5 0.71 84 81 40 50 3.00 49.4 205 336 320 655 Tracked; wore down
5.0 11 HOLY EKATI © R>S D>D 51 5410 51 5.5 4.9 1.12 78 76 66 60 4.00 48.9 220 324 356 681 Soft pace; outfinished
5.0 2 2 BRAD'S -5 R>S D>D 46 48 10 47 8.7 6.5 1.35 64 50 57 44 8.0 51.5 171 306 282 588 Trailed
5.0 6 6 I HEART 0 S>S D>D 40 47 10 47 7.1 5.8 1.22 66 51 71 34 30.00 53.9 188 300 267 567 Always outrun
5.0 55 ENDLESSOPP -13 S>S D>D 46 46 10 46 4.9 6.9 ©.71 91 81 57 47 5.0 53.1 229 307 331 638 Brisk duel; weakened;
5.0 10 10 SPEEDY 0 S>S D>D 47 44 10 46 6.3 6.4 ©.98 85 71 62 54 5.0 53.8 218 306 321 627 Dueled ins; wore down
5.0 8 8 GRAN 0 S>S D> 37 39 3 37 3.5 8.7 ©.41 91 72 62 39 10.00 50.2 225 280 314 594 Pressed pace; spent
5.0 9 9 HARP -28 S>S D>b 37 37 5 37 3.8 7.2 ©0.54 83 69 62 43 12.00 51.0 214 289 302 591 Up close tol/4p;weaken
5.0 77 LUV LUNA © S>S D> 17 17 1 17 5.0 10.0 0.50 84 66 7 4 30.00 47.2 157 211 152 363 Bumped; early speed
LAST TOTL
ASP AVG ASP THREE SECND PACE BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE CLASS SRR SUR 110 SPD R# TDS SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE P2F P4F PFN AVG MLINE CALL LAST ALL LAST TOTALS LAST RACE COMMENT
11/26/18 MNR 3 5.0 22 US -10 S>S D>D 76 6510 66 6.5 7.1 ©.92 86 84 52 55 4.0 51.7 222 316 296 612 Chase pace;5w;wknd
5.0 55 BRAIN 0 S>SS D>D 69 63 10 63 3.4 6.0 0.57 93 89 60 62 2.50 54.5 242 325 335 660 Hooked turn; wore out
5.0 77 GEMOF A © S>SD>D 65 63 8 63 4.3 5.2 0©.82 80 72 8@ 57 5.ee 55.0 232 315 327 642 Rallied gamely inside
5.0 8 8 NEEDLING -5 S>SD>D 61 60 10 61 4.0 5.4 0.76 75 56 51 10.00 51.7 131 293 230 523 Never a factor
5.0 10 10 JIM THE 0 S>S D>D 61 59 10 59 3.3 4.0 ©0.82 86 80 72 64 4.50 54.1 238 302 333 636 Pressed 6wi outgamed
5.0 11 JK'S 0 S>S D> 51 55 9 55 8.4 5.8 1.45 69 68 80 59 30.00 58.1 217 293 315 608 Inside; no menace
5.0 4 4 ROCKSHINE o S>S D>D 52 5410 54 4.7 5.1 ©.93 85 79 7@ 58 12.00 54.4 234 288 320 608 Bid ins; weakened;
5.0 6 6 BEDTIME -9 S>SD>D 55 53 7 53 2.4 6.0 0.39 80 65 54 15.00 50.8 145 293 265 558 4p turn; came out lane
5.6 99 STOMP MY 15 S>S D> 59 53 5 53 4.0 5.7 .71 83 74 78 51 10.00 53.7 235 286 328 614 Dug in 4p; had enough
5.0 3 3 COWBOY -5 S>S D> 52 5110 53 3.7 7.8 0.48 93 48 53 6.00 52.7 141 288 252 541 Dueled 2wd; faltered



LAST TOTL

ASP AVG ASP THREE SECND PACE BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG  HORSE CLASS SRR SUR 110 SPD R# TDS SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE P2F P4F PFN AVG MLINE CALL LAST ALL LAST TOTALS LAST RACE COMMENT
11/26/18 MNR 4 6.0 9 9 FRENCHANA -5 R>S D>D 59 5910 59 4.8 4.1 1.18 83 80 48 54 5.00 48.0 211 309 299 608 4w5/16; missed place
6.0 33 CALIFORNIA -5 S>S D>D 54 57 6 54 6.0 8.9 0.68 84 77 63 57 2.50 53.9 224 328 309 637 Could gain little
6.0 10 10 THE -5 S>SD>D 60 54 7 60 8.0 8.1 ©.98 78 78 70 55 12.80 55.6 226 309 321 631 3path turn; improved
6.0 8 8 CLASSY -5 R>S D>D 54 54 7 54 6.3 6.3 1.00 81 71 53 54 6.00 46.9 205 302 290 592 Hooked turn; empty;
6.0 7 7  SHINY -5 S>S D>D 54 54 9 54 5.9 6.5 0.91 84 69 56 56 6.00 52.9 209 300 274 575 No menace
6.0 66 REDNECK -9 S>S D>D 49 52 9 49 6.9 5.9 1.16 76 66 79 56 5.00 55.4 221 308 317 625 Broke out;2p;mvd up
6.0 11 OUR PAUL © S>S D>D 46 48 7 48 4.0 6.0 0.68 91 61 62 4.50 52.2 152 298 298 596 Duel w/winner;held2d
6.0 55 DA VINCI'S o S>S D>D 47 48 9 46 5.9 7.3 ©.81 75 68 78 46 15.00 52.4 221 283 296 579 Bid turn; even fin 7wi
6.0 4 4  THIRSTY 0 S>S D>D 42 46 10 42 7.0 6.9 1.02 76 66 69 47 30.00 55.4 211 284 295 580 Never involved
6.0 2 2 HOLLANDER © S>S D>D 47 41 10 47 7.0 7.8 ©.99 77 65 75 49 20.00 52.6 217 278 301 579 Chased; weakened2p
LAST TOTL
ASP AVG ASP THREE SECND PACE BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE CLASS SRR SUR 110 SPD R# TDS SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE P2F P4F PFN AVG MLINE CALL LAST ALL LAST TOTALS LAST RACE COMMENT
11/26/18 MNR 5 6.0 7 7 HARLAN'S © S>S D>D 78 78 106 78 6.4 3.3 1.96 87 90 84 75 6.00 55.4 261 309 330 639 Bid5w;abreast;edge up
6.0 9 9 DUKIN' -5 S>S DD 77 77 1@ 77 4.0 5.4 0.75 91 86 82 73 4.00 54.3 259 313 321 634 Blckd;ckdl/4fin well
6.0 2 2 MACHO BREW -5 R>S D>D 77 76 186 75 6.8 6.4 1.06 77 81 66 75 3.00 50.8 224 308 292 600 Wide early; no threat;
6.0 6 6 I STAND -5 S>S D>D 78 76 10 77 5.2 3.6 1.45 85 78 88 70 15.00 56.6 251 301 314 615 Had a steady gain
6.0 4 4 SEBA'S -5 S>SD>b 70 74 10 71 4.8 4.4 1.09 81 77 72 71 4.50 54.8 230 300 275 575 Bobbled st; no threat
6.0 55 BROTHERS -5 R>S D>D 73 7210 74 8.4 7.4 1.14 71 77 49 69 6.00 50.0 197 290 248 538 No factor;
6.0 8 8 SLICK MAN © R>S D>D 73 7110 71 3.3 4.9 0.68 80 86 62 71 20.00 51.3 228 291 287 578 Evenly; no bid
6.0 10 10 WONDER 0 S>S DD 71 70 10 75 3.8 5.5 ©.70 98 96 63 76 12.00 52.5 257 297 308 606 Pressed pace; tired;
6.0 33 MARTY WHO © S>SS Db>b 75 7010 75 3.1 4.6 ©0.67 99 96 67 78 10.00 53.9 262 298 316 614 Pressed ins; weakened;
6.6 11 A J'S MOJO @ S>SD>D 71 68 10 71 4.7 4.9 ©.97 83 83 79 73 10.00 57.1 245 292 308 600 Evenly; weakened ins
LAST TOTL
ASP AVG ASP THREE SECND PACE BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE CLASS SRR SUR 110 SPD R# TDS SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE P2F P4F PFN AVG MLINE CALL LAST ALL LAST TOTALS LAST RACE COMMENT
11/26/18 MNR 6 6.0 2 2  OUR ANTHEM 13 S>S D>D 55 53 9 56 5.2 6.8 0.77 84 72 64 53 5.00 53.7 220 362 354 716 Hard used; outfinished
6.0 4 4  ERDELYI 0 S>S D>D 52 52 8 52 3.8 4.7 0.82 87 74 67 51 3.50 53.7 228 355 360 715 Chased; lacked surge
6.0 8 8 CAMERONS 8 S>SD>D 44 49 6 49 6.4 7.6 0.84 83 64 61 27 20.00 50.3 208 344 296 640 Speed turn;faltered
6.0 7 7 MAJESTIC -15 S>S D>D 45 47 10 47 2.9 5.6 ©.52 89 82 65 52 3.0 54.8 236 342 379 721 Long duel;stubborn
6.0 10 10 GORDON'S 13 S>S D>D 49 47 10 48 7.8 5.5 1.41 77 62 72 53 10.00 53.3 211 328 345 673 Mild rally mid track
6.0 55 POWFUL 0 S>S D>D 49 43 4 43 8.9 7.1 1.24 69 62 74 49 5,00 55.2 205 322 332 654 Slow early; no factor;
6.0 11 MAXIMA -15 S>S D>D 45 42 9 43 5.7 8.1 .71 83 72 51 45 6.00 52.4 206 326 307 633 Evenly; wide; weakened
6.0 3 3 AMERICAN -17 R>S D>D 36 40 8 36 7.9 7.9 1.0 82 72 73 46 15.00 48.3 227 322 357 679 Chased turn; short 3p
6.0 66 LUCKY CORN © S>S D>D 34 34 5 34 7.0 8.5 ©.82 85 60 53 490 15.00 51.2 198 298 270 569 Gave way on the turn
6.0 9 9 QUICK ILR 0>S >D ERR ERR © ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR 12.00 ERR 0 ERR ERR ERR



LAST TOTL

ASP AVG ASP THREE SECND PACE BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE CLASS SRR SUR 110 SPD R# TDS SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE P2F P4F PFN AVG MLINE CALL LAST ALL LAST TOTALS LAST RACE COMMENT
11/26/18 MNR 7 6.0 1 1 UTANA %] R>S D>D 78 77 10 78 7.0 5.9 1.18 84 82 76 74 2.50 52.3 242 402 416 818 Led turn; drew off;
6.0 7 7  SPANISH -55 R>SD>D 78 7410 76 4.0 4.0 1.00 82 84 48 76 2.00 48.3 214 399 370 770 Stalked;weakened turn
6.0 4 4 TOMATO 20 S>S DD 72 7210 72 5.4 5.3 1.2 75 69 78 67 3.50 55.4 222 387 373 760 3-4w;lacked rally
6.0 8 8 FLOWERS 0 S>SD>D 67 67 6 68 4.8 7.0 ©0.68 96 88 71 65 8.00 53.5 255 380 401 781 Set pace; weakened;
6.0 3 3 SILVER 35 S>S D>D 54 6510 54 3.3 5.7 ©.59 87 84 53 50 15.00 52.1 224 361 339 700 Through after half
6.0 2 2 DANG IT (%] S>S D>D 64 63 10 66 3.9 5.1 0.77 86 83 67 6.00 56.9 169 369 381 750 Bid4w;loom;out fins
6.0 55 TIZ ALL (%] S>S T>D 53 60 10 52 3.3 5.1 0©.64 82 82 73 72 12.00 57.7 237 357 408 764 Stalk;ledl/8;out fins
6.0 6 6 TIME ROCK @ S>SD>D 49 5710 51 6.2 5.1 1.21 79 65 55 20.00 54.3 144 344 312 656 Outrun; showed little;
LAST TOTL
ASP AVG ASP THREE SECND PACE BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE CLASS SRR SUR 110 SPD R# TDS SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE P2F P4F PFN AVG MLINE CALL LAST ALL LAST TOTALS LAST RACE COMMENT
11/26/18 MNR 8 5.5 2 2  RAISE YOUR 15 S>S D>D 8 80 10 8 2.2 3.0 0.71 94 93 69 77 3.0 55.8 256 314 305 619 Dug in 3p; outfinished
5.5 55 TEN CENT 10 S>S DD 79 79 10 79 5.9 3.0 2.00 84 84 86 76 4.00 56.7 254 319 317 636 Evenly; 4 wide
5.5 3 3  SHESMYHEAR -10 S>S D> 77 76 16 77 2.3 5.3 ©.43 91 91 71 72 8.00 54.0 253 308 297 605 Faded 8path
5.5 10 10 AWESOME 10 S>S DD 75 7410 75 5.9 4.9 1.20 86 88 70 68 12.00 55.8 244 305 294 599 Failed to menace;
5.5 44 IVY O'DAY -20 R>SD>D 71 7010 70 2.7 3.7 ©.72 86 86 76 84 1.80 52.4 248 301 312 612 Long duel;clear3/16
5.5 7 7 QUICK 20 S>SD>D 69 69 10 69 5.2 4.3 1.21 95 95 73 78 20.00 56.7 263 294 318 612 Hard duel;stubborn
5.5 11 SHESA BAD 20 S>SD>D 69 68 106 69 2.4 4.6 ©.53 93 95 74 76 8.00 56.9 262 301 318 619 Duel3path;edged up
5.5 9 9 HOLY 20 S>S DD 72 6710 71 1.3 3.3 ©.39 88 65 72 20.00 53.8 153 288 249 537 Rushed;vied3w;held2d
5.5 6 6  KENTUCKY 15 S>S D>D 65 6510 64 3.8 5.6 ©.68 96 93 52 68 20.00 54.3 241 285 275 560 Duel tol/4p;weakened
5.5 8 8 KATE N ABS 20 S>S D>D 65 6510 65 4.0 4.5 ©0.89 96 90 76 74 30.00 54.8 262 286 314 600 Shook clear top lane
LAST TOTL
ASP AVG ASP THREE SECND PACE BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE CLASS SRR SUR 110 SPD R# TDS SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE P2F P4F PFN AVG MLINE CALL LAST ALL LAST TOTALS LAST RACE COMMENT
11/26/18 MNR 9 5.5 7 7 SAINT 0 S>S D>D 61 67 10 61 4.9 6.4 ©.77 87 87 67 66 2.50 54.9 241 324 316 640 Prompted; evenly late
5.5 2 2  JEANINES -5 S>SD>D 69 67 10 70 4.2 6.1 ©.69 90 87 71 69 8.00 54.2 248 315 323 638 Set pressured pace;
5.5 10 10 LEARNING © S>SD>D 69 67 10 67 6.1 4.7 1.30 79 80 76 66 3.50 55.7 235 318 322 640 Bid5-5wi;need more
5.5 4 4  SMART (%] S>S D>D 64 64 106 64 6.2 4.7 1.32 95 89 56 56 12.00 52.8 240 306 302 608 Led;duel btw;weakened
5.5 55 ROSIE'S 0 S>S D>D 61 5910 61 5.5 5.7 ©.98 91 84 75 63 5.00 55.9 250 298 330 628 Vied4w-1/8p;held 2d
5.5 6 6 ONE 0 S>S D>D 58 58 10 58 6.7 6.5 1.03 79 72 59 20.00 53.1 151 294 261 556 Step slow; 5wi lane
5.5 3 3  GREELEY 0 S>S D>D 57 57 10 57 4.1 6.5 ©0.62 85 59 61 10.00 52.5 144 289 251 540 Hard pursuit; short
5.5 8 8 SHOWMETHET © S>S D>D 55 5510 55 5.9 5.9 1.00 93 88 70 62 4.00 54.8 251 294 329 623 Hard ins duel;edged2d
5.5 11 CHARLIES © S>S D>D 52 5410 52 6.2 6.7 ©.93 87 80 60 60 20.00 54.7 227 286 287 573 Brief chase; tired;
5.5 9 9 INSPIRED © S>SD>D 48 5010 50 5.1 8.0 ©.63 91 71 68 42 20.00 50.4 230 275 278 553 Pressed pace; wilted



ERLY TOTL

ASP AVG ASP LAST FIVE PACE PACE
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG  HORSE SRR SUR NOTES FROM LAST RACE 110 RX SPD R# TDS RT S1 S2 SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDONE TDTWO TDCLO P2F P4F PFN SPEED RATINGS DSLR BRIS P CALL1 CALL2 MEDS EQUIP MLINE CLS TRK DIS CHNG SPPNT PWR COMB TOTL LAST COMMENTS
11/26/18 MNR 1 6.0 3 3  RICHIE S>S D>D Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 6510 6510 6510 92 72 2.8 6.2 0.5 2.8 6.2 0.5 96 95 67 72,62,56,37,69 49 E 7 22.2 45.5 1 0 5.00 120 MNR 6.0 C>C 18.4 107 96.8 191 258 Widened ins; faltered;/
2-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? Pressed turn; spent/
WATCH!BTL horse. Clear early.lst off 49 Through after half
day layoff. Class @ Finished 4 from post
2 TIW= 64
6.0 99 STORM WELL S>S D>D Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 68 9 6910 6910 9% 74 3.5 6.0 0.6 3.5 6.0 0.6 97 96 69 73,68,69,76,52 36 E/P 22. 46. 12.00 124 MNR 5.5 C>C 13.2 109 95.5 193 262 Set pace; faltered;/
1-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? Dueled 3w; led; tired/
WATCH! Clear early.lst off 36 day 2wd turn; no response
layoff. Class @ Finished 4 from post 1
TIW= 50
6.0 7 7 DETERMINED S>S D>D 1st off 51 day layoff. Class © Finished 72 2 6510 69 4 83 71 3.9 59 ©.7 3.7 4.7 0.8 8 84 54 58,69,74,63,71 51 E 24.0 48. 6.00 131 CT 7.0 C>C 15.8 109 93.4 170 224 Svd grnd; 3p turn/ Pace
5 from post 3 TIW= 71 inside;rail turns/ Pace
inside;rail turns
6.0 11 GENERAL S>S D>D Class -5 Finished 8 from post 5 TJw=32 74 6 7510 74 6 8 77 3.6 5.3 0.7 4.7 6.9 0.7 93 91 70 70,79,65,76,87 26 E 23. 47. 6.00 140 MVR 6.0 C>C 5.3 116 94.7 184 254 Through after half/ Set
pace; driving;/ Pressed
turn; tired;
6.0 8 8 QUIETLY S>S D>D Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 64 8 6510 6510 8 -5 4.3 4.7 ©.9 4.3 4.7 0.9 9 70 77,68,73,56,69 47 E/P 21. 46. 10.00 121 MNR 5.0 C>C 18.4 108 101.6 99 169 Duel tol/4p;widen;ins/
1-hole. Fast last race Inside; no rally/ Clear
(12) .Uncharacteristic early speed? turn; empty late
WATCH! Clear early.lst off 47 day
layoff. Class @ Finished 1 from post 1
TIW= 53
6.0 6 6 DO WHAT I S>S D>D Made big overall move (4). 1st off 40 63 6 6510 64 8 83 76 6.3 5.5 1.1 6.5 5.4 1.2 81 81 78 69,73,63,74,63 40 E/P 23. 46. 20.00 125 MNR 6.0 C>C 2.6 100 95.5 162 240 Up gamely on rail/ Slight
day layoff. Class @ Finished 1 from post ins bid;no fact/ Evenly;
5 TIW= 41 no threat;
6.0 4 4 MOOVIN ON S>S D>D Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 79 8 7910 7910 8 76 3.6 2.4 1.3 3.0 2.4 1.3 94 93 74 74,73,83,79,88 36 E/P 22.4 4e. 3.00 146 MNR 5.5 C>C 18.4 120 99.9 187 261 Extended 3p; weakened;/
6-hole. 1st off 36 day layoff. Class © Widen late;in hand;ins/
Finished 3 from post 6 TIW= 75 Set pace; held firm
6.0 10 10 SNIFFER S>S D>D Made big overall move (5). *Stretch gain 67 10 67 10 67 10 83 80 6.0 4.7 1.3 6.0 4.7 1.3 79 81 82 71,68,64,63,70 36 P 23. 47. 30.00 116 MNR 5.5 C>C 0.0 101 90.0 160 242 Swung 6w; even finish/
(1.75). 1st off 36 day layoff.2 races in Evenly; 5wi lane/ Fin
one pattern. Class @ Finished 5 from evenly mid track
post 3 TIW= 37
6.0 22 HOLTZ S>S D>D Made big overall move (3). Class -5 71 5 7110 71 6 83 88 4.6 3.5 1.3 4.5 4.0 1.1 87 85 86 77,76,72,70,62 12 P 23. 47. 2.50 123 MVR 5.5 C>C 7.9 112 98.8 172 258 Rallied; finished well/
Finished 3 from post 12 TIW= 64 Exchanged bumps/ Roused;
needed more
6.0 55 THIRTEEN S>S D>D *Stretch gain (4). 1st off 56 day 64 2 6610 64 2 74 8 6.5 4.8 1.4 9.4 4.7 2.6 63 54 91 57,71,71,63,55 56 S 26. 49, 12.00 127 MNR 6.0 C>C 0.0 97 93.9 117 208 Failed to respond/

layoff. Class © Finished 7 from post 1
TIW= 26

5-4plst;2p far;6p lane/
Ins;shiftd 4p 1/8;drvg
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NOTES FROM LAST RACE

Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
6-hole. 1st off 43 day layoff. Class ©
Finished 6 from post 6 TJW= 38

Flashed speed. Slow last race (19). 1st
off 33 day layoff. Class @ Finished 7
from post 6 TIW= 28

Chased Pace. 1st off 56 day layoff.
Class -28 Finished 7 from post 7 TIW= 56

*Stretch gain (.25). 1st off 43 day
layoff. Class © Finished 4 from post 4
TIW= 44

Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
2-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed?
WATCH! Clear early.lst off 36 day
layoff. Class -13 Finished 4 from post 2
TIW= 39

*Stretch gain (1.5). 1st off 112 day
layoff. Class -30 Finished 6 from post 8
TIW= 80

Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
2-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed?
WATCH! Clear early.lst off 33 day
layoff. Class @ Finished 4 from post 2
TIW= 61

Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
2-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed?
WATCH! Clear early.lst off 35 day
layoff. Class @ Finished 2 from post 2
TIW= 47

Slow last race (13). 1st off 69 day
layoff. Class @ Finished 6 from post 3
TIW= 37

1st off 48 day layoff. Class -5 Finished
6 from post 1 TIW= 83
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LAST FIVE

SPEED RATINGS

45,43,28,0,0

-2,17,-3,0,0

42,48,38,15,48

57,64,59,65,55

49,58,35,39,45

49,50,52,63,60

47,55,60,46,37

61,67,53,61,42

34,28,41,48,43

43,44,46,31,48

LAST FIVE
SPEED RATINGS

33

56

43

36

112

33

35

69

48

DSLR

BRIS P CALL1 CALL2 MEDS EQUIP MLINE

NA

22.6

24.0

23.0

23.6

22.7

46.9

23.5

48.7

25.8

52.2

BOFF

EQUIP

30.

.00

.00

.50

.00

.00

.00

.00

00

.00

100

129

119

117

136

120

108

105

115

TRK

MNR

MNR

MNR

MNR

MNR

MNR

MNR

MNR

TDN

DIS

ERLY
PACE
CHNG SPPNT PWR COMB TOTL

TOTL

PACE

LAST

157

214

231

229

205

218

220

188

171

COMMENTS

Pressed pace; spent/ Dule
isn;empty lane/ Early
bid;retreated

Bumped; early speed/
Chase tol/4;gave way/
Outrun; never involved
Up close tol/4p;weaken/
Early speed; tired;/
Tracked;ask;no bid
Evenly; hung mid tk/
Ceded to ins pressure/
Rallied gamely 3p

Brisk duel; weakened;/
Set pace; bit short 2p/
Gave way on the turn

Tracked; wore down/ Drift
in start; 4wd/ Outrun

Dueled ins; wore down/
Chased;5wi-1/8;held2d/
Pushed out1/4p;willing

Soft pace; outfinished/
Set pace; saved 2nd/
Through early; faded

Always outrun/ Outrun;
wide trip/ Gave way on
the turn

Trailed/ Trailed moved
up/ Never a factor

COMMENTS

11/26/18 MNR 3

DT PP PRG  HORSE
5.0 8 8 GRAN

5.0 77 LUV LUNA
5.0 99 HARP

5.0 3 3  PRAYEROFPE
5.0 55 ENDLESSOPP
5.0 4 4 SHAKIN'
5.0 10 10 SPEEDY
5.0 11 HOLY EKATI
5.0 6 6 I HEART
5.0 22 BRAD'S

DT PP PRG  HORSE
5.0 6 6 BEDTIME
5.0 3 3 COwBOY

5.0 55 BRAIN

5.6 99 STOMP MY
5.0 8 8 NEEDLING
5.0 10 10 JIM THE
5.0 77 GEMOF A
506 22 US

5.0 4 4 ROCKSHINE
50 11 3JK'S

S$>S

S>S

S>S

S$>S

S$>S

S>S

S>S

S>S

S>S

D>l

o

D>l

o

D>D

D>D

D>D

D>l

o

D>D

D>D

1st off 303 day layoff. Class -9
Finished 6 from post 1 TiW= 71

Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
8-hole. 1st off 61 day layoff. Class -5
Finished 9 from post 8 TIW= 21

Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
2-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed?
WATCH! 1st off 50 day layoff. Class @
Finished 5 from post 2 TIW= 75

Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
5-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed?
WATCH! Clear early.lst off 42 day
layoff. Class 15 Finished 1 from post 5
TIW= 41

Slow last race (19). 1st off 257 day
layoff. Class -5 Finished 8 from post 6
TIW= 64

Chased Pace. 1st off 41 day layoff.
Class @ Finished 2 from post 6 TIW= 45

Made big overall move (6). *Stretch gain
(2.25).BTL horse. 1st off 41 day layoff.
Class @ Finished 3 from post 8 TIW= 79
Slow last race (15). 1st off 53 day
layoff. Class -10 Finished 7 from post 6
TIW= 23

Chased Pace.BTL horse. 1st off 41 day
layoff. Class @ Finished 6 from post 5
TIW= 17

1st off 50 day layoff. Class @ Finished
6 from post 3 TIW= 33

52

69

59

61

61

65

52

51

51

63

53

60

59

63

65

54

55

10

10

10

10

10

10

53

63

53

61

59

63

66

54

55

10

10

91

89

78

74

84

79

86

83

79

68

77

76

81

76

78

3.7

3.4

4.0

3.3

4.3

6.5

4.7

8.4

7.8

6.0

5.7

5.4

4.0

5.2

7.1

5.1

5.8

0.6

0.8

0.9

1.4

6.3

4.7

8.3

5.3

5.1

5.8

0.5

0.8

0.9

0.9

1.4

93

93

83

75

86

80

86

85

69

89

74

80

72

84

79

68

48

60

78

56

72

80

52

70

80

51,50,61,61,68

51,57,50,38,55

61,63,63,61,57

61,44,48,57,54

41,48,63,66,67

61,60,71,61,63

61,56,54,43,68

50,53,62,76,81

58,56,61,52,52

60,63,55,62,58

61

50

42

257

a1

41

53

41

50

22.5

22.4

23.3

24.9

22.6

23.7

22.7

22.8

24.4

48.9 1
526 1
8.9 1
8.3 1
47.6 1
73.7 1
8.1 1
75.7 1
50.3 1
77.9 1

CALL2 MEDS
8.4 1
47.5 1
6.7 1
47.9 1
50.4 1
47.0 1
47.7 1
8.3 1
7.1 1
47.2 1

10.

10.

12.

30.

.00

.50

00

00

.50

.00

.00

00

00

121

144

110

115

112

129

131

110

117

MNR

MNR

MVR

MNR

MNR

GPW

MNR

MNR

5.0

6.0

5.5

5.0

5.5

5.5

6.0

5.5

6.0

M>M 18.8 83 85.0 163
M>M 12.5 64 68.7 150
S>M 9.4 86 85.3 152
M>M 12.5 97 93.4 156
M>M 18.8 89 89.7 172
SS>M 3.1 89 90.0 165
M>M 15.6 91 90.1 156
M>M 0.0 98 90.8 154
M>M 9.4 78 81.7 117
M>M 0.0 85 84.0 114

ERLY

PACE
CHNG SPPNT PWR COMB TOTL
oC 8.6 89 92.7 80
oC 17.1 93 82.8 93
oC 22.9 102 96.4 182
M>C 17.1 92 93.3 157
oC 5.7 91 83.9 75
oC 14.3 9 96.8 166
oC 0.0 100 93.9 152
oC 2.9 100 88.1 170
(e 8.6 91 91.2 164
oC 2.9 93 91.e 137

242

235

131

238

23

N

222

234

217

4p turn; came out lane/
Step slow; 8p turn/ Pace
inside;held on

Dueled 2wd; faltered/
2wd; shaken off; tired/
Well placed; tired;
Hooked turn; wore out/
Leg weary late held on/
Clear early; much best

Dug in 4p; had enough/
Failed to menace/ Pressed
btw; shftd3wl/2

Never a factor/ Off slow
no threat;/ Inside trip;
no gain

Pressed 6wi outgamed/
Hustled; weakened rail/
Worked pace; held 2nd
Rallied gamely inside/
Angled 7p far turn/
Outside; no threat

Chase pace;5w;wknd/ Chase
pace;retreated/ Rated;ask
tn;no kick

Bid ins; weakened;/ Saved
ground; no rally/ Dueled;
drew off 2p

Inside; no menace/
Improved along rail/ Slow
early; no factor



ERLY TOTL

ASP AVG ASP LAST FIVE PACE PACE
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG  HORSE SRR SUR NOTES FROM LAST RACE 110 RX SPD R# TDS RT S1 S2 SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDONE TDTWO TDCLO P2F P4F PFN SPEED RATINGS DSLR BRIS P CALL1 CALL2 MEDS EQUIP MLINE CLS TRK DIS CHNG SPPNT PWR COMB TOTL LAST COMMENTS
11/26/18 MNR 4 6.0 11 OUR PAUL S>S D>D Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 46 6 48 7 48 7 82 1 4.6 6.0 0.7 4.0 6.0 0.7 91 61 62,60,64,55,37 36 E 6 22.9 48.2 1 0  4.50 112 MNR 5.0 M>M 30.0 94 94.3 91 152 Duel w/winner;held2d/
2-hole. Fast last race Pressed pace; short/ 2
(14) .Uncharacteristic early speed? wide; faltered
WATCH! 1st off 36 day layoff. Class @
Finished 2 from post 2 TIW= 38
6.0 3 3 CALIFORNIA S>S D>D 1st off 44 day layoff. Class -5 Finished 54 3 57 6 54 3 83 73 6.0 8.9 0.7 6.9 8.6 0.8 8 77 63 53,51,66,60,66 44 NA 1 23.7 48.2 1 © 2.50 143 DEL 6.0 M>M 5.0 101 89.3 161 224 Could gain little/
6 from post 5 TIW= 71 Dueled; weakened/ Off
rail;no rally
6.0 55 DA VINCI'S S>S D>D Chased Pace. Made a big move early (3). 47 4 48 9 46 5 77 75 5.9 7.3 0.8 6.6 7.9 0.8 75 68 78 55,39,45,58,43 42 E 1 23.5 48.7 1 © 15.00 103 MNR 5.5 M>M 5.0 85 75.5 143 221 Bid turn; even fin 7wi/
*Stretch gain (1). 1st off 42 day Chase tol/2gave way/ Hard
layoff.2 races in one pattern. Class @ pursuit; gave way
Finished 3 from post 8 TIW= 28
6.0 2 2 HOLLANDER S>S D>D 1st off 42 day layoff. Class © Finished 47 5 4110 47 5 75 74 7.0 7.8 0.9 5.8 5.8 1.0 77 65 75 51,61,34,47,44 42 E/P 3 23.8 48.9 1 © 20.00 116 MNR 5.5 M>M 15.0 83 87.9 142 217 Chased; weakened2p/
4 from post 2 TIW= 45 Finished evenly rail/
Never involved
6.0 7 7  SHINY S>S D>D Slow last race (13). Class -5 Finished 54 9 54 9 54 9 77 70 59 6.5 ©.9 5.9 6.5 0.9 8 69 56 41,58,69,60,59 20 E/P 4 25.6 50.6 1 @ 6.00 108 MVR 6.0 M>M 20.0 91 85.0 153 209 No menace/ Hard used;
9 from post 9 TIW= 65 gave all/ Lacked a rally
6.0 10 10 THE S>S D>D Made big overall move (3). Made a big 60 1 54 7 60 1 84 80 8.0 8.1 1.0 8.8 5.0 1.8 78 78 70 60,43,61,48,55 93 S 0 23.6 47.3 1 0 12.00 121 ELP 6.0 M>M 0.0 89 87.5 156 226 3path turn; improved/ In
move early (3). 1st off 93 day layoff. tight;checked early/
Class -5 Finished 4 from post 4 TIW= 31 Never a threat
6.0 8 8 CLASSY R>S D>D Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 54 2 54 7 54 2 74 70 6.3 6.3 1.0 6.3 6.3 1.0 81 71 53 49,64,48,60,49 40 E/P 1 49.8 77.9 1 0 6.00 114 MNR 8.0 M>M 5.0 93 86.7 152 205 Hooked turn; empty;/
6-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? Pressed; second best;/
WATCH! 1st off 40 day layoff. Class -5 Hustled; even fin 5p
Finished 6 from post 6 TIW= 66
6.0 4 4  THIRSTY S>S D>D 1st off 55 day layoff. Class © Finished 42 5 4610 42 5 8 74 7.0 6.9 1.6 6.6 6.6 1.0 76 66 69 49,46,46,22,48 55 P 1 24.5 48.3 2] © 30.00 105 MNR 6.0 M>M 5.0 79 89.2 142 211 Never involved/ Played no
7 from post 8 TIW= 26 factor/ Angled 7w; no
menace
6.0 6 6  REDNECK S>S D>D Made big overall move (3). *Stretch gain 49 6 52 9 49 6 77 8 6.9 5.9 1.2 7.5 6.9 1.1 76 66 79 55,55,58,60,41 19 S 0 24.4 48.3 1 © 5.00 122 IND 5.5 M>M 0.0 88 94.1 142 221 Broke out;2p;mvd up/ Bid
(2). Class -9 Finished 3 from post 5 3wd;far;aim;hung/ Gained
TIW= 45 show late
6.0 99 FRENCHANA R>S D>D Flashed speed.Uncharacteristic early 59 5 5910 59 5 72 56 4.8 4.1 1.2 5.5 3.7 1.5 83 80 48 52,52,59,58,60 23 E/P 3 49.5 77.0 1 [} 5.00 106 FL 8.1 M>M 15.0 94 87.4 163 211 4w5/16; missed place/

speed? WATCH!
post 5 TIW= 52

Class -5 Finished 3 from Widest;up for share/ Rail

trn; wknd ins

1st off 43 day layoff. Class @ Finished
1 from post 5 TIW= 44

ERLY TOTL
ASP AVG ASP LAST FIVE PACE PACE
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG  HORSE SRR SUR NOTES FROM LAST RACE 110 RX SPD R# TDS RT S1 S2 SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDONE TDTWO TDCLO P2F P4F PFN SPEED RATINGS DSLR BRIS P CALL1 CALL2 MEDS EQUIP MLINE CLS TRK DIS CHNG SPPNT PWR COMB TOTL LAST COMMENTS
11/26/18 MNR 5 6.0 8 8 SLICK MAN R>S D>D 1st off 43 day layoff. Class © Finished 73 5 7110 71 8 82 71 3.3 4.9 0.7 3.1 5.0 0.6 80 86 62 66,72,74,75,69 43 E/P © 48.4 74.1 1 0 20.00 117 MNR 8.0 C>C 0.0 109 91.7 166 228 Evenly; no bid/ Dueled
4 from post 3 TIW= 48 ins; short late/
Bid5-6wi;missed 3rd
6.0 3 3 MARTY WHO S>S D>D Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 75 6 70610 75 7 9 71 3.1 4.6 0.7 3.0 3.3 0.9 99 9% 67 72,85,76,68,72 40 E 8 22.2 46.7 1 0 10.00 117 MNR 6.0 C>C 32.0 115 97.8 195 262 Pressed ins; weakened;/
2-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? Pressed; shook clear/
WATCH! 1st off 40 day layoff. Class @ Chased; saved place
Finished 4 from post 2 TIW= 79
6.0 10 10 WONDER S>S D>D Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 71 6 7010 75 8 9 69 3.8 5.5 0.7 2.7 4.4 0.6 98 96 63 69,74,86,64,60 40 E/P 7 22.2 47.4 1 0 12.00 120 MNR 6.0 C>C 28.0 114 96.3 194 257 Pressed pace; tired;/
7-hole. 1st off 40 day layoff. Class @ Rail pace; grudgingly/
Finished 6 from post 7 TIW= 55 Well handled;ins;drvng
6.0 99 DUKIN' S>S D>D Flashed speed. Class -5 Finished 3 from 77 9 77 10 77 10 85 81 4.0 5.4 0.7 4.0 5.4 0.7 91 86 82 76,72,71,70,70 12 E 5 23.0 47.3 1 @ 4.00 133 FL 5.5 C>C 20.0 111 98.6 177 259 Blckd;ckdl/4fin well/
post 4 TIW= 79 Pace; weakened/ No match
for top two
6.0 11 A J'SMOJO S>S D>D *Stretch gain (1.25).BTL horse. 1st off 71 4 68 10 71 4 87 79 4.7 4.9 1.0 6.3 5.6 1.3 83 83 79 72,74,74,56,50 41 S 1 23.5 46.6 1 0 10.00 118 MNR 6.0 C>C 4.0 106 97.1 166 245 Evenly; weakened ins/
41 day layoff. Class @ Finished 6 from Stalked; weakened lane/
post 2 TIW= 37 Rail run; driving;
6.0 2 2 MACHO BREW R>S D>D Class -5 Finished 5 from post 8 TJw=82 77 4 7610 75 5 83 77 6.8 6.4 1.1 7.3 5.4 1.4 77 81 66 69,79,78,77,69 13 S 0 48.3 74.3 1 @ 3.00 126 MVR 8.0 C>C 0.0 121 94.1 158 224 Wide early; no threat;/
7-p str; much the best/
8-p str; drew clear
6.0 44 SEBA'S S>S D>D Slow last race (13). Class -5 Finished 70 3 7410 71 4 81 78 4.8 4.4 1.1 5.7 5.4 1.1 81 77 72 61,80,73,78,86 22 E 3 23.6 47.7 1 @ 4.50 123 (D 6.0 O>C 12.0 107 86.7 158 230 Bobbled st; no threat/
9 from post 11 TIW= 34 Stalked; weakened 5wi/
4path turn; weakened
6.0 55 BROTHERS R>S D>D Slow last race (20). Class -5 Finished 73 7 7210 74 8 77 69 8.4 7.4 1.1 8.1 7.0 1.2 71 77 49 52,76,79,68,75 13 S 9 49.4 75.8 1 @ 6.00 123 MVR 8.0 C>C 0.0 107 85.9 148 197 No factor;/ Slow early;
9 from post 1 TIW= 54 no menace/ Mild rally
late 4 wide
6.0 6 6 I STAND S>S D>D Made big overall move (3). *Stretch gain 78 8 7610 77 9 83 8 5.2 3.6 1.4 4.7 3.1 1.5 85 78 88 74,66,69,83,80 57 P 0 24.1 47.4 1 @ 15.00 117 BTP 6.0 C>C 0.0 108 97.0 163 251 Had a steady gain/ Played
(.25).BTL horse. 1st off 57 day layoff. no factor/
Class -5 Finished 4 from post 11 TIW= 68 Swung5w; btw-1/8;even
S>S D>D Chased Pace. Made big overall move (4). 78 10 78 16 78 10 87 82 6.4 3.3 1.9 3.3 1.9 87 90 84 80,64,81,84,76 43 22.5 46.4 .00 116 MNR cC 4.0 110 100.8 177 261 Bidsw;abreast;edge up/

Outrun early; tired;/
Ceded to wide pressure



DATE  TRK #

11/26/18 MNR 6

DATE  TRK #

11/26/18 MNR 7

10

10

MAJESTIC

MAXIMA

OUR ANTHEM

ERDELYI

LUCKY CORN

CAMERONS

AMERICAN

POWFUL

GORDON'S

SILVER

TIZ ALL

FLOWERS

DANG IT

SPANISH

TOMATO

UTANA

TIME ROCK

S>S

S>S

S>S

S>S

S>S

R>S

S>S

S>S

S>S

S$>S

S$>S

R>S

S$>S

R>S

S>S

>D

D>D

D>D

D>D

D>D

D>D

D>D

D>D

D>l

o

D>D

D

D>D

D>l

o

D>D

D>D

D>D

NOTES FROM LAST RACE

1st off 737024 day layoff. FTS. Class
ILR Finished @ from post @ TIW= 36
Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
2-hole. Fast last race

(12) .Uncharacteristic early speed?
WATCH! Clear early.lst off 43 day
layoff. Class -15 Finished 2 from post 2
TIW= 25

1st off 43 day layoff. Class -15
Finished 7 from post 7 TIW= 51

Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
7-hole. Clear early.lst off 33 day
layoff. Class 13 Finished 2 from post 7
TIW= 34

Flashed speed. *Stretch gain (.75). 1st
off 36 day layoff. Class © Finished 3
from post 4 TIW= 47

1st off 36 day layoff. Class @ Finished
7 from post 1 TIW= 22

Slow last race (12). Class 8 Finished
11 from post 12 TIW= 25

Fast last race (17). 1st off 40 day
layoff. Class -17 Finished 4 from post 2
TIW= 42

*Stretch gain (3). 1st off 36 day
layoff. Class @ Finished 5 from post 7
TIW= 45

Made big overall move (4). *Stretch gain
(1.5). 1st off 33 day layoff. Class 13
Finished 3 from post 1 TIW= 19

NOTES FROM LAST RACE

Slow last race (14).
9 from post 8 TIW= 56

Class 35 Finished

Chased Pace. Fast last race (11). 1st
off 84 day layoff. Class © Finished 2
from post 4 TIW= 30

Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
4-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed?
WATCH!BTL horse. 1st off 42 day layoff.
Class @ Finished 6 from post 4 TIw= 37
Made big overall move (3). Fast last
race (15). 1st off 75 day layoff. Class
0 Finished 2 from post 4 TIW= 61
Flashed speed.Uncharacteristic race? 1st
off 44 day layoff. Class -55 Finished 7
from post 2 TIW= 90

Class 20 Finished 7 from post 5 TIW= 74

Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
2-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed?
WATCH! Clear early.lst off 54 day
layoff. Class @ Finished 1 from post 2
TIW= 61

1st off 75 day layoff. Class @ Finished
6 from post 6 TIW= 39

ERR

45

45

55

34

36

49

49

53

67

78

72

78

49

R#

10

10

10

3 7410

10

10

ASP
DS

43

56

52

34

49

36

43

48

52

68

66

76

72

78

51

RT S1 S2 SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDONE TDTWO TDCLO P2F P4F PFN

10

80

80

79

76

81

71

70

75

84

85

82

75

78

83

77

70

74

63

67

80

79

74

91

71

66

85

81

3.3

4.8

3.9

4.0

5.4

7.0

6.2

SYS2

5.1

7.0

5.1

4.0

5.3

5.9

5.1

0.8

0.8

0.8

1.3

CLOSE TDONE

1.2

5.0

4.8

3.9

4.0

5.4

7.2

6.9

1.0

0.8

0.8

0.8

89

83

84

87

85

83

82

69

77

TDTWO TDCLO P2F

5.3

4.8

6.1

0.8

0.9

1.5

82

96

86

82

75

84

79

82

72

72

74

60

64

72

62

62

82

88

84

69

82

65

51

6

it

67

53

61

73

74

72

73

71

83

48

78

76

65

LAST FIVE

SPEED RATINGS DSLR
0,0,0,0,0 ok
59,52,44,35,28 43
39,57,38,46,37 43
50,61,49,46,14 33
51,47,55,68,51 36
26,41,54,26,21 36
37,24,19,50,88 19
57,50,32,51,39 a0
46,45,56,25,0 36
49,57,54,47,45 33

LAST FIVE

SPEED RATINGS DSLR
51,43,57,53,82 17
71,71,75,65,58 84
67,63,65,65,71 4
78,52,72,69,75 75
64,83,80,77,74 a4
62,69,71,73,73 12
75,79,67,88,76 54
55,55, 56,66,41 75

BRIS P CALL1
NA 0.0
E 22.9
S 24.0
E/P 23.4
E/P 23.6
E 24.2
S 24.3
P 49.8
NA 25.3
S 24.4
BRIS P CALL1
E 22.7
E/P 24.6
E 22.2
E/P 23.3
E/P 48.9
E/P 24.9
S 47.8
P 24.3

CALL2 MEDS EQUIP MLINE

49.2

48.0

48.2

50.0

50.5

77.1

49.2

49.2

CALL2

47.4

46.9

46.5

76.3

48.7

48.6

MEDS

EQUIP

15.00

20.00
15.00

10.00

6.00

2.00

20.00

125

121

119

122

139

133

111

1e1

162

139

171

152

156

TRK DIS

MNR

MNR

6.0

MNR 6.0

MNR 5.5

MNR 5.5
MVR 5.5
MNR 8.0
MNR 5.5

MNR 6.0

MNR 7.0

MNR 5.5

MNR 5.0

T 9.0

MNR 8.0

MNR 5.0

ERLY

PACE
CHNG SPPNT PWR COMB TOTL
>M 0.0 ERR ]
S>M 35.0 92 88.2 171
SS>M 0.0 85 81.4 155
M>M 10.0 9% 91.5 156
M>M 25.0 92 91.3 161
M>M 15.0 78 80.8 145
M>M 5.0 83 76.3 147
S>M 5.0 8 78.1 154
M>M 5.0 85 88.4 131
M>M 0.0 81 89.9 139

ERLY

PACE
CHNG SPPNT PWR COMB TOTL

OA 12.5 1e6 83.5 171
ASA 12.5 103 100.7 164
AO>A  20.8 109 93.3 184
A>A 12.5 108 100.6 86
N>A 20.8 120 92.9 166
OA 16.7 110 94.3 144
ASA 0.0 117 98.7 166
ASA 4.2 9% 92.7 79

TOTL
PACE
LAST

206

220

228

19

=3

208

227

205

21

[

237

25

vy

169

214

222

242

144

COMMENTS

Long duel;stubborn/ No
match; saved 2nd/
Weakened turn; faded

Evenly; wide; weakened/
Bumped hard break/
Evenly; lacked surge
Hard used; outfinished/
4wd bid; gave way/ 3wd;
loomed gave way

Chased; lacked surge/
Duel tol/4p;btw;tired/
Bid-upper;level off
Gave way on the turn/
Evenly; inside; tired;/
Hard pursuit;need more
Speed turn;faltered/
Never factored/ Never a
factor

Chased turn; short 3p/
Evenly; lacked more/ No
factor

Slow early; no factor;/
Bumped early; 3wd turn/
Improved; no menace
Mild rally mid track/
Hesitated off late/
Rallied past others5wi

COMMENTS

Through after half/ Brief
speed; folded up/ 4path
turn; faded late
Stalk;led1/8;out fins/
Bid3/16;drew clear;drv/
Hard used; outbid ins

Set pace; weakened;/
Never a threat/
Stalk3w-turn;tired

Bid4w; loom;out fins/
Dropped back early/
Press;btw;miss;game
Stalked;weakened turn/
Dueled btw; out gamed/
Widen;won in hand3path
3-4w;lacked rally/ Forced
pace;gamely/ Steadied
deep stretch

Led turn; drew off;/ Bid
willingly inside/
Sluggish bore out turn

Outrun; showed little;/
Swung5w;out gamed-2d/
Split late; up2nd



ERLY TOTL

ASP AVG ASP LAST FIVE PACE PACE
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG  HORSE SRR SUR NOTES FROM LAST RACE 110 RX SPD R# TDS RT S1 S2 SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDONE TDTWO TDCLO P2F P4F PFN SPEED RATINGS DSLR BRIS P CALL1 CALL2 MEDS EQUIP MLINE CLS TRK DIS CHNG SPPNT PWR COMB TOTL LAST COMMENTS
11/26/18 MNR 8 5.5 9 9 HOLY S>S D>D Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 72 3 6710 71 8 8 -1 1.3 3.3 0.4 0.8 2.1 0.4 88 65 62,79,76,44,64 48 E/P 7 22.9 47.4 1 0 20.00 118 MNR 5.0 O>R 13.2 108 97.3 88 153 Rushed;vied3w;held2d/
8-hole. 1st off 48 day layoff. Class 20 Repulsed bid;riddn out/
Finished 2 from post 8 TIW= 36 Led3path;duel;held on
5.5 3 3  SHESMYHEAR S>S D>D 1st off 31 day layoff. Class -10 77 8 7616 77 8 92 75 2.3 5.3 0.4 2.8 4.8 0.6 91 91 71 71,69,77,75,77 31 E 5 23.3 47.8 1 0 8.00 136 MVR 5.5 R>R 9.4 116 91.5 182 253 Faded 8path/ Chased;
Finished 8 from post 9 TIW= 40 short on rail/ Ins
duel;chase;tired
5.5 11 SHESA BAD S>S D>D Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 69 8 6810 69 8 93 76 2.4 4.6 0.5 3.0 4.1 0.7 93 95 74 77,82,69,61,59 41 E/P 7 22.3 45.5 1 © 8.00 138 MNR 6.0 C>R 13.2 116 100.2 188 262 Duel3path;edged up/
7-hole. Clear early.lst off 41 day Pressed clear; driving/
layoff. Class 20 Finished 1 from post 7 Duel w/winner;held3d
TIW= 58
5.5 6 6 KENTUCKY S>S D>D Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 65 3 6510 64 4 92 66 3.8 5.6 0.7 4.3 53 0.8 9% 93 52 57,78,68,71,58 41 E/P 7 22.2 46.5 1 @ 20.00 119 MNR 6.0 C>R 13.2 110 94.1 189 241 Duel tol/4p;weakened/
1-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? Widen;driftd wide late/
WATCH! 1st off 41 day layoff. Class 15 Dug in 4p; held gamely
Finished 7 from post 1 TIW= 66
5.5 4 4 IVY O'DAY R>S D>D Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 71 7 7010 70 8 8 81 2.7 3.7 ©.7 3.4 4.4 0.8 8 86 76 78,80,95,78,67 47 E/P 7 47.5 72.7 1 0 1.80 131 MNR 8.0 AO>R  13.2 122 98.5 172 248 Long duel;clear3/16/
2-hole. Clear early.lst off 47 day Abreast; turned away/ Ins
layoff. Class -20 Finished 1 from post 2 duel;ridden out
TIW= 62
5.5 2 2 RAISE YOUR S>S D>D Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 8 8 8010 8 9 9 77 2.2 3.0 0.7 2.0 3.3 0.6 9 93 69 72,73,85,83,75 9 E 6 23.3 47.0 1 0 3.00 126 MVR 6.0 C>R 11.3 124 96.9 187 256 Dug in 3p; outfinished/
1-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? Second flight;weakened/
WATCH! Clear early. Class 15 Finished 3 Clearedl/4;3path;drvng
from post 1 TIW= 64
5.5 8 8 KATE N ABS S>S D>D Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 65 9 6510 65 9 8 78 4.0 4.5 0.9 4.3 4.0 1.1 9% 90 76 75,77,71,64,73 34 E/P 5 22.5 46.6 ] 0 30.00 117 MNR 6.0 C>R 9.4 110 99.6 186 262 Shook clear top lane/
2-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? Rallied 3-4p; saved 2d/
WATCH! Clear early.lst off 34 day Tracked;bid4w;willing
layoff. Class 20 Finished 1 from post 2
TIW= 32
5.5 10 10 AWESOME S>S D>D Class 10 Finished 5 from post 4 TJWw= 40 75 9 7410 75 9 88 76 5.9 4.9 1.2 5.5 4.5 1.2 8 88 70 69,67,69,82,79 30 E/P 2 23.6 47.3 1 0 12.00 134 MVR 6.0 C>R 3.8 113 95.3 174 244 Failed to menace;/ Off
late;belated bid/ Angled
in1/8;2best
5.5 7 7 QUICK S>S D>D Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 69 9 6910 69 9 93 76 5.2 4.3 1.2 5.1 4.1 1.2 95 95 73 76,80,79,59,63 41 E/P 5 22.2 45.5 1 0 20.00 118 MNR 6.0 C>R 9.4 111 101.5 190 263 Hard duel;stubborn/ Bid
2-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? 3deep; edged up/ In close
WATCH!BTL horse. Clear early.lst off 41 7/16; driving

day layoff. Class 20 Finished 2 from

post 2 TIW= 26

Made big overall move (3). Class 10 79106 7916 7910 8 8 5.9 3.0 2.0 59 3.0 2.0 84 84 86 79,74,74,74,88 14 S 2 24.2 47.5 1 0 4.00 143 MVR 6.0 C>R 3.8 118 99.7 168 254 Evenly; 4 wide/ Missed

Finished 4 from post 4 TIW= 60 break; swept up/ Evenly;
outbid rest

5.5 55 TEN CENT S>S D>l

o



DATE  TRK #

11/26/18 MNR 9

DT PP PRG

GREELEY

INSPIRED

JEANINES

SAINT

CHARLIES

ROSIE'S

SHOWMETHET

ONE

LEARNING

SMART

S$>S

S>S

S>S

S>S

S>S

S>S

S>S

S>S

S>S

D>D

D>l

o

D>D

D>l

o

D>D

D>D

D>l

o

D>D

D>D

NOTES FROM LAST RACE

1st off 63 day layoff. Class @ Finished
7 from post 8 TIW= 23

Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
3-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed?
WATCH! 1st off 49 day layoff. Class ©
Finished 8 from post 3 TIW= 8

Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
3-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed?
WATCH! Clear early.lst off 488 day
layoff. Class -5 Finished 7 from post 3
TiW= 21

Class @ Finished 4 from post 9 TIW= 48

1st off 41 day layoff. Class @ Finished
6 from post 3 TIW= 26

Flashed speed. 1st off 36 day layoff.
Class @ Finished 2 from post 6 TIW= 22

Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
1-hole. Fast last race

(13) .Uncharacteristic early speed?
WATCH! Clear early.lst off 36 day
layoff. Class © Finished 3 from post 1
TIW= 34

*Stretch gain (1.75). 1st off 34 day
layoff. Class @ Finished 5 from post 8
TIW= 54

Made big overall move (4). Made a big
move early (3.25). 1st off 36 day
layoff. Class © Finished 4 from post 10
TIW= 75

Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
2-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed?
WATCH! 1st off 36 day layoff. Class @
Finished 6 from post 2 TIW= 19
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83
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0.9
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87
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79
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87
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84

88

80
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68

71

67

60

75
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LAST FIVE

SPEED RATINGS

54,63,66,49,53

50,47,29,36,49

68,71,69,73,72

63,62,73,58,73

53,67,60,58,46

69,49,70,64,66

68,55,64,65,58

61,55,62,62,62

67,67,65,65,70

57,50, 60,54, 64

DSLR

49

488

23

41

36

36

34

36

36

BRIS P CALL1
P 23.2
E 22.6
P 22.9
P 23.1
NA 23.7
E/P 23.1
E 22.7
E 24.4
S 23.5
S 22.6

CALL2 MEDS EQUIP MLINE

48.8

47.2

47.2

47.9

46.7

46.8

49.3

47.2

47.6

20.

20.

20.

12.

00

.00

.50

00

.00

.00

00

.50

00

118

119

136

116

117

120

119

117

118

TRK DIS

MNR

TDN

MVR

MNR

MNR

MNR

MNR

MNR

MNR

5.5

6.0

5.5

6.0

6.0

6.0

5.0

6.0

6.0

CHNG

C

C

oC

C

C

C

oC

oC

oC

9.1 9%

12.1 90

9.1 103

6.1 108

9.1 94

18.2 97

9.1 102

3.0 95

6.1 109

18.2 101

ERLY
PACE

SPPNT PWR COMB TOTL

99.6 85

85.4 162

92.8 177

96.4 174

90.4

167

96.7

175

96.7

181

86.3 79

98.6 159

92.6 184

TOTL
PACE
LAST

248

241

227

251

S

251

151

235

24

)

COMMENTS

Hard pursuit; short/
Shied;stedy briefly3/8/
Mild rally; even findp
Pressed pace; wilted/ 3wd
speed; tired 4 wd/ Faded
on the turn

Set pressured pace;/
Stalked; faded 4path/ Mid
move3w; empty

Prompted; evenly late/
Off rail turn;weakened/
3wd;mild bid 3/8;wknd
Brief chase; tired;/
Bid4w;bested rest/
Pressed pace; tired;
Vied4w-1/8p;held 2d/
Chased early; tired;/ Led
mid tk overpowered

Hard ins duel;edged2d/
Saved ground to 1/4p/
Close to rail; no bid

Step slow; 5wi lane/
Through after half;/
Saved ground no avail
Bid5-5wi;need more/
Rallied 5wi; angled in/
Extended 3deep; short

Led;duel btw;weakened/
Chased early gave way;/ 7
wide; mild gain



