LAST TOTL

ASP AVG ASP THREE SECND PACE BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG  HORSE CLASS SRR SUR 110 SPD R# TDS SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE P2F P4F PFN AVG MLINE CALL LAST ALL LAST TOTALS LAST RACE COMMENT
11/11/18 DMR 1 8.5 6 6 GIRL -20 RX>R D>T 84 84 10 84 4.5 3.4 1.30 82 90 75 85 1.60 52.6 247 520 521 1042 Bid 4deep;duel;wknd
8.5 33 AWARD IT 5 R>R T>T 78 82 10 78 7.5 5.1 1.47 67 67 89 79 5.00 58.3 223 495 485 980 Came out str;outkicked
8.5 44 OK DOLL 5 R>R T>T 81 80 10 81 2.9 6.1 0©.48 79 77 87 81 5.00 53.3 243 487 496 982 Btwn 2nd turn;no bid
8.5 11 BELIEVE -50 S>R T>T 81 80 10 81 5.3 3.8 1.41 83 92 81 3.00 58.4 175 511 477 987 Off step slow;3wd lane
8.5 2 2 INDYPENDEN -60 RX>R D>T 81 79 10 81 7.8 4.1 1.88 74 81 89 75 10.00 52.4 244 4990 502 992 Between; flattened out
8.5 5 5 BUNNY -10 S>RT>T 76 78 7 76 6.9 6.0 1.16 84 88 83 76 4.00 58.2 255 496 520 1016 Off rail;mild late bid
LAST TOTL
ASP AVG ASP THREE SECND PACE BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE CLASS SRR SUR 110 SPD R# TDS SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE P2F P4F PFN AVG MLINE CALL LAST ALL LAST TOTALS LAST RACE COMMENT
11/11/18 DMR 2 8.9 2 2 CREATIVE 0 S>R D>D ERR 84 2 ERR 1.1 4.4 0.25 100 105 80 84 2.50 55.5 285 459 479 939 Inside duel;2nd best
8.0 55 TIVAT (%] S>R D>D ERR 82 2 ERR 2.8 2.8 1.0 98 102 71 82 3.50 54.6 271 452 452 904 Came out 1/4;best rest
8.0 33 GIVEHERDAL © S>R D>D ERR 76 2 ERR 5.0 4.4 1.13 94 91 72 76 4,00 53.7 257 436 423 859 Drifted in str;wkened
8.0 7 7 DANCING 0 R>R T>D 80 75 10 8 6.7 5.4 1.23 83 83 77 76 4.00 54.1 243 439 421 860 3wd into strjedged 3rd
8.0 4 4 WAZE READY 0 R>R T>D ERR 74 2 ERR 8.0 7.3 1.9 77 78 77 74 8.00 54.0 232 422 411 833 3wd;4wd;no rally
8.0 6 6 JOHANSSON -5 SSRD>D 62 66 4 62 8.6 7.1 1.20 87 83 88 68 4.00 58.4 258 402 424 826 4wd into str;late 3rd
8.0 11 SANDONA (%] S>R D>D ERR 57 2 ERR 8.9 8.3 1.7 83 83 79 57 20.00 54.8 245 389 390 779 3wd into str;no rally
LAST TOTL
ASP AVG ASP THREE SECND PACE BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG  HORSE CLASS SRR SUR 110 SPD R# TDS SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE P2F P4F PFN AVG MLINE CALL LAST ALL LAST TOTALS LAST RACE COMMENT
11/11/18 DMR 3 8.5 3 3 SENSE OF 20 R>R D>D 83 84 10 83 2.8 4.6 ©.61 83 75 97 90 3.50 54.4 255 502 535 1037 Fought back rail lane
8.5 5 5 TRAPALANDA 25 R>R D>D 86 83 10 8 4.4 4.8 ©.93 85 86 83 86 2.50 50.7 254 518 514 1032 Stalked btwn;no bid
8.5 4 4 ABOVE 25 R>R D>D 84 83 10 84 3.9 5.0 .77 93 97 74 86 4.00 52.5 264 506 527 1033 Drifted out & in str
8.5 2 2 BANZE NO 20 R>R D>D 84 81 10 84 8.0 6.8 1.17 77 71 99 890 3.00 54.7 247 493 522 1015 Crowded start;bid 3wd
8.5 6 6 EXOTIC 10 R>R D>D 83 80 10 83 3.5 6.4 .55 79 73 76 83 4.00 53.1 228 500 479 979 Roused 3w;no response
8.5 11 SILENT 0 R>R D>D 84 79 106 82 3.3 5.4 0.62 99 96 31 80 8.00 51.9 217 480 423 903 Led rail; stopped 3/8
LAST TOTL
ASP AVG ASP THREE SECND PACE BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG  HORSE CLASS SRR SUR 110 SPD R# TDS SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE P2F P4F PFN AVG MLINE CALL LAST ALL LAST TOTALS LAST RACE COMMENT
11/11/18 DMR 4 6.5 6 6 ITALIANO -5 S>S T>D 84 82 8 82 2.6 5.8 ©.45 92 94 77 81 2.50 59.4 263 455 454 909 Dueled btwn;outkicked
6.5 11 TREASURE -17 S>SD>D 8 8110 83 3.6 5.1 0.71 86 79 81 4.00 57.6 165 438 381 819 Chased 2w; weakened
6.5 55 ROYAL BAR © S>SD>D 8 8 5 80 3.6 3.6 1.0 93 95 74 82 10.00 55.8 262 412 428 8490 Dueled;weakened
6.5 7 7 NEIGHBORHO © S>S T>D 83 7910 81 7.4 5.3 1.40 72 80 88 82 2.00 59.6 240 434 431 865 Squeezed after start
6.5 4 4 REDESIGN 3 S>S D>D 85 79 10 85 4.1 4.9 ©0.84 94 93 74 81 10.00 57.0 261 428 439 866 3w between; weakened;
6.5 22 SPA -12 S>ST>D 706 75 4 70 3.8 7.6 ©.50 89 91 69 77 6.00 60.1 249 427 425 852 3wd;4wd;weakened
6.5 3 3 WILD VERSE 33 S>SD>D 79 75 4 75 2.6 4.4 9.60 92 93 79 77 6.00 56.7 264 407 442 849 Off rail; drew clear



LAST TOTL

ASP AVG ASP THREE SECND PACE BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE CLASS SRR SUR 110 SPD R# TDS SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE P2F P4F PFN AVG MLINE CALL LAST ALL LAST TOTALS LAST RACE COMMENT
11/11/18 DMR 5 8.5 3 3 SHAKY -15 S> R T>T 85 82 4 85 1.9 4.6 ©0.41 97 100 63 82 2.00 59.8 260 511 493 1005 Dueled btwn;weakened
8.5 55 AUSSIE FOX 30 R>RD>T 81 79 6 81 2.4 4.4 0.54 91 96 65 78 8.00 49.3 252 475 472 948 Rail bid;led;weakened
8.5 11 RUMPUS CAT 5 S>R T>T 76 78 6 76 4.5 4.7 ©0©.96 91 92 76 79 2.50 60.1 259 497 499 996 Inside trip;willingly
8.5 6 6 FALCONE 5 R>X>R T>T 78 78 5 78 5.4 2.7 2.00 79 74 88 81 6.00 53.9 241 490 482 971 Stdied 1st;waited 1/4
8.5 77 SILVER 5 S> R T>T 68 73 10 68 6.4 5.9 1.08 88 86 78 73 12.00 59.5 252 466 477 944 4wd;3wd;outkicked
8.5 2 2 MAGNUM 10 R>X>R T>T 73 62 6 73 5.7 7.4 0©.77 88 80 75 69 12.00 52.8 243 425 456 881 Dueled;forced;held 3rd
8.5 44 MO BOB 20 R>R T>T ERR ERR © ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR 3.00 ERR 0 ERR 121 ERR
LAST TOTL
ASP AVG ASP THREE SECND PACE BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE CLASS SRR SUR 110 SPD R# TDS SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE P2F P4F PFN AVG MLINE CALL LAST ALL LAST TOTALS LAST RACE COMMENT
11/11/18 DMR 6 5.5 6 6 FAST -20 S>SS Db 75 73 5 73 2.5 5.3 0.48 89 83 77 76 3.00 53.5 249 351 346 697 Bid btwn;vied;wkened
5.5 44 OPTIMUM 0 S>SD>D 73 73 2 73 3.5 3.5 1.00 94 93 78 73 2.50 54.8 265 340 371 711 Hopped start;gamely
5.5 77 HARLEY'S -21 S>SD>D 70 706 1 70 1.7 4.2 ©0.40 92 93 69 70 6.00 56.1 254 347 354 700 Rail bid;clear;wknd
5.5 33 DUDE'S -20 S>S D>D 68 67 9 67 4.4 8.1 ©0.55 84 81 58 65 20.00 51.8 223 340 309 648 Dueled btwn;wkened
5.5 88 MIKEYS -41 R>S D>D 65 65 3 65 9.2 4.6 2.00 83 77 76 65 10.00 51.9 236 331 329 659 5wd 3-1/2;n0 bid
5.5 55 SOUGHT BAI -5 S>S D>D 65 65 7 65 2.4 6.7 ©0©.36 94 95 50 69 15.00 53.0 239 323 319 642 Pace rail; tired
5.5 10 106 GRAND 0 S>S D>D 67 65 4 67 5.3 6.5 ©0.82 87 84 77 67 5.00 55.7 248 322 346 667 Inside;no late bid
5.5 22 IRISH -25 S>S D>D 62 62 3 62 3.4 7.2 0.48 85 82 79 68 10.00 56.1 246 328 348 676 Bumped start;lost 3rd
5.5 11 FLEETWOOD -20 S>S D>D 66 56 4 56 5.9 6.3 0.95 83 66 70 47 15.00 51.0 219 320 280 599 Chased; weakened
5.5 99 ROUNDING ILR 0>S >D ERR ERR © ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR 15.00 ERR (7] ERR ERR ERR
5.5 11 11 THE BULL ILR 0>S >D ERR ERR © ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR 20.00 ERR (2] ERR ERR ERR
LAST TOTL
ASP AVG ASP THREE SECND PACE BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE CLASS SRR SUR 110 SPD R# TDS SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE P2F P4F PFN AVG MLINE CALL LAST ALL LAST TOTALS LAST RACE COMMENT
11/11/18 bDMR 7 8.5 7 8 SOUTER 0 R>R T>T 87 86 6 87 6.1 3.5 1.72 83 88 90 89 2,50 56.0 261 395 395 790 Inside trip;willingly
8.5 45 HOT -25 R>R T>T 83 8 6 85 6.9 4.8 1.42 81 77 81 87 3.50 53.5 239 385 370 755 Btwn 2nd turn;no bid
8.5 56 EAST RAND -23 R>R T>T 84 82 10 84 8.2 5.3 1.56 68 72 95 92 6.00 56.4 235 388 375 763 3wd into str;outkicked
8.5 6 7 AYACARA -5 RX>R D>T 80 82 10 80 8.0 5.6 1.42 79 86 79 80 15.00 50.2 244 376 360 736 Bobbled start;no bid
8.5 3 4  WORTHY 0 S>R T>T 87 82 6 87 5.9 4.0 1.48 92 95 82 89 3.00 61.5 269 387 395 781 3wd bid;led;edged
8.5 89 IT'S Tiz (2] R>R D>T ERR 80 8 ERR 6.0 6.0 1.0 79 79 90 79 15.00 53.0 248 362 368 730 5wd 7/8;rail lane
8.5 12 GRAY 25 R>XR T>T 79 74 106 79 6.1 6.0 1.02 62 67 80 77 15.00 55.7 209 351 347 698 Bobbled start;4wd str
8.5 23 SNAZZY (2] S>R T>T 86 73 7 86 2.0 4.9 0.41 94 99 75 83 6.00 60.5 268 357 389 746 Off rail str;held 3rd



LAST TOTL

ASP AVG ASP THREE SECND PACE BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG  HORSE CLASS SRR SUR 110 SPD R# TDS SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE P2F P4F PFN AVG MLINE CALL LAST ALL LAST TOTALS LAST RACE COMMENT

11/11/18 DMR 8 7.0 8 8 S Y SKY 0 S>S D>D 93 93 5 96 2.8 1.9 1.43 94 97 94 5.00 58.9 191 350 322 672 Rre-bid str;2nd best
7.6 3 3 JUST 35 R>S D>D 92 91 4 92 4.3 2.0 2.17 85 89 91 93 2.50 52.8 265 337 343 680 Stalked pace; 2nd best
7.0 55 SHOW ITN 5 S>S D>D 89 88 10 89 4.2 4.3 0.97 97 103 78 93 8.00 56.9 278 332 341 673 Vied;stalked;best rest
7.9 4 4 SPICED 17 S>S T>D 85 87 10 87 4.6 2.9 1.63 89 98 84 88 3.00 60.2 271 341 343 683 Inside trip;up 3rd
7.9 6 6 MEET AND © S>S D>D ERR 8 5 85 4.6 3.4 1.36 88 92 86 12.00 57.5 180 330 303 633 Btwn to turn;no rally
7.9 9 9 GORGEOUS 40 S>SD>D 99 8 8 85 1.5 2.3 0.67 9 97 73 85 15.00 57.1 266 325 322 648 Vied inside;wknd drive
7.0 7 7 ONE FAST 35 R>S T>D 82 84 10 82 8.3 3.5 2.36 83 91 86 88 8.00 56.4 260 332 339 672 Tight 1/2;4wd into str
7.0 22 LOVE A 0 S>S D>D 81 82 10 82 2.0 3.6 ©.56 95 98 91 5.00 58.6 193 336 331 666 Bit off rail;gamely
7.0 11 MO SEE CAL 35 R>S D>D ERR 81 10 71 2.9 4.2 ©.69 89 94 93 90 12.00 54.5 276 316 355 672 Drifted in str;cleared

LAST TOTL
ASP AVG ASP THREE SECND PACE BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE CLASS SRR SUR 110 SPD R# TDS SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE P2F P4F PFN AVG MLINE CALL LAST ALL LAST TOTALS LAST RACE COMMENT

11/11/18 DMR 9 5.0 7 7 HERUNBRIDL 45 S>S D>T ERR 85 10 ERR 1.8 2.8 ©.67 90 96 83 84 15.00 57.3 269 280 285 565 Dueled;clear;held
5.0 2 2 BAKO 35 S>S D>T 88 83 10 88 3.0 2.4 1.29 93 97 81 83 3.50 57.9 271 282 281 563 Tracked 2w;late bid 2d
5.0 11 11 DISCATSONT 60 S>S D>T ERR 8110 79 5.5 4.8 1.14 87 93 81 83 4.00 57.1 261 280 277 557 Bid 3wd;led;gamely
5.0 44 COCO 25 S>S D>T ERR 890 9 ERR 3.2 3.4 0.96 92 97 85 82 8.00 57.5 274 282 287 569 Rail;strong hand ride
5.6 11 OPERANDI 40 S>S T>T 84 77 16 83 3.0 3.9 0.77 92 96 80 83 2.50 59.9 268 285 285 570 Dueled;clear;held
5.0 99 JUDICIAL o S>SD>T 8 77 5 81 3.8 2.9 1.29 89 89 73 890 6.00 54.1 251 268 256 525 3wd into str;wkened
5.0 3 3 SHYLOCK 0 S>S T>T 79 77 16 78 8.0 4.7 1.71 85 86 80 80 4.00 59.4 251 274 266 540 Off bit slow;late bid
5.0 10 10 CHARMINGSL © S>S T>TERR 74 8 76 6.5 5.3 1.22 84 88 80 75 10.00 60.1 252 271 267 537 3wd into str;late bid
5.0 6 6 DON'T PASS 50 S>S D>T ERR 74 5 ERR 2.9 4.9 0.60 88 90 82 77 20.00 56.9 260 254 270 524 Inside duel;held 2nd
5.0 8 8 GREAT MA 30 S>S D>T 8 73 7 79 3.0 5.9 ©.50 92 95 78 78 12.00 56.0 265 264 268 532 Dueled;cleared
5.0 55 GYPSY BLU 25 S>S D>T ERR 73 3 ERR 6.5 6.5 1.00 87 90 74 73 15.00 55.3 251 261 257 518 Stalked pace; weakened



DATE  TRK #

11/11/18 DMR 1

DATE  TRK #

11/11/18 DMR 2

DATE  TRK #

11/11/18 DMR 3

DT

PP
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NOTES FROM LAST RACE

Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
6-hole. 1st off 177 day layoff. Class 5
Finished 5 from post 6 TIW= 42

*Stretch gain (4.5).BTL horse. 1st off
35 day layoff. Class -10 Finished 5 from
post 5 TIW= 59

Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
5-hole. 1st off 58 day layoff. Class -20
Finished 4 from post 5 TIW= 73

Made big overall move (3). *Stretch gain
(2). Class -50 Finished 5 from post 2
TIW= 60

BTL horse. 1st off 38 day layoff. Class
5 Finished 5 from post 2 TIW= 64

Made big overall move (4). Made a big
move early (3.25). Class -60 Finished 6
from post 5 TIW= 53

NOTES FROM LAST RACE

Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
4-hole. Clear early. Class @ Finished 2
from post 4 TIW= 51

Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
1-hole. Class © Finished 3 from post 1
TIW= 46

Fast last race (14).
from post 6 TIW= 38
Class @ Finished 7 from post 5 TIW= 50

Class @ Finished 5

Class @ Finished 4 from post 3 TIW= 96

Made big overall move (7). *Stretch gain
(4.25). Fast last race (14). 1st off 71
day layoff. Class -5 Finished 3 from
post 7 TIW= 32
*Stretch gain (.75).
from post 7 TIW= 63

Class @ Finished 4

NOTES FROM LAST RACE

*Stretch gain (.75). 1st off 36 day
layoff. Class 10 Finished 3 from post 4
TIW= 54

Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
3-hole.Uncharacteristic race? Clear
early. Class 20 Finished 1 from post 3
TIW= 48

Flashed speed. Slow last race (20).
Class @ Finished 4 from post 4 TIW= 38

Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
6-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed?
WATCH! Clear early. Class 25 Finished 1
from post 6 TIW= 81

Flashed speed. 1st off 72 day layoff.
Class 25 Finished 5 from post 3 TJW= 51
Flashed speed. Made big overall move
(3). *Stretch gain (.5).BTL horse.
Class 20 Finished 3 from post 2 TIW=
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RT S1 S2 SYs1

61

83

97

82

77

81

91

78

84
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80
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6.9

4.5

5.3

7.5

7.8
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2.8

8.9

8.0

5.0

8.6

6.7

SYs1

2.8

3.3

3.9

4.4

8.0

SYS2 CLOSE TDONE TDTWO TDCLO P2F P4F PFN

6.1 0.5
6.0 1.2
3.4 1.3
3.8 1.4
5.1 1.5
4.1 1.9
SYS2 CLOSE
4.4 0.3
2.8 1.0
8.3 1.1
7.3 1.1
4.4 1.1
7.1 1.2
5.4 1.2
SYS2 CLOSE
6.4 0.5
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86
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83
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89
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79

77

72

88

77

97

31

74

83

99

LAST FIVE

SPEED RATINGS DSLR
79,82,81,74,76 177
80,70,79,83,76 35
83,86,85,81,84 58
85,80,78,70,83 8
76,87,74,84,89 38
86,58,80,80,83 27

LAST FIVE

SPEED RATINGS DSLR
90,77,0,0,0 30
81,83,0,0,0 30
71,42,0,0,0 30
74,74,0,0,0 16
72,79,0,0,0 30
80,54,70,61,0 71
76,66,85,79,75 16

LAST FIVE

SPEED RATINGS DSLR
74,88,86,89,80 36
89,86,94,83,80 23
59,93,87,90,92 29
83,89,87,89,88 22
83,85,89,91,84 72
88,77,74,89,80 23

BRIS P CALL1 CALL2 MEDS EQUIP MLINE CLS

45.3

72.2

45.6

72.1

73.5

CALL1 CALL2

45.5

46.1

47.8

71.7

47.6

46.9

71.6

CALL1 CALL2

E/P 5 49.0
P 22.6
E/P 5 47.1
E/P 23.0
p 49.4
s 48.3
BRIS

E 21.7
E 21.9
NA 23.7
s 47.2
NA 23.0
E/P 24.2
s 47.1
BRIS

E/P 6 49.8
E 48.8
E/P 8 49.1
E/P 6 46.1
E/P 6 48.5
P 49.1

74.7

73.1

74.5

71.2

74.5

73.3

MEDS

MEDS

2]

EQUIP

EQUIP

3.00

5.00

10.00

3.50

8.00

2.50

3.00

161

168

156

151

168

153

168

163

181

129

14

[

133

164

136

TRK DIS

SA 8.0
SA 6.5
LRC 8.0
SA 5.0
SA 8.0
ZIA 8.0
TRK DIS

SA 6.0
SA 6.0
SA 6.0
SA 8.0
SA 6.0
DMR 6.0
SA 8.0
TRK DIS

FNO 8.5
SA 8.5
HST 12.0
SA 8.0
DMR 8.0
SA 8.5

CHNG

C

R>C

A0>C

oC

CHNG

S$>S

S$>S

S>S

S>S

S>S

S>S

CHNG

OR

CO>R

OR

R

OR

SPPNT

13.0

21.7

30.4

13.0

SPPNT

20.0

13.3

20.0

13.3

13.3

SPPNT

21.6

21.6

16.2

16.2

PWR

117

139

128

119

125

125

110

111

122

113

118

123

122

127

126

118

ERLY
PACE
COMB  TOTL

100.9 172

101.5 172

103.5

99.0 134

87.8 155

ERLY
PACE
COMB  TOTL

105.5 205

103.1 200

83.5 166

99.1 155
100.1 185
90.7 170

99.2 166

ERLY
PACE
COMB  TOTL

101.2 152

104.8 158

91.0 186

104.0 190

100.6 171

101.6 148

TOTL
PACE
LAST

24

N

175

223

244

TOTL

PACE
LAST

245

23

N

25

N

258

243

TOTL
PACE
LAST

217

264

25.

B

247

COMMENTS

Btwn 2nd turn;no bid/ 3wd
5/16;n0 rally/ Chased
btw;stdied late

Off rail;mild late bid/
4wd into str;no rally/
Broke in;bit slow

Bid 4deep;duel;wknd/
Stalked;bid;led;clear/
Pulled;tight 6-1/2

Off step slow;3wd lane/
Riddn out;in hand late/
Bid 3wd;led;held 2nd
Came out str;outkicked/
Sw;4w;led 1/4;held 2nd/
Came out str;no rally
Between; flattened out/
Stumbled st; no threat/
Ins-2path;4p1/4;5p3/16

COMMENTS

Inside duel;2nd best/ Off
step slow;inside/

Came out 1/4;best rest/
Dueled btwn;2nd best/

3wd into str;no rally/
Chased; gave way/

3wd;4wd;no rally/ Came
out str;edged 3rd/

Drifted in str;wkened/
3wd into str;drift in/
4wd into str;late 3rd/
Saved ground; gave way/
Off rail str;best rest

3wd into strj;edged 3rd/
Off bit slow;steadied/
Stalked rail;outkicked

COMMENTS

Roused 3w;no response/
3wd into str;led;game/
Led 3wd;drift out str
Fought back rail lane/
Angled in;edged 2nd/ Bit
off rail;cleared

Led rail; stopped 3/8/
Clear lead; grudgingly/
Led rail; held

Drifted out & in str/ 3wd
bid;clear late/
Dueled;weakened

Stalked btwn;no bid/
Dueled btwn;best rest/
Dueled;led;held game
Crowded start;bid 3wd/
Angled in early;no bid/
4wd; 3wd ;weakened



DATE  TRK #

11/11/18 DMR 4

DATE  TRK #

11/11/18 DMR 5

DT

PP

PRG ~ HORSE

6  ITALIANO
2 SPA

3 WILD VERSE

1  TREASURE
4  REDESIGN
5 ROYAL BAR

7  NEIGHBORHO

PRG  HORSE

4 MO BOB

3 SHAKY

5 AUSSIE FOX

2 MAGNUM
1 RUMPUS CAT
7  SILVER
6  FALCONE

S>S

S>S

S>S

S>S

S>S

S>S

R>R

R>R

S>R

S>R

R>R

™D

D>D

D>l

o

D>l

o

D>D

™D

D>T

T

T

T>

4

T

NOTES FROM LAST RACE

Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
5-hole.BTL horse. Clear early. Class -5
Finished 5 from post 5 TIW= 62

Class -12 Finished 9 from post 8 TIW= 62

Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
7-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed?
WATCH! Clear early. Class 33 Finished 1
from post 7 TIW= 61

Flashed speed. 1st off 37 day layoff.
Class -17 Finished 6 from post 2 TIW= 54

Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
8-hole.BTL horse. Clear early. Class 3
Finished 6 from post 8 TIW= 77

Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
7-hole.BTL horse. Clear early.lst off
314 day layoff. Class © Finished 6 from
post 7 TIW= 40

*Stretch gain (2.5). 2 races in one
pattern. Class @ Finished 7 from post 4
TIW= 61

NOTES FROM LAST RACE

1st off 143 day layoff. Class 20
Finished 5 from post © TIW= 66

Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
5-hole.BTL horse. Clear early. Class -15
Finished 5 from post 5 TIW= 49

Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
3-hole. 1st off 72 day layoff. Class 30
Finished 4 from post 3 TIW= 61

Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
6-hole. Fast last race

(11) .Uncharacteristic early speed?
WATCH! Class 10 Finished 3 from post 6
TIW= 88

Made big overall move (3). *Stretch gain
(.5). Class 5 Finished 2 from post 3
TIW= 75

*Stretch gain (2.25).BTL horse. Class 5
Finished 6 from post 10 TJIW= 54

Made big overall move (5). *Stretch gain
(2). 2 races in one pattern. Class 5
Finished 2 from post 2 TIW= 63

70

79

84

85

81

83

81

73

76

68

78

75

75

81

79

80

79

79

62

78

73

78

R#

10

10

10

ASP

DS

70

75

83

85

80

81

81

73

76

68

78

RT S1 S2 SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDONE TDTWO TDCLO P2F P4F PFN

94

93

90

93

92

86

81

85

96

94

82

91 2.6 5.8 0.4
% 3.8 7.6 0.5
80 2.6 4.4 0.6
-4 3.6 5.1 0.7
80 4.1 4.9 0.8
76 3.6 3.6 1.0
58 7.4 5.3 1.4
2 SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE
42 ERR ERR  ERR
87 1.9 4.6 0.4
75 2.4 4.4 0.5
91 5.7 7.4 0.8
94 4.5 4.7 1.0
95 6.4 5.9 1.1
98 5.4 2.7 2.0

3.2 4.5
8.6 10.0
2.6 4.4
3.8 4.4
4.3 3.8
3.6 3.6
7.5 4.1

0.9

0.6

0.9

1.1

1.0

1.8

89

92

86

94

93

72

TDONE TDTWO TDCLO P2F

1.8

5.0

5.4

7.5

2.7

0.6

0.7

0.7

0.9

2.0

97

91

88

91

88

79

91

93

93

95

80

100

96

80

92

86

74

69

79

79

74

74

88

63

65

75

76

78

88

LAST FIVE

SPEED RATINGS

81,82,79,89,80

72,78,81,70,0

80,74,78,69,0

75,84,84,80,97

76,92,74,80,88

77,79,91,78,73

78,85,84,70,78

LAST FIVE

SPEED RATINGS

75,86,84,83,0

76,79,80,83,82

73,59,76,51,54

78,82,76,77,83

75,75,68,79,74

78,81,83,77,71

DSLR

21

22

37

20

314

15

DSLR

72

14

30

30

14

BRIS P CALL1 CALL2 MEDS EQUIP MLINE CLS

22.5

21.9

23.3

22.1

22.1

23.3

44.4

45.2

46.2

45.3

45.8

45.5

CALL1 CALL2

21.4

47.8

47.7

21.8

22.3

48.2

43.5

74.6

72.7

43.8

44.5

72.7

MEDS

EQUIP

6.00

6.00

10.00

10.00

2.00

8.00

12.00

2.50

12.00

6.00

163

138

160

151

157

163

157

TRK DIS

SA 6.5
SA 6.5
SA 6.0
FNO 5.0
TP 6.0
SA 6.0
SA 6.5
TRK DIS

LEP 8.0
SA 6.5
DMR 8.0
SA 8.0
SA 6.5
SA 6.5
SA 8.0

CHNG  SPPNT
oC 19.4
R>C 12.9
M>C 25.8
AO>C 6.5
A>C 12.9
co>C 22.6
C 0.0
CHNG  SPPNT
S>M 0.0
S>M 26.7
M>M 16.7
M>M 20.0
M>M 16.7
M>M 13.3
M>M 6.7

PWR

115

120

120

125

117

123

PWR

122

117

107

119

111

124

ERLY
PACE
COMB  TOTL
105.4 186

102.8 180

98.0 185

102.2 86

102.0 187

93.1 188

1e03.0 152

108.2 197

95.8 187

93.0 168

107.7 183

100.7 174

104.1 153

TOTL

249

26:

»

165

261

262

240

25

N

243

259

252

24

s

COMMENTS

Dueled btwn;outkicked/
3wd;bid btwn;wkened/ Off
rail str;weakened

3wd; 4wd;weakened/ Inside
duel ;weakened/
Ins;drivel/4;duel;game
Off rail; drew clear/
Inside;outkicked 2nd/ Bit
off rail;outkicked

Chased 2w; weakened/
3-4wd to lane;2nd best/
Came out str;game btwn
3w between; weakened;/
Advanced3w;edged clear/
Pace; dueled inside
Dueled;weakened/
Vied;stalked;outkicked/
Drifted in str;held

Squeezed after start/ 4wd
into str;up 3wd/ 4wd into
str;2nd best

COMMENTS

Dueled btwn;weakened/
Inside;dueled;lost 2nd/
3wd; 2wd;rail ;wkened

Rail bid;led;weakened/
Came in upper str/
Drifted out;bump 1/8
Dueled;forced;held 3rd/
Btwn;inside;wkened/ Saved
ground; weakened

Inside trip;willingly/
Came out str;no rally/
4wd into str;no bid
4wd; 3wd; outkicked/ 4wd
into str;late 3rd/
Spill;impeded 3/16
Stdied 1st;waited 1/4/
4wd into str;came in/
Came out 1/8;2nd best



ERLY TOTL

ASP AVG ASP LAST FIVE PACE PACE

DATE TRK # DT PP PRG  HORSE SRR SUR NOTES FROM LAST RACE 110 RX SPD R# TDS RT S1 S2 SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDONE TDTWO TDCLO P2F P4F PFN SPEED RATINGS DSLR BRIS P CALL1 CALL2 MEDS EQUIP MLINE CLS TRK DIS CHNG SPPNT PWR COMB TOTL LAST COMMENTS
11/11/18 DMR 6 5.5 11 11 THE BULL ©>S >D 1st off 737009 day layoff. FTS. Class ERR © ERR @ ERR © 57 -9 ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR 0,0,0,0,0 ¥*¥** NA @ 0.0 0.0 1 0 20.00 ERR 0.0 >M 0.0 ERR 2] o/ /
ILR Finished @ from post @ TIW= 61
5.5 99 ROUNDING ©>S >D 1st off 737009 day layoff. FTS. Class ERR © ERR © ERR © 57 -9 ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR 0,0,0,0,0 *kkk NA @ 0.0 0.0 1 0 15.00 0.0 >M 0.0 ERR 2] e/ /
ILR Finished @ from post © TIW= 32
5.5 55 SOUGHT BAI S>S D>D Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 65 7 65 7 65 7 87 69 2.4 6.7 0.4 2.4 6.7 0.4 9 95 50 58,70,78,47,66 51 E 6 23.0 47.9 1 9 15.00 128 GG 6.0 M>M 15.8 106 96.3 189 239 Pace rail; tired/ Brk
2-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? slw;4w;lost whip/ Pace
WATCH! 1st off 51 day layoff. Class -5 3w;dug in;tagged
Finished 5 from post 2 TIW= 21
5.5 7 7 HARLEY'S S>S D>D Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 70 1 76 1 70 1 8 77 1.7 4.2 0.4 1.7 4.2 0.4 92 93 69 70,0,0,0,0 351 E 6 22.1 45.7 1 BON 6.00 142 GG 5.5 S>M 15.8 114 102.8 185 254 Rail bid;clear;wknd/ /
4-hole. Clear early.lst off 351 day
layoff. Class -21 Finished 5 from post 4
TIW= 54
5.5 6 6 FAST S>S D>D Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 75 4 73 5 73 5 87 78 2.5 5.3 0.5 2.5 5.3 0.5 89 83 77 69,88,72,69,68 44 E 6 22.8 47.4 1 0 3.00 145 SA 5.5 M>M 15.8 116 99.5 172 249 Bid btwn;vied;wkened/
3-hole. 1st off 44 day layoff. Class -20 Btwn;inside;2nd best/
Finished 4 from post 3 TIW= 57 Bumped start;wkened
S>S D>D Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 62 62 62 88 80 3.4 7.2 3.4 7.2 0.5 8 82 79 69,0,66,51,0 57 22.6 46.2 0 10.00 140 LRC M>M 13.2 105 102.4 167 246 Bumped start;lost 3rd/
4-hole. 1st off 57 day layoff. Class -25 Bumpd;lost jock;vanned/
Finished 4 from post 4 TIW= 26 Btwn; inside;wkened
S>S Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 68 67 67 84 73 4.4 8.1 49 8.0 0.6 8 81 58 59,70,66,61,65 52 23.3 48.8 0 20.00 161 LRC M>M 10.5 107 92.1 165 223 Dueled btwn;wkened/ 3wd
5-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? turn;weakened/ Forced out
WATCH! 1st off 52 day layoff. Class -20 bit brk;wkd
Finished 7 from post 5 TIW= 34
S>S D>D *Stretch gain (.75). Class © Finished 5 67 65 67 89 79 5.3 6.5 5.2 5.6 ©.9 87 84 77 70,59,73,57,0 22 22. 46.5 0 5.00 120 SA M>M 5.3 106 97.9 171 248 Inside;no late bid/ 5Swd
from post 3 TIW= 64 into str;wkened/ 4wd into
str;lost 3rd
5.5 11 FLEETWOOD S>S D>D 1st off 44 day layoff. Class -20 66 2 56 4 56 4 83 70 5.9 6.3 0.9 5.9 6.3 0.9 83 66 70 47,0,0,0,12 44 p 3 23.7 49.5 1 BON 15.00 189 SA 5.5 M>M 7.9 101 86.2 149 219 Chased; weakened/ Pulled
Finished 6 from post 7 TIW= 28 up; walked off/ Pulled
up;walked off
5.5 44 OPTIMUM S>S D>D Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 73 2 73 2 73 2 9 81 3.5 3.5 1.0 3.5 3.5 1.0 94 93 78 77,68,0,0,0 34 E 6 22.1 46.2 1 @ 2.50 121 SA 5.5 M>M 15.8 109 102.7 187 265 Hopped start;gamely/ Bit
5-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? off rail;edged 3rd/
WATCH!BTL horse. Clear early.lst off 34
day layoff. Class @ Finished 2 from post
5 TIW= 56
5.5 8 8 MIKEYS R>S D>D Flashed speed. Made big overall move 65 2 65 3 65 2 74 8 9.2 4.6 2.0 9.4 3.8 2.5 83 77 76 66,67,62,0,0 765 S 0 49.4 74.8 1 0 10.00 149 SA 8.0 S>M 0.0 107 94.1 160 236 5wd 3-1/2;n0 bid/ Came
(3). 1st off 765 day layoff. Class -41 out str;up 2nd/ 3wd into
Finished 5 from post 7 TIW= 38 str;no bid
ERLY TOTL
ASP AVG ASP LAST FIVE PACE PACE
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG  HORSE SRR SUR NOTES FROM LAST RACE 110 RX SPD R# TDS RT S1 S2 SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDONE TDTWO TDCLO P2F P4F PFN SPEED RATINGS DSLR BRIS P CALL1 CALL2 MEDS EQUIP MLINE CLS TRK DIS CHNG SPPNT PWR COMB TOTL LAST COMMENTS
11/11/18 DMR 7 8.5 2 3  SNAZzY S>R T>T Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 86 1 73 7 8 1 98 93 2.0 49 0.4 1.3 5.0 0.3 94 99 75 83,86,80,68,49 21 E 8 21.7 43.5 1 BOFF 6.00 139 SA 6.5 R>R 36.4 121 107.7 193 268 Off rail str;held 3rd/
1-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? Off rail str;outkicked/
WATCH!BTL horse. Clear early. Class @ Off rail lane;clear
Finished 3 from post 1 TIW= 48
8.5 89 IT'S TI1Z R>R D>T Made big overall move (3). *Stretch gain ERR © 80 8 ERR © 81 8 6.0 6.0 1.0 ERR ERR ERR 79 79 90 82,80,75,77,77 22 P 5 48.4 73.3 1 @ 15.00 164 SA 8.0 R>R 22.7 112 100.2 158 248 5Swd 7/8;rail lane/
(.75). Class @ Finished 2 from post 5 Stalked 3wd;no rally/
TIW= 26 Waited 3/16-1/8;up 3rd
8.5 12 GRAY R>R T>T Made big overall move (6). Made a big 79 6 74106 79 6 8 93 6.1 6.0 1.0 6.5 4.5 1.4 62 67 80 80,83,69,45,80 16 P 1 46.7 70.4 1 @ 15.00 149 SA 8.0 C>R 4.5 117 101.6 129 209 Bobbled start;4wd str/
move early (9.25). *Stretch gain (1.25). Came out;brushed 1/8/ 5Swd
Very strong move! Take note! Class 25 into str;wkened
Finished 2 from post 7 TIW= 42
8.5 6 7  AYACARA R>R D>T Made big overall move (3). 1st off 70 80 3 8210 8 3 77 8 8.6 5.6 1.4 8.2 7.3 1.1 79 8 79 80,82,77,80,87 70 S 0 48.5 74.8 1 0 15.00 198 DMR 8.0 R>R 0.0 117 97.8 165 244 Bobbled start;no bid/ 3wd
day layoff. Class -5 Finished 5 from into str;no rally/ Waited
post 3 TIW= 65 3/16;rail bid
8.5 45 HOT R>R T>T *Stretch gain (1.25). 2 races in one 83 3 8 6 8 6 8 48 6.9 4.8 1.4 6.9 4.8 1.4 81 77 81 85,83,93,80,83 23S 1 47.8 72.5 1 0 3.50 174 SA 10.0 AO>R 4.5 136 101.8 158 239 Btwn 2nd turn;no bid/ 5wd
pattern. Class -25 Finished 7 from post into str;outkicked/ 3wd
7 TIW= 59 into str;edged 2nd
8.5 3 4  WORTHY S>R T>T Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 8 3 8 6 8 3 9% 60 5.9 40 1.5 6.4 2.4 2.7 92 95 82 85,87,94,80,81 21 E/P 4 22.1 43.5 1 @ 3.00 163 SA 6.5 R>R 18.2 134 109.4 187 269 3wd bid;led;edged/ 3wd
6-hole.BTL horse. Class @ Finished 2 into str;willingly/ 4wd
from post 6 TIW= 85 str;brushed game
8.5 56 EAST RAND R>R T>T *Stretch gain (.75).BTL horse. Class 84 8 8210 84 8 8 103 8.2 5.3 1.5 8.3 4.6 1.8 68 72 95 90,91,94,86,86 17 s 0 49.2 72.6 1 © 6.00 200 SA 8.0 AO>R 0.0 135 101.3 140 235 3wd into str;outkicked/
-23 Finished 5 from post 1 TIW= 42 Rail bid strj;willingly/
Swd into str;best rest
8.5 7 8 SOUTER R>R T>T Made big overall move (3). 1st off 38 87 4 8 6 8 4 9 98 6.1 3.5 1.7 5.0 3.1 1.6 83 88 90 88,93,85,82,82 38 P 3 46.9 70.4 1 0 2.50 172 SA 8.0 R>R 13.6 136 109.0 171 261 Inside trip;willingly/

day layoff. Class @ Finished 2 from post
6 TIW= 67

Stalked 3wd;up 3rd/ 4wd
into str;led;edged



DATE  TRK #

11/11/18 DMR 8

DATE  TRK #

11/11/18 DMR 9

5.0 6

5.0 7

5.0 1

5.0 5

5.0 11

5.0 10

5.0 2

5.0 9

5.0 3
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NOTES FROM LAST RACE

Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
7-hole. Fast last race

(20) .Uncharacteristic early speed?
WATCH! Clear early. Class @ Finished 1
from post 7 TIW= 67

Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
1-hole. Clear early. Class 40 Finished 4
from post 1 TIW= 77

Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
4-hole. Fast last race

(18) .Uncharacteristic early speed?
WATCH! Clear early. Class 35 Finished 1
from post 4 TIW= 67

Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
4-hole. 1st off 35 day layoff. Class 5
Finished 3 from post 4 TIW= 58

*Stretch gain (1.25). Class © Finished ERR
4 from post 2 TIW= 78

9%

ERR

89

Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 93
6-hole. Clear early. Class © Finished 2

from post 6 TIW= 65

Made big overall move (5). *Stretch gain
(3.5).BTL horse. 1st off 43 day layoff.

Class 17 Finished 3 from post 3 TIW= 75

1st off 35 day layoff. Class 35 Finished
2 from post 1 TIW= 62

85

92

Flashed speed.Uncharacteristic race?BTL 82
horse. 1st off 34 day layoff. Class 35

Finished 3 from post 4 TIW= 46

ASP
110

86

NOTES FROM LAST RACE
Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
4-hole. Clear early.lst off 52 day
layoff. Class 30 Finished 1 from post 4
TIW= 63

Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
1-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed?
WATCH! Clear early. Class 50 Finished 2
from post 1 TIW= 51

Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
4-hole. Clear early.lst off 64 day
layoff. Class 45 Finished 1 from post 4
TIW= 81
Flashed
7-hole.
layoff.
TIW= 71
Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
3-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed?
WATCH! Clear early. Class 25 Finished 1
from post 3 TIW= 64

Chased Pace. 1st off 34 day layoff.
Class 25 Finished 6 from post 4 TIW= 68

ERR

ERR

speed. *Pressed Pace from 84
Clear early.1lst off 35 day

Class 40 Finished 1 from post 7

ERR

ERR

Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from ERR
3-hole. Clear early. Class 60 Finished 1
from post 3 TIW= 53

Made big overall move (4). *Stretch gain ERR
(1.75).BTL horse. Class @ Finished 5

from post 8 TIW= 34

1st off 44 day layoff. Class 35 Finished 88
2 from post 5 TIW= 59

Chased Pace. Class @ Finished 4 from 81
post 6 TIW= 63
*Stretch gain (3).BTL horse. Class @ 79

Finished 6 from post 1 TIW= 57

RX

86

81

88

86

93

87

91

84

AVG

SPD

73

74

85

77

80

73

81

74

83

77

77

R#

10

10

10

10

10

10

10

10

10

ASP
DS

85

71

89

85

96

87

92

82

ASP

TDS

79

ERR

ERR

83

ERR

ERR

79

76

88

81

78

RT S1 S2 SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDONE TDTWO TDCLO P2F P4F PFN

RT

92

89

98

91

95

95

84

92

S1

89

92

91

97

93

90

93

92

87

91

91

77

86

79

95

87

97

S2

80

84

96

82

78

80

95

84

76

95

SYs1

3.0

2.9

1.8

3.0

3.2

6.5

5.5

6.5

3.0

3.8

8.0

SYs2

5.9

4.9

2.8

3.9

6.5

4.8

5.3

2.4

2.9

4.7

1.4

1.5

CLOSE

0.5

0.9

1.0

1.1

1.2

1.3

1.3

1.7

10.0

TDONE

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

2.9

3.0

9.3

TDTWO

5.9

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

5.8

5.8

2.9

4.0

6.0

2.0

TDCLO

0.3

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

0.7

1.1

1.0

0.8

1.6

96

89

97

88

94

89

85

83

P2F

92

88

90

92

92

87

87

84

93

89

85

97

94

103

98

89

91

P4F

95

90

96

96

97

90

93

88

97

89

86

73

93

78

92

97

84

91

86

82

83

80

85

74

81

80

81

73

80

LAST FIVE
SPEED RATINGS

102,91,79,89,92

78,89,87,90,90

99,91,80,81,83

89,96,93,90,76

90,89,80,88,83

99,92,92,91,93

89,94,82,91,93

93,89,98,85,0

91,86,88,89,75

LAST FIVE

SPEED RATINGS

79,87,68,79,65

81,83,68,73,64

85,92,75,85,97

85,84,79,90,79

88,73,85,81,66

73,62,83,0,0

83,81,86,87,59

78,71,77,66,80

85,87,77,77,88

73,81,86,77,68

76,79,84,84,78

DSLR

DSLR

BRIS P CALL1 CALL2 MEDS EQUIP MLINE
29 E 21.8 44.4 5.00
22 E/P 22.0 45.2 15.00
29 E/P 46.4 70.6 12.00
35 E 21.8 45.0 8.00
29 E/P 22.9 45.9 12.00
29 E/P 22.0 44.5 5.00
43 P 22.5 44.4 3.00
35 P 47.9 73.0 2.50
34 s 47.1 70.5 8.00

BRIS P CALL1 CALL2 MLINE

29 E

64

35 E/P

29 E

34 p

16

21S

24

21 s

22.

22.

21.

22.

22.

22.

22.

22.

22.

22.

45.4

45.3

43.8

45.0

46.5

45.4

45.7

46.7

45.0

20.00

15.00

8.00

15.00

10.00

6.00

191

179

206

192

210

209

199

214

175

172

174

164

169

162

TRK DIS

SA 5.0
TUP 6.0
SA 8.0
SA 6.5
SA 5.0
SA 5.0
SA 6.5
SA 8.0
SA 8.0
TRK DIS

SA

SA

SA

SA

SA

SA

GG

SA

SA

6.5

5.5

6.0

6.0

6.5

6.5

CHNG  SPPNT
N>N 29.6
N>N 18.5
AO>N 0.0
G3>N  18.5
N>N 7.4
N>N 18.5
N>N 7.4
AO>N 0.0
AO>N 0.0
CHNG  SPPNT

S>A 10.9
OA 17.4
R>A 15.2
OA 13.0
S>A 10.9
R>A 2.2
OA 10.9
AO>A 0.0
OA 8.7
AO>A  10.9
AO>A 0.0

130

130

140

135

114

127

136

132

114

123

133

ERLY
PACE

TOTL
PACE

COMB  TOTL LAST

114.8

102.3

105.5

102.4

107.9

111.1

106.9

105.6

106.5

CcomB

99.5

101.1

109.5

110.3

106.5

100.0

105.8

104.7

104.4

99.5

106.6

95

193

183

200

187

174

174

ERLY
PACE
TOTL

187

178

186

188

189

177

180

172

190

178

171

193

266

27

&

278

18

]

191

271

26!

vy

260

260

269

268

274

251

26

i

252

27

s

251

251

COMMENTS

Bit off rail;gamely/ Bit
off rail;2nd best/
Speed;inside;lost 2nd

Vied inside;wknd drive/
Dueled; led; no match/
Drew out; driving
Drifted in str;cleared/
Bid 3wd;drift in;held/
Dueled;led;caught

Vied;stalked;best rest/
4wd turn;late 2nd/ Btwn
into str;2nd best

Btwn to turn;no rally/
Off bit slow;rallied/ 4wd
into str;weakened

Rre-bid str;2nd best/ Bid
lane;led;cleared/
Stalked;bid;led;game
Inside trip;up 3rd/
Stalked 3wd;rallied/ Came
out str;wkened

Stalked pace; 2nd best/
Stdied 7/8;3wd lane/ 4wd
turn;3wd into str

Tight 1/2;4wd into str/
4wd into str;rallied/
Bobbled start;3wd lane

COMMENTS
Dueled;cleared/ 3wd into
str;btwn wire/ 4w into
str;stdied1/16

Inside duel;held 2nd/
Dueled;drew clear/ Inside
duel ;weakened

Dueled;clear;held/ Off
slow; rail rally/ Inside
duel;lost 3rd

Dueled;clear;held/
Bid;led;held 2nd/ Stalked
3wd;weakened

Rail;strong hand ride/
4wd;3wd;up 2nd/
Dueled;clear;caught

Stalked pace; weakened/
Pulled;steadied early/
4wd;3wd; cleared

Bid 3wd;led;gamely/
Dueled;outkicked 2nd/ Bid
4wd 1/8;held 3rd

3wd into str;late bid/
4wd 3/8;weakened/
Inside;held on gamely
Tracked 2w;late bid 2d/
Prssd 2w;bid;clr;drvng/
4w trn; rallied

3wd into str;wkened/ Btwn
late;edged 3rd/ 3wd
bid;led;held

Off bit slow;late bid/
Circled Sw;bmpd 3/16s/
Circled 6w;battled;nod



