LAST TOTL

ASP AVG ASP THREE SECND PACE BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE CLASS SRR SUR 110 SPD R# TDS SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE P2F P4F PFN AVG MLINE CALL LAST ALL LAST TOTALS LAST RACE COMMENT
11/12/18 DMR 1 6.0 2 2  HOT ROD 50 S>SD>b 76 76 1 76 1.3 1.3 1.00 88 85 85 76 2.50 55.5 258 511 516 1028 Drifted out str;clear
6.0 6 6 MIDNIGHT 20 S>S D> 72 75 4 75 3.9 2.1 1.83 89 90 75 77 2.00 55.7 254 524 508 1032 4wd;3wd;led;held game
6.0 4 4 CHITTER 20 S>SD>b 67 73 3 73 4.1 3.6 1.13 90 89 67 73 6.00 53.9 246 493 477 970 Chased btwn;no rally
6.0 55  STAYTHIRST 35 S>SD>D 72 68 5 71 3.3 4.2 ©.80 90 85 76 66 6.00 54.6 251 497 493 990 3wd;rail;cleared
6.0 11 BE LIFTED 2@ S>SD>D 68 65 4 65 6.0 4.0 1.50 89 90 74 69 3.00 54.8 253 496 494 990 Off bit slow;late btwn
6.0 3 3  PORTAL 45 S>SD>D 68 64 5 64 3.9 5.2 ©.75 93 88 381 64 8.00 54.3 262 478 512 990 3wd;off railj;cleared
LAST TOTL
ASP AVG ASP THREE SECND PACE BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE CLASS SRR SUR 110 SPD R# TDS SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE P2F P4F PFN AVG MLINE CALL LAST ALL LAST TOTALS LAST RACE COMMENT
11/12/18 DMR 2 7.0 3 3  IT'SJUSTAN 15 S>S D>D ERR 91 2 91 1.8 2.7 ©.67 98 101 87 91 1.40 56.8 286 615 650 1265 Fought back rail lane
7.0 4 4  CHASING 15 S>SD>D 8 88 3 88 5.2 3.9 1.33 89 98 91 88 1.20 57.5 278 621 648 1269 Stalked;bid;gamely
7.0 2 2  ANDYOUSHAL 15 S>S D>D ERR 84 2 84 7.0 4.0 1.75 89 93 86 84 8.00 56.3 268 589 612 1201 3wd into str;best rest
7.0 55 BOUJIE -5 R>S D>D 74 83 4 86 5.0 3.5 1.42 78 91 62 81 6.00 50.4 231 586 539 1125 Bobbled st; moved up
7.6 11 DER LU -5 R>S D>D 92 83 2 92 4.6 3.8 1.20 90 97 54 83 6.00 50.7 241 588 552 1140 Stalked 3wd;weakened
LAST TOTL
ASP AVG ASP THREE SECND PACE BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE CLASS SRR SUR 110 SPD R# TDS SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE P2F P4F PFN AVG MLINE CALL LAST ALL LAST TOTALS LAST RACE COMMENT
11/12/18 DMR 3 8.0 7 7  BUCKSTOPPE 3 R>R T>T 82 84 7 84 7.4 5.3 1.39 67 65 92 81 3.00 55.3 224 390 365 755 Off bit slow;no bid
8.0 2 2 FLIP THE -37 S>R T>T 83 84 106 85 2.4 3.9 0.60 92 98 79 86 2.50 60.0 269 400 399 799 Inside duel;weakened
8.0 11  ZESTFUL -5 S>R T>T 81 8210 81 5.7 5.4 1.05 86 89 84 81 4.00 59.2 259 392 390 781 Stalked 3wd;edged 3rd
8.0 8 8 HEY -70 R>R D>T ERR 80 10 ERR 7.3 4.9 1.49 72 71 104 87 10.00 56.4 247 382 386 768 3w2ndturn; belated bid
8.0 3 3 PLATINUM 13 R>R T>T 80 79 10 80 3.7 6.2 0©.60 88 94 67 78 12.00 54.7 249 372 370 742 Stalked;bid;lost 3rd
8.0 4 4  POINT 28 R>R D>T 79 78 10 79 5.6 5.3 1.06 80 86 62 76 12.00 50.4 228 356 338 694 Svd ground to stretch
8.0 6 6 WILD WILD -12 S>R T>T 78 74 5 78 3.4 5.4 ©.63 92 95 73 80 4.00 60.9 260 364 382 746 Stalked btwn;no bid
8.0 5 5 SPIRIT 33 RX>R D>T 69 71 5 69 4.6 4.9 0©.95 81 81 386 65 10.00 52.8 248 345 369 714 Drifted out str;held
LAST TOTL
ASP AVG ASP THREE SECND PACE BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG  HORSE CLASS SRR SUR 110 SPD R# TDS SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE P2F PAF PFN AVG MLINE CALL LAST ALL LAST TOTALS LAST RACE COMMENT
11/12/18 DMR 4 5.5 6 6  DESIRED 0 S>S D> 75 75 4 75 3.4 5.4 0.63 88 73 75 4.00 54.5 161 447 376 823 Squeezed;steadied strt
5.5 44 BIG BASE © S> Db 71 72 5 72 5.1 4.0 1.28 92 99 77 71 3.50 56.0 259 421 451 871 Btwn turn;held 2nd
5.5 55 WHATA 0 S>S Db 72 71 6 72 3.3 5.2 ©0.63 96 95 67 71 5.0 55.5 258 442 439 880 4wd;3wd;btwn foes wire
5.5 33 MI 0 S>SD>D 76 706 6 70 3.9 4.3 0.92 95 80 77 12.00 54.9 175 424 417 841 Stalked rail;best rest
5.5 11 GIA LULA 0 S>S D>D 72 69 106 67 4.1 4.9 0.84 94 97 73 77 3.00 54.8 264 437 462 898 4wd to turn;rail str
5.5 2 2 GONE -40 S>SD>D 68 68 1 68 2.2 6.7 ©.33 93 88 72 68 2.50 54.4 253 441 431 872 Inside trip;weakened
5.5 7 7 CHEYENNE © S>S D>D 63 61 10 63 2.5 5.3 0.47 98 100 62 60 12.00 55.9 260 389 426 815 Btwn;inside;edged wire



LAST TOTL

ASP AVG ASP THREE SECND PACE BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG  HORSE CLASS SRR SUR 110 SPD R# TDS SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE P2F P4F PFN AVG MLINE CALL LAST ALL LAST TOTALS LAST RACE COMMENT
11/12/18 DMR 5 8.0 2 2  PITINO 0 S>R T>T ERR 83 4 ERR 4.4 5.0 0.88 92 96 62 83 8.00 60.2 250 383 357 741 5wd into str;drift in
8.0 33 SELLWOOD @ R>R T>T 82 83 9 84 4.7 3.3 1.41 81 88 387 84 2.50 57.3 256 388 395 783 Bid btwn;led;edged
8.0 55 STONEGATE © R>R T>T ERR 82 5 88 5.8 6.7 ©0.86 96 102 72 80 4.00 55.1 270 378 394 772 Speed;inside;outkicked
8.0 8 8 CUPID'S 0 R>R T>T 77 81 3 81 6.4 4.5 1.40 99 95 81 81 3.00 56.6 266 377 397 774 Led 3wd 1/8;held 3rd
8.0 77 BIGBUZZ © S>RT>T 79 79 8 79 5.6 4.1 1.35 83 89 381 79 4.00 62.9 253 385 377 762 Came out str;rallied
8.0 4 4 ARCH 4 R>R T>T 77 77 3 77 6.6 4.1 1.62 83 82 86 77 6.00 53.1 251 365 364 730 Waited 1/4;split 1/16
8.0 11 POINTED 10 R>R T>T 77 77 106 76 6.1 6.0 1.02 88 86 62 74 20.00 54.0 236 355 345 700 Inside;steadied 1/16
8.0 6 6 BLITZKRIEG © S>R T>T 77 76 5 77 3.5 6.7 ©.53 97 102 62 76 12.00 60.3 261 369 369 738 Bit off rail str;wkend
LAST TOTL
ASP AVG ASP THREE SECND PACE BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE CLASS SRR SUR 110 SPD R# TDS SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE P2F P4F PFN AVG MLINE CALL LAST ALL LAST TOTALS LAST RACE COMMENT
11/12/18 DMR 6 8.0 4 4  FOREVER -10 S>R T>D ERR 89 10 ERR 4.5 5.2 ©.87 90 94 84 85 3.00 60.2 268 420 404 824 Came out str;willingly
8.0 8 8 POINT -20 R>R T>D 88 88 10 89 6.7 5.8 1.17 79 81 77 86 2.50 54.5 237 394 362 755 Saved ground; weakened
8.0 77 DUKES UP -10 R>R D>D 87 87 106 87 7.5 3.4 2.21 76 85 90 87 3.50 52.5 251 381 392 773 3wd into str;bid btwn
8.0 55 HOLLAND 0 R>R D>D 82 82 10 82 6.6 5.7 1.17 80 72 091 79 12.00 53.9 243 370 373 743 Saved ground; no rally
8.0 3 3 FREDDIES 5 R>R D>D 83 82 10 83 8.3 4.7 1.75 67 69 80 79 12.00 53.1 216 356 350 706 4wd into str;best rest
8.0 2 2 PIONEEROF @ R>R D>D 82 81 10 82 7.7 6.5 1.18 79 72 94 82 4.00 54.3 245 373 383 756 Chased 3wd;outkicked
8.0 6 6 MONTEREY @ S>RD>D 77 80 10 77 5.0 5.9 0.85 90 95 71 78 8.00 56.7 256 366 374 740 Stalked btwn;edged 3rd
8.0 11 HARROVIAN © S>R D>D 74 7510 74 6.5 5.8 1.12 85 93 77 80 12.00 57.7 255 341 361 703 Came out str;gained 2d
LAST TOTL
ASP AVG ASP THREE SECND PACE BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE CLASS SRR SUR 110 SPD R# TDS SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE P2F P4F PFN AVG MLINE CALL LAST ALL LAST TOTALS LAST RACE COMMENT
11/12/18 DMR 7 8.0 6 6  SEVEN -20 S>R D>T ERR 82 5 ERR 4.7 3.8 1.23 92 99 383 87 2.50 57.8 274 407 415 822 Bit off rail;outkicked
8.0 4 4 OUR SILVER -43 S>R D>T ERR 75 3 ERR 7.1 4.3 1.67 87 86 90 75 3.50 57.0 263 395 400 796 3wd into str;willingly
8.0 8 8 PALLADIUM 35 R>R D>T ERR 75 5 ERR 8.6 3.5 2.47 76 65 94 76 8.00 53.2 235 366 364 729 Came out str;late bid
8.0 77 HONCHO -35 R>R T>T 73 71 5 73 4.8 6.2 ©.77 92 101 61 73 5.00 52.3 254 378 380 758 3wd into str;wkened
8.0 2 2 MORE ICE -35 R>R T>T 72 71 4 72 6.0 4.9 1.24 92 101 65 72 4.50 52.4 258 377 380 757 Stalked 3wd;weakened
8.0 3 3 THE CREEP 45 R>R T>T 76 76 5 76 4.2 5.3 .79 88 77 87 73 10.00 51.3 252 355 375 730 Modest fractions;drvng
8.0 11 SAMMYS 45 S>R T>T ERR 70 1 ERR ©.8 0.8 1.00 97 64 70 6.00 56.8 161 363 327 690 Urged rail; held sway
8.0 55 GRAB THE 45 S>R D>T ERR 69 5 ERR 6.6 4.7 1.40 85 79 80 68 10.00 55.2 244 359 359 718 3w;swung 5w;driving



LAST TOTL

ASP AVG ASP THREE SECND PACE BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE CLASS SRR SUR 110 SPD R# TDS SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE P2F P4F PFN AVG MLINE CALL LAST ALL LAST TOTALS LAST RACE COMMENT
11/12/18 DMR 8 6.0 1 1 LAGOON -25 S>s D> 71 71 1 71 1.0 8.0 1.25 78 79 82 71 4.50 56.2 239 454 449 903 Off step slow;no rally
6.0 4 4  AGRONOMO -10 S>S D> 76 706 3 706 5.9 5.0 1.18 88 87 78 70 6.00 55.9 253 440 463 903 3wd into str;no rally
6.0 22 CALDER 0 S>SD>D 65 69 8 68 3.9 5.2 0©.76 86 78 82 62 6.00 55.1 246 447 452 899 Vied;stalked;2nd best
6.0 66 SHAKE N 0 S>SD>D 68 68 1 68 1.4 5.7 ©.25 990 86 72 68 4.00 53.6 248 431 447 878 Inside duel;wkend late
6.0 99 STAY IN YO © R>S D>D 67 66 3 67 2.3 4.6 0.50 85 79 63 66 3.50 51.2 227 421 414 835 Inside duel;weakened
6.0 77 MR. CLASS © S>S D>D 62 62 3 62 5.7 3.9 1.46 81 73 66 62 6.00 54.0 220 415 390 805 Bobbled start;4wd str
6.0 88 LIFESBEENG © R>S D>D 58 58 3 58 7.5 6.8 1.11 83 78 55 58 20.00 50.1 216 391 385 776 Bid 3 wide;wkened
6.0 55 MALIBU BAY ILR 0>S >D ERR ERR © ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR 8.00 ERR 0 ERR ERR ERR
6.0 33 HARD TO ILR 0>S >D ERR ERR © ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR 8.00 ERR 0 ERR ERR ERR
LAST TOTL
ASP AVG ASP THREE SECND PACE BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE CLASS SRR SUR 110 SPD R# TDS SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE P2F P4AF PFN AVG MLINE CALL LAST ALL LAST TOTALS LAST RACE COMMENT
11/12/18 TUP 1 4.5 3 3 FLAT OUT 0 S>S D>D ERR 58 5 58 5.0 4.8 1.05 80 80 54 58 5.00 52.4 214 532 535 1067 Chsd;drifted;collared
4.5 22 BLITZING 0 S>S D>D 58 56 10 56 3.0 6.2 0.49 86 70 61 1.60 54.3 156 530 524 1054 Inside;clear for place
4.5 6 6 COTTON 0 S>S D>D ERR 55 3 55 5.0 6.5 ©.77 88 84 63 55 4.00 56.9 235 521 566 1088 Vied to 1/8; gave way;
4.5 55 MT POCKETS © S>SD>D 60 50 5 50 4.3 7.3 0.59 86 68 60 3.56 54.3 154 515 510 1025 Bumped start
4.5 44 GO YOUR 0 S>S D>D ERR 50 4 50 4.7 8.2 .58 93 85 41 49 2.50 55.4 219 503 492 994 Vied early;chased;wknd
4.5 11 RANDY 'S 0 R>S D>D 28 27 6 28 5.7 9.6 ©.60 79 75 28 26 30.00 48.3 182 400 373 772 Retreated
LAST TOTL
ASP AVG ASP THREE SECND PACE BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE CLASS SRR SUR 110 SPD R# TDS SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE P2F P4AF PFN AVG MLINE CALL LAST ALL LAST TOTALS LAST RACE COMMENT
11/12/18 TUP 2 6.5 55 PONTIFICAT -5 S>S D> 81 8 9 80 4.1 4.1 1.00 87 90 80 79 1.60 59.7 257 533 536 1069 Edged away;ridden out
6.5 11 RECONCILIN 25 S>SD>D 82 80 10 81 7.7 3.8 2.00 81 85 86 81 1.80 59.1 252 517 523 1039 Steady urging; gaining
6.5 4 4  AWESOMETAS 15 S>S D> 78 77 8 79 4.7 4.7 1.00 92 98 83 78 2.00 55.5 273 514 553 1067 Off bit slow;3wd bid
6.5 22 ROCKANTHAR 30 S>S D> 77 7110 73 9.0 6.5 1.38 79 74 69 15.00 56.3 153 469 406 875 Off bit slow;4wd lane
6.5 6 6 KALLISTE -5 S>S D> 77 70 106 77 5.9 6.0 0©.98 81 84 86 74 10.00 57.2 251 493 518 1010 7pth uppr; 2nd best
6.5 33 NOT THAT I 25 S>Ss D> 71 70 106 72 7.5 5.8 1.31 84 85 65 71 12.00 56.3 234 474 464 938 3p3/8;5pl/4;6p3/16
LAST TOTL
ASP AVG ASP THREE SECND PACE BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE CLASS SRR SUR 110 SPD R# TDS SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE P2F P4F PFN AVG MLINE CALL LAST ALL LAST TOTALS LAST RACE COMMENT
11/12/18 TUP 3 8.0 11 TRULY -5 R>R T>D 78 73 10 78 6.4 4.6 1.40 82 73 83 80 1.20 54.7 238 447 453 900 Inside;needed more
8.0 33 WEB OF 0 S>RD>D 72 7210 72 4.9 4.9 1.00 80 77 80 67 3.50 56.9 237 436 446 882 Off rail; late bid
8.0 2 2 TWO STEPS © S>R D>D ERR 71 10 ERR 3.6 3.5 1.04 91 79 73 4.50 57.3 170 435 421 855 Dueled; long drive;
8.0 6 6 RACING FOR -15 R>R D>D 69 69 106 69 6.1 5.7 1.8 80 75 73 60 12.00 50.8 228 422 408 830 Nothing left; outrun;
8.0 55 BONITA 0 S>R D>D 69 68 9 69 5.5 2.9 1.99 78 66 85 72 8.00 58.2 229 422 419 841 Lacked late response;
8.0 44 A SONG OF -15 R>R D>D 66 66 106 66 4.1 5.0 ©.82 89 81 69 68 6.00 50.4 239 418 423 842 Vied 2across; gave way
8.0 77 BIG ALICE © S> R D>D 66 66 1@ 66 9.2 5.7 1.61 75 70 85 66 8.00 58.8 230 420 430 850 Passed tiring rival



LAST TOTL

ASP AVG ASP THREE SECND PACE BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG  HORSE CLASS SRR SUR 110 SPD R# TDS SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE P2F P4F PFN AVG MLINE CALL LAST ALL LAST TOTALS LAST RACE COMMENT
11/12/18 TUP 4 7.5 3 3  THEGLORYIS ILR S>S D>T ERR 76 6 80 4.3 5.3 ©0.81 85 81 88 77 ©.80 56.8 254 502 505 1007 Fell back;best of rest
7.5 55 CATS ILR S>S D>T ERR 67 5 74 5.6 7.1 ©.79 77 75 82 69 5.00 56.4 234 442 465 907 Bumped start;3wide bid
7.5 4 4 CELTURIAN -115 S>S D>T ERR 66 7 ERR 5.2 6.2 ©0.85 88 85 69 55 3.50 56.6 242 453 458 911 Outside;lacked a rally
7.5 2 2 REVENGE ILR S>S D>T ERR 62 5 ERR 6.2 5.6 1.11 83 78 77 64 8.00 55.7 238 429 457 886 Swung wide; gave way;
7.5 8 8 ASBAAD -135 R>S D>T ERR 58 8 61 5.5 6.5 0.84 67 62 23 44 20.00 46.4 152 407 297 704 Hesitated break outrun
7.5 77 YAMPAH -110 R>S D>T ERR 57 9 ERR 4.8 5.5 0.87 80 74 73 63 10.00 50.3 227 400 435 835 4pth uppr;willingly
7.5 11 CELESTIAL' -110 R>S D>T ERR 50 10 59 6.0 7.1 ©.85 86 78 54 42 20.00 49.9 218 366 383 750 Saved ground; tired
7.5 6 6  SPOOKY ILR ©>S >T ERR ERR @ ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR 15.00 ERR © ERR ERR ERR
LAST TOTL
ASP AVG ASP THREE SECND PACE BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE CLASS SRR SUR 110 SPD R# TDS SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE P2F P4F PFN AVG MLINE CALL LAST ALL LAST TOTALS LAST RACE COMMENT
11/12/18 TUP 5 5.5 55 TWIRLING -49 S>S D>b 74 72 2 72 3.7 1.6 2.33 88 90 75 72 1.20 56.3 253 445 477 921 Bumped start;5w-turn
5.5 3 3 SHARP 40 S>S D>D ERR 66 2 66 0.0 3.6 ERR 92 79 66 6.00 -60.3 171 444 430 875 Much the best
5.5 6 6 INDICATIVE 40 S>S D>D 63 58 9 58 4.0 6.0 0.66 85 87 78 69 8.00 54.3 250 413 472 885 Bmpd;3-4w;kicked clr
5.5 11 INFANTRY -50 S>S D>D 48 57 4 57 1.3 5.9 ©.21 83 80 54 56 4.50 57.0 217 433 381 814 7-w; no rally
5.5 4 4  MUNNY -60 S>S D>b 57 57 3 57 4.8 4.8 1.0 85 84 73 57 4.00 58.3 242 438 423 861 Never menaced
5.5 7 7 THE HYBRID 30 S>S D>D 40 57 6 57 2.1 5.3 ©.39 80 63 84 62 8.00 53.6 227 416 428 844 Tracked; up in time
5.5 2 2 MONEY ZONE 20 S>S Db>b 59 55 8 55 2.0 5.8 0.35 93 65 64 8.00 54.1 158 413 388 801 Pace score inside
LAST TOTL
ASP AVG ASP THREE SECND PACE BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG  HORSE CLASS SRR SUR 110 SPD R# TDS SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE P2F P4F PFN AVG MLINE CALL LAST ALL LAST TOTALS LAST RACE COMMENT
11/12/18 TUP 6 6.5 9 9 TIGER MARK © S>SD>D 61 63 10 63 5.2 4.8 1.07 86 81 75 63 1.20 56.7 242 362 391 753 Willingly; not enough
6.5 7 7  UNUSUAL 5 S>S D>D 60 59 7 55 8.3 9.2 0.90 64 76 55 6.00 51.9 140 362 285 647 Inside; no rally
6.5 5 5  PARLEY 0 S>S D>D ERR 55 1 55 8.0 7.0 1.14 65 68 78 26 8.00 59.1 211 334 345 679 Even effort; outrun;
6.5 8 8 BATTLE -19 R>S T>D 60 52 6 60 8.0 8.2 0.97 75 69 55 41 5.0 51.0 199 333 308 641 Failed to menace
6.5 11 RIVER 0 R>S D>D 45 52 6 49 7.1 6.9 1.03 82 75 69 57 4.00 50.5 226 326 355 681 5pth uppr;needed rally
6.5 33 KG'SPRO © S>S D>D 51 5110 51 6.6 6.9 ©.95 74 69 65 50 20.00 56.2 208 325 315 640 No factor; outrun;
6.5 6 6  PEGASUS 0 S>S D>D 49 48 10 46 6.6 7.2 0.92 70 72 81 53 10.00 57.5 223 321 364 685 Steady effort;
6.5 2 2  MIGHTY 0 S>S D>D 48 47 10 47 6.0 6.9 0©.87 77 72 63 55 15.00 56.0 212 321 332 653 No factor; outrun;
6.5 44 TROPICAL @ S>S D>D 45 46 10 44 6.0 7.5 0.79 78 74 46 20.00 53.0 152 315 305 620 Broke in;needed rally



LAST TOTL

ASP AVG ASP THREE SECND PACE BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE CLASS SRR SUR 110 SPD R# TDS SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE P2F P4F PFN AVG MLINE CALL LAST ALL LAST TOTALS LAST RACE COMMENT

11/12/18 TUP 7 6.0 7 7 TWO HAIL -15 S>S D> 77 75 8 77 4.8 4.5 1.06 87 88 69 68 1.80 56.3 244 414 414 828 3wd into str;no rally
6.0 22 I'M 0 S>S D> 74 73 106 73 5.1 5.1 1.00 93 79 54 68 3.00 53.4 226 399 345 745 Vied early btwn;tired
6.0 66 SINGAPRAYE © S>S D> 71 69 9 69 3.9 4.6 0.8 93 90 75 70 2.00 56.1 258 394 432 826 4deep into turn;led
6.0 3 3 ATTACK 0 S>SD>0 69 67 9 67 7.7 7.7 1.00 76 72 35 20.00 52.6 148 372 315 688 2-3wide; no menace
6.0 11 GAME STAR © S>S D>D 66 66 106 66 6.5 6.4 1.02 84 78 80 67 6.00 56.1 242 379  4e5 784 Crowded;chckd 3/8s
6.0 88 NO CLASS 0 S>S D>D 60 60 106 60 5.9 6.4 ©.92 87 79 75 62 15.00 55.7 241 361 389 751 No rally;
6.0 4 4 EGOISTA 0 S>S D>D 60 57 9 57 4.4 4.7 ©.94 83 78 72 63 10.00 55.2 233 356 385 741 7wide; mild bid
6.0 55 DR. JAX 0 S>S D>D 46 46 10 46 7.4 7.8 ©0.95 82 72 60 45 30.00 54.8 214 324 314 638 No factor; outrun;

LAST TOTL
ASP AVG ASP THREE SECND PACE BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE CLASS SRR SUR 110 SPD R# TDS SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE P2F P4F PFN AVG MLINE CALL LAST ALL LAST TOTALS LAST RACE COMMENT

11/12/18 TUP 8 8.0 4 4  SORRYABOUT -35 R>R D>T 78 84 10 78 7.3 4.9 1.50 76 80 82 81 6.00 54.2 238 514 463 977 Inside; no response
8.0 22 JOMELO -44 R>R T>T 81 8210 82 7.6 5.1 1.38 65 57 70 82 2.50 51.8 192 516 463 979 Inside bid;hand ridden
8.0 33 PAPPOU 0 R>R D>T ERR 75 10 ERR 5.5 6.1 ©.91 88 80 96 76 3.50 52.9 264 509 495 1004 Drifted; kept to task
8.0 55 CLEANUP 0 R>RD>T 78 74 10 78 4.0 4.3 ©.92 79 79 74 73 10.00 52.3 232 493 448 942 Edged;no match wnnr
8.6 11 AP 5 R>RD>T 72 6910 74 7.6 6.6 1.6 78 75 79 67 20.00 51.7 232 460 442 903 4wd;lack needed bid
8.0 6 6 JUST NIK 5 R>R D>T 69 67 1@ 69 5.5 6.3 0.88 93 94 64 64 15.00 51.4 251 451 450 901 Held safe margin
8.0 77 WORTHURWEI 72 69 73 20.00 214 56 237 293 Always outrun



ERLY TOTL

ASP AVG ASP LAST FIVE PACE PACE
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG  HORSE SRR SUR NOTES FROM LAST RACE 110 RX SPD R# TDS RT S1 S2 SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDONE TDTWO TDCLO P2F P4F PFN SPEED RATINGS DSLR BRIS P CALL1 CALL2 MEDS EQUIP MLINE CLS TRK DIS CHNG SPPNT PWR COMB TOTL LAST COMMENTS
11/12/18 DMR 1 6.0 3 3  PORTAL S>S D>D Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 68 3 64 5 64 5 9% 8 3.9 5.2 0.8 3.9 5.2 0.8 93 8 81 77,58,58,70,55 39 E 6 22.2 46.6 1 © 8.00 135 SA 6.0 M>A 20.7 112 97.9 181 262 3wd;off rail;cleared/

6-hole. Fast last race (13). Clear
early.1st off 39 day layoff. Class 45
Finished 1 from post 6 TIW= 39

Saved ground; weakened/
4wd trip;weakened

6.0 55 STAYTHIRST S>S D>D Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 72 3 68 5 71 4 8 78 3.3 4.2 0.8 1.8 3.2 0.6 9 85 76 71,67,59,79,66 9 E 5 22.6 46.8 1 © 6.00 144 SA 6.0 M>A 17.2 117 99.0 175 251 3wd;rail;cleared/
7-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? Duel;clear;drifted out/
WATCH! Clear early. Class 35 Finished 1 Angled in strj;no rally
from post 7 TIW= 48

6.0 2 2 HOT ROD S>S D>D Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 76 1 76 1 76 1 8 8 1.3 1.3 1.0 1.3 1.3 1.0 88 85 85 76,0,0,0,0 51 E 6 22.3 46.1 1 @ 2.50 121 LRC 5.5 M>A 20.7 116 103.6 173 258 Drifted out str;clear/ /
4-hole. Clear early.lst off 51 day
layoff. Class 50 Finished 1 from post 4
TIW= 51

6.0 4 4 CHITTER S>S D>D 1st off 31 day layoff. Class 20 Finished 67 1 73 3 73 3 89 75 4.1 3.6 1.1 4.1 3.6 1.1 9% 89 67 67,80,71,0,0 31 E 5 22.7 47.2 1 BON 6.00 121 SA 6.0 CO>A 17.2 118 96.8 179 246 Chased btwn;no rally/
5 from post 6 TIW= 63 Sent;pace rail;driving/

Pressed 3w;easy 2d

6.0 11 BE LIFTED S>S D>D Chased Pace. Made big overall move (5). 68 2 65 4 65 4 9% 79 6.0 4.0 1.5 6.0 4.0 1.5 8 9 74 73,62,71,53,0 31pP 2 22.6 46.7 1 @ 3.00 157 SA 6.0 CO>A 6.9 116 96.3 179 253 Off bit slow;late btwn/
*Stretch gain (1.25).BTL horse. 1st off Inside trip;weakened/
31 day layoff.2 races in one pattern. Bumped start;rally btw
Class 20 Finished 2 from post 5 TIW= 71

6.0 6 6 MIDNIGHT S>S D>D Chased Pace. Made big overall move (5). 72 2 75 4 75 4 % 79 3.9 2.1 1.9 3.9 2.1 1.9 89 99 75 74,69,87,68,0 31 E/P 5 22.6 46.3 1 © 2.00 147 SA 6.0 CO>A 17.2 121 102.8 179 254 4wd;3wd;led;held game/

1st off 31 day layoff. Class 20 Finished
1 from post 8 TIW= 57

Came out deep stretch/
Inside duel;cleared

ERLY TOTL
ASP AVG ASP LAST FIVE PACE PACE
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG  HORSE SRR SUR NOTES FROM LAST RACE 110 RX SPD R# TDS RT S1 S2 SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDONE TDTWO TDCLO P2F P4F PFN SPEED RATINGS DSLR BRIS P CALL1 CALL2 MEDS EQUIP MLINE CLS TRK DIS CHNG SPPNT PWR COMB TOTL LAST COMMENTS
11/12/18 DMR 2 7.0 3 3  IT'SJUSTAN S>S D>D Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from ERR @ 91 2 91 2 97 8 1.8 2.7 0.7 1.8 2.7 0.7 98 101 87 92,990,0,0,0 29 E 6 21.5 44.7 1 0 1.40 184 SA 6.0 N>N 30.0 133 108.1 199 286 Fought back rail lane/

2-hole.BTL horse. Clear early. Class 15
Finished 2 from post 2 TIW= 78

Drifted in 1/8;clear/

R>S Flashed speed. 1st off 44 day layoff. 92 83 92 86 66 1.2 1.9 9% 97 54 73,92,0,0,0 44 47.3 73.3 6.00 196 GI>N  20.0 136 98.7 187 241 Stalked 3wd;weakened/ 3wd
Class -5 Finished 4 from post 4 TIW= 89 bid;led;clear late/
S>S D>D Chased Pace. Made big overall move (3). 80 88 88 95 86 1.3 1.3 89 98 91 93,80,92,0,0 29 21.8 44.8 1.20 199 N>N 15.0 138 109.0 187 278 Stalked;bid;gamely/ Bmps
Made a big move early (3). Class 15 st;3wl/2;7w 1/8/
Finished 1 from post 5 TIW= 96 Stalked;bid;led;clear
R>S D>D Made big overall move (6). 1lst off 38 74 83 86 78 71 1.4 1.1 78 91 62 74,74,94,90,0 38 47.8 74.0 6.00 207 GI>N 10.0 131 94.7 169 231 Bobbled st; moved up/
day layoff. Class -5 Finished 5 from Came out str;held 3rd/
post 7 TIW= 76 4wd;3wd;drift in str
S>S Uncharacteristic race? Class 15 ERR 84 84 93 84 1.8 1.8 89 93 86 85,82,0,0,0 29 22.3 45.7 8.00 181 N>N 25.0 126 104.4 182 268 3wd into str;best rest/
Finished 3 from post 4 TIW= 57 Off bit slow;rallied/
ERLY TOTL
ASP AVG ASP LAST FIVE PACE PACE
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG  HORSE SRR SUR NOTES FROM LAST RACE 110 RX SPD R# TDS RT S1 S2 SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDONE TDTWO TDCLO P2F P4F PFN SPEED RATINGS DSLR BRIS P CALL1 CALL2 MEDS EQUIP MLINE CLS TRK DIS CHNG SPPNT PWR COMB TOTL LAST COMMENTS
11/12/18 DMR 3 8.0 3 3  PLATINUM R>R T>T Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 80 5 7910 8 5 94 87 3.7 6.2 0.6 2.1 6.1 0.3 8 94 67 78,77,78,83,83 17 E 7 45.8 69.9 1 0 12.00 170 SA 8.0 O>C 17.5 113 97.9 182 249 Stalked;bid;lost 3rd/

4-hole. Clear early. Class 13 Finished 4
from post 4 TIW= 51

Stalked 3wd;wkened/
Steadied 1/8;lost 3rd

8.0 22 FLIP THE S>R T>T Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 83 2 8 10 8 3 9% 91 2.4 3.9 0.6 1.9 4.8 0.4 92 98 79 85,91,81,85,88 29 E 8 21.7 43.8 1 0 2.50 171 SA 6.5 AO>C  20.0 138 104.1 190 269 Inside duel;weakened/
6-hole. Clear early. Class -37 Finished Drifted out;held game/
7 from post 6 TIW= 48 Drifted out 1/16;held

8.0 6 6 WILD WILD S>R T>T Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 78 1 74 5 78 1 9% 92 3.4 54 0.6 5.0 3.8 1.3 92 95 73 78,78,85,60,70 22 P 7 22.1 43.7 1 0 4.00 140 SA 6.5 R>C 17.5 120 103.4 187 260 Stalked btwn;no bid/
5-hole. Class -12 Finished 5 from post Stalked;held 3rd btwn/
5 TIW= 85 3wd into str;bid;clear

8.0 55 SPIRIT R>R D>T Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 69 1 71 5 69 1 8 87 4.6 4.9 0.9 8.3 6.7 1.2 81 81 86 79,46,69,75,88 50 E 3 47.9 72.9 1 @ 10.00 151 LRC 8.0 M>C 7.5 108 96.3 162 248 Drifted out str;held/
1-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? Carried far wide;eased/
WATCH! Clear early.lst off 50 day 3wd str;slammed 3/16
layoff. Class 33 Finished 1 from post 1
TIW= 51

8.0 11 ZESTFUL S>R T>T *Stretch gain (1.25).BTL horse. 2 races 81 2 8210 8 2 91 58 5.7 5.4 1.1 4.7 8.0 0.6 8 89 84 82,77,85,86,87 16 E/P 7 22.4 44.7 1 0 4.00 173 SA 6.5 O>C 17.5 124 104.7 175 259 Stalked 3wd;edged 3rd/

in one pattern. Class -5 Finished 4 from 4wd; 3wd ;weakened/ Off
post 6 TIW= 63 rail str;wkened
8.0 4 4 POINT R>R D>T Class 28 Finished 5 from post 4 TJWw=53 79 4 78 18 79 4 84 75 5.6 5.3 1.1 3.6 4.1 0.9 8 86 62 70,81,76,83,77 15 E/P 5 47.9 74.1 1 @ 12.00 156 SA 8.5 C>C 12.5 113 91.1 166 228 Svd ground to stretch/
Brushed 1/8;edged 3rd/
Came out str;no rally

8.0 7 7 BUCKSTOPPE R>R T>T Made big overall move (3). Made a big 82 5 8 7 8 7 8 62 7.4 5.3 1.4 7.4 5.3 1.4 67 65 92 81,77,85,93,81 16 S 0 48.6 72.5 1 BON 3.00 178 SA 8.0 O>C 0.0 124 100.2 132 224 Off bit slow;no bid/ 3wd
move early (4). *Stretch gain (3). 2 into str;edged 3rd/ Off
races in one pattern. Class 3 Finished 7 slow;3wd bid
from post 1 TIW= 55

8.0 8 8 HEY R>R D>T *Stretch gain (2). 1st off 50 day ERR © 80 10 ERR © 82 95 7.3 4.9 1.5 ERR ERR ERR 72 71 104 88,90,82,83,74 50 P 3 49.1 72.5 1 BON 10.00 180 EMD 8.5 N>C 7.5 121 98.9 143 247 3w2ndturn; belated bid/
layoff. Class -70 Finished 5 from post 5 Angled outl/8;late bid/

TIW= 50 Pressd3w;some late run



DATE  TRK #

11/12/18 DMR 4

DATE  TRK #

11/12/18 DMR 5

DT

PP

CHEYENNE

DESIRED

WHATA

GIA LULA

MI

BIG BASE

BLITZKRIEG

STONEGATE

PITINO

POINTED

BIG BUZZ

CUPID'S

SELLWOOD

ARCH

S>S

S>S

S>S

S>S

S>S

S>S

R>R

S>R

R>R

S>R

R>R

R>R

R>R

D>l

o

D>D

D>D

D>D

D>l

o

D>D

T>

4

T>

4

T>

4

T

T

T

T

NOTES FROM LAST RACE

Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
1-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed?
WATCH! 1st off 53 day layoff. Class -40
Finished 6 from post 1 TIW= 42

Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
3-hole.BTL horse. Clear early. Class ©
Finished 3 from post 3 TIW= ©

Class @ Finished 6 from post 5 TIW= 58

Flashed
8-hole.
Class @

speed. *Pressed Pace from
*Stretch gain (2.94).BTL horse.
Finished 2 from post 8 TIW= 53
Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
5-hole. Fast last race (11). 1st off 82
day layoff. Class @ Finished 2 from post
5 TIW= 54

Flashed speed. Fast last race (15).
Class @ Finished 3 from post 1 TIW= 35

Flashed speed. *Stretch gain (.75).
Class @ Finished 2 from post 11 TIW=

NOTES FROM LAST RACE

Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
1-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed?
WATCH! Clear early. Class @ Finished 4
from post 1 TIW= 62

Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
6-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed?
WATCH!BTL horse. Clear early. Class ©
Finished 4 from post 6 TIW= 56

Slow last race (13). Class @ Finished 6
from post 9 TIW= 63

Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
2-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed?
WATCH! Clear early.lst off 43 day
layoff. Class 10 Finished 5 from post 2
TIW= 30

Made big overall
(1.5).BTL horse.
from post 7 TIW=
Uncharacteristic
horse.
TIW= 63
*Stretch gain (.44).BTL horse.
Finished 2 from post 3 TIW= 77

move (7). *Stretch gain
Class @ Finished 2

54

early speed? WATCH!BTL
Class @ Finished 3 from post 5

Class @
Made big overall move (4). *Stretch gain

(1). 1st off 376 day layoff. Class 4
Finished 3 from post 8 TIW= 73

63

75

72

72

70

71

ERR

ERR

77

79

77

82

77

61

75

71

69

70

72

82

83

77

79

81

83

77

10

10

10

63

75

72

67

70

72

88

ERR

76

79

81

84

77

RT S1 S2 SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDONE TDTWO TDCLO P2F P4F PFN

93

86

91

92

91

9%

91

96

83

93

88

86

79

72

74

76

77

96

87

87

60

104

95

2.5

3.4

3.3

4.1

5.1

5.3

5.4

5.2

4.9

4.3

4.0

0.5

0.6

0.6

0.8

0.9

1.3

SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE

5.8

4.4

6.1

5.6

6.4

4.7

6.6

6.7

5.0

6.0

4.1

4.5

3.3

4.1

0.9

0.9

1.0

1.4

1.4

1.4

1.6

2.8

5.0

5.4

4.4

4.0

4.3

4.0

0.5

0.6

0.6

1.1

0.9

1.3

TDONE TDTWO TDCLO

ERR

6.6

6.7

ERR

0.3

ERR

1.0

1.3

1.4

1.4

1.6

98

88

96

94

95

92

96

92

88

83

90

81

83

100

95

97

9%

102

96

86

89

95

88

82

62

73

67

73

80

77

72

62

62

81

81

87

86

LAST FIVE
SPEED RATINGS

68,0,0,0,0

70,71,39,59,64

71,82,71,76,0

70,73,70,73,71

80,78,72,74,82

85,72,73,69,66

79,66,67,75,71

LAST FIVE
SPEED RATINGS

75,77,77,78,74

88,76,77,89,78

70,87,91,84,0

71,79,73,71,77

80,76,82,83,81

90,76,78,0,0

91,79,82,85,82

79,82,70,0,0

30

10

30

82

10

18

24

22

43

22

24

24

376

BRIS P CALL1 CALL2 MEDS EQUIP MLINE

22.3

21.5

23.7

21.9

22.4

22.7

23.3

46.6

45.1

48.0

45.7

46.5

46.8

46.8

CALL1 CALL2

21.3

46.4

21.9

47.1

22.6

47.0

47.4

48.0

43.2

70.4

43.8

71.5

43.6

70.4

70.5

72.9

MEDS

EQUIP

12.

5.

3.

12.

20.

00

00

00

00

.00

.00

00

.00

.00

.50

.00

151

149

151

121

167

166

163

178

161

166

164

TRK DIS

LRC 5.5
SA 5.5
SA 5.0
SA 5.5
DMR 6.5
SA 5.0
SA 7.0
TRK DIS

SA 6.5
SA 9.0
SA 6.5
SA 9.0
SA 6.5
SA 9.0
SA 9.0
DMR 8.0

CHNG  SPPNT
M 16.7
MM 19.4
MM 11.1
MM 16.7
MM 11.1
MM 19.4
M>M 5.6
CHNG  SPPNT
S>s 24.2
s> 15.2
S>S 24.2
M>S 9.1
S>S 3.0
s>s 12.1
S>S 6.1
S>S 6.1

PWR

112

104

115

115

115

113

113

PWR

120

117

1ol

121

124

134

119

ERLY

PACE

COMB  TOTL

100.4 181

91.5 198

97.8 88

1e01.1 191

101.2 191

101.3

97.1 182

ERLY
PACE
COMB  TOTL

104.9 199

105.3 198

105.9 188

99.9 174

108.2 172

106.7 185
107.9 169

99.7 165

TOTL
PACE
LAST

260

16.

i

25,

[

264

175

259

TOTL
PACE
LAST

270

250

23

)

253

266

256

251

COMMENTS

Inside trip;weakened/ /

Btwn;inside;edged wire/
3wd;drifted in 3/16/
Clear 2d turn;gave way
Squeezed;steadied strt/
Inside bid;lost 2nd/
Inside duel;weakened
4wd; 3wd; btwn foes wire/
Led;drift in;bump 1/16/
Vied; stalked;wkened
4wd to turn;rail str/
Vied;stalked;held 2nd/
Stalked btwn;no bid

Stalked rail;best rest/
Inside; lost 2nd late/
3wd into str;2nd best
Btwn turn;held 2nd/ 4wd
into str;no rally/
4w;eased in;mild bid

COMMENTS

Bit off rail str;wkend/
3wd;inside 1/4;wkened/
Stalked;bid 3wd;wkened

Speed;inside;outkicked/
Bid 4 wide; weakened/
Bobbled start;5wd;4wd

Swd into str;drift in/
Inside;dueled;edged 2d/
Came out from whip 1/8
Inside;steadied 1/16/ 3wd
into str;edged 3rd/ 4wd
str;slammed 3/16

Came out str;rallied/
Came out str;wkened/ 4wd
into str;btwn wire

Led 3wd 1/8;held 3rd/
Stalked rail; 2d best/
4wd into str;edged 3rd
Bid btwn;led;edged/ 4wd
turns;weakened/ 3wd into
str;led;edged

Waited 1/4;split 1/16/
Came out 1/8;up 3rd/ 3wd
into str;no bid



DATE  TRK #

11/12/18 DMR 6

DATE

TRK #

11/12/18 DMR 7

DT

PP

HORSE SRR
MONTEREY  S>R
FOREVER S>R
HARROVIAN S>R
POINT R>R
HOLLAND R>R
PIONEEROF R>R
FREDDIES R>R
DUKES UP  R>R

HORSE SRR

HONCHO R>R
THE CREEP R>R
SAMMYS S>R
MORE ICE R>R
SEVEN S>R
GRAB THE  S>R

OUR SILVER S>R

PALLADIUM R>R

D>l

T>l

D>l

D>l

D>l

D>l

T>

T>

D>

D>

D>

D>

o

o

o

D

o

D

4

T

T

4

T

4

ASP
NOTES FROM LAST RACE 110
Flashed speed. *Stretch gain (.5). 1st 77

off 37 day layoff. Class @ Finished 4

from post 7 TIW= 30

Made big overall move (3). *Stretch gain ERR
(1).BTL horse. Class -10 Finished 2
from post 3 TIW= 51

Made big overall move (4). *Stretch gain
(1.25). 1st off 37 day layoff.2 races in
one pattern. Class @ Finished 2 from
post 5 TIW= 52

1st off 38 day layoff. Class
Finished 10 from post 2 TIW=

74

-20
54

88

Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 82
1-hole. Class @ Finished 5 from post 1
TIW= 44

Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
4-hole.BTL horse. Class @ Finished 4
from post 4 TIW= 65

Made big overall move (3). Made a big
move early (6.5). *Stretch gain (1.5).
Very strong move! Take note! Class 5
Finished 3 from post 3 TIW= 53

Made big overall move (5). *Stretch gain
(1.25).BTL horse. 1st off 92 day layoff.
Class -10 Finished 2 from post 4 TIW= 57

82

83

87

NOTES FROM LAST RACE

Chased Pace. 1st off 35 day layoff.
Class -35 Finished 7 from post 7 TIW= 62

Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 76
7-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed?
WATCH! Clear early. Class 45 Finished 1
from post 7 TIW= 54

Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
2-hole. Clear early.lst off 58 day
layoff. Class 45 Finished 1 from post 2
TIW= 48

1st off 35 day layoff. Class -35
Finished 8 from post 8 TIW= 78

ERR

72

Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from ERR
1-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed?
WATCH! Clear early. Class -20 Finished 3
from post 1 TIW= 44

Made big overall move (5). Class 45
Finished 1 from post 6 TIW= 67

ERR

*Stretch gain (.75).BTL horse. 1st off ERR
51 day layoff. Class -43 Finished 3 from
post 6 TIW= 59

*Stretch gain (3.5).BTL horse.

Finished 4 from post 2 TIW= 61

Class 35 ERR

10

RX

89

75

88

82

81

82

87

AVG
SPD

71

70

70

71

82

69

75

75

10

10

10

10

10

10

10

R#

ERR

74

89

82

82

83

87

ASP
DS

73

76

ERR

72

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

RT S1 S2 SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDONE TDTWO TDCLO P2F

10

RT

94

92

86

82

82

83

82

S1

94

67

9%

91

97

82

91

74

94

78

89

89

90

83

88

S2

93

-4

87

82

84

89

94

Sysi

4.8

4.2

0.8

6.0

4.7

6.6

7.1

8.6

SYS2

6.2

5.3

0.8

4.9

3.8

4.7

4.3

3.5

0.9

1.8

CLOSE

0.8

1.0

1.7

2.5

ERR

7.1

TDONE

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

5.2

TDTWO

5.0

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

TDCLO

1.1

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

90

85

79

80

79

67

76

92

88

97

92

92

85

87

76

P4F

94

93

81

72

72

69

85

P4F

101

77

101

99

79

86

65

PFN

84

77

77

91

94

80

90

87

64

65

83

80

90

%

LAST FIVE
SPEED RATINGS
78,84,71,90,68

86,87,83,80,91

80,76,85,73,82

79,88,91,92,80

84,78,75,70,80

86,81,79,86,66

78,73,85,82,86

90,81,89,86,90

LAST FIVE
SPEED RATINGS

77,72,71,55,78

76,76,73,75,56

70,0,0,0,0

76,71,69,68,0

88,86,88,69,77

67,65,72,64,75

85,66,73,0,0

75,72,81,78,69

DSLR

25

37

38

24

24

23

92

DSLR

35

15

58

35

22

22

51

17

BRIS P CALL1

BRIS

P

21.9

22.9

47.1

49.0

49.0

47.6

48.0

CALL1

45.8

50.5

22.1

46.3

22.0

22.8

22.1

50.7

CALL2 MEDS EQUIP MLINE

43.8

45.8

71.3

73.5

73.3

72.4

73.1

CALL2

71.0

76.2

45.3

71.5

44.8

46.7

45.3

75.5

MEDS

EQUIP

0

12.00

12.00

12.00

198

126

182

155

151

126

146

131

113

124

116

121

116

126

CcomMB

108.3

87.1

95.5

96.5

101.0

96.2

101.1

ERLY

PACE

TOTL

184

178

160

152

151

136

161

TOTL
PACE
LAST

25

v

237

243

24!

G

216

251

COMMENTS

Stalked btwn;edged 3rd/
Shifted 3wd into lane/
Off bit slow;inside
Came out str;willingly/
Stalked btwn;no bid/ 4wd
into str;rallied

Came out str;gained 2d/
3-4wd to str;gained 2d/
Inside trip;edged 3rd

Saved ground; weakened/
3wd into str;rallied/
Btwn foes 1/8;rail bid
Saved ground; no rally/
Off bit slow;up 3rd/ Off
bit slow;no rally
Chased 3wd;outkicked/
Pressed;bid;led;cleard/
Waited 1/4;no bid

4wd into str;best rest/
Stumbled badly start/
Saved ground to lane

3wd into str;bid btwn/
Settled;bid 2w;empty/ 4w
into str;clear late

COMMENTS

10.00

6.00

10.00

3.50

8.00

142

178

186

203

156

TRK DIS

SA 7.0
SA 6.5
SA 7.0
SA 8.0
SA 8.5
SA 8.5
SA 8.0
DMR 8.0
TRK DIS

SA 8.0
GG 8.0
CBY 5.0
SA 8.0
SA 6.5
GG 5.5
LRC 6.5
SA 8.0

CHNG  SPPNT
C 18.2
C 15.2
cC 18.2
C 9.1
C 15.2
cC 12.1
cC 9.1
cC 3.0
CHNG  SPPNT
N>A 7.1
R>A 16.7
S>A 14.3
N>A 9.5
N>A 19.0
R>A 11.9
N>A 14.3
CO>A 7.1

114

108

121

130

113

125

98.0

104.9

99.4

105.4

100.3

102.1

97.1

165

97

193

191

164

173

141

252

161

258

274

244

263

235

3wd into str;wkened/ 4wd
into str;no bid/ 5wd into
str;drift in

Modest fractions;drvng/
Saved ground;weakened/
3wd bid;drifted in str

Urged rail; held sway/ /

Stalked 3wd;weakened/ 3wd
into str;rallied/ Btwn
1/4;outkicked

Bit off rail;outkicked/
Bid 3wd;came back on/ Bid
3wd;led str;gamely

3w;swung 5w;driving/
Vied;stalked;wkened/ Came
out str;no rally

3wd into strj;willingly/
Off slowly;inside/ 3wd
into str;rallied

Came out str;late bid/
Angled outl/8;late bid/
3wd into strj;late 2nd



DATE  TRK #

11/12/18 DMR 8

DATE  TRK #

11/12/18 TUP 1

DATE  TRK #

11/12/18 TUP 2

DT PP
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R>S
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S>S

S>S

S>S
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S$>S

S$>S
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S>S

S>S
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>D
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o

D>D

D>D

D>D

D>D

D>l

o

D>l

o

D>D

D>l

o

D>D

D>D

NOTES FROM LAST RACE

1st off 737010 day layoff. FTS. Class
ILR Finished @ from post @ TIW= 58

1st off 737010 day layoff. FTS. Class
ILR Finished © from post © TIW= 64
Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
3-hole. Clear early.1lst off 81 day
layoff. Class @ Finished 4 from post 3
TIW= 61

Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
5-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed?
WATCH! Clear early. Class @ Finished 4
from post 5 TIW= 48

Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
4-hole. Class @ Finished 2 from post 4
TiW= 13

Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
8-hole.Uncharacteristic race? Class @
Finished 6 from post 8 TIW= 38

1st off 45 day layoff. Class -10
Finished 4 from post 4 TIW= 42

Uncharacteristic race? 1st off 37 day
layoff. Class -25 Finished 4 from post 3
TIW= 45

Class @ Finished 5 from post 7 TIW= 63

NOTES FROM LAST RACE

Class @ Finished 2 from post 1 TIW= 22

Flashed speed.Uncharacteristic early
speed? WATCH! 1st off 211 day layoff.
Class @ Finished 6 from post 5 TIW= 64
Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH!
Class @ Finished 3 from post 2 TIW= 51

1st off 59 day layoff. Class @ Finished
7 from post 8 TIW= 47

Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
3-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed?
WATCH! Clear early. Class @ Finished 7
from post 3 TIW= 54

Chased Pace. 1st off 50 day layoff.
Class @ Finished 3 from post 4 TIw= 70

NOTES FROM LAST RACE

Made big overall move (7). Class -5
Finished 2 from post 2 TIW= 59

Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
1-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed?
WATCH! Clear early. Class -5 Finished 1
from post 1 TIW= 79

Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
6-hole.BTL horse. Clear early.lst off 89
day layoff. Class 15 Finished 4 from
post 6 TIW= 68

1st off 122 day layoff. Class 25
Finished 6 from post 8 TIW= 65

1st off 50 day layoff. Class 30 Finished
7 from post 4 TIW= 49

Made big overall move (3). *Stretch gain
(2).BTL horse. Class 25 Finished 3 from
post 2 TIW= 43
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66 3
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LAST FIVE
SPEED RATINGS

68,0,0,0,0

64,58,76,0,0

70,57,58,73,72

57,61,55,0,0

74,64,71,0,0

71,0,0,0,0

52,62,71,0,0

LAST FIVE

SPEED RATINGS

63,61,58,67,59

42,59,45,55,0

60,56,63,36,35

24,39,16,27,20

59,57,50,0,0

55,72,48,54,59

LAST FIVE
SPEED RATINGS
78,67,78,76,62

80,81,75,74,79

86,82,67,85,84

64,78,71,73,75

63,68,76,67,55

78,79,85,81,78

sokoskok

81

24

22

24

45

37

22

DSLR

211

21

59

16

50

29

89

122

50

23

BRIS P CALL1 CALL2 MEDS EQUIP MLINE
NA 0.6 0.0 1 o 8.00
NA 6.6 0.0 1 o 8.00
E 22.9 47.5 1 ° 4.00
E 48.4 74.2 1 BOFF 3.50
E 23.0 47.0 1 ® 6.00
NA 48.7 75.1 1 0 20.00
E 23.2 46.9 1 BON 6.00
NA 24.1 47.6 1 o 4.50
P 23.5 48.06 1 BON 6.0
BRIS P CALL1 CALL2 MEDS EQUIP MLINE

E 22.3 46.6 1 ° 1.60
NA 22.8 46.6 1 BOFF 2.50
E 22.3 46.6 1 o 3.50
NA 50.7 78.6 1  BON 30.00
E 22.7 45.9 1 ° 4.00
3 23.7 48.9 1 ® 5.00
BRIS P CALL1 CALL2 MEDS EQUIP MLINE

3 23.1 46.2 1 o 10.00
E/P 22.8 44.9 1 o 1.60
E/P 22.2 46.0 1 ° 2.00
S 23.4 46.9 1 o 12.00
3 23.7 47.1 1 o 15.00
s 23.8 46.2 1 ° 1.8

127
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151
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152

127

113

115

113

113

162
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148
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SA

SA
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ALB
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LRC
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DIS

8.0

6.0

6.0

DIS

6.0

4.5

8.0

6.0

7.0

6.5

5.5

6.5

5.0

5.5

CHNG  SPPNT
>M 0.0
>M 0.0
MM 30.0
MM 20.0
MM 15.0
M>M 0.0
MM 25.0
M>M 0.0
MM 10.0
CHNG  SPPNT
MM 26.1
MM 21.7
MM 26.1
M>M 0.0
MM 13.0
MM 13.0
CHNG  SPPNT
A>A 11.8
AO>A  47.1
A 29.4
A 0.0
oA 0.0
A 11.8

PWR COMB

110

113 89.2

108 98.1

103 84.7

110 96.9

108 97.5

107 93.7

PWR COMB

97 91.4

97 99.8

79 76.0

92 94.2

100 94.1

PWR COMB

101.9

122 107.9

123 103.4

110 95.7

106 96.4

117 104.5

ERLY
PACE
TOTL

176
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164

161
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157

154

ERLY

PACE

TOTL

178

86

154

172

160

ERLY
PACE
TOTL

165

177

190

169

79

166

TOTL
PACE
LAST

248

227

246

216

253

239

220

TOTL
PACE
LAST

154

18

N

23

vy

214

TOTL
PACE
LAST

257

273

23

B

15

w

25

N

COMMENTS
//
//
Inside duel;wkend late/ /

Inside duel;weakened/
Stalked pace; weakened/
Bid btwn;edged 2nd

Vied;stalked;2nd best/
Btwn into str;no bid/ 6wd
turn;imp position

Bid 3 wide;wkened/ Off
bit slow;4wd lane/ Off
slow;3wd into str

3wd into str;no rally/
Bit tight 3/8;no bid/
Dueled btwn;edged 2nd
Off step slow;no rally/ /

Bobbled start;4wd str/
3wd;4wd;no rally/
Swd;4wd; came out 3/16

COMMENTS

Inside;clear for place/
Duel inside; held 2nd/
Stmbld;pressd;held 2nd
Vied early;chased;wknd/
Chased inside; tired/
Away well; stopped;
Bumped start/ Dueled
inside;weakened/ Clear
early; gave way
Retreated/ No rally/
Trailed throughout

Vied to 1/8; gave way;/
Swung wide; no rally;/
Dpd bck; came again

Chsd;drifted;collared/
Closed determinedly/
Setpcd;weakened

COMMENTS

7pth uppr; 2nd best/
Tracked3w;faded/ Tracked
3w;outkicked2d

Edged away;ridden out/
Pressed rail;edged clr/
Pressed rail; gave way

Off bit slow;3wd bid/
Re-bid;led;held game/
Chased; weakened

3p3/8;5p1/4;6p3/16/ 2path
turn;no rally/ 3-2p
turn;4p3/16;rally

Off bit slow;4wd lane/
Off bit slow;5wd lane/
Came out str;edged 3rd
Steady urging; gaining/
No match; 2nd best/
Controll/16;edgedclr



ERLY TOTL
LAST FIVE PACE PACE
DATE  TRK # NOTES FROM LAST RACE 110 RX SPD R# TDS RT S1 S2 SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDONE TDTWO TDCLO P2F P4F PFN SPEED RATINGS DSLR BRIS P CALL1 CALL2 MEDS EQUIP MLINE CLS TRK DIS CHNG SPPNT PWR COMB TOTL LAST COMMENTS

11/12/18 TUP 3 8.0 4 4 A SONG OF R>R D>D Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 66 9 6610 66 9 76 76 4.1 5.0 0.8 4.1 5.1 0.8 8 81 69 64,71,68,59,76 23 E/P 8 47.8 74.0 1 0 6.00 119 TUP 8.0 CO>C  25.8 107 96.4 170 239 Vied 2across; gave way/

6-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed?
WATCH! Clear early. Class -15 Finished 5
from post 6 TIW= 39

Wide early; even fin/
Lone spd; held well

S>R Made big overall move (4). *Stretch gain 72 72 72 68 76 4.9 4.9 4.5 5.2 0.9 8 77 80 75,59,66,62,65 100 26.0 49.2 0 3.50 129 ASD C>C 22.6 109 157 237 Off rail; late bid/
(.5).BTL horse. 1st off 100 day layoff. Forward inside; no bid/
Class @ Finished 2 from post 3 TIW= 52 Tracked;brief bid rail
S>R Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from ERR 71 ERR 92 -3 3.6 3.5 ERR ERR ERR 91 79 79,66,73,75,75 22 22.2 45.2 0 4.50 115 TUP C>C 19.4 109 91 170 Dueled; long drive;/
2-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? Weakened; held show/ Btw
WATCH! Clear early. Class @ Finished 1 hrs; even fin
from post 2 TIW= 41
8.0 6 6 RACING FOR R>R D>D Class -15 Finished 6 from post 5 TJW=60 69 9 6910 69 9 73 78 6.1 5.7 1.1 6.2 5.5 1.1 8 75 73 62,58,60,72,78 23 P 3 48.5 74.4 1 0 12.00 124 TUP 8.0 CO>C 9.7 101 93.3 155 228 Nothing left; outrun;/
Brief factor btw;empty/
Bumped brk;faded insd
8.0 11 TRULY R>R T>D Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 78 4 7310 78 4 79 8 6.4 4.6 1.4 6.3 3.3 1.9 8 73 83 74,85,82,69,69 9s 3 48.3 72.4 1 0 1.20 122 TUP 8.0 C>C 9.7 115 103.2 155 238 Inside;needed more/
2-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? Gaining; just missed/
WATCH!BTL horse. Class -5 Finished 4 Drew off; easy winner
from post 2 TIW= 54
8.0 7 7 BIG ALICE S>R D>D Class @ Finished 4 from post 5 TIW= 52 66 5 6610 66 5 81 83 9.2 5.7 1.6 9.0 5.4 1.7 75 70 85 66,71,62,63,64 29 S 0 24.1 46.6 1 0 8.00 117 TUP 6.0 C>C 0.0 99 101.9 145 230 Passed tiring rival/
4wlstturn; Sw2ndturn/ Off
step slow;3w-turn
8.0 55 BONITA S>R D>D Class @ Finished 4 from post 4 TIW= 49 69 5 68 9 69 5 79 8 5.5 2.9 1.9 4.1 2.4 1.7 78 66 85 62,0,81,64,68 10 P 4 24.5 47.2 1 © 8.00 116 TUP 6.0 C>C 12.9 98 100.7 144 229 Lacked late response;/
Pulled up; walked off/
Bid1/8;vied;edged clr
ERLY TOTL
ASP AVG ASP LAST FIVE PACE PACE
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG  HORSE SRR SUR NOTES FROM LAST RACE 110 RX SPD R# TDS RT S1 S2 SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDONE TDTWO TDCLO P2F P4F PFN SPEED RATINGS DSLR BRIS P CALL1 CALL2 MEDS EQUIP MLINE CLS TRK DIS CHNG SPPNT PWR COMB TOTL LAST COMMENTS
11/12/18 TUP 4 7.5 6 6  SPOOKY 0>S >T 1st off 737010 day layoff. FTS. Class ERR © ERR @ ERR © 57 -9 ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR 0,0,0,0,0 X NA @ 0.0 0.0 1 0 15.00 ERR 0.0 >MO 0.0 ERR ] e/ /
ILR Finished @ from post @ TIW= 49
7.5 55 CATS S>S D>T Made big overall move (3). Class ILR ERR © 67 5 74 1 83 83 5.6 7.1 0.8 2.0 4.0 0.5 77 75 82 70,64,74,65,63 28 E 4 23.5 46.9 1 © 5.00 112 TUP 6.5 MO>MO 21.1 97 97.7 152 234 Bumped start;3wide bid/
Finished 3 from post 5 TIW= 45 Well placed; empty/
2w;drifted out;bested
7.5 3 3 THEGLORYIS S>S D>T Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from ERR © 76 6 8 1 8 8 4.3 5.3 ©.8 7.8 8.9 0.9 8 81 88 79,80,73,78,72 28 E 5 23.0 46.2 1 © 0.80 148 TUP 6.5 MO>MO 26.3 120 101.4 166 254 Fell back;best of rest/
3-hole. *Stretch gain 4wd; 3wd ;weakened/ Svd
(.25).Uncharacteristic early speed? ground; weakened
WATCH! Clear early. Class ILR Finished 2
from post 3 TIW= 51
7.5 4 4 CELTURIAN S>S D>T Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from ERR © 66 7 ERR © 89 78 5.2 6.2 0.8 ERR ERR ERR 88 85 69 65,33,68,75,80 10 E 3 23.0 46.3 1 BOFF 3.50 152 TUP 6.0 M>MO  15.8 91 97.3 173 242 Outside;lacked a rally/
8-hole. Class -115 Finished 3 from post 4wd;3wd; gave way;eased/
8 TIW= 46 Pulled;tight 6-1/2
7.5 11 CELESTIAL' R>S D>T Flashed speed.Uncharacteristic race? ERR @ 5010 59 1 74 73 6.0 7.1 0.8 6.7 6.7 1.0 8 78 54 47,23,55,62,49 10 E 1 49.1 75.6 1 0 20.00 121 TUP 8.0 M>MO 5.3 64 86.6 164 218 Saved ground; tired/ Gave
Class -110 Finished 7 from post 6 TIW= way; spent/ Duel
17 tol/2;tired;held3
7.5 8 8 ASBAAD R>S D>T Slow last race (27). Class -135 ERR @ 58 8 61 1 74 55 5.5 6.5 0.8 5.6 2.2 2.5 67 62 23 31,52,50,55,61 21 S 1 49.9 78.4 1 0 20.00 147 MNR 8.0 S>MO 5.3 74 82.4 129 152 Hesitated break outrun/
Finished 6 from post 3 TIW= 30 Bold move;vied;flatten/
3wd 1st; tired inside
7.5 7 7 YAMPAH R>S D>T *Stretch gain (4).BTL horse. Class -110 ERR © 57 9 ERR © 76 82 4.8 5.5 0.9 ERR ERR ERR 80 74 73 61,65,63,54,55 10 P 1 48.6 74.9 1 0 10.00 108 TUP 8.0 M>MO 5.3 87 94.8 154 227 4pth uppr;willingly/
Finished 4 from post 3 TIW= 58 Moved out;bid;game/ No
match; 2nd best
7.5 2 2 REVENGE S>S D>T Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from ERR © 62 5ERR © 8 8 6.2 5.6 1.1 ERR ERR ERR 83 78 77 69,66,58,61,55 28 E 4 23.2 46.9 1 © 8.00 108 TUP 6.5 MO>MO 21.1 99 92.0 161 238 Swung wide; gave way;/

6-hole.Uncharacteristic race? Class ILR

Finished 4 from post 6 TIW= 67

4-w; no rally/ 3-w; no
rally



ERLY TOTL
LAST FIVE PACE PACE
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG NOTES FROM LAST RACE 110 RX SPD R# TDS RT S1 S2 SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDONE TDTWO TDCLO P2F P4F PFN SPEED RATINGS DSLR BRIS P CALL1 CALL2 MEDS EQUIP MLINE CLS TRK DIS CHNG SPPNT PWR COMB TOTL LAST COMMENTS

11/12/18 TUP 5 5.5 3 3  SHARP S>S D>D Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from ERR @ 66 2 66 2 60 -5 0.0 3.6 0.0 0.0 3.6 0.0 92 79 75,57,0,0,0 63 E 4 21.9 0.0 ] ® 6.00 112 CTD 3.5 M>A 12.5 110 105.9 92 171 Much the best/

5-hole. 1st off 63 day layoff. Class 40
Finished 1 from post 5 TIW= 89

Steadied;good energy/

S>S 1st off 93 day layoff. Class -50 48 57 57 88 70 0.2 0.2 83 80 54 48,65,54,62,0 93 24.1 47.2 4.50 167 ALB 6.0 N>A 6.3 105 91.3 163 217 7-w; no rally/ Drv pst
Finished 5 from post 2 TIW= 76 3wd; cleared/ Never a
factor
S>S D>D Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 59 55 55 82 -2 0.3 0.3 93 65 66,65,60,58,53 68 23.0 47.4 8.00 133 ASD 5.0 S>A 25.0 107 93 158 Pace score inside/
2-hole. Fast last race Outside spd; gave way/
(11) .Uncharacteristic early speed? Inside speed
WATCH! Clear early.lst off 68 day
layoff. Class 20 Finished 1 from post 2
TIW= 55
S>S Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 40 57 57 80 81 0.4 0.4 80 63 84 62,61,63,40,53 51 23.1 47.7 8.00 127 HST 6.5 M>A 21.9 103 143 227 Tracked; up in time/
2-hole. 1st off 51 day layoff. Class 30 Pressed; outfinished/
Finished 1 from post 2 TIW= 37 Dueled; 1st whip 1/16
S>S D>D Made big overall move (4). Fast last 63 58 58 78 76 0.7 0.7 85 87 78 74,68,64,42,62 16 23.0 47.3 8.00 106 CTD 6.0 M>A 12.5 111 172 250 Bmpd;3-4w;kicked clr/
race (16). Class 40 Finished 1 from Pressed;steadied;even/
post 10 TIW= 36 Pressed 2w; outfinish
S>S D>D *Stretch gain (.5). Fast last race (11). 57 57 57 85 75 1.0 1.0 85 84 73 68,58,46,0,0 58 23.9 46.5 4.00 164 CBY 6.0 N>A 9.4 109 169 242 Never menaced/ Pressed
1st off 58 day layoff. Class -60 3w;drove clear/ Settled
Finished 9 from post 10 TJW= 55 btw; evenly;
S>S Made big overall move (6). *Stretch gain 74 72 72 92 83 2.3 2.3 88 90 75 74,69,0,0,0 92 22.4 45.8 1.20 94 EMD 6.0 N>A 12.5 117 178 253 Bumped start;5w-turn/
(1.25). 1st off 92 day layoff.2 races in Drew off; driving;/
one pattern. Class -49 Finished 2 from
post 11 TIW= 70
ERLY TOTL
ASP AVG ASP LAST FIVE PACE PACE
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG  HORSE SRR SUR NOTES FROM LAST RACE 110 RX SPD R# TDS RT S1 S2 SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDONE TDTWO TDCLO P2F P4F PFN SPEED RATINGS DSLR BRIS P CALL1 CALL2 MEDS EQUIP MLINE CLS TRK DIS CHNG SPPNT PWR COMB TOTL LAST COMMENTS
11/12/18 TUP 6 6.5 4 4 TROPICAL S>S D>D Fast last race (12). Class © Finished 4 45 3 4610 44 7 91 -3 6.0 7.5 ©.8 6.7 8.2 0.8 78 74 58,44,35,39,41 21 E 0 22.3 47.2 1 © 20.00 106 TUP 4.5 M>M 0.0 86 83.8 78 152 Broke inj;needed rally/
from post 3 TIW= 24 Bumped start; off slow/
No threat
6.5 22 MIGHTY S>S D>D Class @ Finished 9 from post 9 TIW= 26 48 4 47 10 47 10 84 76 6.0 6.9 0.9 6.0 6.9 0.9 77 72 63 50,55,61,51,52 16 S 0 23.9 47.5 1 0 15.00 111 TUP 6.0 M>M 0.0 87 91.9 149 212 No factor; outrun;/
Inside; no rallt/ 4-w;
along for 3rd
6.5 7 7  UNUSUAL S>S D>D *Stretch gain (1.75). Slow last race 60 2 59 7 55 3 9 -6 8.3 9.2 0.9 7.4 8.7 0.9 64 76 46,50,68,52,54 37 NA 0 22.7 48.2 1 © 6.00 137 LA 4.5 M>M 0.0 93 92.6 64 140 Inside; no rally/ Saved
(13). 1st off 37 day layoff.2 races in ground;no bid/ Off bit
one pattern. Class 5 Finished 5 from slow;3wd lane
post 6 TIW= 49
6.5 6 6 PEGASUS S>S D>D Made big overall move (5). Made a big 49 5 4810 46 8 84 8 6.6 7.2 ©.9 7.0 7.0 1.0 70 72 8l 64,51,45,61,50 16 P 0 23.9 46.9 1 0 10.00 107 TUP 6.0 M>M 0.0 87 90.1 142 223 Steady effort;/ Failed to
move early (3.25). *Stretch gain (.75). contend/ No factor
Fast last race (16). Class © Finished 5
from post 6 TIW= 47
6.5 33 K G'SPRO S>S D>D Class @ Finished 10 from post 10 TJWw= 25 51 9 5110 51 9 8 77 6.6 6.9 1.0 6.5 6.7 1.0 74 69 65 48,44,57,23,64 16 E 1 24.2 47.7 1 0 20.00 111 TUP 6.0 M>M 25.0 82 83.7 143 208 No factor; outrun;/ Near
rail; no bid/ Inside
faded
6.5 8 8 BATTLE R>S T>D *Stretch gain (.5). 1st off 45 day 60 1 52 6 60 1 73 81 8.0 8.2 1.0 10.0 10.0 1.0 75 69 55 45,21,58,63,60 45 S 1 49.8 75.7 1 © 5.00 138 RP 8.0 M>M 25.0 87 86.9 144 199 Failed to menace/ 4 wide
layoff. Class -19 Finished 8 from post 5 trip; faltered/ 4-5wilst
TIW= 22 turn;brief bid
6.5 11 RIVER R>S D>D Flashed speed. *Stretch gain (1.75). 45 1 52 6 49 4 74 8 7.1 6.9 1.6 7.5 7.5 1.0 8 75 69 57,58,57,45,50 10 s 0 49.0 75.2 1 0 4.00 107 TUP 8.0 M>M 0.0 90 93.1 157 226 5pth uppr;needed rally/
Class @ Finished 5 from post 1 TIW= 64 Spth uppr;needed bid/
6-w; mild rally
6.5 9 9 TIGER MARK S>S D>D Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 61 6 6310 6310 8 8 5.2 4.8 1.1 5.2 4.8 1.1 8 81 75 66,61,62,72,63 16 P 2 23.0 46.3 1 0 1.20 166 TUP 6.0 M>M 50.0 99 100.5 167 242 Willingly; not enough/

5-hole.

S>S

Class @ Finished 3 from post 5
TIW= 70
Class @ Finished 7 from post 3 TJW= 70  ERR

55

55

79

80

1.1

1.1

65

68

78

55,-4,0,0,0 30

24.

47.1

8.00

106

TUP

5.5

M>M

84

133

21

[y

Lacked late response;/
Steadied9/16;6w-turn
Even effort; outrun;/
Hesitated brk;outpaced/



DATE  TRK #

11/12/18 TUP 7

DATE  TRK #

11/12/18 TUP 8

DT

PP

PRG  HORSE SRR
6  SINGAPRAYE S>S
8 NO CLASS S>S
4  EGOISTA S>S
5 DR. JAX S>S
2 I'M S>S
3 ATTACK S>S
1 GAME STAR S>S
7  TWO HAIL  S>S
PRG  HORSE SRR
7 WORTHURWEI

6 JUST NIK R>R
3 PAPPOU R>R
5  CLEANUP R>R
1 AP R>R
2 JOMELO R>R
4 SORRYABOUT R>R

o
v
o

D>D

D>D

D>D

D>D

D>D

D>D

D>

4

D>T

D>T

D>T

T

D>T

ASP

NOTES FROM LAST RACE 110
Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 71
5-hole.BTL horse. Clear early. Class ©
Finished 2 from post 5 TIW= 82
*Stretch gain (.25). Class © Finished 4 60
from post 4 TIW= 35
Class @ Finished 4 from post 8 TIW= 67 60
Class @ Finished 8 from post 4 TIW= 10 46
Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 74
2-hole. Slow last race
(28) .Uncharacteristic race? Class ©
Finished 6 from post 2 TIW= 56
Slow last race (14). Class @ Finished 6 69
from post 7 TIW= 24
Class @ Finished 7 from post 1 TIW= 40 66
1st off 86 day layoff. Class -15 77
Finished 5 from post 5 TIW= 71

ASP

NOTES FROM LAST RACE 110
Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 69
2-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed?
WATCH! Clear early. Class 5 Finished 1
from post 2 TIW= 72
Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from ERR
2-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed?
WATCH! Clear early. Class @ Finished 1
from post 2 TIW= 70
Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 78
4-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed?
WATCH! Clear early. Class @ Finished 2
from post 4 TIW= 78
Flashed speed. Class 5 Finished 3 from 72
post 6 TIW= 54
Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 81
4-hole. Made big overall move (3). 1st
off 240 day layoff. Class -44 Finished 1
from post 4 TIW= 68
Class -35 Finished 6 from post 1 TIW= 69 78

60

57

46

73

67

66

75

67

75

74

69

82

84

10

10

10

10

10

10

10

10

10

10

60

57

46

73

67

66

77

69

ERR

78

74

82

78

RT S1 S2 SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDONE TDTWO TDCLO P2F P4F PFN

10

10

85

85

82

89

91

80

89

89

83

80

81

65

78

79

78

73

65

83

73

79

91

80

84

77

5.5

5.5

4.0

7.0

7.0

7.3

SYs2

6.3

6.1

4.3

6.6

5.1

4.9

0.9

1.0

CLOSE TDONE

0.9

0.9

1.4

3.6

ERR

6.3

8.9

6.6

4.3

0.9

87

83

82

93

76

84

87

TDTWO TDCLO P2F

6.8

ERR

5.7

0.5

ERR

0.8

1.2

1.3

0.8

93

88

79

78

65

76

79

78

72

79

78

88

94

80

79

75

57

80

75

72

60

54

72

80

69

64

96

74

7

)

70

LAST FIVE

SPEED RATINGS

72,67,71,63,64

63,64,58,54,60

61,63,66,61,56

47,42,46,28,33

45,82,78,83,70

53,-22,73,73,70

68,69,64,61,75

72,70,62,80,75

LAST FIVE
SPEED RATINGS

70,58,65,55,75

84,76,69,50,77

73,74,71,73,64

71,62,67,62,61

99,75,82,80,77

78,82,83,87,89

14

14

29

22

86

DSLR

21

16

14

240

15

BRIS P CALL1 CALL2 MEDS EQUIP MLINE

23.3

23.3

23.9

22.6

22.0

24.1

23.3

CALL1 CALL2 MEDS

46.3

47.4

47.0

48.4

49.5

47.6

47.0

47.2

48.0

47.3

47.1

47.6

46.7

72.0

72.3

72.2

75.0

72.0

EQUIP

15.00

10.00

30.00

20.00

15.00

10.00

20.00

6.00

120

119

121

136

125

122

153

143

138

133

TUP

TUP

TUP

TUP

LA

GG

DMR

TUP

TUP

CTD

TUP

TUP

TUP

DIS

5.5

6.0

6.0

5.5

4.5

6.0

7.0

8.0

8.0

8.5

8.0

12.0

8.0

CHNG SPPNT
C>C 33.3
>C 6.7
cC 0.0
cC 0.0
C 20.0
C 0.0
C 20.0
cC 20.0
CHNG  SPPNT
Clm40 16.7
00n4x

>C

cC 13.3
c>C 26.7
C 16.7
C>C 20.0
N>C 6.7
AO>C 0.0

PWR

113

94

96

86

108

93

105

113

PWR

94

119

115

96

118

112

CcomMB

93.8

97.3

73.4

94.9

92.5

97.2

96.8

CcomMB

98.9

105.0

101.2

100.0

105.3

102.2

ERLY

PACE

TOTL

166

161

154

172

76

162

175

ERLY
PACE
TOTL

187

168

158

153

122

156

TOTL
PACE
LAST

233

214

22

o

148

24

)

244

251

264

232

23

N

19

N

238

COMMENTS

4deep into turn;led/ Bmpd
strt;4w;willingly/ Pace
2w;resisted;cght

No rally;/ No factor;
outrunor/ Bumped; crowded
start

7wide; mild bid/ Swide
bid; hung/ Six wide ent
stretch

No factor; outrun;/
Trailed; showed little/
Saved; no rally

Vied early btwn;tired/
6pth uppr;willingly/ Spth
uppr;needed bid

2-3wide; no menace/
Steadied 3/8;eased str/
Saved ground; no rally
Crowded;chckd 3/8s/
Tracked 2w; steady bid/
Tracked 3w; no rally
3wd into str;no rally/
Inside trip;weakened/
3wd;4wd; gave way

COMMENTS

Held safe margin/
Sw-turn; no factor/
4w2ndturn; weakened

Drifted; kept to task/
Vied; held place/
Btwn;bid inside;wkened

Edged;no match wnnr/
Tracked; intight;yield/
Stlkd;4w;clsd;missed

4wd;lack needed bid/ Lack
room upper;stdied/ Pace
2w;cght;easy 2d

Inside bid;hand ridden/
Led late; outclosed/
Inside;3pth;willing

Inside; no response/
Squeezed start; bumped/
4w2ndturn; no factor



