

SHORT SHEETS

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	CLASS	SRR	SUR	ASP	AVG	ASP	SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	P2F	P4F	PFN	LAST	SECND	TOTL	BEST	BEST	TOTALS	LAST RACE COMMENT			
									110	SPD	R#							TDS		THREE	AVG	MLINE			CALL	LAST	ALL
11/16/18	DMR 1	6.5	1	1	BEA'S BOY	20	S>S	D>D	82	75	5	75	6.4	3.9	1.62	89	90	86	82	5.00	54.4	265	525	551	1076	Stalked 3wd;edged 2nd	
		6.5	2	2	BABY	20	R>S	D>D	77	74	6	74	4.8	3.9	1.24	81	70	85	76	3.50	52.9	236	507	510	1017	Dueled;led;edged late	
		6.5	3	3	TWO FIFTY	45	S>S	D>D	65	74	5	74	2.4	3.7	0.65	96	99	81	74	2.50	56.4	276	513	565	1078	Bit off rail;drew away	
		6.5	4	4	PRINCIPE	-50	S>S	T>D	ERR	71	4	70	3.4	4.7	0.73	98		64	73	4.00	56.2	162	508	433	940	Stalked pace; weakened	
		6.5	5	5	IRISH	5	R>S	T>D	ERR	81	67	7	69	5.7	4.1	1.37	82	79	56	70	3.00	53.1	217	479	447	926	No speed
		6.5	6	6	SWAMP	45	R>S	D>D	ERR	64	2	54	5.9	5.9	1.00	76	72	78	64	6.00	51.6	226	470	493	962	4wd move;led 3wd	

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	CLASS	SRR	SUR	ASP	AVG	ASP	SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	P2F	P4F	PFN	LAST	SECND	TOTL	BEST	BEST	TOTALS	LAST RACE COMMENT		
									110	SPD	R#							TDS		THREE	AVG	MLINE			CALL	LAST
11/16/18	DMR 2	6.0	5	5	DON'T	0	S>S	D>D	81	80	9	80	5.4	2.9	1.85	83	94	87	86	1.80	58.1	264	516	580	1096	4wd into str;drift in
		6.0	4	4	COLORMEMON	0	S>S	D>D	80	79	10	79	2.9	3.6	0.81	91	96	79	86	2.00	56.5	266	512	566	1077	Vied btwn foes;held 3d
		6.0	2	2	YES I'M	-17	S>S	D>D	60	77	10	78	2.8	6.0	0.47				88	20.00	4.4	0	502	359	861	Off rail; improved
		6.0	3	3	GRINGO	-2	S>S	D>D	78	77	10	78	5.2	4.5	1.16	91	91	49	76	2.50	52.8	231	486	458	944	5wd to turn;gave way
		6.0	1	1	BOB'S ALL	5	S>S	D>D	76	77	10	76	7.2	6.0	1.20	89	92	78	77	6.00	56.3	259	494	540	1034	Off step slow;inside
		6.0	6	6	MASTER	5	S>S	D>D	73	70	7	70	6.9	7.9	0.88	82	81	78	71	8.00	54.6	241	490	497	987	Bobbled;stdied start

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	CLASS	SRR	SUR	ASP	AVG	ASP	SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	P2F	P4F	PFN	LAST	SECND	TOTL	BEST	BEST	TOTALS	LAST RACE COMMENT			
									110	SPD	R#							TDS		THREE	AVG	MLINE			CALL	LAST	ALL
11/16/18	DMR 3	5.0	7	7	STORMS	0	S>S	T>T	ERR	82	1	82	3.3	4.4	0.75	91	91	82	82	3.00	57.5	264	531	539	1070	Inside trip;edged 3rd	
		5.0	1	1	HAYDENS	10	S>S	D>T	ERR	79	2	ERR	5.8	5.8	1.00	90	95	87	79	2.50	56.9	272	507	551	1058	3wd;2wd;gamely	
		5.0	3	3	TRUCK	-5	S>S	D>T	ERR	89	77	3	89	2.2	4.8	0.46	94	102	52	77	5.00	55.2	248	489	465	954	Vied btwn;2wd;wkened
		5.0	9	10	SEEKING	-60	R>S	T>T	ERR	83	75	2	83	3.3	6.7	0.50	93	88	60	75	6.00	52.0	241	501	464	965	3wd into str;wkened
		5.0	10	11	DAMIANO	0	S>S	D>T	ERR	71	1	ERR	3.3	5.0	0.67	98	99	63	71	6.00	54.0	260	486	487	973	Dueled btwn;weakened	
		5.0	2	2	BOLD	0	S>S	T>T	ERR	70	1	70	7.8	10.0	0.78	94	86	72	70	8.00	55.2	252	485	493	979	Vied;stalked;wkened	
		5.0	8	8	THERMAL	ILR	0>S	>T	ERR	ERR	0	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR				ERR	20.00	ERR	0	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR
		5.0	5	5	NICE WORK	ILR	0>S	>T	ERR	ERR	0	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR				ERR	10.00	ERR	0	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR
		5.0	4	4	KA'NAH	ILR	0>S	>T	ERR	ERR	0	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR				ERR	3.50	ERR	0	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR
		5.0	6	6	CAECILIUS	ILR	0>S	>T	ERR	ERR	0	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR				ERR	10.00	ERR	0	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	CLASS	SRR	SUR	ASP	AVG	ASP	SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	P2F	P4F	PFN	LAST	MLINE	SECND	TOTL	BEST	BEST	TOTALS	LAST RACE COMMENT	
									110	SPD	R#							TDS		THREE	PACE	ALL	LAST			
11/16/18	DMR 4	6.5	4	4	DOMINATING	0	S>S	T>D	89	89	8	87	2.4	2.9	0.84	94	103	83	90	3.50	60.6	280	446	463	910	Inside duel;held 2nd
		6.5	7	7	LAKE TIME	5	S>S	D>D	91	88	10	91	6.6	4.9	1.34	89	86	88	84	6.00	58.5	263	436	428	864	Late gain outside
		6.5	1	1	KELLY'S	-33	S>S	D>D	85	84	10	85	7.3	4.3	1.72	75	83	94	87	2.00	58.5	252	436	424	860	Inside turn; some gain
		6.5	3	3	STEPH	-18	S>S	T>D	87	83	9	84	3.6	4.4	0.81	95	102	60	86	2.50	57.6	257	430	405	835	Drifted in 1/8;wkened
		6.5	2	2	LIGHTNING	0	S>S	D>D	81	83	10	81	4.8	4.8	1.00	84	86	99	83	8.00	57.0	269	423	451	874	Came out 1/8;rallied
		6.5	5	5	SMILING	0	S>S	D>D	81	80	10	81	6.3	5.4	1.18	90	95	85	80	12.00	58.7	270	418	437	854	Came out str;rallied
		6.5	6	6	SPRING	-28	R>S	T>D	84	77	7	84	5.2	6.1	0.87	94	95	64	84	6.00	54.8	253	412	391	803	Chased; weakened

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	CLASS	SRR	SUR	ASP	AVG	ASP	SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	P2F	P4F	PFN	LAST	MLINE	SECND	TOTL	BEST	BEST	TOTALS	LAST RACE COMMENT	
									110	SPD	R#							TDS		THREE	PACE	ALL	LAST			
11/16/18	DMR 5	6.5	5	5	ITS FIVE	-20	S>S	D>D	75	71	4	71	8.0	5.3	1.50	84	80	80	75	3.50	57.6	244	364	360	724	Came out str;no rally
		6.5	7	7	INDI LUCK	0	S>S	D>D	ERR	71	1	71	5.0	3.8	1.33	89	90	74	71	4.00	53.8	253	360	361	721	3w;drifted to rail 1/8
		6.5	1	1	STARRING	0	S>S	D>D	68	65	3	65	5.7	5.4	1.07	90	87	76	65	3.00	54.3	253	345	357	702	Off bit slow;4wd turn
		6.5	9	9	HANDSOME	5	S>S	D>D	72	62	6	62	4.7	5.3	0.90	89	87	77	61	4.00	53.6	253	341	361	702	3wd into str;late 2nd
		6.5	6	6	POPPY'S C	-20	R>S	T>D	70	62	6	61	8.7	5.4	1.60	87	88	63	65	6.00	50.6	238	336	336	672	Saved ground; no rally
		6.5	10	10	HAMMURABI'	0	S>S	D>D	ERR	56	1	56	7.5	6.3	1.20	90	83	64	56	20.00	53.0	237	323	316	639	Stalked inside;wkened
		6.5	2	2	FORESTATIO	0	S>S	D>D	ERR	54	2	63	7.9	7.1	1.10	77	76	78	54	15.00	55.6	231	320	328	648	4wd into str;no bid
		6.5	4	4	ULTRA	0	S>S	D>D	ERR	53	1	53	1.3	8.8	0.14	98	88	55	53	10.00	51.6	241	315	312	627	Inside duel;weakened
		6.5	3	3	MULZOFF	-20	S>S	D>D	41	41	1	41	5.0	10.0	0.50	86	81	39	41	20.00	53.4	206	296	270	566	4wd 1/2;gave way
6.5	8	8	SEA OF	ILR	0>S	>D	ERR	ERR	0	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	20.00	ERR	0	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	CLASS	SRR	SUR	ASP	AVG	ASP	SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	P2F	P4F	PFN	LAST	MLINE	SECND	TOTL	BEST	BEST	TOTALS	LAST RACE COMMENT	
									110	SPD	R#							TDS		THREE	PACE	ALL	LAST			
11/16/18	DMR 6	8.0	6	6	JUST	10	R>R	D>D	90	89	10	89	4.2	3.6	1.17	93	99	87	93	3.00	53.1	279	303	322	624	Inside duel;drew off
		8.0	8	8	CLEAR THE	10	R>R	D>D	90	88	10	90	6.3	6.1	1.02	71	81	88	87	8.00	52.8	240	300	292	592	3wd into str;cleared
		8.0	5	5	MERCER	0	R>R	D>D	88	88	10	88	4.7	4.9	0.97	84	91	78	90	6.00	54.6	253	300	299	599	3wd into str;outkicked
		8.0	1	1	CROWN THE	0	R>R	D>D	90	88	10	90	7.3	4.5	1.60	74	79	89	89	6.00	56.4	242	297	296	593	3wd into str;willingly
		8.0	4	4	AVANTI	-45	R>R	D>D	86	86	10	86	4.0	5.6	0.71	91	98	79	93	3.50	53.7	268	310	316	626	Dueled;just held 2nd
		8.0	7	7	BEANTOWN	0	R>R	D>D	88	86	10	88	6.4	4.1	1.57	73	79	88	87	5.00	55.8	240	295	295	590	4wd into str;angled in
		8.0	10	10	MUCHOS	0	R>R	D>D	85	85	10	85	3.9	4.3	0.90	84	92	81	88	12.00	55.0	257	291	301	592	Re-bid rail;led;edged
		8.0	2	2	ARCH	0	R>R	D>D	85	83	10	85	7.8	5.9	1.31	79	79	92	85	12.00	54.3	250	299	300	599	Angled in str;up 3rd
		8.0	9	9	COMMA	-45	R>R	T>D	ERR	81	10	54	5.1	6.0	0.86	88	82	79	86	15.00	53.7	249	310	298	608	3wd str;no late bid
8.0	3	3	FERGUSON	-45	R>R	D>D	85	81	8	85	5.4	6.3	0.85	92	98	57	78	12.00	51.1	247	295	281	576	Inside duel;weakened		

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	CLASS	SRR	SUR	ASP	AVG	ASP	SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	P2F	P4F	PFN	LAST	MLINE	SECND	TOTL	BEST	BEST	TOTALS	LAST RACE COMMENT		
									110	SPD	R#							TDS		THREE	CALL	PACE	ALL			LAST	
11/16/18	DMR 7	9.0	1	1	KODIAK	-5	R>R	T>T	ERR	83	1	83	10.0	7.0	1.43	77	81	83	83	2.50	55.4	241	386	375	761	Awaited room 1/4-1/8	
		9.0	4	4	RETRO	-30	R>R	T>T	ERR	85	2	82	6.0	4.8	1.26	82	84	85	82	3.00	53.0	251	383	378	762	3wd turns;no rally	
		9.0	3	3	DON'T	0	R>R	T>T	ERR	82	5	81	5.7	3.7	1.53	91	97	70	81	12.00	53.4	258	373	378	750	Inside;no late bid	
		9.0	2	2	STRADELLA	23	R>R	T>T	ERR	82	6	82	2.3	3.5	0.65	84	85	82	82	20.00	55.4	251	373	379	752	Stalked;bid;led;clear	
		9.0	5	5	SAPPHO	-20	S>R	T>T	ERR	81	80	7	78	6.6	4.7	1.40	81	89	86	81	6.00	60.3	256	384	381	765	Step slow;steadied 1/8
		9.0	7	7	NICE ICE	-5	R>R	T>T	ERR	83	80	9	83	5.1	4.1	1.24	88	94	65	84	5.00	54.9	247	375	378	753	Bid;dueled;wkened
		9.0	8	8	PACIFIC	3	R>R	D>T	ERR	85	77	10	80	6.6	4.4	1.50	86	90	63	77	10.00	52.4	239	358	351	709	Came out str;gained 3d
		9.0	6	6	K P	-30	R>R	T>T	ERR	83	75	6	80	6.9	3.8	1.80	82	83	86	84	3.50	56.3	251	367	380	747	5wd into str;best rest

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	CLASS	SRR	SUR	ASP	AVG	ASP	SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	P2F	P4F	PFN	LAST	MLINE	SECND	TOTL	BEST	BEST	TOTALS	LAST RACE COMMENT		
									110	SPD	R#							TDS		THREE	CALL	PACE	ALL			LAST	
11/16/18	DMR 8	8.0	1	1	BLAZE OF	0	R>R	D>D	ERR	77	73	8	77	4.2	5.0	0.83	79	77	76	65	3.50	51.3	232	313	316	629	3wd bid;clear;caught
		8.0	3	3	BITTER	-25	R>R	T>D	ERR	70	4	ERR	6.7	7.4	0.90	80	77	75	73	3.00	53.0	232	324	317	642	3wd to str; no threat	
		8.0	5	5	FRIENDLY	0	S>R	D>D	ERR	69	6	ERR	5.0	5.0	1.00	90	88	76	70	5.00	56.0	254	311	331	641	Btwn;off rail;held 3rd	
		8.0	8	8	ROYAL	0	R>R	D>D	ERR	69	68	10	69	8.2	6.4	1.27	71	69	83	73	15.00	49.9	223	299	301	601	Bobbled start;inside
		8.0	9	9	ALPHADAR	0	R>R	D>D	ERR	73	67	7	73	6.7	6.0	1.12	78	82	79	74	6.00	52.9	239	305	325	630	4wd;3wd; best rest
		8.0	10	10	GAME OF	0	R>R	D>D	ERR	67	67	5	67	8.3	5.9	1.41	76	72	81	68	20.00	51.5	229	294	306	600	4wd into str;late bid
		8.0	4	4	ELEVATE	0	R>R	D>D	ERR	74	65	4	74	7.4	5.5	1.35	75	77	72	74	10.00	52.0	224	291	292	584	Saved ground; wknd
		8.0	7	7	SERVE ME A	0	R>R	D>D	ERR	71	63	6	71	4.2	6.4	0.66	75	75	77	70	6.00	50.5	227	295	311	606	Waited 1/4;rail bid
		8.0	6	6	VALIANT	-45	S>R	T>D	ERR	61	3	ERR	6.1	7.1	0.86	85	82	56	61	6.00	56.1	223	312	278	590	Steadied early;inside	
8.0	2	2	CALIE VIEW	0	S>R	D>D	ERR	44	4	ERR	9.1	7.9	1.15	69	68	52	41	30.00	53.3	189	254	223	477	Off bit slow;3wd lane			

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	CLASS	SRR	SUR	ASP	AVG	ASP	SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	P2F	P4F	PFN	LAST	MLINE	SECND	TOTL	BEST	BEST	TOTALS	LAST RACE COMMENT		
									110	SPD	R#							TDS		THREE	CALL	PACE	ALL			LAST	
11/16/18	GPW 1	7.5	7	7	SHAFIRO	20	S>S	D>T	ERR	75	2	ERR	5.0	4.4	1.14	91	90	69	75	10.00	55.7	250	394	382	776	Chased 3wd btwn; tired	
		7.5	1	1	MOZO BELLO	20	S>S	D>T	ERR	85	73	7	85	5.7	5.2	1.09	90	90	72	76	4.50	55.7	252	396	387	783	4wd; gave way 3/16p
		7.5	8	8	HARD BELLE	-5	S>S	T>T	ERR	72	73	5	72	1.0	4.9	0.21	83	82	71	75	8.00	52.9	236	393	370	763	Duel ins into str;wknd
		7.5	6	6	DOCTOR D J	-5	S>S	T>T	ERR	77	69	3	77	6.8	4.2	1.62	68	74	80	69	6.00	53.0	222	387	368	756	Unhurried;wide bid
		7.5	4	4	VOW ME NOW	55	S>S	T>T	ERR	81	66	4	81	3.9	5.9	0.67	85	82	86	66	3.50	56.7	253	376	405	781	Rated;3w1/4p;pull awy
		7.5	5	5	TANGIBLE	-5	S>S	T>T	ERR	77	65	5	77	5.9	3.5	1.71	80	79	83	75	3.00	53.4	242	373	373	746	Ang in 1st;edg closer
		7.5	3	3	MAJESTIC	60	R>S	T>T	ERR	68	62	7	68	5.0	5.0	1.00	88	79	67	65	20.00	52.0	234	350	360	710	Bmp st; led late; held
		7.5	2	2	HOLLYWOOD	60	S>S	T>T	ERR	45	2	77	3.8	5.2	0.73	90		79	45	4.00	55.3	169	329	357	685	Vied tn;3-4wd;kick clr	

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	CLASS	SRR	SUR	ASP		ASP		SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	P2F	P4F	PFN	LAST	SECND	TOTL		TOTALS	LAST RACE COMMENT			
									110	SPD	R#	TDS							THREE		AVG	PACE			BEST	BEST	
11/16/18	GPW	2	5.5	5	5	ALL IN	0	S>S	T>D	67	69	10	67	3.3	3.0	1.12	93		67	68	2.50	54.5	160	502	482	984	Veid 1/4p;kept on
			5.5	1	1	KAYLIE'S	0	S>S	D>D	60	58	8	60	1.7	5.4	0.32	93		58	60	4.50	53.1	151	465	436	901	Duel;2pth 1/8;ang rail
			5.5	8	8	RACHEL'S	-30	S>S	T>D	43	54	5	43	5.7	7.4	0.77	97	95	71	62	1.80	55.9	263	476	570	1046	5w upper; wknd late
			5.5	7	7	MAGIC	0	S>S	D>D	53	54	3	51	3.3	4.4	0.75	93		51	54	3.50	52.8	144	441	409	849	Duel rail;checked str
			5.5	2	2	TRI DELTA	0	S>S	D>D	52	52	5	52	5.0	8.2	0.61	76		56	50	15.00	51.8	132	432	353	785	Stumbled st;wide 7/16p
			5.5	6	6	JOURNEY	0	S>S	T>D	42	43	3	37	5.4	8.2	0.65	90	76	48	43	12.00	48.6	214	399	463	862	In range ins;3w1/4;fad
			5.5	4	4	Z RED	0	S>S	D>D	11	11	1	11	10.0	10.0	1.00	72	60	30	11	30.00	52.8	162	287	287	574	Lack speed;no bid
			5.5	3	3	DOWNTOWNCO	ILR	0>S	>D	ERR	ERR	0	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR				ERR	20.00	ERR	0	ERR	ERR	ERR	

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	CLASS	SRR	SUR	ASP		ASP		SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	P2F	P4F	PFN	LAST	SECND	TOTL		TOTALS	LAST RACE COMMENT			
									110	SPD	R#	TDS							THREE		AVG	PACE			BEST	BEST	
11/16/18	GPW	3	6.0	1	1	DORITZA	0	S>S	D>D	81	82	10	82	9.4	5.2	1.81	72	80	96	85	6.00	58.5	248	534	522	1056	Stumbl'd start;ins gain
			6.0	2	2	FASHION	5	S>S	D>D	75	75	10	75	2.4	3.8	0.64	87	87	83	81	3.00	53.0	257	496	509	1005	Lacked needed rally
			6.0	5	5	GABRIELLE	0	S>S	D>D	87	73	6	74	3.0	5.0	0.60	98	102	77	80	1.60	56.3	277	511	548	1059	Vied early;pulled away
			6.0	3	3	PURE BLISS	0	S>S	D>D	72	72	10	72	6.1	6.0	1.03	88	88	85	78	6.00	57.7	261	483	519	1002	2wd bid;duel late
			6.0	6	6	MISS WILBY	5	S>S	D>D	69	70	10	68	5.7	5.7	1.00	89	86	37	59	10.00	54.1	212	480	393	874	Brief bid; retreated
			6.0	4	4	ALLIYA'S	-10	S>S	D>D	74	68	10	69	7.2	5.4	1.33	100	94	71	76	3.50	53.6	265	495	508	1003	Rail;dueled;weakened

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	CLASS	SRR	SUR	ASP		ASP		SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	P2F	P4F	PFN	LAST	SECND	TOTL		TOTALS	LAST RACE COMMENT			
									110	SPD	R#	TDS							THREE		AVG	PACE			BEST	BEST	
11/16/18	GPW	4	8.0	2	2	MISSION	-55	R>R	D>T	82	86	9	86	5.1	4.9	1.05	90	93	77	85	3.50	51.6	260	288	277	566	Weakened
			8.0	10	10	WEEKEND	-5	R>R	T>T	82	83	10	82	5.7	6.2	0.92	99	108	47	75	15.00	49.4	254	279	255	534	Stalked;bid;faded upr
			8.0	3	3	PORTER	-55	R>R	T>T	83	83	10	83	8.5	5.5	1.54	70	69	84	85	3.00	50.7	223	285	261	546	2wd;inching closer
			8.0	11	11	KING POWER	-60	S>R	D>T	ERR	82	10	ERR	1.8	4.1	0.44	91	100	54	82	6.00	54.2	245	276	255	530	Tracked insde;retreat
			8.0	1	1	GOTSOMEMOJ	0	R>R	D>T	82	81	10	82	7.1	4.8	1.48	82	88	80	82	4.00	53.3	250	270	274	544	Stalk;5wd upr;gain plc
			8.0	6	6	GREELY IS	0	S>R	D>T	ERR	81	10	ERR	3.0	2.9	1.05	92	93	82	85	10.00	55.8	267	270	283	554	Duel;wore down late
			8.0	9	9	FAST FIRE	-25	S>R	T>T	78	80	10	78	8.3	3.9	2.14	66	66	103	83	10.00	53.9	235	265	265	530	Wide into upr;late bid
			8.0	5	5	DAVE	5	R>R	T>T	79	79	10	79	5.2	3.7	1.41	90	98	85	87	6.00	50.7	273	272	300	571	2wd 1/4p;good finish
			8.0	7	7	UNO EMAYO	-5	R>R	T>T	85	78	10	85	7.4	4.7	1.57	81	93	81	78	12.00	53.8	255	269	279	548	6wd bid upr;up in time
			8.0	4	4	AT THE	-34	R>R	T>T	84	76	10	84	5.1	5.0	1.02	81	84	92	86	20.00	54.6	257	278	286	563	Good finish outside
			8.0	8	8	DAY OF	5	S>R	T>T	75	67	10	75	2.3	3.8	0.60	88	82	79	71	12.00	53.6	249	248	267	515	Set pace;ins;kpt clear

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	CLASS	SRR	SUR	ASP	AVG	ASP	SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	P2F	P4F	PFN	LAST	MLINE	SECND	TOTL	BEST	BEST	TOTALS	LAST RACE COMMENT		
									110	SPD	R#							TDS		THREE	PACE	ALL	LAST				
11/16/18	GPW	5	8.0	1	1	BORN FOR A	-10	S>R	D>D	88	86	10	89	6.0	4.2	1.44	86	92	71	79	3.50	55.6	249	461	410	871	Roused 3w; belatedly
			8.0	3	3	ERCOLANO	0	S>R	D>D	ERR	85	3	ERR	7.3	3.6	2.00	92	98	91	85	4.50	59.4	281	457	461	918	3-4wd; rallied outside
			8.0	7	7	SEVEN GEMS	40	R>R	D>D	98	75	10	98	3.3	5.1	0.65	94	103	89	85	1.80	53.8	286	419	468	888	Set pace;duel;nipped
			8.0	4	4	ALL GOLDEN	40	R>R	D>D	77	74	10	77	6.9	6.3	1.09	89	94	68	77	20.00	53.5	251	412	409	821	Pressured;duel;wknd
			8.0	2	2	MOTOWN MAN	55	R>R	D>D	79	74	10	79	6.2	6.7	0.94	77	72	89	81	10.00	54.4	238	416	411	827	Pressured pace;drw clr
			8.0	5	5	CHOVANES	0	R>R	D>D	75	74	10	75	2.8	4.0	0.70	97	104	66	85	2.50	51.8	267	408	430	838	Rated 2path; driving
			8.0	6	6	MINUTE	0	S>R	D>D	ERR	72	10	ERR	8.7	8.0	1.09	84	85	88	75	12.00	57.0	257	426	411	838	Lack speed ins;5wd str

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	CLASS	SRR	SUR	ASP	AVG	ASP	SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	P2F	P4F	PFN	LAST	MLINE	SECND	TOTL	BEST	BEST	TOTALS	LAST RACE COMMENT			
									110	SPD	R#							TDS		THREE	PACE	ALL	LAST					
11/16/18	GPW	6	6.0	5	5	PASO A LA	5	S>S	T>D	ERR	66	6	69	3.4	3.7	0.91	79	71	80	67	8.00	51.5	230	516	534	1050	Stalk top 2;5wd bid	
			6.0	8	8	STARSHIP	10	S>S	D>D	ERR	62	1	62	7.5	3.8	2.00	70	62	81	62	4.00	58.9	213	488	497	985	Bump start;traild erly	
			6.0	3	3	HOT FUDGE	-10	S>S	D>D	60	60	5	61	4.9	5.9	0.83	91	91	45	52	8.00	54.4	227	506	479	985	Up clse 3p;5/16p;fade	
			6.0	4	4	FLYING MY	-20	S>S	D>D	59	59	1	59	8.8	7.5	1.17	75	84	65	59	6.00	51.6	224	503	494	997	Drft in start;lack spd	
			6.0	7	7	BEGIN	-20	S>S	D>D	63	58	4	66	6.2	6.2	1.00	89	87	68	55	3.50	52.2	244	501	512	1012	4wd bid tn;wide upr	
			6.0	2	2	MY SWEET	-15	S>S	D>D	58	57	8	50	4.9	5.5	0.89	86	82	60	58	6.00	55.0	228	486	484	970	5p;bid;couldn't gain	
			6.0	6	6	ELISSAS	ILR	0>S	>D	ERR	ERR	0	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	10.00	ERR	0	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR
			6.0	1	1	SHIMMYSHIM	ILR	0>S	>D	ERR	ERR	0	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	4.50	ERR	0	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	CLASS	SRR	SUR	ASP	AVG	ASP	SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	P2F	P4F	PFN	LAST	MLINE	SECND	TOTL	BEST	BEST	TOTALS	LAST RACE COMMENT		
									110	SPD	R#							TDS		THREE	PACE	ALL	LAST				
11/16/18	GPW	7	5.0	2	2	VERY	0	S>S	D>T	85	83	10	83	6.6	4.2	1.55	85		88	90	10.00	57.8	173	334	327	662	Trailed;late improve
			5.0	9	9	EARTH	55	S>S	T>T	82	80	10	81	3.6	4.8	0.76	99		76	77	6.00	55.9	175	336	327	664	Veid;ins;drew away
			5.0	5	5	TEAK	5	S>S	T>T	81	80	5	81	3.1	5.8	0.52	94		67	77	4.00	54.7	161	338	300	638	Prompted; gave way
			5.0	4	4	EPIC DRAMA	55	S>S	D>T	80	79	10	80	3.4	5.3	0.64	90	94	86	79	15.00	57.5	270	333	390	723	Gave way grudgingly
			5.0	1	1	I'M	0	S>S	T>T	83	79	10	83	1.9	3.7	0.53	90		88	86	3.50	56.8	178	335	341	676	Duel;clear;drfting out
			5.0	3	3	GREEN	0	S>S	T>T	84	77	9	84	4.4	4.2	1.04	90		85	81	6.00	54.8	175	339	335	674	Drft wide;up in time
			5.0	7	7	GRAN SAMAN	0	S>S	T>T	79	77	10	78	3.1	4.4	0.69	88		86	81	12.00	58.3	174	329	331	661	Rated;outsde;drw clear
			5.0	6	6	BLUE CHIP	5	S>S	T>T	82	75	9	82	2.5	3.5	0.72	94		72	80	10.00	53.3	166	327	309	636	Bumped st; held gamely
			5.0	8	8	GRAN	0	S>S	T>T	79	73	7	79	1.7	2.7	0.63	91		86	83	2.00	58.6	177	327	340	667	Speed;insde;drv finsh

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	CLASS	SRR	SUR	ASP		ASP		SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	P2F	P4F	PFN	LAST	SECND	TOTL		TOTALS	LAST RACE COMMENT			
									THREE	AVG	MLINE	CALL							PACE		BEST	BEST					
								110	SPD	R#	TDS								AVG		LAST	ALL	LAST				
11/16/18	GPW	8	5.5	1	1	BULLGRATS	-20	S>S	D>D	73	73	3	73	4.8	5.2	0.92	93	92	72	73	2.50	53.4	257	634	633	1267	Chased 2wd; tired str
			5.5	7	7	C'ERA UNA	-5	S>S	D>D	71	71	6	71	3.4	4.9	0.69	99	95	65	65	4.00	54.3	259	617	618	1236	Pressed 2wd; wknd rail
			5.5	6	6	ACCOUNTANT	15	S>S	D>D	68	68	7	68	4.3	4.9	0.89	87	86	84	70	3.00	55.9	257	592	650	1242	Duel til 1/8p;good try
			5.5	2	2	JUST	-3	S>S	D>D	54	64	5	54	3.5	6.5	0.54	92	83	60	62	10.00	52.4	235	578	539	1118	Hustled st; faltered
			5.5	8	8	SUPER	-5	R>S	T>D	74	61	6	71	8.0	7.0	1.14	65	63	82	67	20.00	53.7	210	579	559	1138	Ask far tn;no gain
			5.5	4	4	DEFENSE	ILR	0>S	>D	ERR	ERR	0	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	10.00	ERR	0	ERR	ERR	ERR		
			5.5	5	5	ECLIPTICAL	ILR	0>S	>D	ERR	ERR	0	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	12.00	ERR	0	ERR	ERR	ERR		
			5.5	3	3	COWTOWN	ILR	0>S	>D	ERR	ERR	0	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	6.00	ERR	0	ERR	ERR	ERR		
			5.5	9	9	SOUPERY	ILR	0>S	>D	ERR	ERR	0	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	15.00	ERR	0	ERR	ERR	ERR		

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	CLASS	SRR	SUR	ASP		ASP		SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	P2F	P4F	PFN	LAST	SECND	TOTL		TOTALS	LAST RACE COMMENT			
									THREE	AVG	MLINE	CALL							PACE		BEST	BEST					
								110	SPD	R#	TDS								AVG		LAST	ALL	LAST				
11/16/18	GPW	9	7.5	13	13	HENNY'S	-15	S>S	T>T	64	67	2	67	7.0	7.0	1.00	85	85	55	67	6.00	52.6	225	274	259	534	In range;flatnd turn
			7.5	12	12	ONE SLICK	5	S>S	T>T	64	64	1	64	3.3	3.3	1.00	85	82	58	64	6.00	53.0	225	258	262	520	Stalkd;2wd tn;5wd late
			7.5	2	2	NARROWS	-11	R>S	T>T	ERR	63	2	63	3.1	3.8	0.80	95	97	53	63	3.00	54.6	245	259	270	529	Led btw str; hung late
			7.5	15	15	SAND DRIFT	0	S>S	T>T	ERR	63	1	63	7.0	6.0	1.17	73		81	63	8.00	55.1	154	263	235	498	Off pace;outsde urging
			7.5	6	6	BRITESIDEO	-15	S>S	T>T	63	59	4	63	3.2	7.6	0.43	100	100	37	62	4.00	52.6	237	251	258	510	Stalkd leader;wknd str
			7.5	1	1	SECRET	0	S>S	T>T	73	59	5	73	4.4	4.4	1.00	83	75	80	73	1.80	53.2	238	260	279	539	Duel;led;duel;bump lte
			7.5	11	11	KINDHEARTE	5	S>S	T>T	59	59	2	59	9.0	7.0	1.29	81	72	66	59	15.00	53.2	219	245	253	498	4wd uppr;lugging in
			7.5	10	10	MESA	0	S>S	T>T	69	58	4	69	6.3	5.3	1.20	76	62	86	59	12.00	53.2	224	250	267	517	Insde;2wd;needed more
			7.5	9	9	PRINCESS	5	S>S	T>T	ERR	58	1	58	8.9	5.6	1.60	72		76	58	15.00	56.0	148	247	223	469	Lack speed;5wd imprve
			7.5	16	16	TENNESSEE	0	R>S	T>T	64	55	4	64	5.5	6.3	0.88	90	94	56	59	15.00	51.0	240	244	266	510	Bid 1/4p;4w;brushd 1/8
			7.5	7	7	FLASHPROUD	10	S>S	D>T	44	48	5	51	6.1	7.4	0.82	89	83	56	51	30.00	52.3	228	223	237	460	Bump st;chase;flatned
			7.5	14	14	DAMASKA	0	S>S	T>T	ERR	46	1	46	10.0	9.0	1.11	67		68	46	30.00	53.8	135	225	191	416	Failed to menace
			7.5	4	4	CONQUEST	ILR	0>S	>T	ERR	ERR	0	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	15.00	ERR	0	ERR	ERR	ERR		
			7.5	3	3	SUBTLE	ILR	0>S	>T	ERR	ERR	0	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	6.00	ERR	0	ERR	ERR	ERR		
			7.5	8	8	ZARINA	ILR	0>S	>T	ERR	ERR	0	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	20.00	ERR	0	ERR	ERR	ERR		
			7.5	5	5	RUCIA MORA	ILR	0>S	>T	ERR	ERR	0	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	20.00	ERR	0	ERR	ERR	ERR		

LONG SHEETS

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	SRR	SUR	NOTES FROM LAST RACE	ASP	AVG	ASP	LAST FIVE										ERLY TOTL		COMMENTS																					
									110	RX	SPD	R#	TDS	RT	S1	S2	SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	TDONE	TDTWO	TDCL0	P2F		P4F	PFN	SPEED	RATINGS	DSL	R	P	CALL1	CALL2	MEDS	EQUIP	MLINE	CLS	TRK	DIS	CHNG	SPPNT	PWR	COMB	TOTL	PACE
11/16/18	DMR	1	6.5	3	3	TWO FIFTY	S>S	D>D	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 4-hole. Fast last race (12).Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH! Clear early.1st off 34 day layoff. Class 45 Finished 1 from post 4 TJW= 47	65	1	74	5	74	5	92	81	2.4	3.7	0.6	2.4	3.7	0.6	96	99	81	86,65,72,83,65	34	E	7	21.8	45.2	1	0	2.50	147	SA	5.5	M>A	41.2	124	101.2	195	276	Bit off rail;drew away/ 3wd into str;wkened/ Stalked;just held 2nd
			6.5	4	4	PRINCIPE	S>S	T>D	Flashed speed. 1st off 41 day layoff. Class -50 Finished 6 from post 6 TJW= 20	ERR	0	71	4	70	3	87	-9	3.4	4.7	0.7	1.9	3.5	0.5	98	64	72,81,66,64,0	41	E	6	22.2	45.7	1	0	4.00	163	SA	5.0	N>A	35.3	116	90.2	98	162	Stalked pace; weakened/ 3wd to turn;clear/ Inside; edged foe 2nd	
			6.5	6	6	SWAMP	R>S	D>D	Made big overall move (6). Class 45 Finished 1 from post 6 TJW= 51	ERR	0	64	2	54	1	80	84	5.9	5.9	1.0	10.0	10.0	1.0	76	72	78	73,54,0,0,0	28	S	0	48.3	73.9	1	0	6.00	137	SA	8.0	M>A	0.0	111	96.9	148	226	4wd move;led 3wd/ Off slow;no menace/
			6.5	2	2	BABY	R>S	D>D	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 5-hole.Uncharacteristic race?BTL horse. Clear early. Class 20 Finished 2 from post 5 TJW= 63	77	1	74	6	74	4	80	90	4.8	3.9	1.2	4.7	4.0	1.2	81	70	85	77,74,77,85,68	21	P	2	49.5	74.4	1	0	3.50	154	SA	8.0	CO>A	11.8	118	97.8	151	236	Dueled;led;edged late/ 4wd into str;no rally/ Inside; edged foe 3rd
			6.5	5	5	IRISH	R>S	T>D	Class 5 Finished 4 from post 5 TJW= 74	81	2	67	7	69	6	68	77	5.7	4.1	1.4	5.1	3.7	1.4	82	79	56	58,83,70,78,63	20	P	2	50.8	75.7	1	BON	3.00	145	GG	8.0	AO>A	11.8	112	93.7	161	217	No speed/ Stalked btwn;up 2nd/ Bid 3wd;led;clear
			6.5	1	1	BEA'S BOY	S>S	D>D	1st off 35 day layoff. Class 20 Finished 3 from post 5 TJW= 62	82	3	75	5	75	5	90	85	6.4	3.9	1.6	6.4	3.9	1.6	89	90	86	83,85,79,69,61	35	P	0	22.8	47.0	1	0	5.00	163	SA	6.0	CO>A	0.0	122	101.6	179	265	Stalked 3wd;edged 2nd/ Saved ground to lane/ 4wd;3wd;2nd best

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	SRR	SUR	NOTES FROM LAST RACE	ASP	AVG	ASP	LAST FIVE										ERLY TOTL		COMMENTS																					
									110	RX	SPD	R#	TDS	RT	S1	S2	SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	TDONE	TDTWO	TDCL0	P2F		P4F	PFN	SPEED	RATINGS	DSL	R	P	CALL1	CALL2	MEDS	EQUIP	MLINE	CLS	TRK	DIS	CHNG	SPPNT	PWR	COMB	TOTL	PACE
11/16/18	DMR	2	6.0	2	2	YES I'M	S>S	D>D	*Stretch gain (2).BTL horse. 2 races in one pattern. Class -17 Finished 5 from post 7 TJW= 36	60	3	77	10	78	9	42	-9	2.8	6.0	0.5	1.9	5.6	0.3			86,87,92,83,73	27	E	5	0.0	301.9	1	0	20.00	147	LA	4.0	A>C	21.7	109	101.5	0	0	Off rail; improved/ Bumped brk; 3wd/ 4wd/ Vie inside;cleared 1/8	
			6.0	4	4	COLORMEMON	S>S	D>D	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 3-hole. Clear early.1st off 33 day layoff. Class 0 Finished 3 from post 3 TJW= 59	80	8	79	10	79	10	91	82	2.9	3.6	0.8	2.9	3.6	0.8	91	96	79	82,87,89,91,72	33	E/P	6	22.4	45.8	1	0	2.00	136	SA	5.5	C>C	26.1	125	104.0	187	266	Vied btwn foes;held 3d/ 3wd duel;led;held/ 4wd turn;wkened
			6.0	6	6	MASTER	S>S	D>D	1st off 120 day layoff. Class 5 Finished 11 from post 6 TJW= 44	73	6	70	7	70	7	84	80	6.9	7.9	0.9	6.9	7.9	0.9	82	81	78	68,69,77,78,70	120	E	5	23.4	47.5	1	BON	8.00	175	DMR	5.5	C>C	21.7	109	93.1	163	241	Bobbled;stdied start/ Dueled;best rest/ Steadied early;wkened
			6.0	3	3	GRINGO	S>S	D>D	Flashed speed. Slow last race (21). Class -2 Finished 6 from post 6 TJW= 45	78	9	77	10	78	9	91	63	5.2	4.5	1.2	5.5	4.2	1.3	91	91	49	56,85,86,83,84	20	E/P	4	22.7	47.7	1	BON	2.50	141	SA	6.5	C>C	17.4	117	90.3	182	231	5wd to turn;gave way/ 4wd into str;bid btwn/ Tight 3-1/2;4wd str
			6.0	1	1	BOB'S ALL	S>S	D>D	Flashed speed. 1st off 33 day layoff. Class 5 Finished 7 from post 1 TJW= 47	76	7	77	10	76	7	89	81	7.2	6.0	1.2	7.6	5.5	1.4	89	92	78	77,67,86,82,82	33	P	2	22.8	46.2	1	0	6.00	137	SA	5.5	C>C	8.7	114	98.5	181	259	Off step slow;inside/ Hugged rail; no bid/ 5wd into str;edged 2nd
			6.0	5	5	DON'T	S>S	D>D	Made big overall move (6). 1st off 33 day layoff. Class 0 Finished 1 from post 7 TJW= 67	81	8	80	9	80	9	88	88	5.4	2.9	1.9	5.4	2.9	1.9	83	94	87	87,86,84,82,73	33	P	1	23.1	45.8	1	0	1.80	133	SA	5.5	C>C	4.3	125	107.0	177	264	4wd into str;drift in/ 5wd bid;3wd into str/ Rail trip;led;cleared

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	SRR	SUR	NOTES FROM LAST RACE	ASP	AVG	ASP	LAST FIVE											ERLY		TOTL	PACE	PACE	COMMENTS																	
									110	RX	SPD	R#	TDS	RT	S1	S2	SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	TDONE	TD TWO	TD CLO	P2F	P4F	PFN				SPEED	RATINGS	DSL	R	P	CALL1	CALL2	MEDS	EQUIP	MLINE	CLS	TRK	DIS	CHNG	SPPNT	PWR	COMB
11/16/18	DMR	7	9.0	2	2	STRADELLA	R>R	T>T	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 2-hole. Class 23 Finished 1 from post 2 TJW= 52	ERR	0	82	6	82	1	89	94	2.3	3.5	0.7	4.3	1.4	3.1	84	85	82	82,79,85,80,81	21	E/P	7	46.8	70.7	1	0	20.00	165	SA	8.0	S>A	26.9	125	103.4	169	251	Stalked;bid;led;clear/ Bit off rail;no bid/ Off bit slow;willingly
			9.0	7	7	NICE ICE	R>R	T>T	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 7-hole. 1st off 75 day layoff. Class -5 Finished 8 from post 7 TJW= 59	83	1	80	9	83	4	84	87	5.1	4.1	1.2	3.1	4.6	0.7	88	94	65	83,83,85,81,82	75	E/P	6	48.4	72.4	1	0	5.00	183	DMR	8.5	AO>A	23.1	125	102.5	182	247	Bit;dueled;wkened/ 2wd;rail;held 2nd/ Came out str;up wire
			9.0	4	4	RETRO	R>R	T>T	1st off 223 day layoff. Class -30 Finished 7 from post 7 TJW= 72	85	1	82	5	82	5	79	100	6.0	4.8	1.3	6.0	4.8	1.3	82	84	85	85,81,80,85,81	223	P	2	48.3	73.2	1	0	3.00	200	SA	9.0	G3>A	7.7	132	98.8	166	251	3wd turns;no rally/ Bit off rail;edged 3rd/ Chased 3wd;no rally
			9.0	5	5	SAPPHO	S>R	T>T	*Stretch gain (4.5). 1st off 48 day layoff.2 pattern. Class -20 Finished 9 from post 8 TJW= 66	81	1	80	7	78	4	90	60	6.6	4.7	1.4	5.6	4.7	1.2	81	89	86	84,78,81,83,70	48	P	3	23.4	45.3	1	0	6.00	191	SA	6.5	N>A	11.5	129	100.1	170	256	Step slow;steadied 1/8/ Pulled;in tight 6-1/2/ Bobbled early;pulled
			9.0	1	1	KODIAK	R>R	T>T	Made big overall move (3). *Stretch gain (1.5). 1st off 97 day layoff.2 races in one pattern. Class -5 Finished 7 from post 1 TJW= 67	ERR	0	83	1	83	1	82	91	10.0	7.0	1.4	10.0	7.0	1.4	77	81	83	83,0,0,0,0	97	S	0	47.9	71.8	1	BON	2.50	193	DMR	8.0	AO>A	0.0	134	102.6	158	241	Awaited room 1/4-1/8/ /
			9.0	8	8	PACIFIC	R>R	D>T	Flashed speed. 1st off 63 day layoff. Class 3 Finished 3 from post 1 TJW= 64	85	3	77	10	80	8	84	78	6.6	4.4	1.5	6.4	3.9	1.6	86	90	63	72,78,81,71,79	63	S	2	48.0	73.2	1	0	10.00	174	LRC	8.0	AO>A	7.7	118	97.5	176	239	Came out str;gained 3d/ 3wd into str;no rally/ Split foes late;game
			9.0	3	3	DON'T	R>R	T>T	Chased Pace.Uncharacteristic race? Class 0 Finished 4 from post 4 TJW= 59	ERR	0	82	5	81	3	92	90	5.7	3.7	1.5	6.2	5.0	1.2	91	97	70	80,81,83,83,84	26	E/P	4	46.2	70.9	1	0	12.00	175	SA	8.0	AO>A	15.4	124	101.7	188	258	Inside;no late bid/ Off bit slow;4wd lane/ Came out str;up btwn
			9.0	6	6	K P	R>R	T>T	Made big overall move (8). *Stretch gain (1.25). Fast last race (12). Class -30 Finished 4 from post 7 TJW= 55	83	2	75	6	80	4	88	95	6.9	3.8	1.8	7.0	3.0	2.3	82	83	86	87,78,88,68,67	20	S	2	47.3	70.7	1	0	3.50	168	SA	8.0	G3>A	7.7	131	98.2	165	251	5wd into str;best rest/ Tight early;rail bid/ Rail bid;led;clear

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	SRR	SUR	NOTES FROM LAST RACE	ASP	AVG	ASP	LAST FIVE											ERLY		TOTL	PACE	PACE	COMMENTS																	
									110	RX	SPD	R#	TDS	RT	S1	S2	SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	TDONE	TD TWO	TD CLO	P2F	P4F	PFN				SPEED	RATINGS	DSL	R	P	CALL1	CALL2	MEDS	EQUIP	MLINE	CLS	TRK	DIS	CHNG	SPPNT	PWR	COMB
11/16/18	DMR	8	8.0	7	7	SERVE ME A	R>R	D>D	Chased Pace. *Stretch gain (2.25).BTL horse. 2 races in one pattern. Class 0 Finished 4 from post 2 TJW= 42	71	1	63	6	71	1	78	84	4.2	6.4	0.7	5.0	5.0	1.0	75	75	77	71,73,65,69,46	12	E/P	5	48.9	75.0	1	0	6.00	129	SA	8.0	M>M	12.8	108	96.5	150	227	Waited 1/4;rail bid/ 3 wide;edged 3rd/ 4wd into str;wkened
			8.0	1	1	BLAZE OF	R>R	D>D	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 6-hole.BTL horse. Class 0 Finished 2 from post 6 TJW= 73	77	2	73	8	77	2	80	84	4.2	5.0	0.8	3.3	4.7	0.7	79	77	76	73,44,78,84,77	12	E/P	5	48.5	74.2	1	0	3.50	138	SA	8.0	M>M	12.8	108	96.6	156	232	3wd bid;clear;caught/ Came out str;gave way/ Inside;btwn 1/16;wkend
			8.0	6	6	VALIANT	S>R	T>D	1st off 40 day layoff. Class -45 Finished 8 from post 2 TJW= 40	ERR	0	61	3	ERR	0	90	84	6.1	7.1	0.9	ERR	ERR	ERR	85	82	56	55,65,63,0,0	40	NA	6	23.1	46.7	1	0	6.00	169	SA	6.5	S>M	15.4	103	90.5	167	223	Steadied early;inside/ Hopped start;wkened/ Stalked 4wd;wkened
			8.0	3	3	BITTER	R>R	T>D	Class -25 Finished 6 from post 10 TJW= 72	ERR	0	70	4	ERR	0	83	92	6.7	7.4	0.9	ERR	ERR	ERR	80	77	75	71,75,0,73,61	19	E	5	48.1	73.0	0	0	3.00	158	SA	8.0	M>M	12.8	114	100.8	157	232	3wd to str; no threat/ Off bit slow;wkened/ Fell over fallen foe
			8.0	5	5	FRIENDLY	S>R	D>D	Flashed speed.Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH! Class 0 Finished 3 from post 6 TJW= 54	ERR	0	69	6	ERR	0	91	79	5.0	5.0	1.0	ERR	ERR	ERR	90	88	76	73,73,65,63,73	27	E/P	6	22.4	46.0	1	0	5.00	127	SA	6.0	M>M	15.4	110	101.3	178	254	Btwn;off rail;held 3rd/ 5wd into str;drift in/ 4wd into str;no rally
			8.0	9	9	ALPHADAR	R>R	D>D	*Stretch gain (1.5). Class 0 Finished 3 from post 7 TJW= 48	73	5	67	7	73	5	81	84	6.7	6.0	1.1	5.6	5.1	1.1	78	82	79	77,76,68,81,65	19	P	3	48.7	73.7	1	0	6.00	134	SA	8.0	M>M	7.7	111	96.6	160	239	4wd;3wd; best rest/ 4wd into str;edged 3rd/ 3wide; no threat
			8.0	2	2	CALIE VIEW	S>R	D>D	Made big overall move (5). Class 0 Finished 8 from post 12 TJW= 35	ERR	0	44	4	ERR	0	83	68	9.1	7.9	1.2	ERR	ERR	ERR	69	68	52	41,43,40,52,0	12	NA	2	24.5	49.2	1	0	30.00	129	SA	6.5	M>M	5.1	91	72.3	137	189	Off bit slow;3wd lane/ Chased 3w; gave way/ Off slow;no rally
			8.0	8	8	ROYAL	R>R	D>D	Made big overall move (7). 1st off 42 day layoff. Class 0 Finished 4 from post 1 TJW= 17	69	6	68	10	69	6	71	87	8.2	6.4	1.3	7.7	5.8	1.3	71	69	83	68,81,69,68,68	42	P	2	50.8	77.3	0	0	15.00	124	SA	8.5	M>M	5.1	104	93.9	140	223	Bobbled start;inside/ 3wd 2nd turn;best rest/ Chased; no rally
			8.0	4	4	ELEVATE	R>R	D>D	Class 0 Finished 7 from post 3 TJW= 27	74	3	65	4	74	3	75	81	7.4	5.5	1.3	6.3	3.7	1.7	75	77	72	65,73,83,39,0	19	P	3	49.8	75.2	1	0	10.00	127	SA	8.0	M>M	7.7	108	89.2	152	224	Saved ground; wknd/ Off bit slow;2nd best/ Off slow;up 2nd
			8.0	10	10	GAME OF	R>R	D>D	*Stretch gain (2).BTL horse. Class 0 Finished 5 from post 3 TJW= 33	67	5	67	5	67	5	76	87	8.3	5.9	1.4	8.3	5.9	1.4	76	72	81	71,67,66,65,66	12	S	2	49.4	75.0	1	BON	20.00	121	SA	8.0	M>M	5.1	102	91.3	148	229	4wd into str;late bid/ Inside;btwn;wkened/ 3wd into str;no rally

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	SRR	SUR	NOTES FROM LAST RACE	ASP	AVG	ASP	LAST FIVE										ERLY		TOTL	COMMENTS																				
									110	RX	SPD	R#	TDS	RT	S1	S2	SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	TDONE	TD TWO	TD CLO	P2F	P4F		PFN	SPEED	RATINGS	DSL	BRIS	P	CALL1	CALL2	MEDS	EQUIP	MLINE	CLS	TRK	DIS	CHNG	SPPNT	PWR	COMB	TOTL	PACE
11/16/18	GPW	1	7.5	8	8	HARD BELLE	S>S	T>T	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 1-hole. Clear early. Class -5 Finished 5 from post 1 TJW= 20	72	1	73	5	72	1	73	82	1.0	4.9	0.2	0.8	4.2	0.2	83	82	71	72,75,79,77,64	22	E	7	24.4	49.3	1	0	8.00	166	GPW	7.5	AO>A	33.3	120	90.1	165	236	Duel ins into str;wknd/ Vied 2pth;5wd 1/8p/ Pace;lost whip near1/4
			7.5	4	4	VOW ME NOW	S>S	T>T	Fast last race (15). Class 55 Finished 1 from post 1 TJW= 65	81	1	66	4	81	1	72	94	3.9	5.9	0.7	4.0	1.0	4.0	85	82	86	81,46,70,65,0	30	P	2	24.6	47.8	1	0	3.50	150	GPW	7.5	M>A	9.5	123	97.9	167	253	Rated;3w1/4p;pull awy/ Brief bid;drop back/ Stumbled&pushed out st
			7.5	2	2	HOLLYWOOD	S>S	T>T	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 1-hole. Fast last race (32).Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH! Clear early. Class 60 Finished 1 from post 1 TJW= 68	ERR	0	45	2	77	1	87	-3	3.8	5.2	0.7	1.0	1.0	1.0	90		79	77,12,0,0,0	21	E	4	22.4	46.3	1	0	4.00	130	GPW	5.0	M>A	19.0	112	101.0	90	169	Vied tn;3-4wd;kick clr/ Slow start;no bid/
			7.5	3	3	MAJESTIC	R>S	T>T	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 1-hole. Made big overall move (4). Class 60 Finished 1 from post 1 TJW= 32	68	2	62	7	68	2	75	86	5.0	5.0	1.0	4.7	4.2	1.1	88	79	67	64,67,65,60,53	26	E/P	0	49.5	74.9	1	0	20.00	131	GPW	8.0	M>A	0.0	108	93.8	167	234	Bmp st; led late; held/ Bump after st;wide upr/ Ins-2wd bid;no impact
			7.5	1	1	MOZO BELLO	S>S	D>T	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 4-hole. Class 20 Finished 5 from post 4 TJW= 68	85	1	73	7	85	1	86	72	5.7	5.2	1.1	4.0	3.0	1.3	90	90	72	72,71,85,79,86	30	P	2	22.8	46.6	1	0	4.50	172	GPW	6.0	CO>A	9.5	117	96.6	180	252	4wd; gave way 3/16p/ Off pace;no bid/ Up 1/4;kept clse;yield
			7.5	7	7	SHAFIRO	S>S	D>T	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 3-hole. Class 20 Finished 6 from post 3 TJW= 71	ERR	0	75	2	ERR	0	86	70	5.0	4.4	1.1	ERR	ERR	ERR	91	90	69	69,80,0,0,0	30	S	4	22.8	46.6	1	0	10.00	150	GPW	6.0	CO>A	19.0	120	97.3	181	250	Chased 3wd btwn; tired/ Steadied st;drv;up1/16/
			7.5	6	6	DOCTOR D J	S>S	T>T	Made big overall move (4). Made a big move early (3.25). *Stretch gain (1.75). 2 races in one pattern. Class -5 Finished 5 from post 9 TJW= 50	77	2	69	3	77	2	68	87	6.8	4.2	1.6	6.1	2.6	2.3	68	74	80	72,82,54,0,0	22	S	0	25.2	50.1	1	0	6.00	160	GPW	7.5	AO>A	0.0	129	94.6	142	222	Unhurried;wide bid/ Rated;circle 5w;drvng/ No impact
			7.5	5	5	TANGIBLE	S>S	T>T	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 10-hole. *Stretch gain (2.25). Fast last race (12).BTL horse. Class -5 Finished 2 from post 10 TJW= 33	77	1	65	5	77	1	71	88	5.9	3.5	1.7	4.2	1.7	2.5	80	79	83	77,77,71,45,54	22	P	2	24.7	49.4	1	0	3.00	157	GPW	7.5	AO>A	9.5	124	83.7	159	242	Ang in 1st;edg closer/ In back;2-3w;no kick/ Rated;shift out1/4;drv

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	SRR	SUR	NOTES FROM LAST RACE	ASP	AVG	ASP	LAST FIVE										ERLY		TOTL	COMMENTS																				
									110	RX	SPD	R#	TDS	RT	S1	S2	SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	TDONE	TD TWO	TD CLO	P2F	P4F		PFN	SPEED	RATINGS	DSL	BRIS	P	CALL1	CALL2	MEDS	EQUIP	MLINE	CLS	TRK	DIS	CHNG	SPPNT	PWR	COMB	TOTL	PACE
11/16/18	GPW	2	5.5	3	3	DOWNTOWNCO	0>S	>D	1st off 737014 day layoff. FTS. Class ILR Finished 0 from post 0 TJW= 4	ERR	0	ERR	0	ERR	0	57	-9	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	0,0,0,0,0	****	NA	0	0.0	0.0	0	0	20.00	ERR	0.0	>M	0.0	ERR	0	0	/ /		
			5.5	1	1	KAYLIE'S	S>S	D>D	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 2-hole. Clear early. Class 0 Finished 1 from post 2 TJW= 10	60	4	58	8	60	4	81	0	1.7	5.4	0.3	1.5	4.1	0.4	93		58	60,61,58,67,65	15	E	7	22.9	47.7	1	0	4.50	129	GPW	5.0	M>M	21.9	103	94.5	93	151	Duel;2pth 1/8;ang rail/ Up clse 3wd 1/4p;flatn/ Duel turn til mid-str
			5.5	2	2	TRI DELTA	S>S	D>D	*Stretch gain (3.5). Class 0 Finished 7 from post 1 TJW= 33	52	2	52	5	52	2	72	0	5.0	8.2	0.6	7.1	7.6	0.9	76		56	42,60,48,49,62	15	E	5	24.9	50.3	1	0	15.00	134	GPW	5.0	M>M	15.6	95	83.1	76	132	Stumbled st;wide 7/16p/ Stalked duelers; empty/ Lost lead 3/8p;retreat
			5.5	6	6	JOURNEY	S>S	T>D	Chased Pace. Fast last race (11). 1st off 44 day layoff. Class 0 Finished 8 from post 1 TJW= 50	42	1	43	3	37	2	70	77	5.4	8.2	0.7	5.9	8.8	0.7	90	76	48	54,32,42,0,0	44	NA	3	23.5	50.7	1	0	12.00	115	GPW	7.5	M>M	9.4	90	89.4	166	214	In range ins;3w1/4;fad/ Vied 2w; faded/ 3w; no factor
			5.5	7	7	MAGIC	S>S	D>D	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 3-hole. Clear early. Class 0 Finished 3 from post 3 TJW= 73	53	1	54	3	51	2	82	0	3.3	4.4	0.8	3.3	5.3	0.6	93		51	53,61,48,0,0	15	E	6	22.9	47.8	1	0	3.50	113	GPW	5.0	M>M	18.8	100	92.8	93	144	Duel rail;checked str/ Steady 3/8p;ins;flatnd/ Chased pace;faded
			5.5	8	8	RACHEL'S	S>S	T>D	Flashed speed. Fast last race (20). 1st off 56 day layoff. Class -30 Finished 5 from post 7 TJW= 26	43	2	54	5	43	2	89	85	5.7	7.4	0.8	7.5	8.3	0.9	97	95	71	74,73,40,37,48	56	E	5	22.8	46.4	1	0	1.80	157	BEL	6.0	M>M	15.6	106	97.3	192	263	5w upper; wknd late/ Hard used 2-3w; wknd/ Chased 3w; faded
			5.5	4	4	Z RED	S>S	D>D	Class 0 Finished 7 from post 6 TJW= 13	11	1	11	1	11	1	74	56	10.0	10.0	1.0	10.0	10.0	1.0	72	60	30	11,0,0,0,0	19	NA	0	26.2	51.2	1	0	30.00	110	GPW	6.0	M>M	0.0	76	79.6	132	162	Lack speed;no bid/ /
			5.5	5	5	ALL IN	S>S	T>D	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 10-hole. *Stretch gain (1). 1st off 33 day layoff.2 races in one pattern. Class 0 Finished 2 from post 10 TJW= 65	67	3	69	10	67	3	88	-4	3.3	3.0	1.1	3.6	3.0	1.2	93		67	69,63,73,73,65	33	E/P	6	21.8	46.1	1	0	2.50	111	GPW	5.0	M>M	18.8	107	103.2	93	160	Veid 1/4p;kept on/ Press pace 1/4p;kpt on/ Duel;game;outkickd

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	SRR	SUR	NOTES FROM LAST RACE	ASP		AVG		ASP		LAST FIVE											ERLY		TOTA		COMMENTS															
									110	RX	SPD	R#	TDS	RT	S1	S2	SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	TDONE	TD TWO	TD CLO	P2F	P4F	PFN	SPEED	RATINGS	DSL	R		P	CALL1	CALL2	MEDS	EQUIP	MLINE	CLS	TRK	DIS	CHNG	SPPNT	PWR	COMB	TOTL	LAST
11/16/18	GPW	3	6.0	5	5	GABRIELLEE	S>S	D>D	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 2-hole. Fast last race (13). Clear early.1st off 36 day layoff. Class 0 Finished 1 from post 2 TJW= 60	87	3	73	6	74	5	94	78	3.0	5.0	0.6	2.6	4.1	0.6	98	102	77	86,89,65,49,87	36	E	6	22.1	45.5	1	0	1.60	167	GPW	6.0	C>C	26.1	131	102.3	200	277	Vied early;pulled away/ Set pace;ins;drew off/ Lost lead 3/8p;empty
			6.0	2	2	FASHION	S>S	D>D	Class 5 Finished 3 from post 4 TJW= 69	75	9	75	10	75	9	85	85	2.4	3.8	0.6	2.2	3.5	0.6	87	87	83	78,81,84,81,74	26	E	4	23.8	48.7	1	0	3.00	154	PRX	5.5	C>C	17.4	122	97.4	174	257	Lacked needed rally/ Ins foes;shift 4w;fade/ Vied; clear; gamely
			6.0	6	6	MISS WILBY	S>S	D>D	Flashed speed. Slow last race (22). Class 5 Finished 6 from post 5 TJW= 44	69	5	70	10	68	7	83	54	5.7	5.7	1.0	6.2	6.7	0.9	89	86	37	48,67,62,51,74	14	E/P	4	24.1	48.6	1	BOFF	10.00	184	GPW	7.0	C>C	17.4	113	86.1	175	212	Brief bid; retreated/ Inside duel; good 2nd/ 4wd 1st; 3wd 2nd trn
			6.0	3	3	PURE BLISS	S>S	D>D	Made big overall move (4). *Stretch gain (.75).BTL horse. Class 0 Finished 2 from post 2 TJW= 22	72	9	72	10	72	10	86	80	6.1	6.0	1.0	6.1	6.0	1.0	88	88	85	81,75,79,29,78	16	E/P	4	23.4	46.3	1	0	6.00	137	GPW	6.0	CO>C	17.4	115	98.1	176	261	2wd bid;duel late/ Ins;up clse 1/8p;gawwy/ Vied early;solid bid
			6.0	4	4	ALLIYA'S	S>S	D>D	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 2-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH!BTL horse. 1st off 34 day layoff. Class -10 Finished 5 from post 2 TJW= 108	74	5	68	10	69	6	86	80	7.2	5.4	1.3	6.4	5.0	1.3	100	94	71	73,75,81,74,53	34	S	5	22.4	47.0	1	0	3.50	169	LRL	6.0	CO>C	21.7	123	100.1	194	265	Rail;dueled;weakened/ Duel 4 wide; no match/ Vied;clear;held game
			6.0	1	1	DORITZA	S>S	D>D	Made big overall move (3). *Stretch gain (2.5). 1st off 57 day layoff. Class 0 Finished 3 from post 6 TJW= 66	81	3	82	10	82	10	85	90	9.4	5.2	1.8	9.4	5.2	1.8	72	80	96	83,86,86,88,87	57	S	0	24.3	46.9	1	0	6.00	185	GP	6.0	C>C	0.0	118	102.3	152	248	Stumbl'd start;ins gain/ Insde;outsde;no impact/ Back;wide;closing fast

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	SRR	SUR	NOTES FROM LAST RACE	ASP		AVG		ASP		LAST FIVE											ERLY		TOTA		COMMENTS															
									110	RX	SPD	R#	TDS	RT	S1	S2	SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	TDONE	TD TWO	TD CLO	P2F	P4F	PFN	SPEED	RATINGS	DSL	R		P	CALL1	CALL2	MEDS	EQUIP	MLINE	CLS	TRK	DIS	CHNG	SPPNT	PWR	COMB	TOTL	LAST
11/16/18	GPW	4	8.0	11	11	KING POWER	S>R	D>T	Slow last race (13). 1st off 69 day layoff. Class -60 Finished 8 from post 2 TJW= 70	ERR	0	82	10	ERR	0	92	68	1.8	4.1	0.4	ERR	ERR	ERR	91	100	54	69,95,82,94,86	69	E	8	23.2	47.6	1	0	6.00	136	GP	7.0	AO>C	18.2	136	96.8	191	245	Tracked insde;retreat/ Vied 3wd;drew off/ Drew off;duel tn;tired
			8.0	8	8	DAY OF	S>R	T>T	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 8-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH! Clear early.1st off 34 day layoff. Class 5 Finished 1 from post 8 TJW= 56	75	1	67	10	75	1	74	91	2.3	3.8	0.6	1.0	1.0	1.0	88	82	79	76,61,75,72,66	34	E	8	23.6	48.3	1	0	12.00	117	GPW	7.5	C>C	18.2	118	99.8	170	249	Set pace;ins;skt clear/ Bad st;rushd;led;tired/ 2wd 1st; drft str; drv
			8.0	10	10	WEEKEND	R>R	T>T	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 10-hole. Slow last race (15).Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH! Class -5 Finished 9 from post 10 TJW= 43	82	8	83	10	82	9	85	76	5.7	6.2	0.9	5.6	6.0	0.9	99	108	47	68,77,80,75,87	27	E/P	4	47.5	74.3	1	0	15.00	178	GPW	8.0	C>C	9.1	111	94.4	207	254	Stalked;bid;faded upr/ 3w bid; led; gamely/ 3w trip; mild gain
			8.0	4	4	AT THE	R>R	T>T	Made big overall move (3). *Stretch gain (2.25). 1st off 649 day layoff. Class -34 Finished 2 from post 8 TJW= 31	84	5	76	10	84	5	86	94	5.1	5.0	1.0	4.0	2.6	1.5	81	84	92	86,85,88,78,83	649	P	1	47.2	71.3	1	0	20.00	165	TAM	8.0	R>C	2.3	119	104.8	165	257	Good finish outside/ Between 1/4; rallied/ Pulled early; rallied
			8.0	6	6	GREELY IS	S>R	D>T	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 5-hole. Clear early. Class 0 Finished 2 from post 5 TJW= 48	ERR	0	81	10	ERR	0	88	78	3.0	2.9	1.0	ERR	ERR	ERR	92	93	82	83,88,85,81,77	14	E/P	6	22.9	46.5	1	0	10.00	125	GPW	6.0	C>C	13.6	123	102.2	185	267	Duel;wore down late/ Duel ins;dug in gamely/ Outside;determinedly
			8.0	2	2	MISSION	R>R	D>T	*Stretch gain (.5). 1st off 46 day layoff. Class -55 Finished 7 from post 8 TJW= 108	82	4	86	9	86	8	87	81	5.1	4.9	1.0	5.3	4.7	1.1	90	93	77	83,86,86,85,0	46	E/P	6	47.3	72.9	1	0	3.50	168	DEL	8.3	AO>C	13.6	132	98.1	183	260	Weakened/ Pressed; bid; tired/ Stalked; rallied 3w
			8.0	5	5	DAVE	R>R	T>T	Made big overall move (6). Made a big move early (5.75). *Stretch gain (3). Fast last race (15). 2 races in one pattern. Class 5 Finished 2 from post 1 TJW= 56	79	7	79	10	79	7	81	94	5.2	3.7	1.4	4.5	3.9	1.2	90	98	85	94,86,81,78,76	20	P	3	47.4	73.4	1	0	6.00	139	GPW	8.5	C>C	6.8	122	103.9	188	273	2wd 1/4p;good finsh/ 5wd; just up/ Clear late; urging
			8.0	1	1	GOTSOMEMOJ	R>R	D>T	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 3-hole.Uncharacteristic race? 1st off 43 day layoff. Class 0 Finished 2 from post 3 TJW= 23	82	6	81	10	82	6	73	82	7.1	4.8	1.5	7.4	4.8	1.5	82	88	80	82,76,87,80,86	43	E/P	5	49.7	74.4	1	0	4.00	138	GPW	8.0	C>C	11.4	121	99.6	170	250	Stalk;5wd upr;gain plc/ Rated;5wd;pulled away/ Solid bid;clear2n best
			8.0	3	3	PORTER	R>R	T>T	Made big overall move (4). *Stretch gain (2.25).BTL horse. 1st off 41 day layoff.2 races in one pattern. Class -55 Finished 4 from post 7 TJW= 70	83	9	83	10	83	10	53	-9	8.5	5.5	1.5	8.5	5.5	1.5	70	69	84	80,84,90,87,78	41	S	0	50.9	77.0	1	0	3.00	162	GPW	12.0	R>C	0.0	141	98.3	139	223	2wd;inching closer/ Lost whip top stretch/ In back;wide;imprvd
			8.0	7	7	UNO EMAYO	R>R	T>T	Made big overall move (8). Made a big move early (3.25). Class -5 Finished 1 from post 7 TJW= 60	85	1	78	10	85	1	81	93	7.4	4.7	1.6	8.0	1.0	8.0	81	93	81	85,70,78,80,76	27	P	0	48.2	72.8	1	0	12.00	135	GPW	8.0	C>C	0.0	121	99.4	174	255	6wd bid upr;up in time/ Inside; no rally/ Mild rally on rail
			8.0	9	9	FAST FIRE	S>R	T>T	Made big overall move (4). *Stretch gain (2.25).BTL horse. 1st off 35 day layoff.2 races in one pattern. Class -25 Finished 5 from post 6 TJW= 28	78	8	80	10	78	8	67	95	8.3	3.9	2.1	8.3	4.1	2.0	66	66	103	82,90,76,76,81	35	S	3	25.3	49.8	1	0	10.00	131	GPW	7.5	CO>C	6.8	124	95.4	132	235	Wide into upr;late bid/ Rail bid;kick clear/ Rail gain tn;angld out

																		LAST FIVE SPEED RATINGS												ERLY TOTL PACE PACE			COMMENTS											
DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	SRR	SUR	NOTES FROM LAST RACE	ASP	AVG	ASP	S1	S2	SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	TDONE	TD TWO	TD CLO	P2F	P4F	PFN	DSL R	BRIS	P	CALL1	CALL2	MEDS	EQUIP	MLINE	CLS	TRK		DIS	CHNG	SPPNT	PWR	COMB	TOTL	LAST				
11/16/18	GPW	5	8.0	7 7	SEVEN GEMS	R>R	D>D	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 5-hole. Fast last race (23).Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH!BTL horse. Clear early.1st off 36 day layoff. Class 40 Finished 2 from post 5 TJW= 65	98	1	75	10	98	1	78	83	3.3	5.1	0.6	1.7	3.3	0.5	94	103	89	98,84,74,75,82	36	E	8	48.2	72.8	1	0	1.80	146	GPW	8.0	C>A	18.2	128	101.8	197	286	Set pace;duel;nipped/ Angled rail; driving/ Chased btwn; weakened
			8.0	5 5	CHOVANES	R>R	D>D	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 6-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH! Clear early.1st off 34 day layoff. Class 0 Finished 1 from post 6 TJW= 77	75	9	74	10	75	9	88	70	2.8	4.0	0.7	2.6	3.5	0.7	97	104	66	84,85,85,85,77	34	E	8	45.7	71.2	1	0	2.50	133	PEN	8.3	A>A	18.2	130	98.4	201	267	Rated 2path; driving/ 3p; bore out; grudging/ Drew off; in hand late
			8.0	2 2	MOTOWN MAN	R>R	D>D	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 6-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH! Clear early. Class 55 Finished 1 from post 6 TJW= 55	79	6	74	10	79	6	67	91	6.2	6.7	0.9	4.9	4.6	1.1	77	72	89	81,81,82,83,70	23	E/P	6	52.0	76.2	1	0	10.00	153	GPW	8.0	C>A	13.6	119	99.9	149	238	Pressured pace;drw clr/ Lack room tn;alt uppr/ Solid;no match for win
			8.0	6 6	MINUTE	S>R	D>D	Made big overall move (4). 1st off 49 day layoff. Class 0 Finished 4 from post 1 TJW= 70	ERR	0	72	10	ERR	0	85	85	8.7	8.0	1.1	ERR	ERR	ERR	84	85	88	81,65,78,73,65	49	NA	2	24.2	47.4	1	BON	12.00	186	GP	6.0	AO>A	4.5	116	93.2	169	257	Lack speed ins;5wd str/ Empty after half/ Rail 2nd tn;no threat
			8.0	4 4	ALL GOLDEN	R>R	D>D	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 7-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH! Clear early. Class 40 Finished 4 from post 7 TJW= 20	77	4	74	10	77	4	80	79	6.9	6.3	1.1	5.5	6.6	0.8	89	94	68	81,88,63,60,79	9	E/P	6	49.2	73.9	1	0	20.00	157	GPW	8.0	C>A	13.6	121	93.4	183	251	Pressured;duel;wknd/ Vied insde;gavewy/ Failed to menace
			8.0	1 1	BORN FOR A	S>R	D>D	Class -10 Finished 3 from post 3 TJW= 65	88	3	86	10	89	4	87	83	6.0	4.2	1.4	5.2	4.1	1.3	86	92	71	76,83,77,93,90	28	P	6	23.8	47.5	1	0	3.50	194	BEL	7.0	A>A	13.6	124	101.1	178	249	Roused 3w; belatedly/ 3-4w uppr; no response/ 3w on turn; gave way
			8.0	3 3	ERCOLANO	S>R	D>D	*Stretch gain (1.5).BTL horse. Class 0 Finished 3 from post 3 TJW= 83	ERR	0	85	3	ERR	0	88	84	7.3	3.6	2.0	ERR	ERR	ERR	92	98	91	94,76,84,0,0	27	S	8	23.4	45.7	1	0	4.50	178	GPW	7.0	AO>A	18.2	130	103.3	190	281	3-4wd; rallied outside/ Steadied3/8;wide;2late/ Cue uppr;strong kick
																		LAST FIVE SPEED RATINGS												ERLY TOTL PACE PACE			COMMENTS											
DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	SRR	SUR	NOTES FROM LAST RACE	ASP	AVG	ASP	S1	S2	SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	TDONE	TD TWO	TD CLO	P2F	P4F	PFN	DSL R	BRIS	P	CALL1	CALL2	MEDS	EQUIP	MLINE	CLS	TRK		DIS	CHNG	SPPNT	PWR	COMB	TOTL	LAST				
11/16/18	GPW	6	6.0	6 6	ELISSAS	0>S	>D	1st off 737014 day layoff. FTS. Class ILR Finished 0 from post 0 TJW= 49	ERR	0	ERR	0	ERR	0	57	-9	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR				0,0,0,0,0	****	NA	0	0.0	0.0	0	0	10.00	ERR	0.0	>M	0.0	ERR	0	0	/ /		
			6.0	1 1	SHIMMYSHIM	0>S	>D	1st off 737014 day layoff. FTS. Class ILR Finished 0 from post 0 TJW= 69	ERR	0	ERR	0	ERR	0	57	-9	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR				0,0,0,0,0	****	NA	0	0.0	0.0	1	0	4.50		0.0	>M	0.0	ERR	0	0	/ /		
			6.0	3 3	HOT FUDGE	S>S	D>D	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 7-hole. 1st off 62 day layoff. Class -10 Finished 7 from post 7 TJW= 69	60	3	60	5	61	4	88	64	4.9	5.9	0.8	4.2	5.5	0.8	91	91	45	54,46,57,81,62	62	E	3	23.1	47.4	1	0	8.00	149	GP	6.5	M>M	30.0	112	91.6	182	227	Up clse 3p;5/16p;fade/ Asked turn;no avail/ In range;rail tn;empty
			6.0	2 2	MY SWEET	S>S	D>D	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 10-hole.BTL horse. Clear early. Class -15 Finished 2 from post 10 TJW= 29	58	1	57	8	50	3	82	72	4.9	5.5	0.9	4.2	5.4	0.8	86	82	60	58,62,53,73,47	28	E/P	4	24.0	48.0	1	0	6.00	154	CT	6.5	S>M	40.0	107	88.0	168	228	5p;bid;couldn't gain/ Bid; second best/ Bad step turn; faded
			6.0	5 5	PASO A LA	S>S	T>D	*Stretch gain (3.5). 1st off 35 day layoff.2 races in one pattern. Class 5 Finished 3 from post 2 TJW= 58	ERR	0	66	6	69	2	69	85	3.4	3.7	0.9	0.0	5.0	0.0	79	71	80	70,66,65,56,65	35	S	1	24.2	49.9	1	BON	8.00	125	GPW	7.5	M>M	10.0	113	96.9	150	230	Stalk top 2;5wd bid/ In range;edgd for show/ In aim 1/4p;weaknd
			6.0	7 7	BEGIN	S>S	D>D	Made a big move early (4.5). Class -20 Finished 4 from post 1 TJW= 49	63	1	58	4	66	2	81	68	6.2	6.2	1.0	5.3	3.5	1.5	89	87	68	63,38,64,68,0	28	E	2	22.8	48.1	1	0	3.50	156	GPW	5.5	M>M	20.0	115	89.3	176	244	4wd bid tn;wide upr/ Faile to respond/ Stalkd;bid far tn;wknd
			6.0	4 4	FLYING MY	S>S	D>D	Made a big move early (11). Class -20 Finished 6 from post 2 TJW= 61	59	1	59	1	59	1	81	66	8.8	7.5	1.2	8.8	7.5	1.2	75	84	65	59,0,0,0,0	28	NA	0	22.8	48.4	1	BON	6.00	141	GPW	5.5	M>M	0.0	111	93.9	159	224	Drft in start;lack spd/ /
			6.0	8 8	STARSHIP	S>S	D>D	Made big overall move (5). Middle move (6). Class 10 Finished 3 from post 5 TJW= 39	ERR	0	62	1	62	1	74	81	7.5	3.8	2.0	7.5	3.8	2.0	70	62	81	62,0,0,0,0	26	S	0	25.9	48.3	1	0	4.00	111	GPW	7.0	M>M	0.0	104	95.0	132	213	Bump start;traild erly/ /

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	SRR	SUR	NOTES FROM LAST RACE	ASP		AVG		ASP		LAST FIVE										ERLY		TOTL		COMMENTS																
									110	RX	SPD	R#	TDS	RT	S1	S2	SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	TDONE	TD TWO	TD CLO	P2F	P4F	PFN	SPEED	RATINGS	DLSR		BRIS	P	CALL1	CALL2	MEDS	EQUIP	MLINE	CLS	TRK	DIS	CHNG	SPPNT	PWR	COMB	PACE	PACE
11/16/18	GPW	7	5.0	1	1	I'M	S>S	T>T	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 6-hole. Clear early.1st off 40 day layoff. Class 0 Finished 1 from post 6 TJW= 65	83	3	79	10	83	3	88	-4	1.9	3.7	0.5	1.9	3.5	0.5	90	88	87,87,85,83,75	40	E/P	7	22.5	45.7	1	0	3.50	133	GPW	5.0	AO>A	13.2	136	108.6	90	178	Duel;clear;drftng out/Bump st;up late;edg by/Set pace;drv;kep clear	
			5.0	5	5	TEAK	S>S	T>T	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 7-hole. 1st off 162 day layoff. Class 5 Finished 8 from post 7 TJW= 71	81	4	80	5	81	4	86	-3	3.1	5.8	0.5	1.7	4.8	0.4	94	67	70,87,74,92,78	162	E	7	22.6	46.8	1	BOFF	4.00	170	DEL	5.0	AO>A	13.2	123	100.7	94	161	Prompted; gave way/Quickly clear;mild drv/No match; lost 2d late	
			5.0	8	8	GRAN	S>S	T>T	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 4-hole. Fast last race (13). Clear early.1st off 64 day layoff. Class 0 Finished 1 from post 4 TJW= 83	79	6	73	7	79	6	96	-1	1.7	2.7	0.6	1.4	1.4	1.0	91	86	86,80,84,87,62	64	E	8	22.2	44.7	1	0	2.00	134	GP	5.0	AO>A	15.1	136	108.9	91	177	Speed;insde;drv finsh/Pace;drop whip;sharp/Clear;hop track;drv	
			5.0	4	4	EPIC DRAMA	S>S	D>T	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 6-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH!BTL horse. Clear early.1st off 37 day layoff. Class 55 Finished 3 from post 6 TJW= 62	80	3	79	10	80	3	89	82	3.4	5.3	0.6	3.0	2.7	1.1	90	94	86	86,71,79,66,86	37	E	7	22.6	45.6	1	0	15.00	164	DEL	6.0	C>A	13.2	115	102.9	184	270	Gave way grudgingly/Vied; weakened/ Pressed pace; tired;
			5.0	7	7	GRAN SAMAN	S>S	T>T	Made big overall move (4). 1st off 50 day layoff. Class 0 Finished 1 from post 7 TJW= 59	79	5	77	10	78	8	93	1	3.1	4.4	0.7	3.2	3.5	0.9	88	86	83,86,75,76,70	50	E/P	5	22.9	45.5	1	0	12.00	139	GP	5.0	AO>A	9.4	125	106.2	88	174	Rated;outsde;drw clear/Vied erly;dug in gamly/Duel;dug in gamely	
			5.0	6	6	BLUE CHIP	S>S	T>T	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 5-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH! Clear early.1st off 56 day layoff. Class 5 Finished 1 from post 5 TJW= 66	82	5	75	9	82	5	84	4	2.5	3.5	0.7	1.9	2.4	0.8	94	72	75,81,84,87,84	56	E	6	23.3	48.1	1	0	10.00	164	MED	5.0	A>A	11.3	126	100.1	94	166	Bumped st; held gamely/Pressed pace; faded/Evenly on rail	
			5.0	9	9	EARTH	S>S	T>T	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 3-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH! Clear early.1st off 42 day layoff. Class 55 Finished 1 from post 3 TJW= 31	82	4	80	10	81	5	92	-4	3.6	4.8	0.8	3.1	3.6	0.9	99	76	84,66,82,77,80	42	E	6	21.3	44.9	1	0	6.00	176	GPW	5.0	C>A	11.3	120	100.6	99	175	Veid;ins;drew away/ Vie early;ins half;3w/ Up clse rail tn;flatnd	
			5.0	3	3	GREEN	S>S	T>T	Made big overall move (6). Class 0 Finished 1 from post 7 TJW= 44	84	3	77	9	84	3	85	-3	4.4	4.2	1.0	5.5	1.8	3.1	90	85	84,86,73,81,81	21	E/P	4	22.5	46.6	1	0	6.00	160	GPW	5.0	AO>A	7.5	131	108.0	90	175	Drft wide;up in time/Drv outside;determind/Chased 4-3wd; lack bid	
			5.0	2	2	VERY	S>S	D>T	*Stretch gain (2.75). 1st off 70 day layoff. Class 0 Finished 4 from post 1 TJW= 45	85	8	83	10	83	9	85	2	6.6	4.2	1.6	6.3	4.0	1.6	85	88	82,99,89,83,80	70	S	3	24.2	47.0	1	0	10.00	145	GP	5.0	AO>A	5.7	121	104.2	85	173	Trailed;late improve/Duel;game;won nose bob/Track leader;drvng;up	

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	SRR	SUR	NOTES FROM LAST RACE	ASP		AVG		ASP		LAST FIVE										ERLY		TOTL		COMMENTS																
									110	RX	SPD	R#	TDS	RT	S1	S2	SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	TDONE	TD TWO	TD CLO	P2F	P4F	PFN	SPEED	RATINGS	DLSR		BRIS	P	CALL1	CALL2	MEDS	EQUIP	MLINE	CLS	TRK	DIS	CHNG	SPPNT	PWR	COMB	PACE	PACE
11/16/18	GPW	8	5.5	9	9	SOUPERY	0>S	>D	1st off 737014 day layoff. FTS. Class ILR Finished 0 from post 0 TJW= 23	ERR	0	ERR	0	ERR	0	57	-9	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	0,0,0,0,0	****	NA	0	0.0	0.0	1	0	15.00	ERR	0.0	>M	0.0	ERR	0	0	//				
			5.5	3	3	COWTOWN	0>S	>D	1st off 737014 day layoff. FTS. Class ILR Finished 0 from post 0 TJW= 41	ERR	0	ERR	0	ERR	0	57	-9	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	0,0,0,0,0	****	NA	0	0.0	0.0	1	0	6.00	ERR	0.0	>M	0.0	ERR	0	0	//				
			5.5	4	4	DEFENSE	0>S	>D	1st off 737014 day layoff. FTS. Class ILR Finished 0 from post 0 TJW= 61	ERR	0	ERR	0	ERR	0	57	-9	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	0,0,0,0,0	****	NA	0	0.0	0.0	1	0	10.00	ERR	0.0	>M	0.0	ERR	0	0	//				
			5.5	5	5	ECLIPTICAL	0>S	>D	1st off 737014 day layoff. FTS. Class ILR Finished 0 from post 0 TJW= 48	ERR	0	ERR	0	ERR	0	57	-9	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	0,0,0,0,0	****	NA	0	0.0	0.0	1	0	12.00	ERR	0.0	>M	0.0	ERR	0	0	//				
			5.5	2	2	JUST	S>S	D>D	Flashed speed. 1st off 237 day layoff. Class -3 Finished 10 from post 11 TJW= 50	54	2	64	5	54	2	80	70	3.5	6.5	0.5	5.0	8.0	0.6	92	83	60	55,53,79,60,74	237	E	7	23.3	48.5	1	0	10.00	156	AQU	6.0	M>M	33.3	102	88.1	175	235	Hustled st; faltered/Bumped st; tired/ 2w;bid 3/16;weakened
			5.5	7	7	C'ERA UNA	S>S	D>D	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 3-hole. Clear early.1st off 120 day layoff. Class -5 Finished 4 from post 3 TJW= 28	71	5	71	6	71	6	88	71	3.4	4.9	0.7	3.4	4.9	0.7	99	95	65	69,66,59,70,78	120	E	5	22.3	46.6	1	0	4.00	155	GP	6.0	M>M	23.8	115	96.7	194	259	Pressed 2wd; wknd rail/Bmp st; duel 2pth;tire/Hopped&bump st; wide
			5.5	6	6	ACCOUNTANT	S>S	D>D	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 7-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH! Clear early.1st off 61 day layoff. Class 15 Finished 2 from post 7 TJW= 36	68	7	68	7	68	7	85	82	4.3	4.9	0.9	4.3	4.9	0.9	87	86	84	78,59,74,77,69	61	E	4	23.6	47.2	1	0	3.00	130	GP	6.0	M>M	19.0	109	100.3	173	257	Duel til 1/8p;good try/ Inisde bid;no impact/Strong ride 5-6w;flatn
			5.5	1	1	BULLGRATS	S>S	D>D	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 4-hole. 1st off 209 day layoff. Class -20 Finished 6 from post 4 TJW= 53	73	3	73	3	73	3	89	75	4.8	5.2	0.9	4.8	5.2	0.9	93	92	72	73,84,63,0,0	209	E	5	22.7	47.4	1	0	2.50	157	GP	6.0	S>M	23.8	120	99.1	185	257	Chased 2wd; tired str/ Up close;4wd1/8;kpt on/Hustld 5wd;angl in3/16
			5.5	8	8	SUPER	R>S	T>D	1st off 50 day layoff. Class -5 Finished 8 from post 6 TJW= 23	74	2	61	6	71	3	72	100	8.0	7.0	1.1	6.7	5.2	1.3	65	63	82	67,70,64,78,51	50	NA	0	52.4	76.9	1	0	20.00	155	GP	8.0	M>M	0.0	107	90.4	128	210	Ask far tn;no gain/ Lack speed;wide bid/Hopped;slow start

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	SRR	SUR	NOTES FROM LAST RACE	ASP	AVG	ASP	LAST FIVE											ERLY			TOTL	COMMENTS																						
									110	RX	SPD	R#	TDS	RT	S1	S2	SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	TDONE	TD TWO	TD CLO	P2F	P4F	PFN	SPEED		RATINGS	DSL	BRIS	P	CALL1	CALL2	MEDS	EQUIP	M LINE	CLS	TRK	DIS	CHNG	SPPNT	PWR	COMB	TOTL	PACE	PACE			
11/16/18	GPW	9	7.5	5	5	RUCIA MORA	0>S	>T	1st off 737014 day layoff. FTS. Class ILR Finished 0 from post 0 TJW= 37	ERR	0	ERR	0	ERR	0	57	-9	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	0	0	0	/	/	/							
			7.5	8	8	ZARINA	0>S	>T	1st off 737014 day layoff. FTS. Class ILR Finished 0 from post 0 TJW= 50	ERR	0	ERR	0	ERR	0	57	-9	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	0	0	0	/	/	/							
			7.5	3	3	SUBTLE	0>S	>T	1st off 737014 day layoff. FTS. Class ILR Finished 0 from post 0 TJW= 37	ERR	0	ERR	0	ERR	0	57	-9	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	0	0	0	/	/	/					
			7.5	4	4	CONQUEST	0>S	>T	1st off 737014 day layoff. FTS. Class ILR Finished 0 from post 0 TJW= 63	ERR	0	ERR	0	ERR	0	57	-9	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	0	0	0	/	/	/	
			7.5	6	6	BRITESIDEO	S>S	T>T	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 11-hole. 1st off 44 day layoff. Class -15 Finished 9 from post 11 TJW= 62	63	2	59	4	63	2	80	70	3.2	7.6	0.4	2.5	7.0	0.4	100	100	37	61,64,61,49,0	44	E	4	23.3	48.4	1	0	4.00	129	GPW	7.5	M>M	20.0	101	91.2	200	237	Stalkd leader;wknd str/ In aim 3wd 1/4p;wknd/ Led;duel insde;faded				
			7.5	2	2	NARROWS	R>S	T>T	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 4-hole. 1st off 91 day layoff. Class -11 Finished 2 from post 4 TJW= 55	ERR	0	63	2	63	1	88	84	3.1	3.8	0.8	2.9	4.3	0.7	95	97	53	62,63,0,0,0	91	E	4	46.8	71.0	1	0	3.00	129	ELP	8.0	M>M	20.0	92	99.0	192	245	Led btw str; hung late/ Dueled to 1/4p faded/				
			7.5	7	7	FLASHPROUD	S>S	D>T	Flashed speed. Class 10 Finished 4 from post 10 TJW= 20	44	1	48	5	51	2	83	68	6.1	7.4	0.8	5.5	8.5	0.6	89	83	56	52,44,58,45,41	19	P	2	23.7	49.0	1	0	30.00	116	GPW	6.0	M>M	10.0	87	84.8	172	228	Bump st;chase;flatned/ Empty after half/ Step awkward start				
			7.5	16	16	TENNESSEE	R>S	T>T	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 12-hole. Class 0 Finished 9 from post 12 TJW= 36	64	1	55	4	64	1	77	83	5.5	6.3	0.9	5.8	2.5	2.3	90	94	56	65,64,47,45,0	22	S	0	49.0	74.9	1	0	15.00	129	GPW	8.0	M>M	0.0	96	92.1	184	240	Gain;shift wider late/ Slow start;widest str				
			7.5	13	13	HENNY'S	S>S	T>T	Class -15 Finished 6 from post 10 TJW= 65	64	1	67	2	67	2	73	79	7.0	7.0	1.0	7.0	7.0	1.0	85	85	55	64,70,0,0,0	27	NA	1	24.7	49.8	1	BON	6.00	149	GPW	7.5	M>M	5.0	111	92.8	170	225	In range;flatnd turn/ Step slw st;no threat/				
			7.5	1	1	SECRET	S>S	T>T	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 3-hole. Fast last race (14).BTL horse. 1st off 35 day layoff. Class 0 Finished 2 from post 3 TJW= 44	73	3	59	5	73	3	71	85	4.4	4.4		2.4	2.4	1.0	83	75	80	73,74,73,60,13	35	E/P	4	23.8	48.7	1	0	1.80	126	GPW	7.5	M>M	20.0	123	95.5	158	238	Duel;l;d;duel;bump lte/ Stlkd ins;outsde bid/ Set pace;outkickd late				
			7.5	12	12	ONE SLICK	S>S	T>T	Flashed speed. Class 5 Finished 3 from post 7 TJW= 69	64	1	64	1	64	1	74	83	3.3	3.3		3.3	3.3	1.0	85	82	58	64,0,0,0,0	28	E	4	24.8	49.7	1	0	6.00	111	GPW	7.5	M>M	20.0	108	95.8	167	225	Stalkd;2wd tn;5wd late/ /				
			7.5	14	14	DAMASKA	S>S	T>T	Class 0 Finished 9 from post 7 TJW= 67	ERR	0	46	1	46	1	74	-5	10.0	9.0	1.1	10.0	9.0	1.1	67		68	46,0,0,0,0	23	NA	0	24.6	49.2	1	0	30.00	116	GPW	5.0	M>M	0.0	84	83.8	67	135	Failed to menace/ /				
			7.5	15	15	SAND DRIFT	S>S	T>T	*Stretch gain (4). Class 0 Finished 6 from post 3 TJW= 48	ERR	0	63	1	63	1	76	-5	7.0	6.0	1.2	7.0	6.0	1.2	73		81	63,0,0,0,0	23	NA	0	24.2	48.2	1	0	8.00	116	GPW	5.0	M>M	0.0	108	98.7	73	154	Off pace;outside urging/ /				
			7.5	10	10	MESA	S>S	T>T	*Stretch gain (2.5). Fast last race (11).BTL horse. 1st off 35 day layoff. Class 0 Finished 5 from post 11 TJW= 49	69	1	58	4	69	1	65	88	6.3	5.3	1.2	6.4	4.5	1.4	76	62	86	69,44,64,54,0	35	E/P	0	25.0	49.9	1	0	12.00	117	GPW	7.5	M>M	0.0	104	94.5	138	224	Insde;2wd;needed more/ Chase pace;faded/ Insde early;drftd wide				
			7.5	11	11	KINDHEARTE	S>S	T>T	*Stretch gain (3). Class 5 Finished 5 from post 1 TJW= 42	59	2	59	2	59	2	69	87	9.0	7.0	1.3	9.0	7.0	1.3	81	72	66	62,56,0,0,0	28	NA	1	25.8	50.6	1	0	15.00	114	GPW	7.5	M>M	5.0	97	91.5	153	219	4wd uppr;lugging in/ In back;no bid/				
			7.5	9	9	PRINCESS	S>S	T>T	Made big overall move (3). *Stretch gain (.5). 1st off 42 day layoff. Class 5 Finished 5 from post 5 TJW= 43	ERR	0	58	1	58	1	75	-4	8.9	5.6	1.6	8.9	5.6	1.6	72		76	58,0,0,0,0	42	NA	0	24.4	48.0	1	0	15.00	111	GPW	5.0	M>M	0.0	93	95.4	72	148	Lack speed;5wd imprve/ /				