LAST TOTL

ASP AVG ASP THREE SECND PACE BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG  HORSE CLASS SRR SUR 110 SPD R# TDS SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE P2F P4F PFN AVG MLINE CALL LAST ALL LAST TOTALS LAST RACE COMMENT
11/17/18 AQU 1 8.0 2 2  BECKER'S -15 R>X>R D>D 82 83 10 84 4.5 7.1 0.63 86 86 69 76 3.50 51.1 241 516 486 1002 2w pursuit; folded
8.0 55 SPARTY BOY © R>RD>D 84 83 9 84 6.9 5.6 1.24 74 72 85 82 1.66 55.3 231 511 517 1028 4w upper; improved
8.0 33 OLD -15 R>R D>D 83 83 10 83 7.8 5.1 1.55 69 67 61 78 4.50 52.6 197 490 430 919 Quick tuck 2p;outrun
8.0 6 6 TOOHOTTOEV © S>RD>D 76 8310 76 5.4 4.9 1.09 83 88 82 76 12.00 55.0 253 485 515 1000 Chased 4-3w; ran on
8.0 11 NO -5 S>R D>D 80 82 10 80 5.2 6.2 ©.84 87 90 78 81 6.00 56.0 255 501 524 1025 Vie ins 1/2-1/16;wknd
8.0 4 4 MARRIAGE 0 R>R D>D 83 82 10 83 4.6 4.7 .97 77 80 85 84 2.50 56.0 242 498 528 1027 6w upper; kept on
5,1,2
LAST TOTL
ASP AVG ASP THREE SECND PACE BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE CLASS SRR SUR 110 SPD R# TDS SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE P2F P4F PFN AVG MLINE CALL LAST ALL LAST TOTALS LAST RACE COMMENT
11/17/18 AQU 2 6.0 4 4 BASELINE © S>S T>T 89 8310 79 2.5 4.6 ©.55 90 90 85 83 12.00 55.2 265 284 292 576 Tracked 1ldr; tired
6.0 6 6 FUEL THE © S>S T>T 8 82 10 86 3.9 4.3 ©0.89 81 86 96 81 2.00 57.0 263 295 306 601 Settled; closed 7w
6.0 11 11 BLINDED 22 S>S D>T 74 76 10 74 1.8 4.9 ©0.36 86 84 85 77 6.00 55.7 255 268 282 550 2w;sputter 3-4w upper
6.0 10 10 SPECIAL -15 S>S D>T ERR 74 10 ERR 4.5 6.9 ©0.65 77 76 71 68 12.00 53.8 224 267 255 523 Angled out;evenly lane
6.0 7 7 FLED -5 S>S D>T ERR 72 8 ERR 4.4 4.8 0.91 92 99 60 75 20.00 55.8 251 275 279 554 Vied 3p; stopped 1/8
6.0 55 DRAGON 15 S>S D>T ERR 52 1 ERR 7.0 9.0 0.78 81 87 42 52 5.00 55.0 210 228 225 453 Slow start; no threat
6,7,10
LAST TOTL
ASP AVG ASP THREE SECND PACE BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE CLASS SRR SUR 110 SPD R# TDS SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE P2F P4F PFN AVG MLINE CALL LAST ALL LAST TOTALS LAST RACE COMMENT
11/17/18 AQU 3 8.0 4 4  SUNSET -18 R>R D>D 104 100 4 102 2.2 1.5 1.50 8 94 90 104 1.00 54.9 270 637 624 1261 Stumbled st; drew clr
8.0 3 3  SATISFY -20 S>R D>D ERR 92 6 ERR 4.5 1.7 2.63 84 93 103 94 1.40 59.4 280 623 640 1263 Ins turn;5w upr;denied
8.0 11 POSSE -5 S>RD>D 84 84 9 84 7.1 4.3 1.64 83 94 92 89 10.00 58.3 269 592 609 1201 3-4w turn;5w into uppr
8.0 55 TIZNOW'S -20 R>R D>D 83 79 10 83 7.9 5.5 1.43 79 81 93 91 4.00 51.7 253 584 584 1167 2w; improved in lane

3,4,5



LAST TOTL

ASP AVG ASP THREE SECND PACE BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE CLASS SRR SUR 110 SPD R# TDS SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE P2F P4F PFN AVG MLINE CALL LAST ALL LAST TOTALS LAST RACE COMMENT
11/17/18 AQU 4 6.0 9 9 LE GENERAL © S>S D>D ERR 87 1 87 3.3 3.3 1.00 94 83 87 1.60 56.3 177 556 518 1074 3w;5w upper;no match
6.0 44 TRIP UPS 30 S>S D>D 83 83 1 83 2.9 2.9 1.00 89 90 87 83 3.00 53.4 266 522 563 1085 2 wide; gaining
6.0 55 KADENS 7] S> S Db 75 75 3 75 2.7 3.1 0©.88 99 100 68 75 6.00 56.6 267 534 549 1083 Pressed;led;battled on
6.0 8 8 CLEAR THE © S> S Db 73 73 1 73 6.0 4.0 1.50 89 95 69 73 5.0 56.9 253 514 522 1036 Chased 5-6w; ran on
6.0 3 3 WISECRACK © S>SD>D 61 61 4 61 4.5 7.3 0.63 93 84 50 58 15.00 51.2 227 456 425 881 Chased 5w; tired
6.0 2 2  BRONX 0 S>S D>D 42 42 1 42 3.3 6.7 ©0.50 102 85 45 42 15.00 50.7 232 420 423 843 Lite bmp st;2w;between
6.0 7 7 TAZMONIAN ILR 0>S >D ERR ERR © ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR 20.00 ERR (2] ERR ERR ERR
6.0 11 BLINDWILLI ILR 0>S >D ERR ERR © ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR 10.00 ERR (7] ERR ERR ERR
9,1,5
LAST TOTL
ASP AVG ASP THREE SECND PACE BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE CLASS SRR SUR 110 SPD R# TDS SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE P2F P4F PFN AVG MLINE CALL LAST ALL LAST TOTALS LAST RACE COMMENT
11/17/18 AQU 5 7.0 3 3 PINK SANDS 2 S>SD>D 83 8 7 83 6.2 3.7 1.68 78 74 90 85 8.00 53.2 242 272 263 535 Inside;pull left half
7.0 22 ELECTRIC 2 S>S D>D 83 83 2 83 5.7 3.3 1.71 93 96 66 83 3.50 53.8 255 274 266 539 In tight leaving chute
7.0 4 4 QUIVERY (7] R>S T>D ERR 82 3 ERR 8.4 6.8 1.24 77 84 79 82 20.00 52.2 240 271 263 534 4w upper; tired
7.0 11 BARRIER 2 S>SD>D 79 80 5 80 6.7 3.6 1.86 80 71 87 78 12.00 53.3 238 265 253 518 2w;ask 3/8;6p by 1/8
7.0 8 8 HATL 2 S>S D>b 82 77 6 82 5.1 5.3 ©0.96 80 74 97 78 5.0 55.1 251 265 269 534 3w 1/2;4w5/16;held off
2,3,1
LAST TOTL
ASP AVG ASP THREE SECND PACE BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE CLASS SRR SUR 110 SPD R# TDS SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE P2F P4F PFN AVG MLINE CALL LAST ALL LAST TOTALS LAST RACE COMMENT
11/17/18 AQU 6 6.0 55 SANDLOT -41 R>S T>D ERR 79 2 ERR 1.8 4.1 0.44 98 103 68 79 2.50 52.5 269 376 367 743 Brsh brk;2w;led3/8-1/8
6.0 11 CAUSFORCEL -45 S>S T>D 58 73 10 58 5.0 3.7 1.34 84 84 76 74 8.00 56.5 244 351 340 691 Quick to rail;5w upper
6.0 6 6 BACK OF 0 S>S D>D 66 68 3 66 2.2 4.1 ©.55 90 84 72 68 4.50 54.6 246 341 339 680 Dueled 2p; caught late
6.0 7 7 LATIN LOVE © S>S D> 71 67 10 71 5.9 4.4 1.34 79 81 87 77 6.00 53.8 247 338 363 701 4w;asked upper;held
6.0 8 8 THERESA'S -15 R>S D>D 62 64 106 62 4.2 5.6 ©0.76 88 87 73 65 12.00 50.9 248 329 342 671 3w pursuit;5w upper
6.0 4 4 FREUDIAN (2] S>S D>D 62 61 106 61 6.6 6.3 1.3 85 73 70 61 30.00 55.8 228 320 296 616 5-4p turn;8p into lane
6.0 2 2 MAN OF -15 S>S D>D 63 48 10 42 8.7 8.5 1.83 80 67 85 56 20.00 53.3 232 301 319 619 5-6w uppr; no impact
6.0 99 NEUTRAL (2] S>S D>D 43 43 5 43 8.9 8.9 1.0 77 71 73 48 30.00 52.1 221 284 295 579 Quick to rail; 6w 1/8

7,8,4



LAST TOTL

ASP AVG ASP THREE SECND PACE BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE CLASS SRR SUR 110 SPD R# TDS SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE P2F P4F PFN AVG MLINE CALL LAST ALL LAST TOTALS LAST RACE COMMENT

11/17/18 AQU 7 8.5 12 12 ABIDING -15 R>R T>T 93 92 10 93 3.5 3.7 .93 102 110 68 92 10.00 47.9 280 185 187 373 Sent; rail; tired;
8.5 15 14 GYPSUM 0 S>R D>T ERR 91 10 ERR 5.2 5.5 ©.95 96 100 59 81 12.00 53.6 255 187 171 358 Bumped st; eased
8.5 34 SNAP 7] R>R D>T 90 90 10 91 7.1 4.7 1.51 77 82 82 89 6.00 51.8 241 189 176 365 Rail to 1/4; no impact
8.5 9 10 UNCLE MOJO -5 R>R D>T ERR 90 9 ERR 2.8 3.8 ©0©.74 92 101 80 96 8.00 53.9 273 191 199 390 Ins-3plst;3p2nd;4pl/4
8.5 13 13 EKHTIBAAR 50 R>R T>T 84 89 9 84 5.3 3.9 1.36 89 94 79 88 15.00 54.2 262 187 191 377 Ins 1st;3w 2d;got plce
8.5 10 11 HOLIDAY 45 R>R T>T 89 87 10 87 5.5 4.4 1.27 68 71 96 90 20.00 59.1 235 192 184 376 5w upper; late foot
8.5 56 GREEK (2] R>R D>T ERR 86 5 ERR 6.8 5.7 1.19 71 74 77 87 15.00 53.1 222 182 171 353 Inside; 3w into lane
8.5 7 8 LUNAIRE 5 R>R D>T 84 85 10 84 7.8 4.4 1.75 74 79 98 99 12.00 55.4 251 188 190 377 Stumbled st; gamely
8.5 16 15 CALEDONIAN © S>R D>T ERR 85 10 ERR 7.6 5.2 1.45 86 90 89 88 8.00 57.0 265 186 188 374 Ins turnj;urge 5w into

11,15,8 11 paid $44.75 $1 Double paid $148 pick 3 paid $462

LAST TOTL
ASP AVG ASP THREE SECND PACE BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE CLASS SRR SUR 110 SPD R# TDS SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE P2F P4F PFN AVG MLINE CALL LAST ALL LAST TOTALS LAST RACE COMMENT

11/17/18 AQU 8 11.0 14 14 CONTROL -5 R>R D>T ERR 97 10 ERR 2.7 3.6 ©0©.76 77 80 98 95 2.00 53.7 255 194 200 395 Inside;5w upr;shy late
11.0 3 3 ZULU ALPHA © R>R T>T ERR 91 106 91 4.5 3.6 1.24 65 51 100 93 2.50 51.2 216 186 178 364 Up ins str; drew clear
11.0 13 13 RED KNIGHT -5 R>R T>T 87 88 9 88 5.3 2.0 2.71 84 95 73 91 15.00 50.3 252 184 188 372 2w pursuit; 5p 3/16
11.0 2 2 VILLAGE 15 R>R T>T ERR 88 2 88 2.3 5.4 0.43 83 75 102 88 15.00 54.0 260 184 192 377 Ins;vs duo str;nipl/16
11.0 55 SOGLIO 20 R>R T>T 92 88 10 88 3.9 2.5 1.56 64 53 87 95 10.00 49.2 204 184 175 360 Came in st; held sway
11.0 15 15 EXULTING -5 R>R D>T ERR 87 106 79 5.0 5.9 0.84 79 81 94 94 1.40 52.3 254 186 195 381 2-3w trnj;ask 3/16pl
11.0 4 4 GALOPE 15 R>R T>T ERR 86 1 86 10.0 8.3 1.20 71 67 102 86 20.00 53.8 240 184 185 369 Inside journey; empty

2,5,14 #2 paid $12 $1 double paid $377 pick 3 paid $969



ASP AVG ASP THREE SECND PACE BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG  HORSE CLASS SRR SUR 110 SPD R# TDS SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE P2F P4F PFN AVG MLINE CALL LAST ALL LAST TOTALS LAST RACE COMMENT

11/17/18 AQU 9 6.0 9 9  UNSULLIED -45 R>S D>D 76 73 5 76 7.8 5.4 1.46 79 73 70 73 2.00 53.5 222 337 320 658 Broke in st; tired
6.0 3 3 CROSS -15 S>S T>D 74 7110 74 5.5 4.3 1.29 88 87 59 70 4.50 55.5 234 320 314 634 At/near 2p;drive 1/4
6.0 5 5 NINJA BOYS 5 R>S D>D 75 70 6 75 8.7 6.6 1.33 80 65 69 73 6.00 50.0 214 318 297 615 Ins;4w angle 5/16-upr
6.0 6 6 NO HITTER © S>SD>D 65 65 2 65 5.9 5.3 1.11 83 80 70 65 6.00 54.3 233 307 309 617 Hit gate; steady 9/16p
6.0 4 4 THEFINALCR -15 S>SD>D 65 63 6 65 2.4 5.8 0.41 97 101 59 70 3.50 53.1 257 308 335 643 Bobbled st; no match
6.0 2 2 HOLYCOWITS -45 R>S D>D 55 60 5 55 7.6 6.4 1.19 79 78 70 68 8.00 53.6 227 305 320 625 2w;long drive turn
6.0 8 8 PLAYBOY -10 R>S D>D 60 60 106 61 3.7 6.3 ©.58 79 68 50 59 20.00 51.4 197 291 270 561 2p trns; weakened
6.6 11 RIDOLFO 0 S>SD>D 61 57 7 61 5.4 6.8 0.79 83 80 72 61 20.00 52.8 235 296 316 612 Vied 2w; gave way
6.0 10 10 WELL IN -15 R>S D>D 32 52 9 32 7.8 6.8 1.14 78 69 45 63 30.00 46.8 192 276 265 541 Brsuh gate;rail to 1/2
6.0 7 7 GOLDEN 5 S>SD>D 33 33 3 33 9.3 8.7 1.08 82 70 61 35 50.00 53.9 213 241 253 494 Bumped st; no impact

4,6,9 #4 paid $14 $1 pick 3 paid $2445 .50 pick 4 paid $3636 pick 5 paid 6919 ALL WINNERS 1°" OR 2" PFN EXCEPT LAST RACE: HUGE P2F AND P4F

LAST TOTL
ASP AVG ASP THREE SECND PACE BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE CLASS SRR SUR 110 SPD R# TDS SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE P2F P4F PFN AVG MLINE CALL LAST ALL LAST TOTALS LAST RACE COMMENT
11/17/18 ¢D 1 6.0 4 4 IMMA BLING -10 S>S D>D 93 8910 93 2.6 2.6 1.00 90 91 86 91 1.60 58.1 267 519 510 1029 Bore out4wl/4;dueled
6.0 55 K1J'S -5 S>S D>D 88 88 10 88 5.6 3.7 1.53 87 99 81 88 3.00 60.0 267 520 514 1034 3-4p trn;4p upr;hung
6.0 11 DAN THE GO 15 S>S D>D 83 8210 84 2.8 6.3 0.44 92 102 76 82 2.00 58.4 270 502 513 1015 Bumped st; caught late
6.0 6 6 TORAZO -5 S>S D>D 84 8210 84 5.0 4.2 1.19 93 101 74 83 5.00 59.2 268 501 507 1008 Vied btwn;weakened
6.0 2 2 HARD TO BE -5 S>S D>D 76 8110 76 1.9 4.7 ©0.42 93 102 66 81 8.00 58.4 261 489 483 971 Vied 3w;empty lane
6.0 3 3 SHOOTERS 40 S>S D>D 80 8010 80 7.2 5.0 1.44 84 81 88 78 20.00 55.7 253 468 474 942 Bumped st; some gain
6,5,1
LAST TOTL
ASP AVG ASP THREE SECND PACE BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE CLASS SRR SUR 110 SPD R# TDS SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE P2F P4AF PFN AVG MLINE CALL LAST ALL LAST TOTALS LAST RACE COMMENT
11/17/18 ¢D 2 8.5 1 1  SHE MIGHT 8 RX>RD>D 79 76 16 79 8.5 4.6 1.87 68 60 99 73 4.50 52.1 227 436 431 868 Ins;angld md-trck;plce
8.5 6 6 LA FEE -42 S>RD>D 76 74 10 76 5.3 5.7 ©.93 76 67 76 76 4.00 55.6 219 434 394 828 Done early
8.5 7 7 SWEETSONGO -15 RX>R T>D 79 72 9 79 7.0 5.2 1.35 80 84 77 74 6.00 52.8 241 434 432 865 No speed; outrun
8.5 4 4 EVENING 8 RX>RD>D 74 71 8 74 7.2 5.6 1.28 73 68 90 73 4.00 53.2 231 425 436 862 Long drv; edged clear
8.5 55 TRIPLE 8 S>RD>D 70 7110 70 4.8 4.7 1.03 87 87 64 71 4.00 56.1 238 423 420 843 Through after half
8.5 2 2 DIAMONDCOA © S>RD>D 69 69 106 69 3.9 5.6 ©0.69 91 87 76 70 2.50 55.8 254 436 446 882 Clrd 1/8th; yielded
8.5 3 3 JORDAN'S 28 R>R T>D 59 67 7 59 4.8 4.0 1.21 76 86 79 69 12.00 49.4 241 410 441 851 Hop st;3-4p farj;cleard

2,6,4



ASP AVG ASP THREE SECND PACE BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG  HORSE CLASS SRR SUR 110 SPD R# TDS SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE P2F P4F PFN AVG MLINE CALL LAST ALL LAST TOTALS LAST RACE COMMENT
11/17/18 ¢cD 3 8.5 8 8 BLESS THE -5 RX>R D>D 68 69 3 68 8.8 7.5 1.17 74 71 72 69 4.00 18.0 217 403 385 788 2p;asked5/16;n0 threat
8.5 33 PLAYFUL 0 RX>RD>D 68 64 4 68 6.9 6.3 1.10 72 74 66 65 4.50 52.0 212 380 380 760 Bumped st; moved up
8.5 7 7  CASSIDY 15 R>X>RD>D 65 64 8 65 4.6 4.6 1.00 83 78 75 706 5.00 51.7 236 376 397 773 Steadied 1st;flattened
8.5 11 HOLIDAY 15 S>R D>D 58 63 5 58 6.3 3.7 1.72 87 89 74 66 6.00 54.5 250 379 413 792 Flattened; lost place
8.5 4 4 BELIEVE -35 R>R T>D ERR 62 2 ERR 4.7 8.2 .57 86 82 31 62 4.00 48.7 199 385 339 725 Off rail 1/4; tired
8.5 22 MAGICAL -25 S> R D>D 57 59 3 57 5.0 4.2 1.20 86 88 67 59 6.00 58.5 241 386 398 784 Chsd 2p;mvd up;2best
8.5 6 6 WOODY'S (] R>R D>D 65 59 6 65 6.6 7.2 ©.92 82 84 68 68 3.50 52.2 234 378 402 780 Off rail 3/16;no match
8.5 55 GEMLOVER © R>R D>D 38 38 1 38 10.0 8.8 1.14 79 77 25 38 20.00 49.9 181 311 286 597 Tightend 1st; steadied
7,2,6 PICK 3 paid $124
LAST TOTL
ASP AVG ASP THREE SECND PACE BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG  HORSE CLASS SRR SUR 110 SPD R# TDS SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE P2F P4F PFN AVG MLINE CALL LAST ALL LAST TOTALS LAST RACE COMMENT
11/17/18 CD 4 8.0 5 5 AFOOLSBROK © R>R T>D 77 77 16 77 3.8 4.1 0.94 92 114 42 69 5.00 49.1 248 348 353 701 4path far; bid; tired
8.6 99 LUSTY GIT © S>R D>D ERR 76 10 ERR 6.7 4.4 1.51 81 83 76 71 8.00 56.8 240 344 348 692 5path turn; moved up
8.0 4 4 VOODOOTHAT -10 R>R T>D 77 76 106 77 6.5 5.4 1.21 64 51 91 70 6.00 52.8 206 337 322 659 5-3plst;3p far;no fctr
8.0 7 7 KATIE THE -5 R>X>RD>D 76 76 106 76 4.0 4.1 ©0.97 80 84 72 75 6.00 51.8 236 341 353 693 Came in st; flattened
8.6 11 MISS -5 RX>R D>D 74 7310 74 7.3 4.9 1.50 73 75 71 72 6.00 51.6 219 336 337 673 6path turn; improved
8.0 2 2 SEE THE 0 RX>RD>D 72 7310 72 6.5 4.0 1.62 64 46 81 72 15.00 52.1 191 324 312 636 6path 1/4; moved up
8.0 3 3  SUNRISE -15 R>R D>D 72 69 10 72 6.5 4.2 1.56 67 66 91 77 15.00 53.9 224 320 357 676 Bid4w;led late;out fin
8.0 6 6 NATIVE 0 R>RD>D 69 69 106 69 3.8 2.9 1.30 68 53 84 71 3.00 52.7 205 319 331 650 4path 1/4; drew away
7,1,6
LAST TOTL
ASP AVG ASP THREE SECND PACE BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE CLASS SRR SUR 110 SPD R# TDS SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE P2F P4F PFN AVG MLINE CALL LAST ALL LAST TOTALS LAST RACE COMMENT
11/17/18 CD 5 8.5 66 GRAY SKY -35 S>RD>D 89 89 10 89 6.4 4.1 1.54 81 95 81 88 2.50 59.3 257 465 438 904 Chased 2p; no impact
8.5 11 TRAPPEZOID -25 S>R T>D ERR 83 5 ERR 7.2 2.8 2.58 80 87 89 86 6.00 56.1 256 441 430 870 5path turn; belatedly
8.5 5 5 RAISING 25 S>R D>D ERR 82 3 ERR 3.6 3.6 1.00 81 78 102 82 2.00 56.9 261 433 446 878 Drifted out; cleared
8.5 7 7  GHOST -30 R>R D>D 81 78 10 81 5.1 4.2 1.21 76 86 73 82 3.50 54.6 235 416 421 837 3path 1/4; bid; hung
8.5 33 LITTLE -5 S>R D>D ERR 68 9 ERR 5.7 4.0 1.43 74 76 83 69 12.00 60.5 233 400 393 793 4p;rallied late

5,7,6



ASP AVG  ASP THREE SECND PACE BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG  HORSE CLASS SRR SUR 110 SPD R# TDS SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE P2F PAF PFN AVG MLINE CALL LAST ALL LAST TOTALS LAST RACE COMMENT
11/17/18 CD 6 7.0 7 7 TROY OUNCE 10 S>SD>D 76 76 1 76 1.3 5.0 ©.25 93 84 81 76 4.00 54.4 258 456 490 946 Pace; yielded btw
7.0 55 LORD 5 R>SD>D 74 73 3 74 5.2 6.1 ©.84 72 72 66 73 4.50 49.4 210 439 436 875 Never a factor
7.0 66 DECLINED 5 S>S D>D ERR 72 1 72 9.2 8.3 1.10 83 81 81 72 6.0 54.7 245 446 467 913 Came in st; no threat
7.0 10 10 ROAN LIKE 5 S>s D>D 63 63 2 63 5.2 6.5 ©.80 89 91 43 63 6.00 55.6 223 417 395 812 Vied btw; faded late
7.0 12 12 PASSION 25 S>S D>D ERR 59 1 59 7.1 4.3 1.67 82 68 59 12.80 55.8 150 406 380 786 Rail;bidl/4;brush rail
7.0 11 STOCK ) R>S D>D 53 57 2 53 5.7 8.6 ©.67 77 75 54 57 20.00 47.8 206 399 403 802 Brk out st;done early
7.0 11 11 CONFECTION ILR ©>S >D ERR ERR © ERR ERR ERR  ERR ERR 20.00 ERR © ERR ERR  ERR
7.0 3 3 LAUGHING ILR ©>S >D ERR ERR © ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR 15.00 ERR © ERR ERR  ERR
7.0 22 COME ON ILR ©>S >D ERR ERR © ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR 6.00 ERR © ERR ERR  ERR
7.0 8 8 THREE ILR ©>S >D ERR ERR © ERR ERR ERR  ERR ERR 15.00 ERR © ERR ERR  ERR
7,12,5
LAST TOTL
ASP AVG  ASP THREE SECND PACE BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG  HORSE CLASS SRR SUR 110 SPD R# TDS SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE P2F P4F PFN AVG MLINE CALL LAST ALL LAST TOTALS LAST RACE COMMENT
11/17/18 €D 7 8.5 3 4  HARVEY ) R>RD>D 87 87 3 87 5.0 2.0 2.50 74 74 95 87 1.60 53.6 243 284 286 570 Bid ins str; hung late
8.5 7 8 PARADE ) R>R T>D ERR 78 1 ERR 9.0 7.0 1.29 67 77 82 78 20.00 54.4 226 265 260 525 Came in st; mild rally
8.5 4 5 BOOBY TRAP 10 R>R T5D ERR 73 1 ERR 6.0 6.0 1.00 78 81 70 73 8.00 52.5 229 256 261 517 4path 1/4; improved
8.5 91 BIRD DOG © R>RD>D 71 71 2 71 2.1 5.8 ©.36 92 94 58 71 15.00 50.0 244 254 261 515 Bobbled st; gave way
8.5 12 SHARP 5 SSRD>D 76 71 2 76 5.5 3.2 1.72 77 82 64 71 2.50 58.2 223 256 249 505 Rallied str; gaining
8.5 89 NAPOLEON'S 25 R\RD>D 61 69 2 61 8.3 5.0 1.67 70 57 84 69 8.80 52.6 211 247 238 484 Unrushed;no late bid
8.5 23 COWBOYS 5 R>R T>D ERR 66 4 ERR 6.4 5.7 1.12 84 88 61 68 12.00 50.1 233 246 250 496 Came in st;shied early
8.5 56 REELFOOT 5 S>R D>D ERR 64 1 ERR 5.0 6.7 ©.75 82 84 69 64 20.00 53.5 235 248 248 496 Through after half
8.5 6 7 WHATA SHOW 5 SS>R D>D ERR 64 2 ERR 9.0 6.2 1.46 74 72 59 64 8.00 58.7 205 241 223 465 4path turn; moved up
8.5 10 1A HIGH 10 S>R D>D ERR 54 3 ERR 6.8 7.7 ©.88 83 82 76 54 15.80 55.0 241 233 257 490 Never a threat
8.5 12 11 CHARLES T 10 R>R D>D 48 48 1 48 8.0 9.0 ©.89 83 76 50 48 15.00 47.9 209 219 216 434 Bumped; bothered start



ASP AVG ASP THREE SECND PACE BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE CLASS SRR SUR 110 SPD R# TDS SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE P2F P4F PFN AVG MLINE CALL LAST ALL LAST TOTALS LAST RACE COMMENT
11/17/18 €D 8 8.0 88 THE GOMPER -40 R>R T>D 99 90 10 99 8.3 6.4 1.30 92 96 54 78 12.00 48.6 242 387 340 728 Through after 3/4
8.0 55  FASCILITAT 7 S>R D>D ERR 8 7 ERR 5.8 2.9 2.00 82 83 86 83 3.50 58.1 251 382 370 752 4path turn; improved
8.0 11 EBBEN -43 S>RD>D 8 84 10 84 6.3 5.1 1.24 85 91 76 85 4.50 53.4 252 390 366 756 Through after half
8.0 44 GO NAVY GO 5 R>R T>D ERR 84 10 ERR 4.9 5.5 ©0.89 88 101 62 83 8.00 54.2 251 380 381 761 6w; finished willingly
8.0 6 6 MR DARCY -10 R>R D>D 85 83 10 87 3.0 3.9 0©.78 89 95 71 85 3.0 53.5 255 380 393 773 4path 1/4; no match
8.0 3 3 BOURBON 15 SS>RD>D 86 8310 8 7.0 4.5 1.54 81 90 95 88 6.00 57.1 266 381 404 785 Bumped; bothered start
8.0 7 7 CABIN JOHN 20 RX>RD>D 8 73 9 85 2.9 3.3 0.88 95 91 80 85 3.50 54.7 266 349 398 747 Prompted foe;took over
4,6,1
LAST TOTL
ASP AVG ASP THREE SECND PACE BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE CLASS SRR SUR 110 SPD R# TDS SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE P2F P4F PFN AVG MLINE CALL LAST ALL LAST TOTALS LAST RACE COMMENT
11/17/18 CD 9 8.5 88 MYLADY 3 R>RD>D 89 87 3 89 2.2 1.3 1.75 86 82 97 87 3.00 52.5 265 311 321 632 Not enough; 2nd best
8.5 10 10 MISS 3 RX>RD>D 84 85 7 8 4.8 4.5 1.08 80 78 85 81 8.00 51.9 243 308 296 604 3path 3/16; bid; faded
8.5 77 BO PEEP 5 R>R D>D 82 82 10 82 6.4 5.8 1.10 80 77 83 81 15.00 51.7 240 302 292 595 3path 3/16; faded late
8.5 33 DESSERT 5 R>RD>D 8 82 8 84 6.1 3.2 1.91 76 73 101 84 5.00 53.6 250 307 318 625 Swept past; drew off
8.5 6 6 GO GOOGLE -20 S>R D>D 87 82 10 87 4.9 3.6 1.38 84 87 92 82 4.00 56.2 263 304 317 621 Late bid 3wd; missed
8.5 22 BEACH -15 R>R T>D ERR 80 9 ERR 3.4 4.4 0.78 84 76 84 83 12.00 51.1 244 300 286 586 4path 1/4; weakened
8.5 11 TRUE DREAM 5 R>RD>D 81 80 10 81 6.3 3.9 1.61 74 76 82 85 10.00 51.6 232 294 287 582 Through after half
8.5 55 AUSPICIOUS 5 R>RD>D 82 79 6 79 7.4 4.3 1.76 73 75 091 78 6.00 53.3 239 298 297 595 3path 3/16; no match
8.5 44 TAP GUN 13 R>RD>D 78 78 4 78 4.5 3.8 1.18 80 78 92 80 4.00 54.6 250 294 315 609 3path 1/4; edged away
8.5 99 SWEET 5 R>RD>D 81 75 7 81 6.5 5.6 1.17 81 74 68 81 50.00 51.1 223 281 270 551 4path 3/16; empty
5,6,1
LAST TOTL
ASP AVG ASP THREE SECND PACE BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE CLASS SRR SUR 110 SPD R# TDS SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE P2F P4F PFN AVG MLINE CALL LAST ALL LAST TOTALS LAST RACE COMMENT
11/17/18 CD 10 9.0 4 4 OSCAR 0 R>R T>T ERR 96 10 96 4.4 4.2 1.07 62 48 85 93 4.00 49.8 195 381 333 715 4path 1/4; empty late
9.0 3 3 MR. -10 R>R T>T 94 94 10 94 5.4 2.7 1.96 84 106 80 94 1.66 52.6 270 394 404 798 Bid str; weakened late
9.0 2 2 POSTULATIO -5 R>R T>T 86 92 10 92 4.2 4.7 ©0.88 74 69 81 87 5.00 51.3 224 369 356 725 2w 1/4p; mild kick
9.0 77 FLATLINED -5 R>R T>T 88 90 10 89 8.4 6.0 1.40 72 46 112 87 15.00 54.6 230 370 376 746 Off rail turn;moved up
9.0 11 MASTER 20 R>R T>T 93 90 9 92 4.0 2.5 1.60 72 76 96 94 10.00 54.4 244 373 384 757 Bumped st; gaining
9.0 55 BIG 20 R>R T>T 90 90 106 9 2.3 2.4 0©.95 85 89 92 91 5.00 53.4 266 377 404 781 Long drv str;held late
9.0 8 8 SIR DUDLEY -5 R>R T>T 87 89 9 90 7.2 5.4 1.35 65 50 98 88 8.00 54.8 213 371 362 733 Bid str; leveled off
9.0 6 6 TEAM 20 R>R T>T 91 88 9 91 6.6 4.9 1.35 69 67 107 92 12.00 54.3 243 365 381 745 Rallied str;edged past

3,5,6



LAST TOTL

ASP AVG ASP THREE SECND PACE BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE CLASS SRR SUR 110 SPD R# TDS SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE P2F P4F PFN AVG MLINE CALL LAST ALL LAST TOTALS LAST RACE COMMENT
11/17/18 ¢CD 11 7.0 55 FROLIC 0 S>S Db 77 77 3 77 4.1 3.7 1.10 86 95 74 77 3.50 56.4 255 643 670 1313 5path turn; moved up
7.0 4 4 WRATH 15 S>S D>D 72 71 2 71 4.7 4.7 1.00 99 89 69 71 6.00 54.8 248 619 635 1254 3path turn; faded late
7.0 12 12 ESKENFORIT 5 S>S D>D ERR 69 2 69 8.3 5.4 1.54 70 75 81 69 8.00 54.2 226 605 594 1199 Stumbled st; steadied
7.0 99 LAUGHING -5 S>SD>D 66 66 1 66 4.4 7.8 ©.57 91 89 660 66 4.50 53.7 240 597 597 1195 In tight ins 3/4;ins
7.0 22 MARKET -5 S>S D>D ERR 50 2 50 2.6 8.9 0©.29 97 82 50 50 15.00 51.9 229 534 503 1037 2w;btwn foe;pinch upr
7.0 11 11 RUN THIS ILR 0>S >D ERR ERR © ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR 5.00 ERR 0 ERR ERR ERR
7.0 10 106 ALL IN ILR 0>S >D ERR ERR © ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR 15.00 ERR (2] ERR ERR ERR
7.0 33 OLD SOT ILR 0>S >D ERR ERR © ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR 10.00 ERR 0 ERR ERR ERR
7.0 77 POW ILR 0>S >D ERR ERR © ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR 12.00 ERR (7] ERR ERR ERR
7.0 6 6 HEART OF A ILR 0>S >D ERR ERR © ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR 15.00 ERR (2] ERR ERR ERR
7.0 11 EQUIVOCAL ILR 0>S >D ERR ERR © ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR 12.00 ERR (2] ERR ERR ERR
7.0 8 8 AWESOME ILR 0>S >D ERR ERR © ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR 12.00 ERR (2] ERR ERR ERR
5,2,3
LAST TOTL
ASP AVG ASP THREE SECND PACE BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE CLASS SRR SUR 110 SPD R# TDS SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE P2F P4F PFN AVG MLINE CALL LAST ALL LAST TOTALS LAST RACE COMMENT
11/17/18 DMR 1 7.0 5 5 RAILMAN (2] S>S D>D ERR 77 1 77 6.7 2.5 2.67 89 91 78 77 3.00 55.7 258 1600 1632 3232 Off bit slow;inside
7.0 3 3 NORTHWESTE © R>S T>D ERR 57 1 ERR 10.0 10.0 1.00 68 62 74 57 8.00 53.0 204 1400 1368 2768 Saved ground; weakened
7.0 6 6 FIGURE ILR 0>S >D ERR ERR © ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR 2.50 ERR (7] ERR ERR ERR
7.0 22 COLISEUM ILR 0>S >D ERR ERR © ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR 2.00 ERR 0 ERR ERR ERR
7.0 4 4 TRIAL BY ILR 0>S >D ERR ERR © ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR 6.00 ERR (2] ERR ERR ERR
7.0 11 LIGHT OF ILR 0>S >D ERR ERR © ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR 5.00 ERR (] ERR ERR ERR
2,6,5
LAST TOTL
ASP AVG ASP THREE SECND PACE BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE CLASS SRR SUR 110 SPD R# TDS SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE P2F P4F PFN AVG MLINE CALL LAST ALL LAST TOTALS LAST RACE COMMENT
11/17/18 DMR 2 8.0 11 AGGRESSIVI © S>R D>D ERR 84 2 ERR 9.3 4.0 2.33 82 86 90 84 2.00 56.8 258 444 438 882 Came ot;rallied;up 2nd
8.0 77 JUSTIN'S @ R>X>R D>D 82 8 3 82 2.9 6.5 0.45 78 71 97 84 2.50 53.3 246 438 433 871 Bid;btwn;edged foe 2nd
8.0 6 6 CARIBBEAN -5 RX>R D>D 85 82 3 85 5.2 4.8 1.09 90 94 81 82 3.00 50.6 265 437 443 880 Bid btwn;2nd best
8.0 4 4 HOLLY (2] R>X>R T> D 85 82 6 85 6.7 6.2 1.07 80 81 86 86 6.00 57.3 247 437 436 873 Came out str;no bid
8.0 55 MOMMA'S 25 R>R D>D 83 8110 83 8.0 5.1 1.58 75 68 101 82 6.00 52.3 244 427 426 853 Split foes 1/8;willing
8.0 33 DAWOOD 10 R>R T>D ERR 77 4 ERR 6.0 6.3 0.96 80 74 113 77 12.00 47.7 267 413 427 840 Well off ins; moved up
8.0 2 2 CAUSEIDIDI 20 R>R T>D ERR 74 5 ERR 5.3 6.4 ©0.83 88 78 77 74 20.00 53.0 243 404 398 802 Forced;rail; missed 3d

5,7,6



ASP AVG ASP THREE SECND PACE BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE CLASS SRR SUR 110 SPD R# TDS SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE P2F P4F PFN AVG MLINE CALL LAST ALL LAST TOTALS LAST RACE COMMENT
11/17/18 DMR 3 6.5 7 7 AMERICAN 5 S>SD>D 84 82 5 82 2.5 3.0 0.83 98 97 82 84 6.00 54.1 277 388 419 807 Vied 3wd;edged 2nd
6.5 8 8 BLAME JOE 5 S>S D>D 81 79 10 81 5.7 4.8 1.18 78 85 83 890 2.00 56.1 246 392 395 787 Brushed rail into str
6.5 11 EXTREME -10 R>S T>D 809 78 8 80 2.0 4.2 0.48 92 96 57 78 2.50 54.6 245 393 381 773 Dueled;wkened late
6.5 55 CATCH FIRE -10 R>S T>D 74 78 5 80 4.8 4.4 1.09 83 90 61 79 8.00 54.0 234 378 373 752 Chased; no rally
6.5 4 4 BUILDER -5 R>S T>D 77 76 7 77 6.2 5.6 1.11 70 70 82 78 8.00 53.1 222 378 371 749 Hesitated;off slowly
6.5 2 2  STREET 5 S>SD>D 78 76 9 75 5.8 3.4 1.69 83 79 90 76 8.00 56.0 252 371 390 761 3wd into strj;angled in
6.5 6 6 TURNAROUND 20 S>SD>D 66 72 8 71 2.5 5.8 ©0.43 90 94 79 79 6.00 56.8 263 377 407 784 Pace rail;handy winner
6.5 33 LUCKY 5 S>S D>D 46 57 16 57 5.0 7.4 0.68 84 82 33 59 30.00 51.1 199 323 264 587 Angled in; gave way
7,4,2
LAST TOTL
ASP AVG ASP THREE SECND PACE BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE CLASS SRR SUR 110 SPD R# TDS SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE P2F P4F PFN AVG MLINE CALL LAST ALL LAST TOTALS LAST RACE COMMENT
11/17/18 DMR 4 6.0 3 3 CUTE KNOWS -52 S>S D>D 87 80 10 83 4.1 5.9 .70 97 101 54 77 3.0 53.7 252 440 393 833 3 wide; weakened
6.0 77 COME ON 18 S>S D>D 75 80 3 83 2.3 4.2 0.55 96 101 82 80 3.50 57.7 279 437 453 890 Bit off rail;drew off
6.0 4 4 TWISTED 10 S>S D>D 80 78 16 78 6.6 4.8 1.37 86 90 84 79 8.00 56.8 260 432 424 856 3wd into str;edged 2nd
6.0 6 6 SPECTACULA 3 S>S T>D 78 78 9 78 5.4 5.1 1.06 92 98 80 79 4.00 58.9 270 438 449 887 4wd;bid 2wd;2nd best
6.0 55 EMPRESS OF 8 S>S D>D 76 76 16 76 6.1 5.5 1.11 87 90 87 80 8.00 56.8 264 418 429 847 Came out str;up 3wd
6.0 2 2 AMERS 3 S>S DD 77 75 9 75 6.4 4.6 1.41 88 89 87 79 5.00 58.9 264 423 433 855 2w;shifted out;rallied
6.0 11 UNO 5 S>S D>D 75 72 7 75 3.8 4.8 0.79 96 103 66 79 4.00 57.1 265 412 420 833 Dueled;clear;held 2nd
7,2,4
LAST TOTL
ASP AVG ASP THREE SECND PACE BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE CLASS SRR SUR 110 SPD R# TDS SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE P2F P4F PFN AVG MLINE CALL LAST ALL LAST TOTALS LAST RACE COMMENT
11/17/18 DMR 5 5.0 3 3  SIR SAMSON © S>S D>T ERR 88 10 87 4.4 4.5 0.98 90 92 83 84 20.00 55.4 265 376 383 759 3wd into str;weakened
5.0 11 MY MAN 30 S>S T>T 87 86 10 87 8.0 4.5 1.76 72 81 97 86 2.50 62.0 250 385 393 778 Came out str;edged 3rd
5.0 8 8 HITTERS 35 S>S T>T 90 86 16 85 5.3 5.1 1.05 88 97 80 89 3.00 59.9 265 380 394 775 Stalked pace; weakened
5.0 4 4 SWORD -10 S>S D>T ERR 84 9 84 4.8 5.8 ©0.83 87 94 80 82 3.00 56.2 261 383 384 767 Chased 2p; no kick
5.6 55 P CLUB -35 S>S T>T 84 8310 83 6.3 6.2 1.02 87 81 82 15.00 57.7 168 374 330 704 Off bit slow;no threat
5.0 2 2  BUCKYS 25 S>S T>T ERR 83 10 82 4.5 5.6 ©.81 88 91 87 87 4.00 62.2 266 380 400 780 3wd into str;rallied
5.0 77 MARKET 75 S>S D>T ERR 83 7 ERR 5.1 5.1 1.00 92 93 54 81 8.00 56.4 239 362 330 692 Rail;btwn 1/8;gave way
5.0 66 INVASION 40 S>S T>T ERR 82 106 82 4.1 4.9 0.84 89 95 78 82 15.00 59.7 262 360 385 745 4wd into strjedged 3rd

8,1,4



ASP AVG ASP THREE SECND PACE BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE CLASS SRR SUR 110 SPD R# TDS SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE P2F P4F PFN AVG MLINE CALL LAST ALL LAST TOTALS LAST RACE COMMENT
11/17/18 DMR 6 6.5 6 6 JUMP THE 5 S>S D>D 81 80 10 80 4.0 3.1 1.31 85 86 87 83 2.50 57.3 258 359 365 724 Bid 4wd;3wd;outgamed
6.5 4 4 VINTAGE -35 R>S T>D 82 76 3 76 4.4 5.2 ©.86 86 91 72 76 3.50 54.3 249 348 347 695 Came out str;wkened
6.5 88 LIVIN ON 5 R>SD>D 76 74 5 76 5.2 4.3 1.21 87 90 53 72 6.00 50.2 230 331 314 645 Forced;2wd;weakened
6.5 77 WHOA BUDDY -15 S>S D>D 75 7310 74 4.5 5.8 0.79 88 90 76 75 5.00 58.2 254 346 347 693 Chased 2w; weakened
6.5 11 JUNE TWO -35 R>S D>D 75 7310 75 5.7 5.7 1.00 82 83 70 78 6.00 50.1 235 336 326 661 Bid btwn;weakened
6.5 22 FROM THE 5 S>S D>D 68 71 7 67 3.9 7.2 0.54 99 93 59 71 12.00 52.3 251 330 307 637 Dueled bwn;gave way
6.5 9 9 GRYFFINDOR -5 S>SD>D 72 76 9 71 7.5 5.9 1.27 89 88 80 78 6.00 56.1 257 327 340 667 4wd str;imp position
6.5 55 SPIRIT 5 S>SD>D 63 6410 69 7.4 7.8 ©0.95 79 82 84 59 30.00 55.2 245 303 306 609 Steadied start;no bid
6.5 33 TAP TAP 5 S>SD>D 67 63 4 706 5.7 5.4 1.07 89 88 80 62 12.00 56.9 257 321 348 669 Btwn 3w;dug in;drvng
6,4,2
LAST TOTL
ASP AVG ASP THREE SECND PACE BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE CLASS SRR SUR 110 SPD R# TDS SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE P2F P4F PFN AVG MLINE CALL LAST ALL LAST TOTALS LAST RACE COMMENT
11/17/18 DMR 7 8.0 7 7 ABSOLUTELY © S>R D>T ERR 81 1 ERR 5.0 5.0 1.00 89 90 83 81 4.50 56.5 262 404 399 803 Stalked 3wd;edged 3rd
8.0 88 PAPRIKA 0 S>R T>T ERR 8 6 ERR 5.8 3.1 1.88 91 91 79 80 2.560 59.3 261 410 401 811 Bid;led;caught wire
8.0 6 6 WEATHER 25 R>R T>T 76 72 6 76 7.3 4.8 1.52 76 80 79 69 6.00 53.3 235 374 380 754 3wd into str;rallied
8.0 2 2 INTO RISSA © S>RD>T 76 7110 76 6.9 5.0 1.39 63 78 99 79 6.00 58.8 240 384 391 776 Hesitated;off slowly
8.0 11 RADISH -5 R>R T>T 77 69 10 77 4.9 5.1 0.98 86 94 70 74 4.00 53.0 250 377 387 764 Saved ground;edged 3rd
8.0 33 SPECTACULA 45 S>R D>T ERR 66 6 ERR 5.6 6.2 ©.90 83 81 56 62 20.00 55.9 220 332 318 650 Angled in; weakened
8.0 44 JUST KATHY 25 R>R T>T 606 59 4 606 5.9 8.2 0.71 95 94 49 57 20.00 49.2 238 329 325 654 Vied;stalked;gave way
8.0 55 MISS ILR ©>R >T ERR ERR © ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR 8.00 ERR 0 ERR ERR ERR
7,6,8
LAST TOTL
ASP AVG ASP THREE SECND PACE BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE CLASS SRR SUR 110 SPD R# TDS SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE P2F P4F PFN AVG MLINE CALL LAST ALL LAST TOTALS LAST RACE COMMENT
11/17/18 DMR 8 7.0 2 3 MUCHO 60 S>S D>D ERR 99 1 90 1.4 1.4 1.00 97 97 88 90 2.50 55.5 282 518 521 1039 Drifted out strjclear
7.0 12 EXTRA HOPE 55 R>S D>D 81 83 4 81 7.7 3.2 2.40 83 83 90 83 3.50 53.1 256 490 494 985 Stalked;bid;clear
7.0 5 6  SPARKY 10 S>S D>D 84 82 5 82 3.9 4.2 0.92 89 96 93 84 3.00 58.5 278 517 527 1045 Bid 3wd str;led 1/16
7.0 3 4 SAVAGERY 10 S>S D>D 92 80 4 85 2.3 4.5 0.50 92 99 87 85 4.00 58.0 278 499 520 1019 Dueled;led;2nd best
7.0 45 OWNING -5 R>S T>D ERR 76 3 80 5.5 6.0 ©.92 85 78 67 76 15.00 52.9 230 492 432 923 Off bit slow;no rally

3,4,6



LAST TOTL

ASP AVG ASP THREE SECND PACE BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE CLASS SRR SUR 110 SPD R# TDS SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE P2F P4F PFN AVG MLINE CALL LAST ALL LAST TOTALS LAST RACE COMMENT
11/17/18 DMR 9 6.5 11 MATRICULAT -5 S>S D>D 87 86 10 87 4.8 4.2 1.14 82 80 93 80 3.50 55.3 255 314 339 653 Came out str;late 2nd
6.5 2 2 PICK ONE -25 S>S D>D ERR 86 106 87 2.9 5.0 0.58 84 20.00 4.4 0 313 222 535 Off slow; late rally
6.5 8 8 BABY (7] S>S D>D 81 81 10 81 4.3 6.6 0.65 96 103 66 82 5.00 54.9 265 307 330 637 Bid btwn turn;wkened
6.5 6 6 LOUDEN'S 7] S>S D>D 81 8110 81 6.6 5.0 1.33 83 92 88 84 4.00 57.1 263 305 352 657 3wd into str;drift in
6.5 3 3 VENDING -25 S>S T>D ERR 80 10 ERR 5.4 5.9 ©0.93 82 96 80 81 3.00 60.2 258 329 348 678 Chased 3wd;no bid
6.5 4 4 FINALLYGOT o R>S D>D 81 80 10 81 6.7 5.7 1.19 76 68 82 74 12.00 52.5 226 294 301 596 Came out str;wkened
6.5 55 GO GHETTO © S>S D>D 80 7910 79 6.5 4.9 1.33 85 95 85 81 4.00 57.3 265 294 347 642 Stumbled badly start
6.5 10 10 AIR POCKET © R>S D>D 73 73 10 76 6.7 6.7 1.00 80 76 62 67 20.00 51.3 218 281 285 566 Came out strj;gave way
6.5 77 LION -25 S>S D>D 68 7110 72 6.9 5.5 1.26 70 20.00 4.3 (7] 287 211 498 Off slow; gained 3rd
6.5 9 9 MANY (%] S>S D>D 58 66 106 68 6.3 8.7 0©.72 80 76 67 67 30.00 55.1 223 275 264 539 Saved ground; no rally
8,5,2
LAST TOTL
ASP AVG ASP THREE SECND PACE BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE CLASS SRR SUR 110 SPD R# TDS SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE P2F P4F PFN AVG MLINE CALL LAST ALL LAST TOTALS LAST RACE COMMENT
11/17/18 GPW 1 8.5 7 7 IMMUNITY -10 R>R T>T 79 7910 79 7.3 4.8 1.50 85 93 74 81 2.50 53.1 252 289 289 578 3-4wd tn;gain;yielded
8.5 11 THERE GOES © R>R T>T 77 76 106 77 6.2 4.4 1.41 66 78 91 73 4.50 55.3 235 285 289 574 Sligt stedy 1/4p;clear
8.5 3 3 WIGWAM -5 S>R T>T 74 7510 74 4.9 3.7 1.32 81 88 86 76 3.50 56.6 255 279 294 574 4-5wd;lasted for plce
8.5 44 ZITMAN 0 RX>R T>T 76 75 10 76 7.4 5.1 1.45 69 43 106 75 12.00 55.0 218 274 261 535 Wide;pass tiring foes
8.5 99 ARPINELLA © R>XR T>T 74 74 106 74 5.3 4.9 1.6 73 51 100 73 20.00 55.6 224 271 264 535 Bit keen;ins;evn late
8.5 10 10 MR. (7] R>R T>T 73 7310 73 6.6 5.8 1.15 77 74 69 72 15.00 49.4 220 265 252 517 Off pace;no threat
8.5 22 MOSCA (2] R>X>R T>T 73 73 106 73 6.2 3.9 1.58 73 55 92 73 10.00 52.8 220 269 262 530 5wd uppr;no late kick
8.5 55 SOUTHERN 0 R>R T>T 70 72 10 70 6.1 4.3 1.44 77 55 95 74 8.00 52.9 227 272 268 539 Wide into str;imprve
8.5 11 11 TIZ FROM 0 RX>RD>T 706 71 9 70 5.2 5.3 ©.97 80 78 78 75 8.00 54.3 236 275 277 552 Duel;brushed;gamely
8.5 6 6 TWO STEP (2] R>R D>T 68 71 106 68 5.1 5.3 ©0.96 67 61 91 73 8.00 56.1 219 265 272 537 Well rated;vie 1/8;drv
8.5 8 8 SCHWEETS (2] R>X>R T>T 71 64 106 71 8.8 5.5 1.60 81 78 80 74 15.00 51.2 239 257 271 528 5wd uppr;lacked kick
7,9,8
LAST TOTL
ASP AVG ASP THREE SECND PACE BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE CLASS SRR SUR 110 SPD R# TDS SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE P2F P4F PFN AVG MLINE CALL LAST ALL LAST TOTALS LAST RACE COMMENT
11/17/18 GPW 2 6.0 2 2 DISCREET -25 S>S Db 79 79 8 79 4.9 5.7 ©0.85 89 88 71 77 2,00 54.1 248 383 358 741 Wide into str;no rally
6.0 6 6 JACKS A 0 S>SD>D 72 7110 70 3.7 4.4 0.85 95 96 84 75 8.00 55.4 275 351 407 758 Pace;ins;collerd 1/8p
6.0 55 NO DINERO -5 S>S D>b 72 7110 72 2.8 5.3 ©.52 93 89 59 71 10.00 53.1 241 346 339 685 Lugged out;drifted out
6.0 7 7 NICKIE'S -20 S>S T> D 74 68 106 72 4.6 6.5 0.71 86 53 63 3.0 53.5 139 356 267 622 3-2path turn; tired
6.0 8 8 CAPE MARCO © R>S D>D ERR 68 106 69 6.3 4.1 1.53 76 72 75 66 20.00 54.9 223 325 329 654 Outsde;no late impact
6.0 11 MORE -25 S>S D>D 65 64 7 65 5.2 6.0 0.86 81 80 62 60 4,00 55.2 223 318 300 618 Bobbled;slow start
6.0 33 RIGO 0 R>S D>D 61 60 10 64 6.4 6.1 1.05 78 84 56 60 20.00 50.1 218 310 324 634 3wd bid tn;weaknd
6.0 99 CLEMSON (2] R>S D>D 45 55 10 52 8.7 8.2 1.05 80 82 44 47 30.00 51.1 206 297 274 571 Early bid;retreated
6.0 4 4 CLEAR SKY 10 S> S D>D 72 53 4 72 4.4 6.4 0.70 101 96 79 68 6.00 55.2 276 315 402 717 Set pace;kept clear

5,2,6



ASP AVG ASP THREE SECND PACE BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE CLASS SRR SUR 110 SPD R# TDS SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE P2F P4F PFN AVG MLINE CALL LAST ALL LAST TOTALS LAST RACE COMMENT
11/17/18 GPW 3 6.0 1 1 STARSHIP 0 S>S D>D 83 8310 83 4.8 5.2 0.92 79 75 93 81 2.50 57.1 247 352 335 686 Lunged st;wide uppr
6.0 6 6 SWAGGER (%] S>S T>D 87 8110 87 4.4 3.6 1.21 103 73 85 2.00 56.3 176 352 326 678 Set pace; held well
6.0 55 EXCLUSIVE -5 R>S D>D ERR 80 10 ERR 5.6 5.6 1.00 80 74 96 79 3.00 53.7 250 349 351 701 Vied 2w; drew clear
6.0 33 AFRICAN -5 S>S D>b 79 78 106 78 6.9 5.8 1.19 80 80 83 71 12.00 56.3 243 330 326 656 2-3w bid upr;no threat
6.0 8 8 SILVER -5 S>S D>b 79 78 106 79 5.2 5.9 ©.88 92 93 78 78 15.00 55.8 263 333 347 680 Vied inside til late
6.0 4 4 NIGHT (%] S>SD>D 80 78 10 78 4.6 4.1 1.14 92 93 78 77 12.00 56.3 263 332 350 682 Duel til late;gaveway
6.0 7 7 FORCE -5 S>SD>D 79 7510 79 5.9 5.3 1.11 87 88 80 80 10.00 54.0 255 329 342 671 Outside bid;no theat
6.0 2 2 CHASE YOUR © S>SD>D 74 74 106 74 5.3 5.0 1.05 77 84 78 75 20.00 54.2 239 318 319 637 Wide into str;no rally
6.0 99 POTOCHON (] S>S D>b 71 7110 71 8.1 7.5 1.07 82 82 78 70 30.00 54.8 242 306 304 610 3wd into str;no impact
5,6,8
LAST TOTL
ASP AVG ASP THREE SECND PACE BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE CLASS SRR SUR 110 SPD R# TDS SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE P2F P4F PFN AVG MLINE CALL LAST ALL LAST TOTALS LAST RACE COMMENT
11/17/18 GPW 4 8.0 9 9 ATHERA -20 R>R T>T 79 8110 79 7.1 4.1 1.76 55 63 90 83 12.00 54.7 208 313 290 603 In back;wide str
8.0 6 6 PAINT THE -55 R>R T>T 79 80 10 79 5.6 5.1 1.10 80 75 91 81 2.00 54.2 246 321 307 628 Stalked 2w; outkicked
8.0 55 MI CUAIMA -20 R>R T>T 76 76 106 76 3.0 5.6 ©.53 94 104 71 84 4.50 53.6 269 311 322 633 Set pace;vie 1/8;evnd
8.0 11 FEED ME -20 R>R T>T 76 76 16 76 6.2 4.0 1.54 80 86 84 82 3.50 55.9 250 307 316 624 Vied 1/8;no clsing kik
8.0 8 8 SWAPL 5 R>X>R T>T 74 75 10 74 7.1 4.9 1.44 85 83 74 71 10.00 52.7 242 289 290 580 Stalked;bid tn;wknd
8.0 44 PILLANGO 5 R>R T>T 76 75 10 76 4.0 4.3 0.95 86 83 78 80 12.00 53.4 247 294 299 593 Stalkd ins;3-4wd bid
8.0 22 VOILA LA 5 R>R T>T 74 74 10 74 6.9 5.0 1.38 77 76 83 73 15.00 54.7 236 286 288 574 Angl in upr;need more
8.0 77 BIG -55 R>R T>T 73 7110 73 8.6 6.3 1.36 80 84 71 66 20.00 53.5 235 295 271 566 Off pace;no bid
8.0 3 3 DIGITAL 5 R>R T>T 67 67 16 67 6.4 5.5 1.17 80 81 75 73 15.00 53.0 236 277 296 573 Circled; ran down ldr
6,9,4
LAST TOTL
ASP AVG ASP THREE SECND PACE BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE CLASS SRR SUR 110 SPD R# TDS SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE P2F P4F PFN AVG MLINE CALL LAST ALL LAST TOTALS LAST RACE COMMENT
11/17/18 GPW 5 5.5 9 9 SWEET 0 S>SD>D 66 64 4 64 1.5 3.6 0.42 91 90 67 66 1.60 55.4 248 404 405 809 Lug in bump st; 3-4p
5.5 10 16 UNCLE -10 S>S D>D 62 62 1 62 6.3 6.3 1.00 8 80 71 62 12.00 53.3 237 392 383 775 3wd bid tn;5wd stretch
5.5 55 SCHOOL -15 S>S D>D 59 59 3 59 3.8 6.7 0.57 88 86 72 59 2.00 56.0 246 392 404 796 Press pace;kept on
5.5 44 ROSAS FOR © S>S D>D 60 59 10 59 3.7 5.6 ©0.66 94 87 69 60 10.00 56.3 250 384 399 783 Up close 1/8p;flatnd
5.5 33 MARCELINO © S>S D>D 51 55 3 55 1.0 6.6 ©.16 98 94 43 55 20.00 53.8 235 370 350 721 Vie briefly;chase;wknd
5.5 6 6 KARAS 0 S>SD>D 60 54 6 57 6.1 7.6 ©.80 80 81 79 58 20.00 58.3 240 370 398 768 Steadied 5/8;no threat
5.5 77 PAPA Y -5 S>S D>D 51 47 3 51 6.8 8.6 ©0.79 89 73 58 47 12.00 52.1 220 354 325 679 Urged rail tn;no avail
5.5 8 8 WHY TRUST @ S>S D>D 40 40 2 40 5.0 7.9 0.64 87 84 47 40 15.00 52.8 218 334 334 668 Step slw st;best rest
5.5 11 GOLDEN ILR 0>S >D ERR ERR © ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR 20.00 ERR (2 ERR ERR ERR
5.5 22 EL PLAYON ILR 0>S >D ERR ERR © ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR 8.00 ERR 0 ERR ERR ERR

9,8,4



LAST TOTL

ASP AVG  ASP THREE SECND PACE BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG  HORSE CLASS SRR SUR 110 SPD R# TDS SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE P2F PAF PFN AVG MLINE CALL LAST ALL LAST TOTALS LAST RACE COMMENT
11/17/18 GPW 6 7.5 3 3  FLYING -10 S>S T>T 70 76 10 78 6.6 4.3 1.52 86 84 80 0.8 57.4 170 232 215 447 Strong urging;good fin
7.5 11 LONG NIGHT -5 R>S T>T ERR 76 9 ERR 4.7 6.7 ©.71 83 83 67 71 4.50 52.4 233 217 220 438 Set pace;lost lead trn
7.5 7 7 IRISH ) S>S T>T 76 7010 76 5.8 4.2 1.37 77 81 72 73 6.00 56.1 230 208 221 429 Wide;gaining late
7.5 22 BETA MAX -10 R>S T>T 67 65 9 67 5.1 5.5 ©.92 80 81 76 65 8.80 52.7 237 205 216 421 5wd far tn;weaknd
7.5 66 DMR. -5 R>S T>T 70 64 8 70 4.9 7.1 ©.69 97 91 36 56 20.00 50.6 224 191 195 386 Duel into far tn;tired
7.5 44 SOBY ) S>S T>T 62 6410 62 5.1 5.0 1.82 71 76 60 56 20.00 53.0 207 194 197 391 Bump st;wide uppr
7.5 55 OURS DREAM © R>S D>T 67 64 10 62 7.2 4.7 1.52 64 58 68 59 30.00 56.0 190 187 184 371 3-4wd uppr;no gain
7.5 99 SALUTE AND © R>S T>T 70 61 9 70 4.7 6.4 ©.74 77 81 63 61 30.00 52.9 221 185 200 386 Rail turn;no late kick
7.5 10 10 SPINOS ) S>S T>T 58 56 6 59 7.4 7.4 1.00 86 65 53 15.00 54.7 151 190 183 373 Outsde str;no impact
7.5 88 WILD FORCE © S»>S T>T 50 5510 50 9.0 8.2 1.11 63 66 44 55 30.00 52.2 173 185 159 344 Brush start;no bid
3,7,2
LAST TOTL
ASP AVG  ASP THREE SECND PACE BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG  HORSE CLASS SRR SUR 110 SPD R# TDS SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE P2F PAF PFN AVG MLINE CALL LAST ALL LAST TOTALS LAST RACE COMMENT
11/17/18 GPW 7 8.0 99 CUTTING © R>RD>D 80 84 2 8 2.5 2.5 1.00 82 81 75 84 1.80 50.4 238 305 297 602 Broke out st; weakened
8.0 11 GEONOSIS © S>R D>D ERR 84 4 ERR 8.0 3.7 2.18 87 86 90 87 4.00 54.8 263 308 316 624 Rank early; no threat
8.0 8 8 IDENTIFIER 10 R>RD>D 83 83 1 83 2.5 2.5 1.0 91 87 83 83 3.50 50.8 261 298 308 607 Set pace; no match
8.0 6 6 FOREVER MO © S>R D>D ERR 71 2 ERR 4.2 7.5 ©.56 97 82 80 71 15.80 58.2 259 283 293 576 Insde;2wd;wknd 1/16p
8.0 10 10 CONGRATS 35 S>R D>D ERR 69 1 ERR 5.5 2.7 2.00 77 85 68 69 20.00 53.2 230 269 274 543 4wd tn; best of rest
8.0 7 7 SOUPER 25 R>RD>D 68 68 3 68 3.8 3.3 1.14 86 83 72 68 20.00 50.8 241 267 287 554 Bid 2wd 2nd; no match
8.0 55 SURF AND ILR O>R >D ERR ERR © ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR 8.00 ERR © ERR ERR  ERR

9,8,1



ASP AVG ASP THREE SECND PACE BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE CLASS SRR SUR 110 SPD R# TDS SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE P2F P4F PFN AVG MLINE CALL LAST ALL LAST TOTALS LAST RACE COMMENT
11/17/18 GPW 8 6.0 1 1 GOLDEN 0 S>S DD 77 77 1e 77 2.8 3.6 ©.76 92 95 70 76 10.00 55.0 257 316 323 638 Chase pace;ins 1/4p
6.0 4 4 SHIM (%] S> S D>D 78 75 9 76 4.8 4.6 1.3 83 84 72 78 4.00 53.0 239 316 303 619 2wd turn;wide into str
6.0 55 SALSA (] R>SD>D 74 7110 74 5.5 6.1 ©0.91 86 90 60 71 12.00 53.5 236 291 292 583 Pressured pace;weaknd
6.0 3 3 GIANT (7] S>S D>D 74 70 10 75 5.2 5.2 1.00 92 94 94 74 2.50 55.6 280 313 367 680 2wd bid turn;pull away
6.0 99 POKERIST (] S>S D>D 72 70 10 70 4.4 4.4 1.00 90 97 78 78 5.00 56.2 265 304 342 646 Duel outside turn
6.0 2 2 OUTRUN (] S>S D>D 74 67 9 79 2.8 5.3 ©.52 79 87 78 77 3.00 54.5 244 306 321 627 7pth uppr;drove clear
6.0 7 7 GRAND 3JR 0 S>S T>D ERR 67 10 64 6.2 7.6 ©0.81 85 78 69 20.00 57.9 163 296 275 571 Rail 1/4;angl out;wknd
6.0 8 8 CYBER JOSH © S>S D>D 67 63 10 66 9.3 8.0 1.16 75 77 90 66 20.00 58.2 242 289 307 596 Inside bid;gain place
6.0 6 6 MYSTICAL (] S>S T>D 63 62 10 63 5.8 8.2 0.71 80 64 54 30.00 54.6 144 295 236 531 Widej;carried wider
6.0 10 10 LITTLE 0 S>S D>D 56 56 10 59 4.5 6.4 ©.70 92 82 37 59 20.00 50.2 211 273 234 507 Early bid; retreated
3,4,9
LAST TOTL
ASP AVG ASP THREE SECND PACE BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE CLASS SRR SUR 110 SPD R# TDS SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE P2F P4F PFN AVG MLINE CALL LAST ALL LAST TOTALS LAST RACE COMMENT
11/17/18 GPW 9 5.0 8 8 PROSPECTIV © S> T>T 75 79 10 75 7.2 4.7 1.54 86 81 77 8.00 56.6 167 264 235 499 3-4wd upr;ang inj;gain
5.0 44 DAHLONEGA 40 S>S T>T 79 75 5 79 5.4 3.6 1.50 100 84 80 2.00 59.5 184 254 269 523 Duel;kick clear uppr
5.0 2 2 TAYLOR'S 35 S>S T>T 81 74 10 81 5.8 4.2 1.37 88 82 81 6.00 57.1 170 253 244 497 Step slw;5wd;solid fin
5.0 55 IT'S EASY © S>S D>T 74 72 10 74 4.8 7.2 0.66 90 62 67 20.00 55.4 152 241 203 444 Steadied back rail
5.0 77 BAND OF 15 S>S T>T 77 72 10 77 2.3 4.5 0.52 99 80 83 1.660 58.6 179 259 262 521 Widened under wraps
5.0 11 TRUE 65 S> T>T 73 70 7 73 3.8 4.8 0.79 100 69 72 15.00 55.7 169 236 239 475 Edg closer 1/4;kik clr
5.0 10 10 SALSALIDA 65 S>S T>T 74 66 106 74 2.0 5.5 0.37 92 81 75 10.00 56.9 173 241 247 488 Qukly clear;drft inl/6
5.0 33 CAT'S 70 S>S T>T 73 50 3 73 1.6 7.2 0.22 97 68 50 15.00 55.6 165 215 234 448 Duel2w;lug inl/16p;clr

7,8,10



LAST TOTL

ASP AVG ASP THREE SECND PACE BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE CLASS SRR SUR 110 SPD R# TDS SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE P2F P4F PFN AVG MLINE CALL LAST ALL LAST TOTALS LAST RACE COMMENT

11/17/18 GPW 106 6.0 9 9 RODDICK 15 S> S DD 74 74 1 74 3.3 1.7 2.00 94 94 71 74 12.00 54.3 259 351 384 735 4wd trun;wide bid str
6.0 6 6 GUERRERON 5 R>SD>D 71 68 6 68 4.5 5.3 ©0.86 83 97 70 69 3.50 50.0 250 349 377 726 Stalk;bid tn;best rest
6.0 11 VENEZUELAN -10 S>SD>D 68 68 3 68 4.0 2.8 1.43 93 92 52 68 4.00 55.4 237 350 347 697 Chase rail;drft 5-6wd
6.0 10 10 FIELD -10 S>S T>D 61 62 3 63 5.2 5.6 ©0.93 80 82 53 62 10.00 52.1 215 327 328 655 Midpack;insde;retreatd
6.0 55 VALIANT -35 S>SSD>D 71 61 2 61 4.0 5.2 0.77 90 84 44 61 5.0 51.1 218 339 311 650 Stalkd;bid tn;faded
6.0 11 11 AWESOME -20 S>S DD 59 59 2 59 3.2 8.9 ©.35 95 87 62 59 8.00 52.5 244 338 341 679 Loom up turn;faded
6.0 22 DAD'S -45 S>S T> D ERR 56 1 ERR 6.0 7.0 0.86 85 61 56 10.00 54.1 146 344 291 635 5wd into str;no threat
6.0 8 8 GEM JUAN 10 S>S D>D 68 52 10 64 5.7 6.4 0.89 88 82 75 68 15.00 56.0 245 314 365 679 Insde bid tn;3wd str
6.0 33 BLACK TIE 5 S> T>D ERR 44 1 ERR 7.0 7.0 1.00 75 59 44 30.00 52.9 134 289 256 544 Off speed;5wd uppr
6.0 7 7 W W ILR ©0>S >D ERR ERR © ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR 20.00 ERR 0 ERR ERR ERR
6.0 4 4 BOLD ILR ©>S >D ERR ERR © ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR 12.00 ERR (] ERR ERR ERR
6.0 12 12 SIR ILR ©>S >D ERR ERR © ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR 8.00 ERR (] ERR ERR ERR

1,9,8



