LAST TOTL

ASP AVG ASP THREE SECND PACE BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE CLASS SRR SUR 110 SPD R# TDS SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE P2F P4F PFN AVG MLINE CALL RTTL LAST ALL LAST TOTALS LAST RACE COMMENT
12/12/18 GP 1 8.0 2 2  HOLLYWOOD -40 R>RD>D 8 88 9 88 6.9 7.2 ©.96 71 81 77 83 3.50 53.7 323 229 396 373 769 Step slow; steadied
8.0 11 ROYAL (%] S>R D>D 91 87 10 91 4.6 5.0 ©.92 88 91 87 90 2.50 59.5 266 266 391 399 789 4wd 1/4p;edgd for shw
8.0 6 6 EMPIRE 0 S>R D>D ERR 85 10 ERR 4.3 4.4 ©.97 89 96 91 84 3.00 58.9 276 276 391 415 805 Prompt;duel;just miss
8.0 55 FORTUNE 0 R>R D>D 83 82 10 83 5.3 4.4 1.22 78 85 64 75 10.00 52.6 311 227 365 340 705 Lunge start;lost irons
8.0 7 7  CURLINS -15 R>R D>D 83 81 10 83 8.9 7.3 1.22 74 79 790 73 15.00 52.2 306 223 375 346 721 Broke slow; no factor
8.0 3 3 INHIBITION -15 R>RD>D 84 80 10 84 4.8 4.4 1.9 92 89 83 86 12.00 53.6 359 264 360 391 750 Duel;weaknd str
8.0 8 8 AREYOUTALK © R>R T> D 86 80 106 86 5.2 3.4 1.54 74 83 86 85 4.50 55.1 328 243 357 376 733 In back;4wd;up place
8.0 4 4 DON'S 15 R>R D>D 77 77 16 77 6.2 6.8 ©.99 73 70 87 77 12.00 54.4 306 230 366 361 726 Bid late turn;vied
LAST TOTL
ASP AVG ASP THREE SECND PACE BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE CLASS SRR SUR 110 SPD R# TDS SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE P2F P4F PFN AVG MLINE CALL RTTL LAST ALL LAST TOTALS LAST RACE COMMENT
12/12/18 GP 2 8.5 44 WINDJAMMER © R>R T>T 73 76 106 76 4.6 6.0 0©.76 83 78 65 77 3.50 49.2 300 226 304 269 573 Staedied 1st;no rally
8.5 22 ELIZABETH' © R>R T>T 75 76 16 75 8.0 3.9 2.66 78 78 80 76 4.50 51.2 312 236 288 287 574 6wd uppr;imprve
8.5 3 3 MIJA BELLA -78 R>R T>T 72 72 5 72 7.6 6.0 1.26 74 76 76 77 15.00 56.2 302 226 289 270 559 Failed to menace
8.5 6 6  LOVELY 0 R>R D>T 74 7110 74 3.7 4.5 ©.82 91 91 44 64 3.00 47.6 304 226 275 250 526 Pressed pace; weakened
8.5 9 9  SWEET 10 S>RD>T 72 6910 72 5.3 3.7 1.46 89 84 63 69 12.00 55.7 236 236 266 271 537 Off trio;weakened
8.5 8 8 PEGGITY 10 S>R T>T 72 68 10 72 4.7 4.7 1.0 79 75 65 68 20.00 49.8 219 219 264 261 525 Outsde bid tn;faded
8.5 11 11 GLORIOUS 20 R>R T>T 76 67 4 76 5.9 4.1 1.44 84 81 90 66 12.00 53.3 330 255 271 304 575 Well rated;determindly
8.5 11 SHE'S NO 10 S>R T>T 58 64 106 58 8.0 5.7 1.39 76 69 80 66 20.00 53.1 225 225 258 265 522 Unhurried;2wl/4;solid
8.5 5 5 SUNSHINE 10 R>R T>T 64 62 10 64 8.1 6.6 1.24 63 54 87 68 10.00 55.5 261 204 267 266 533 7pth uppr;good finsh
8.5 7 7 REILTIN 20 R>R T>T 71 62 9 71 6.4 5.3 1.20 73 82 67 67 6.00 53.4 303 222 262 279 541 Ang out;bump foe;clear
8.5 10 10 HERECITYKI 15 S>R T>T ERR 62 3 ERR 6.4 3.0 2.10 76 80 73 62 15.00 59.5 229 229 256 278 535 5w bid;clear late;safe
LAST TOTL
ASP AVG ASP THREE SECND PACE BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE CLASS SRR SUR 110 SPD R# TDS SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE P2F P4F PFN AVG MLINE CALL RTTL LAST ALL LAST TOTALS LAST RACE COMMENT
12/12/18 GP 3 8.0 8 8 DAWN (%] S>R T>D ERR 71 10 ERR 6.7 5.3 1.26 82 70 66 2.50 56.8 152 152 405 340 745 Lack speed;no rally
8.0 11 ROSE M. -5 S>RD>D 70 706 6 70 5.9 5.9 1.00 85 77 80 69 4.50 53.7 242 242 407 412 818 3-4wd; lack needed bid
8.0 5 5 TAPETE 0 S>RD>D 69 64 10 69 6.8 4.6 1.46 86 85 67 68 3.00 54.3 238 238 384 401 785 Duel 3wd 5/16p;gaveway
8.0 33 MOMMA 0 R>R D>D 55 61 1@ 55 8.7 6.0 1.45 77 74 67 58 20.00 51.6 273 218 358 348 707 In back throughout
8.0 7 7 ZARABANDA © R>R D>D 58 60 10 58 6.3 6.5 ©0.98 94 92 44 65 10.00 49.4 299 230 367 351 718 Duel early; retreated
8.0 6 6  CASUAL 0 R>R D>D 59 58 106 59 8.9 8.2 1.08 80 85 62 65 12.00 50.5 298 227 363 377 740 Unhurried;2-3wd gain
8.0 4 4 ALTA 10 R>RD>D 75 55 4 75 5.6 5.9 ©.96 97 100 67 58 3.50 51.1 353 264 360 431 791 Set pace;drew off
8.0 2 2 MAGNATO GO © S>R D>D ERR 54 10 ERR 6.0 6.7 ©.89 90 73 60 54 10.00 52.6 223 223 355 341 696 Shuffled back early



LAST TOTL

ASP AVG ASP THREE SECND PACE BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE CLASS SRR SUR 110 SPD R# TDS SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE P2F P4F PFN AVG MLINE CALL RTTL LAST ALL LAST TOTALS LAST RACE COMMENT
12/12/18 GP 4 8.0 7 7 INTERLAKEN -5 R>RD>D 77 75 7 77 6.8 5.3 1.36 75 70 81 76 4.00 52.1 297 226 324 312 636 Came out st; no match
8.0 33 BRAG DUDE © S>R T>D 74 69 10 74 3.5 4.6 0©.76 95 99 54 72 2.50 53.9 248 248 307 318 626 Ins;tight 1/8p;kept on
8.0 6 6 FIGHTINIRI © S>R D>D 59 67 10 59 7.2 6.6 1.09 69 65 83 67 8.00 58.0 217 217 312 296 608 3w;getting to runnerup
8.0 10 10 BOOMING -5 R>R T>D ERR 67 8 ERR 7.7 6.3 1.23 85 82 72 67 10.00 52.4 313 239 307 299 605 Wide into str;no thret
8.0 22 CURLIN'S -5 S>RD>D 61 66 4 61 5.4 7.1 0©.76 99 91 74 67 8.00 56.6 255 255 297 323 620 3w;even finish
8.0 11 OUTSIDE 0 R>RD>D 706 65 9 70 7.5 6.3 1.18 75 78 67 74 3.00 51.7 287 220 305 282 587 Fractious gate;weaknd
8.0 4 4  MARNESIA -10 S>R T>D ERR 63 2 ERR 8.2 9.4 0.88 86 84 58 63 15.00 ****x 228 228 300 295 595 Brk in;bmp start;insde
8.0 55 DAZZLING 0 S>R D>D 62 60 106 62 7.6 5.8 1.31 84 77 83 63 20.00 56.5 244 244 289 306 596 Ins;2wd 1/4p;btwn late
8.0 99 LONDON -5 S>R D>D ERR 58 1 ERR 7.5 5.8 1.29 85 70 76 58 15.00 52.8 231 231 286 287 573 Done early
8.0 8 8 SUPER 0 R>R D>D 62 55 3 62 6.3 6.7 0.95 81 83 65 55 30.00 51.1 299 229 274 281 555 Fractious;rate;weaknd
LAST TOTL
ASP AVG ASP THREE SECND PACE BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE CLASS SRR SUR 110 SPD R# TDS SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE P2F P4F PFN AVG MLINE CALL RTTL LAST ALL LAST TOTALS LAST RACE COMMENT
12/12/18 GP 5 7.5 10 10 GETMOTHERA -30 S>S T>T ERR 75 2 75 1.8 4.1 .44 95 96 77 75 4.00 55.5 268 268 356 373 729 3w uppr; wknd late

7.5 22 CHARGE IT -25 R>S T>T ERR 74 2 77 4.5 4.1 1.11 80 79 70 74 6.00 55.1 309 229 347 337 684 Stalkd;ins;3wd;flatnd
7.5 11 MATZO -25 S>S T>T 67 70 3 70 2.8 4.5 0.62 88 79 67 70 6.00 52.2 234 234 337 330 667 Pressured;duel;gavewy
7.5 11 11 LOOKINLIKE 10 S>S T>T 69 69 2 69 2.1 4.2 0©.50 990 92 50 69 12.00 53.6 232 232 321 326 646 Duel til 1/8p; gaveway
7.5 66 RED ROBE -30 R>S T>T ERR 68 1 ERR 7.0 9.0 0©.78 78 90 54 68 8.00 51.8 309 222 334 325 659 Bmp brk;urge 4w into
7.5 99 IT'S -30 R>S D>T ERR 68 2 ERR 6.2 5.2 1.18 75 81 56 68 5.00 50.9 283 212 329 304 633 Broke slowly; improved
7.5 55 FILLY -15 R>S D>T ERR 68 2 ERR 7.9 5.8 1.36 92 94 67 68 10.00 52.0 335 253 328 343 671 Stalkd;bid tn;insd str
7.5 4 4 INDICIA -25 S>S D>T ERR 65 2 ERR 5.4 4.6 1.17 84 77 80 65 8.00 54.8 241 241 331 338 669 Veer out st;3w; no bid
7.5 88 FOLLY -15 R>S D>T ERR 65 1 ERR 6.7 10.0 ©.67 83 70 75 65 12.00 50.0 293 228 317 323 640 3wd; gave way
7.5 77 BELLO ILR 0>S >T ERR ERR © ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR 15.00 ERR 0 7] ERR ERR ERR
7.5 33 LADY ILR 0>S >T ERR ERR © ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR 15.00 ERR 0 0 ERR ERR ERR



LAST TOTL

ASP AVG ASP THREE SECND PACE BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG  HORSE CLASS SRR SUR 110 SPD R# TDS SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE P2F P4F PFN AVG MLINE CALL RTTL LAST ALL LAST TOTALS LAST RACE COMMENT
12/12/18 GP 6 5.0 3 3 LOVE AND -20 S>S T>T 75 7510 75 5.4 4.9 1.09 90 76 76 4.00 56.5 166 166 248 234 481 Ins tn;shift out;evnly
5.0 2 2 LIFE TIME -23 S>S T>T 8 72 9 74 5.7 5.5 1.3 73 67 65 68 3.50 53.0 205 205 250 221 471 3w 1/2;6w late;empty
5.0 12 12 BARBADOS @ S>S T>T 75 6910 74 5.5 4.7 1.16 90 82 75 8.00 54.0 172 172 242 244 486 Off pace;outsde;rally
5.0 11 11 TRUE -55 S>S T>T 72 69 8 72 4.4 5.2 0.85 82 75 69 10.00 55.5 157 157 234 219 453 2-3wd; no menace
5.0 7 7 PROUD 10 R>S T>T 75 69 10 74 3.9 5.2 .75 87 89 58 62 20.00 51.7 318 234 220 240 460 Press pace;duel turn
5.0 6 6  SOLARTE -35 S>S D>T ERR 68 2 ERR 0.0 1.3 ERR 091 70 68 12.00 53.9 161 161 241 225 466 Pace outside; led 2x
5.0 9 9 FREUDEE 5 S>S T>T 66 68 16 70 4.5 8.3 0.54 96 95 67 64 30.00 53.3 258 258 219 262 481 Pace;duel;faded 1/8p
5.0 8 8 RETHINKME @ S>S T>T 72 6810 72 2.6 4.0 0.66 97 66 72 20.00 52.5 163 163 229 225 454 In range;5wd str;flatn
5.0 4 4 GRACIAS 10 S>S T>T 73 67 10 73 2.2 3.7 .58 97 74 73 5.00 55.0 171 171 234 240 474 Pressurd pace;drvg fin
5.0 11 HAPPY 10 S>S T>T 66 67 9 66 6.2 5.1 1.21 82 79 65 15.00 53.8 161 161 228 223 450 Last flight;wide gain
5.0 55 NOT NICE 10 S>S T>T 76 65 8 76 3.8 4.2 0.89 93 81 72 6.00 55.8 174 174 232 250 482 2nd flight;bid 2pth
5.0 10 10 WISHFULLY 5 S>S D>T 68 63 10 63 3.8 6.8 ©.57 95 93 44 48 20.00 54.2 232 232 214 221 434 Vied backstr;faded
5.0 13 13 CAN YOU 10 S>S T>T 63 6210 63 4.8 6.6 0.72 99 50 62 30.00 52.7 149 149 211 197 408 Duel 2wd;fade stretch
LAST TOTL
ASP AVG ASP THREE SECND PACE BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG  HORSE CLASS SRR SUR 110 SPD R# TDS SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE P2F P4F PFN AVG MLINE CALL RTTL LAST ALL LAST TOTALS LAST RACE COMMENT
12/12/18 GP 7 7.5 8 8  ONTHEWAYTO © S>S D>T ERR 89 1 ERR ©.0 2.9 ERR 98 82 89 8.00 57.0 180 180 338 313 651 Speed 3w; gave in

7.5 4 4  FRONT RUN -5 S>S T>T ERR 82 2 83 6.1 3.3 1.83 86 86 90 82 1.80 58.3 262 262 330 341 671 Bumped st; gd energy
7.5 7 7 JUSTCALLME -5 S>S T>T ERR 79 3 78 3.9 4.8 ©.80 93 91 79 79 6.00 57.0 263 263 320 329 649 Cut corner; kept on
7.5 11 11 HE'S NO 0 R>S T>T ERR 78 1 ERR 7.5 4.2 1.80 75 77 85 78 12.00 51.1 309 237 306 313 619 Slow start; mild gain
7.5 12 12 IMPUNITY 25 R>S D>T ERR 76 1 ERR 1.3 2.5 ©.50 90 87 76 76 15.00 50.7 335 253 299 319 618 Vied betw 2p; 2nd best
7.5 55 MACHO 0 R>S T>T ERR 75 3 70 4.4 3.3 1.33 88 82 84 75 10.00 51.9 331 254 303 322 625 Duel late btw;just mis
7.5 13 13 CASH ON 0 S>S D>T ERR 67 3 ERR 3.7 5.8 0.64 88 87 41 67 20.00 48.6 216 216 286 258 544 3wd; dropped far back
7.5 10 10 KING LEO © S>S T>T ERR 64 4 70 4.3 6.3 0.68 90 71 64 20.00 56.7 161 161 288 267 555 Step slw st;even finsh
7.5 9 9 HONEY -10 R>S T>T ERR 63 2 ERR 5.0 7.5 ©.67 85 86 65 63 12.00 54.8 325 236 288 309 597 Pocket;ask priorl/4
7.5 66 DR. ALLDAY 10 S>S D>T ERR 40 1 ERR 6.4 7.9 ©.82 80 79 33 40 15.00 49.1 192 192 241 230 471 Broke inj;bump start
7.5 33 ROCHAMBEAU ILR 0>S >T ERR ERR © ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR 20.00 ERR 0 0 ERR ERR ERR
7.5 22 ARMY SCOUT ILR 0>S >T ERR ERR © ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR 5.00 ERR 0 0 ERR ERR ERR
7.5 11 WACKY PAL ILR ©>S >T ERR ERR © ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR 20.00 ERR 0 © ERR ERR ERR



LAST TOTL

ASP AVG ASP THREE SECND PACE BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE CLASS SRR SUR 110 SPD R# TDS SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE P2F P4F PFN AVG MLINE CALL RTTL LAST ALL LAST TOTALS LAST RACE COMMENT
12/12/18 GP 8 5.0 10 106 TREV 0 S>S D>T 85 87 10 85 2.9 3.3 0.87 93 98 86 89 1.8 57.7 277 277 310 347 657 Pace;slim lead;firm
5.0 22 STARSHIP 0 S>S D>T 86 85 10 86 3.6 3.4 1.04 092 72 82 1.80 53.8 164 164 316 269 586 Duel 3wl/4p;wknd
5.6 55 AMELIA'S 0 S>S T>T 82 82 10 82 6.0 5.3 1.13 093 82 81 3.50 55.3 175 175 312 291 603 Wide;up late;caught
5.0 11 HARRY'S 0 S>S T>T 82 82 10 82 5.7 3.8 1.49 82 91 81 8.00 55.0 173 173 308 288 596 Very wide;rallied late
5.0 7 7 AT ODDS -4 R>S T>T 8 81 3 86 4.0 7.0 0.57 78 89 62 81 10.00 52.9 319 229 301 298 599 Stalk;gain far trn;wkn
5.0 99 FRENCHMEN © S>S T>T 80 80 10 79 3.1 4.3 0.73 095 76 83 12.00 55.4 171 171 302 282 585 Duel 1/8p;led;outkickd
5.0 66 KANTHAROS' © S>S D>T 81 77 106 81 5.8 3.8 1.52 87 87 80 78 8.00 55.6 254 254 292 312 604 Insde tnj;angl out upr
5.0 414 BLACK 0 S>S D>T ERR 75 5 ERR 4.8 3.9 1.22 94 99 75 75 4.50 55.3 268 268 295 327 622 Vied 1/4p;2-3wd str
5.6 33 VINO 0 S>S D>T 79 71 6 79 7.2 7.4 ©.97 94 85 83 78 10.00 56.6 262 262 291 315 607 Between; steady 7/16
5.0 8 8 CITY ROC 0 S>S T>T 78 66 106 78 3.0 4.8 0.62 095 71 80 20.00 56.3 166 166 272 270 543 Vied inside;tired
LAST TOTL
ASP AVG ASP THREE SECND PACE BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE CLASS SRR SUR 110 SPD R# TDS SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE P2F P4F PFN AVG MLINE CALL RTTL LAST ALL LAST TOTALS LAST RACE COMMENT
12/12/18 GP 9 6.0 22 A BIT OF 40 S>SD>D 9 95 1 9 1.1 1.1 1.00 096 104 87 95 1.e0 57.8 287 287 412 438 851 Rail;clearly best
6.0 11 MIDTOWN 25 S>S D> 77 77 5 79 3.3 3.3 1.00 95 94 79 73 4.00 55.7 268 268 376 395 771 Duel;edg awy;held safe
6.0 3 3 JELTRIN 40 S>S D> 77 77 2 77 2.0 2.0 1.00 96 93 81 77 10.00 56.1 270 270 373 405 778 Pace;ins;2wd;pull away
6.0 77 CRUMB BUN -25 S>S D> 76 74 8 74 3.6 3.8 0.9 91 990 78 80 20.00 53.6 259 259 378 386 764 In range;bid 3/8;flatn
6.0 55 ROSEDALE -25 R>S T>D ERR 71 3 77 3.9 5.7 ©.69 85 81 52 71 15.00 51.7 296 218 373 321 694 In range;rail;retreat
6.0 4 4 CREEDIBILI © S>S D> 77 71 5 72 7.6 4.2 1.79 94 89 74 73 5.0 52.9 257 257 374 377 751 4-5wd trip; willing
6.0 8 8 ARTS AND 25 S>S D> 73 69 3 69 4.2 3.3 1.25 75 80 69 6.00 54.9 155 155 354 306 660 3-4wd str;up show
6.0 6 6 CELEBRATEM 40 S>SD>D 706 68 2 68 2.7 3.3 ©.80 93 86 75 68 20.00 54.6 254 254 360 371 732 Vie ins;shook free upr
LAST TOTL
ASP AVG ASP THREE SECND PACE BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE CLASS SRR SUR 110 SPD R# TDS SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE P2F P4F PFN AVG MLINE CALL RTTL LAST ALL LAST TOTALS LAST RACE COMMENT
12/12/18 GP 10 8.0 7 7 ZALZA -5 S>R D>D ERR 61 3 ERR 4.5 5.8 0.78 94 96 62 61 2.00 54.7 252 252 324 329 654 Trackd;3wd tn;flatnd
8.0 12 12 PERFECT 0 R>RD>D 60 60 3 60 5.8 5.4 1.7 75 76 61 60 15.00 50.0 274 212 304 283 587 2wd 1/4p;drft out str
8.0 33 EL PLAYON -5 S>R D>D ERR 60 2 ERR 8.3 5.0 1.67 81 81 70 60 15.00 55.4 232 232 304 307 611 Lack speed;4wd str
8.0 11 11 TREASURE 0 R>R D>D 57 58 5 57 6.7 4.8 1.41 84 82 55 67 8.00 50.3 293 221 304 292 597 Rated;3wd 1/4p;kept on
8.0 8 GEM JUAN -15 S>R D>D ERR 55 10 ERR 5.8 5.5 1.07 89 79 85 69 5.00 57.4 253 253 304 337 641 Ins;up clse 1/8;kpt on
8.0 55 KARAS 0 S>R D>D ERR 55 8 ERR 6.9 7.2 0.96 74 65 94 63 15.00 56.2 233 233 292 319 611 Drft out;surge to wire
8.0 10 10 DEWEYCHEAT -5 S>R D>D ERR 53 1 ERR 10.0 10.0 1.00 77 64 77 53 15.e0 53.0 218 218 288 283 571 Steadied nearing 5/16
8.0 11 BRUNO NOSE © R>RD>D 44 44 1 44 7.8 5.6 1.40 58 59 60 44 20.00 51.5 222 177 264 243 506 Pass tiring foes
8.0 4 4 BELLAMY -10 S>R T>D ERR 42 1 ERR 8.0 8.0 1.00 73 59 42 20.00 53.9 132 132 268 224 492 Insde urging uppr
8.0 6 6 WATCH YOUR © R>R D>D 57 34 3 57 5.2 7.9 .65 92 87 52 34 6.00 50.0 305 231 250 292 542 Pressurd;lost lead tn
8.0 22 ZAMAN -15 S>R T>D ERR ERR © ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR 12.00 53.7 0 0 ERR 91 ERR Bump rail 1st;ease up
8.0 99 TIZM ILR O>R >D ERR ERR © ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR 10.00 ERR 0 (4] ERR ERR ERR



DATE  TRK #

12/12/18 GP

DATE  TRK #

12/12/18 GP

8.5 11

8.5 10

PRG  HORSE SRR
4 DON'S R>R
1 ROYAL S>R
2 HOLLYWOOD R>R
6  EMPIRE S>R
3 INHIBITION R>R

5  FORTUNE R>R
7  CURLINS R>R
8  AREYOUTALK R>R

4 WINDJAMMER

6  LOVELY R>R
8  PEGGITY S>R
7  REILTIN R>R
5 SUNSHINE R>R

3 MIJA BELLA R>R

1 SHE'S NO S>R
9  SWEET S>R
11 GLORIOUS R>R

2 ELIZABETH' R>R

10 HERECITYKI S>R

D>l

o
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D>D

D>l

o
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o
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™D
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T

T

T

T

T
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T

ASP

NOTES FROM LAST RACE 110
Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 77
3-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed?
WATCH! Clear early.lst off 49 day
layoff. Class 15 Finished 2 from post 3
TIW= 66 TIH= 80
Flashed speed. Class © Finished 4 from 91
post 5 TIW= 68 TJIH= 87
1st off 55 day layoff. Class -40 88

Finished 9 from post 4 TIW= 107 TJH= 118
Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from ERR
6-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed?
WATCH!BTL horse. Clear early. Class ©
Finished 2 from post 6 TIW= 59 TJH= 77
Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
6-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed?
WATCH! 1st off 62 day layoff. Class -15
Finished 5 from post 6 TIW= 34 TJH= 42
Slow last race (13). 1st off 35 day
layoff. Class @ Finished 6 from post 3
TIW= 76 TIH= 97

Class -15 Finished 5 from post 1 TIW= 58
TIH= 69

83

Made big overall move (8). Made a big 86
move early (3.25). 1st off 33 day
layoff. Class @ Finished 2 from post 8

TIW= 43 TIH= 53

NOTES FROM LAST RACE

Made a big move early (3). Slow last
race (11). 1st off 33 day layoff. Class
0 Finished 8 from post 3 TIW= 84 TJH= 90
Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
6-hole. Slow last race (17). 1st off 55
day layoff. Class @ Finished 8 from post
6 TIW= 64 TIH= 72

1st off 46 day layoff. Class
11 from post 11 TIW= 62 TIH=

10 Finished
70

72

Made big overall move (7). Fast last 71
race (11). Class 20 Finished 1 from
post 9 TIW= 72 TIH= 83

Made big overall move (5). *Stretch gain
(1.5). Class 1@ Finished 2 from post 1
TIW= 43 TIH= 53

1st off 39 day layoff. Class -78
Finished 10 from post 1 TIW= 34 TJH= 54

72

Made big overall move (8). Class 10 58

Finished 2 from post 8 TIW= 50 TJH= 54

Flashed speed. 1st off 31 day layoff.
Class 10 Finished 6 from post 5 TIW= 34
TIH= 39

Made big overall move (5). Fast last
race (13). 1st off 97 day layoff. Class
20 Finished 1 from post 2 TIW= 67 TJH=
92

Chased Pace. Made big overall move (4).
Made a big move early (3.75). 1st off 33
day layoff. Class @ Finished 4 from post
6 TIW= 37 TIH= 41

Made big overall move (6). Middle move
(7). Class 15 Finished 1 from post 8
TIW= 44 TIH= 77
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2.1

ERR
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ERR
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88

71

89

92

78

74

74

TDTWO TDCLO P2F

10.0

2.8

4.0
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1.0
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ERR

91
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76

89

84
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91

81

96

89
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91
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54

76

69

84
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78

80

87

77

91

83

64

70

86

44

65

67

87

76

80

63

90

80

73

LAST FIVE

SPEED RATINGS DSLR
79,78,75,77,75 49
87,90,92,87,89 19
85,74,90,92,91 55
93,92,66,79,92 19
88,85,85,81,83 62
69,67,88,86,87 35
72,70,78,74,88 20
84,82,88,87,76 33

LAST FIVE

SPEED RATINGS DSLR
65,82,84,79,81 33
54,70,67,76,72 55
64,70,70,74,75 26
73,60,68,68,67 24
70,62,71,62,67 24
72,80,79,68,60 39
69,62,68,65,74 18
64,68,74,78,72 31
80,71,47,70,0 97
75,71,81,73,74 33
72,62,51,0,0 28

BRIS P CALL1 CALL2 MEDS EQUIP MLINE

52.1

23.4

48.2

22.9

49.6

50.6

47.5

48.9

CALL1

47.3

24.3

49.7

52.6

50.9

26.1

23.9

49.6

49.3

25.4

76.3

45.6

72.8

45.4

74.2

75.7

72.8

72.9

CALL2

75.0

50.9

74.4

76.4

74.4

51.0

47.6

74.3

75.1

47.6

MEDS

EQUIP

BON

3.

12.

10.

15.

20.

10.

15.

20.

12.

12.

15.

00

00

00

00

.00

00

.00

00

00

00

00

00

.50

00

176

200

184

138

144

119

124

147

162

119

114

125

136

112

TRK

GPW

GPW

GPW

GPW

D

GPW

LRL

GPW

GPW

GPW

GPW

GPW

GPW

GP

GPW

GPW

DIS

7.0

8.5

7.0

8.0

8.0

8.0

8.0

8.0

7.5

8.5

8.5

8.0

7.5

7.0

8.0

8.0

7.5

CHNG SPPNT
C 11.8
cC 20.6
AO>C 5.9
C 23.5
co>C 23.5
C 14.7
C 0.0
c>C 0.0
CHNG  SPPNT
C 12.5
cC 21.9
cC 6.3
M>C 9.4
oC 6.3
N>C 0.0
oC 6.3
oC 18.8
M>C 9.4
oC 0.0
M>C 9.4

ERLY
PACE

PWR COMB TOTL

130

127

128

124

119

119

123

1ol

101

109

102

116

99

103

110

111

99

96.4

102.3

99.5

103.7

95.7

93.6

96.2

97.6

90.3

90.6

95.8

94.3

85.9

85.2

93.9

98.4

95.2

93.7

143

179

152

185

181

163

153

157

182

154

155

117

150

145

173

165

156

156

TOTL
PACE
LAST

266

229

27

o

26:

B

227

223

243

226

219

22

N

204

226

22

i

236

25

vy

236

229

COMMENTS

Bid late turn;vied/ Ins;
btwn; no threat/ Tracked
inside; tired

4wd 1/4p;edgd for shw/
Dueled;weaken uppr/
3-4w;duel;no match lat
Step slow; steadied/ 3w
to 1/2p; tired/ Steadied
7/16;6pth 1/4
Prompt;duel;just miss/
Brk thru gate;3wd;up/
Early bid; retreated

Duel;weaknd str/
Press;duel;gaveway/
Duel;solid effort

Lunge start;lost irons/
Ooff slowly; outrun/ Track
btwn;kpt on 3wd

Broke slow; no factor/
Bothered st; no factor/
Angled out; empty

In back;4wd;up place/ Got
thru upr;stedy lte/
Unhurried;outsde gain

COMMENTS

Staedied 1st;no rally/
Duel 2wd1/8p;drw clr/
2w;btwn foes 2nd;tired
Pressed pace; weakened/
Bid; clear; caught/
Keen;brief stdy 1/4

Outsde bid tn;faded/
Steadid tnj;insde bid/
Lack room late tn-uppr
Ang out;bump foe;clear/
éwd 1/4; gave way/ 54wd
1/4; no factor

7pth uppr;good finsh/
Midpack;wide into upr/
Outsde bid;late gain
Failed to menace/ In
back;steady 2wd bid/ Well
rated;pulled away
Unhurried;2wl/4;solid/
Insde;gain uppr;wknd/
Heels clip st;4w;tired
Off trio;weakened/ Off
pace;widest str/ Could
not reach winner

Well rated;determindly/
4-5wd bid tn;flatnd/ Vied
breifly;retreated

6wd uppr;imprve/ Finished
early/ 5wd;wider;gain
postion

Sw bid;clear late;safe/
In aim 3wl/4p;evnd out/
Fractious;lunged start



DATE  TRK #
12/12/18 GP
DATE  TRK #

MAGNATO GO

ALTA

ZARABANDA

ROSE M.

CASUAL

DAWN

TAPETE

R>R

R>R

S>R

R>R

S>R

R>R

S>R

D>D

D>D

D>l

o

D>D

T>l

o

D>D

D>D

ASP

NOTES FROM LAST RACE 110
Class @ Finished 8 from post 2 TIW= 9 ERR
TIH= 14
Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 75
4-hole. Fast last race
(20) .Uncharacteristic early speed?
WATCH! Clear early.lst off 35 day
layoff. Class 10 Finished 1 from post 4
TIW= 48 TIH= 73
Slow last race (11).Uncharacteristic 58

race? Class © Finished 5 from post 6

TIW= 28 TIH= 33

Flashed speed. Class -5 Finished 4 from 70
post 7 TIW= 75 TIH= 92

Made big overall move (4). Class @ 59
Finished 2 from post 5 TJW= 21 TJH= 25
*Stretch gain (.25). 1st off 65 day ERR
layoff. Class @ Finished 8 from post 5
TIW= 85 TJH= 92
1st off 42 day layoff. Class @ Finished 55
7 from post 7 TIW= 68 TIH= 74
Chased Pace. Made big overall move (3). 69
1st off 31 day layoff. Class @ Finished
3 from post 6 TIW= 110 TIH= 114
ASP
NOTES FROM LAST RACE 110

55

60

70

58

71

61

64

10

10

10

10

10

75 1

58 6

70 1

59 5

ERR ©

55 2

69 1

75

68

82

69

80

56

87

79

79

73

81

74

SYs2

0.9

CLOSE

7.8

ERR

9.2

TDONE

1.3

ERR

9.2

TDTWO

1.0

1.2

ERR

1.0

97

94

85

80

82

77

86

100

92

77

85

74

85

RT S1 S2 SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDONE TDTWO TDCLO P2F P4F PFN

44

80

62

70

67

67

115

140

131

117

TRK

GPW

GPW

GPW

GPW

GPW

GPW

GPW

DIS

8.0

8.0

7.0

8.0

5.0

8.0

6.5

ERLY
PACE

PWR COMB TOTL

108

102

111

1ol

105

97

110

94.4

89.2

95.3

90.9

94.6

84.6

96.6

CcomB

197

186

162

165

82

151

171

ERLY
PACE
TOTL

TOTL
PACE
LAST

23

®

242

22

~

152

218

238

TOTL
PACE
LAST

COMMENTS

Shuffled back early/
Duel;led 1/8;outkickd/
Brief bid; faded

Set pace;drew off/ Rank
early;wide str/ Chaed
pace;faded

Duel early; retreated/
Set pace;duel inside/
Duel;no matchl/4;rebid
3-4wd; lack needed bid/
Pace;collared past 3/8/
Forwardly;bested rest
Unhurried;2-3wd gain/
Rated;3wd;best rest/
Inside bid;no threat
Lack speed;no rally/
Swung wide tn;up show/
Urged outsde tn;no kik
In back throughout/ In
range;flatnd out/
Trailed;no bid

Duel 3wd 5/16p;gaveway/
Back;wide;drft in late/
Bid 1/2p;duel;outfnshd

COMMENTS

12/12/18 GP 4

10

10

BRAG DUDE

CURLIN'S

MARNESIA

SUPER

FIGHTINIRI

OUTSIDE

BOOMING

INTERLAKEN

LONDON

DAZZLING

S>R

S>R

R>R

S>R

R>R

R>R

R>R

S>R

S>R

>l

o

D>D

D>D

D>l

o

™D

D>D

D>D

D>D

Chased Pace.BTL horse. Class @ Finished 74
3 from post 1 TIW= 50 TJH= 50
Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 61
9-hole. *Stretch gain (.5). Fast last

race (11).BTL horse. 1st off 54 day

layoff. Class -5 Finished 6 from post 9

TIW= 53 TJH= 53

1st off 222 day layoff. Class -10
Finished 7 from post 3 TIW= 43 TJH=
Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH!
Class @ Finished 5 from post 8 TIW=
TIH= 25

Made big overall move (3). *Stretch gain
(.25).BTL horse. Class @ Finished 3
from post 5 TIW= 56 TJH= 56

Class @ Finished 6 from post 7 TIW= 34
TIH= 34

ERR

43
62

25

59

70

1st off 40 day layoff. Class -5 Finished ERR
7 from post 8 TIW= 60 TIH= 60

Chased Pace. Made big overall move (3). 77
1st off 38 day layoff. Class -5 Finished

2 from post 2 TIW= 51 TJH= 51

Class -5 Finished 7 from post 8 TIW= 54 ERR
TIH= 54

*Stretch gain (2).BTL horse. Class ©
Finished 5 from post 1 TIW= 68 TJH= 68

62

66

63

55

67

65

67

75

58

60

10

10

61 1

ERR @

59 2

70 4

ERR ©

77 2

ERR ©

62 3

88

63

68

77

67

74

73

77

83

84

48

75

81

76

87

87

80

80

5.4

8.2

6.3

7.2

7.5

7.7

6.8

7.5

7.6

7.1

9.4

6.7

6.6

6.3

6.3

5.3

5.8

5.8

0.9

1.2

1.2

1.3

1.3

1.3

ERR

3.0

ERR

ERR

7.1

ERR

5.0

6.3

ERR

ERR

5.8

ERR

0.6

ERR

ERR

1.2

90

86

81

69

75

85

75

85

84

91

84

83

65

78

82

70

70

77

74

58

65

83

67

72

81

76

83

LAST FIVE

SPEED RATINGS DSLR
47,73,42,53,62 17
75,46,54,46,0 35
49,76,70,63,51 28
71,63,72,70,73 18
61,73,62,36,45 28
61,70,67,64,73 65
54,66,53,56,63 4
66,68,69,66,63 31

LAST FIVE

SPEED RATINGS DSLR
72,74,71,72,72 18
77,61,64,60,0 54
64,62,0,0,0 222
62,49,55,0,0 28
66,65,71,65,60 19
61,80,80,68,58 28
69,61,71,68,64 40
75,79,75,73,76 38
58,0,0,0,0 28
70,57,62,67,65 24

BRIS P CALL1 CALL2 MEDS EQUIP MLINE

E 23.4 48.6 1 0 10.00
E 48.6 74.4 1 0 3.50
E 49.1 75.9 1 0 10.00
E 24.1 48.7 1 0 4.50
S 48.9 75.1 1 0 12.00
P 23.8 47.0 1 0 2.50
S 53.4 79.0 1 0 20.00
E/P 23.2 47.5 1 0 3.00
BRIS P CALL1 CALL2 MEDS EQUIP MLINE

E 24.1 48.5 1 0 2.50
NA 23.3 46.7 1 BON 8.00
NA 1.4 1.9 1 0 15.00
P 50.3 76.1 1 0 30.00
E/P 24.7 47.4 1 0 8.00
E/P 50.6 76.1 1 BOFF 3.00
S 49.4 74.6 1 0 10.00
P 50.0 75.3 1 0 4.00
NA 24.1 49.1 1 0 15.00
P 23.6 47.0 1 0 20.00

lel

140

114

138

136

138

140

116

117

GP

GPW

GPW

GPW

GPW

D

(@]

GPW

7.5

8.0

7.0

8.0

8.0

8.5

6.0

6.0

CHNG  SPPNT
C 17.8
M>C 13.3
C 13.3
C 17.8
oC 6.7
C 11.1
C 8.9
C 11.1
CHNG  SPPNT
M>M 20.5
M>M 12.8
M>M 10.3
M>M 10.3
M>M 5.1
M>M 7.7
M>M 0.0
M>M 12.8
M>M 15.4
M>M 5.1

108

96

98

106

116

104

111

98

101

98.2

93.1

95.1

84.5

91.1

87.4

97.1

95.1

91.3

194

181

170

164

134

153

167

145

155

161

255

228

229

217

22

]

239

226

23

s

244

Ins;tight 1/8p;kept on/
Clear lead;duel;inside/
In aim 3wd 1/4p;wknd
3w;even finish/ 3w;lacked
rally/ Bmp top str;no
rspns

Brk in;bmp start;insde/
Pinch back after start/
Fractious;rate;weaknd/
Very slw start;stead'd/
Bit fractious;slow st;
3w;getting to runnerup/
6wd bid;gain position/
Ins tn;angl out;gainin
Fractious gate;weaknd/
Stubborn load;dueled/
Outrun early;imprved
Wide into str;no thret/
Outside;no threat/ 3-4wd
bid tn;flattnd

Came out st; no match/
4path 3/16; faded/ Bumped
st; thru 1/2

Done early/ /

Ins;2wd 1/4p;btwn late/
Outsde trip;no impact/
Wide; no factor



ERLY TOTL

ASP AVG ASP LAST FIVE PACE PACE
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG  HORSE SRR SUR NOTES FROM LAST RACE 110 RX SPD R# TDS RT S1 S2 SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDONE TDTWO TDCLO P2F P4F PFN SPEED RATINGS DSLR BRIS P CALL1 CALL2 MEDS EQUIP MLINE CLS TRK DIS CHNG SPPNT PWR COMB TOTL LAST COMMENTS
12/12/18 GP 5 7.5 7 7 BELLO 0>S >T 1st off 737040 day layoff. FTS. Class ERR © ERR @ ERR © 57 -9 ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR 0,0,0,0,0 ¥*** NA @ 0.0 0.0 1 0 15.00 ERR 0.0 >M 0.0 ERR 2] o/ /

ILR Finished @ from post @ TIW= 80 TJH=
80

7.5 33 LADY 0>S >T 1st off 737040 day layoff. FTS. Class ERR © ERR © ERR © 57 -9 ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR 0,0,0,0,0 ¥EENA @ 0.0 0.0 1 0 15.00 0.0 >M 0.0 ERR Q e/ /
ILR Finished © from post © TIW= 64 TJH=
64

7.5 10 10 GETMOTHERA S>S T>T Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from ERR © 75 2 75 2 8 87 1.8 4.1 .4 1.8 4.1 0.4 95 9 77 80,70,0,0,0 33 E 5 23.4 47.2 1 0 4.00 171 AQU 6.0 S>M 31.3 119 100.9 191 268 3w uppr; wknd late/ Pace
6-hole.BTL horse. 1st off 33 day layoff. ins turn;weakened/
Class -30 Finished 6 from post 6 TIW= 54
TIH= 54

7.5 11 11 LOOKINLIKE S>S T>T Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 69 2 69 2 69 2 77 77 2.1 4.2 0.5 2.1 4.2 0.5 99 92 50 65,72,0,0,0 53 E 2 23.9 48.6 1 0 12.00 131 GPW 7.5 M>M 12.5 108 95.3 182 232 Duel til 1/8p; gaveway/
4-hole. 1st off 53 day layoff. Class 10 Duel 1/4-1/8p;kept on/
Finished 5 from post 4 TIW= 64 TJH= 64

7.5 11 MATZO S>S T>T Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 67 1 76 3 70 3 72 83 2.8 4.5 0.6 2.8 4.5 0.6 8 79 67 67,69,75,0,0 46 E 5 24.1 49.4 1 @0 6.00 168 GPW 7.5 S>M 31.3 113 95.5 167 234 Pressured;duel;gavewy/
2-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? Insde turn;5-6wd bid/
WATCH!BTL horse. Clear early.lst off 46 Ins;clr hedgel/4;flat
day layoff. Class -25 Finished 6 from
post 2 TIW= 45 TJH= 45

7.5 88 FOLLY R>S D>T Flashed speed. 1st off 95 day layoff. ERR @ 65 1ERR © 69 85 6.7 10.0 0.7 ERR ERR ERR 83 70 75 65,0,0,0,0 95 NA 0 50.7 77.1 FTL © 12.00 156 LRL 8.0 S>M 0.0 100 94.5 153 228 3wd; gave way/ /
Class -15 Finished 6 from post 5 TIW= 77
TIH= 77

7.5 66 RED ROBE R>S T>T 1st off 39 day layoff. Class -30 ERR © 68 1ERR © 75 8 7.0 9.0 0.8 ERR ERR ERR 78 90 54 68,0,0,0,0 39NA 0 48.9 74.4 1 0 8.00 171 AQU 8.5 S>M 0.0 110 94.9 168 222 Bmp brk;urge 4w into/ /
Finished 9 from post 8 TIW= 91 TJH= 91

7.5 2 2 CHARGE IT R>S T>T 1st off 59 day layoff. Class -25 ERR © 74 2 77 1 77 8 4.5 4.1 1.1 7.0 5.6 1.4 8 79 70 71,77,0,0,0 59 P 0 49.8 73.8 1 © 6.00 166 GPW 8.0 S>M 0.0 118 98.0 159 229 Stalkd;ins;3wd;flatnd/
Finished 4 from post 8 TIW= 71 TJH= 71 Stedy st;gain;evn fnsh/

7.5 4 4 INDICIA S>S D>T Flashed speed. *Stretch gain (.25). ERR © 65 2ERR © 82 78 5.4 4.6 1.2 ERR ERR ERR 84 77 80 68,62,0,0,0 17 P 4 23.5 47.6 1 © 8.00 166 GPW 6.0 S>M 25.0 110 98.4 161 241 Veer out st;3w; no bid/
Class -25 Finished 3 from post 6 TIW= 57 Bid 3path tn;clear shw/
TIH= 57

7.5 99 IT'S R>S D>T Class -30 Finished 6 from post 3 TJW= 54 ERR © 68 2 ERR © 71 76 6.2 5.2 1.2 ERR ERR ERR 75 81 56 60,76,0,0,0 17 NA 0 49.9 75.8 1 @ 5.00 169 (D 8.5 S>M 0.0 110 91.9 156 212 Broke slowly; improved/
TIH= 54 Slow start; moved up/

7.5 55 FILLY R>S D>T Uncharacteristic race? 1st off 31 day ERR © 68 2ERR © 72 78 7.9 5.8 1.4 ERR ERR ERR 92 94 67 71,64,0,0,0 31S 0 49.6 75.0 1 0 10.00 161 GPW 8.0 S>M 0.0 113 93.5 186 253 Stalkd;bid tn;insd str/
layoff. Class -15 Finished 2 from post 1 Stubborn to load/

TIW= 45 TIH= 45



DATE  TRK #

12/12/18 GP

DT PP PRG

10

13

11

12

HORSE

SOLARTE

FREUDEE

WISHFULLY

GRACIAS

RETHINKME

CAN YOU

PROUD

TRUE

NOT NICE

LIFE TIME

LOVE AND

BARBADOS

HAPPY

S>S

S>S

S>S

S>S

S>S

R>S

S>S

S>S

S>S

S>S

S>S

S$>S

D>T

T

T

T

T

T>

4

T

T>

4

T>

4

T

T

NOTES FROM LAST RACE

Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
4-hole. Class -35 Finished 1 from post
4 TIW= 51 TIH= 151

Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
1-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed?
WATCH! Clear early.lst off 73 day
layoff. Class 5 Finished 8 from post 1
TIW= 15 TIH= 24

Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
4-hole. Slow last race

(13) .Uncharacteristic early speed?
WATCH! 1st off 33 day layoff. Class 5
Finished 6 from post 4 TJW= 39 TJH= 53
Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
4-hole. Fast last race

(12) .Uncharacteristic early speed?
WATCH! Clear early.lst off 34 day
layoff. Class 10 Finished 1 from post 4
TIW= 25 TIH= 45

Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
4-hole. Class @ Finished 4 from post 4
TIW= 41 TIH= 54

Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
10-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed?
WATCH! 1st off 48 day layoff. Class 10
Finished 9 from post 10 TIW= 30 TJH= 35
Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
5-hole. Class 10 Finished 11 from post
5 TIW= 26 TIH= 35

Class -55 Finished 6 from post 1 TIW= 65
TIH= 90

Fast last race (18). 1st off 48 day
layoff. Class 10 Finished 1 from post 7
TIW= 74 TIH= 99

Slow last race (18). 1st off 55 day
layoff. Class -23 Finished 6 from post 6
TIW= 58 TIH= 80

*Stretch gain (.5). 1st off 56 day
layoff. Class -20 Finished 4 from post 6
TIW= 33 TIH= 50

Made big overall move (5). Fast last
race (11). Class © Finished 1 from post
5 TIW= 35 TIH= 46

Made big overall move (6). *Stretch gain
(4.75). 1st off 47 day layoff.2 races in
one pattern. Class 10 Finished 2 from
post 5 TIW= 40 TIH= 62

66

68

73

72

63

75

72

76

80

75

75

66

10

10

10

10

10

10

10

10

70

63

73

72

63

74

72

76

74

75

74

66

RT S1 S2 SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDONE TDTWO TDCLO P2F P4F PFN

83 4.5 8.3

60 3.8 6.8

-4 4.8 6.6

8 3.9 5.2

-4 3.8 4.2

84 5.7 5.5

-4 5.4 4.9

1.1

1.2

4.3

8.0

0.9

0.8

96

95

97

97

99

87

82

93

73

90

90

82

95

93

89

67

67

44

74

66

50

58

75

81

65

76

82

79

LAST FIVE
SPEED RATINGS
67,68,0,0,0

77,51,64,62,71

50,62,33,72,61

79,71,70,66,69

72,81,62,68,38

58,64,64,52,69

67,46,72,81,79

67,77,64,76,74

83,74,60,69,25

54,82,68,75,70

75,70,82,85,73

80,76,74,75,75

70,67,57,67,67

DSLR

73

33

34

27

48

17

25

48

55

56

27

47

BRIS P CALL1 CALL2 MEDS EQUIP MLINE

E 22.3 46.8 12.00
E 24.1 48.8 30.00
E/P 22.7 47.1 20.00
E 21.9 45.9 5.00
E/P 22.3 47.5 20.00
P 21.7 46.8 30.00
E/P 49.9 75.5 20.00
E/P 23.7 47.4 10.00
P 22.1 45.8 6.00
E/P 24.5 49.4 3.50
E/P 22.3 45.7 4.00
S 22.9 47.4 8.00
E/P 23.1 47.7 15.00

128

128

142

120

120

124

130

114

184

150

141

131

TRK DIS

GP

GPW

GPW

GPW

GPW

GPW

GPW

GPW

GPW

GPW

GPW

7.5

6.0

5.0

5.0

5.0

CHNG SPPNT
A>C 14.6
C 7.3
oC 14.6
oC 17.1
oC 14.6
oC 7.3
oC 4.9
AO>C  12.2
C 4.9
oC 0.0
Co>C 0.0
oC 2.4
oC 0.0

PWR COMB

87 86.0

9 85.0

109

100.2

110 95.5

82 86.9

93 84.4

112 97.8

119

106.1

111 94.0

107

101.0

117

103.6

98 96.6

ERLY TOTL
PACE PACE

TOTL

191

188

97

97

99

176

82

93

140

90

90

82

LAS

23

17

16

14

23,

15

17

20

16

17

16

T

2

s

3

9

4

7

4

v

6

2

-

COMMENTS

Pace outside; led 2x/
Pace;determined effort/

Pace;duel;faded 1/8p/
Hustle up;lack speed/
Stalkd;insde bid;empty

Vied backstr;faded/ Vied
turn;faded/ Stalkd;quik
retreated

Pressurd pace;drvg fin/
Set pace;sharp & clear/
Bumpd start;chase pace

In range;5wd str;flatn/
Cleared 3/8p;pull away/
Led til 3/16p;gaveway
Duel 2wd;fade stretch/
Wide uppr;no threat/ Rail
bid;firm for shw

Press pace;duel turn/
Failed to respond/ In
contention;4wd

2-3wd; no menace/ Edg
closer 1/4;kik clr/ Lost
kick leaving turn

2nd flight;bid 2pth/
Rail;wait tn;riddn out/
In range;flatend out

3w 1/2;6w late;empty/
3w;up late;held firm/ 3w
1st turn; weakened

Ins tn;shift out;evnly/
Lack speed;widest str/
Very wide into stretch
Off pace;outsde;rally/
3wd bid 1/4p; wknd/ 2wd
bid str;good finsh

Last flight;wide gain/
Rail tn;2wd 1/8p;evnly/
Outside bid;no avail



DATE  TRK #

12/12/18 GP

DT PP PRG  HORSE

12

13

10

11

8  ONTHEWAYTO

2 ARMY SCOuT

3 ROCHAMBEAU

1  WACKY PAL

12 IMPUNITY

13 CASH ON

9  HONEY

10 KING LEO

6  DR. ALLDAY

7 JUSTCALLME

5 MACHO
11 HE'S NO
4 FRONT RUN

0>S

0>S

0>S

R>S

S$>S

R>S

S>S

S>S

S>S

R>S

R>S

S>S

D>T

>T

>T

>T

D>T

D>

4

T>

4

T

D>T

T>

4

T

T

T>

4

NOTES FROM LAST RACE

Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
7-hole. 1st off 250 day layoff. Class ©
Finished 2 from post 7 TJW= 88 TJH= 88
1st off 737040 day layoff. FTS. Class
ILR Finished © from post © TIW= 87 TJH=
87

1st off 737040 day layoff. FTS. Class
ILR Finished © from post © TIW= 29 TJH=
29

1st off 737040 day layoff. FTS. Class
ILR Finished © from post © TIW= 42 TJH=
42

Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
7-hole. Clear early.lst off 62 day
layoff. Class 25 Finished 2 from post 7
TIW= 60 TIH= 60

Slow last race (17). 1st off 53 day
layoff. Class @ Finished 5 from post 4
TIW= 40 TIH= 40

Fast last race (13). 1st off 109 day
layoff. Class -10 Finished 6 from post 1
TIW= 60 TIH= 60

Made big overall move (3). *Stretch gain
(.75). 1st off 45 day layoff. Class @
Finished 3 from post 1 TIW= 42 TJH= 42
1st off 46 day layoff. Class 10 Finished
11 from post 10 TIW= 74 TIH= 74

Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
9-hole. 1st off 40 day layoff. Class -5
Finished 4 from post 9 TIW= 74 TJH= 74
Chased Pace. Made big overall move (3).
*Stretch gain (1.37).BTL horse. 1st off
46 day layoff. Class @ Finished 3 from
post 9 TIW= 71 TIH= 71

Made big overall move (4). *Stretch gain
(.75). 1st off 68 day layoff. Class @
Finished 5 from post 10 TIW= 68 TJH= 68
Made big overall move (4). *Stretch gain
(2.75).BTL horse. 1st off 4@ day layoff.
Class -5 Finished 2 from post 5 TIW= 93
TIH= 93

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

76

67

63

64

40

79

75

78

82

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

70

ERR

78

70

ERR

83

RT S1 S2 SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDONE TDTWO TDCLO P2F P4F PFN

8.00 167 KEE 4.5

85

59

89

59

84

93

100

89

ERR

ERR

ERR

1.3

3.7

5.0

4.3

6.4

3.9

4.4

7.5

6.1

ERR

ERR

ERR

2.5

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

4.0

ERR

ERR

5.0

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

3.0

ERR

ERR

2.0

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

1.3

ERR

ERR

2.5

90

88

85

90

80

93

88

75

86

87

87

86

79

91

82

77

86

82

76

41

65

71

33

79

84

85

90

LAST FIVE

SPEED RATINGS

89,0,0,0,0

0,0,0,0,0

0,0,0,0,0

0,0,0,0,0

76,0,0,0,0

50,80,71,0,0

76,49,0,0,0

70,62,60,62,0

40,0,0,0,0

78,87,71,0,0

78,77,70,0,0

78,0,0,0,0

83,80,0,0,0

*okskok

sokskok

sokskok

62

53

109

45

46

46

68

BRIS P CALL1 CALL2 MEDS EQUIP MLINE CLS TRK DIS

NA

NA

47.

23.

48.

22.

23.

22.

49.

50.

23.

73.5

50.8

72.4

46.2

50.6

45.9

75.1

76.7

45.9

BOFF

u

20.

20.

15.

20.

12.

20.

15.

10.

12.

.00

00

00

00

00

00

00

00

.00

00

00

.80

ERR

142

169

177

162

157

174

155

167

172

0.0

BEL 8.0

GPW 7.0

SAR 8.5

GPW 5.0

GPW 7.0

AQU 6.0

GPW 8.0

KEE 8.5

AQU 6.0

ERLY
PACE

CHNG SPPNT PWR COMB TOTL

S$>S

>S

>S

M>S

S$>S

S$>S

S>S

S>S

S>S

S$>S

S$>S

42.9 133 107.1

21.4

120

108

108

109

105

124

124

116

132

ERR

ERR

99.0

9%0.7

96.8

96.8

87.3

101.8

98.8

97.7

107.1

177

175

171

90

159

184

170

152

172

TOTL
PACE
LAST

253

216

23

)

161

192

263

254

237

262

COMMENTS
Speed 3w; gave in/ /
/7
!/
/7

~

Vied betw 2p; 2nd best/

3wd; dropped far back/
Stedy urgin;nip for 2n/
Push out st;wkn;regain
Pocket;ask priorl/4/
Brushed gate; tired/

Step slw st;even finsh/
3wd tn;no late respnse/
In range;fade pastl/8
Broke in;bump start/ /

Cut corner; kept on/
Ins;slip out /8;4w upr/
3w 1st turn; weakened
Duel late btw;just mis/
Drvg 3wd;solid effort/
Perked up nearing wire

Slow start; mild gain/ /

Bumped st; gd energy/ Off
1/2 slow;2w;4p upr/



DATE  TRK #

12/12/18 GP

DATE  TRK #

12/12/18 GP

DT

PP

10

10

HORSE SRR
AT 0ODDS R>S
CITY ROC  S>S
FRENCHMEN  S>S
TREV S>S
VINO S>S
STARSHIP  S>S
AMELIA'S  S>S
BLACK S>S
HARRY'S S>S
KANTHAROS* S>S

HORSE SRR
ROSEDALE  R>S
CELEBRATEM S>S
CRUMB BUN S>S
MIDTOWN S$>S
A BIT OF S>S
JELTRIN S$>S
ARTS AND  S>S
CREEDIBILI S>S

T>

4

D>T

D>T

D>T

T

D>T

T>

4

D>

4

D>D

D>D

D>D

D>D

D>l

o

NOTES FROM LAST RACE

Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH! 1st
off 257 day layoff. Class -4 Finished 6
from post 3 TIW= 83 TJH= 116

Flashed speed. 1st off 47 day layoff.
Class @ Finished 7 from post 8 TIW= 40
TIH= 54

Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
9-hole.BTL horse. 1st off 47 day layoff.
Class @ Finished 4 from post 9 TIW= 60
TIH= 68

Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
3-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed?
WATCH! Clear early.lst off 81 day
layoff. Class @ Finished 1 from post 3
TIW= 61 TIH= 90

Flashed speed. 1st off 115 day layoff.
Class @ Finished 4 from post 3 TIW= 67
TIH= 84

Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
6-hole. Slow last race (11). 1st off 42
day layoff. Class @ Finished 4 from post
6 TIW= 61 TIH= 84

Flashed speed. *Stretch gain (2).BTL
horse. 1st off 47 day layoff. Class ©
Finished 2 from post 1 TJW= 77 TJH= 100
Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
5-hole. 1st off 40 day layoff. Class ©
Finished 3 from post 5 TIW= 57 TJH= 77
Made big overall move (6). *Stretch gain
(4.25).BTL horse. 1st off 47 day layoff.
Class @ Finished 3 from post 2 TIW= 49
TIH= 67

Class @ Finished 6 from post 4 TIW= 65
TJH= 86

78

80

85

79

86

82

ERR

82

81

ASP
NOTES FROM LAST RACE 110
Flashed speed. Slow last race (13). 1st ERR
off 74 day layoff. Class -25 Finished 10
from post 6 TIW= 46 TIH= 79
Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
2-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed?
WATCH! Clear early. Class 40 Finished 1
from post 2 TIW= 48 TJH= 98
Chased Pace. *Stretch gain (.5). 1st off
32 day layoff.2 races in one pattern.
Class -25 Finished 4 from post 5 TIW= 40
TJH= 53
Flashed
4-hole.
layoff.
TIW= 54
Flashed
1-hole. Clear
layoff. Class
TIW= 103 TIH= 203
Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
4-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed?
WATCH! Clear early.lst off 48 day
layoff. Class 40 Finished 1 from post 4
TIW= 72 TIH= 122
*Stretch gain (3). 1st off 69 day
layoff. Class 25 Finished 3 from post 6
TIW= 48 TIH= 81
Made big overall move (3). 1st off 46
day layoff. Class @ Finished 2 from post
6 TIW= 71 TIH= 91

70

76

speed. *Pressed Pace from 77
Clear early.1lst off 33 day

Class 25 Finished 1 from post 4
TIH= 94
speed. *Pressed Pace from 95
early.1st off 75 day

49 Finished 1 from post 1

77

73

77

66

80

87

71

85

82

75

82

77

68

74

77

95

77

69

71

10

10

10

10

10

10

10

78

79

85

79

86

82

ERR

82

81

68

74

79

95

77

69

72

RT S1 S2 SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDONE TDTWO TDCLO P2F P4F PFN

10

10

85

87

93

85

89

85

90

83

87

87

84

9%

93

87

79

84

84

79

75

78

76

74

78

83

80

81

SYS1 SYS2

2.7 3.3

3.6 3.8

3.3 3.3

1.1 1.1

2.0 2.0

7.6 4.2

0.9

1.0

1.5

CLOSE

1.8

2.8

6.0

ERR

TDONE

3.4

4.1

3.6

6.7

3.1

5.3

ERR

TDTWO

0.8

1.1

1.2

1.0

1.1

1.1

ERR

1.3

95

95

93

94

92

93

94

82

87

93

91

95

96

96

75

94

98

85

99

87

86

9%

94

104

93

89

71

76

86

83

72

82

75

91

80

75

78

79

87

81

80

74

LAST FIVE
SPEED RATINGS

72,87,84,0,0 257
75,77,87,74,57 47
80,84,86,84,79 a7
89,93,84,88,103 81
75,79,79,66,48 115
74,80,93,91,88 42
83,76,83,84,82 47
81,81,64,72,78 40
82,80,80,71,99 a7
76,79,80,85,65 19
LAST FIVE

SPEED RATINGS DSLR
58,78,77,0,0 74
70,66,0,0,0 27
78,85,76,76,65 32
81,69,70,81,82 33
95,0,0,0,0 75
83,71,0,0,0 48
63,78,67,0,0 69
73,81,65,65,70 46

22.5

22.1

22.6

23.1

22.9

22.5

22.5

22.9

23.2

22.5

23.0

22.3

22.6

23.0

24.4

23.0

45.9

45.9

45.5

46.5

47.5

46.3

46.3

46.9

46.9

CALL2

46.6

47.6

46.0

45.4

46.5

48.4

47.9

MEDS

EQUIP

DSLR BRIS P CALL1 CALL2 MEDS EQUIP MLINE

20.00

12.00

10.00

20.00

20.00

1.00

10.00

6.00

5.00

138

168

153

186

187

177

166

165

153

159

141

143

178

TRK DIS

GPW

GPW

GP

MTH

GPW

GPW

GPW

GPW

GPW

5.0

5.0

6.0

5.5

5.0

5.0

6.0

5.0

6.0

TRK DIS

GPW

GPW

GPW

GP

GPW

GPW

6.0

6.5

6.0

6.0

6.5

5.0

6.0

CHNG  SPPNT
AO>A 6.7
AO>A  15.6
AO>A  13.3
AO>A  17.8
AO>A 4.4
AO>A  15.6
AO>A 8.9
AO>A  11.1
AO>A 2.2
AO>A 4.4
CHNG  SPPNT
N>A 9.1
M>A 18.2
N>A 3.0
CO>A  12.1
M>A 18.2
M>A 18.2
Co>A  12.1
AO>A 9.1

113

120

125

111

130

124

129

127

122

116

126

126

132

126

113

ERLY
PACE
COMB  TOTL

101.4 167
99.4 95

102.9 95

106.6 191

99.9 179

l1e1.0 92

106.4 93

100.8 193

105.2 82

98.6 174

ERLY
PACE
COMB  TOTL

88.9 166

98.3 179

97.4 181

96.7 189

105.0 200

101.3 189

95.8 75

97.9 183

TOTL

PACE

LAST

166

17

s

277

262

16:

»

175

26

[+

173

254

254

259

268

287

270

155

257

COMMENTS

Stalk;gain far trn;wkn/
Dug in late; driving/
Step slw;wide into str
Vied inside;tired/
Chased;inside;2wd/ Vied
mid-str;edged awy

Duel 1/8p;led;outkickd/
Outsde str;evenly/
Eager;strong on top

Pace;slim lead;firm/ Hop
st; rush up; drvg/
Duel;ins;kpt onl/8;wkn

Between; steady 7/16/
Bumped start; no rally/
Set pace; weakened

Duel 3wl/4p;wknd/ Stumble
st;led late/ Duel;drft
out;kept on

Wide;up late;caught/ Bid
turn;even finish/ Rally
btwn; got nod

Vied 1/4p;2-3wd str/ Vied
turn;drv;2p;clear/
Stalkd;faded far turn
Very wide;rallied late/
Rate;5wd bid upr;wider/
Carried widr;lack kick

Insde tn;angl out upr/
Duel btw 1/16p;gavewy/
4-5wd;edgd for show

COMMENTS

In range;rail;retreat/
Pace;pressurd;wkn late/
Bid tn;wider;up late
Vie ins;shook free upr/
Broke inj;chase;evn out/

In range;bid 3/8;flatn/
Lead mid-tn;riden out/
2-3w;clear 2nd best

Duel;edg awy;held safe/
Hustled insde;2wd str/
Duel;no match late

Rail;clearly best/ /

Pace;ins;2wd;pull away/
3wd; lack needed kick/

3-4wd str;up show/
Pressurd pace;pull awy/
Chased pace;weaknd
4-5wd trip; willing/
Prompted; 2nd best/ 7wd
1/4;by-faders



DATE  TRK #

12/12/18 GP 10

DT PP

ZAMAN

WATCH YOUR

ZALZA

KARAS

BELLAMY

DEWEYCHEAT

GEM JUAN

PERFECT

BRUNO NOSE

TREASURE

EL PLAYON

S>R

R>R

S>R

S>R

S>R

S>R

S>R

R>R

R>R

R>R

S>R

™D

D>D

D>l

o

D>D

>l

o

D>D

D>l

o

D>D

D>D

D>l

o

D>D

ASP
NOTES FROM LAST RACE 110
1st off 737040 day layoff. FTS. Class ERR
ILR Finished @ from post @ TIW= 56 TJH=
56
Made big overall move (8). Very strong ERR
move! Take note! 1st off 56 day layoff.

Class -15 Finished @ from post 2 TIW= 69
TIH= 69

Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 57
5-hole. Fast last race

(23).Uncharacteristic early speed?

WATCH! Class @ Finished 3 from post 5

TIW= 53 TIH= 53

Flashed speed. Class -5 Finished 3 from ERR
post 8 TIW= 74 TIH= 74

Made big overall move (4). *Stretch
(4). Fast last race (14).BTL horse.
Class @ Finished 4 from post 8 TIW= 32
TIH= 32

1st off 47 day layoff. Class -10
Finished 8 from post 8 TJW= 30 TJH= 30
*Stretch gain (1.25). Class -5 Finished ERR
12 from post 5 TIW= 54 TIH= 54

Middle move (6). Fast last race (18).
Class -15 Finished 3 from post 8 TIW= 9
TIH= 9

Class @ Finished 4 from post 3 TIW= 97 60
TIH= 97

gain ERR

ERR

ERR

Made big overall move (4). Class @ 44
Finished 5 from post 9 TIW= 30 TJH= 30
Chased Pace. Class @ Finished 2 from 57
post 8 TIW= 13 TIH= 13

Class -5 Finished 5 from post 5 TIW= 42 ERR
TIH= 42

ERR

34

61

55

42

53

55

60

58

60

10 ERR

1 44

2 ERR

RT S1 S2 SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDONE TDTWO TDCLO P2F P4F PFN

62

68

73

87

81

81

73

72

70

76

ERR

5.

10.

2

2]

ERR

10.0

1.0

1.0

ERR

2.2

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

5.6

7.8

3.3

ERR

ERR

3.3

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

5.0

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

92

94

74

73

77

89

75

58

84

81

87

96

65

64

79

76

59

82

81

52

62

94

59

77

85

61

60

5!

Ul

70

LAST FIVE
SPEED RATINGS

57,31,15,0,0

68,53,62,0,0

69,51,68,52,54

42,0,0,0,0

53,0,0,0,0

73,67,68,70,63

55,65,59,0,0

44,0,0,0,0

57,81,62,42,46

62,57,0,0,0

DSLR

56

28

10

18

47

24

25

28

28

28

10

BRIS P CALL1 CALL2 MEDS EQUIP MLINE

NA Q. 0.0 0 10.00
NA 30. 55.2 BON 12.00
E 49.3 75.7 0 6.00
P 23.1 47.3 0 2.00
S 24.9 48.4 0 15.00
NA 24.6 49.1 0 20.00
NA 24.6 49.5 0 15.00
E/P 23.4 46.4 0 5.00
NA 50.5 76.9 BON 15.00
NA 52.1 77.7 0 20.00
P 49.5 75.7 0 8.00
NA 24.5 48.4 0 15.00

115

142

115

117

112

117

115

107

119

110

TRK DIS

GPW

GPW

GP

GPW

GPW

(@]

GPW

GPW

GPW

GPW

GP

7.5

8.0

6.0

6.0

5.0

6.0

6.0

8.0

8.0

8.0

6.0

CHNG SPPNT PWR COMB TOTL

M>M

M>M

M>M

M>M

M>M

M>M

M>M

M>M

M>M

M>M

M>M

3.8

23.1

19.2

3.8

3.8

19.2

3.8

11.5

3.8

99

113

100

90

95

111

105

93

108

101

90.4

86.9

94.9

91.7

90.3

90.1

93.6

89.8

84.5

91.5

92.1

179

190

139

73

141

168

151

117

166

162

ERLY TOTL
PACE PACE

LAST

()

23

e

252

23

w

132

218

253

21

N

177

22

[t

232

COMMENTS

Bump rail 1st;ease up/ /

Pressurd;lost lead tn/
Chase pace;retreated/
Bumped start;no bid

Trackd;3wd tn;flatnd/ In
range;weakened/ Bruushed
st;no rally

Drft out;surge to wire/

Bump st;3wd; no factor/
Steadied 5/8;no threat

Insde urging uppr/ /
Steadied nearing 5/16/ /

Ins;up clse 1/8;kpt on/
Insde bid tn;3wd str/
Track insde;3wd bid

2wd 1/4p;drft out str/
Bump st;bid tn;no gain/
Saved ground;wide bid
Pass tiring foes/ /

Rated;3wd 1/4p;kept on/
Wait 1/4p;2-3wd bid/
Insde;wait turn;gain
Lack speed;4wd str/ In
turn; mild response/



