

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	CLASS	SRR	SUR	ASP		ASP		SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	P2F	P4F	PFN	LAST THREE		SECND	RTTL	TOTL			TOTALS	LAST RACE COMMENT		
									110	SPD	R#	TDS							AVG	MLINE			CALL	LAST	BEST ALL			BEST LAST	
1/20/19	AQU	1	9.0	3	4	CLASSIC	-40	S>R	D>D	ERR	73	2	ERR	10.0	7.9	1.27	73	78	91	73	1.40	58.0	242	242	421	420	841	Chased 3-4w; improved	
			9.0	2	3	BRAZEN	2	R>R	D>D	ERR	67	3	74	7.3	5.5	1.33	82	81	83	67	8.00	48.3	318	246	381	406	787	6-7w upper; kept on	
			9.0	9	8	LONE	-8	S>R	D>D	ERR	66	3	57	5.2	5.7	0.92	86	91	57	66	4.00	53.8	234	234	388	382	770	Bobble brk;2w on turn	
			9.0	4	5	MIDNIGHT	2	R>R	D>D	ERR	63	3	76	6.3	5.8	1.09	86	86	78	63	3.00	49.0	329	250	383	409	792	4w upper; fought on	
			9.0	1	2	MID DAY	2	R>R	D>D	ERR	60	4	58	4.4	7.2	0.62	86	87	75	63	6.00	48.8	328	248	371	406	777	2-3w upper; battled on	
			9.0	8	1A	BRIDGETOTH	-38	R>R	D>D	ERR	61	57	8	53	6.8	8.3	0.82	76	69	68	53	15.00	47.2	270	213	367	331	698	Mostly 3w turn;ask3/8
			9.0	5	6	AMERICAN	2	R>R	D>D	ERR	55	1	55	7.1	7.1	1.00	62	52	81	55	30.00	48.5	237	195	346	332	679	4w upper; improved	
			9.0	6	7	BUMPERDOO	2	R>R	D>D	ERR	51	50	3	51	9.0	9.3	0.96	75	65	51	50	15.00	50.5	251	191	342	314	656	Through after half
			9.0	7	1	TIO BLAS	ILR	0>R	>D	ERR	ERR	0	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR				ERR	15.00	ERR	0	0	ERR	ERR	ERR	

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	CLASS	SRR	SUR	ASP		ASP		SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	P2F	P4F	PFN	LAST THREE		SECND	RTTL	TOTL			TOTALS	LAST RACE COMMENT	
									110	SPD	R#	TDS							AVG	MLINE			CALL	LAST	BEST ALL			BEST LAST
1/20/19	AQU	2	8.0	2	2	PRETTY	29	R>R	D>D	82	80	10	82	5.8	4.2	1.40	71	67	98	82	1.80	54.6	305	236	439	440	879	4w;alter out 3/16;game
			8.0	7	7	BEYOND	4	R>R	D>D	79	79	10	79	6.0	5.7	1.06	83	87	73	78	3.00	51.5	335	243	442	443	885	3w 1st;ask5/16;4w upr
			8.0	6	6	ARCHUMYBAB	65	S>R	D>D	75	79	10	75	4.5	4.7	0.96	91	92	79	80	5.00	55.4	262	262	439	452	890	3w upper; inched away
			8.0	4	4	THAT'S	4	R>R	D>D	85	77	7	82	8.2	4.9	1.67	73	76	76	80	4.00	51.9	304	225	432	420	852	3-4w 6F;to 7p by upper
			8.0	1	1	ELEGANT	4	R>R	D>D	80	76	10	79	5.1	4.2	1.23	88	93	60	79	6.00	49.8	336	241	425	430	854	Pace inside; gave way
			8.0	3	3	PEACHES	-1	R>R	D>D	75	74	10	75	8.2	7.0	1.16	77	73	87	75	8.00	50.4	313	237	430	416	846	Cut corner; no impact
			8.0	5	5	MAZMANIA	69	R>R	D>D	71	71	10	71	5.7	5.3	1.07	74	76	75	73	15.00	49.9	300	225	393	400	793	Ins 6F;3w upr;resolute

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	CLASS	SRR	SUR	ASP		ASP		SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	P2F	P4F	PFN	LAST THREE		SECND	RTTL	TOTL			TOTALS	LAST RACE COMMENT		
									110	SPD	R#	TDS							AVG	MLINE			CALL	LAST	BEST ALL			BEST LAST	
1/20/19	AQU	3	5.5	1	1	STIRRED	-38	S>S	D>D	70	70	1	70	7.1	7.1	1.00	98	85	76	70	8.00	51.2	259	259	555	541	1096	Broke in st; tired	
			5.5	7	7	BEL CUORE	2	S>S	D>D	65	65	3	65	1.9	4.1	0.46	92	87	68	65	3.50	52.8	247	247	516	515	1031	Pace 2w;caught fin 70	
			5.5	4	4	D'S SIS	-13	S>S	D>D	64	64	4	64	2.8	5.1	0.55	92	80	72	68	3.00	52.0	244	244	530	506	1036	Chased 3-4w; weakened	
			5.5	9	9	IRISH	-15	S>S	D>D	63	57	4	57	7.0	8.2	0.85	79	77	79	55	12.00	52.8	235	235	508	515	1023	Chased 6-5w; weakened	
			5.5	2	2	BIG BROWN	0	S>S	D>D	45	46	5	45	3.6	8.0	0.44	94	88	65	54	8.00	52.6	247	247	458	493	950	Brsh brk;gap duel 2w	
			5.5	6	6	T J'S ROSE	0	S>S	D>D	41	41	2	41	7.8	10.0	0.78	80	70	68	41	20.00	52.4	218	218	433	430	863	Loose pocket;ask 3/8	
			5.5	5	5	FOURNINETE	ILR	0>S	>D	ERR	ERR	0	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR				ERR	4.00	ERR	0	0	ERR	ERR	ERR	
			5.5	3	3	BOOSTED	ILR	0>S	>D	ERR	ERR	0	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR				ERR	10.00	ERR	0	0	ERR	ERR	ERR	
			5.5	8	8	GEMINI	ILR	0>S	>D	ERR	ERR	0	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR				ERR	4.50	ERR	0	0	ERR	ERR	ERR	

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	CLASS	SRR	SUR	ASP		ASP		SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	P2F	P4F	PFN	LAST THREE		SECND	RTTL	TOTL		TOTALS	LAST RACE COMMENT		
									110	SPD	R#	TDS							AVG	MLINE			CALL	PACE			BEST ALL	BEST LAST
1/20/19	AQU	4	6.0	2	2	CREA'S	-21	S>S	D>D	88	84	9	88	7.0	5.1	1.38	83	95	96	92	1.60	56.2	274	274	438	460	898	2-3w;stdied 6p 3/16pl
			6.0	3	3	CALIFORNIA	-4	S>S	D>D	85	83	8	84	4.7	5.8	0.81	89	94	73	83	5.00	54.9	256	256	440	407	848	Hustled early;overland
			6.0	6	6	WUSHU	19	S>S	D>D	83	83	10	83	3.5	4.3	0.82	94	100	79	81	4.00	55.0	273	273	430	439	869	2-3w upper; caught
			6.0	1	1	DEVINE	34	S>S	D>D	80	81	10	81	5.3	5.4	0.97	87	91	85	74	10.00	55.1	263	263	433	426	859	5w uppr; flattened out
			6.0	4	4	BOOTLEGGER	-41	R>S	T>D	ERR	80	9	ERR	4.0	5.5	0.72	85	80	79	83	6.00	52.8	331	244	435	414	849	Spurred 2-3w; wknd lte
			6.0	5	5	VICAR'S	-40	S>S	D>D	73	75	10	76	8.1	5.9	1.37	84	97	83	90	8.00	55.0	264	264	411	433	844	Bumped st; no response
			6.0	7	7	MAD MUNNYS	1	S>S	D>D	66	71	10	67	4.7	4.9	0.95	98	100	70	77	4.50	54.0	268	268	412	422	834	Hustled;3w & btwn half

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	CLASS	SRR	SUR	ASP		ASP		SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	P2F	P4F	PFN	LAST THREE		SECND	RTTL	TOTL		TOTALS	LAST RACE COMMENT				
									110	SPD	R#	TDS							AVG	MLINE			CALL	PACE			BEST ALL	BEST LAST		
1/20/19	AQU	5	7.0	6	6	THE BIG	2	S>S	D>D	91	91	1	91	2.7	1.8	1.50	92	100	85	91	2.50	54.9	277	277	478	492	969	4w uppr; second best		
			7.0	3	3	PAPA JIM	25	S>S	D>D	ERR	86	1	86	5.7	2.9	2.00	92	91	89	86	3.50	53.5	272	272	455	478	934	7w upper; ran on		
			7.0	1	1	PIER FORTY	2	R>S	D>D	76	72	6	76	4.5	4.7	0.96	82	87	74	77	6.00	48.3	323	243	429	430	859	Brsh start;4w;held off		
			7.0	7	7	LONDON	2	S>S	D>D	ERR	70	2	70	4.4	5.6	0.80	90	92	80	70	6.00	54.9	262	262	430	456	886	5w upper; mild kick		
			7.0	4	4	VENTUS	2	S>S	D>D	ERR	70	1	70	7.5	6.3	1.20	89	77	85	70	20.00	53.4	251	251	425	427	852	7w upper; improved		
			7.0	9	9	BEBE	2	R>S	D>D	72	67	3	64	4.6	5.0	0.93	88	92	70	67	15.00	47.8	331	250	420	424	845	Vie ins;ease back 1/2		
			7.0	5	5	TICKED ALL	2	S>S	D>D	37	49	2	49	8.6	8.6	1.00	82	68	48	49	30.00	52.9	198	198	362	292	654	Chased 4-5w; no impact		
			7.0	2	2	CLEVER	ILR	0>S	>D	ERR	ERR	0	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	3.00	ERR	0	0	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR
			7.0	8	8	JUDGE	ILR	0>S	>D	ERR	ERR	0	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	8.00	ERR	0	0	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	CLASS	SRR	SUR	ASP		ASP		SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	P2F	P4F	PFN	LAST THREE		SECND	RTTL	TOTL		TOTALS	LAST RACE COMMENT		
									110	SPD	R#	TDS							AVG	MLINE			CALL	PACE			BEST ALL	BEST LAST
1/20/19	AQU	6	6.0	3	3	MA	-28	S>S	D>D	73	73	7	73	4.1	5.5	0.74	90	87	72	68	6.00	53.1	249	249	402	375	777	2-3w;6w into upr;tired
			6.0	5	5	INFATUATIO	17	S>S	D>D	72	72	1	72	3.3	1.7	2.00	92	90	73	72	4.00	53.8	255	255	372	386	758	Pressed 2w;held late
			6.0	6	6	SARATOGA	-9	S>S	D>D	71	71	3	71	7.7	4.5	1.70	86	88	80	71	4.50	55.5	254	254	374	390	763	Ins half;6p;late foot
			6.0	7	7	MRS. CREWS	-53	S>S	D>D	80	69	6	80	4.6	4.6	1.00	101	98	67	55	2.00	51.7	266	266	392	397	789	Inside trip; faltered
			6.0	4	4	MIMIC	17	S>S	D>D	64	64	5	64	4.9	5.1	0.96	94	91	84	66	8.00	51.7	269	269	365	408	773	3-2w upper; went clear
			6.0	2	2	JAZZY J	-9	S>S	D>D	65	62	9	66	5.3	7.2	0.73	97	100	50	61	15.00	53.3	247	247	376	364	740	3w vs duo half;ask5/16
			6.0	1	1	WAVING	-28	S>S	D>D	62	62	3	62	7.8	7.0	1.13	81	75	57	62	5.00	51.3	213	213	364	305	669	Bump start;3w;trailed
			6.0	8	8	WILD TYPE	17	S>S	D>D	56	59	6	59	5.1	4.3	1.18	96	87	69	48	12.00	52.0	252	252	355	376	731	4w uppr; inched away

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	CLASS	SRR	SUR	ASP		ASP		SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	P2F	P4F	PFN	LAST THREE		SECND	RTTL	TOTL			TOTALS	LAST RACE COMMENT	
									110	SPD	R#	TDS							AVG	MLINE			CALL	LAST	BEST ALL			BEST LAST
1/20/19	AQU	7	9.0	7	7	FOREVER	4	R>R	D>D	87	88	10	88	4.3	4.5	0.97	84	89	94	92	3.50	52.6	352	267	439	442	880	Checked 1/16
			9.0	5	5	SARA	29	R>R	D>D	91	88	6	91	2.7	3.4	0.79	86	89	86	92	1.40	52.4	362	261	437	448	885	Fog; 5w1/4; inched clr
			9.0	2	2	CRIMSON	20	S>R	D>D	79	86	10	86	6.3	4.7	1.32	81	85	90	87	4.50	54.8	256	256	431	423	854	To rail 1/2;6p1/8;mild
			9.0	4	4	TOTAL	4	R>R	D>D	89	86	10	88	4.1	3.0	1.37	86	93	89	90	4.00	51.8	359	268	431	447	878	Carried out 1/16;game
			9.0	6	6	ENTHRALL	0	R>R	D>D	85	83	10	81	5.7	5.2	1.10	76	77	87	79	15.00	52.2	321	240	416	413	829	In close st;willng ins
			9.0	3	3	SEXY	4	R>R	D>D	ERR	82	2	83	4.2	5.0	0.83	86	89	78	82	10.00	51.7	345	253	431	423	854	3w vs duo 6F;won place
			9.0	1	1	MATTY'S	6	R>R	D>D	88	82	10	85	8.3	3.9	2.13	68	68	95	85	8.00	53.9	301	231	415	404	819	2w;ask trn;to rail3/16

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	CLASS	SRR	SUR	ASP		ASP		SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	P2F	P4F	PFN	LAST THREE		SECND	RTTL	TOTL			TOTALS	LAST RACE COMMENT	
									110	SPD	R#	TDS							AVG	MLINE			CALL	LAST	BEST ALL			BEST LAST
1/20/19	AQU	8	5.5	1	1	MIDNITESAL	0	S>S	D>D	74	74	6	74	2.5	4.2	0.59	94	88	67	73	1.60	54.2	249	249	395	442	837	In hand 2p; succumbed
			5.5	9	9	EVAN'S	-38	S>S	D>D	74	71	4	73	4.4	4.6	0.95	96	102	58	70	2.50	55.1	256	256	386	453	839	5w uppr; lug in 1/8p
			5.5	8	8	ANNETTE'S	0	S>S	D>D	67	67	4	67	1.8	4.2	0.44	94	89	69	70	3.00	53.1	252	252	368	436	804	Duel rail;weary late
			5.5	4	4	JOANSBURNT	2	S>S	D>D	65	65	2	65	1.3	4.0	0.33	99	92		31	12.00	47.6	191	191	324	82	405	Fog;2w;ask on turn
			5.5	3	3	CARALICIOU	0	S>S	D>D	57	57	8	44	6.6	6.2	1.07	75	72	82	58	10.00	53.6	229	229	341	408	749	Ins 1/2-5/16;4w upper
			5.5	7	7	MATS	2	S>S	D>D	54	54	1	54	10.0	10.0	1.00	89	60	3	26	30.00	49.9	152	152	320	168	488	Bmp btwn start;3w
			5.5	6	6	I TOOK A	0	S>S	D>D	34	47	2	47	4.4	8.1	0.54	92	87	58	47	12.00	54.2	237	237	314	397	711	Prompted 3w; tired
			5.5	2	2	MINIT MAUS	2	S>S	D>D	35	35	3	35	7.9	9.0	0.88	90	81	42	35	30.00	50.8	213	213	278	318	596	Brsh brk;vie 3w;tired
			5.5	5	5	TODDLE	-13	S>S	D>D	33	33	1	33	10.0	9.0	1.11	79	63	53	33	15.00	51.7	195	195	274	297	571	4w upper; no impact

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	CLASS	SRR	SUR	ASP		ASP		SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	P2F	P4F	PFN	LAST THREE		SECND	RTTL	TOTL			TOTALS	LAST RACE COMMENT			
									110	SPD	R#	TDS							AVG	MLINE			CALL	LAST	BEST ALL			BEST LAST		
1/20/19	GP	1	6.0	5	5	MONEY COME	-8	S>S	T>D	74	69	5	68	3.8	3.8	1.00	90		75	70	2.50	60.9	165	165	652	611	1263	Bump st;ins 1/4;3wd		
			6.0	4	4	BANK NOTE	-18	S>S	D>D	62	62	3	62	5.8	6.3	0.93	83	79	65	62	20.00	54.3	227	227	600	587	1187	Dropped back early		
			6.0	2	2	CAGLIARI	7	S>S	D>D	62	62	1	62	2.5	5.0	0.50	93	87	64	62	3.50	53.9	244	244	590	634	1224	Slammed btwn start		
			6.0	3	3	GOOD	-33	S>S	D>D	60	56	2	56	7.6	7.1	1.07	90	86	43	56	8.00	53.4	219	219	581	547	1128	Chase pace;fade turn		
			6.0	6	6	HEATED	2	S>S	D>D	56	56	3	56	4.0	6.5	0.62	79	79	72	56	6.00	54.6	230	230	579	622	1200	Slight hop;broke in		
			6.0	1	1	GUSTAVOSKY	ILR	0>S	>D	ERR	ERR	0	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR				ERR	2.00	ERR	0	0	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR
			6.0	7	7	OGRE'S CAT	ILR	0>S	>D	ERR	ERR	0	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR				ERR	8.00	ERR	0	0	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	CLASS	SRR	SUR	ASP		ASP		SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	P2F	P4F	PFN	LAST THREE		SECND	RTTL	TOTL			TOTALS	LAST RACE COMMENT			
									110	SPD	R#	TDS							AVG	MLINE			CALL	PACE	BEST			BEST		
1/20/19	GP	2	6.0	6	6	MY OWN MO	-25	S>S	D>D	64	65	3	65	6.9	4.1	1.67	84	71	81	65	1.00	52.7	236	236	560	568	1128	Drft out wide stretch		
			6.0	1	1	MR LUCAS	2	S>S	D>D	58	59	3	58	3.5	5.0	0.69	85	81	73	59	3.50	54.7	239	239	513	563	1075	Bump st;3w1/4;gavewy		
			6.0	7	7	KING KINGO	-13	S>S	D>D	51	51	3	51	7.0	7.8	0.91	87	82	65	51	6.00	54.9	234	234	499	544	1043	3w;never in contention		
			6.0	3	3	RISING	2	R>S	D>D	47	49	6	47	4.1	7.2	0.57	90	83	17	42	30.00	47.4	256	190	471	396	866	In range;retreat turn		
			6.0	8	8	RED ONE	-3	S>S	D>D	44	48	4	44	8.0	7.8	1.03	78	75	50	48	30.00	51.5	203	203	483	448	931	3wd; dropped far back		
			6.0	2	2	REGGAE	-13	S>S	D>D	39	43	6	39	7.0	8.9	0.80	84	77	56	41	30.00	53.3	217	217	475	482	956	Chased pace;faded		
			6.0	4	4	CAPTAIN	ILR	0>S	>D	ERR	ERR	0	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	4.50	ERR	0	0	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR
			6.0	5	5	MAD	ILR	0>S	>D	ERR	ERR	0	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	12.00	ERR	0	0	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	CLASS	SRR	SUR	ASP		ASP		SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	P2F	P4F	PFN	LAST THREE		SECND	RTTL	TOTL			TOTALS	LAST RACE COMMENT	
									110	SPD	R#	TDS							AVG	MLINE			CALL	PACE	BEST			BEST
1/20/19	GP	3	8.0	5	5	QUEENS	0	R>R	D>D	81	80	10	81	6.0	4.0	1.50	86	90	79	81	2.50	51.5	340	255	453	474	928	Broke out st; swung4wd
			8.0	7	7	GRACE'S	4	R>R	D>D	82	78	10	82	4.4	4.1	1.06	81	80	85	81	3.00	53.5	330	246	454	470	924	Slim lead;duel;kpt on
			8.0	1	1	TREATHERLI	0	R>R	D>D	84	78	10	84	5.3	5.0	1.07	94	101	74	77	2.00	51.7	366	269	452	491	943	Brisk pace; resolute
			8.0	4	4	LUZ	0	R>R	D>D	73	73	10	73	2.9	4.8	0.60	92	97	75	77	3.50	51.9	356	264	427	478	905	Driven 5/16p to finish
			8.0	3	3	BREAK AWAY	0	R>R	D>D	71	71	10	71	7.7	7.4	1.05	67	69	72	67	30.00	51.7	276	208	409	388	798	Pushed out & bumped st
			8.0	2	2	MOTION'S	-10	R>R	T>D	74	71	10	74	5.4	6.2	0.87	69	68	50	60	30.00	51.7	238	187	403	299	702	Clip heels&stmb1 to1st
			8.0	6	6	CUCKOO	0	R>R	D>D	70	69	10	70	4.0	5.6	0.72	91	96	47	68	15.00	49.7	321	234	402	399	801	Bump st;chase winner3w

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	CLASS	SRR	SUR	ASP		ASP		SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	P2F	P4F	PFN	LAST THREE		SECND	RTTL	TOTL			TOTALS	LAST RACE COMMENT				
									110	SPD	R#	TDS							AVG	MLINE			CALL	PACE	BEST			BEST			
1/20/19	GP	4	7.5	2	2	VELVET	0	S>S	D>T	ERR	78	2	ERR	2.9	3.5	0.83	91	93	74	78	6.00	56.2	258	258	338	333	671	Chase;slight drft 1/8p			
			7.5	5	5	ANDREA'S	-13	S>S	T>T	ERR	74	3	74	4.4	5.6	0.79	94	92	79	74	4.00	55.4	265	265	336	339	675	4-5w upper; wknd late			
			7.5	9	9	HERE COMES	-8	S>S	T>T	83	72	5	74	3.1	3.7	0.84	93	98	73	77	3.50	54.4	264	264	328	347	675	Press;duel 2w;caught			
			7.5	1	1	LOOKINLIKE	17	S>S	T>T	72	72	3	72	2.1	3.9	0.55	94	83	83	72	8.00	53.8	260	260	315	337	653	Prompted 2wd;outkicked			
			7.5	3	3	DOUBLE	2	S>S	D>T	80	68	5	76	2.5	4.5	0.55	89	89	51	70	6.00	52.7	229	229	314	277	591	Tired inside			
			7.5	6	6	KONSTANTIN	25	R>S	T>T	63	66	3	63	6.1	3.9	1.57	93	93	62	66	20.00	53.6	335	248	300	314	615	3w turns;aim;lugged in			
			7.5	4	4	MISS HEART	47	R>S	D>T	ERR	59	5	ERR	6.5	4.1	1.58	69	65	79	64	20.00	51.5	278	213	276	295	571	Off slow; rail rally			
			7.5	8	8	LETSNOTGET	25	R>S	T>T	ERR	54	4	ERR	5.5	7.1	0.78	96	99	59	54	30.00	53.4	345	254	276	299	575	Pace inside;yield late			
			7.5	10	10	SKY SHAFT	-5	S>S	T>T	48	48	1	48	10.0	10.0	1.00	60	66	51	48	20.00	52.4	177	177	267	225	493	Dwelt start; trailed			
			7.5	12	12	WINNAGER	2	S>S	D>T	ERR	41	1	ERR	8.2	9.1	0.90	85	74	51	41	30.00	53.3	210	210	249	233	483	Off slowly; done early			
			7.5	7	7	HOT N SOUR	ILR	0>S	>T	ERR	ERR	0	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	4.50	ERR	0	0	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR
			7.5	11	11	DIXIELAND	ILR	0>S	>T	ERR	ERR	0	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	15.00	ERR	0	0	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	CLASS	SRR	SUR	ASP		R#	TDS	SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	P2F	P4F	PFN	LAST THREE		SECND	CALL	RTTL	TOTL			TOTALS	LAST RACE COMMENT	
									110	SPD									AVG	MLINE				AVG	PACE	BEST ALL			BEST LAST
1/20/19	GP	5	6.0	4	4	SHE TAKES	-45	R>S	D>D	ERR	83	10	85	4.5	5.1	0.89	79	76	88	85	2.00	52.8	325	243	440	446	886	Moderate pace; faded	
			6.0	5	5	FRITTATA	-16	S>S	D>D		80	81	6	82	1.8	2.2	0.82	96		85	83	4.00	56.2	181	181	431	430	861	Dueled btwn; drew clr
			6.0	3	3	TOO MUCH	-36	S>S	D>D		83	80	6	80	3.7	6.1	0.61	90	94	73	73	6.00	56.8	257	257	432	445	877	Prompt;duel;kept on
			6.0	2	2	SNACK	-76	S>S	T>D	ERR	80	10	72	3.9	6.1	0.65	81		83	77	10.00	59.8	164	164	434	350	784	Finished early	
			6.0	6	6	COPPER FOX	-16	S>S	D>D		83	80	10	83	3.0	5.9	0.51	99	104	61	76	10.00	56.8	264	264	421	436	857	Brk inwd;bmp;fltn out
			6.0	7	7	DENVER	-36	S>S	D>D		82	79	7	80	6.0	3.8	1.55	65	67	105	82	6.00	59.7	237	237	422	439	862	Angle wide;drifted out
			6.0	1	1	WHIP ME	-36	S>S	D>D		83	79	10	81	5.6	5.4	1.03	91	93	77	84	3.00	56.0	261	261	418	454	872	Outmoved1/4;lugged in

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	CLASS	SRR	SUR	ASP		R#	TDS	SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	P2F	P4F	PFN	LAST THREE		SECND	CALL	RTTL	TOTL			TOTALS	LAST RACE COMMENT	
									110	SPD									AVG	MLINE				AVG	PACE	BEST ALL			BEST LAST
1/20/19	GP	6	8.0	4	4	MUCH ABOUT	-21	R>R	T>T		78	78	2	78	5.9	5.0	1.18	79	84	82	78	2.50	54.9	327	245	227	226	454	Bmp2x st;steadied late
			8.0	5	5	YES ITS	4	S>R	T>T		77	72	10	74	5.2	5.8	0.90	92	94	40	65	20.00	51.3	226	226	212	194	406	In range;weaknd turn
			8.0	13	13	MAMBO	0	S>R	T>T		73	72	5	73	7.4	5.1	1.46	91	88	61	70	10.00	52.4	240	240	218	212	430	Rail bid 1/4;2wd;flatn
			8.0	15	15	SACRIFICE	0	S>R	T>T		72	72	5	72	6.4	4.3	1.50	87	85	70	69	10.00	54.1	242	242	212	215	428	Snug hold;3w;miss2nd
			8.0	6	6	MISS	-1	R>R	D>T		61	68	10	61	4.1	5.8	0.71	67	63	104	69	4.00	52.5	289	234	211	219	430	5-7wd turn; rallied
			8.0	14	14	SUPER MAMA	0	S>R	T>T		76	67	6	76	4.3	4.5	0.96	81	76	78	62	15.00	55.0	235	235	215	215	430	3-4wd;edgd for show
			8.0	1	1	BERNING	4	R>R	T>T		65	67	10	65	5.7	5.0	1.15	77	67	90	73	3.00	54.3	295	234	216	216	432	Pressurd pace;outkickd
			8.0	9	9	SAL AND	4	R>R	T>T		66	66	1	66	7.0	4.0	1.75	70	55	94	66	8.00	54.3	266	219	203	201	405	5wd bid uppr;imprve
			8.0	8	8	REGAL	-97	R>R	D>T	ERR	62	4	ERR	3.3	5.7	0.59	89	81	24	66	12.00	51.8	284	194	211	171	382	Prssurd pace3w;weekend	
			8.0	7	7	ITS ABOUT	0	S>R	T>T		60	59	9	60	5.8	5.8	1.00	82	77	76	59	20.00	53.8	235	235	193	210	403	Steadid 1st;keen;wide
			8.0	2	2	BARB'S	4	S>R	T>T	ERR	56	6	ERR	7.9	6.0	1.32	87	90	61	59	15.00	54.8	238	238	188	204	392	Bid 2nd tn;evn finsh	
			8.0	10	10	SMIRKOTCH	-36	S>R	D>T		58	47	2	58	9.4	9.4	1.00	74	58	60	47	30.00	58.0	192	192	182	150	332	Trailed;no bid
			8.0	11	11	MIDNIGHT	4	S>R	T>T		68	47	10	68	5.8	5.4	1.06	92	94	64	65	10.00	55.2	250	250	183	222	405	Mid-flight;3w gain;evn
			8.0	12	12	INDY	0	S>R	T>T		59	40	6	59	8.6	8.6	1.00	79	71	72	45	30.00	53.6	222	222	170	190	360	Urged rail tn;no rally
8.0	3	3	MIZZEN THE	9	S>R	D>T		2	34	9	2	6.7	7.6	0.87	91	85	23	50	20.00	50.2	199	199	157	154	311	Pressed2wd btwn;faded			

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	CLASS	SRR	SUR	ASP AVG		ASP		SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	P2F	P4F	PFN	LAST THREE		SECND		TOTL		TOTALS	LAST RACE COMMENT		
									110	SPD	R#	TDS							AVG	MLINE	CALL	RTTL	PACE	BEST			BEST	ALL
1/20/19	GP	7	7.0	4	4	FIVE O ONE	-1	S>S	D>D	ERR	83	9	84	4.5	3.2	1.39	89	85	74	78	8.00	55.4	248	248	292	259	551	In range 2-3w;fade trn
			7.0	6	6	STARSHIP	4	S>S	D>D	85	82	10	83	5.1	5.7	0.89	80	87	95	79	2.50	58.6	262	262	287	296	583	Track rail;bid outside
			7.0	3	3	DRINK IN	-5	S>S	D>D	83	82	10	82	4.8	5.1	0.95	92	96	81	78	3.50	56.8	269	269	284	289	573	3wd in aim 5/16p;evnd
			7.0	8	8	KING POWER	0	R>S	D>D	80	82	10	80	2.6	4.5	0.58	87	88	78	78	4.00	52.3	339	253	278	279	557	2-3w;kept on wide late
			7.0	7	7	CRAZY	4	S>S	D>D	81	81	10	81	5.3	5.6	0.96	89	92	67	75	30.00	56.6	248	248	274	263	538	Bumped st; 4-3wd;tired
			7.0	5	5	SANFILIPO	0	R>S	D>D	77	80	10	77	4.8	4.4	1.08	83	87	56	71	20.00	51.5	309	226	262	240	502	Hopped st;tired inside
			7.0	2	2	FRANCESCO	4	S>S	D>D	82	79	10	78	3.6	4.2	0.86	96	96	67	78	8.00	55.3	259	259	271	271	541	Duel ins;no match 1/4p
			7.0	9	9	WHISKEY	4	R>S	D>D	ERR	76	10	ERR	4.8	5.1	0.94	71	73	98	79	15.00	55.9	321	242	263	283	546	3w early;advanced;even
			7.0	11	11	BROOKSIDE	0	S>S	D>D	69	75	10	74	8.6	5.8	1.48	76	77	99	74	20.00	57.6	252	252	262	277	539	Closing in far outside
			7.0	10	10	OFF DUTY	4	S>S	D>D	81	74	10	75	4.0	6.5	0.61	96	100	65	62	8.00	56.4	261	261	270	277	547	Hard-used early; faded
7.0	1	1	POWERLINE	0	R>S	D>D	77	72	10	77	3.2	6.7	0.48	75	69	93	75	20.00	54.2	314	237	259	264	523	Widest early;no factor			

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	CLASS	SRR	SUR	ASP AVG		ASP		SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	P2F	P4F	PFN	LAST THREE		SECND		TOTL		TOTALS	LAST RACE COMMENT				
									110	SPD	R#	TDS							AVG	MLINE	CALL	RTTL	PACE	BEST			BEST	ALL	LAST	
1/20/19	GP	8	6.0	7	7	BLUE EYED	17	S>S	D>D	ERR	80	1	80	2.9	2.9	1.00	96		76	80	4.50	54.9	172	172	511	464	975	Aim uppr; drifted out		
			6.0	4	4	CAN U	0	S>S	D>D	76	76	1	76	8.3	3.3	2.50	85	81	86	76	4.00	57.2	252	252	515	515	1030	Outside gain stretch		
			6.0	8	8	MIAMI ROSE	17	S>S	D>D	75	76	2	76	2.7	3.3	0.80	87	85	81	76	8.00	56.2	253	253	498	513	1011	Pace;ins;headed 1/16p		
			6.0	10	10	LA	-3	S>S	D>D	72	75	2	75	4.2	5.8	0.73	90	95	68	75	5.00	53.5	253	253	511	503	1014	Came in st; faded		
			6.0	9	9	GRAY OWL	27	S>S	D>D	71	71	2	71	1.3	3.1	0.40	90	85	83	71	6.00	55.2	258	258	489	521	1010	Pace inside; resisted		
			6.0	1	1	MOON EYES	17	S>S	D>D	67	67	1	67	5.7	4.3	1.33	90	82	75	67	6.00	53.0	247	247	476	484	960	Toss head st; 5wd bid		
			6.0	2	2	AMERICA	ILR	0>S	>D	ERR	ERR	0	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR				ERR	15.00	ERR	0	0	ERR	ERR	ERR		
			6.0	3	3	WAR STAR	ILR	0>S	>D	ERR	ERR	0	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR				ERR	20.00	ERR	0	0	ERR	ERR	ERR		
			6.0	5	5	CAREER	ILR	0>S	>D	ERR	ERR	0	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR				ERR	10.00	ERR	0	0	ERR	ERR	ERR		
			6.0	6	6	AFTER THE	ILR	0>S	>D	ERR	ERR	0	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR				ERR	10.00	ERR	0	0	ERR	ERR	ERR		

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	CLASS	SRR	SUR	ASP		ASP		SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	P2F	P4F	PFN	LAST THREE		SECND		TOTL		TOTALS	LAST RACE COMMENT	
									110	SPD	R#	TDS							AVG	MLINE	CALL	RTTL	PACE	BEST			BEST
1/20/19	GP	9	6.0	7 7	FIELD TRIP	-31	S>S	T>D	89	88	10	89	4.1	4.1	1.00	81		90	87	5.00	59.1	171	171	309	261	569	Broke slowly; outrun
			6.0	3 3	HARRYHEE	49	S>S	D>D	88	88	10	88	1.9	5.1	0.37	97	100	65	83	8.00	55.8	262	262	300	290	590	Dueled 2wd; tired str
			6.0	2 2	SANTIAMEN	-1	S>S	D>D	89	87	4	89	5.7	5.0	1.14	91	92	90	86	20.00	57.7	273	273	304	314	618	Up close early;wknd
			6.0	10 10	HE HATE ME	-4	S>S	D>D	88	86	5	87	3.9	3.1	1.27	89	97	85	85	6.00	58.5	271	271	303	314	617	Drew even 3w; gave in
			6.0	1 1	FOCUS ON	9	S>S	D>D	88	86	10	87	4.8	5.2	0.94	89	95	87	87	12.00	58.4	271	271	306	316	622	Drift out; missed btwn
			6.0	4 4	IMPACT	-24	S>S	D>D	86	86	6	89	3.0	3.9	0.78	91	96	65	87	3.00	54.2	252	252	300	282	581	Urged rail;retreated
			6.0	5 5	DUPREE	34	S>S	D>D	86	86	10	86	2.8	4.1	0.69	97	104	81	86	4.00	57.1	282	282	301	325	626	Drove clr; drifted out
			6.0	9 9	PIVEN	-1	S>S	D>D	89	83	7	84	5.7	4.9	1.17	85	90	89	85	8.00	60.0	264	264	306	310	616	Brsh gate; steadied
			6.0	8 8	HIS NAME	-4	S>S	D>D	81	79	10	81	4.6	4.6	1.00	89	92	78	87	10.00	55.8	259	259	291	300	591	Veered in st; weakened
			6.0	6 6	MY	34	S>S	D>D	76	72	10	76	3.3	6.7	0.49	101	102	64	83	20.00	55.5	267	267	279	290	569	Blast out early; tired

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	CLASS	SRR	SUR	ASP		ASP		SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	P2F	P4F	PFN	LAST THREE		SECND		TOTL		TOTALS	LAST RACE COMMENT	
									110	SPD	R#	TDS							AVG	MLINE	CALL	RTTL	PACE	BEST			BEST
1/20/19	GP	10	5.0	3 3	VINNIE VAN	-20	S>S	D>T	68	74	3	68	4.8	4.0	1.20	88	91	67	74	3.50	55.8	246	246	317	332	650	Bump st;bid tn;flatnd
			5.0	1 1	QUICK	12	S>S	D>T	ERR	73	1	ERR	3.3	1.7	2.00	88	89	72	73	15.00	55.1	249	249	311	339	650	2w;btwn to 1/4;ask3/16
			5.0	10 10	DANCE TILL	23	S>S	T>T	80	72	3	80	3.8	2.8	1.38	89		83	72	2.50	55.6	172	172	312	312	624	Stedy drft out;drw clr
			5.0	8 8	NEVER BAD	2	S>S	T>T	70	70	3	70	6.3	5.4	1.15	80		76	70	15.00	58.3	156	156	312	276	588	Slow start;widest lane
			5.0	7 7	BRADSHAW	17	S>S	D>T	ERR	67	5	ERR	4.3	4.3	1.00	89	89	81	72	4.50	56.5	259	259	310	354	664	Pace;repe1 bid;sharp
			5.0	5 5	FELON	2	S>S	T>T	71	65	6	71	2.2	4.6	0.48	94		66	71	6.00	57.0	160	160	308	291	600	Bump2x st;won gap duel
			5.0	9 9	MARCELINO	17	S>S	T>T	73	57	5	73	1.0	5.8	0.17	86		78	57	10.00	58.2	164	164	282	287	569	Speed to lead;ins;2wd
			5.0	2 2	PERFECT	-68	S>S	D>T	73	56	5	64	2.9	4.4	0.65	100	89	20	53	20.00	51.6	209	209	282	226	508	Duel btwn; retreated
			5.0	4 4	GOLDEN	-8	S>S	D>T	ERR	54	10	ERR	3.1	6.3	0.50	96	91	51	53	12.00	55.1	238	238	278	295	573	Dropped back turn
			5.0	6 6	HOLLYWOOD	2	S>S	T>T	72	54	4	68	3.2	5.8	0.55	94		63	68	10.00	57.3	157	157	289	286	575	Dueled 2wd;drifted out

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	CLASS	SRR	SUR	ASP		ASP		SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	P2F	P4F	PFN	LAST THREE		SECND	RTTL	TOTL		TOTALS	LAST RACE COMMENT		
									110	SPD	R#	TDS							AVG	MLINE			CALL	PACE			BEST	BEST
1/20/19	GP	11	6.0	11	11	SHERPA	-10	S>S	T>D	82	77	10	81	4.7	5.3	0.88	105		64	82	4.50	57.0	169	169	252	226	478	Ins turn;2p upr;no bid
			6.0	2	2	DIFFERENCE	4	S>S	T>D	83	76	9	80	2.9	3.8	0.77	82		75	71	6.00	55.3	157	157	244	206	450	3wd turn; lacked a bid
			6.0	8	8	GOLDEN	4	S>S	D>D	76	76	10	76	3.5	3.6	0.97	85	89	80	73	15.00	55.6	254	254	234	248	482	Rally btw; pick up 2nd
			6.0	6	6	OVERZEALOU	-1	R>S	D>D	80	75	9	80	5.3	4.4	1.20	79	79	74	78	3.50	52.6	307	232	241	235	476	Chased btwn; wknd str
			6.0	4	4	DR HARLAN	0	S>S	D>D	74	74	9	74	4.2	3.6	1.16	84	86	77	78	3.00	60.2	247	247	241	246	487	2wd bid tn;shift wider
			6.0	12	12	KID MAC	-10	S>S	T>D	72	72	10	72	2.4	5.7	0.43	95	104	59	75	20.00	55.1	258	258	230	247	477	Set pace;duel;tired
			6.0	13	13	COPPER	0	S>S	D>D	72	71	10	73	5.6	5.1	1.10	87	83	69	72	20.00	59.0	239	239	228	228	456	Wide upper;evenly
			6.0	1	1	SALSA	0	S>S	D>D	72	69	10	72	7.1	6.8	1.04	82	82	73	60	30.00	59.0	237	237	222	218	440	Urged turn;mild imprve
			6.0	9	9	SUB FACTUM	4	S>S	D>D	69	69	10	69	2.1	4.2	0.49	87	85	84	71	12.00	56.2	256	256	227	254	481	Duel 2wd;drew clear
			6.0	5	5	NUCLEAR	4	S>S	D>D	74	67	10	74	5.3	5.5	0.98	84	90	85	67	8.00	59.1	259	259	223	256	479	2wd bid tn;kept on
			6.0	10	10	GRAND JR	-10	S>S	T>D	50	65	10	50	6.2	7.5	0.83	94		59	60	30.00	57.2	153	153	220	186	405	4wd throughout; outrun
			6.0	3	3	KOKOMO	0	S>S	D>D	64	64	10	64	3.3	8.3	0.40	93	96	46	61	20.00	57.3	235	235	220	214	435	Set pace;collared 3/16
6.0	7	7	MYSTICAL	4	S>S	D>D	62	61	9	62	5.3	7.6	0.70	93	97	61	68	30.00	57.3	251	251	218	236	454	Bump;pinch back start			

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	CLASS	SRR	SUR	ASP		ASP		SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	P2F	P4F	PFN	LAST THREE		SECND	RTTL	TOTL		TOTALS	LAST RACE COMMENT		
									110	SPD	R#	TDS							AVG	MLINE			CALL	PACE			BEST	BEST
1/20/19	SA	1	8.0	4	4	PINCHECK	-31	R>R	T>T	89	89	1	89	6.7	6.7	1.00	84	89	89	89	2.50	52.5	352	262	444	428	872	In tight 1/4;3wd lane
			8.0	2	2	KAZAN	4	R>R	T>T	84	89	10	89	8.2	3.8	2.17	72	82	96	95	4.00	56.4	339	250	431	429	860	5wd into str;edged 2nd
			8.0	3	3	KEEP QUIET	34	R>R	T>T	88	88	10	88	3.4	3.7	0.92	83	82	84	87	6.00	57.5	342	249	426	421	847	4w 1/4;duel str;ran on
			8.0	7	7	COUNT	4	S>R	T>T	87	87	6	87	3.7	3.6	1.05	93	95	87	88	3.00	58.5	275	275	434	441	875	Dueled;led;held game
			8.0	6	6	CHOO CHOO	-29	R>R	T>T	85	86	10	85	4.5	4.2	1.05	88	93	79	88	8.00	55.2	357	260	422	419	841	Came out str;no bid
			8.0	1	1	MOVE OVER	36	S>R	T>T	85	86	9	85	7.1	4.5	1.57	85	92	91	87	10.00	61.3	268	268	432	440	872	Stdied early;4wd lane
			8.0	5	5	MORSE CODE	4	R>R	T>T	88	85	9	90	6.4	4.1	1.58	75	81	81	90	4.00	53.5	327	237	410	422	833	Saved ground;outkicked

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	CLASS	SRR	SUR	ASP		ASP		SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	P2F	P4F	PFN	LAST THREE		SECND	RTTL	TOTL		TOTALS	LAST RACE COMMENT		
									110	SPD	R#	TDS							AVG	MLINE			CALL	PACE			BEST	BEST
1/20/19	SA	2	6.0	7	7	MOON JUICE	4	S>S	D>D	73	73	10	73	4.8	4.6	1.03	90	94	73	74	3.00	56.0	257	257	459	548	1007	Btwn;inside;best rest
			6.0	8	8	SHANGHAI	-25	S>S	D>D	67	68	4	67	3.4	6.3	0.55	91	90	52	65	2.50	54.6	233	233	456	461	917	Off step slow;inside
			6.0	2	2	VICTOR'S	4	S>S	D>D	74	68	3	70	4.8	7.7	0.63	93	94	53	68	3.50	55.2	240	240	444	494	938	Btwn foes;wkened
			6.0	4	4	PIG IRON	-41	R>S	T>D	66	65	2	66	5.8	8.4	0.69	94	97	50	65	6.00	51.7	328	241	451	486	937	Pulled;steadied 5-1/2
			6.0	6	6	PASTORELLI	4	S>S	D>D	77	62	2	77	9.4	6.7	1.42				62	4.00	56.5	0	0	436	141	577	Pulled up;walked off
			6.0	5	5	JIMMY THE	9	S>S	D>D	47	47	2	47	8.1	9.5	0.85	84	80	43	47	20.00	52.6	207	207	374	396	769	Bit off rail;gave way
			6.0	1	1	SILVER	4	S>S	D>D	45	45	2	45	2.6	7.4	0.35	86	79	72	45	12.00	55.5	237	237	382	474	856	3wd into str;wkened
			6.0	3	3	CASUAL	ILR	0>S	>D	ERR	ERR	0	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR				ERR	12.00	ERR	0	0	ERR	ERR



DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	CLASS	SRR	SUR	ASP		ASP		SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	P2F	P4F	PFN	LAST THREE		SECND	RTTL	TOTL			TOTALS	LAST RACE COMMENT	
									110	SPD	R#	TDS							AVG	MLINE			CALL	LAST	BEST ALL			BEST LAST
1/20/19	SA	3	8.0	6	6	KAWARA	-10	R>R	D>D	85	85	7	86	6.0	7.7	0.78	77	84	73	80	5.00	50.3	327	234	449	424	873	4wd 7/8;no rally
			8.0	5	5	LINDANTE	0	R>R	D>D	82	83	10	82	4.6	4.9	0.94	87	89	81	83	4.00	53.5	347	257	431	447	878	Vied btwn;led;lost 2nd
			8.0	3	3	KENZOU'S	9	R>R	D>D	84	80	10	84	6.5	6.6	0.98	82	81	87	84	2.50	53.8	339	250	432	449	881	Inside duel;2nd best
			8.0	4	4	BANZE NO	0	R>R	D>D	81	80	10	81	6.1	6.3	0.98	84	86	58	79	3.00	52.4	314	228	423	398	821	Inside;wkened;eased
			8.0	1	1	HARD ARCH	9	R>R	D>D	80	80	10	80	5.1	4.0	1.29	68	71	93	83	4.00	53.4	306	232	424	432	856	4wd 7/8;5wd into str
			8.0	7	7	MONTEREY	9	S>R	D>D	77	79	10	77	5.5	6.9	0.80	84	81	80	78	10.00	55.4	245	245	428	418	846	3wd into str;no rally
			8.0	2	2	SHIRL'S	9	R>R	D>D	77	74	10	77	5.6	3.8	1.47	82	84	77	75	10.00	53.8	331	243	412	432	844	Came out str;willingly

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	CLASS	SRR	SUR	ASP		ASP		SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	P2F	P4F	PFN	LAST THREE		SECND	RTTL	TOTL			TOTALS	LAST RACE COMMENT		
									110	SPD	R#	TDS							AVG	MLINE			CALL	LAST	BEST ALL			BEST LAST	
1/20/19	SA	4	6.5	6	6	BARTLETT	4	S>S	D>D	76	76	10	76	5.3	4.4	1.21	82	84	89	75	4.00	57.3	255	255	544	544	1089	Off bit slow;willingly	
			6.5	2	2	CAPTAIN N.	4	S>S	D>D	74	72	10	73	5.1	4.8	1.07	90	94	81	71	3.50	56.6	265	265	520	553	1073	Bid btwn;2wd;outgamed	
			6.5	1	1	EMOTIONAL	4	S>S	D>D	69	69	3	69	5.8	5.8	1.00	82	93	69	69	3.00	55.4	244	244	515	511	1026	Off bit slow;4wd;wkend	
			6.5	3	3	BLESS HIS	-5	R>S	D>D	51	63	7	64	4.7	5.5	0.84	90	98	38	46	4.00	49.2	314	226	490	447	937	Inside duel;weakened	
			6.5	5	5	DOHENY	4	S>S	D>D	75	61	8	61	7.0	6.7	1.04	81	78	92	71	10.00	57.5	251	251	497	524	1021	Bobbled start;4wd;3wd	
			6.5	4	4	SCORPIO	-1	S>S	D>D	43	47	6	48	5.7	8.8	0.64	91	73	67	51	30.00	52.0	231	231	434	422	855	Came out str;gave way	
			6.5	7	7	CENTAURUS	ILR	0>S	>D	ERR	ERR	0	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	4.00	ERR	0	0	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR
			6.5	8	8	RAGGY	ILR	0>S	>D	ERR	ERR	0	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	10.00	ERR	0	0	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	CLASS	SRR	SUR	ASP		ASP		SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	P2F	P4F	PFN	LAST THREE		SECND	RTTL	TOTL			TOTALS	LAST RACE COMMENT				
									110	SPD	R#	TDS							AVG	MLINE			CALL	LAST	BEST ALL			BEST LAST			
1/20/19	SA	5	6.5	5	5	BLUE	2	S>S	D>D	70	70	1	70	3.8	6.3	0.60	98	99	61	70	3.50	55.0	258	258	2999	3000	5999	Bobbled start;inside			
			6.5	2	2	THREE	ILR	0>S	>D	ERR	ERR	0	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	4.50	ERR	0	0	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR			
			6.5	3	3	LIVE THE	ILR	0>S	>D	ERR	ERR	0	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	12.00	ERR	0	0	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR		
			6.5	4	4	CHOCOLATE	ILR	0>S	>D	ERR	ERR	0	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	6.00	ERR	0	0	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR		
			6.5	1	1	RUN'N DOWN	ILR	0>S	>D	ERR	ERR	0	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	15.00	ERR	0	0	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	
			6.5	6	6	FLAT OUT	ILR	0>S	>D	ERR	ERR	0	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	15.00	ERR	0	0	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR
			6.5	7	7	FLOR DE LA	ILR	0>S	>D	ERR	ERR	0	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	0.80	ERR	0	0	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	CLASS	SRR	SUR	ASP		ASP		SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	P2F	P4F	PFN	LAST THREE		SECND		TOTL		TOTALS	LAST RACE COMMENT			
									110	SPD	R#	TDS							AVG	MLINE	CALL	RTTL	PACE	BEST			BEST		
1/20/19	SA	6	6.5	10	10	RAILMAN	-20	R>S	D>T	ERR	79	3	ERR	5.0	4.3	1.17	82	84	71	79	3.00	50.8	321	237	425	393	818	Btwn into str;no bid	
			6.5	9	9	VIOLENT	17	S>S	D>T	ERR	74	5	ERR	5.3	4.7	1.12	89	86	84	79	5.00	56.5	259	259	412	419	831	4wd turn;rallied	
			6.5	1	1	SECRET	-20	S>S	T>T	70	70	1	70	5.8	9.2	0.64	89	90	68	70	6.00	55.9	247	247	415	395	810	Bumped 5wd into str	
			6.5	2	2	RED CLEM	5	R>S	T>T	ERR	66	10	ERR	5.3	5.4	0.98	83	89	62	73	15.00	54.7	325	234	381	390	771	3wd into str;btwn wire	
			6.5	4	4	THIN LINE	17	S>S	D>T	ERR	64	6	ERR	5.8	6.4	0.91	88	90	88	72	4.00	57.5	266	266	393	436	829	4wd to str;willingly	
			6.5	7	7	YOU MUST	0	R>S	T>T	ERR	63	5	ERR	3.6	5.3	0.68	93	102	55	72	3.50	54.3	349	250	385	405	791	Bid 3wd 1/4;held 3rd	
			6.5	3	3	SHARED	-3	S>S	D>T	ERR	39	2	33	5.0	8.0	0.63	99	89	41	39	20.00	52.8	229	229	313	323	636	Bump 9/16; eased 1/16	
			6.5	6	6	TRIAL BY	-18	S>S	D>T	ERR	22	1	ERR	5.0	10.0	0.50	86	79	8	22	20.00	47.4	173	173	276	238	514	Gave way;eased lane	
			6.5	8	8	LOYALTY	ILR	0>S	>T	ERR	ERR	0	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR				ERR	12.00	ERR	0	0	ERR	ERR	ERR	
			6.5	5	5	LAKE SHOW	ILR	0>S	>T	ERR	ERR	0	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR				ERR	20.00	ERR	0	0	ERR	ERR	ERR	
6.5	11	11	LIL SYDNEY	ILR	0>S	>T	ERR	ERR	0	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR				ERR	15.00	ERR	0	0	ERR	ERR	ERR				

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	CLASS	SRR	SUR	ASP		ASP		SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	P2F	P4F	PFN	LAST THREE		SECND		TOTL		TOTALS	LAST RACE COMMENT			
									110	SPD	R#	TDS							AVG	MLINE	CALL	RTTL	PACE	BEST			BEST		
1/20/19	SA	7	6.0	2	2	SHAKE N	-8	S>S	D>D	70	70	4	70	2.1	4.2	0.50	94	91	66	71	2.50	55.3	251	251	392	402	794	Dueled;weakened	
			6.0	3	3	SILENT	-8	S>S	D>D	69	69	8	67	3.4	4.0	0.86	90	86	78	74	3.00	55.4	254	254	395	418	813	Lost whip late	
			6.0	1	1	TANKER	-8	S>S	D>D	57	66	6	66	3.1	6.7	0.47	94	92	49	60	12.00	54.2	235	235	378	350	727	Inside duel;weakened	
			6.0	10	10	ROYAL	-23	S>S	D>D	63	63	1	63	10.0	8.3	1.20	80	78	76	63	8.00	55.7	234	234	386	388	774	3-4wd; lacked rally	
			6.0	4	4	REDROCK	-8	S>S	D>D	61	62	4	61	5.8	5.0	1.15	86	77	65	64	5.00	54.5	228	228	366	355	721	4wd turn;wkened	
			6.0	8	8	SMALL TOWN	-23	S>S	D>D	60	60	1	60	6.0	6.0	1.00	84	84	64	60	15.00	53.0	232	232	373	369	743	Angled in 1/4;wkened	
			6.0	5	5	A SALUTE	-8	S>S	D>D	55	55	2	55	4.7	8.9	0.53	94	85	62	55	12.00	52.3	241	241	352	359	711	5wd;4wd;weakened	
			6.0	9	9	WARRENSDIR	-8	S>S	D>D	54	54	3	54	4.7	7.2	0.65	91	86	64	54	20.00	53.9	241	241	356	359	716	Stalked pace; weakened	
			6.0	6	6	FRIDAY'S	ILR	0>S	>D	ERR	ERR	0	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR				ERR	12.00	ERR	0	0	ERR	ERR	ERR	
			6.0	7	7	CONTAGION	ILR	0>S	>D	ERR	ERR	0	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR				ERR	5.00	ERR	0	0	ERR	ERR	ERR	

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	CLASS	SRR	SUR	ASP		ASP		SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	P2F	P4F	PFN	LAST THREE		SECND	RTTL	TOTL		TOTALS	LAST RACE COMMENT		
									110	SPD	R#	TDS							AVG	MLINE			CALL	LAST		BEST	BEST	
1/20/19	SA	8	12.0	4	4	AMBOSELI	4	R>R	T>T	92	91	10	91	7.9	6.0	1.31	73	73	90	90	6.00	55.3	326	236	320	305	625	3wd 2nd turn;outkicked
			12.0	10	10	PANTSONFIR	24	R>R	D>T	89	90	10	91	7.4	4.5	1.63	66	69	92	88	6.00	54.8	306	227	308	290	598	Asked 3w; no threat
			12.0	1	1	CHEEKABOO	34	R>R	T>T	ERR	89	10	89	7.4	5.5	1.35	74	70	99	88	10.00	55.4	319	243	309	298	607	Rail trip;best rest
			12.0	9	9	INDIA	4	R>R	T>T	ERR	89	10	91	4.3	5.2	0.82	87	92	80	94	3.50	52.4	356	259	312	321	634	Drifted out 1/8;held
			12.0	5	5	PLEIN AIR	9	R>R	T>T	91	88	3	88	1.7	5.0	0.33	89	92	73	88	4.00	51.4	343	254	311	300	611	Inside;dueled;wkened
			12.0	2	2	LYNNE'S	24	R>R	D>T	ERR	86	10	85	9.6	4.7	2.03	73	72	104	86	6.00	55.9	324	249	299	309	608	2w;rallied btwn;drvng
			12.0	3	3	ARCTIC	30	R>R	D>T	ERR	83	4	79	2.8	5.6	0.50	86	86	78	85	20.00	51.9	339	250	287	294	581	3wd;tight 3/16;wkened
			12.0	8	8	K P	-4	R>R	T>T	ERR	79	8	84	6.6	4.0	1.67	86	88	81	90	3.00	54.8	348	255	295	303	598	Inside;dueled;held 2nd
			12.0	6	6	TRUST FUND	55	R>R	T>T	ERR	78	10	82	7.4	4.9	1.52	78	78	90	84	30.00	54.1	323	246	279	294	573	Squeezed bit strt;rail
12.0	7	7	COPPER	79	R>R	T>T	ERR	78	10	80	5.2	4.3	1.20	75	71	86	79	30.00	55.2	309	232	279	287	565	Bid 3w; determinedly			

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	CLASS	SRR	SUR	ASP		ASP		SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	P2F	P4F	PFN	LAST THREE		SECND	RTTL	TOTL		TOTALS	LAST RACE COMMENT		
									110	SPD	R#	TDS							AVG	MLINE			CALL	LAST		BEST	BEST	
1/20/19	SA	9	6.0	4	4	LONDON	9	S>S	D>D	79	74	4	79	7.1	4.7	1.50	72	74	95	79	2.50	55.9	241	241	393	428	821	Drifted in;ridden out
			6.0	2	2	K P'S	4	S>S	D>D	69	71	9	69	6.3	5.4	1.16	77	76	87	70	5.00	55.5	240	240	374	402	775	5wd;4wd;no rally
			6.0	1	1	DON' TEATMY	-36	R>S	T>D	76	70	3	76	2.6	6.1	0.43	95	99	39	70	2.00	50.0	325	233	381	368	748	Pulled;dueled;wkened
			6.0	7	7	MI	4	S>S	D>D	68	70	9	70	3.9	4.4	0.89	90	87	77	71	4.00	55.1	254	254	366	412	779	Inside;wkened late
			6.0	6	6	LUCKY VAL	-1	S>S	D>D	75	69	5	75	8.0	5.9	1.38	71	79	84	74	6.00	57.5	234	234	379	405	785	3wd into str;rail late
			6.0	5	5	MAJESTIC	-1	S>S	D>D	63	68	7	67	4.1	5.7	0.72	87	81	10	30	15.00	49.6	178	178	359	248	607	4wd;gave way;eased
			6.0	8	8	TIZ MI	9	S>S	D>D	67	67	5	66	6.5	6.0	1.07	91		65	61	12.00	55.7	156	156	383	350	733	Inside duel;weakened
			6.0	3	3	BLISSFUL	4	S>S	D>D	67	67	10	67	6.0	7.0	0.85	86	78	80	62	20.00	54.2	244	244	364	388	753	Stalked pace; weakened

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	CLASS	SRR	SUR	ASP		ASP		SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	P2F	P4F	PFN	LAST THREE		SECND	RTTL	TOTL		TOTALS	LAST RACE COMMENT		
									110	SPD	R#	TDS							AVG	MLINE			CALL	LAST		BEST	BEST	
1/20/19	SA	10	6.5	4	4	SPECIAL	-14	S>S	T>T	84	84	1	84	8.6	2.9	3.00	83	90	86	84	4.00	59.6	259	259	294	298	592	4wd into str;rallied
			6.5	10	10	HELEN'S	-16	S>S	D>T	81	84	10	86	4.8	3.2	1.50	91	97	84	87	5.00	57.5	272	272	286	305	590	Roused 3w; evenly
			6.5	9	9	FIERY LADY	-6	R>S	D>T	ERR	84	10	ERR	6.4	4.8	1.33	80	81	93	86	6.00	54.6	338	254	276	295	571	Bid 2-3w;late bid 2d
			6.5	5	5	SPY RING	-1	R>S	T>T	89	82	5	89	3.7	6.7	0.55	97	103	53	78	8.00	50.9	355	253	274	273	547	Speed;inside;wkened
			6.5	1	1	BATIQUITOS	4	S>S	T>T	82	81	10	83	4.1	4.0	1.03	94		81	83	8.00	58.2	175	175	284	264	548	4wd into str;btw late
			6.5	3	3	NAUGHTY	56	S>S	D>T	ERR	81	9	87	1.6	3.6	0.45	94	99	55	79	10.00	55.9	248	248	263	259	522	Bobbled start;wkened
			6.5	2	2	GLEEFULY	49	S>S	D>T	78	81	2	78	5.5	1.5	3.67	82	83	93	81	20.00	56.4	258	258	267	295	562	4w;swung out;surged
			6.5	11	11	OLEKSANDRA	4	R>S	T>T	82	79	2	82	5.2	4.8	1.10	93	94	67	79	3.50	54.2	345	254	274	281	555	Pulled;inside;wkened
			6.5	6	6	HAPPINESS	4	S>S	T>T	ERR	78	4	79	3.4	6.6	0.52	97		72	74	20.00	57.5	169	169	269	250	519	Vied;stalked;wkened
			6.5	7	7	DRIFT AWAY	25	R>S	T>T	ERR	77	10	69	3.7	5.3	0.70	82	82	91	81	10.00	54.1	338	255	269	294	563	Bid;dueled;led late
			6.5	8	8	WE ALL	4	S>S	D>T	ERR	67	4	ERR	4.3	5.7	0.77	90	92	6	62	12.00	52.6	188	188	245	186	432	Vied;gave way;eased















DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	SRR	SUR	NOTES FROM LAST RACE	ASP	AVG	ASP	LAST FIVE															ERLY TOTL		PACE		COMMENTS																			
									110	RX	SPD	R#	TDS	RT	S1	S2	SYS1	SYS2	CLOS	CLOSE	TDONE	TD TWO	TD TOT	CLOSE	P2F	P4F	PFN	SPEED	RATINGS	DSL		BRIS	P	CALL1	CALL2	MEDS	EQUIP	MLINE	CLS	TRK	DIS	CHNG	SPPNT	PWR	COMB	TOTL	LAST			
1/20/19	GP	6	8.0	8	8	REGAL	R>R	D>T	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 1-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH! 1st off 477 day layoff. Class -97 Finished 7 from post 1 TJW= 69 TJH= 69	ERR	0	62	4	ERR	0	83	58	3.30	5.70	9.00	0.58	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	89	81	24	53,71,74,49,0	477	E	8	49.3	74.8	1	BOFF	12.00	170	GP	8.5	M>M	13.8	109	83.4	170	194	Prssurd pace3w;weakend/ Kept on 2w;solid bid/ Up close;outside;clr2n
			8.0	6	6	MISS	R>R	D>T	Made big overall move (6). *Stretch gain (1.44).BTL horse. 1st off 73 day layoff. Class -1 Finished 2 from post 9 TJW= 63 TJH= 63	61	1	68	10	61	1	68	98	4.10	5.80	9.90	0.71	3.60	9.10	12.70	0.40	67	63	104	77,69,62,55,62	73	P	3	49.6	74.8	1	0	4.00	137	LRL	8.0	M>M	5.2	102	100.0	130	234	5-7wd turn; rallied/ Pinched start;3-4wd; No factor			
			8.0	3	3	MIZZEN THE	S>R	D>T	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 5-hole.Uncharacteristic race? 1st off 37 day layoff. Class 9 Finished 7 from post 5 TJW= 52 TJH= 52	2	1	34	9	2	1	86	53	6.70	7.60	14.30	0.88	10.00	10.00	20.00	1.00	91	85	23	36,62,51,64,43	37	E	5	23.4	49.7	1	0	20.00	120	GP	7.0	M>M	8.6	80	82.2	176	199	Pressed2wd btwn;faded/ Rail trn;4-5wd stretch/ Outside trip faded			
			8.0	5	5	YES ITS	S>R	T>T	Slow last race (13). 1st off 31 day layoff. Class 4 Finished 9 from post 5 TJW= 43 TJH= 43	77	3	72	10	74	4	79	76	5.20	5.80	11.00	0.90	2.80	6.30	9.10	0.44	92	94	40	59,71,66,68,70	31	E/P	4	23.9	49.6	1	0	20.00	147	GP	7.5	M>M	6.9	91	93.6	186	226	In range;weaknd turn/ Stlkd btwn;evn str bid/ 2nd flight 3wd;4w;wknd			
			8.0	14	14	SUPER MAMA	S>R	T>T	Made big overall move (5). *Stretch gain (.5). Class 0 Finished 4 from post 8 TJW= 79 TJH= 79	76	2	67	6	76	2	69	63	4.30	4.50	8.80	0.96	2.90	2.90	5.80	1.00	81	76	78	72,40,73,76,76	19	P	6	25.3	49.3	1	0	15.00	155	GP	7.5	M>M	10.3	102	100.3	157	235	3-4wd;edgd for show/ Led;dueled; tired;bled/ 4-5w uppr; wknd late			
			8.0	10	10	SMIRKOTCH	S>R	D>T	Slow last race (12). 1st off 100 day layoff. Class -36 Finished 7 from post 5 TJW= 2 TJH= 2	58	1	47	2	58	1	73	69	9.40	9.40	18.80	1.00	8.90	8.90	17.80	1.00	74	58	60	35,58,0,0,0	100	NA	0	26.1	48.9	0	BOFF	30.00	160	GPW	6.0	S>M	0.0	80	80.7	132	192	Trailed;no bid/ Step slow start;no bid/			
			8.0	12	12	INDY	S>R	T>T	Fast last race (25). Class 0 Finished 10 from post 3 TJW= 54 TJH= 54	59	2	40	6	59	2	66	95	8.60	8.60	17.20		8.50	6.50	15.00	1.31	79	71	72	65,61,8,42,-9	19	NA	2	25.8	50.4	1	0	30.00	120	GP	7.5	M>M	3.4	88	81.1	150	222	Urged rail tn;no rally/ Saved ground;no threat/ Slow st;ease to wire			
			8.0	7	7	ITS ABOUT	S>R	T>T	Made big overall move (3). *Stretch gain (1.75). Fast last race (12). Class 0 Finished 5 from post 4 TJW= 24 TJH= 24	60	2	59	9	60	2	69	97	5.80	5.80	11.60		5.50	6.40	11.90	0.86	82	77	76	71,60,47,63,46	19	S	6	25.2	49.7	1	0	20.00	117	GP	7.5	M>M	10.3	93	95.3	159	235	Steadid 1st;keen;wide/ Inside bid;no impact/ 3wd bid tn;weaknd			
			8.0	11	11	MIDNIGHT	S>R	T>T	Made big overall move (3). Fast last race (28). 1st off 31 day layoff. Class 4 Finished 3 from post 4 TJW= 70 TJH= 70	68	1	47	10	68	1	79	88	5.80	5.40	11.20	1.07	0.80	2.50	3.30	0.32	92	94	64	75,68,51,44,38	31	E	6	23.9	47.8	1	0	10.00	115	GP	7.5	M>M	10.3	100	100.3	186	250	Mid-flight;3w gain;evn/ Set pace;ins;tired/ Early spd btw hrs			
			8.0	1	1	BERNING	R>R	T>T	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 3-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH! Clear early.1st off 46 day layoff. Class 4 Finished 2 from post 3 TJW= 65 TJH= 65	65	2	67	10	65	2	77	100	5.70	5.00	10.70	1.14	4.50	4.00	8.50	1.13	77	67	90	72,71,75,57,69	46	E/P	6	49.9	74.2	1	0	3.00	143	GP	8.0	M>M	10.3	113	102.0	144	234	Pressurd pace;outkickd/ 3w1st; 2p traffic uppr/ Bdi 3w1/4p;inching up			
			8.0	4	4	MUCH ABOUT	R>R	T>T	1st off 45 day layoff. Class -21 Finished 7 from post 6 TJW= 85 TJH= 85	78	2	78	2	78	2	85	95	5.90	5.00	10.90	1.18	5.90	5.00	10.90	1.18	79	84	82	80,76,0,0,0	45	NA	0	48.1	72.1	1	0	2.50	140	GP	8.0	M>M	0.0	111	101.1	163	245	Bmp2x st;steadied late/ Bid 2nd tn;drft out/			
			8.0	2	2	BARB'S	S>R	T>T	Made big overall move (5). Fast last race (14). 1st off 31 day layoff. Class 4 Finished 5 from post 10 TJW= 36 TJH= 36	ERR	0	56	6	ERR	0	77	86	7.90	6.00	13.90	1.32	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	87	90	61	70,54,53,53,51	31	S	3	24.3	48.4	1	0	15.00	117	GP	7.5	M>M	5.2	90	86.6	177	238	Bumped at the start/ Raced wide throughout		
			8.0	13	13	MAMBO	S>R	T>T	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 2-hole.Uncharacteristic race? Class 0 Finished 6 from post 2 TJW= 50 TJH= 50	73	4	72	5	73	4	74	90	7.40	5.10	12.50	1.45	8.90	5.00	13.90	1.78	91	88	61	69,69,71,76,77	19	S	3	24.2	49.3	1	BON	10.00	146	GP	7.5	M>M	5.2	106	98.6	179	240	Rail bid 1/4;2wd;flatn/ Insde;ang out;mildly/ 2w;btwn foes 2nd turn			
			8.0	15	15	SACRIFICE	S>R	T>T	Class 0 Finished 3 from post 1 TJW= 59 TJH= 59	72	1	72	5	72	1	73	95	6.40	4.30	10.70	1.49	3.30	5.60	8.90	0.59	87	85	70	73,62,72,74,78	19	P	6	24.5	48.9	1	0	10.00	134	GP	7.5	M>M	10.3	102	96.9	172	242	Snug hold;3w;miss2nd/ Chased 4-3w; tired/ Chased 2p; weakened			
			8.0	9	9	SAL AND	R>R	T>T	Made big overall move (4). *Stretch gain (.75). 1st off 46 day layoff. Class 4 Finished 4 from post 4 TJW= 27 TJH= 27	66	1	66	1	66	1	70	102	7.00	4.00	11.00	1.75	7.00	4.00	11.00	1.75	70	55	94	66,0,0,0,0	46	NA	0	51.3	75.6	1	0	8.00	120	GP	8.0	M>M	0.0	95	97.0	125	219	5wd bid uppr;imprve/ /			





DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	SRR	SUR	NOTES FROM LAST RACE	ASP	AVG	ASP	LAST FIVE																ERLY TOTL		TOTL		COMMENTS														
									110	RX	SPD	R#	TDS	RT	S1	S2	SYS1	SYS2	CLOS	CLOSE	TDONE	TD TWO	TD TOT	CLOSE	P2F	P4F	PFN	SPEED	RATINGS	DSL	BRIS		P	CALL1	CALL2	MEDS	EQUIP	MLINE	CLS	TRK	DIS	CHNG	SPPNT	PWR	COMB	TOTL
1/20/19	GP	11	6.0	3 3	KOKOMO	S>S	D>D	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 4-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH! Clear early. Class 0 Finished 8 from post 4 TJW= 19 TJH= 28	64	7	64	10	64	8	92	65	3.30	8.30	11.60	0.40	2.60	8.10	10.70	0.32	93	96	46	58,66,59,54,76	17	E	7	22.6	45.7	1	0	20.00	131	GP	6.5	C>C	17.5	110	88.8	189	235	Set pace;collared 3/16/ Vied btwn 2-3wd; tired/ Early bid;retreated tn
			6.0	12 12	KID MAC	S>S	T>D	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 6-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH! Clear early. Class -10 Finished 12 from post 6 TJW= 32 TJH= 43	72	2	72	10	72	2	84	90	2.40	5.70	8.10	0.42	2.50	4.40	6.90	0.57	95	104	59	78,68,79,72,76	16	E/P	5	23.6	47.6	1	0	20.00	131	GP	7.5	C>C	12.5	109	92.7	199	258	Set pace;duel;tired/ Vied 3wd btw; gave way/ Dueled btw; insd;empty
			6.0	9 9	SUB FACTUM	S>S	D>D	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 4-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH! Clear early. Class 4 Finished 1 from post 4 TJW= 19 TJH= 32	69	10	69	10	69	10	88	83	2.10	4.20	6.30	0.50	2.10	4.20	6.30	0.50	87	85	84	78,63,71,78,44	21	E/P	7	23.1	46.6	1	0	12.00	118	GP	6.0	C>C	17.5	110	102.5	172	256	Duel 2wd;drew clear/ Pressed 3wd;bid;faded/ Duel past 1/8p;tired
			6.0	7 7	MYSTICAL	S>S	D>D	1st off 31 day layoff. Class 4 Finished 6 from post 6 TJW= 9 TJH= 21	62	8	61	9	62	8	89	68	5.30	7.60	12.90	0.70	4.60	7.20	11.80	0.64	93	97	61	67,68,0,54,61	31	E	4	23.5	46.5	1	0	30.00	124	GP	6.0	C>C	10.0	110	96.7	190	251	Bump;pinch back start/ Argued pace 3-4wd;wknd/ Lost irons;pulled up
			6.0	2 2	DIFFERENCE	S>S	T>D	1st off 56 day layoff. Class 4 Finished 5 from post 7 TJW= 59 TJH= 81	83	2	76	9	80	3	82	-1	2.90	3.80	6.70	0.76	2.30	2.70	5.00	0.85	82		75	67,74,73,73,81	56	E/P	4	23.5	47.4	1	0	6.00	148	GPW	5.0	C>C	10.0	115	98.9	82	157	3wd turn; lacked a bid/ Duel 2pth;edged awy/ Steadied 1/4;outsde bd
			6.0	10 10	GRAND JR	S>S	T>D	Class -10 Finished 9 from post 2 TJW= 17 TJH= 21	50	1	65	10	50	1	92	0	6.20	7.50	13.70	0.83	6.00	9.00	15.00	0.67	94		59	63,66,50,72,62	18	P	0	22.7	45.8	1	0	30.00	125	GP	5.0	C>C	0.0	100	81.0	94	153	4wd throughout; outrun/ Cut corner; no threat/ Early bid; retreated
			6.0	11 11	SHERPA	S>S	T>D	Flashed speed. Class -10 Finished 7 from post 1 TJW= 36 TJH= 48	82	2	77	10	81	4	97	0	4.70	5.30	10.00	0.89	3.50	3.80	7.30	0.92	105		64	78,82,85,73,54	18	E/P	4	21.6	44.8	1	0	4.50	158	GP	5.0	C>C	10.0	118	104.3	105	169	Ins turn;2p upr;no bid/ Pressurd pace;duel str/ Gaining;steadied late
			6.0	5 5	NUCLEAR	S>S	D>D	Made big overall move (4). *Stretch gain (1.5). Fast last race (15). 1st off 31 day layoff. Class 4 Finished 2 from post 1 TJW= 24 TJH= 44	74	5	67	10	74	5	86	80	5.30	5.50	10.80	0.96	6.60	3.40	10.00	1.94	84	90	85	82,48,71,71,76	31	P	0	24.2	46.5	1	0	8.00	127	GP	6.0	C>C	0.0	109	98.2	174	259	2wd bid tn;kept on/ Midpack 5w;retreated/ Swung wide; bore out;
			6.0	8 8	GOLDEN	S>S	D>D	Made big overall move (4). *Stretch gain (1.5). 1st off 45 day layoff. Class 4 Finished 2 from post 7 TJW= 17 TJH= 28	76	7	76	10	76	7	84	83	3.50	3.60	7.10	0.97	3.80	3.60	7.40	1.06	85	89	80	76,69,74,74,79	45	E/P	4	23.9	47.6	1	0	15.00	123	GP	5.5	C>C	10.0	111	98.8	174	254	Rally btw; pick up 2nd/ Vied erly;chase tn;wkn/ Chase pace;ins 1/4p
			6.0	1 1	SALSA	S>S	D>D	Made big overall move (3). Class 0 Finished 5 from post 2 TJW= 39 TJH= 48	72	7	69	10	72	7	85	78	7.10	6.80	13.90	1.04	7.00	5.80	12.80	1.21	82	82	73	68,62,50,55,67	17	P	1	24.0	46.4	1	0	30.00	121	GP	6.5	C>C	2.5	105	79.4	164	237	Urged turn;mild imprve/ Broke out;brushd start/ Wide 1st;brief bid
			6.0	13 13	COPPER	S>S	D>D	Class 0 Finished 6 from post 10 TJW= 12 TJH= 23	72	2	71	10	73	3	86	76	5.60	5.10	10.70	1.10	6.70	4.10	10.80	1.63	87	83	69	66,78,73,62,77	17	P	1	23.9	46.3	1	0	20.00	126	GP	6.5	C>C	2.5	110	93.8	170	239	Wide upper;evenly/ Chase pace;6wd uppr/ Keen while rated;wknd
			6.0	4 4	DR HARLAN	S>S	D>D	Made big overall move (4). Class 0 Finished 2 from post 5 TJW= 33 TJH= 55	74	6	74	9	74	7	87	81	4.20	3.60	7.80	1.17	3.90	3.20	7.10	1.22	84	86	77	74,84,77,81,67	17	P	3	23.6	45.6	1	0	3.00	141	GP	6.5	C>C	7.5	118	101.7	170	247	2wd bid tn;shift wider/ Vied 1/8;lack need kik/ Bump st; 2wd btwn;drvg
			6.0	6 6	OVERZEALOU	R>S	D>D	Flashed speed. Class -1 Finished 3 from post 1 TJW= 41 TJH= 61	80	1	75	9	80	1	86	81	5.30	4.40	9.70	1.21	7.00	2.00	9.00	3.50	79	79	74	70,86,0,80,80	25	P	0	47.7	72.8	1	0	3.50	144	GP	8.0	C>C	0.0	119	99.0	158	232	Chased btwn; wknd str/ Shook free 3/8p;clear/ Eased str; vanned off











DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	SRR	SUR	NOTES FROM LAST RACE	ASP	AVG	ASP	LAST FIVE											ERLY TOTL		TTL		COMMENTS																				
									110	RX	SPD	R#	TDS	RT	S1	S2	SYS1	SYS2	CLOS	CLOSE	TDONE	TDW0	TDTOT	CLOSE	P2F	P4F		PFN	SPEED	RATINGS	DSL	R	P	CALL1	CALL2	MEDS	EQUIP	MLINE	CLS	TRK	DIS	CHNG	SPPNT	PWR	COMB	TOTL	LAST
1/20/19	SA	9	6.0	1	1	DON'TEATMY	R>S	T>D	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 8-hole. Slow last race (11).Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH! 1st off 100 day layoff. Class -36 Finished 10 from post 8 TJW= 49 TJH= 82	76	2	70	3	76	2	89	71	2.60	6.10	8.70	0.43	2.30	3.10	5.40	0.74	95	99	39	59,77,74,0,0	100	E	5	46.2	72.6	1	0	2.00	152	SA	8.0	R>C	20.0	107	92.0	194	233	Pulled;dueled;wkened/ Bit off rail;held game/ Drifted in str;held 3d
			6.0	5	5	MAJESTIC	S>S	D>D	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 6-hole. Slow last race (49).Uncharacteristic race? 1st off 71 day layoff. Class -1 Finished 10 from post 6 TJW= 41 TJH= 54	63	4	68	7	67	5	87	51	4.10	5.70	9.80	0.72	4.20	5.10	9.30	0.82	87	81	10	19,-8,79,70,84	71	E/P	5	23.3	49.9	1	0	15.00	146	DMR	6.5	C>C	20.0	97	84.2	168	178	4wd;gave way;eased/ Eased lane;walked off/ Rail bid str;gamely
			6.0	3	3	BLISSFUL	S>S	D>D	Flashed speed. Class 4 Finished 8 from post 2 TJW= 67 TJH= 73	67	10	67	10	67	10	85	81	6.00	7.00	13.00	0.86	6.00	7.00	13.00	0.86	86	78	80	68,62,56,68,73	23	E/P	4	23.5	47.9	1	0	20.00	132	SA	6.0	C>C	16.0	107	89.4	164	244	Stalked pace; weakened/ Saved ground; no rally/ Came out str;wkened
			6.0	7	7	MI	S>S	D>D	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 4-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH! Clear early. Class 4 Finished 4 from post 4 TJW= 47 TJH= 58	68	7	70	9	70	9	90	79	3.90	4.40	8.30	0.89	3.90	4.40	8.30	0.89	90	87	77	74,69,69,85,72	23	E	6	22.6	46.5	1	0	4.00	121	SA	6.0	C>C	24.0	112	94.5	177	254	Inside;wkened late/ 3wd into str;gamely/ Vied;stalked;wkened
			6.0	8	8	TIZ MI	S>S	D>D	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 1-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH!BTL horse. Clear early.1st off 42 day layoff. Class 9 Finished 6 from post 1 TJW= 30 TJH= 50	67	2	67	5	66	3	89	-5	6.50	6.00	12.50	1.08	5.40	5.00	10.40	1.08	91	65	66,54,63,79,72	42	E/P	3	22.0	45.7	1	0	12.00	156	LRC	5.0	C>C	12.0	111	100.8	91	156	Inside duel;weakened/ Chased; weakened/ Spill;steadied late	
			6.0	2	2	K P'S	S>S	D>D	Made big overall move (6). *Stretch gain (.75). Class 4 Finished 5 from post 11 TJW= 72 TJH= 83	69	3	71	9	69	3	84	84	6.30	5.40	11.70	1.17	7.40	4.10	11.50	1.81	77	76	87	72,70,69,73,72	23	P	0	23.7	47.5	1	0	5.00	136	SA	6.0	C>C	0.0	111	95.4	153	240	5wd;4wd;no rally/ 3wd bid;led;held 3rd/ Inside trip;weakened
			6.0	6	6	LUCKY VAL	S>S	D>D	Made a big move early (3.25). *Stretch gain (1.25). 1st off 45 day layoff. Class -1 Finished 7 from post 3 TJW= 22 TJH= 42	75	4	69	5	75	4	82	84	8.00	5.90	13.90	1.36	7.90	5.30	13.20	1.49	71	79	84	71,72,80,46,78	45	P	2	23.1	46.0	1	0	6.00	136	LRC	5.5	C>C	8.0	109	102.2	150	234	3wd into str;rail late/ Chased; no rally/ Steadied start;bid btw
			6.0	4	4	LONDON	S>S	D>D	Chased Pace. Made big overall move (5). Made a big move early (3.75). 1st off 58 day layoff. Class 9 Finished 1 from post 3 TJW= 52 TJH= 77	79	3	74	4	79	3	83	89	7.10	4.70	11.80	1.51	5.50	2.30	7.80	2.39	72	74	95	79,83,75,59,0	58	S	0	23.7	47.4	1	0	2.50	143	DMR	6.5	M>C	0.0	116	104.6	146	241	Drifted in;ridden out/ Off bit slow;4wd lane/ Off bit slow;inside

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	SRR	SUR	NOTES FROM LAST RACE	ASP	AVG	ASP	LAST FIVE															ERLY		TOTL	PACE		COMMENTS															
									110	RX	SPD	R#	TDS	RT	S1	S2	SYS1	SYS2	CLOS	CLOSE	TDONE	TD TWO	TD TOT	CLOSE	P2F	P4F	PFN	SPEED	RATINGS	DSL	R		P	CALL1	CALL2	MEDS	EQUIP	MLINE	CLS	TRK	DIS	CHNG	SPPNT	PWR	COMB	TOTL	LAST
1/20/19	SA	10	6.5	3	3	NAUGHTY	S>S	D>T	Chased Pace. Slow last race (16). Class 56 Finished 7 from post 3 TJW= 43 TJH= 76	ERR	0	81	9	87	2	93	66	1.60	3.60	5.20	0.44	1.60	3.70	5.30	0.43	94	99	55	65,84,89,93,76	25	E	6	22.0	45.6	1	0	10.00	152	SA	6.0	C>A	25.0	121	96.9	193	248	Bobbled start;wkened/ Inside;outkicked late/ Lugged out 4wd turn
			6.5	6	6	HAPPINESS	S>S	T>T	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 7-hole. 1st off 57 day layoff. Class 4 Finished 9 from post 7 TJW= 42 TJH= 67	ERR	0	78	4	79	1	88	-7	3.40	6.60	10.00	0.52	3.60	8.20	11.80	0.44	97	72	79,62,82,90,0	57	E	5	22.6	45.5	1	0	20.00	177	DMR	5.0	AO>A	20.8	113	102.7	97	169	Vied;stalked;wkened/ 3wd turn; fell back/ Hopped;duel ins;wknd Speed;inside;wkened/ Came out str;outkicked/ Saved ground; weakened	
			6.5	5	5	SPY RING	R>S	T>T	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 1-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH! 1st off 218 day layoff. Class -1 Finished 10 from post 1 TJW= 38 TJH= 48	ERR	1	82	5	89	1	88	80	3.70	6.70	10.40	0.55	4.50	1.80	6.30	2.50	97	103	53	74,83,76,86,89	218	E/P	0	47.2	73.1	1	0	8.00	203	SA	8.0	AO>A	0.0	114	98.4	200	253	
			6.5	7	7	DRIFT AWAY	R>S	T>T	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 5-hole. Clear early. Class 25 Finished 1 from post 5 TJW= 87 TJH= 120	ERR	0	77	10	69	1	84	100	3.70	5.30	9.00	0.70	5.80	6.70	12.50	0.87	82	82	91	86,79,77,78,77	16	E/P	1	48.4	72.8	1	0	10.00	168	SA	8.0	R>A	4.2	128	105.1	164	255	Bid;dueled;led late/ Bid 3wd 1/4;weakened/ Bid 3wd;led;wkened
			6.5	8	8	WE ALL	S>S	D>T	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 5-hole. Slow last race (38). 1st off 245 day layoff. Class 4 Finished 7 from post 5 TJW= 81 TJH= 106	ERR	0	67	4	ERR	0	92	51	4.30	5.70	10.00	0.75	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	90	92	6	29,66,90,83,0	245	E	4	23.0	48.1	1	0	12.00	186	SA	7.0	AO>A	16.7	104	89.3	182	188	Vied;gave way;eased/ Bit off rail;weakened/ Drifted in str;clear
			6.5	1	1	BATIQUITOS	S>S	T>T	*Stretch gain (2).BTL horse. 1st off 57 day layoff. Class 4 Finished 4 from post 9 TJW= 84 TJH= 104	ERR	2	81	10	83	5	87	-7	4.10	4.00	8.10	1.03	4.20	2.70	6.90	1.56	94	81	84,82,82,68,79	57	P	3	22.8	45.5	1	0	8.00	189	DMR	5.0	AO>A	12.5	127	108.7	94	175	4wd into str;btw late/ Dueled;led;held game/ Steadied 3/8;4wd lane	
			6.5	11	11	OLEKSANDRA	R>S	T>T	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 1-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH! Clear early.1st off 59 day layoff. Class 4 Finished 9 from post 1 TJW= 64 TJH= 84	ERR	1	79	2	82	1	86	81	5.20	4.80	10.00	1.08	9.00	1.00	10.00	9.00	93	94	67	76,82,0,0,0	59	E/P	0	46.4	70.7	1	0	3.50	178	DMR	8.0	AO>A	0.0	128	104.0	187	254	Pulled;inside;wkened/ Off bit slow;steadied/
			6.5	9	9	FIERY LADY	R>S	D>T	Flashed speed. Made big overall move (3). *Stretch gain (.5). 1st off 43 day layoff. Class -6 Finished 2 from post 5 TJW= 37 TJH= 66	ERR	0	84	10	ERR	0	71	93	6.40	4.80	11.20	1.33	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	80	81	93	89,87,83,80,82	43	P	1	49.9	74.1	1	0	6.00	169	GG	8.5	N>A	4.2	135	102.7	161	254	Bid 2-3w;late bid 2d/ Bid 4w;rallied;nipped/ Bid 3w;rallied;driving
			6.5	10	10	HELEN'S	S>S	D>T	Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 7-hole. *Stretch gain (1.5).BTL horse. 1st off 43 day layoff. Class -16 Finished 6 from post 7 TJW= 69 TJH= 82	ERR	3	84	10	86	8	89	85	4.80	3.20	8.00	1.50	5.20	2.70	7.90	1.93	91	97	84	87,87,86,91,92	43	P	3	22.8	45.7	1	0	5.00	181	GG	6.0	N>A	12.5	134	108.2	188	272	Roused 3w; evenly/ Surged 4wd late;edged/ Fanned 6wd into lane
			6.5	4	4	SPECIAL	S>S	T>T	Made big overall move (4). *Stretch gain (2.75).BTL horse. 1st off 238 day layoff. Class -14 Finished 2 from post 7 TJW= 81 TJH= 114	ERR	1	84	1	84	1	92	97	8.60	2.90	11.50	2.97	8.60	2.90	11.50	2.97	83	90	86	84,0,0,0,0	238	S	0	22.5	44.6	1	0	4.00	208	SA	6.5	N>A	0.0	131	110.6	173	259	4wd into str;rallied/ /
			6.5	2	2	GLEEFULY	S>S	D>T	Made big overall move (6). 1st off 43 day layoff. Class 49 Finished 1 from post 3 TJW= 26 TJH= 76	ERR	1	81	2	78	1	82	89	5.50	1.50	7.00	3.67	4.00	2.00	6.00	2.00	82	83	93	83,78,0,0,0	43	P	1	23.4	46.8	1	0	20.00	143	GG	6.0	S>A	4.2	116	108.5	165	258	4w;swung out;surged/ Bit off rail;2nd best/