AVG ASP ASP LAST BEST  BEST

DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE DST SURF MOVING? SPD R# TDS RT 110 RD SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDS1 TDS2 CLOSE BROT1 P2F P4F LST Last DSLR BTOT POWER MLINE 3AVG TIW% CLS COMMENT OVERAL LAST TOTALS
1/5/20 AQU 1 8.0 2 2 HONORABL R>R D>D Y(1>2) Class Change -18 63 5 68 2 68 2 4.1 3.9 1.1 5.0 4.2 1.2 53.38 81 75 75 231 45 298 106.6 1.00 65 36 142 2p5/16;best of rest 409 540 949
8.0 1 1 CARNEGIE S>R D>D N(3>8) Class Change -13 57 1 ERR © ERR © 9.1 7.3 1.3 ERR ERR ERR 51.89 70 64 81 215 43 215 99.8 1.60 57 79 137 Bump st;ins half;3w 391 488 879
8.0 5 4 CRAY S>R D>D SP-11/N(2>11) Class Change -13 56 2 ERR © ERR © 9.5 8.1 1.2 ERR ERR ERR 53.64 75 69 61 205 64 205 97.5 6.00 56 99 140 Brush after brk;inside 384 437 821
8.0 3 1A LEGEND S>R D>D F/Y(8>7) Class Change -13 5 5 22 1 22 1 5.7 8.7 0.7 9.110.06 0.9 55.67 89 81 45 215 15 215 101.1 1.60 52 76 162 3w;press half; folded 357 437 794
8.0 4 3 CONCRETE S>R D>D BM2:5/SG:3.5/N(7>10) Class Change 43 1 ERR © ERR © 10.0 8.3 1.2 ERR ERR ERR 46.83 66 39 84 189 22 189 86.8 8.00 43 35 137 Fog;insidejnever in it 335 412 747
-13
8.0 7 7 ODIN'S S>R D>D N(5»12) Class Change -13 38 2 ERR O ERR © 8.9 9.5 0.9 ERR ERR ERR 51.58 73 66 42 181 22 181 89.3 15.00 38 12 140 Fog;to rail 1/2;no bid 317 347 664
8.0 6 5 OLIVER S>R D>D N(1>6) Class Change -18 34 1 ERR © ERR © 10.0 10.0 1.0 ERR ERR ERR 52.91 73 49 122 144 122 82.5 12.00 34 41 142 Brk slw;dkd in shrply 307 339 646
AVG ASP ASP LAST BEST  BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE DST SURF MOVING? SPD R# TDS RT 110 RD SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDS1 TDS2 CLOSE BROT1 P2F P4F LST Last DSLR BTOT POWER MLINE 3AVG TIW% CLS COMMENT OVERAL LAST TOTALS
1/5/206 AQU 2 6.5 2 2 NISHA S>S D>D  F/PP/WATCH/E/Y(1>1) Class Change 9 86 9 87 7 87 7 3.1 3.6 ©.9 3.1 2.9 1.157.17 93 95 95 283 241 283 130.1 1.20 79 65 183 In hand 2p; held well 451 571 1022
6.5 1 1 NOWITNA S>S D>D BOM:4/N(6>5) Class Change -6 7810 78 9 77 6 8.4 4.1 2.0 8.4 4.5 1.951.79 77 75 91 243 8 243 119.9 15.00 77 41 130 Dart to rail 1/2;7wl/8 418 483 901
6.5 3 3 MALARKEY S>S D>D SP-12/N(4>9) Class Change 9 76 106 76 8 76 8 4.4 59 0.7 4.4 5.5 0.856.77 93 96 58 247 163 247 115.0 6.00 76 143 146 2p-ins turn;asked 5/16 404 458 862
6.5 4 4 COVER S>S D>D  BOM:4/N(2>3) Class Change -6 7510 75 8 74 7 7.6 4.6 1.6 7.4 4.0 1.9 53.46 84 83 85 252 8 252 119.0 6.00 77 182 146 To insl1/2;3w into lane 412 499 911
6.5 5 5 MISS MI S>S D>D F/PP/SP+11/Y(4>2) Class Change -31 7410 78 4 81 3 4.4 4.6 1.1 3.9 3.2 1.258.56 92 98 80 270 57 270 125.7 1.60 80 110 127 Move out; got 2nd 422 538 959
6.5 6 6 COBRA R>S D>D BOM:4/SG:.25/N(2>2) Class Change 7210 70 4 70 2 9.4 5.8 1.610.0 6.4 1.650.65 59 61 79 199 25 270 111.7 10.00 74 46 137 Off pace;chased str 393 451 844
-11
AVG ASP ASP LAST BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE DST SURF MOVING? SPD R# TDS RT 110 RD SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDS1 TDS2 CLOSE BROT1 P2F P4F LST Last DSLR BTOT POWER MLINE 3AVG TIW% CLS COMMENT OVERAL LAST TOTALS
1/5/206 AQU 3 6.0 3 3 VICTORY S>S D>D F/PP/WATCH/Y(4>2) Class Change 2 68 2 68 2 68 2 4.3 2.9 1.5 4.3 2.9 1.555.98 86 74 83 243 44 243 109.0 1.60 68 99 127 3-2w in aim; held 2nd 493 555 1048
6.0 4 4 HOSTILE R>S D>D F/Y(9>4) Class Change 2 63 5 5 1 56 1 4.5 6.6 0.7 5.6 7.8 0.752.91 78 74 80 232 7 301 109.1 2.00 66 80 154 6w uppr; flattened out 465 542 1007
6.0 1 1 GRITO DE S>S D>D SP+11/N(3>4) Class Change 2 56 2 56 2 56 2 8.7 8.0 1.1 8.7 8.0 1.154.93 78 79 77 234 21 234 106.9 4.50 56 109 140 Hustle early; 4w turn 448 538 987
6.0 6 6 TIPAZO S>S D>D SP+19/N(7>2) Class Change 2 51 5 49 4 51 3 7.3 7.6 1.0 7.6 7.0 1.156.34 91 85 75 251 21 251 103.4 6.00 58 38 137 3w turn; rally place 418 539 957
6.0 5 5 JOHN R>S D>D SP+19/N(8>8) Class Change 2 42 5 34 3 33 2 9.3 8.6 1.110.0 9.1 1.151.46 71 70 79 220 7 275 97.7 15.00 42 116 142 Chased 5-6w; no impact 375 481 856
6.0 7 7 BIG'S S>S D>D  F/Y(4>9) Class Change -13 20 1 20 1 20 1 5.6 10.0 0.6 5.6 10.0 0.6 54.95 91 84 9 184 23 184 87.5 15.00 20 25 142 2wl1/2;rhru after half 300 345 646
6.0 2 2 IHADADRE 0>S >D  Y(0>0) ERR © ERR © ERR © ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR Q ¥*xx 4] 8.00 ERR 90 ERR ERR ERR ERR
AVG ASP ASP LAST BEST  BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE DST SURF MOVING? SPD R# TDS RT 110 RD SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDS1 TDS2 CLOSE BROT1 P2F P4F LST Last DSLR BTOT POWER MLINE 3AVG TIW% CLS COMMENT OVERAL LAST TOTALS
1/5/206 AQU 4 6.6 3 3 PRAIRIE S>S D>D T/BOM:6/SG:4.25/Y(4>5) Class Change 74 6 74 6 74 6 6.5 3.8 1.7 6.5 3.8 1.7 52.84 84 80 91 255 8 255 120.6 4.00 80 218 154 4w upper; belatedly 374 453 827
-11
6.0 2 2 ELEGANT S>S D>D F/PP/T/SP+11/WATCH/E/Y(5>3) Class 7310 78 5 78 4 4.2 5.7 0.7 3.0 3.9 0.856.65 89 93 82 264 72 264 119.5 1.60 83 82 156 Inside;led to ins 1/16 379 476 855
Change 4
6.0 1 1 CADEAU S>S D>D BOM:4/Y(10>1) Class Change 29 7310 77 5 76 4 7.2 5.2 1.4 7.6 4.1 1.955.05 87 88 88 263 23 263 119.5 1.80 74 82 177 4w;6wl/8;up ins 1/16 373 468 841
6.0 7 7 DIRTY R>S D>D BOM:3/N(1>3) Class Change 34 72 9 73 5 73 5 5.3 4.3 1.2 6.5 4.9 1.356.36 8 91 70 247 21 333 118.1 5.00 78 76 148 2w turn;3w upr;got shw 365 437 801
6.0 4 4 WHYISSHE R>S D>D F/SP-27/UN?/Y(3>7) Class Change 54 7110 74 8 75 6 6.6 5.9 1.1 7.1 5.1 1.456.52 90 96 18 204 21 292 108.3 12.00 65 158 146 Inside turn; 3w upper 350 337 687
6.0 5 5 HAPPYCRE R>S D>D F/Y(4>6) Class Change 64 66 10 ERR © ERR © 4.7 5.2 0.9 ERR ERR ERR 53.26 82 83 52 217 39 296 105.2 30.00 65 0 121 Stalked;3w;no threat 328 377 705
6.0 6 6 TRANS S>S D>D  F/PP/SP+20/WATCH/Y(1>1) Class 5 4 66 3 66 3 5.5 6.8 0.8 5.7 5.7 1.058.38 91 92 79 262 59 262 105.6 15.00 54 92 156 5w upper; edged clear 330 454 784
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AVG ASP ASP LAST BEST  BEST

DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE DST SURF MOVING? SPD R# TDS RT 110 RD SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDS1 TDS2 CLOSE BROT1 P2F P4F LST Last DSLR BTOT POWER MLINE 3AVG TIW% CLS COMMENT OVERAL LAST TOTALS
1/5/20 GP 1 5.0 4 4 FRIENDLY S>S D>T F/PP/E/Y(4>3) Class Change -6 75 4 ERR © ERR © 3.1 3.8 ©.8 ERR ERR ERR 58.64 93 93 72 258 25 258 113.6 4.00 77 98 143 Dueled 2wd; wknd 1/8p 351 417 768
5.6 3 3 R BOY S>S D>T  F/PP/UN?/E/Y(6>3) Class Change 9 79 2 68 1 68 1 2.9 3.6 ©.8 2.5 2.5 1.058.82 95 91 71 257 23 257 1065.0 3.00 70 150 111 Pace inside; weakened 335 409 744
5.0 1 1 BARBIE'S S>S D>T Y(5>5) Class Change 9 68 106 68 5ERR © 4.8 4.8 1.0 6.3 4.5 1.455.65 76 72 68 216 50 216 98.7 12.00 65 286 113 Track btw;3wd;gavewy 320 356 676
5.0 5 5 NOTHIN  S>S D>T F/UN?/Y(3>5) Class Change -6 63 1 ERR © ERR © 8.3 8.3 1.0 ERR ERR ERR 56.87 90 86 66 242 25 242 96.5 10.00 63 55 126 Off slow; faded 4wd 314 381 695
5.0 9 9 COLMAN S>S T>T F/PP/Y(1>6) Class Change -16 62 5 68 4 66 3 3.3 8.3 0.4 2.9 7.7 0.460.30 90 62 152 17 152 93.3 2.50 66 121 157 Vied inside; wknd uppr 314 334 648
5.0 8 8 PINK S>S D>T  F/PP/Y(9>3) Class Change 14 61 6 51 2 51 2 3.1 5.3 0.6 6.7 10.0 0.7 59.38 97 95 64 256 30 256 98.3 15.00 68 50 99 Forced pace;evened out 310 397 707
5.0 2 2 FRIED S>S D>T  F/PP/T/SP+21/WATCH/E/Y(6>6) Class 5010 62 4 62 4 2.6 6.4 0.4 1.4 4.0 0.456.87 8 88 71 245 52 245 100.8 6.00 66 187 116 Vied;weakend late 287 392 678
Change 9
5.0 6 6 SACCO S>S D>T N(2>6) Class Change 9 47 3 ERR © ERR © 7.3 8.2 0.9 ERR ERR ERR 56.39 82 81 46 209 23 209 89.0 15.00 47 104 118 Outrun 3wd; eased up 270 314 584
5.0 7 7 CHARLIE ©>S >T Y(0>0) ERR © ERR © ERR © ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR Q k¥kx 0 10.00 ERR 115 ERR ERR ERR ERR
AVG ASP ASP LAST BEST  BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE DST SURF MOVING? SPD R# TDS RT 110 RD SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDS1 TDS2 CLOSE BROT1 P2F P4F LST Last DSLR BTOT POWER MLINE 3AVG TIW% CLS COMMENT OVERAL LAST TOTALS
1/5/20 GP 2 6.0 4 4 COMPANY S>S D>D F/PP/T/WATCH/E/Y(4>2) Class Change 81 7 81 7 81 7 4.7 3.3 1.4 4.7 3.3 1.459.22 99 108 74 281 21 281 126.5 1.60 83 141 157 Drift; brushed;yielded 537 672 1208
4
6.0 3 3 BROTHER S>S D>D F/Y(6>5) Class Change -36 80 4 80 4 8 4 3.2 5.0 0.6 3.2 5.0 0.655.96 88 87 77 252 38 252 122.4 1.80 81 83 177 Came out st; 4pth turn 525 605 1129
6.0 1 1 PARKLAND S>S D>D T/SG:3.25/Y(2>3) Class Change 4 77 6 8 4 83 3 5.1 5.6 0.9 4.3 4.3 1.057.17 94100 81 275 21 275 119.1 4.50 83 81 155 Rail trip;edged closer 518 661 1178
6.0 5 5 ROAD TO R>S T>D F/PP/WATCH/Y(1>4) Class Change 29 76 3 ERR @ ERR © 6.3 5.6 1.1 ERR ERR ERR 54.70 82 83 64 229 23 309 113.3 6.00 76 131 158 Inherited lead; wilted 500 569 1069
6.0 2 2 FOUR OF S>S D>D N(10>10) Class Change -36 50 1 50 1 50 1 6.010.06 0.6 6.0 10.0 0.6 54.34 84 80 53 217 38 217 104.8 8.00 50 165 186 Slow; came out start 421 494 915
6.0 6 6 KINGS 0>S >D  Y(0>0) ERR © ERR © ERR © ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR Q@ wkik 0 15.00 ERR 139 ERR ERR ERR ERR
AVG ASP ASP LAST BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE DST SURF MOVING? SPD R# TDS RT 110 RD SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDS1 TDS2 CLOSE BROT1 P2F P4F LST Last DSLR BTOT POWER MLINE 3AVG TIW% CLS COMMENT OVERAL LAST TOTALS
1/5/20 GP 3 8.5 4 4 BATTLE R>R T>T F/PP/WATCH/E/Y(2>1) Class Change 14 87 10 87 9 87 9 3.5 4.0 0.9 3.3 4.3 0.854.91 8 81 90 255 21 337 138.7 2.00 86 132 176 Easy pace; mild drive 369 433 801
8.5 7 7 DRAGON R>R D>T F/PP/SG:.25/Y(9>2) Class Change -36 8510 85 5 8 5 3.7 6.0 0.6 2.8 6.7 ©0.452.60 72 72 92 236 30 315 125.1 10.00 86 23 194 Stalked;forced;chased 353 420 773
8.5 2 2 SCHOLAR R>R t>T N(7>4) Class Change -16 8510 87 9 8 6 3.1 4.5 0.7 3.2 4.2 0.7 54.43 84 82 87 253 95 334 133.6 3.00 85 151 199 3wlst;2w;askl/4;4w 362 430 792
8.5 5 5 HOLIDAY R>R D>T BOM:5/BM1:4.5/SP+12/N(1>3) Class 8410 84 3 8 2 7.3 6.8 1.1 4.5 7.7 0.656.13 79 99 87 256 29 357 137.9 8.00 87 149 198 Mvd out;loomed;flttnd 358 446 804
Change -61
8.5 3 3 MOROCCO R>R T>T Y(2>5) Class Change -21 8410 8 5 8 5 6.2 5.2 1.2 5.3 6.3 0.852.81 65 73 85 223 31 303 126.1 8.00 84 57 181 Cue 4wd 1/4p;wknd 354 408 762
8.5 1 1 CAMMACK R>R T>T T/BOM:4/BM3:5.44/SG:5.44/Y(4>2) 8410 8 8 8 8 7.1 5.5 1.3 7.3 5.2 1.453.78 8 92 89 267 78 364 139.6 4.00 80 69 186 Inside trip; led late 357 452 809
Class Change -36
8.5 6 6 ZULU R>R T>T BOM:3/SG:2.25/N(4>3) Class Change 8210 8 1 8 1 7.2 6.1 1.2 10.0 4.3 2.353.79 71 71 94 236 21 307 121.2 6.00 65 143 181 Slid out lane;miss plc 348 411 759
14
AVG ASP ASP LAST BEST  BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE DST SURF MOVING? SPD R# TDS RT 110 RD SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDS1 TDS2 CLOSE BROT1 P2F P4F LST Last DSLR BTOT POWER MLINE 3AVG TIW% CLS COMMENT OVERAL LAST TOTALS
1/5/20 GP 4 5.5 6 6 SCARTO S>S D>D F/PP/Y(4>2) Class Change -38 69 1 69 1 69 1 2.9 2.9 1.0 2.9 2.9 1.0 57.32 9% 66 160 210 160 112.0 3.50 69 98 167 Vied;no match;kept on 545 641 1186
5.5 3 3 KHOZY MY S>S D>D F/UN?/Y(8>5) Class Change 2 68 4 68 4 68 4 5.3 4.7 1.1 5.3 4.7 1.155.37 87 81 74 242 18 242 111.6 8.00 68 88 136 Forwardly 4wd; tired 526 695 1221
5.5 5 5 CHINOMAD S>S D>D N(6>8) Class Change -28 606 9 606 9 59 7 6.6 6.3 1.1 6.6 6.3 1.152.34 79 79 57 215 22 215 109.5 15.00 63 69 150 Bmp;clip heel&chk erly 497 588 1085
5.5 4 4 PURECRAZ S>S D>D CP/BM1:3/Y(11>3) Class Change 7 55 6 55 4 63 3 5.1 5.9 0.9 4.6 4.4 1.157.44 84 66 150 24 150 106.5 8.00 62 40 132 Bid 1/4pl; wknd late 488 585 1073
5.5 7 7 CAT GONE S>S D>D SP-22/N(7>7) Class Change -3 49 3 49 3 49 3 3.5 7.3 0.5 3.5 7.3 0.555.21 84 64 49 197 51 197 97.7 10.00 49 61 135 3wd; finished early ddd 491 935
5.5 1 1 PRINCE ©>S >D Y(0>90) ERR © ERR © ERR © ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR Q Fkxx 4] 2.50 ERR 98 ERR ERR ERR ERR
5.5 2 2 ANIMA 0>S >D  Y(0>0) ERR © ERR © ERR © ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR Q ¥kxx 0 2.00 ERR 169 ERR ERR ERR ERR



1/5/20

1/5/20

1/5/20

ANDI'S
HOT

BIT COIN
ALWAYS
PRINCESA
TINY

WILD
BAD
ANNIEGET

POCKET
BABY ICE
BEST

MICAH'S
SHALL

suz

FRECKLES
SALSA

PAY ANY

FIG

MAI TY
STAR

BIG

BOA NOVA
EXPLORAT
HARRY'S

R>R
S>R
R>R

S>S
R>S

S>S

S>S
S>S

S>S
S>S

D>T
™T
D>T

D>D
D>D

D>D

T>D
D>D

D>T
™T
™T
™T

MOVING?

F/PP/Y(5>3) Class Change -16

N(1>6) Class Change 9
F/Y(9>7) Class Change -1

F/PP/WATCH/E/Y(9>6) Class Change 9
F/PP/WATCH/Y(4>5) Class Change -6
F/PP/T/WATCH/E/Y(1>6) Class Change

4

F/UN?/Y(8>7) Class Change 9

N(6>10) Class Change 9

SP-11/N(1>7) Class Change -1

MOVING?

F/PP/E/Y(4>1) Class Change 4
F/SP-14/UN?/Y(5>7) Class Change -1
F/PP/WATCH/E/Y(1>3) Class Change

-89

F/PP/WATCH/E/Y(4>1) Class Change 4
SP-73/WATCH/Z/Y(2>0) Class Change

-61

F/PP/T/SP+12/WATCH/E/Y(1>2) Class

Change -11
F/Y(3>3) Class Change -6
F/Y(1>4) Class Change 4

MOVING?

F/PP/WATCH/E/Y(3>1) Class Change

-16

CP/T/Y(6>4) Class Change -11
SG:1.25/N(2>5) Class Change 4
F/PP/WATCH/Y(5>8) Class Change 9

N(3>11) Class Change -29

F/PP/WATCH/E/Y(1>3) Class Change 4
F/PP/WATCH/E/Y(1>2) Class Change 9
F/PP/WATCH/E/Y(1>1) Class Change 9

MOVING?

58
54
45

39
26

75
73

71

71
69

ERR
ERR
56

75
78

71

73
69

ERR
ERR
56

75
78

70

73
72

RD SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDS1 TDS2 CLOSE

CLOSE

CLOSE

(o)
vl

LAST

BROT1 P2F P4F LST Last DSLR BTOT POWER MLINE 3AVG TIW% CLS

54.
55.
52.

58.
56.

60

55.
.09

57

65
98
o8

88
03

.72

86

.15
.86

85
82
79

95

100

81
91

98
100
93
98
106
97
95

99

90

77

82
70

348
149
297
230
219
319

276
131
201

276

163
251

278
282
182
174

114.
81.
82.
80.
78.
80.

78.
67.
70.

POWER

123.
116.

119.

111.
109.

POWER

.00
.00
.00

5.00

10.00
20.00

45

84
74

78

105

23

30

164
102

120

78
25

TIW%

110
112
123

143
139

152

125
125

203
186
173
187

Prompt pace;vied tn
Inside;3wd;no rally
Forwardly;steady fade
Cleared inside; wilted
Set pace;collared turn
Pace off rail;gave out

Dropped back turn
Brief bid;faded
Done early; eased up

2wd 1/4p;took overl/8
Pressed btwn;drop back
Pace;vied 1/4p;gaveway

Inside duel;clear;held
Bmp st;pull up;wlk off

2-3p trn;clear;nailed

Off duelers; no rally
Ask top str;no respnse

Pressured pace;gamely

3w;btwn foes in lane
Rail; no rally

Set pace;gave way
Through early

Btwn near 1/8;wkened
Pace;insde;game try
Duel inside;game

BEST
OVERAL

251
239
199

BEST
OVERAL

321
310

314
309
290

BEST
OVERAL

BEST
OVERAL

BEST
LAST

379
392
358
336

TOTALS

560
501
413

TOTALS

763
426

770

673
683

TOTALS

TOTALS

DT PP PRG
8.0 1 1
8.0 2 2
8.0 8 8
8.6 9 9
8.0 3 3
8.0 7 7
8.0 6 6
8.0 5 5
8.0 4 4
DT PP PRG
55 7 7
55 2 2
5.5 4 4
5.5 8 8
5.5 5 5
55 1 1
55 3 3
5.5 6 6
DT PP PRG
5.6 2 2
5.0 6 6
5.6 3 3
5.0 4 4
506 1 1
5.0 8 8
5.6 5 5
5.6 7 7
DT PP PRG
6.6 5 5
6.0 4 4
6.0 6 6
6.0 2 2
6.0 7 7
6.0 3 3
6.0 1 1

LEMNISCA
STARSHIP
ALLURSTR
HE IZ
UNPUBLIS
AWESOME
SAINT

CP/T/Y(7>5) Class Change -26
F/PP/WATCH/E/Y(7>1) Class Change 64
BOM:4/Y(7>2) Class Change 9
CP/SG:.5/R2/Y(6>2) Class Change 4
F/PP/Y(3>3) Class Change 4
F/SP-24/UN?/Y(1>6) Class Change -40

N(3>8) Class Change 59

255 30
149 175
217 35
230 67
219 10
237 23
213 23
131 66
161 16
Last DSLR
261 32
249 23
232 28
267 17

o 23
276 36
163 25
251 17
Last DSLR
183 223
286 58
284 148
267 9
278 41
282 73
182 30
174 32
Last DSLR
252 120
271 9
262 43
265 21
268 21
218 22
159 135

Bid 5w; faltered

Clear off rail;driving
4-5wd; up late for plc
Chased 3wd; along plc
Vied w/winner;lost plc
Brief pace rail; empty
Inside; no rally

831
827
813
677
683



1/5/20

CHARMAIN
BOUJIE
KITTEN'S
MY
SEAN'S
GRAY OWL
HIDDEN
BARONESS
SPEED

S>S
S>S
S>S
S>S
S>S
S>S
S>S
S>S
S>S

AVG

MOVING? SPD

N(6>9) Class Change -6 83
F/PP/Y(6>1) Class Change -16 82
T/Y(4>3) Class Change 9 81
N(1>6) Class Change 9 80
F/PP/WATCH/Y(4>1) Class Change 29 79

10

NOPARLRRPONON

D - A -

A NNNmMAMP
NP OOR TR IO

TDS2

CLOSE

D - A

PR RORMRLM®
WUwwNIT o I

CLOSE

BROT1

.57

.32
.61

Last

DSLR

125
36
64
57

LAST

POWER MLINE 3AVG TIW% CLS

Checked early;3-4w

Bid 3wd 1/4; edged clr
2wd tn;ins;up for shw

Chased inside;weakend

Angled rail;bid3/8;clr
Stmbl strt;kept giving
Inside turn; willingly
Off rail trn;belatedly
Rated;5wd late tn;fade

BEST
OVERAL

BEST
OVERAL

BEST
LAST

TOTALS

587

TOTALS

1/5/20

BAND OF
HIGH
NONCENTS
HEIR
BRIGHT
FANCY
MAJESTIC
CHRISTMA
BAHAMA
DIXIE

ERR
ERR

WO ONWONWNO® VLV

ERR
ERR

X .
TOONO®O IOV

X .

N%I’H\IW\II—‘FHI—‘N
=

o)}

83

85
87
76

167
162
150
170
128
125

Off top 2;3wd tn;gavwy
Prompted; led; wknd
Dueled;stayed on

Vied rail; shook clear
Drvng 5wd;drew clear
Prolonged drive; game
No factor inside
Tracked 4wd;weakened
Shaken up5/8;even late
Done early; eased up

271
259
256
254
249
247
234

219

BEST
OVERAL

238

616

550
575
524
524
530
457

TOTALS

1/5/20

CARDIFF

COMMANDI

MURALIST

GO DADDY
CAPE

BORDER

DA KINE
LINCOLN

R>R

R>R
S>R

R>R

R>R
S>R

™T

™T
™T

™T

™T
™T

82

79
ERR

78

78
ERR

82

79
ERR

78

ERR
ERR

6.3
5.4
ERR

7.2

2.5
5.8
ERR
3.9

7.1
ERR

TDS2

2.5
0.9
ERR
1.9

1.2
ERR

CLOSE

53.35

56.86
57.44

54.73

53.75
57.69

70

88
91

61

89
93

66

91

75

82

82

93

84
80

88

71
78

229

263
171

224

242
171

351

77
42

99

56
42

304

355
171

299

326
171

82

79
79

78

77
82

74

28
64

143

198
69

164

166
166

169

166
164

Steadied 1/4;willingly
Tight5/16;bid btw;rail
Hopped start;rail bid

Came in late;edged 2nd
Stalked rail;edged 3rd

7w upper; improved

Tight 5/16;stdied 1/4
3 wide; held 3rd

COMMENT

315

312
313

314

300
308

BEST
OVERAL

377

406
342

371

375
345

691

718
655

685

675
652

TOTALS

1/5/20

DT PP PRG
5.6 3 3
5.6 9 9
5.0 6 6
5.6 5 5
5.0 4 4
5.6 8 8
5.6 2 2
5.6 1 1
5.6 7 7
DT PP PRG
5.6 2 2
5.0 10 10
5.6 8 8
5.6 1 1
5.6 6 6
5.6 7 7
5.6 3 3
5.0 4 4
5.6 5 5
5.6 9 9
DT PP PRG
8.0 1 1
8.0 3 3
8.0 7 7
8.0 4 4
8.0 8 8
8.0 5 5
8.0 2 2
8.0 6 6
DT PP PRG
6.5 1 1
6.5 6 6
6.5 3 3
6.5 5 5
6.5 4 4
6.5 2 2

AFTERNOO
GRANDPA
A MAN'S
STREET
BRACE

HOOP

F/PP/WATCH/E/Y(6>1) Class Change 21 78
T/SG:2.75/Y(1>5) Class Change -16 77
BOM:5/SG:.5/N(2>4) Class Change -16 76
N(9>10) Class Change -16 73
AVG
MOVING? SPD
F/PP/Y(4>8) Class Change -91 83
F/PP/E/Y(7>4) Class Change -66 81
F/PP/Y(2>2) Class Change 4 79
F/PP/E/Y(5>1) Class Change -1 78
BOM:5/Y(8>1) Class Change 9 76
F/PP/WATCH/E/Y(3>1) Class Change 9 75
SG:1.25/N(1>4) Class Change 4 75
F/SP-11/Y(7>8) Class Change -11 73
N(3>3) Class Change 14 73
SP-29/N(2>7) Class Change 14 70
AVG
MOVING? SPD
CP/T/BOM:3/SG:2/R2/Y(2>3) Class 84
Change 4
F/PP/T/SG:1.25/UN?/R2/Y(7>2) Class 82
Change 4
T/BOM:5/BM1:4/SG:.5/Y(3>2) Class 82
Change 6
T/SG:.75/Y(5>3) Class Change 4 79
CP/T/SG:1.25/R2/Y(4>4) Class Change 79
4
BOM:4/SG:3.75/N(8>5) Class Change 78
-6
CP/Y(1>5) Class Change 4 75
F/PP/T/SG:.25/UN?/Y(7>3) Class 74
Change 4
AVG
MOVING? SPD
N(4>3) Class Change 9 81
F/PP/Y(2>4) Class Change 9 79
BOM:4/N(3>5) Class Change 9 77
N(8>8) Class Change 9 70
F/PP/SP+16/UN?/Y(2>2) Class Change 60
4
Y(0>0) ERR

ERR

ERR
ERR
60

ERR

RD SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE
0 4.1 5.7 0.7
0 4.4 5.0 0.9
1 4.4 4.2 1.1
@0 3.0 5.8 0.5
1 6.3 5.3 1.2
1 2.6 4.3 0.6
2 2.2 4.0 0.6
4 7.2 49 1.4
6 6.3 5.8 1.1

RD SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE
9 2.3 3.7 0.6
2 1.8 4.0 0.5
o 3.3 3.3 1.0
7 1.9 4.1 0.5
8 6.9 4.5 1.5
3 43 4.0 1.1
7 7.7 6.1 1.3
0 4.0 6.5 0.6
0 5.2 6.6 0.8
1 4.0 5.2 0.8

RD SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE
1 4.3 4.3 1.0
2 6.9 4.4 1.6
1 8.0 3.5 2.3
3 5.4 5.8 0.9
0 6.4 5.7 1.1
2 7.2 3.9 1.9
e 7.1 5.7 1.3
0 6.1 4.9 1.2

RD SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE
1 3.8 3.1 1.3
1 2.6 3.7 0.7
0 10.0 5.6 1.8
e 8.9 8.9 1.0
2 9.0 7.0 1.3
@ ERR ERR ERR

(]

koK kk

125.2 8.00
127.1  3.50
135.3  3.00
111.8 20.00
121.9 12.00
124.2 4.50
137.4 2.50
119.6 15.00
123.6 3.50
POWER MLINE
136.5 1.60
134.3 3.50
122.8 2.50
116.2 6.00
107.4 4.50
113.1 8.00
99.1 20.00
103.2 12.00
100.7 15.00
88.7 15.00
POWER MLINE
128.4 2.50
129.4 3.00
121.0 8.00
121.5 6.00
113.8 12.00
127.3 5.00
120.0 5.00
118.7 8.00
POWER MLINE
122.0  2.00
124.8 1.60
116.2 3.50
109.8 30.00
108.0 4.00
8.00

3wd into str;up 3rd
Stalked pace;edged 3rd
Off slow;outkicked

4wd into lane;wkened
Steadied start;3wd str



AVG ASP ASP LAST BEST  BEST

DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE DST SURF MOVING? SPD R# TDS RT 110 RD SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDS1 TDS2 CLOSE BROT1 P2F P4F LST Last DSLR BTOT POWER MLINE 3AVG TIW% CLS COMMENT OVERAL LAST TOTALS
1/5/20 SA 3 5.5 8 8 RINSE S>S D>T BOM:4/N(6>3) Class Change 9 84 10 8 4 8 1 7.7 4.3 1.8 7.8 3.6 2.257.72 82 87 88 257 22 257 123.4 12.00 82 133 184 2-3wd to str;gained 3d 326 389 715
5.5 1 1 GENERAL R>S D>T SG:1.5/N(6>6) Class Change 19 83 7 8 4 8 4 5.5 4.0 1.4 6.8 4.3 1.655.17 86 94 66 246 38 344 126.8 2.50 83 129 183 Best bid 4w;lost punch 319 374 693
5.5 2 2 FOSTER R>S T>T CP/Y(8>7) Class Change -1 82 4 84 1ERR © 5.6 4.1 1.4 5.6 1.1 5.054.65 79 74 81 234 218 314 125.8 3.00 81 91 195 Stalked 3wd;no bid 319 370 689
5.5 7 7 DESMOND R>S T>T CP/T/Y(7>5) Class Change -29 80 3 ERR O ERR © 6.2 5.0 1.2 ERR ERR ERR 54.57 85 88 74 247 197 337 126.1 5.00 80 57 189 Off slow;3wd;no bid 315 384 699
5.5 4 4 MIDNIGHT S>S D>T N(1>4) Class Change 4 78 10 ERR © ERR © 5.9 5.3 1.1 ERR ERR ERR 58.82 90 93 81 264 56 264 114.6 12.00 77 26 177 Bobbled start;lost 3rd 310 390 700
5.5 5 5 HIT THE S>S T>T F/PP/T/SP+11/E/Y(1>6) Class Change 7410 77 5 77 4 3.1 5.4 0.6 2.8 5.3 0.5 60.52 104 72 176 35 176 129.8 3.50 84 157 173 Inside;wkened late 317 352 668
4
5.5 6 6 FIRST IN S>S T>T SP+12/N(4>3) Class Change 41 69 6 78 3 78 3 3.8 6.5 0.6 3.2 5.9 0.559.19 95 77 172 154 172 113.5 8.00 79 35 155 Angled in;just held 3d 299 344 643
5.5 3 3 BOB'S S>S D>T  F/PP/SP+16/Y(1>3) Class Change 34 67 8 ERR © ERR © 3.9 4.5 ©.9 ERR ERR ERR 59.06 88 91 85 264 23 264 118.9 8.00 83 37 155 Stalked;inside;held 3d 296 396 692
AVG ASP ASP LAST BEST  BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE DST SURF MOVING? SPD R# TDS RT 110 RD SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDS1 TDS2 CLOSE BROT1 P2F P4F LST Last DSLR BTOT POWER MLINE 3AVG TIW% CLS COMMENT OVERAL LAST TOTALS
1/5/20 SA 4 8.0 5 5 CLASSY S>R D>D BOM:3/SG:1/Y(4>2) Class Change 2 86 1 ERR © ERR © 3.8 2.5 1.5 ERR ERR ERR 57.29 85 88 92 265 36 265 125.6 ©0.80 86 141 161 3wd into str;2nd best 453 539 992
8.0 3 3 STORIE R>R D>D CP/T/Y(5>2) Class Change 7 83 2 8 2 8 2 5.4 3.1 1.8 5.4 3.1 1.855.63 84 75 95 254 21 332 127.7 2.00 83 214 159 3wd;bid;duel;denied 442 527 969
8.0 4 4 COSMIC R>R D>D F/PP/WATCH/Y(3>3) Class Change 2 78 2 77 1 77 1 7.6 6.6 1.2 5.0 7.5 0.7 53.68 77 67 94 238 44 303 117.5 4.00 78 186 161 Pressed pace; held 3rd 418 491 908
8.0 2 2 DEL MAR S>R D>D F/UN?/Y(7>3) Class Change 7 75 2 ERR @ ERR © 7.3 5.3 1.4 ERR ERR ERR 57.54 88 95 75 258 22 258 118.1 15.00 75 69 159 3wd; 4wd; held 3rd 417 506 923
8.0 1 1 LAST R>R D>D F/PP/WATCH/Y(2>4) Class Change 2 68 2 76 1 76 1 9.3 10.0 0.9 7.510.0 0.853.57 75 64 94 233 44 297 110.6 12.00 68 29 161 Stalked rail;edged 3rd 381 472 853
8.0 6 6 CRAZY S>R D>D  SG:2.25/N(4>5) Class Change 2 68 1 ERR O ERR © 8.0 5.0 1.6 ERR ERR ERR 55.18 80 80 80 240 85 240 112.0 12.00 68 167 161 Came out str;no bid 389 465 854
AVG ASP ASP LAST BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE DST SURF MOVING? SPD R# TDS RT 110 RD SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDS1 TDS2 CLOSE BROT1 P2F P4F LST Last DSLR BTOT POWER MLINE 3AVG TIW% CLS COMMENT OVERAL LAST TOTALS
1/5/20 SA 5 8.0 7 7 HYPERSON R>R D>D F/PP/WATCH/Y(3>7) Class Change -21 73 4 77 2 70 1 3.8 5.4 ©.7 1.8 5.3 ©.355.76 90 90 60 240 134 328 111.1 4.50 77 60 129 Step slow;btwn;wkened 188 222 410
8.0 3 3 DARKHAWK S>R D>D SG:.5/Y(5>3) Class Change 4 73 5 ERR @ ERR © 4.5 4.7 0.9 ERR ERR ERR 56.68 87 83 87 257 22 257 111.1 12.00 74 14 130 4wd into str;late 3rd 192 240 432
8.0 6 6 MOANA R>R D>D F/PP/T/WATCH/E/Y(3>2) Class Change 71 5 74 3 74 3 3.6 6.4 ©.6 2.2 5.7 ©0.455.22 84 84 69 237 71 322 111.7 3.50 74 25 146 Fought back rail lane 186 227 413
4
8.0 1 1 WILL S>R D>D  F/PP/Y(1>5) Class Change -16 70 7 77 3 8 2 7.0 6.4 1.1 5.0 5.9 0.857.54 83 80 71 234 37 234 110.5 5.00 62 31 157 Saved ground;wkened 187 213 400
8.0 2 2 CROSS R>R T>D F/PP/T/Y(2>3) Class Change 4 69 7 70 1 70 1 3.5 5.1 ©.7 2.0 5.0 0©.453.19 79 70 83 232 42 302 107.8 5.00 70 73 124 Rail bid;dueled;hung 185 226 411
8.0 4 4 DERBY R>R D>D CP/Y(7>3) Class Change 4 6910 69 9 69 9 4.0 4.8 0.8 3.9 5.1 0.856.11 85 87 63 235 29 316 105.5 12.00 66 18 123 Came out str;held 3rd 183 218 401
8.0 9 9 THE EASY R>R D>D BM1:5.5/N(4>5) Class Change 4 68 3 68 2 68 2 6.8 5.9 1.2 5.9 4.7 1.352.50 50 51 70 171 93 229 105.3 4.00 68 36 126 Stumbled badly start 176 185 361
8.0 5 5 FORTNITE S>R D>D SG:.5/SP+12/N(6>4) Class Change 4 6610 60 1 60 1 6.6 7.1 0.9 6.0 8.0 0.8 56.68 84 83 87 254 22 254 106.1 20.00 67 52 129 Off slow;5wd into lane 182 236 418
8.0 8 8 FORT R>R D>D T/BOM:5/BM1:5.75/BM++/SG:1.87/SP+11 65 10 66 6 66 6 8.5 6.6 1.3 8.2 5.6 1.555.64 70 74 81 225 29 301 107.6 6.00 71 126 130 Rail bid str;edged 180 226 406
/Y(1>2) Class Change 4
8.0 10 10 STARSHIP R>R D>D SG:.25/R2/N(6>5) Class Change 4 6410 64 7 64 7 7.8 7.1 1.1 7.6 6.8 1.151.54 59 43 95 197 50 239 98.9 20.00 65 8 124 Angled in str;no bid 174 200 374
8.0 14 14 ZIYANAIR S>R D>D BOM:4/SG:1.25/N(2>5) Class Change 4 59 5 ERR © ERR © 10.0 8.3 1.2 ERR ERR ERR 54.12 71 70 83 224 30 224 100.7 30.00 62 47 144 Off bit slow;best rest 172 210 381
8.0 11 11 NIL PHET R>R D>D N(4>7) Class Change 4 58 5 52 1 52 1 8.9 8.7 1.010.010.0 1.0 51.24 64 47 79 190 50 229 96.6 15.00 56 18 158 Stumbled after start 164 183 347
8.0 13 13 SHARED S>R D>D F/PP/WATCH/Y(4>5) Class Change 1 56 6 ERR © ERR © 4.1 7.3 0.6 ERR ERR ERR 58.98 91 84 63 238 24 238 103.9 6.00 63 111 142 Drifted in str;wkened 169 208 377
8.0 12 12 SON OF A S>R D>D N(7>6) Class Change 4 50 2 ERR O ERR © 7.3 8.0 0.9 ERR ERR ERR 56.68 84 75 76 235 30 235 94.8 50.00 50 22 131 3wd into str;no rally 161 208 369
AVG ASP ASP LAST BEST  BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE DST SURF MOVING? SPD R# TDS RT 110 RD SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDS1 TDS2 CLOSE BROT1 P2F P4F LST Last DSLR BTOT POWER MLINE 3AVG TIW% CLS COMMENT OVERAL LAST TOTALS
1/5/20 SA 6 5.5 3 3 TONAHUTU R>S T>T T/SG:2/N(4>5) Class Change © 88 7 8 2 84 1 7.7 3.1 2.5 8.4 2.1 4.052.65 70 65101 236 344 308 134.3 6.00 86 69 199 Hopped bit strt;3w str 234 280 513
5.5 11 11 KENTAN  S>S T>T F/PP/Y(2>6) Class Change 4 86 10 8 8 8 8 1.7 5.1 0.3 1.6 4.4 0.4 59.51 101 72 173 42 173 128.0 6.00 84 69 193 Vied;stalked;wkened 230 250 480
5.5 7 7 HOLLY R>S T>T N(7>9) Class Change -24 8 10 87 7 8 6 3.6 4.2 0.8 4.5 3.2 1.458.01 8 97 72 255 71 361 132.4 3.50 87 93 196 Steadied 1/8;no bid 233 287 521
5.5 1 1KIMK R>S D>T F/PP/Y(6>4) Class Change -26 83 9 ERR O ERR © 3.7 4.8 0.8 ERR ERR ERR 55.93 92 101 74 267 28 371 147.1 6.00 88 242 207 3wd 2nd turn;no rally 231 296 526
5.5 9 9 SMOOVIE S>S T>T BOM:4/SG:4.5/R2/N(7>4) Class Change 83 10 84 5 8 3 4.1 4.1 1.0 6.3 4.3 1.556.82 89 87 176 42 176 125.3 12.00 86 26 188 Came out str;best rest 231 257 488
4
5.5 5 5 LOVE AND S>S T>T SG:1.75/N(2>6) Class Change -1 83 4 8 1 8 1 8.8 6.5 1.410.0 8.6 1.2 57.57 85 88 173 205 173 126.0 8.00 82 64 199 4wd into str;no rally 228 252 480
5.5 4 4 STORMING R>S T>T T/BM1:3.5/N(2>6) Class Change -16 83180 83 6 85 3 4.9 3.1 1.6 5.8 2.4 2.556.28 81 86 76 243 58 337 129.5 4.80 84 27 181 Angled in str;outkickd 226 278 504
5.5 10 10 FLOWER S>S T>T T/BOM:4/SG:3.75/R2/Y(3>3) Class 82 8 8 6 8 5 8.3 3.9 2.1 8.6 3.1 2.857.95 091 90 181 42 181 132.1 4.00 89 73 191 Angle in late;edged 2d 232 266 497
Change 4
5.5 8 8 DEVILS R>S T>T F/Y(6>9) Class Change 6 8010 84 6 8 4 3.6 6.2 0.6 3.6 4.5 0.855.45 91 99 61 242 50 331 115.2 20.00 82 32 194 3wd into str;wkened 211 258 469
5.5 2 2 CREATIVE S>S D>T F/PP/WATCH/Y(2>4) Class Change -31 7910 8 1ERR © 3.6 5.9 ©0.610.0 7.1 1.457.84 87 94 81 262 49 262 128.6 8.00 81 212 208 Inside duel;edged 3rd 222 289 511
5.5 6 6 POSIT S>S D>T  F/PP/E/Y(4>1) Class Change 21 78 6 8 1ERR © 1.9 4.0 0.5 1.0 3.0 0.358.99 99 96 79 265 241 265 128.5 20.00 83 163 161 Pace;clear;tired;held 223 288 511



DATE

1/5/20

TRK #

SA

DT PP PRG
7.0 1 1
7.0 7 7
7.0 2 2
7.0 6 6
7.0 4 4
7.0 5 5
7.0 3 3

AUBERGE
BAST
GOLDEN
ORQUIDIA
PAIGE

K P
LOVELY

S>S
R>S
S>S
S>S
R>S
R>S
S>S

MOVING?

F/PP/E/Y(5>1) Class Change 62
F/PP/WATCH/E/Y(2>1) Class Change -3
F/PP/E/Y(7>1) Class Change 62
BOM:4/SG:1/R2/N(5>2) Class Change 2
F/PP/UN?/E/Y(4>1) Class Change 67
F/PP/UN?/Y(5>3) Class Change -3
F/PP/WATCH/E/Y(8>1) Class Change 72

75

R#

ASP
TDS

RD SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDS1 TDS2 CLOSE

BROT1 P2F P4F LST Last DSLR BTOT

.43 94 100
.91 100
.89 92
.12 87
.65 88
.56 97
.45 95

98
98
93
80
96
96

LAST
POWER MLINE 3AVG TIW% CLS

132.2  2.50 93 172 161
146.1 1.00 93 214 214
134.9 2.50 89 209 161
125.8 12.00 84 91 177
125.6 20.00 83 38 162
131.1 20.00 77 116 202
121.9 12.00 75 103 148

COMMENT

Dueled;drew off str
Bit off rail;held game
Bid turn;led;clear

3wd into str;gained 2d
Pace;inside;held sway
3wd;4wd;edged foe 3rd
3wd;rail str;held

BEST
OVERAL

BEST

LAST TOTALS

463
439
415
422
406
408



AVG ASP ASP LAST BEST  BEST

DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE DST SURF MOVING? SPD R# TDS RT 110 RD SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDS1 TDS2 CLOSE BROT1 P2F P4F LST Last DSLR BTOT POWER MLINE 3AVG TIW% CLS COMMENT OVERAL LAST TOTALS
1/5/20 SA 8 8.0 7 7 CANADIAN R>R D>T F/PP/Y(6>5) Class Change -21 8710 8 2 8 2 4.8 4.3 1.1 5.3 4.0 1.355.70 82 78 85 245 37 321 122.6 6.00 82 58 176 Stalked btwn;no bid 219 256 475
8.0 4 4 HOOTIE R>R D>T F/PP/WATCH/Y(5>4) Class Change -16 8310 83 7 82 5 4.3 6.1 0.7 3.4 6.3 ©.555.86 91 97 72 260 29 352 126.0 6.00 82 102 173 3wd 2nd turn;wkened 215 264 478

8.0 1 1 SOUL R>R T>T N(5>11) Class Change -46 8310 8 7 8 7 6.2 6.0 1.0 6.6 5.9 1.154.22 79 83 77 239 35 332 116.6 8.00 83 25 172 Saved ground; no rally 213 251 464

8.0 11 11 BROKE R>R D>T BOM:3/SG:.25/N(5>2) Class Change 4 83 6 74 2 63 1 8.4 5.1 1.7 10.0 7.6 1.3 51.41 63 60 104 227 78 292 112.8 10.00 87 130 153 Came out str;2nd best 209 255 465

8.0 5 5 GO FOR A R>R T>T F/PP/Y(6>5) Class Change -21 79 8 76 4 76 4 3.3 5.0 0.7 3.6 4.8 0.855.96 88 93 66 247 58 346 121.1 4.00 78 230 167 Stalked pace; weakened 211 262 473

8.0 9 9 FACTORIA S>R T>T N(8>9) Class Change -51 7910 8 3 84 3 4.3 6.1 0.7 1.7 5.0 0.3 56.97 88 83 171 133 171 124.9 3.50 83 123 180 3wd str;lost whip 1/8 216 236 451

8.0 2 2 MYSTERY R>R D>T F/PP/UN?/Y(7>7) Class Change -41 7810 8 5 8 4 5.6 5.6 1.0 7.2 6.2 1.254.82 87 87 69 243 28 330 122.2 8.00 79 135 164 Dueled 3wd;weakened 206 246 452

8.0 3 3 BLAME IT R>R T>T N(9>10) Class Change -21 781 77 8 75 6 8.1 5.4 1.5 8.1 5.7 1.453.99 67 71 71 209 58 289 116.4 8.00 79 99 157 4wd into str;no bid 207 236 443

8.0 10 10 BIRD R>R D>T CP/BM1:3.75/Y(2>3) Class Change 6 76 5 76 2 76 2 4.2 5.0 0.8 4.1 5.3 0.857.01 8 82 77 239 43 317 112.4 15.00 75 39 147 Btw into str;best rest 203 250 453

8.0 6 6 SINGLE R>R T>T BOM:5/Y(3>1) Class Change -1 76 9 72 6 72 6 6.2 4.9 1.3 5.9 5.7 1.055.42 76 70 81 227 63 295 118.7 15.00 80 80 151 3wd into strjup wire 209 245 454

8.0 8 8 YOU MUST R>R D>T F/PP/Y(2>6) Class Change -21 7110 74 5 74 5 3.6 5.2 0.7 2.5 3.8 0.756.07 88 82 79 249 37 328 116.8 20.00 79 151 154 Btwn;inside 1/4;wkened 198 249 448

8.0 12 13 BRAZILIA S>R D>T N(4>4) Class Change 19 68 6 ERR @ ERR @ 6.5 5.7 1.2 ERR ERR ERR 57.64 85 85 77 247 7 247 105.7 20.00 71 31 134 Saved ground; no rally 194 250 443



