DATE TRK #

6/20/20 BEL 1

#4 closer, moves

DATE TRK #

T>T
©T

T
D>T
T

D>T
>T
>T
>T

3rd

MOVING? SPD
F/PP/E/Y(6>3) Class Change -13 79
SP-11/N(4>9) Class Change -15 77
F/Y(3>6) Class Change -5 76
F/PP/SP+12/WATCH/E/Y(2>2) Class 75
Change 2
T/SG:.75/Y(4>2) Class Change 10 75
F/PP/WATCH/E/Y(4>8) Class Change 67
-15
SP-24/N(2>12) Class Change -15 66
N(4>7) Class Change -5 64
BOM:5/BM2:5/5G:2.5/SP+12/Y(1153) 59
Class Change 30
N(2>6) Class Change -15 ERR
Y(0>0) ERR
Y(0>0) ERR
Y(0>0) ERR

off, steps up, 50-1 ML.

[N

75
70

42
ERR
ERR

ERR
ERR
ERR
ERR

ASP

®ORr

[N

73
67

42
ERR
ERR

ERR
ERR
ERR
ERR

®OR

[N

TDS1

ERR
ERR
ERR
ERR

BROT1

brot2 P2F P4F LST

56.17 72 62 88
53.33 79 75 64

48.58 72 66 44
51.83 81 76 74
*¥xxxx 81 81 82
46.22 62 35 28

ERR
ERR

BTOT

284
295

242
231
244

125

POWER MLINE

84.5

47.7

POWER

3.00

15.00

MLINE

LAST FIVE FIGS

79,0,0,0,0
66,81,80,75,78
72,76,80,0,0

87,69,77,79,62

72,76,75,83,72
70,67,77,67,55

42,83,78,56,71
64,0,0,0,0
71,38,54,46,64

-5,0,0,0,0
0,0,0,0,0
0,0,0,0,0
0,0,0,0,0

LAST FIVE FIGS

97
77

76
67
45

62
204
151

53

COMMENT

Vie 2w;wknd final 1/16
Veered in st; tired
Stalked inside;gaveway
Fought back inside

Tip out 4wd;bid;missed
Rank 1st;pull 2w;tired

Steadied st; no impact
3wd turn; dropped back
Circled 4-5w;stdy run

3w;galloped around

COMMENT

BEST
OVERAL

274
276
278

280
257

243
253
240

ERR
ERR
ERR
ERR

BEST

LAST TOTALS

433
385

326
393
392

204
ERR
ERR
ERR

713
642

568
646
633

ERR
ERR
ERR
ERR

TOTALS

6/20/20 BEL 2

DATE TRK #

F/PP/WATCH/E/Y(3>1) Class Change 25 97
CP/T/SG:1.25/R2/Y(7>3) Class Change 93
25

w

ERR

52.30 89 93 90
52.38 78 102 63
56.87 102 107 89

POWER

95,103,97,93,95
94,86,100,90,0

96,99,97,72,86
87,86,93,93,86
99,38,90,95,95

LAST FIVE FIGS

146
117

TIW%

Ins duoj;game;tenacious
3-4p;tight1/8;1late kck

Vied; led; edged clear

Split foes;bid;falterd
Roused; geared down

COMMENT

834

TOTALS

6/20/20 BEL 3

DATE TRK #

F/PP/E/Y(6>1) Class Change 10 88

CP/BM1:5.25/Y(6>5) Class Change 5 88

F/PP/SP+16/WATCH/E/Y(1>1) Class 83
Change 35

AVG

MOVING? SPD

F/PP/E/Y(3>3) Class Change -28 96

F/PP/BOM:3/Y(6>1) Class Change 14 92

SP-16/N(3>8) Class Change © 84

F/PP/Y(1>2) Class Change -5 84

F/PP/T/WATCH/E/Y(3>2) Class Change 82
-9

F/PP/Y(2>2) Class Change -5 82
F/PP/T/WATCH/E/Y(3>5) Class Change 80
-34

o N

o N

126.2

119.6
122.3

POWER

30.00

93,99,0,0,0
100,83,0,0,0

68,92,77,89,71
89,89,90, 80,85
90,67,89,81,0

82,90,64,76,83
89,82,92,83,85

LAST FIVE FIGS

151

53
22

Came in st; weakened
Hard hold;2p;tip4p3/16
Chased 2p; weakened
Slgsh st;rail trn
Dueled inside; game

3w;asked more 5/16
Duel ins;ask 5/16;wknd

COMMENT

542
558

885

887
891

TOTALS

6/20/20 BEL 4

#1 PP1OW.

DT PP PRG HORSE DST
8.0 9 9 STRIKING R>R
8.0 11 11 TURN OF R>R
8.0 7 7 HOLY R>R
8.0 10 10 SOUPER R>R
8.0 8 8 SCANNO R>R
8.0 3 5 TIZ ENVY R>R
8.0 1 3 ZUZUDINI R>R
8.0 13 2B HIDDEN S>R
8.0 2 4 SECOND S>R
8.0 6 6 FAZE R>R
8.0 5 1A TRAFFIC ©O>R
8.0 4 1 CONGLOME ©>R
8.0 12 2 SEA CITY @>R
to 2-hole from 11-hole.
DT PP PRG HORSE DST
7.0 4 4 ECHO S>S
7.0 2 2 MERU S>S
7.0 3 3 MISCHEVI R>S
7.0 5 5 SHOPLIFT R>S
7.0 1 1NO S>S
DT PP PRG HORSE DST
6.5 6 6 INDIAN S>S
6.5 7 7 MRS. S>S
6.5 2 2 CARRIZO S>S
6.5 5 5 FOREVER S>S
6.5 1 1 PALOMITA S>S
6.5 4 4 MAIDEN R>S
6.5 3 3 SEA S>S
DT PP PRG HORSE DST
8.0 1 1 DECORATE R>R
8.0 5 5 VANZZY R>R
8.0 6 6 MAROON R>R
8.0 7 7 FAMISHED R>R
8.0 3 3 PROVEN R>R
8.0 4 4 MR. R>R
8.0 2 2 VENEZUEL R>R

D>T

D>T
T

T
T

AVG
MOVING? SPD
BOM:10/BM1:8/BM++/Y(10>1) Class 87
Change 0
F/PP/WATCH/E/Y(2>1) Class Change © 86
F/PP/UN?/E/Y(3>1) Class Change 85 86
N(4>5) Class Change 30 84
F/PP/SP+11/WATCH/E/Y(7>2) Class 82
Change 15
CP/BOM:3/Y(9>2) Class Change 65 82
BOM:8/Y(1>1) Class Change 70 80

ERR
77
83
85

85
80

ERR
77
83
85

85
80

TDS2 CLOSE
ERR  ERR
4.4 1.1
3.8 0.3
4.4 0.7
3.9 1.2
6.9 0.6

10.0 0.8
ERR  ERR
ERR  ERR
ERR  ERR
ERR  ERR
ERR  ERR
ERR  ERR

TDS2 CLOSE
2.1 1.9
2.4 1.4
1.7 1.2
2.0 3.0
1.1 1.0

TDS2 CLOSE
2.2 0.5
2.7 2.0
4.1 1.3
3.5 1.4
3.3 0.6
6.2 0.9
5.3 0.5

TDS2 CLOSE
1.7 3.8
ERR  ERR
2.0 1.5
4.7 1.0
3.1 0.7
3.0 1.4
2.4 2.8

55.39 92 105 71
57.22 75 62 102

Last DSLR
254 133
230 14
246 63
262 98
222 21
218 8
182 14
231 28
244 8
125 173

e ok Kk
o Kok kk
o Kok kk

Last DSLR
287 26
281 26
272 105
243 70
298 57

Last DSLR
278 245
287 307
250 15
274 264
284 104
242 181
281 98

Last DSLR
242 84
261 98
261 63
247 16
269 49
268 52
239 21

357

344
368

374
308

96,87,90, 85,77

93,0,90,83,86
94,77,0,0,0

87,79,88,80,82
93,82,87,78,87

88,87,8

7,86,78
86,74,80,

86,7
81,0

Hit gate;5w;clear late

Pace;repelled;drew off
Sped clear; held sway
Ins;no cover;empty
Vied;clr;yielded late

3wd advance; led late
Guided out; along late

577

561
594

573
531

914
949

922
884



DATE TRK #

6/20/20 BEL 5

DATE TRK #

DT PP PRG HORSE DST
7 7 RARE S$>S
5 5 THE S>S
2 2 O'TROUBL S>S

1 1 MUTAKAAM R>S
6 6 SHADOW S>S
4 4 UNCLE R>S
3 3 ISLANDMA 0>S

8 8 HAPPY 0>S

D>D
D>D
D>D

D>D
>D
>D

N(3>4) Class Change 7

92

T/BOM:5/SG:2.75/Y(2>4) Class Change 87

-1

F/PP/Y(5>3) Class Change -11
F/UN?/Y(4>4) Class Change -4
BOM:6/SG:1.5/R2/N(3>6) Class Change

-5

N(6>5) Class Change 2
Y (0>0)

Y(0>0)

86
82
74

67

ERR
ERR

86
81
74

ERR

ERR
ERR

ASP

ERR
83
74

ERR
ERR
ERR

SYS2 CLOSE TDS1

[N

58.61
54.27
54.16

49.95
ERR
ERR

brot2 P2F P4F LST

272
246
237
213

(*]

301
125
28

147

ek kK
ek kK

BTOT

272
330
237

272

POWER MLINE

104.5

POWER

50.00
30.00
3.00

LAST FIVE FIGS

92,0,0,0,0
87,0,0,0,0

86,0,0,0,0
76,89,83,90,71
74,0,0,0,0

69,68,71,68,58

0,0,0,0,0
0,0,0,0,0

LAST FIVE FIGS

71
168
144

24
57
198

COMMENT

Bumped btwn start
Ins;drive5/16;alt 4w

Chased 4-3w; ran on
4w vs duo to 5/16;tird
Slow st;3-4p tn;7p upr

Unhurry 2w;fan 5p 1/8

COMMENT

BEST
OVERAL

438
422
405

358
ERR
ERR

BEST

LAST TOTALS

693
642
633

559
ERR
ERR

TOTALS

6/20/20 BEL 6

#2 PP12T, drops,
#5 PP13T, drops,

DATE TRK #

4 ANTOINET R>R
3 HIGHLAND R>R
5 SELFLESS R>R
2 SWEET R>R

1 1 SPEAKTOM R>R

Jose for Todd.
Javier for Chad.

F/PP/Y(7>3) Class Change 5
BOM:9/Y(2>2) Class Change 10
SG:.5/R2/N(13>5) Class Change -8
F/PP/T/SP+12/E/Y(12>3) Class Change

-8

BOM:8/SP+15/Y(6>1) Class Change -3

POWER

90,90,81,83,77
84,87,89,77,78
99,85,72,0,0

93,89,91,74,70

83,68,54,0,0

LAST FIVE FIGS

2nd flight 3w;best rst
Checkd1st;traffic;game
3wd;4wd;outkicked
Bid;led;held 3rd

Ins6F;4wl/8;up 1/16pl

COMMENT

TOTALS

6/20/20 BEL 7

DATE TRK #

[ B I )
[N

[ I N I B W)}
OO0

5 WINIFRED S>S
3 SINGLE  S>S
8 MY SASSY S>S
4 STRONGER S>S
6 NOBLE R>S

16 16 BUSTIN S>S

12 12 SPEIGHTS R>S

7 7 TRADEABL S>S

14 14 ANCIENT S>S
15 15 OVERTIME S>S

N
N

ANYDAYIS S>S

11 11 CANARSIE S>S
13 13 AVA K'S R>S

9 9 CRATER R>S

10 10 LIGHT IN S>S

1 1 MZSEB S>S

>t
tt
tt
D>t

D>t
tt
tt
>t
>t
tt

F/PP/T/E/Y(5>6) Class Change ©
F/Y(6>5) Class Change -31
SP-16/N(4>6) Class Change -31
F/PP/WATCH/E/Y(1>1) Class Change 25

Y(3>8) Class Change -15

T/BOM:3/SG:2.75/R2/Y(3>2) Class

Change 0
N(8>8) Class Change -16
N(9>9) Class Change 45

BOM:4/SG:1/Y(6>3) Class Change ©
F/PP/T/WATCH/E/Y(2>2) Class Change

65

SP-11/N(11>12) Class Change ©
F/PP/WATCH/Y(4>1) Class Change 24
F/UN?/Y(1>8) Class Change -31

N(11>7) Class Change 45

T/SG:4.75/R2/N(6>5) Class Change 9

N(2>8) Class Change -5

72

71
71
71
69
68
67

ERR

ERR

83
56

ERR
74
80
69
76
71

R ROV

CONWENO

ERR

ERR
74
83
56

ERR
74
80
69
76
71

PR OO

NNWENO

103

83
89

81
79
89
99

82
98
79
72
87
20

78
78
95

101

78

101

78
73
88
91

79
84
81
69

70
71
66
68
83
71

238
241
265
269

230
270
223
213
258
252

203
217
15
13

204
265
223
250
216

322
241
265
269

230
270
286
288
258
252

10.00
30.00

8.00
20.00

MLINE

81,68,76,82,79
72,80,83,77,80
60,81,91,72,0
85,84,70,59,0
75,75,61,90,0
84,67,73,59,82

79,66,0,0,0
71,77,68,76,71
83,55,76,76,0

78,71,69,71,69

60,76,79,61,62
80,64,68,0,0
61,80,0,0,0
70,69,77,72,74
77,59,74,62,0
71,71,78,74,69

LAST FIVE FIGS

202
55
93

125

18
105
102

57
105

69

2w;led to ins 1/16pl
5w upper; tired

Chased 3-4w; no impact
Inside; rated for half
Steady beh wall 1/16p
3w pursuit; mild kick

2wd 1/8p;no threat
3w pursuit; no headway
To ins 1/2;5w into str

169 Vie ins;game;nail wire

Chased 4w; tired
2w;kicked in 1/8pl
Pulled early; tired
3w2nd; 5w upper;no kick
No factor

Inside trip; gave way

COMMENT

158
153
159
157

148
153
151
146
154
147

BEST
OVERAL

249

257
243
269
257

218
264
227
226
261
245

427

415
396
429
415

366
417
379
373
415
393

TOTALS

6/20/20 BEL 8

4
1 GAMINE R>R
2 LUCREZIA R>R
3 WATER R>R
7 PERFECT R>R
6 PLEASANT R>R
5 GLASS S>R

F/PP/E/Y(4>1) Class Change 25
F/PP/E/Y(6>1) Class Change 35
F/PP/Y(7>2) Class Change 5
BOM:5/R2/Y(6>1) Class Change 5
BOM:4/SG:2.75/N(3>4) Class Change 2
CP/Y(1>3) Class Change 20
F/PP/SP+14/WATCH/E/Y(5>1) Class

Change 45

ERR

105
232
36
35

280

132.6

20.00

96,97,0,0,0
98,89,0,0,0

96,92,88,73,92
88,88,90, 76,89
88,83,91,79,86
85,86,85,68,0
94,87,81,80,57

157

120

Ooff rail uppr;edgd clr
Pace; rated; dug in

In aim 2wl/4p;kept on
4w uppr; closed well
5w; making up ground
Steadied turn;bid;wknd
Off rail;drift 1/8;drv

375
358
348
352
340
347

592

904



DATE TRK #

6/20/20 BEL 9

DATE TRK #

DT PP PRG HORSE
6.0 6 6 HIDDEN

4 4 PURE
1 1 KANTHAKA

6.0 7 7 WHITE
6.0 5 5 STUBBINS

3 3 TEXAS
2 2 OLEKSAND

6.0 8 8 LONHTWIS

DST SURF MOVING? SPD

R>S T>t PP/SP-97/WATCH/Y(8>0) Class Change 97
35

S>S T>t T/SG:1.25/N(2>5) Class Change @ 95

S>S T>t F/SG:1.75/UN?/Y(1>3) Class Change 94
10

S>S T>t N(6>8) Class Change 10 93

S>S T>t F/PP/T/SG:1.75/R2/Y(2>3) Class 92
Change 6

S>S T>t F/T/SG:1/Y(7>4) Class Change 6 90

S>S T>t T/BOM:5/BM3:6/SG:6/Y(2>2) Class 88
Change 6

S>S T>t CP/WATCH/Y(12>10) Class Change 11 83

10
10

10

93
92

89
920

86

94
93

95
920

87

SYS2 CLOSE TDS1

L)
w o
[N
o wn
[P
o n
(LN
N ®
N B
AN

N A
0
w w
w b
N P
w b
o un
N 00
N W
aN

BROT1

brot2

brot2

93
90

85

103

1le4

89

95

92

107

107

99

1e3

P4F LST

94
96

96
86

85
94

75

187
186

273
296

296
282

273

231
392

287
28

28
26

13

BTOT

187
186

273
296

296
282

273

POWER MLINE

171.2
139.2

153.4
155.0

149.8
157.5

135.8

POWER

2.50
10.00

MLINE

LAST FIVE FIGS

0,96,106,95,89

96,88,95,108,94
95,90,93,100,93

93,88,87,101,91
98,97,102,90,85

97,87,93,91,93
98,99,83,90,87

87,88,95, 88,82

LAST FIVE FIGS

158
104

122
91

a7

TIW%

COMMENT
Stumbled st;lost rider

Step slow;tight 1/2
Vied;stalked;edged 2nd

Swung wide; no factor
Rail bid;steadied 1/16

4wd into str;edged 3rd
Step slow;late surge

Bid 3w 3/8;tired

COMMENT

BEST
OVERAL

309
321

316
309

287

BEST
LAST TOTALS

501
601

598
584

544

810
921

914

832

TOTALS

6/20/20 BEL 10

#4 from 14-hole,
#1 only speed?

DATE TRK #

8 8 TIZ THE

2 2 SOLE

9 9 DR POST
10 10 PNEUMATI
5 FARMINGT
3 MAX
4 MODERNIS
6 FORE

1 TAP IT

9.0 7 7 JUNGLE

closer, great works

DT PP PRG HORSE

AUV wWwoOwwou

-]

WRAWUNRLADL

NPFPWERWERERRERNW
WwwuNwuoO b~
VO WOUNNOUNWN
OWNNOUNOWON
OO R WNNNWN
NOUVOWNONW
NNNENNENN

PAUNRWRNRR
WHANUGO WOV A
AR OONONWOLO
VIO ® ONERKERNNO
OO R WNRUNN
VO hOUIUIONOG®

w
~N
w
)]
[y
®
a
~N
a
®
[y
[y

brot2

135
16

49

POWER

n
S o

B

w |
a0 uuiuioouv h iR

50.00

100, 108,89,93,97
98,96,102,100,95
94,104,83,0,0
94,95,94,0,0
94,96,91,86,86
95,89,84,0,0
93,92,87,90,78
0,80,90,88,59
101,99,67,48,92

76,70,76,76,79

LAST FIVE FIGS

198
210
171
106
120
102
112

105

TIW%

Stalk3wd;drivel/8-1/16
4w;along late rddn out
Stuck btw;bmpl/2p;game
Battled str; gave in
Mid move 4w;flattened
5-4w pursuit; edged cl
4-5w;drifted out 3/16

2w;rated to 3/16pl

No speed; no rally

COMMENT

244

222

TOTALS

6/20/20 BEL 11

9.0 13 12 DISCREET
9.0 1 2 BREAKING
9.0 6 7 MONARCHS
9.0 12 11 BACKSIDE
9.0 2 3 LARGENT
9.0 5 6 PILLAR

9.0 9 9 DIGITAL

9.0 11 10 HAVE AT
9.0 8 8 SAND
9.0 10 1A SURPRISE
9.0 3 4 RED
9.0 4 5 ARGONNE
9.0 7 1 TALK OR

AVG

DST SURF MOVING? SPD
R>R D>D F/PP/E/Y(4>1) Class Change © 97
R>R D>D BOM:5/Y(6>1) Class Change 40 95
R>R D>D F/PP/BOM:4/Y(3>1) Class Change 20 94
R>R D>D F/PP/T/E/Y(1>3) Class Change 10 94
R>R D>D BOM:4/N(8>4) Class Change © 89
R>R D>D F/BOM:4/Y(3>1) Class Change 10 89
R>R D>D SG:.25/R2/N(14>3) Class Change 5 88
S>R D>D SP-81/WATCH/Y(©>1) Class Change 10 81
R>R D>D F/PP/SP+21/WATCH/E/Y(3>1) Class 80

Change 35
R>R D>D N(5>8) Class Change © 72
since, Junior for Mott.

AVG

DST SURF MOVING? SPD
R>R D>t SP-12/N(10>11) Class Change -25 94
R>R T>t SG:.5/R2/N(7>8) Class Change -20 92
R>R T>t F/PP/T/Y(3>3) Class Change 10 92
R>R D>t N(7>3) Class Change -25 91
R>R T>t F/PP/E/Y(3>1) Class Change 10 91
R>R T>t F/SG:.75/SP+11/Y(5>3) Class Change 91

-21
R>R T>t T/BOM:3/SG:2.25/N(3>4) Class Change 91

-24
R>R T>t BM1:4.25/N(9>6) Class Change -16 90
R>R T>t N(1>7) Class Change -10 89
R>R D>t N(6>5) Class Change -16 87
R>R T>t F/PP/Y(5>10) Class Change -16 85
R>R t>t N(4>6) Class Change -21 84

R>R T>t T/Y(0>4) Class Change -19 ERR

10
10

10

0 ERR

® Vo Vv

95

90
91
87
85
83

ERR

53.08
54.89
52.18
54.33
53.47

ERR

53.10
58.23
17.15
49.24
55.58

ERR

84

79
71

96
81

85

85
84
63

106

94

91

65
87
63
25
79

260

229
242
126
227
254

105

251

203

210

42
188
210
250
310

352

333
341
126
345
357

140.4
132.6
144.5
129.1
139.7

3.00

10.00
30.00
10.00
15.00
12.00
10.00

82,80,98,106, 88
91,82,88,97,93
90,93, 86, 88,95
98,99,93,91,96
95,94,95,83,88
102,81,99,98,89

93,92,93,99,98

96,92,90, 83,86
94,90, 88, 86,84
91,90,95,73,94
82,95,99,92,88
92,96,84,82,82
0,0,0,0,0

159

204

138

49
138
106
119
238

Through early

3w uppr; no response
Sted'd 1st;keen;bid1/4
3w;ask by 5/16; held
Duel;shook clr;firm

5w upper; mild kick

Blocked 4wd into str

3w uppr; flattened out
Steadied top stretch
Checked top str; even
Rated ins; folded
Tracked 2p; tired

207

201
202
197
192
197
ERR

374
284

362

280
355
231
269
357

94

549

489

569

481
556
429
461
554
ERR



DATE TRK # DT
6/20/20 BEL 12 6.0
6.0

DATE TRK #

PP

12
11

13

PRG

12
11

13

BIG
RUNNINGW

DOUBLE

VETERANS
FLY FLY
POWER UP
QIAN B C

BIG

IMPETUOU
TURBO

SIMPLY

KIERKEGA
CooLBoOY
STARRY
CRACK
WHAT THE

S>S
S>S
S>S
S>S
S>S

R>S

S>S
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F/PP/WATCH/E/Y(6>4) Class Change 50 70
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AVG ASP ASP BEST  BEST

DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE DST SURF MOVING? SPD R# TDS RT 110 RD SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDS1 TDS2 CLOSE BROT1 brot2 P2F P4F LST Last DSLR BTOT POWER MLINE LAST FIVE FIGS TIW% CLS COMMENT OVERAL LAST TOTALS
6/20/20 GP 3 8.5 3 3 ETANA R>R D>D BOM:5/BM3:5.25/SG:5.25/Z/N(7>3) 73 9 74 8 74 8 8.0 4.0 2.0 7.9 3.5 2.354.6252.65 62 72 990 224 23 295 117.0 3.00 78,74,67,72,77 124 152 Swung 5wd; best rest 380 662 1042
Class Change -10
8.5 2 2 WITCH R>R D>D F/PP/WATCH/E/Y(10>1) Class Change 71 6 69 4 69 4 5.7 3.8 1.5 4.9 3.4 1.4 55.24 51.60 74 72 88 234 28 299 114.5 1.80 73,72,75,76,57 129 132 Took over turn;driving 375 657 1032
10
8.5 6 6 BLOSSOM R>R T>D CP/Y(4>6) Class Change -8 68 6 73 3 73 3 4.6 6.3 0.7 4.5 5.5 0.8 56.37 50.79 87 88 73 248 120 325 112.8 8.00 71,71,56,83,81 55 150 3wd turns;bid;gave way 365 664 1029
8.5 1 1 FIAMMA R>R D>D PP/SP-66/WATCH/Y(4>0) Class Change 66 9 68 4 68 4 2.7 4.3 0.6 3.0 3.7 0.8 55.46 55.51 e 21 0 112.4 3.50 0,68,71,70,57 110 123 Brk opn gate2x;veer in 356 279 634
%]
8.5 4 4 PAOLA'S S>R D>D CP/UN?/Y(4>2) Class Change -5 63 6 74 2 74 2 4.2 5.1 0.8 2.1 2.9 0.857.6254.55 8 86 66 237 36 237 113.1 5.00 68,66,71,77,26 95 125 No threat far outside 354 637 991
8.5 5 5 KAUFY R>R D>D N(6>5) Class Change @ 63 10 6310 63 10 5.2 5.1 1.0 5.2 5.1 1.0 52.17 54.59 62 52 66 180 21 240 101.1 20.00 56,63,76,69,70 63 120 Edgy gate; hit gate st 339 545 884
8.5 7 7 I'M THAT R>R D>D N(3>4) Class Change © 59 7 60 3 60 3 8.5 5.6 1.5 7.8 4.8 1.6 52.17 54.59 67 55 66 188 21 249 101.5 10.00 57,59,66,63,64 93 130 Bumped&bothered start 332 555 887
#2 PP1oW
AVG ASP ASP BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE DST SURF MOVING? SPD R# TDS RT 110 RD SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDS1 TDS2 CLOSE BROT1 brot2 P2F P4F LST Last DSLR BTOT POWER MLINE LAST FIVE FIGS TIW% CLS COMMENT OVERAL LAST TOTALS
6/20/20 GP 4 8.0 8 8 GARNER R>R T>T T/BOM:5/Y(4>2) Class Change 10 79 3 79 3 79 3 5.5 2.3 2.4 5.5 2.3 2.455.1554.,55 85 86 89 260 44 342 115.4 4.00 86,79,71,0,0 106 114 4wd move;duel&brushed 188 314 501
8.0 9 9 CASSEY'S S>R D>T SG:4.25/UN?/Z/N(4>3) Class Change 71 2 ERR OERR © 6.4 7.1 0.9 ERR ERR ERR 56.03 56.31 87 79 166 30 166 109.6 6.00 75,67,0,0,0 127 152 No factor outside 177 229 406
-15
8.0 11 11 OUR R>R T>T SP-11/N(1>7) Class Change -18 71 7 67 2 67 2 4.6 4.3 1.1 4.3 5.7 ©0.851.1154.59 70 50 82 202 65 250 113.7 3.50 60,74,64,69,79 223 150 Lacked room early&late 176 259 434
8.0 5 5 FLORADO R>R T>T F/PP/T/WATCH/E/Y(2>4) Class Change 70 8 73 3 73 3 5.6 3.9 1.3 2.9 2.9 1.0 54.7555.98 8 83 75 244 43 329 114.0 2.50 77,74,68,58,76 132 136 Pace inside; weakened 178 299 477
-15
8.0 2 2 HELENA  S>R T>T SG:2/N(2>3) Class Change 4 70 2 ERR O ERR © 6.5 4.5 1.4 ERR ERR ERR 55.74 56.48 87 83 82 252 252 252 100.1 8.00 72,67,0,0,0 159 141 Inside; mild gain 175 292 467
8.0 15 15 DONA R>R D>T F/PP/T/WATCH/E/Y(7>2) Class Change 68 4 66 2 66 2 5.5 6.5 0.8 4.8 7.0 0.7 55.81 52.80 84 79 68 231 23 309 98.5 8.00 69,62,70,69,0 78 123 Bumped st; drifted out 163 270 433
10
8.0 13 13 PHILLY R>R T>T F/PP/T/Y(2>5) Class Change 2 68 4 72 3 72 3 4.9 5.1 1.0 3.2 3.9 0.8 54.07 54.68 84 81 67 232 64 310 112.5 8.00 68,74,73,55,0 91 148 Checked behind winner 173 281 454
8.0 7 7 CAFFEINE S>R T>T BOM:3/SG:4/N(10>2) Class Change 15 68 1 ERR O ERR 0 4.2 1.7 2.5 ERR ERR ERR 55.28 57.62 77 82 159 37 159 94.3 15.00 68,0,0,0,0 65 110 Bumped st;3wd;rallied 170 218 387
8.0 1 1 PRINCESS R>R D>T N(3>3) Class Change -13 65 3 65 1 65 1 8.3 7.9 1.1 10.0 9.0 1.1 53.44 49.72 75 76 67 218 62 282 95.6 12.00 61,65,69,0,0 87 151 Brk slowly;improvd btw 160 247 407
8.0 12 12 WHISKEY R>R T>T SG:.25/N(10>8) Class Change -3 61 1 61 1 61 1 9.0 8.6 1.1 9.0 8.0 1.1 52.4551.64 67 69 66 202 42 263 98.9 15.00 61,0,0,0,0 117 128 Reservd insd;no threat 160 255 415
8.0 10 10 SASSY S>R T>T BM1:3/SG:2.5/N(10>10) Class Change 61 2 ERR © 67 1 10.0 8.7 1.2 ERR ERR ERR 49.98 53.44 64 64 82 210 211 210 93.2 30.00 67,55,0,0,0 75 131 Steadied after start 157 253 410
-6
8.0 16 16 NATURELL R>R D>T T/SG:.75/WATCH/Y(1>4) Class Change 60 3 58 1 58 1 7.6 7.6 1.0 10.0 9.1 1.1 54.56 51.56 87 86 56 229 22 305 98.5 10.00 67,58,55,0,0 118 137 Close up;flattened out 156 266 422
15
8.0 4 4 DREAM R>R T>T F/Y(6>11) Class Change -5 606 3 52 1 52 1 7.7 7.7 1.0 8.2 10.0 0.8 52.47 53.44 75 68 56 199 42 261 92.9 30.00 52,74,55,0,0 44 137 Hard bmp;fought rating 156 237 393
8.0 3 3 LETSNOTG R>R T>T F/PP/SP+14/Y(7>2) Class Change 6 5710 67 6 67 7 4.1 6.5 .6 2.5 5.7 0.454.92 54.57 83 82 72 237 78 314 92.1 20.00 71,79,37,69,71 8 129 Up 3wl/4p;led late 160 291 451
8.0 6 6 LA GATA R>R D>T CP/BOM:3/BM1:3/SG:.5/SP+16/Y(6>2) 5 5 59 2 5 2 84 6.7 1.2 7.9 5.8 1.457.19 51.16 81 8 66 232 26 315 93.7 30.00 71,57,61,51,34 33 117 5w turn;aim;not enough 151 270 421
Class Change 10
8.0 14 14 REVVEDUP @>R >T  Y(0>0) ERR © ERR © ERR © ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR Q Fxkx o 12.00 0,0,0,0,0 78 ERR ERR ERR ERR
AVG ASP ASP BEST  BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE DST SURF MOVING? SPD R# TDS RT 110 RD SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDS1 TDS2 CLOSE BROT1 brot2 P2F P4F LST Last DSLR BTOT POWER MLINE LAST FIVE FIGS TIW% CLS COMMENT OVERAL LAST TOTALS
6/20/20 GP 5 6.0 11 11 VICTORY S>S D>D F/PP/BOM:3/SG:1.5/R2/Y(12>2) Class 71 2 71 2 78 1 5.0 4.2 1.2 5.0 4.2 1.2 56.80 54.50 84 84 84 252 23 252 112.5 3.00 78,64,0,0,0 132 117 Loom up 1/4p; 2nd best 204 346 550
Change 0
6.0 3 3 COMMANDI S>S D>D F/PP/WATCH/E/Y(2>3) Class Change -5 76 4 70 4 70 4 5.1 5.1 1.0 5.1 5.1 1.0 57.57 55.96 92 94 75 261 43 261 112.8 2.5 77,71,67,63,0 118 141 Vied between; weakened 203 348 550
6.0 6 6 PERFECTC S>S D>D F/PP/SG:1/R2/Y(3>5) Class Change © 68 3 68 3 68 3 4.4 59 0.8 4.4 5.9 0.8 56.56 53.40 85 83 78 246 23 246 110.7 12.00 73,68,62,0,0 126 125 No rally inside 199 334 533
6.0 14 14 MORE S>S D>D F/PP/E/Y(4>4) Class Change © 62 7 62 7 62 7 1.9 4.7 0.4 1.9 4.7 0.4 57.62 55.42 92 87 68 247 14 247 102.4 8.00 63,59,66,63,56 86 123 Dueled 2w; wknd inside 187 317 505
6.0 15 15 NENITA S>S D>D F/PP/Y(1>4) Class Change © 62 9 62 7 62 6 3.6 4.3 0.8 3.7 4.1 0.9 56.77 55.05 87 82 66 235 7 235 105.5 4.50 66,65,62,74,59 69 109 Close up inside;no bid 184 316 500
6.0 12 12 LUCY'S S>S D>D N(8>6) Class Change -5 62 7 66 6 66 6 7.3 6.2 1.2 7.0 5.7 1.2 54.37 56.07 82 81 80 243 43 243 105.9 20.00 70,62,39,66,57 60 132 Outrun 4 wide 188 320 508
6.0 10 10 AUBURN S>S D>D F/PP/WATCH/Y(11>8) Class Change © 61 5 63 4 64 3 4.7 6.0 0.8 3.9 5.6 0.7 56.8551.68 87 84 55 226 23 226 106.3 10.00 56,56,66,70,58 76 144 Pace fight; faltered 186 295 481
6.0 5 5 HECHIZAD S>S T>D BOM:3/SG:1.5/SP-16/N(7>8) Class 56 8 60 4 60 3 6.9 6.4 1.1 7.0 6.8 1.0 52.91 55.32 65 65 130 10 130 91.6 15.00 40,52,61,56,60 69 125 Always outrun 171 199 370
Change 0
6.0 1 1 FLAT OUT R>S D>D N(3>8) Class Change 2 56 3 62 2 62 2 6.1 5.2 1.2 5.0 4.0 1.3 53.93 50.00 79 68 53 200 118 256 95.5 20.00 46,58,65,0,0 87 110 Outrun throughout 173 264 437
6.0 13 13 SUPER S>S D>D BOM:4/N(2>3) Class Change @ 56 1 5 1 56 1 8.8 3.8 2.3 8.8 3.8 2.3 52.8255.16 73 63 81 217 20 217 96.0 20.00 56,0,0,0,0 33 110 Moved out; along show 182 297 479
6.0 9 9 LIZA R>S D>D F/PP/WATCH/Y(8>8) Class Change © 54 6 56 3 60 2 5.9 8.0 0.7 6.5 7.3 0.955.01 49.29 78 74 53 205 28 268 99.2 8.00 51,58,45,59,61 97 145 Awkward st; faltered 172 278 450
6.0 4 4 RACK S>S D>D N(6>11) Class Change © 53 4 53 3 53 3 7.9 7.2 1.1 7.4 6.8 1.1 52.7252.97 65 66 60 191 23 191 94.7 20.09 45,62,51,53,0 63 121 Sandwiched st; inside 166 259 424
6.0 7 7 MAKE A S>S T>D SG:1.75/N(6>9) Class Change © 52 3 ERR @ERR © 6.9 6.9 1.0 ERR ERR ERR 55.74 56.68 78 62 140 58 140 95.5 15.00 49,63,43,0,0 92 121 Always outrun 173 228 401
6.0 2 2 TRINNI S>S D>D N(8>8) Class Change -1 13 1 13 1 ERR © 10.0 10.0 1.0 10.0 10.0 1.0 51.60 52.09 74 27 101 280 101 72.4 30.00 13,0,0,0,0 27 111 No bid 111 152 264
6.0 8 8 MAMMEE ©>S >D Y(0>0) ERR © ERR © ERR © ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR @ Hkkk 0 4.50 0,0,0,0,0 106 ERR ERR ERR ERR
6.0 16 16 FIDDLERS ©>S >D  Y(0>0) ERR © ERR © ERR © ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR Q@ Hkkk 0 30.00 0,0,0,0,0 60 ERR ERR ERR ERR



AVG ASP ASP BEST  BEST

DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE DST SURF MOVING? SPD R# TDS RT 110 RD SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDS1 TDS2 CLOSE BROT1 brot2 P2F P4F LST Last DSLR BTOT POWER MLINE LAST FIVE FIGS TIW% CLS COMMENT OVERAL LAST TOTALS
6/20/206 GP 6 8.0 7 7 BIMINI R>R D>D F/PP/WATCH/E/Y(2>1) Class Change 4 8110 8 5 8 5 6.1 6.4 1.0 4.5 5.9 0.8 56.76 54.32 86 84 89 259 29 349 125.1 6.00 89,79,80,89,81 122 181 Took over 5/16;driving 294 480 775
8.0 9 9 NOWITNA R>R D>D WATCH/Y(5>1) Class Change © 78 16 83 2 83 2 8.1 4.7 1.7 5.7 1.4 4.0 56.84 53.48 85 87 76 248 21 343 121.5 4.00 84,85,78,74,78 138 135 3wd; edged away late 289 467 756
8.0 2 2 DESCENTE R>R D>D F/PP/SP+15/WATCH/E/Y(8>1) Class 77 10 78 7 78 7 2.8 3.7 0.8 2.9 3.1 0.9 55.08 55.65 83 86 88 257 35 352 125.3 1.40 92,77,83,69,83 113 147 Kept busy to late 291 482 773
Change -1
8.0 4 4 TUESDAY' S>R D>D BOM:4/N(2>3) Class Change © 76 9 ERR O ERR © 6.4 4.6 1.4 ERR ERR ERR 54.79 56.82 78 81 84 243 21 243 115.9 8.00 75,61,76,72,68 134 122 Bump& shut off st; 4wd 274 433 707
8.0 6 6 KINDHEAR R>R D>D SG:2.25/R2/N(6>5) Class Change @ 7510 7510 75 10 6.1 4.9 1.2 6.1 4.9 1.2 55.99 53.65 82 83 73 238 21 326 111.5 20.00 78,72,67,72,75 73 122 No factor 3 wide 272 439 711
8.0 3 3 MINESHAF R>R T>D SP-14/N(5>11) Class Change -21 7410 77 5 77 5 3.3 4.9 0.7 2.1 4.8 0.4 53.00 53.66 82 78 59 219 14 291 113.6 4.50 60,75,76,79,76 106 153 Finished early 274 397 671
8.0 1 1ITS R>R T>D BOM:3/N(5>7) Class Change -6 74 10 ERR © ERR © 5.3 5.8 0.9 ERR ERR ERR 54.92 54.01 86 89 79 254 42 331 109.2 30.00 74,70,73,73,70 85 135 Taken up far turn 275 443 718
8.0 5 5 GRACE'S R>R D>D T/BOM:5/BM3:5.25/SG:5.25/Y(2>2) 7310 7310 73 106 5.8 4.6 1.3 5.8 4.6 1.3 55.40 54.59 79 78 86 243 21 326 116.3 10.00 83,74,81,73,62 58 122 Off rail late; got plc 274 458 733
Class Change 0
8.0 8 8 MYFRANCE R>R D>D N(4>6) Class Change © 7110 71 6 71 6 6.4 6.1 1.1 5.1 4.9 1.0 55.17 52.42 83 81 59 223 21 304 110.3 20.00 65,71,67,75,66 88 125 Finished early inside 257 400 657
AVG ASP ASP BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE DST SURF MOVING? SPD R# TDS RT 110 RD SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDS1 TDS2 CLOSE BROT1 brot2 P2F P4F LST Last DSLR BTOT POWER MLINE LAST FIVE FIGS TIW% CLS COMMENT OVERAL LAST TOTALS
6/20/20 GP 7 5.0 10 10 NOBODYKN S>S T>T N(6>6) Class Change -30 77 7 82 4 82 4 5.9 5.7 1.0 5.8 4.8 1.2 60.75 56.10 92 74 166 66 166 99.3 4.00 75,61,62,81,86 83 157 Fanned 4wd; no rally; 264 347 611
5.0 16 16 STORM S>S T>T BOM:4/Y(7>4) Class Change @ 74 5 71 2 71 2 3.0 3.8 0.8 3.6 5.0 0.7 58.77 56.70 91 72 163 20 163 101.4 2.00 72,80,69,69,81 106 113 Brushed st; edged show 258 344 602
5.0 9 9 SUNDOWN S>S D>T CP/SP-11/Y(8>9) Class Change 10 72 5 67 1 67 1 4.5 5.5 0.8 4.3 4.3 1.0 58.64 54.14 91 96 53 240 29 240 101.4 2.50 61,67,84,75,71 69 132 Broke in; empty lane 247 398 646
5.0 15 15 JAXON'S S>S T>T F/PP/Y(5>10) Class Change -30 71 4 706 3 706 3 1.6 5.3 0.3 1.9 6.7 0.3 59.33 58.05 94 61 155 29 155 108.3 1.80 65,79,73,67,0 123 143 Very troubled journey 254 328 582
5.0 7 7 FAYEZ R>S D>T F/PP/Y(8>7) Class Change © 65 10 ERR © ERR © 3.5 4.0 0.9 ERR ERR ERR 54.84 50.98 78 67 62 207 30 270 88.9 8.00 56,68,62,56,71 73 114 Vied btwn foes; tired 227 366 594
5.0 2 2 TRINNI S>S D>T N(9>6) Class Change © 60 5 53 1 53 1 7.8 8.9 0.9 8.0 10.0 0.8 55.53 55.93 83 80 68 231 34 231 93.2 30.00 63,62,66,57,53 45 144 4wd turn; faded 224 392 616
5.0 11 11 VALID S>S D>T CP/SP+14/Y(8>3) Class Change © 56106 62 6 62 6 5.6 6.5 0.9 5.5 5.6 1.0 58.00 55.23 90 71 161 36 161 88.2 20.00 70,65,67,22,50 54 112 Boxed in; awkward uppr 224 331 555
5.0 14 14 LAST JET S>S T>T SP-12/N(4>9) Class Change © 5510 51 2 51 2 6.2 7.0 0.9 7.9 6.8 1.2 54.98 55.58 73 59 132 57 132 75.4 20.00 43,62,63,49,58 52 112 3wd;no menace 210 267 477
5.0 12 12 MONEY R>S D>T N(3>6) Class Change © 54 4 30 1ERR © 7.7 5.1 1.5 8.3 1.0 0.8 53.59 50.36 72 71 68 211 28 270 90.6 10.00 57,63,66,30,0 37 122 Bobbled st; done early 213 373 586
5.0 3 EL R>S D>T N(1>10) Class Change © 50 1 ERR © ERR 0 4.0 10.0 0.4 ERR ERR ERR 54.62 51.06 72 71 49 192 10 259 86.8 15.00 50,0,0,0,0 119 111 Chased 2-path; tired 205 342 547
5.0 5 5 BIG'S R>S T>T F/PP/SP+21/WATCH/E/Y(11>7) Class 35 4 55 1 55 1 4.1 8.7 0.5 7.3 10.06 0.7 54.08 52.82 83 91 39 213 57 292 80.6 30.00 56,55,9,20,0 72 125 Bmp st;lean in&bmpl/8p 173 360 533
Change 2
5.0 8 8 TRIBUTE ©0>S >T Y(0>0) ERR © ERR © ERR © ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR Q kkkx (2] 5.00 0,0,0,0,0 135 ERR ERR ERR ERR
5.0 6 6 ONELETHA ©>S >T  Y(0>0) ERR © ERR © ERR © ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR @ kkkk (2] 20.00 0,0,0,0,0 57 ERR ERR ERR ERR
5.0 4 4 PATERFAM 0>S >T  Y(0>0) ERR © ERR © ERR © ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR @ Hkkk 2] 4.50 0,0,0,0,0 213 ERR ERR ERR ERR
5.0 1 1EL 0>S >T  Y(0>9) ERR © ERR © ERR © ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR @ Hkkk 2] 20.00 0,0,0,0,0 51 ERR ERR ERR ERR
5.0 13 13 MYMAGIC ©0>S >T Y(0>0) ERR © ERR © ERR © ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR @ Fkkk 2] 12.00 0,0,0,0,0 106 ERR ERR ERR ERR
AVG ASP ASP BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE DST SURF MOVING? SPD R# TDS RT 110 RD SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDS1 TDS2 CLOSE BROT1 brot2 P2F P4F LST Last DSLR BTOT POWER MLINE LAST FIVE FIGS TIW% CLS COMMENT OVERAL LAST TOTALS
6/20/206 GP 8 7.0 7 7 SWEET S>S D>D F/PP/Y(2>3) Class Change -5 84 5 83 3 8 2 2.4 2.6 0.9 2.2 2.2 1.0 56.82 56.82 89 92 86 267 48 267 127.6 1.80 86,87,86,86,76 112 174 Mvd out;weakened late 375 605 980
7.0 5 5 MONEY S>S D>D F/PP/Y(6>3) Class Change @ 79 8 8 4 8 2 6.3 4.3 1.5 8.1 4.5 1.8 57.29 56.53 89 95 82 266 35 266 128.3 3.00 86,90,86,74,73 111 159 Advanced 4wd; evenly 368 610 979
7.6 4 A4 DON'T R>S D>D F/PP/E/Y(1>1) Class Change 45 7816 78 7 8 3 5.9 3.2 1.9 6.7 3.0 2.256.23 54.03 81 79 96 256 10 338 123.8 10.00 88,87,84,80,74 78 129 Took over 1/4p inside 356 600 956
7.0 3 3 TWEET S>S T>D BOM:4/SG:1/N(6>6) Class Change 35 75 3 75 2 8 1 5.8 54 1.1 3.1 5.0 0.6 55.74 60.63 79 85 164 22 164 119.0 8.00 74,89,61,0,0 153 142 Bobble st;steady along 358 446 804
7.0 1 1 RUN R>S D>D F/PP/T/SP+11/WATCH/E/Y(5>2) Class 74 5 66 2ERR © 4.6 3.6 1.3 4.1 4.1 1.0 56.65 52.88 88 91 81 260 51 351 124.7 3.50 85,87,68,64,68 163 167 Bumped st; grudgingly 352 600 952
Change -2
7.0 2 2 CHEZ S>S D>D F/BOM:3/Y(2>1) Class Change 53 71 5 71 5 73 1 4.5 3.7 1.2 4.5 3.7 1.2 57.42 56.95 90 84 77 251 13 251 115.7 15.ee 73,79,63,71,67 78 138 Waited3/16;splitl/8;up 343 566 908
7.0 6 6 SWEETHEA S>S D>D F/PP/UN?/Y(2>2) Class Change 30 71 4 71 4 ERR © 4.2 3.2 1.3 4.2 3.2 1.3 57.62 55.02 95 93 73 261 49 261 124.4 5.00 75,75,89,44,0 77 169 No match turnj;held plc 348 572 921
AVG ASP ASP BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE DST SURF MOVING? SPD R# TDS RT 110 RD SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDS1 TDS2 CLOSE BROT1 brot2 P2F P4F LST Last DSLR BTOT POWER MLINE LAST FIVE FIGS TIW% CLS COMMENT OVERAL LAST TOTALS
6/20/26 GP 9 8.0 5 5 MYSTIC R>R T>T BOM:3/SG:.5/Y(6>2) Class Change © 85 9 87 4 8 3 4.4 4.7 0.9 3.4 3.9 0.9 54.2257.87 81 83 81 245 21 339 134.6 1.80 89,92,86,82,79 109 202 Bumped st;3wd;rallied 342 540 882
8.0 4 4 MECHA R>R T>T N(8>5) Class Change 25 78 5 76 4 76 3 4.0 4.4 0.9 4.3 5.1 0.8 53.30 55.91 68 58 89 215 22 278 115.3 15.0e 75,88,74,74,79 81 161 4wilst turn; fanned 5wd 317 482 799
8.0 6 6 RIGGINS R>R T>T BOM:6/Y(4>1) Class Change 35 77 2 77 2 77 2 7.3 4.1 1.8 7.3 4.1 1.8 55.50 55.02 83 87 84 254 42 339 121.2 4.50 83,70,0,0,0 97 154 Mvd out 4wd;brush;up 323 528 851
8.0 8 8 JUSTINTH R>R T>T F/PP/T/SP+15/Y(2>5) Class Change 76 9 8 5 81 6 3.5 3.5 1.0 2.9 2.5 1.2 55.68 56.41 91 93 86 270 49 364 129.3 3.00 91,81,86,79,75 153 156 Vied;yielded;ran on 324 546 870
-25
8.0 2 2 CADET R>R T>T BOM:3/SG:.75/N(3>3) Class Change 25 72 9 79 5 79 5 3.9 3.5 1.1 3.2 3.7 0.9 53.41 56.15 65 59 95 219 22 283 122.9 10.00 79,82,88,69,75 56 171 Firm rating;split insd 312 497 809
8.0 3 3 DIAMONDS R>R D>T F/PP/WATCH/E/Y(2>2) Class Change -2 70 9 67 1 67 1 4.7 4.9 1.0 8.0 7.0 1.1 55.45 53.38 83 81 68 232 27 311 1e7.6 12.00 72,45,84,79,87 98 175 2pth;clr to late;yield 294 469 763
8.0 7 7 AFICIONA R>R T>T F/PP/WATCH/Y(3>12) Class Change © 69 5 78 3 78 3 5.1 5.3 1.0 2.6 4.3 0.6 56.90 53.64 92 98 61 251 62 353 104.6 30.00 79,53,80,75,59 60 176 Prolonged presure;tire 293 502 795
8.0 1 1 KOKOKOMO R>R D>T SG:2.25/N(5>3) Class Change -2 69 5 77 2 77 2 5.5 4.5 1.2 3.3 3.8 0.9 53.3252.32 73 69 70 212 27 272 117.1 4.00 62,82,72,74,57 142 176 Bit awkward; lost whip 296 434 730
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162 Off 3-way fight;no bid
145 Took over 3-4wd 1/4pl
180 Lost position; willing
151 Settld;st'd;split insd
174 Bid inside;drift;miss
150 4wd; even finish

156 Drifted way out; drvng
171 Sped off half;gave way
170 Stalked;chased;weaken
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Y(2>4) Class Change 36
F/PP/T/Y(5>2) Class Change 26
BOM:7/Y(7>1) Class Change 51
CP/BOM:3/Y(6>2) Class Change 11
CP/T/SG:.25/Y(1>2) Class Change 50
F/PP/SP-18/WATCH/Y(4>6) Class
Change -4

CP/BM1:8/Y(1>3) Class Change -4
BOM:6/BM1:4.5/Y(7>1) Class Change
50

BOM:4/BM1:17/BM++/Y(4>1) Class
Change -4

CP/BOM:3/Y(2>1) Class Change 31
T/BM1:3/Y(4>6) Class Change -10
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63,87,81,71,89
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160 Lacked clear path late
183 Forwrd;tk ovr;resisted
164 3wl/4p;4-5w;game fnsh
158 Four wide for place
139 Long drv;miss mid-trck
195 Caught turn; eased up

154 3wd bid; outfnshed 2nd
164 Drifted;up inside foes

146 Off pace; rail run
142 Rated rail;split 1/4

192 2-4w;stalled late
156 Pulled up; walked off
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F/PP/UN?/Y(2>2) Class Change -9
F/PP/WATCH/E/Y(5>2) Class Change -5
F/SP-13/Y(7>4) Class Change -5
F/PP/SP-14/UN?/Y(3>5) Class Change
-5

F/PP/UN?/Y(1>4) Class Change -44
F/PP/Y(2>3) Class Change -40
F/PP/WATCH/Y(7>4) Class Change -40
N(6>11) Class Change -44
SG:.25/N(7>7) Class Change -13
BOM:3/N(6>4) Class Change 2
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76,76,60,101,92
73,91,99,75,67

78,73,91,90,90
80,86,91,79,94
81,94,86, 85,85
69,86,72,87,76
69,79,77,80,79
73,78,76,76,85

LAST FIVE FIGS

TIW%

181 Pressed 2wd btwn; wknd
183 Pressed;led;no match
195 Lost ground 3wd turn
171 Dueled inside; tired

191 3wd in range;wknd 3/16
174 Duel btwn foes; ran on
181 Weakened after 6f

157 Always outrun

144 Settled outside

149 Outside;needed more
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F/PP/T/SG:.75/Y(2>2) Class Change
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N(2>5) Class Change @

Y(6>8) Class Change ©

SP+12/N(6>3) Class Change 12
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258 50
223 84
241 70
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256 26
225 34
222 17
246 26
190 17
231 42
236 252

e 27

Last DSLR
277 21
274 28
262 41
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239 34
171 17
225 29
229 149
243 31
247 55
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251 27
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111.1 10.00
109.3 12.00
20.00
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77,77,68,70,69
63,76,0,0,0
78,46,73,0,0
0,0,0,0,0
0,0,0,0,0

215
93

97
58
88
85
172

166 Inside;clear;caught
166 Broke in;slow;3wd str
148 Bid 3wd 1/16;gamely

165 Came out 1/8;no bid
166 Stalked 3wd;wkened
162 Shifted 2w; no rally
ERR
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697 1148
663 1101
667 1085
643 1050
592 988
651 1041
ERR ERR
ERR ERR



DATE TRK #
6/20/20 SA 2 8.0
8.0
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8.0
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#3 in from 10-hole.
#5 won from 10-hole
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MOVING? SPD
Y(10>1) Class Change -10 92
T/BOM:4/BM1:5.25/N(5>4) Class 92
Change -10
T/BOM:4/SG:3.37/Y(10>2) Class 91
Change 30
F/PP/WATCH/E/Y(6>5) Class Change -5 90
CP/Y(5>7) Class Change -1 88

F/T/BOM:3/SG:4/Y(3>2) Class Change 84
30
BM2:7.5/BM++/Y(6>4) Class Change 2 82
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F/T/SG:.75/Y(9>3) Class Change 5 91
F/PP/T/SG:.75/Y(2>5) Class Change 89
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BOM:5/Y(8>1) Class Change 5 89

F/PP/WATCH/E/Y(6>8) Class Change 81
-45

CP/BOM:4/Y(4>1) Class Change 10 79
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104

120
106
50
66
121

=

518
494
508
494
487
480
371
ERR
ERR
ERR
ERR

848

830
807
791
778
659
ERR
ERR
ERR
ERR

TOTALS

6/20/20 SA 5

[ 0 I« W< N I W W)}
OO0OOOOOOO®

ONNOR AW
CONNOR PV W

S$>S
S$>S
S$>S
S$>S
S$>S
S$>S

SHANGHAI S>S

F/PP/UN?/Y(6>7) Class Change © 78
CP/Y(3>3) Class Change © 77
SG:.25/R2/N(2>5) Class Change © 76
F/PP/Y(2>7) Class Change © 73
N(8>7) Class Change 0 71
F/PP/Y(4>10) Class Change 4 67
Y(0>0) ERR
Y(0>0) ERR
Y(0>0) ERR
Y(0>0) ERR
AVG

MOVING? SPD

BOM:4/N(2>3) Class Change @ 85
F/PP/E/Y(5>1) Class Change -5 81
SG:.5/N(10>11) Class Change -50 78
F/SP-17/Y(5>6) Class Change -13 76
F/PP/Y(8>2) Class Change © 72
N(9>4) Class Change © 72
SG:2/N(4>5) Class Change -50 69

F/PP/WATCH/E/Y(2>1) Class Change 15 68
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Last DSLR
260 26
270 202
255 36
240 14
250 6
271 8
244 21

Last DSLR
275 36
282 36
275 36
233 27
259 324

Last DSLR
264 35
264 35
244 27
258 20
250 20
259 35
251 26
158 258

e *k kK
e *k kK
e * 3k kK
0 ok ok

Last DSLR
259 27
271 35
248 26
239 246
266 27
262 27
238 13
231 21

76,81,85,83,84
84,77,0,0,0
71,81,76,82,93
59,82,85,79,0
77,93,45,0,0
76,84,61,66,0
72,75,0,78,55
64,78,63,0,0

105

127

BEST
COMMENT OVERAL
3wd into str;led;held 376
4wd into str;outkicked 374
Came out str;rallied 361
Inside; weakened late 353
Asked 3w; outfinished 353
Came out strjrallied 352
Came out str;in tight 331
BEST
COMMENT OVERAL
4wd turn;outkicked 520
Came out 1/16;willing 512
4wd into strj;up late 509
Inside;dueled;wkened 479
4wd into str;led 3wd 479
BEST
COMMENT OVERAL
Steadied start;inside 330
Came out 1/8;late 2nd 330
Saved ground;no bid 315
Came out strj;edged 2nd 321
Inside;no late bid 313
Step slow;3wd into str 304
3wd to turn;wkened 299
Steadied 1/8;wkened 288
ERR
ERR
ERR
ERR
BEST
COMMENT OVERAL
Stdied 3/8;4w into str 333
Bit off rail;held game 332
4 wide into str;no bid 322
4wd to turn;gave way 306
3wd into str;drift in 308
3wd into str;edged 3rd 310
3wd;4wd;edged 3rd 299
Inside bid;led;clear 290

484



AVG ASP ASP BEST  BEST

DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE DST SURF MOVING? SPD R# TDS RT 110 RD SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDS1 TDS2 CLOSE BROT1 brot2 P2F P4F LST Last DSLR BTOT POWER MLINE LAST FIVE FIGS TIW% CLS COMMENT OVERAL LAST TOTALS
6/20/206 SA 6 5.5 1 1 PSYCHO S>S T>T F/PP/T/WATCH/E/Y(4>4) Class Change 87 10 8 6 99 5 3.1 4.3 0.7 2.3 4.2 0.6 59.67 58.93 98 83 181 300 181 124.7 4.00 90,91,94,94,83 101 205 Inside duel;edged 3rd 326 411 737
-5
5.5 8 8 SILARDI S>S T>T F/PP/E/Y(7>1) Class Change 25 8 2 8 1 8 1 1.7 2.1 0.8 1.7 0.8 2.0 59.33 57.39 96 97 84 277 28 277 136.3 3.00 86,84,0,0,0 215 168 Bobbled bit start;game 321 510 831
5.5 4 4 SILENCED S>S T>T F/PP/SP+15/Y(8>1) Class Change 25 83 4 8 2 8 2 2.9 4.3 0.7 2.5 3.1 0.8 59.3557.07 101 107 86 294 92 294 120.1 5.00 98,77,76,80,0 71 166 Came out 1/8;up 3wd 314 546 860
5.5 5 5 CITY S>S T>T BOM:5/SG:.75/Y(1>2) Class Change © 83 9 8 2 8 2 3.8 5.0 0.8 6.3 3.2 2.0 58.54 58.93 93 97 84 274 26 274 130.6 6.00 87,89,84,81,89 146 188 Came out 1/8;up 2nd 321 515 836
5.5 2 2 UNBRIDLE S>S T>T F/PP/BOM:3/Y(2>1) Class Change © 80 5 8 2 8 1 4.3 3.8 1.1 4.7 1.3 3.5 57.34 57.24 990 93 91 274 27 274 132.7 5.00 89,81,78,83,68 125 184 Waited 1/8;rallied btw 317 522 838
5.5 7 7 STRICTLY S>S D>T F/PP/Y(5>8) Class Change @ 79 3 81 1 8 1 5.6 5.2 1.1 10.0 4.4 2.3 59.46 53.33 94 91 75 260 36 260 117.1 12.00 73,81,82,0,0 104 181 Dueled btwn;gave way 300 474 774
5.5 6 6 WHOOPING S>S D>T F/PP/SP+17/WATCH/E/Y(4>1) Class 77 6 91 1 91 1 5.3 4.2 1.3 5.0 3.3 1.559.9556.82 95 99 90 284 34 284 125.5 3.50 94,75,84,40,91 87 202 Inside;cleared;held 306 534 840
Change ©
5.5 3 3 LUCK'S S>S D>T F/PP/T/E/Y(2>2) Class Change 4 75 7 ERR O ERR 0 1.5 3.1 0.5 ERR ERR ERR 59.17 56.41 89 88 82 259 569 259 113.1 12.0ee 78,74,77,78,77 96 192 Btwn turn;rail;edged 295 488 783
AVG ASP ASP BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE DST SURF MOVING? SPD R# TDS RT 110 RD SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDS1 TDS2 CLOSE BROT1 brot2 P2F P4F LST Last DSLR BTOT POWER MLINE LAST FIVE FIGS TIW% CLS COMMENT OVERAL LAST TOTALS
6/20/20 SA 7 8.5 7 7 AXMAN S>R D>D F/PP/WATCH/E/Y(2>5) Class Change 9110 92 5 92 5 2.8 5.3 0.5 2.4 3.1 0.8 55.96 57.54 80 88 89 257 13 257 136.6 1.60 86,97,86,84,103 217 214 Inside duel;weakened 377 607 984
-35
8.5 6 6 MULTIPLI R>R T>D CP/T/SG:.25/R2/Y(2>5) Class Change 9110 95 4 92 3 6.8 5.8 1.2 7.8 6.1 1.3 53.68 55.09 71 72 90 233 28 318 139.7 2.00 93,95,105,94,87 215 219 Saved ground;outkicked 379 561 940
-35
8.5 2 2 ORDER R>R T>D CP/T/Y(3>5) Class Change © 8710 9% 2 9% 2 6.9 4.8 1.5 5.4 2.3 2,355.9256.00 78 84 87 249 29 339 127.1 5.00 88,92,87,86,84 80 187 3wd 2nd turn;edged 3rd 367 614 981
8.5 1 1 ROUTE R>R D>D CP/Y(5>5) Class Change © 8 10 8 9 8 9 5.3 5.4 1.0 5.0 5.4 0.9 56.15 52.44 82 88 77 247 35 343 129.3 8.00 85,94,90,82,71 104 189 Fanned 4wd 7/8;wkened 362 584 946
8.5 3 3 BOLD R>R D>D N(3>6) Class Change -35 8210 8 8 8 8 6.1 6.3 1.0 6.3 5.6 1.1 51.83 54.41 74 81 77 232 26 313 127.2 6.00 76,97,79,95,85 73 184 No speed 348 548 896
8.5 5 5 SYNTHESI R>R T>D F/PP/WATCH/Y(3>6) Class Change -35 8110 82 4 8 4 6.3 6.7 ©.9 4.8 5.2 0.9 53,79 52.46 78 79 54 211 28 300 125.1 8.00 75,90,92,58,81 57 209 Inside;dueled;wkened 349 498 847
8.5 4 4 POTANTIC R>R D>D BOM:5/SP+18/Y(2>1) Class Change 31 67 9 8 7 8 7 7.0 6.7 1.0 6.2 5.6 1.1 54.31 55.39 72 68 99 239 133 313 117.7 20.00 85,69,84,85,89 89 175 Steadied early;up wire 318 588 906
AVG ASP ASP BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE DST SURF MOVING? SPD R# TDS RT 110 RD SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDS1 TDS2 CLOSE BROT1 brot2 P2F P4F LST Last DSLR BTOT POWER MLINE LAST FIVE FIGS TIW% CLS COMMENT OVERAL LAST TOTALS
6/20/20 SA 8 5.5 10 10 READY S>S D>T F/PP/E/Y(3>1) Class Change 37 8 1 ERR OERR © 2.9 1.4 2.0 ERR ERR ERR 57.54 56.22 94 92 85 271 27 271 121.1 12.00 84,0,0,0,0 109 154 Pressed 2w;bid;driving 234 371 605
5.5 7 7 AFTERNOO R>S T>T SP-20/N(7>10) Class Change © 82 10 ERR © ERR © 5.5 3.8 1.5 ERR ERR ERR 55.37 52.24 83 86 54 223 26 304 110.5 20.00 62,79,92,85,88 105 174 Chased; gave way 225 316 541
5.5 11 11 AGAMEMNO S>S D>T CP/BOM:4/Y(8>1) Class Change 45 82 1ERR OERR © 5.0 1.3 4.0 ERR ERR ERR 58.25 55.28 86 89 87 262 20 262 118.5 20.00 82,0,0,0,0 128 146 5wd into str;driftd in 228 365 593
5.5 8 8 JETOVATO S>S T>T T/BOM:6/SG:1.5/Y(4>2) Class Change 81 10 88 3 8 3 3.3 3.7 0.9 6.3 2.5 2.5 55.42 59.30 84 90 93 267 27 267 136.8 3.00 89,88,86,76,84 153 171 Step slow;4wd into str 242 384 626
2]
5.5 6 6 A MAN'S S>S T>T F/PP/WATCH/E/Y(8>5) Class Change © 81 5 84 3 84 3 5.0 4.5 1.1 3.9 3.9 1.0 58.15 57.24 93 96 79 268 27 268 121.7 10.00 82,86,83,75,77 102 172 Bobbled start;wkened 235 371 605
5.5 1 1 ZIPPER S>S D>T F/PP/SP-17/Y(4>8) Class Change 5 79 7 8 4 8 4 3.5 5.1 0.7 3.0 3.0 1.0 59.59 54.25 90 86 66 242 189 242 113.9 4.00 62,82,86,80,88 95 185 Forced 3deep;weakened 225 329 554
5.5 2 2 HANDSOME S>S T>T SG:.25/N(2>4) Class Change 40 77 7 76 2 76 2 5.4 5.1 1.1 6.9 6.2 1.1 57.22 57.57 9 92 79 261 7 261 113.4 12.00 79,87,82,73,69 74 161 Stalked rail;no bid 223 362 585
5.5 9 9 PREACHIN S>S T>T F/PP/Y(6>3) Class Change © 76 6 78 3 87 2 2.6 5.3 0.5 2.3 5.4 0.457.47 58.00 990 95 84 269 27 269 125.0 6.00 85,89,72,77,60 86 179 3wd str;led;held 3rd 230 376 606
5.5 5 5 BRICKYAR S>S D>T F/PP/SP+23/WATCH/E/Y(2>1) Class 75 4 ERR O ERR © 2.1 5.2 0.4 ERR ERR ERR 62.06 58.59 101 111 83 295 27 295 130.4 2.50 98,76,0,85,42 97 153 Drifted in str;driving 226 402 628
Change 42
5.5 4 4 OFFSHORE S>S T>T Y(11>8) Class Change 2 75 7 78 1 ERR © 3.8 4.4 0.9 4.2 6.7 0.6 59.67 57.42 92 93 75 260 536 260 114.3 12.00 78,790,76,77,81 112 168 4wd lane;steadied 1/8 226 371 597
5.5 3 3 SHINNY S>S T>T SP+15/N(3>8) Class Change © 65 3 8 1 8 1 7.3 7.3 1.0 8.9 8.9 1.0 55.30 58.64 85 88 85 258 27 258 112.9 30.00 80,74,40,0,0 87 165 Saved ground to lane 206 355 561
AVG ASP ASP BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE DST SURF MOVING? SPD R# TDS RT 110 RD SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDS1 TDS2 CLOSE BROT1 brot2 P2F P4F LST Last DSLR BTOT POWER MLINE LAST FIVE FIGS TIW% CLS COMMENT OVERAL LAST TOTALS
6/20/206 SA 9 6.5 2 2 RAGTIME S>S D>D F/PP/UN?/E/Y(3>1) Class Change 30 99 3 9% 3 9% 2 2.7 1.8 1.5 2.7 1.8 1.5 60.03 57.12 95 100 91 286 26 286 133.9 2.00 96,96,79,0,0 217 172 Drifted out 1/8;clear 518 815 1333
6.5 1 1 COLLUSIO S>S D>D BOM:4/Y(7>1) Class Change 28 99 3 9 3 94 2 6.8 1.6 4.3 6.8 1.6 4.3 58.33 57.89 90 94 97 281 34 281 136.1 ©0.80 96,0,91,83,0 218 193 3wd into str;led 1/16 524 816 1340
6.5 3 3 PHANTOM S>S T>D F/PP/T/SP+14/WATCH/E/Y(1>4) Class 8 6 8 5 79 3 3.9 4.5 0.9 4.2 4.2 1.0 63.58 57.82 113 119 78 310 14 310 129.0 8.00 101,78,74,86,93 66 201 Fought back rail lane 513 840 1353
Change 10
6.5 5 5 HOWBEIT S>S D>D F/SG:1.5/Y(2>4) Class Change 30 79 6 79 6 8 3 3.6 4.9 0.7 3.6 4.9 0.7 57.92 56.15 91 92 99 273 26 273 123.0 12.00 88,83,85,69,81 90 162 Came out str;no bid 477 772 1250
6.5 4 4 ALCOOLS R>S D>D F/PP/WATCH/E/Y(6>1) Class Change 12 79 4 81 2 81 2 5.1 4.9 1.1 6.9 4.4 1.6 54.08 53.42 92 83 91 266 237 349 121.8 4.00 88,76,65,85,0 169 200 Drew off; ridden out 467 757 1224



AVG ASP ASP BEST  BEST

DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE DST SURF MOVING? SPD R# TDS RT 110 RD SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDS1 TDS2 CLOSE BROT1 brot2 P2F P4F LST Last DSLR BTOT POWER MLINE LAST FIVE FIGS TIW% CLS COMMENT OVERAL LAST TOTALS
6/20/20 SA 10 9.0 2 2 MARGOT'S R>R T>T F/PP/WATCH/E/Y(4>1) Class Change 35 85 4 85 4 ERR © 2.2 2.2 1.0 2.2 2.2 1.0 55.65 53.88 86 83 89 258 28 336 131.8 1.60 81,93,85,80,0 106 176 Fought back rail;game 379 614 993
9.0 3 3 CANYON R>R D>T BOM:4/SG:1.5/N(3>6) Class Change 33 80 8 78 5 80 1 8.3 4.1 2.0 8.2 4.3 1.9 54.74 55.11 63 68 94 225 29 300 117.8 6.00 83,84,80,80,80 87 169 Angled in; no rally 357 578 934
9.0 1 1 SACRED R>R T>T T/SG:2.25/Y(6>2) Class Change 50 79106 79 4ERR © 3.0 3.6 0.8 2.9 2.9 1.0 53.58 53.77 78 73 97 248 21 319 134.5 2.50 82,85,82,79,89 101 180 2-3w;rallied;too late 366 595 961
9.0 7 7 INDIAN R>R T>T F/PP/T/Y(6>2) Class Change 35 78 9 77 3 ERR © 6.5 3.7 1.8 6.5 2.2 3.0 55.59 53.77 82 79 88 249 28 326 138.6 2.50 81,84,82,80,84 145 182 Bid 3wd 1/4;outgamed 369 604 973
9.0 6 6 BAM BAM S>R D>T F/PP/Y(3>6) Class Change 33 73 5 ERR O ERR © 2.8 5.1 0.6 ERR ERR ERR 56.82 54.55 84 88 71 243 13 243 113.5 15.00 72,78,67,75,72 66 181 Inside duel;weakened 336 556 893
9.0 5 5 CALIFORN R>R T>T BOM:6/Y(7>1) Class Change 34 73 5 78 3 ERR © 7.9 4.8 1.7 8.1 4.1 2.0 53.54 54.05 80 74 94 248 21 322 140.5 8.00 82,81,49,80,72 215 191 5wd into strj;cleared 348 593 941
9.0 4 4 DESCARTE S>R T>T BOM:3/Y(5>1) Class Change 70 72 7 75 4 77 1 6.0 5.6 1.1 7.0 7.0 1.0 59.89 56.24 87 82 169 7 169 116.8 30.00 77,70,77,82,83 115 161 Circled 4w;determined 346 460 805
AVG ASP ASP BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE DST SURF MOVING? SPD R# TDS RT 110 RD SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDS1 TDS2 CLOSE BROT1 brot2 P2F P4F LST Last DSLR BTOT POWER MLINE LAST FIVE FIGS TIW% CLS COMMENT OVERAL LAST TOTALS
6/20/20 SA 11 8.0 3 3 WORLD R>R T>D SG:3.75/N(1>6) Class Change -30 72 2 ERR O ERR 0 9.0 4.5 2.0 ERR ERR ERR 51.62 55.23 69 64 91 224 35 279 117.6 2.00 69,75,0,0,0 110 158 Saved ground; no bid 467 722 1189
8.0 7 7 ULTIMATE R>R D>D F/PP/WATCH/E/Y(2>2) Class Change -5 71 3 76 1 76 1 6.5 3.5 1.8 1.0 2.0 0.5 54.60 51.50 86 79 81 246 15 322 111.2 2.50 76,69,69,0,0 100 123 Inside;clear;held 2nd 455 753 1208
8.0 4 4 VODKA R>R D>D F/PP/SP+12/WATCH/E/Y(2>4) Class 69 4 8 1 8 1 6.1 7.1 0.9 0.8 3.3 0.3 55.77 51.72 85 90 73 248 28 337 110.7 3.00 81,60,63,72,0 77 153 Inside; lost 3rd late 438 759 1197
Change ©
8.0 6 6 ENDLESS S>R T>D F/PP/Y(4>9) Class Change -45 68 5 75 1 75 1 3.6 5.9 0.6 1.3 3.8 0.3 58.20 53.64 100 91 61 252 21 252 104.1 6.00 61,0,71,70,75 41 61 Saved ground; weakened 436 683 1119
8.0 2 2 HAPI S>R D>D Y(8>10) Class Change -25 62 3 ERR O ERR © 7.4 6.8 1.1 ERR ERR ERR 57.39 53.12 89 81 74 244 35 244 103.8 8.00 64,48,73,0,0 97 137 Stalked btwn;wkened 419 698 1117
8.0 5 5 FABIO R>R D>D SP-34/UN?/N(3>11) Class Change © 28 1 ERR © ERR © 10.0 10.0 1.0 ERR ERR ERR 52.44 44.27 83 82 165 28 223 79.6 50.00 -6,28,0,0,0 66 144 Gave way;eased lane 285 337 622
8.0 1 1 KAZANSKY @>R >D  Y(0>0) ERR © ERR © ERR © ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR @ ¥d*k o 5.00 0,0,0,0,0 73 ERR ERR ERR ERR
AVG ASP ASP BEST BEST

DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE DST SURF MOVING? SPD R# TDS RT 110 RD SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDS1 TDS2 CLOSE BROT1 brot2 P2F P4F LST Last DSLR BTOT POWER MLINE LAST FIVE FIGS TIW% CLS COMMENT OVERAL LAST TOTALS
6/20/20 SA 12 8.0 8 8 SPANISH S>R T>T F/PP/T/Y(5>6) Class Change 30 88 9 8 8 9 7 3.5 3.6 1.2 3.3 2.5 1.3 58.07 58.48 94 101 74 269 20 269 125.9 10.00 81,0,96,82,87 56 170 Stdied early;4wd str 258 403 661
8.0 4 4 BLACKOUT S>R T>T F/PP/T/Y(3>5) Class Change 30 86 10 ERR O ERR © 5.4 4.6 1.2 ERR ERR ERR 58.33 58.48 94 102 77 273 20 273 129.6 6.00 85,84,83,88,85 169 184 3wd bid;btwn;edged 3rd 258 413 671
8.0 6 6 BOOGALUT R>R D>T BOM:4/SG:2.25/N(5>3) Class Change 85 10 ERR © ERR © 5.7 5.3 1.1 ERR ERR ERR 55.54 55.11 79 82 94 255 29 339 122.3 6.00 88,86,92,85,87 84 178 Tight early;3wd lane 248 404 652

-15
8.0 5 5 WORTHY R>R T>T Y(3>1) Class Change 35 8510 8 7 8 7 5.7 3.6 1.6 5.7 3.3 1.7 54.08 55.35 79 78 93 250 7 328 131.0 10.00 85,85,83,84,82 133 161 Came out str;up late 253 385 638
8.0 7 7 SHADOW S>R T>T T/BOM:4/SG:4/N(8>5) Class Change 8 10 8 5 87 4 5.5 5.2 1.0 4.6 5.9 0.8 57.42 62.59 87 92 89 268 510 268 142.8 3.50 88,92,84,88,84 186 181 Chased;imp position 263 404 666

-19
8.0 10 10 HOOTIE R>R T>T CP/T/SG:1/R2/Y(7>5) Class Change © 83 10 8 7 8 6 4.3 4.3 1.0 3.5 3.9 0.9 54.3253.16 81 79 89 249 27 327 130.4 6.00 83,94,70,87,81 87 159 Asked 2w; outfinished 248 395 643
8.0 1 1 ROYAL R>R D>T F/SG:2.25/Y(5>2) Class Change 1 8310 76 3 76 3 5.4 4.2 1.3 5.6 6.8 0.8 53.73 52.76 74 72 104 250 112 320 122.3 8.00 93,93,87,88,80 95 156 3wd 2nd turn;2nd best 246 379 625
8.0 3 3 MYSTERY S>R T>T T/BOM:3/SG:1.25/Y(4>4) Class Change 83 10 83 5 83 4 6.3 4.7 1.3 7.2 4.1 1.7 56.82 59.01 88 97 83 268 20 268 126.5 4.00 86,80,88,90,84 80 164 3wd into str;rallied 253 414 667

30
8.0 9 9 LIBERAL R>R T>T BOM:5/Y(8>1) Class Change 35 8 4 8 1 8 1 5.7 4.6 1.2 6.7 1.1 6.0 56.31 55.46 82 92 84 258 35 348 121.5 10.00 86,79,76,79,0 100 163 Bid btwn 1/16;gamely 243 411 654
8.0 2 2 GOLDEN R>R T>T T/Y(3>6) Class Change -13 7510 83 5 83 4 6.9 4.5 1.6 6.9 3.9 1.8 55.08 55.49 73 75 77 225 994 313 113.3 15.090 84,80,82,90,78 73 157 Inside bid;led;wkened 232 391 623



