THE SHORT HORSESHEETS, SORTED BY EACH HORSE’S AVERAGE SPEED.
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THE LONG HORSESHEETS, SORTED BY CLOSING TENDENCY
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DATE TRK # DT PP PRG  HORSE PPOT LAST DS NOTES FROM LAST RACE 110 SPD R# TDS #11@ S1 S2 TOT SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDS1 TDS2 CLOSE RD P2F P4F PFN SPEED RATINGS AVG DSLR AVG3 BRIS P EQUIP MLINE CLS TRK DIS TYPE CHNG SPPNT PWR CLASS FINAL COMB TOTL LAST COMMENTS
7/10/26 DMR 1 8.0 7 7 EL 1>5 R>R,D>D Flashed speed. 1st off 49 day 89 89 16 99 8 87 82169 4.10 5.10 ©0.80 3.60 4.90 0.74 9 83 86 83 84,87,80,94,80 84.0 49 B84.0 E/P 5 © 3.00 195 SA 8.0 C AO>C  12.8 125 15.1 84.9 100.0 169 252 Saved ground; weakened/

layoff.Class Change -60 Finished 5 from
post 1 TIW= 64

3wd into str;2nd best/
Chased 5 wide; weakend

8.0 3 Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 90 74,0,92,81,94 12.9 81.1 94.0 19 Rail speed; weakened/
1-hole. Slow last race Asked early; no factor/
(11) .Uncharacteristic early speed? Bit off rail;edged
WATCH! Class Change -3@ Finished 6 from
post 1 TIW= 23

8.0 5 3 Flashed speed. *Stretch gain 82 6 86,86,87,86,71 15.7 86.5 102.3 185 1 Stalked 2wd;best rest/
(1.75).Uncharacteristic early speed? Inside duel;best rest/
WATCH!BTL HORSE 1st off 46 day Off bit slow;outgamed
layoff.Class Change 5 Finished 3 from
post 4 TIW= 57

8.0 4 4  SECRET 9>3 R>R,D>D Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 83 8310 83 10 87 86 172 4.40 4.90 ©0.90 4.40 4.90 0.90 10 94 99 84 89,87,68,84,86 81.0 76 81.0 E 5 © 3.50 158 OP 8.5 C c>C 12.8 123 14.9 84.3 99.2 193 277 Pressed;bid;best rest/
9-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? Soft pace; stubbornly/
WATCH!BTL HORSE 1st off 76 day Steadily faded
layoff.Class Change -25 Finished 3 from
post 9 TIW= 46

8.0 6 6 WILSHIRE 8>7 R>R,D>D  *Stretch gain (1.5). 1st off 46 day 81 8110 81 9 83 75157 4.90 5.20 0.95 4.40 5.20 0.85 9 79 84 70 73,83,80,90,80 79.0 46 79.0 E/P 5 © 8.00 133 SA 8.0 C C>C 12.8 117 12.3 84.3 96.6 163 233 4wd 7/8 & into lane/
layoff.Class Change 5 Finished 7 from Pressed 2w; 2d best/
post 8 TIW= 62 Drifted in str;held 3d

8.0 2 2 SPANISH 8>7 R>R,T>D Class Change -25 Finished 7 from post 8 ERR 87 9 ERR © 99 87 177 4.20 3.70 1.13 ERR ERR ERR © 84 89 71 81,81,0,96,82 54.6 20 54.0 E/P 3 0 10.00 171 SA 8.0 C Cco>C 7.7 125 13.9 86.4 100.3 173 244 Angled in; no rally/
TIW= 39 Stdied early;4wd str/ Svd

ground;needed more

8.0 8 8 BLAME IT 7>2 R>R,D>D Chased Pace. *Stretch gain 79 80 10 81 2 82 90 172 8.10 5.60 1.43 6.80 3.60 1.89 4 72 73 82 78,87,76,81,91 80.0 14 80.0 P 3 © 5.00 148 LRC 8.5 C oC 7.7 121 15.1 85.8 100.9 145 227 3w trn;closed;too late/
(1.75).Uncharacteristic race?BTL HORSE 2 Bid 4wd 1/4;best rest/ No
races in one pattern.Class Change @ speed; outrun
Finished 2 from post 7 TIW= 80

8.0 11 CAMINO DE 1>1 R>R,D>D THIRD OFF Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace 84 84 10 84 7 81 89 169 6.20 3.90 1.58 6.60 4.30 1.52 8 82 86 86 89,88,85,96,85 87.0 28 87.0S 2 2] 5.00 142 SA 9.0 C oC 5.1 125 17.2 86.8 104.0 168 254 Bid 1/16;up wire/ 4wd
from 1-hole. Made big overall move into str;drift in/ Led
(4) .BTL HORSE Class Change -5 Finished 1 late; caught
from post 1 TIW= 57

ERLY TOTL
ASP AVG SPD LAST FIVE PACE PACE
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG  HORSE PPOT LAST DS NOTES FROM LAST RACE 110 SPD R# TDS #11@ S1 S2 TOT SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDS1 TDS2 CLOSE RD P2F P4F PFN SPEED RATINGS AVG DSLR AVG3 BRIS P EQUIP MLINE CLS TRK DIS TYPE CHNG SPPNT PWR CLASS FINAL COMB TOTL LAST COMMENTS

7/10/26 DMR 2 5.0 6 6  SAMSKARA 0>12 S>S,T>T 1st off 299 day layoff.Class Change -31 ERR ERR @ ERR Q0 ERR  ERR ERR ERR ERR © 0,0,0,0,0 ERR 299 ERR NA 0@ © 4.00 ERR LCH 5.0 A 3.0 91.0 94.0 2] e/ /
Finished 12 from post @ TIW= 61
5.0 11 SEASIDE 5>3 $>5,D>T Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 83 79 10 83 1 90 78 168 2.30 4.20 ©.55 5.70 2.99 2.0 1 94 95 73 75,85,83,77,74 81.0 5 81.0 E 5 @ 4.50 166 LRC 5.5 A R>A 19.2 133 14.0 90.5 104.6 189 262 3wide;4wide;lost 2nd/
5-hole. *Stretch gain (.75).BTL HORSE 2 Speed;inside;held 3rd/
races in one pattern.Class Change 30 Waited1/4-3/16;rallied

Finished 3 from post 5 TIW= 76

5.0 55 MEAN 1>8 S>S,D>T Flashed speed. Class Change 5 Finished 8 81 76 5 81 1 89 74 163 3.10 5.60 ©.55 7.50 7.50 1.00 1 88 91 72 73,81,70,68,88 75.0 7 75.0 E 6 @ 8.00 193 LRC 6.0 A AO>A  23.1 126 13.0 86.9 99.8 179 251 Bit off rail; weakened/

from post 1 TIW= 75 Stalked pace; no rally/
3wd into str; weakened

5.0 4 4 ROAD RAGER 1>1 S>S,D>T Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 78 76 10 78 2 95 86 180 3.30 5.20 ©0.64 3.30 6.10 ©.55 2 96 93 92 92,30,81,68,83 68.0 41 68.0 E 4 @0 3.50 183 SA 7.0 A AO>A  15.4 123 16.8 91.6 108.3 189 281 Fought back rail lane/
1-hole. Fast last race (16).BTL HORSE Steadied 3/8;eased str/
Clear early.lst off 41 day layoff.Class Inside duel;held 3rd
Change © Finished 1 from post 1 TIW= 50

5.0 22 AQUA 5>1 S>S,T>T Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 88 78 3 88 1 8 -6 82 3.20 3.60 ©0.88 1.30 1.30 1.00 1 91 88 88,71,76,0,0 78.0 238 78.0 E/P 6 @0 3.00 178 DMR 5.0 A S>A 23.1 126 15.4 92.7 108.2 91 179 Lost whip past 1/8/
5-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? Btwn;dueled;wkened/ 4wd
WATCH!BTL HORSE Clear early.lst off 238 into str;drift in
day layoff.Class Change 29 Finished 1
from post 5 TIW= 66

5.0 3 3 RAKASSAH 9>1 S>S,T>T Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 8 85 3 85 3 84 88172 3.301.90 1.80 3.30 1.99 1.80 3 990 90 86 83,87,85,0,0 85.0 40 85.0 E/P 5 @ 2.50 164 SA 5.5A S>A 19.2 138 15.7 91.0 106.7 180 266 Drifted in str;clear/
9-hole.BTL HORSE Clear early.lst off 40 Dueled;held 2nd/ Inside
day layoff.Class Change 25 Finished 1 bid;led;caught

from post 9 TIW= 76



DATE  TRK #

7/10/20 DMR 3

DATE  TRK #

7/10/20 DMR 4

DT

PP

PRG

HORSE

GARTH

MIDNIGHT

NOTRE DAME

CANDY FURY

DYNAMIC

CHARLITO

HAMMERING

CALI

FRAVEL

EL DIABLO

TABLE FOR

JUNGLE

TROPICAL

GAMBINI

PPOT

6>2

1>3

4>6

11>7

3>3

6>2

3>3

3>8

1>5

253

9>2

8>4

LAST DS

$5S,D5D

$5S,D5D

$5S,D>D

$5S,D>D

$5S,D>D

S$>S,D>D

S$>S,D>D

LAST DS

S>R,T>T

S>R,D>T

R>R,T>T

S>R,T>T

R>R,T>T
R>R,T>T

R>R,T>T

RSR, T>T

NOTES FROM LAST RACE

Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
4-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed?
WATCH! Clear early.lst off 34 day
layoff.Class Change @ Finished 3 from
post 4 TIW= 71

Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
6-hole. 1st off 195 day layoff.Class
Change 4 Finished 2 from post 6 TIW=
Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
1-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed?
WATCH! Clear early.lst off 357 day
layoff.Class Change -5 Finished 3 from
post 1 TIW= 91

Class Change 5 Finished 6 from post 4
TIW= 51

Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
11-hole. 1st off 56 day layoff.Class
Change @ Finished 7 from post 11 TIW= 56
Made big overall move (3). Class Change
20 Finished 3 from post 3 TIW= 12

Made big overall move (3). *Stretch gain
(.25). 1st off 34 day layoff.Class
Change @ Finished 2 from post 6 TIW= 61

NOTES FROM LAST RACE

THIRD OFF Chased Pace. Class Change @
Finished 3 from post 6 TJW= 53

Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
3-hole. Fast last race

(17) .Uncharacteristic early speed?
WATCH! Class Change @ Finished 3 from
post 3 TIW= 56

Class Change © Finished 8 from post 3
TIW= 69

THIRD OFF Made big overall move (3).
*Stretch gain (1.25). Class Change @
Finished 5 from post 1 TIW= 52

Class Change @ Finished 3 from post 2
TIW= 62

BTL HORSE Class Change @ Finished 5 from
post 4 TIW= 47

THIRD OFF Made big overall move (6).
Made a big move early (4.25). *Stretch
gain (1). Very strong move! Take
note!BTL HORSE Class Change @ Finished 2
from post 9 TIW= 46

THIRD OFF Made big overall move (5).BTL
HORSE Class Change © Finished 4 from
post 8 TIW= 54

ASP AVG
110 SPD R# TDS

68

85

65

79

76

87

73

80

65

79

69

83

ASP AVG
110 SPD R# TDS

49

75

68

84

82

78

78

67

75

73

84

80

78

78

SPD

10 69

SPD

#110 S1

S2

76

81

73

80

81

85

84

91

87

89

93

95

94

SYs1

3.00

3.60

7.10

3.80

7.80

8.00

8.80

7.70

7.00

4.40

8.10

5.40

9.00

SYs2

4.00

4.50

8.60

4.40

5.80

4.80

SYs2

8.10

6.30

5.50

3.30

4.30

2.80

4.00

CLOSE

0.75

0.80

0.83

0.86

1.35

1.67

CLOSE

TDS1

3.00

1.90

7.10

3.80

7.80

7.10

TDS1

*okok ok

7.70

7.10

4.40

okk ok

5.40

9.00

TDS2 CLOSE RD P2F P4F PFN

4.00

3.80

8.60

4.40

2.90

TDS2

Kokokok

6.30

8.60

3.30

5.60

2.80

4.00

0.75

0.50

0.83

0.86

1.35

2.50

CLOSE

1.00

0.83

10

92

89

85

91

84

85

91

80

80

90

77

71

73

101

97

84

91

86

91

91

80

83

92

82

81

81

73

81

70

80

77

88

86

73

84

75

82

87

84

LAST FIVE
SPEED RATINGS

86,92,76,68,0

81,79,45,86,0

85,86,70,0,0

65,0,0,0,0

79,83,80,81,75

70,78,79,69,76

87,80,81,0,0

LAST FIVE
SPEED RATINGS
79,78,46,73,0

84,49,0,0,0

70,75,75,77,75

74,77,77,68,70

84,0,0,0,0
82,77,0,0,0

87,73,72,76,80

83,72,79,0,0

AVG DSLR AVG3 BRIS P EQUIP MLINE

15.6 91.0 106.6 186

85.0 34
68.0 195
80.0 357
65.0 13
81.0 56
76.0 20
83.0 34
AVG DSLR
68.0 20
67.0 21
73.0 21
76.0 20
84.0 28
80.0 28
77.6 28
78.0 28

68.0

80.0

65.0

81.0

76.0

83.0

67.0

73.0

76.0

84.0

80.0

77.0

78.0

E/P

NA

BON

2]

15.

12.

20.

15.

12.

00

00

00

.00

.00

00

.00

00

.80

.00

180

183

168

166

169

165

166

156

164

165

TRK DIS
SA 6.5
SA 6.0
DMR 6.0
LRC 6.0
SA 5.5
PLN 5.5
SA 6.5
TRK DIS
SA 5.5
SA 6.0
SA 8.0
SA 5.5
SA 8.0
SA 8.0
SA 8.0
SA 8.0

TYPE CHNG SPPNT

S S>S
S S>S
S S>S
S S>S
S S>S
S S>S
S S>S

26.9

23.1

0.0

TYPE CHNG SPPNT

S S>S
S S$>S
S S$>S
S S>S
S S$>S
S S$>S
S S$>S
S S>S

17.4

13.0

21.7

ERLY
PACE

PWR CLASS FINAL COMB TOTL

123

121

111

119

107

123

PWR

112

109

112

119

113

129

117

15.2

15.2

11.0

11.7

11.4

14.3

CLASS

12.0

10.2

12.0

16.6

14.5

87.

90.

88.

88.

83.

91.

5 102.7

1 105.3

2 105.4

193

186

169

182

170

176

ERLY
PACE

FINAL COMB TOTL

89

91

87.

89.

92

87.

89

87

.9 101.3

.0 103.0

5 96.6

1 99.3

.1 101.6

8 99.9

.1 1e5.7

.4 101.9

182

160

163

182

159

152

154

26

o

267

239

26

[¥

247

264

233

247

257

241

239

238

COMMENTS

Inside duel;edged 2nd/
Inside; edged foe 2nd/
Stumbled badly start

Held 2nd btwn late/
3wd;2wd turn;2nd best/
Dueled btwn;gave way
Inside duel;edged 2nd/
Bit off rail;no rally/
3wd;just held 3rd

Brk in;bpd;no response/ /

4wd ;angled in;wkened/
Vied;stalked;held 3rd/
Inside;edged foe 2nd
3w;no threat;mssd 2d/
Steady rail run/ 3w;late
bid;mssd plcng

3wd into str;gained 2d/
3wd into str;edged 3rd/
3wd into strjangled in

COMMENTS

Veered in;bumped start/
Shifted 2w; no rally/ Ran
off pre-start

Pulled;3wd into str/
Hesitated;off slowly/

Pulled btwn;no bid/
Steadied into lane/ 4wd
3/8 & into lane

Off bit slw;bothrd brk/
Came out 1/8;no bid/
Squeezed strt;rail bid
3wd into str;bid btwn/ /

4wd into str;no bid/ 4wd
into str;best rest/

4wd into str;willingly/

4wd str;gained 2nd/ 4wd

into str;drift out

Came out str;edged 3rd/
Came out 1/8;late 3rd/
3wd into str;outkicked



ERLY TOTL

ASP AVG SPD LAST FIVE PACE PACE
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG  HORSE PPOT LAST DS NOTES FROM LAST RACE 110 SPD R# TDS #11@ S1 S2 TOT SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDS1 TDS2 CLOSE RD P2F P4F PFN SPEED RATINGS AVG DSLR AVG3 BRIS P EQUIP MLINE CLS TRK DIS TYPE CHNG SPPNT PWR CLASS FINAL COMB TOTL LAST COMMENTS
7/10/26 DMR 5 8.0 9 9  SHOW 2>4 S>R,D>D Class Change 5 Finished 4 from post 2 ERR 73 8 ERR @ 86 84 170 5.10 6.60 0.77 ERR ERR ERR © 84 82 86 76,86,76,67,59 79.0 8 79.0 E/P 6 @ 20.00 155 LRC 6.0 R R>R 13.6 118 12.0 86.8 98.9 166 252 2wd; 3wd; evenly late/
TIW= 56 Stalked;bid 3wd;game/

Inside duel;edged 3rd

8.0 7 7 ZORICH 2>2 R>R,D>D Flashed speed. *Stretch gain (.75).BTL 80 80 10 80 8 91 83174 3.60 3.90 0.93 3.70 3.90 ©.96 8 86 94 81 87,77,83,88,80 82.0 42 82.0P 4 @0 5.00 150 SA 8.0 R CO>R 9.1 123 16.2 87.8 104.0 180 261 Came out str;2nd best/
HORSE 1st off 42 day layoff.Class Change Hopped start;inside/
10 Finished 2 from post 2 TIW= 55 4wd ;3wd; edged 2nd

8.0 11 CLAIM OF 7>2 R>R,D>D Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 87 75 9 87 1 80 93 172 5.60 5.60 1.00 4.30 2.90 1.50 1 79 74 98 87,69,74,81,80 77.e 35 77.0 E/P 7 @ 6.00 174 SA 8.0 R >R 15.9 120 16.0 84.4 100.4 153 251 Bid 3wd;4wd;drifted in/
7-hole. Fast last race (12).BTL HORSE Chased 3wd;4wd ;wkened/
1st off 35 day layoff.Class Change 25 Pressed pace;outkicked

Finished 2 from post 7 TIW= 62

8.0 55 MONGOLIAN 3>2 R>R,D>D Made big overall move (3). *Stretch gain 81 81 10 81 10 88 87 175 5.70 5.20 1.10 5.70 5.20 1.10 10 81 91 92 96,85,67,84,86 83.0 8 83.0 E/P 5 © 8.00 153 LRC 8.0 R AO>R  11.4 129 13.9 90.8 104.7 172 264 Split foes trn;rallied/
(1.25). Fast last race (15).BTL HORSE Speed;inside;cleared/
Class Change -20 Finished 2 from post 3 Step slow;weakened
TIW= 60

8.0 3 3 MONGOLIAN 8>4 R>R,D>D *Stretch gain (.5). 1st off 42 day 8 79 10 80 8 838 82170 7.10 5.90 1.21 6.40 5.00 1.28 8 83 90 78 81,80,81,82,80 81.0 42 81.0P 2 © 10.00 163 SA 8.0 R CO>R 4.5 121 15.5 86.3 101.8 173 251 5wd;4wd;edged 3rd/
layoff.Class Change 10 Finished 4 from Btwn;rail str;wkened/ 4wd
post 8 TIW= 55 into str;no rally

8.0 4 4 BUD KNIGHT 6>2 R>R,T>D Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from ERR 77 10 ERR © 85 91 176 5.70 4.50 1.27 ERR ERR ERR © 81 84 85 84,78,82,75,76 81.0 19 81.0 E 7 0 4.00 165 SA 8.0 R CO>R  15.9 129 16.2 92.6 108.8 165 250 Led brfly str;outkickd/
6-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? Dueled;led 1/4;clear/
WATCH!BTL HORSE Class Change 15 Finished Dueled;fought back str
2 from post 6 TIW= 56

8.0 2 2 POLAR WIND 2>1 S>R,D>D Chased Pace. Made big overall move ERR 78 2 ERR © 90 86 176 7.20 5.00 1.44 ERR ERR ERR © 83 86 90 84,72,0,0,0 78.0 47 78.0 P 5 0 8.00 154 SA 6.5R M>R 11.4 118 14.8 87.6 102.4 169 259 Bid btwn;led;clear/ Off
(5).BTL HORSE 1st off 47 day bit slow;no rally/
layoff.Class Change 25 Finished 1 from
post 2 TIW= 52

8.0 8 8 RONAMO 12>1 R>R,D>D Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 83 8210 83 8 79 89 168 4.20 2.80 1.50 4.20 2.80 1.50 9 83 87 84 89,86,89,92,84 88.0 28 88.0 E/P 5 @ 2.50 142 (D 9.0 R M>R 11.4 129 17.0 89.1 106.1 170 254 3path upper;drew clear/
12-hole.BTL HORSE Clear early.Class 5w 1st turn;clr;weaknd/
Change 45 Finished 1 from post 12 TIW= Off slow;inside bid
76

8.0 6 6 DIA DE 4>3 R>R,D>D Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 82 82 8 82 4 80 91 170 8.40 5.20 1.62 7.60 6.40 1.19 4 78 74 95 85,79,89,88,76 84.0 35 84.0P 3 @ 8.00 187 SA 8.0 R >R 6.8 122 15.7 85.4 101.1 152 247 Bid 4wd;5wd;held 3rd/
4-hole.BTL HORSE 1st off 35 day Stalked; 3wd;2wd;wkened/
layoff.Class Change 25 Finished 3 from 4wd 3-1/2;angled in
post 4 TIW= 59

ERLY TOTL
ASP AVG SPD LAST FIVE PACE PACE
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG  HORSE PPOT LAST DS NOTES FROM LAST RACE 110 SPD R# TDS #11@ S1 S2 TOT SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDS1 TDS2 CLOSE RD P2F P4F PFN SPEED RATINGS AVG DSLR AVG3 BRIS P EQUIP MLINE CLS TRK DIS TYPE CHNG SPPNT PWR CLASS FINAL COMB TOTL LAST COMMENTS
7/10/26 DMR 6 5.0 6 6 BIG ANDY 8>1 S>S,D>D Made big overall move (3).BTL HORSE 2 75 75 1 75 1 84 -1 83 0.00 1.30 ERR 0.00 1.30 ERR 1 81 87 75,0,0,0,0 75.06 27 75.0P 1 @ 5.00 161 SA 4.5 S S$>S 8.3 115 12.7 89.2 101.9 81 168 Step slw;drift out 1/8/ /

races in one pattern.Class Change @
Finished 1 from post 8 TJIW= 56
5.0 55 SMOOTHLIKE 6>4 S>S,D>D  *Stretch gain (4.25).BTL HORSE 2 races 67 67 2 67 2 8 -1 83 0.005.30 0.00 5.30 ERR 2 79 82 67,67,0,0,0 67.0 27 67.0NA 0O BON 3.50 161 SA 4.5 S S$>S 0.0 111 12.4 86.8 99.2 79 161 Off slow;in tight 1/8/

in one pattern.Class Change @ Finished 4 Hopped;off very slow/
from post 6 TIW= 65
5.0 33 MIZ LOLA 4>3 $>5,D>D Class Change @ Finished 3 from post 4 65 65 2 65 2 85 -3 82 0.00 4.20 0.00 4.20 ERR 2 88 70 66,63,0,0,0 65.0 26 65.0 P 5 BON 8.00 161 SA 4.5 S S$>S 41.7 113 12.0 87.6 99.6 88 158 Off rail;edged foes 3d/
TIW= 36 Stalked; edged foe 2nd/
5.0 4 4 VALENTINE 0>0 0>5,>D  1st off 737616 day layoff. FTS.Invalid ERR ERR @ ERR @ 57 -9 48 ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR © 0,0,0,0,0 ERR **** ERR NA 0@ @ 12.00 ERR 0.0 S >S 0.0 0.0 ERR ERR 2] e/ /
last race. Finished © from post @ TIW=
30
5.0 2 2 SUPER GAME 0>0 0>5,>D  1st off 737616 day layoff. FTS.Invalid ERR ERR @ ERR @ 57 -9 48 ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR © 0,0,0,0,0 ERR **** NA @ @ 4.00 ERR 0.0 S >S 0.0 0.0 ERR ERR 2] e/ /
last race. Finished © from post @ TIW=
86
5.0 11 TAMING THE 0>0 0>5,>D  1st off 737616 day layoff. FTS.Invalid ERR ERR © ERR @ 57 -9 48 ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR © 0,0,0,0,0 ERR **** NA @ @ 3.00 ERR 0.0 S >S 0.0 0.0 ERR ERR ] e/ /
last race. Finished © from post @ TIW=
9%
5.0 88 LUXURY 0>0 0>5,>D  1st off 737616 day layoff. FTS.Invalid ERR ERR @ ERR @ 57 -9 48 ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR © 0,0,0,0,0 ERR **** NA @ @ 10.00 ERR 0.0 S >S 0.0 0.0 ERR ERR 0 e/ /
last race. Finished © from post @ TIW=
74
5.0 10 10 WARRENS 0>0 0>5,>D  1st off 737616 day layoff. FTS.Invalid ERR ERR © ERR @ 57 -9 48 ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR © 0,0,0,0,0 ERR **** NA @ @ 20.00 ERR 0.0 S >S 0.0 0.0 ERR ERR 2] e/ /
last race. Finished © from post @ TIW=
59
5.0 9 9 RIGHTEOUSL 4>8 S>S,D>D Flashed speed. Class Change 5 Finished 8 62 62 1 62 1 88 -2 86 3.00 8.00 0.38 3.00 8.00 ©.38 1 92 59 62,0,0,0,0 62.0 8 62.0NA 6 @ 15.00 156 LRC 5.0 S S$>S 50.0 111 7.9 87.4 95.3 92 151 Brk in;bp;drftd in str/ /
from post 4 TIW= 56
5.0 7 7 JERSEYS 8>7 S>S,D>D Middle move (5). Class Change 19 47 47 1 47 1 65 -6 59 **** 8,890 1.14 *+** 8,80 1.14 1 63 73 47,0,0,0,0 47.0 12 47.0NA 0@ @ 30.00 142 PLN 5.0 S S$>S 0.0 93 3.7 86.5 90.3 63 136 Choppy early; outrun/ /

Finished 7 from post 8 TIW= 19



DATE  TRK #

7/10/20 DMR 7

DATE  TRK #

7/10/20 DMR 8

SHE'S OUR

STRIKE AT

GREAT

ZEE DROP

MAXIM RATE

PULPIT

TONAHUTU

SASH

MAKE IT A

APPRECIATE

ALLEVA

DREAMS OF

SILKEN

LIGHTNING

PPOT

257

555

4>4

5>6

6>2

3>4

7>1

1>2

3>1

1>3

255

7>1

LAST DS

R>R, T>T

RSR, T>T

R>R, T>T

S>R,T>T

R>R, T>T

R>R,T>T

R>R,T>T

R>R,T>T

LAST DS

$>S,D>D

R>S,D>D

S$>S,D>D

S$>S,D>D

S$>S,T>D

S5S,D5D

R>S,T>D

S5S,D5D

ASP
NOTES FROM LAST RACE 110
Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
3-hole. Fast last race
(12) .Uncharacteristic early speed?
WATCH!BTL HORSE Clear early.lst off 56
day layoff.Class Change @ Finished 1
from post 3 TIW= 34
Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
2-hole.Uncharacteristic race? 1st off 55
day layoff.Class Change @ Finished 7
from post 2 TIW= 53
THIRD OFF Chased Pace.BTL HORSE Class
Change -20 Finished 5 from post 5 TIW=
88
Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
4-hole. *Stretch gain (1.5).BTL HORSE
Class Change @ Finished 4 from post 4
TW= 77
Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
5-hole.BTL HORSE Class Change @ Finished
6 from post 5 TIW= 62
Made big overall move (3). *Stretch gain
(2.12).BTL HORSE Class Change © Finished
2 from post 6 TIW= 61
BTL HORSE 1st off 34 day layoff.Class
Change -35 Finished 4 from post 3 TIW=
83
Made big overall move (4).BTL HORSE 1st
off 40 day layoff.Class Change 45
Finished 1 from post 7 TIW= 56

86

91

85

86

87

89

NOTES FROM LAST RACE

Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
3-hole. Slow last race (12). 1st off 54
day layoff.Class Change @ Finished 6
from post 3 TIWw= 34

Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
1-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed?
WATCH!BTL HORSE Clear early.lst off 33
day layoff.Class Change © Finished 2
from post 1 TIW= 85

Made big overall move (3). Slow last
race (84).BTL HORSE 2 races in one
pattern.Class Change 40 Finished 1 from
post 3 TIW= 100

*Stretch gain (1.25). Slow last race
(11). 1st off 33 day layoff.Class Change
@ Finished 3 from post 1 TJW= 55
*Stretch gain (2). 1st off 194 day
layoff.Class Change © Finished 7 from
post 4 TIW= 66

Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
4-hole. *Stretch gain

(1) .Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH!
1st off 34 day layoff.Class Change ©
Finished 2 from post 4 TIW= 39

Made big overall move (3).BTL HORSE
Class Change @ Finished 5 from post 2
TIW= 43

Chased Pace. Made big overall move (3).
Made a big move early (3).BTL HORSE 1st
off 162 day layoff.Class Change 27
Finished 1 from post 7 TIW= 51

ERR

76

73

80

97

87

81

AVG
SPD

84

85

89

81

87

87

88

89

84

84

81

88

85

78

R#

10

10

SPD
DS

86

85

91

85

87

88

89

ERR

85

85

79

97

85

81

#11e0 S1 Ss2 TOT

93

78

87

85

84

86

85

94

57

86

85

96

85

92

88

48

85

93

98

97

98

79

-9

79

81

88

90

85

125

172

48

164

184

175

SYs1

2.80

4.40

4.00

5.20

5.90

6.50

7.60

4.20

4.60

5.10

3.20

6.30

SYs2

3.20

4.30

3.20

3.70

4.00

4.40

3.7

SYs2

5.80

5.90

6.10

3.80

4.90

5.40

4.20

CLOSE

0.88

1.03

1.28

1.40

1.47

1.49

2.06

CLOSE

0.73

0.79

0.84

0.84

0.85

TDS1

1.70

4.40

1.20

6.70

5.90

5.80

7.20

TDS1

ERR

4.10

7.10

2.30

4.00

7.20

5.00

TDS2 CLOSE RD P2F P4F PFN

17.5 89.5

3.10

4.30

3.20

4.60

4.00

3.30

TDS2

ERR

5.20

5.00

3.50

4.00

5.60

2.50

CLOSE

ERR

0.78

1.43

0.67

1.00

1.30

2.00

3 93103

95 100

85

90

82

76

73

81

78

93

84

80

72

83

70

81

87

78

89

85

89

RD P2F P4F PFN

2]

94 98 77

97 186 79

78

91

91

78

84

82

95

98

86

90

79

82

95

83

87

LAST FIVE
SPEED RATINGS

91,75, 88,85,58

83,92,87,82,76

86,87,95,92,91

86,88,94,92,91

75,93,88,83,63

81,83,89,95,89

82,89,90,89,87

90,84,87,85,87

LAST FIVE
SPEED RATINGS

82,90,87,99,92

98,92,85,91,79

0,88,87,81,85

73,96,0,87,83

83,88,96,78,81

97,90, 93,89, 82

85,95,93,96,81

85,69,77,82,0

AVG DSLR AVG3

85.0 56
87.06 55
89.0 26
89.0 28
85.0 26
84.0 26
87.0 34
87.0 40
AVG DSLR
86.0 54
92.0 33
58.0 27
56.0 33
89.0 194
93.0 34
91.0 19
77.0 162

87.0

89.0

89.0

85.0

84.0

87.0

87.0

92.0

58.0

56.0

89.0

93.0

91.0

77.0

BRIS P EQUIP MLINE

E/P 7

E/P 8

E/P 3

E/P 5

E/P 2

E/P 3

BOFF

12.

12.

12.

15.

00

.00

.50

.00

.00

.50

.00

.60

.00

00

00

.00

.00

00

184

188

180

207

194

207

180

196

172

189

177

164

TRK DIS
SA 8.0
SA 8.0
SA 10.0
SA 5.5
SA 8.0
SA 8.0
SA 8.0
SA 8.0
TRK DIS
SA 6.0
SA 8.5
LA 4.6
SA 6.5
SA 5.5
SA 6.5
SA 8.0
SA 6.5

TYPE

TYPE

CHNG SPPNT
AO>A  18.6
AO>A  16.3
N>A 16.3
AO>A  18.6
AO>A 7.0
AO>A 7.0
N>A 7.0
A 9.3
CHNG  SPPNT
AO>A  22.7
AO>A 4.5
A>A 22.7
AO>A 9.1
AO>A  13.6
AO>A  13.6
AO>A 0.0
S>A 13.6

PWR CLASS FINAL COMB TOTL

131

141

140

133

136

143

139

137

119

123

122

127

126

122

15.

17.

15.

14.

15.

15.

17.

2

88.

86.

91.

86.

86.

87.

87.

2

2]

5

7

9

4

7

ERLY
PACE
107.0 196
104. 195
103. 163
107. 183
100. 166
102. 156
102. 145
104. 164
ERLY
PACE

CLASS FINAL COMB TOTL

14.8 89.1 103.9 192

19.

14.

11.

17.

14.

16.

2]

5

9

1

2]

2

87.3 106.3 203

94.2 96.8

87.7 102.2

92.9 104.8

94.1 111.2

90.1 104.1

86.7 103.0

2]

160

186

189

164

174

265

244

270

244

245

230

253

282

©

239

268

284

247

26

A

COMMENTS

Inside;met bid;held/
3wd ; 4wd ; weakened/
Stalked;bid;outkicked

Bobbled start;pulled/
Speed;inside;held game/
4wd 6-1/2 & into str

3wd str;no late bid/
Broke through gate/
Bid;led;edged 3rd btwn
3wd;bit tight late/
Dueled;led;lost 3rd/
Fought back rail lane

Inside; no late bid/ 5wd
into strjrallied/ Rail
bid;steadied late

3wd into str;rallied/ Bid
3wd 1/2;outkicked/ 3path
1/4;1leveled off

Saved ground to lane/
Came out 1/16;surged/
Inside;dueled;edged 3d
3wd into str;led;clear/
Drifted in late;no bid/
Inside trip;willingly

COMMENTS

Vied;stalked;wkened/
Closer 2p turn;flattnd/
Inside duel;weakened

Fought back rail lane/
Stalked;bid;outgamed/ Bid
3wd 1/2;weakened

Settled; 2w; rallied/
3wd;rally;4deep wire/ Svd
grnd;angld out str

Inside; edged foes 3rd/
Stalked btwn;willing/ éwd
into str;willingly

Came out str;no bid/
Stalked;edged 3rd 3wd/
Rail bid;clear;held

3wd early;2nd best/
Pulled early;3wd lane/
Inside;met bid;clear

Split 1/8;no late bid/
Inside; just held 3rd/
Bobbled start;4wd str
4wd ;3wd; drift in str/
Came out str;no rally/
3wd;4wd; held 3rd



ERLY TOTL

ASP AVG SPD LAST FIVE PACE PACE
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG  HORSE PPOT LAST DS NOTES FROM LAST RACE 110 SPD R# TDS #11@ S1 S2 TOT SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDS1 TDS2 CLOSE RD P2F P4F PFN SPEED RATINGS AVG DSLR AVG3 BRIS P EQUIP MLINE CLS TRK DIS TYPE CHNG SPPNT PWR CLASS FINAL COMB TOTL LAST COMMENTS
7/10/206 DMR 9 8.0 12 12 MARGOT'S 2>3 R>R,T>T THIRD OFF Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace 85 8 5 85 4 84 97 181 2.10 2.60 ©.82 2.10 2.60 ©.82 5 86 86 79 84,81,93,85,80 86.0 20 86.0 E 8 © 8.00 186 SA 9.0 N N>N 13.3 142 17.5 89.2 106.7 172 251 Fought back rail lane/

w

w

v

ha

ha

N

hY

N

hY

[

S>R,D>T

R>R,D>T

R>R, T>T

S>R,T>T

S>R,T>T

R>R,T>T

R>R,T>T

R>R,T>T

S>R,T>T

R>R,T>T

R>R,T>T

from 2-hole.Uncharacteristic early

speed? WATCH!BTL HORSE Clear early.Class
Change @ Finished 3 from post 2 TIW= 67
THIRD OFF Class Change 5 Finished 3 from ERR
post 5 TIW= 49

Flashed speed. 1st off 49 day ERR
layoff.Class Change 33 Finished 4 from

post 6 TIW= 76

Chased Pace. *Stretch gain (.25).BTL 83
HORSE 1st off 34 day layoff.Class Change

@ Finished 3 from post 1 TIW= 30

*Stretch gain (1.75). Fast last race ERR
(17).BTL HORSE 1st off 34 day

layoff.Class Change 15 Finished 5 from

post 4 TIW= 53

Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from ERR
8-hole.BTL HORSE Class Change 33

Finished 1 from post 8 TJIW= 68

Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 81
1-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed?
WATCH!BTL HORSE Clear early.lst off 42

day layoff.Class Change 73 Finished 1

from post 1 TIW= 54

THIRD OFF Made big overall move (4). 84
*Stretch gain (1.87).BTL HORSE Class

Change 15 Finished 2 from post 3 TIW= 71
Chased Pace. Made big overall move 83
(3).BTL HORSE Class Change 15 Finished 1
from post 5 TIW= 97

Chased Pace. Made big overall move (4). ERR
*Stretch gain (1.25). Fast last race
(18).BTL HORSE 1st off 34 day layoff.2

races in one pattern.Class Change 15
Finished 2 from post 3 TJIW= 90

Chased Pace. Made big overall move 87
(4) .BTL HORSE 1st off 49 day

layoff.Class Change 33 Finished 1 from

post 7 TIW= 51

Made big overall move (3). *Stretch gain 81
(.25).BTL HORSE 1st off 34 day

layoff.Class Change © Finished 2 from

post 2 TIW= 66

81,88,83,85,69

86,90, 90,84,86

80,83,79,80,72

101,94,89,86,74

85,86,84,0,0

84,73,78,0,0

84,76,85,79,82

84,78,82,85,79

102,92,90,73,83

90,83,86,95,79

81,85,89,81,67

E/P

E/P

E/P

E/P

E/P

E/P

.0s

.0s

.0s

98.2 177

103.0 175

102.2 140

111.0 221

107.4 191

102.2 194

101.4 155

104.7 161

112.4 222

108.3 165

104.7 134

A

S

vy

U

w

v

)

~

Fought back rail;game/
Bit off rail;held game

3wd into str;up 3rd/ Came
out str;no bid/ 3w into
str;clear late

Bid btwn 1/2;wkened/ 3wd
into str;edged 3rd/
Bid;led;drew clear
Inside; 2wd late 3rd/
Hopped start;gamely/ 3wd
into strj;rallied

Bobbled early;4wd lane/
Bid;led;edged wire/ Came
out str;up 4wd

3wd;re-bid 1/16;game/
Bobbled bit start;game/
Vied btwn turn;weakend
Pulled;inside;held/ 3wd
into str;no rally/ Off
bit slow;3wd lane

Bid 3w;rallied;missed/
Circled 4w; no rally/ Bid
2w;rallied;driving

Bid 3w;led late;held/ Off
step slow;outkickd/ 3wd
into str;edged 3rd

Lacked room 1/4-1/16/ Off
bit slow;up btwn/ Step
slow;stdied 1/4

Came out str;rallied/ 4wd
into strj;rallied/
3wd;4wd;no late bid

Bid 3wd 1/8;gamely/ 4wd
into str;led 3wd/ 5wd
into str;riddn out



ERLY TOTL

ASP AVG SPD LAST FIVE PACE PACE
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG  HORSE PPOT LAST DS NOTES FROM LAST RACE 110 SPD R# TDS #11@ S1 S2 TOT SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDS1 TDS2 CLOSE RD P2F P4F PFN SPEED RATINGS AVG DSLR AVG3 BRIS P EQUIP MLINE CLS TRK DIS TYPE CHNG SPPNT PWR CLASS FINAL COMB TOTL LAST COMMENTS
7/10/26 DMR 10 6.5 8 8 DARK 6>2 S>S,D>D THIRD OFF Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace 81 77 9 82 3 99 78 167 2.70 5.30 0.51 1.40 2.10 .67 4 85 85 76 75,71,87,85,82 78.0 27 78.0 E 8 @ 4.50 164 SA 7.0 C cC 26.7 119 14.2 87.9 102.1 170 246 Btwn;inside;held 2nd/
from 6-hole.Uncharacteristic early Inside;dueled;wkened/ Bid
speed? WATCH! Clear early.Class Change 5 btwn;wkened
Finished 2 from post 6 TJW= 55
6.5 6 6 RED VALOR 6>1 S>S,D>D Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 74 76 9 76 6 92 82174 3.10 4.30 ©0.71 3.10 4.30 ©.71 9 93 95 84 85,0,72,82,72 52.0 49 52.0 E 7 @ 12.00 130 SA 6.0 C C 23.3 114 14.7 91.8 106.5 188 272 Bid;led into str;held/

6-hole.BTL HORSE Clear early.lst off 49
day layoff.Class Change 10 Finished 1
from post 6 TIW= 52

Lacked rm;shft in 1/16/
Bid 3wd;led;wkened

S$>S,T>D Flashed speed. 1st off 46 day 3 74,990,83,81,75 105.3 191 4wd into str;no rally/
layoff.Class Change -55 Finished 10 from 4wd ;2wd;drew clear/
post 12 TIW= 66 Bobbled start;4w;rail
R>S,D>D Flashed speed. 1st off 33 day 83,87,88,89,92 102.5 199 8 Stalked;bid;wkened/
layoff.Class Change -55 Finished 4 from Evenly off rail/ Shifted
post 5 TIW= 51 2w; kept on
8 R>S,D>D Flashed speed.Uncharacteristic race? 1st 3 69,75,83,68,70 93.4 174 7 Through after 3/4/ Off
off 54 day layoff.Class Change @ rail upper; empty/ Came
Finished 8 from post 9 TJIW= 69 in st; weakened
6.5 2 2 SEVEN OXEN 7>5 S>S,D>D  Slow last race (17). Class Change 20 77 71 10 71 3 83 80 162 5.10 4.80 1.08 6.00 3.00 2.00 4 80 73 72 54,82,76,73,76 71.0 13 71.0 P 1 @ 20.00 135 LRC 5.5 C C 3.31106 9.4 92.1 101.4 153 225 2wd; 3wd; no rally/ 3wd
Finished 5 from post 7 TJIW= 36 to turn;rail str/ Rail
bid;led 1/16
6.5 7 7 LITTLE NO 2>4 S$>S,D>D Made big overall move (4). Class Change 82 82 9 82 2 8 81164 5.90 5.20 1.13 8.60 4.30 2.00 2 75 74 84 72,80,0,78,84 51.0 27 51.0P © BOFF 6.00 159 SA 7.0 C C 0.0 119 13.4 88.2 101.6 149 233 Off bit slow;4wd lane/
5 Finished 4 from post 2 TIW= 76 3wd into str;no rally/
Rallied outside;missed
6.5 11 11 JEN GO 4>3 $>5,D>D Flashed speed. Made big overall move 79 8 9 8o 5 87 79 165 5.60 4.80 1.16 5.90 4.30 1.36 8 83 80 79 73,85,0,89,82 53.0 27 53.0P 2 0 8.00144 SA 7.0C C>C 6.7 117 13.4 88.9 102.3 163 242 3wd into str;held 3rd/
(3). Class Change 5 Finished 3 from post Btwn 1/8;edged 3rd/
4 TIW= 47 Angled in turnjout str
6.5 9 9 KNIFES 5>1 R>S,D>D THIRD OFF Made big overall move (5). ERR 72 10 ERR © 84 84 167 5.90 5.10 1.17 ERR ERR ERR © 79 81 81 81,79,29,79,80 63.0 28 63.0 E/P 1 @ 15.00 148 SA 8.0 C oC 3.3 114 14.6 85.4 100.0 160 241 Bobbled start;rallied/
Made a big move early (3.25).BTL HORSE Bid;3wd into str;wkend/
Class Change 10 Finished 1 from post 5 Gave way;eased;walked
TIW= 40
6.5 4 4 ARTIE B 5>5 R>S,T>D Chased Pace.Uncharacteristic race? 1st ERR 82 9 ERR © 88 90 177 7.90 5.60 1.41 ERR ERR ERR © 84 89 73 78,82,0,70,89 80.0 33 80.0 P ] © 20.00 166 SA 8.0 C c>C 0.0 119 12.4 89.4 101.8 173 246 Bid 3wd 1/4;weakened/ 3wd
off 33 day layoff.Class Change -15 into str;outkicked/
Finished 5 from post 5 TIW= 57 Pulled up; walked off
6.5 3 3  UNBRIDLED' 6>5 S>S,T>D  1st off 40 day layoff.Class Change -15 81 81 9 78 3 83 87170 6.10 4.20 1.45 5.90 2.990 2.00 4 88 91 83 81,80,82,94,76 81.0 40 81l.0 P 1 0 12.00 169 SA 5.5 C oC 3.3 120 13.7 93.0 106.7 179 262 Hopped;off slowly/ Came
Finished 5 from post 6 TJIW= 48 out 1/8;edged 3rd/ Split

foes;rail bi



