AVG ASP ASP BEST  BEST

DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE DST SURF MOVING? SPD R# TDS RT 110 RD SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDS1 TDS2 CLOSE BROT1 P2F P4F LST Last DSLR BTOT POWER MLINE LAST FIVE FIGS TIW% CLS COMMENT OVERAL LAST TOTALS
9/19/21 WO 1 6.0 1 1 CHAIRMAN S>S D>D F/PP/BTL/E/Y(5>4) Class Change -16 68 4 71 3 72 2 1.4 4.8 0.3 1.6 3.5 0.5 58.65 92 88 74 254 30 254 111.2 2.00 72,59,71,71,0 138 85 Bmp start;dueled;chase 318 534 852
6.0 2 2 JUST R>S T>D F/PP/E/Y(7>9) Class Change -10 64 3 71 1ERR © 3.9 7.9 0.510.0 7.1 1.4 55.67 88 86 47 221 16 304 103.8 8.00 62,60,71,0,0 92 101 Stalk;press;duel;tire 299 484 783
6.0 6 6 VIRREINA S>S D>D F/PP/Y(6>4) Class Change -5 62 6 64 4 64 4 4.3 7.1 0.6 5.4 6.5 0.8 54.70 79 77 75 231 22 231 105.7 3.00 61,70,56,63,64 39 51 Brk outwd;5-4w;evn out 301 488 788
6.0 4 4 CARDIFF S>S D>D Y(8>5) Class Change © 5710 5710 59 6 7.8 7.1 1.1 7.8 7.1 1.1 56.68 85 71 156 9 156 101.1 6.00 64,55,67,67,48 82 74 3-4w;mild rally 290 388 678
6.0 3 3 MUSIC S>S D>D F/PP/Y(7>8) Class Change -6 56 5 56 4 59 3 3.1 6.9 0.4 3.7 7.0 0.5 56.60 86 77 68 231 318 231 98.5 10.00 54,57,65,57,47 31 16 Bmp start;4-5w;evn out 281 467 748
6.0 8 8 MAGIC S>S D>D F/PP/Y(7>7) Class Change © 56 3 5 3 64 2 5.5 7.7 .7 5.5 7.7 0.7 58.05 90 88 52 230 44 230 106.9 5.00 53,40,74,0,0 74 33 Herded;lost grnd;tired 285 465 750
6.0 9 9 MY BOY R>S T>D N(10>12) Class Change -5 45 1 ERR O ERR © 8.5 9.2 0.9 ERR ERR ERR 53.86 80 75 34 189 16 256 86.8 20.00 45,0,0,0,0 45 111 Leapt up start;no bid 251 415 666
6.0 7 7 THE BAND S>S D>D N(1>7) Class Change © 39 3 39 2 37 1 8.9 9.6 0.9 10.0 10.0 1.0 54.39 79 51 130 37 130 88.4 20.00 40,40,37,0,0 79 73 Never in contention 236 304 540
6.0 5 5 ADELAIDE S>S D>D SP+17/N(6>7) 38 4 46 3 53 2 6.1 9.2 0.7 7.4 89 0.855.81 8 78 66 232 37 232 90.6 10.00 55,15,50,32,0 © 43 Dropped back 3w turn 239 456 696
AVG ASP ASP BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE DST SURF MOVING? SPD R# TDS RT 110 RD SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDS1 TDS2 CLOSE BROT1 P2F P4F LST Last DSLR BTOT POWER MLINE LAST FIVE FIGS TIW% CLS COMMENT OVERAL LAST TOTALS
9/19/21 WO 2 6.5 1 1 LADY S>S T>T BTL/SG:.25/Y(4>5) Class Change © 88 10 8310 8 6 6.1 4.8 1.3 6.1 4.8 1.3 52.82 74 71 102 247 28 247 145.6 3.50 83,90,85,89,91 147 210 Rail then all out btwn 322 487 808
6.5 8 8 JEANNIE' S>S T>T N(8>8) Class Change -14 8610 8 2 81 1 2.4 3.6 0.7 3.5 5.9 0.6 56.46 94 90 83 267 49 267 137.9 1.80 81,90,97,74,84 142 193 4w;no closing rspns 314 524 838
6.5 5 5 AMAZIMA S>S T>T BOM:4/N(11>8) Class Change -10 8410 8 2ERR © 5.8 4.9 1.2 9.4 6.1 1.557.17 84 94 83 261 42 261 139.4 6.00 84,77,90,86,91 71 204 3p upper; improved 318 530 849
6.5 4 4 SISTER S>S T>T F/PP/BTL/WATCH/E/Y(6>6) Class 8310 8 3 8 2 2.0 5.9 0.3 1.2 5.4 0.257.95 99 9 86 281 49 281 132.3 10.00 88,61,75,84,89 116 221 Headed 1/8 out;gv way 309 545 854
Change -14
6.5 3 3 ROMAN S>S t>T SG:1.25/R2/N(6>4) Class Change © 8310 8 9 8 3 6.4 5.7 1.1 6.6 5.4 1.2 59.14 90 87 177 45 177 133.0 8.00 87,80,82,81,79 140 210 Rail;gamely in vain 313 421 735
6.5 7 7 ROSEBUD' S>S T>T F/PP/BTL/WATCH/E/Y(1>2) Class 8210 8 2 8 2 2.2 3.8 0.6 2.1 2.1 1.054.46 78 78 99 255 28 255 148.0 2.00 86,88,83,83,81 128 171 Set pace;caught late 320 504 824
Change ©
6.5 2 2 TOFFEN  S>S D>T F/PP/WATCH/Y(5>7) Class Change -5 81 8 ERR © ERR © 3.1 3.8 0.8 ERR ERR ERR 56.56 91 94 76 261 29 261 139.4 2.5e 81,83,95,88,83 122 176 Passed top str;faded 305 515 820
6.5 6 6 ROYAL S>S T>T F/Y(3>7) Class Change © 80 10 8 2 8 1 5.8 5.6 1.0 6.1 8.3 0.7 53.25 76 73 95 244 28 244 124.6 20.00 80,71,75,80,83 59 216 2-3w;no late response 298 474 772
AVG ASP ASP BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE DST SURF MOVING? SPD R# TDS RT 110 RD SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDS1 TDS2 CLOSE BROT1 P2F P4F LST Last DSLR BTOT POWER MLINE LAST FIVE FIGS TIW% CLS COMMENT OVERAL LAST TOTALS
9/19/21 WO 3 5.0 4 4 DIAMOND S>S D>t F/PP/E/Y(1>3) Class Change 35 77 2 8 1ERR © 1.9 3.8 0.5 2.0 3.0 0.7 57.52 93 95 65 253 21 253 132.1 2.00 74,80,0,0,0 140 187 Big lead;headed 16th 636 1003 1638
5.0 5 5 FEELTHEB S>S D>t F/PP/SP-14/Y(7>6) Class Change © 75 3 ERR © ERR © 2.7 3.8 0.7 ERR ERR ERR 58.82 95 90 62 247 50 247 124.2 2.50 61,81,83,0,0 110 199 Brf spd;pressed;tired 623 924 1547
5.0 2 2 SAN S>S D>t F/PP/E/Y(1>1) Class Change 75 74 1 ERR O ERR © 1.7 1.7 1.0 ERR ERR ERR 58.95 94 89 78 261 26 261 115.7 4.090 74,0,0,0,0 63 147 Pc;lasted;drivg 624 1028 1652
5.0 3 3 SILENT S>S T>t F/PP/Y(8>1) 73 3 73 2 ERR © 2.5 2.5 1.0 3.9 2.8 1.4 54.39 82 68 87 237 17 237 121.8 3.00 68,77,73,0,0 65 57 Clr str;held driving 618 977 1595
5.0 1 1 THIS WAY @>S >t Y(0>0) ERR © ERR © ERR © ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR @ ¥*x* (2] 6.00 0,0,0,0,0 142 ERR ERR ERR ERR
AVG ASP ASP BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE DST SURF MOVING? SPD R# TDS RT 110 RD SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDS1 TDS2 CLOSE BROT1 P2F P4F LST Last DSLR BTOT POWER MLINE LAST FIVE FIGS TIW% CLS COMMENT OVERAL LAST TOTALS
9/19/21 WO 4 6.5 10 10 WHITE S>S D>T F/PP/SP-11/Y(7>6) Class Change -5 9110 93 7 93 7 6.5 4.8 1.4 7.6 4.1 1.9 55.88 84 89 82 255 400 255 136.4 3.00 80,92,93,88,87 116 221 3-4W;6P str;level off 199 299 498
6.5 6 6 ARMISTIC R>S T>T SG:1/R2/N(11>11) Class Change -9 90 10 ERR © ERR © 4.8 5.6 0.9 ERR ERR ERR 55.59 87 89 81 257 225 345 133.6 10.00 84,95,85,99,91 117 219 Traffic chute; faded 196 301 497
6.5 11 11 WILD S>S T>T BTL/SG:.75/Y(2>4) Class Change 0 99 106 9% 2 9% 2 4.3 3.4 1.3 4.8 3.3 1.4 55.77 85 99 95 270 28 270 155.1 4.00 92,96,84,87,92 162 202 Lost path str;miss sho 207 311 518
6.5 7 7 SENOR S>S D>T F/PP/UN?/E/Y(4>1) Class Change 65 8 10 85 1 ERR © 4.1 3.9 1.0 7.1 8.6 0.858.10 92 96 84 272 30 272 134.8 20.00 87,85,75,90,88 142 187 Brk out;drifted;drvg 195 319 514
6.5 2 2 LAPOCHKA R>S T>T BOM:5/Y(10>1) Class Change 60 8 10 8 2 88 2 6.8 2.5 2.8 8.3 4.2 2.0 55.58 76 81 83 240 14 331 145.6 8.00 86,87,92,87,71 155 165 Tip 6P top str;led 8th 200 314 515
6.5 9 9 HONEY S>S T>T BTL/SG:.75/R2/N(5>5) Class Change 8 10 8 6 8 4 5.9 6.5 ©.9 7.3 5.6 1.3 57.14 93 92 89 274 28 274 128.4 30.00 88,69,87,87,73 46 193 Take back;mild close 191 312 503
-15
6.5 8 8 SIR S>S T>T F/PP/BTL/E/Y(11>3) Class Change © 8210 92 2 92 2 1.3 4.3 0.3 0.8 1.7 ©0.557.47 91 97 88 276 28 276 143.3 6.00 92,91,85,72,68 108 173 Lead to 16th;game 3rd 198 330 528
6.5 13 13 SECRET S>S D>T F/PP/SP+12/Y(1>1) Class Change -14 82 4 73 1 ERR © 4.5 2.4 1.9 5.7 7.1 0.8 56.12 87 92 97 276 21 276 139.3 8.00 94,88,73,73,0 119 144 Swept to lead;driving 193 329 523
6.5 4 4 CLEAR R>S t>T SP-36/N(7>12) Class Change © 8010 74 2 74 2 4.6 7.6 0.6 5.7 9.0 0.6 54.21 92 90 21 203 50 288 101.6 30.00 44,69,75,93,91 72 210 Stalked;drop back turn 171 225 395
6.5 1 1 LOOKINAT S>S D>T F/BTL/SG:2.75/Y(1>4) Class Change @ 79 10 ERR @ ERR © 6.7 5.3 1.3 ERR ERR ERR 56.29 88 87 92 267 16 267 129.2 15.00 86,80,88,89,56 118 213 Checked;blocked;gamely 186 313 500
6.5 12 12 MARTEN S>S T>T F/PP/E/Y(9>3) Class Change 45 7816 82 6 8 4 1.4 4.6 0.3 1.0 3.3 0.3 58.07 97 100 78 275 23 275 130.6 10.00 86,89,82,86,78 75 156 Caught final 1/8;faded 188 322 511
6.5 5 5 TOLD IT S>S T>T BOM:7/SP+18/Y(4>1) Class Change 45 76 10 8 2 94 1 3.8 4.3 0.9 5.3 2.9 1.8 55.51 83 90 98 271 23 271 133.8 8.00 94,78,80,68,56 63 155 Rallied outsd;up late 188 330 517
6.5 3 3 MR. S>S t>T BOM:8/BM2:5.25/BM++/SP+13/Y(4>1) 76 16 8 8 79 5 5.2 3.9 1.4 5.3 3.4 1.550.97 72 79 102 253 28 253 141.1 8.00 89,90,79,42,76 78 200 6wd top str;resolutely 187 296 483

Class Change 0



AVG ASP ASP BEST  BEST

DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE DST SURF MOVING? SPD R# TDS RT 110 RD SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDS1 TDS2 CLOSE BROT1 P2F P4F LST Last DSLR BTOT POWER MLINE LAST FIVE FIGS TIW% CLS COMMENT OVERAL LAST TOTALS
9/19/21 WO 5 6.5 10 10 ROSIE S>S T>D F/PP/Y(4>7) Class Change -195 71 1 ERR O ERR © 3.3 7.8 0.4 ERR ERR ERR 56.36 85 90 66 241 22 241 114.3 6.00 71,0,0,0,0 42 186 Slo strt;bid 1/4;faltr 338 543 881
6.5 13 13 YA MAR S>S T>D F/PP/E/Y(1>4) 68 1 ERR O ERR © 1.0 4.0 0.3 ERR ERR ERR 56.60 93 89 66 248 23 248 111.7 4.50 68,0,0,0,0 147 -9 Clr upr str;passed 1/8 327 542 869
6.5 1 1 ESSENTIA S>S D>D F/PP/Y(10>4) 65 2 65 2 65 1 0.9 3.6 0.3 0.9 3.6 0.3 57.54 89 82 72 243 43 243 114.1 3.00 65,64,0,0,0 138 -9 Bmp start;even out str 321 525 846
6.5 3 3 ALLPAIDU S>S D>D F/PP/E/Y(12>6) Class Change -230 64 2 60 1 60 1 2.4 6.2 0.4 0.8 5.0 0.257.74 91 88 56 235 21 235 117.0 12.00 60,68,0,0,0 136 204 Press;clear;led to 8th 318 502 820
6.5 8 8 DREAMS S>S T>D BOM:10/BM++/SP-64/Y(10>0) 64 1 64 1 64 1 8.3 4.2 2.0 8.3 4.2 2.0 56.60 e 23 0 110.7 20.00 0,64,0,0,0 81 -9 Brk to outside fence 320 228 548
6.5 9 9 SNEAKY S>S T>D F/PP/Y(3>7) 56 3 51 2 43 1 3.9 7.7 0.5 3.3 8.1 0.456.00 8 87 65 241 23 241 105.2 20.00 66,43,59,0,0 85 56 Steadied str;lost path 293 522 815
6.5 6 6 WE'VE S>S D>D BTL/BOM:8/SG:1.75/Y(6>3) 53 4 48 3 ERR © 4.8 4.8 1.0 5.0 4.7 1.155.11 78 79 71 228 9 228 110.0 20.00 58,67,79,8,0 70 -9 Hesitate;veer injclosd 296 498 794
6.5 11 11 LOADED S>S D>D BOM:3/SG:4/N(8>7) 52 1 52 1ERR ©10.0 7.0 1.410.0 7.0 1.451.64 63 63 79 205 14 205 101.7 20.00 52,0,0,0,0 67 -9 Dwelt;closed gamely 286 462 748
6.5 12 12 SOUPER ©>S >D Y(0>0) ERR © ERR © ERR © ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR Q kxkx o 8.00 0,0,0,0,0 134 ERR ERR ERR ERR
6.5 14 14 BREATHIN ©>S >D  Y(0>0) ERR © ERR © ERR © ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR Q kxkx o 5.00 0,0,0,0,0 110 ERR ERR ERR ERR
6.5 4 4 MENAGERI ©>S >D Y(0>0) ERR © ERR © ERR © ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR Q kxkx o 4.00 0,0,0,0,0 147 ERR ERR ERR ERR
6.5 5 5 LOAD 0>S >D  Y(050) ERR © ERR © ERR © ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR Q kxkx o 10.00 0,0,0,0,0 80 ERR ERR ERR ERR
6.5 7 7 DEMOGORG ©>S >D  Y(©0>0) ERR © ERR © ERR © ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR Q kxkx o 10.00 0,0,0,0,0 100 ERR ERR ERR ERR
6.5 2 2 MAJESTIC ©>S >D Y(050) ERR © ERR © ERR © ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR Q kxkx o 8.00 0,0,0,0,0 112 ERR ERR ERR ERR

AVG ASP ASP BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE DST SURF MOVING? SPD R# TDS RT 110 RD SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDS1 TDS2 CLOSE BROT1 P2F P4F LST Last DSLR BTOT POWER MLINE LAST FIVE FIGS TIW% CLS COMMENT OVERAL LAST TOTALS
9/19/21 WO 6 7.0 7 7 SKYLERVI R>S t>D F/PP/E/Y(4>5) Class Change © 81 1 ERR O ERR © 2.5 6.3 0.4 ERR ERR ERR 54.98 90 92 69 251 42 345 124.5 2.50 81,0,0,0,0 204 186 Keen 2p; duel; wknd 453 703 1156
7.0 8 8 HALLANVA S>S T>D BOM:4/N(5>4) Class Change © 75 1 ERR O ERR © 8.9 4.4 2.0 ERR ERR ERR 54.61 78 83 78 239 22 239 116.2 10.00 75,0,0,0,0 29 186 Angled str;inching up 433 658 1091
7.6 2 2 JIMMY IS S>S T>D BOM:5/BM1:3.25/Y(7>2) 73 3 72 2ERR © 7.7 4.0 1.9 8.5 5.0 1.7 55.30 80 84 80 244 23 244 119.4 8.00 75,71,73,0,0 94 133 Rail turn;gamely btwn 426 675 1102
7.0 3 3 JOIN THE S>S T>D F/PP/Y(2>6) Class Change © 72 1 ERR O ERR © 4.4 6.7 0.7 ERR ERR ERR 55.88 85 88 69 242 22 242 118.7 3.00 72,0,0,0,0 143 186 Brke slo;bmp str;stall 430 679 1109
7.0 5 5 PROUD S>S D>D BOM:5/N(1>3) Class Change -35 66 1 66 1 66 1 7.5 2.5 3.0 7.5 2.5 3.054.41 84 74 79 237 21 237 122.8 4.00 66,0,0,0,0 90 221 Steady turn;close well 412 641 1053
7.0 9 9 GORMLEY S>S D>D N(9>9) Class Change -35 47 2 47 2 43 1 9.6 7.5 1.3 9.6 7.5 1.3 53.64 83 71 52 206 21 206 108.2 20.00 43,50,0,0,0 100 106 3W to rail turn;evenly 345 520 865
7.0 4 4 PINK 0>S >D  Y(0>0) ERR © ERR © ERR © ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR @ kkkx (7] 10.00 0,0,0,0,0 114 ERR ERR ERR ERR
7.0 1 1 AWESOME ©>S >D Y(0>0) ERR © ERR © ERR © ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR @ kkkx (7] 6.00 0,0,0,0,0 125 ERR ERR ERR ERR
7.0 6 6 FROM 0>S >D  Y(0>0) ERR © ERR © ERR © ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR @ kkkx (7] 20.00 0,0,0,0,0 122 ERR ERR ERR ERR

AVG Asp Asp BEST  BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE DST SURF MOVING? SPD R# TDS RT 110 RD SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDS1 TDS2 CLOSE BROT1 P2F P4F LST Last DSLR BTOT POWER MLINE LAST FIVE FIGS TIW% CLS COMMENT OVERAL LAST TOTALS
9/19/21 WO 7 5.0 4 4 DERRYNAN S>S T>t N(3>5) Class Change © 84 2 8 2 8 2 4.2 3.2 1.3 4.2 3.2 1.356.10 96 104 73 273 32 273 138.2 3.00 84,83,0,0,0 178 199 3w turn;swung 7wl/4 379 622 1001
5.0 3 3 FIFTH S>S D>t F/PP/Y(6>1) Class Change 35 78 2 ERR O@ERR © 4.3 1.4 3.0 ERR ERR ERR 58.85 93 97 74 264 36 264 132.3 4.00 79,76,0,0,0 132 186 3W bid 1/4;clear str 370 611 980
5.0 2 2MO S>S T>t F/PP/Y(5>5) Class Change @ 77 2 77 2 76 1 2.5 3.8 0.7 2.5 3.8 0.7 55.96 89 88 80 257 29 257 128.4 10.00 78,76,0,0,0 149 196 Brk outwd;3w;evn out 365 606 971
5.0 5 5 FULMINAT S>S T>t F/PP/SP-13/Y(8>9) Class Change 0 76 2 76 2 76 2 1.8 5.9 0.3 1.8 5.9 0.358.59 107 165 49 261 32 261 123.5 2.00 63,89,0,0,0 143 196 Outside;3p;6pl/4;faded 350 554 904
5.0 7 7 DUFRESNE S>S T>t F/PP/WATCH/E/Y(1>1) Class Change 45 74 2 79 1 79 1 3.5 3.6 1.2 1.6 1.0 1.058.80 91 95 77 263 38 263 118.3 4.50 79,68,0,0,0 121 176 Drifted 1/8p & 1/16p 357 616 973
5.0 6 6 SWEET S>S t>t BTL/BOM:4/SG:2.75/Y(3>2) Class 76 2 77 1 77 1 7.6 4.7 1.6 7.5 2.5 3.057.44 91 77 168 28 168 118.3 6.00 77,62,0,0,0 115 186 Circled 5w;determined 342 465 808

Change 35

5.0 1 1 FOREST B S>S D>t F/PP/E/Y(6>7) Class Change @ 67 3 ERR @ERR © 1.1 4.7 0.2 ERR ERR ERR 57.24 92 86 55 233 21 233 127.9 12.00 58,86,57,0,0 113 133 Clear;stalk;level 8th 337 526 863

AVG ASP Asp BEST  BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE DST SURF MOVING? SPD R# TDS RT 110 RD SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDS1 TDS2 CLOSE BROT1 P2F P4F LST Last DSLR BTOT POWER MLINE LAST FIVE FIGS TIW% CLS COMMENT OVERAL LAST TOTALS
9/19/21 WO 8 8.0 10 10 EMINENT S>R D>T CP/BOM:4/Y(9>1) Class Change 80 89 1ERR O ERR © 3.3 1.1 3.0 ERR ERR ERR 56.19 90 90 180 64 180 127.9 6.00 89,0,0,0,0 97 146 Outside bid5/16;3p;clr 276 355 631
8.0 2 2 PIZZA R>R t>T BOM:6/Y(7>1) Class Change 40 87 1 8 1 8 110.0 1.4 7.010.0 1.4 7.051.18 83 82 89 254 59 338 125.8 4.00 87,0,0,0,0 178 186 4w upper; good kick 267 435 702
8.0 7 7 DIABOLIC S>R T>T BOM:6/Y(2>1) Class Change 5 83 3 ERR O@ERR @ 6.4 1.4 4.7 ERR ERR ERR 54.91 82 83 97 262 29 262 148.2 3.00 88,87,75,0,0 149 203 Bid upr str;rdn out 277 465 742
8.0 1 1 READY S>R T>T F/PP/Y(3>1) Class Change 40 82 1ERR OERR @ 5.6 1.1 5.0 ERR ERR ERR 55.77 85 88 83 256 22 256 132.6 10.00 82,0,0,0,0 116 186 Perfect trip;led 16th 269 453 722
8.0 8 8 MRS. S>R T>T BOM:3/SG:.25/N(3>3) Class Change 5 80 3 ERR © ERR @ 5.6 3.7 1.5 ERR ERR ERR 55.02 84 83 92 259 29 259 136.8 15.00 83,84,73,0,0 143 198 Off slw;traffic str 266 451 717
8.0 9 9 CARDIO S>R t>T F/PP/E/Y(4>1) Class Change 40 79 1 ERR @ERR 0 1.3 1.3 1.0 ERR ERR ERR 59.38 100 70 170 28 170 134.5 20.00 79,0,0,0,0 137 186 Spd;held driving 265 347 612
8.0 4 4 ROYAL S>R T>T BOM:3/Y(4>2) Class Change 5 79 3 ERR @ ERR © 3.2 2.7 1.2 ERR ERR ERR 55.49 88 86 93 267 29 267 138.1 8.00 86,83,67,0,0 63 196 Stalked;rail;gaining 267 461 728
8.0 3 3 GUILEFUL S>R T>T F/PP/BTL/WATCH/E/Y(6>2) Class 76 3 ERR @ ERR © 6.2 4.8 1.3 ERR ERR ERR 56.53 88 91 79 258 22 258 124.8 15.00 81,78,70,0,0 59 198 Led;repel duelr;caught 255 449 704

Change 40

8.0 6 BAKSHEES S>R D>T BOM:10/Y(3>1) Class Change 5 76 3 ERR O ERR @ 6.7 2.0 3.3 ERR ERR ERR 55.56 82 79 87 248 21 248 138.3 20.00 77,74,77,0,0 147 198 5P str;led 8th;widen 260 431 692
8.0 5 5 WILD S>R T>T Y(@>2) Class Change 10 ERR © ERR © ERR © ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR e 43 2] 2.50 0,0,0,0,0 25 ERR ERR 153 ERR



AVG ASP ASP BEST  BEST

DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE DST SURF MOVING? SPD R# TDS RT 110 RD SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDS1 TDS2 CLOSE BROT1 P2F P4F LST Last DSLR BTOT POWER MLINE LAST FIVE FIGS TIW% CLS COMMENT OVERAL LAST TOTALS
9/19/21 WO 9 8.0 6 6 DEGREE S>R T>T F/PP/SG:.25/R2/Y(6>2) Class Change 81 3 ERR @ ERR © 3.5 4.0 0.9 ERR ERR ERR 58.18 98 111 73 282 29 282 135.1 8.00 90,85,68,0,0 86 172 Ducked out start;hung 314 532 846
5
8.0 1 1 DRIPPING R>R t>T F/PP/BOM:3/Y(2>1) Class Change 40 80 1 8 1 8 1 2.5 1.3 2.0 2.5 1.3 2.0 54.53 160 94 75 269 43 355 139.9 4.50 80,0,0,0,0 81 187 Tracked ins; edged clr 310 500 810
8.0 7 7 SOUPER  S>R D>T Y(4>1) Class Change 40 79 1 ERR O ERR © 3.3 1.7 2.0 ERR ERR ERR 55.11 83 85 81 249 21 249 131.6 15.00 79,0,0,0,0 149 187 Bmp strt;led 16th;held 306 487 793
8.0 8 8 FIRST S>R T>T F/PP/SP+15/E/Y(5>1) Class Change 5 78 3 ERR @ ERR © 1.7 2.9 0.6 ERR ERR ERR 58.69 101 113 74 288 29 288 145.2 2.50 93,84,58,0,0 162 199 Held sway;rdn out 314 544 858
8.0 5 5 HEAT S>R D>T F/Y(8>1) Class Change 40 78 3 ERR O ERR © 3.0 2.4 1.3 ERR ERR ERR 55.44 84 80 96 254 35 254 129.1 15.00 78,81,76,0,0 115 187 2-3w;rallied;up late 304 490 794
8.0 2 2 LUCKMAN S>R D>T BTL/BOM:3/SG:2.25/Y(3>2) Class 77 1 ERR O ERR © 5.7 2.9 2.0 ERR ERR ERR 54.89 81 78 85 244 21 244 130.4 20.00 77,0,0,0,0 140 187 Bid;bmp'd;outfinished 302 479 780
Change 40
8.0 9 9 READY S>R D>T BOM:3/SG:2.5/Y(6>2) Class Change 40 77 1 ERR © ERR © 8.3 3.3 2.5 ERR ERR ERR 54.32 81 82 82 245 21 245 121.4 20.00 77,0,0,0,0 86 187 3W;5P top str;closed 298 478 776
8.0 3 3 GRAFTON S>R D>T N(6>3) Class Change 45 53 1 ERR O ERR © 7.1 4.3 1.7 ERR ERR ERR 57.82 86 58 144 113 144 105.9 10.00 53,0,0,0,0 143 182 5w turn;6w into lane 250 326 576
8.0 4 4 ALBAHR R>R T>T Y(@>1) Class Change 30 ERR © ERR © ERR © ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR ] 30 ] 1.40 0,0,0,0,0 25 ERR ERR 164 ERR
AVG ASP ASP BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE DST SURF MOVING? SPD R# TDS RT 110 RD SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDS1 TDS2 CLOSE BROT1 P2F P4F LST Last DSLR BTOT POWER MLINE LAST FIVE FIGS TIW% CLS COMMENT OVERAL LAST TOTALS
9/19/21 WO 10 6.0 4 4 LAST S>S D>D F/BOM:3/SG:1.75/Y(6>2) Class Change 83 10 83 9 85 8 7.2 3.3 2.2 7.0 3.0 2.452.84 73 70104 247 21 247 121.5 1.80 83,84,82,91,83 99 184 Off slw;4-3w;rallied 364 576 940
20
6.0 5 5 EXECUTIV S>S T>D F/PP/E/Y(9>1) Class Change 20 8210 87 5 8 4 2.7 3.1 0.9 2.8 2.4 1.2 55.49 84 78 92 254 15 254 122.7 4.00 81,78,77,85,90 95 140 Stalk;bid str;led 8th 366 551 917
6.0 2 2 COMBATIV S>S D>D F/PP/BTL/WATCH/E/Y(1>3) Class 8110 79 3 79 2 3.1 5.1 0.6 2.4 6.0 0.4 56.07 84 85 90 259 45 259 124.6 2.00 84,73,78,84,80 142 179 Dueled;weakened late 361 588 948
Change 20
6.0 6 6 SOUPER S>S D>D F/PP/BOM:3/Y(5>1) Class Change 20 79 7 75 4 77 2 4.8 4.4 1.1 5.3 5.3 1.0 58.67 94 96 82 272 36 272 126.8 6.00 84,86,82,69,68 58 169 3-5w;up late;drvg 361 592 953
6.0 7 7 NASHTRIC S>S D>D BOM:9/Y(12>3) Class Change 20 7916 80 4 81 2 6.7 4.9 1.3 7.3 3.7 2.0 56.97 86 94 83 263 84 263 121.4 8.00 84,81,79,78,67 97 177 7w top str;rallied 356 576 932
6.0 3 3 SILENCE S>S D>D BOM:3/Y(7>3) Class Change 55 7816 77 8 77 7 3.5 5.3 .7 3.7 5.1 0.757.39 8 91 80 259 16 259 122.8 10.00 78,60,73,80,90 149 153 Brk outwd;rail;rallied 354 566 920
6.0 1 1 ICOMEFRO S>S D>D BOM:4/Y(3>1) Class Change 65 72 8 72 6 72 4 6.6 4.2 1.6 7.3 3.6 2.0 54.37 78 74 89 241 30 241 113.1 20.00 74,75,71,71,65 101 60 4w;by late;driving 338 552 890
AVG ASP ASP BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE DST SURF MOVING? SPD R# TDS RT 110 RD SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDS1 TDS2 CLOSE BROT1 P2F P4F LST Last DSLR BTOT POWER MLINE LAST FIVE FIGS TIW% CLS COMMENT OVERAL LAST TOTALS
9/19/21 WO 11 8.5 2 2 BLAST IN R>R D>D BTL/SG:1.75/Y(10>3) 81 3 8 3 8 3 3.8 3.4 1.1 3.8 3.4 1.153.63 8 83 79 251 22 336 122.4 5.00 81,84,78,0,0 67 61 Closed well late 209 327 536
8.5 1 1 LOADED R>R D>D F/PP/Y(6>5) 79 4 8 3 8 3 3.7 4.6 0.8 3.4 5.2 0.754.25 91 8 66 242 22 333 120.3 12.00 78,84,77,76,0 60 45 Staked;forced;evn out 204 317 522
8.5 11 11 IN ALL S>R D>D F/PP/Y(6>3) Class Change -195 78 2 ERR © ERR © 3.5 2.5 1.4 ERR ERR ERR 58.10 94 96 64 254 303 254 122.8 4.00 72,84,0,0,0 147 191 Chased;no late kick 212 324 536
8.5 8 8 ALPHA R>R D>D BTL/BOM:5/SG:3/Y(4>2) 76 7 77 5 77 5 6.9 4.4 1.6 7.4 4.6 1.9 52.93 84 77 86 247 22 325 121.5 2.50 82,77,76,74,77 63 110 2-3w;gained steadily 202 328 530
8.5 7 7 BUTTERED R>R T>D F/PP/WATCH/Y(2>7) Class Change -194 72 10 74 5 74 5 7.3 5.5 1.3 7.6 4.5 1.7 51.96 86 82 80 248 22 322 116.1 12.00 76,74,68,76,70 92 126 Led top str;passed 195 299 494
8.5 12 12 SPIRAL R>R D>D N(11>7) 71 4 74 1 74 1 4.6 6.0 0.8 4.2 5.8 0.7 53.35 8 81 69 235 22 317 112.0 30.00 74,64,71,73,0 34 45 3-4w;chased stretch 191 303 495
8.5 6 6 TRUECRES S>R D>D SG:4.5/Z/N(8>7) Class Change -195 70 3 ERR © ERR © 8.7 5.3 1.6 ERR ERR ERR 52.88 78 72 87 237 35 237 113.2 10.00 69,79,61,0,0 71 120 2-4W turn;mild run 197 311 508
8.5 10 10 EXPO S>R t>D F/PP/SG:1/WATCH/R2/Y(2>8) 69 4 ERR O ERR © 4.3 6.5 0.7 ERR ERR ERR 54.93 93 94 66 253 28 253 116.9 15.090 76,78,74,46,0 120 44 Forced pace;evn out 192 317 509
8.5 4 4 STAR S>R T>D BTL/BOM:5/SG:.25/Y(10>3) 69 6 ERR © ERR © 5.7 5.7 1.0 ERR ERR ERR 56.70 84 86 72 242 17 242 114.5 8.00 73,72,71,62,68 112 28 2-4w;traffic;all out 196 326 522
8.5 13 13 FROSTY R>R t>D N(7>7) Class Change -195 67 4 ERR O ERR @ 6.7 6.1 1.1 ERR ERR ERR 54.12 79 82 60 221 29 301 117.5 10.00 65,67,82,53,0 162 179 Off slw;3-4w;no threat 190 294 483
8.5 5 5 HULLABAL S>R D>D SG:2.25/N(5>9) 65 2 ERR O ERR © 10.0 8.9 1.1 ERR ERR ERR 54.08 89 80 77 246 14 246 107.1 30.00 67,62,0,0,0 56 -4 Pinched back at turn 187 3e3 489
8.5 9 9 ARQUEBUS S>R t>D F/PP/BTL/SP+16/WATCH/E/Y(3>5) 62 4 ERR O ERR © 3.8 6.5 0.6 ERR ERR ERR 55.39 97 96 67 260 28 260 109.3 20.00 78,65,58,46,0 50 -5 Led;gave way deep str 179 315 494
8.5 3 3 MR. S>R D>D N(3>9) 36 1 ERR © ERR 0 10.0 10.0 1.0 ERR ERR ERR 50.11 71 52 68 191 35 191 88.2 30.00 36,0,0,0,0 51 -4 Broke out;brush;no bid 146 237 382



DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE
9/19/21 WO 1 6.0 11 CHAIRMAN
6.0 33 MUSIC
6.0 22 JUST START
6.0 66 VIRREINATO
6.0 55 ADELAIDE
6.0 8 8 MAGIC
6.0 99 MY BOY
6.0 77 THE BAND
6.0 44 CARDIFF
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG  HORSE
9/19/21 WO 2 6.5 44 SISTER
6.5 7 7 ROSEBUD'S
6.5 8 8  JEANNIE'S
6.5 22 TOFFEN
6.5 6 6 ROYAL
6.5 3 3  ROMAN
6.5 55 AMAZIMA
6.5 11 LADY GRACE
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG  HORSE
9/19/21 WO 3 5.0 11 THIS WAY
5.0 4 4 DIAMOND

PPOT LAST DS

5>4 S>S,D>D

7>8 S>S,D>D

759 R>S,T>D

654 $>5,D5D

657 $>5,D5D

757 $55,D5D

10>12 R>S,T>D

157 $>5,D5D

8>5 S>5,D>D

PPOT LAST DS

6>6 S>S,T>T

1>2 S>S,T>T

8>8 S>S,T>T

5>7 $>S,D>T

3>7 S>S,T>T

6>4 S>S,t>T

11>8 S>S,T>T

455 S>S,T>T

PPOT LAST DS

0>0 0>S,>t

1>3 S>S,D>t

SPD
NOTES FROM LAST RACE 110
Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
5-hole.BTL HORSE Clear early.Class
Change -10 Finished 4 from post 5 TIW=
68
Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 59
7-hole. 1st off 318 day layoff.Class
Change -6 Finished 8 from post 7 TIW= 21
Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
7-hole. Clear early.Class Change -10
Finished 9 from post 7 TIW= 40
DROP SWITCH Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace
from 6-hole. Class Change -5 Finished 4
from post 6 TIW= 25
THIRD OFF MAYBE? Fast last race (17).
1st off 37 day layoff.Invalid last race.
Finished 7 from post 6 TIW= @
Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
7-hole. 1st off 44 day layoff.Class
Change @ Finished 7 from post 7 TIW=
DROP SWITCH Class Change -5 Finished
from post 10 TIW= 33
1st off 37 day layoff.Class
Finished 7 from post 1 TIW=

ERR

64

53

64

34
12 ERR
Change © 37
47

Class Change @ Finished 5 from post 8 59
TIW= 42

NOTES FROM LAST RACE

Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
6-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed?
WATCH!BTL HORSE Clear early.lst off 49
day layoff.Class Change -14 Finished 6
from post 6 TIW= 56

Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
1-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed?
WATCH!BTL HORSE Clear early.Class Change
@ Finished 2 from post 1 TIW= 64

DROP SWITCH 1st off 49 day layoff.Class
Change -14 Finished 8 from post 8 TIW=
64

DROP SWITCH Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace ERR
from 5-hole.Uncharacteristic early

speed? WATCH! Class Change -5 Finished 7
from post 5 TIW= 64

Flashed speed. Class Change @ Finished 7 8@
from post 3 TIW= 37

85

81

*Stretch gain (1.25).BTL HORSE 1st off 84
45 day layoff.2 races in one
pattern.Class Change © Finished 4 from
post 6 TIW= 62

THIRD OFF MAYBE? DROP SWITCH Made big
overall move (4). 1st off 42 day
layoff.Class Change -10 Finished 8 from
post 11 TIW= 71

THIRD OFF *Stretch gain (.25).BTL HORSE
Class Change @ Finished 5 from post 4
TIW= 65

ERR

88

SPD
NOTES FROM LAST RACE

1st off 738052 day layoff. FTS.Invalid
last race. Finished @ from post @ TIW=
64

Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
1-hole. Clear early.Class Change 35

#110

SPD
DS

71

64

46

ERR

39

85

83

ERR

80

83

87

88

SPD

110 #110 TDS

AVG
#TDS SPD

0 45

2 39

57

88

AVG
#TDS SPD

#R S1 S2

10

10

10

10

83

89

82

85

90

81

76

80

80

88

88

78

93

88

77

75

81

80

73

70

74

61

89

83

61

88

61

TOT

77

140

171

138

89

175

137

Sys1

#R S1 S2 TOT SYS1

SYs2

SYs2

CLOSE

CLOSE

0.50

TDS1

1.60 3.50
3.70  7.00
10.00 7.10
5.40 6.50
7.40 8.90
5.5 7.70

ERR ERR
10.00 10.00
7.80 7.10
TDS1  TDS2
1.20 5.40
2.10 2.10
3.50  5.90

ERR ERR
6.10 8.30
6.60 5.40
9.40 6.10
6.10 4.80
TDS1

ERR ERR
2.00

0.52

0.83

0.71

ERR

ERR

0.73

1.22

1.27

86

88

79

88

90

80

79

85

78

94

91

76

90

84

74

86

77

88

75

TDS2 CLOSE P2F PAF PFN

68

47

75

66

52

51

71

P4F PFN

78

94

73

94

99

83

76

95

87

83

71 102

TDS2 CLOSE P2F P4F PFN

LAST FIVE
SPEED RATINGS

72,59,71,71,8

54,57,65,57,47

62,60,71,0,0

61,70,56,63,64

55,15,50,32,0

53,40,74,0,0

45,0,0,0,0

40,40,37,0,0

64,55,67,67,48

LAST FIVE
SPEED RATINGS

88,61,75,84,89

86,88,83,83,81

81,90,97,74,84

81,83,95,88,83

80,71,75,80,83

87,80,82,81,79

84,77,90,86,91

83,90,85,89,91

LAST FIVE
SPEED RATINGS

3.00 0.67 93 95 65 74,80,0,0,0

BSAD DSLR AVG3

72 30
65 318
71 16
70 22
55 37
74 44
2] 16
40 37
70 9
BSAD DSLR
89 49
86 28
84 49
2] 29
80 28
89 45
90 42
91 28

59.0

64.0

62.0

40.0

45.0

39.0

62.0

86.0

89.0

86.0

75.0

83.0

84.0

86.0

BRIS P EQUIP MLINE CLS

E/P

NA

E/P

NA

NA

BRIS

E/P

E/P

[

o 2
0 10
) 8
2] 3
BOFF 1@.
e 5
0 20
BOFF 20.
0 6

.00

.00

.00

.00

.00

EQUIP MLINE
0 10.00
0 2.00
e 1.80
0 2.50
BON 20.00
0 8.00
0 6.00
@ 3.5

16

43

33

73

74

TRK DIS
Wo 6.0
WO 5.5
wo 8.5
Wo 5.5
Wo 5.5
WO 6.0
Wo 8.5
Wo 5.0
WO 5.0
TRK DIS
WO 6.0
WO 7.0
WO 6.0
Wwo 7.0
Wo 7.0
WO 5.0
ELP 5.5
Wo 7.0

TYPE

CHNG  SPPNT
M>M 20.0
M>M 24.0
M>M 8.0
M>M 16.0
MO>M 12.0
M>M 16.0
M>M 0.0
M>M 0.0
M>M 4.0
CHNG  SPPNT
G2>A 22.7
AO>A  18.2
G2>A 22.7
G3>A 13.6
AO>A 9.1
AO>A 4.5
N>A 9.1
AO>A 0.0

ERLY TOTL

PACE

PWR CLASS FINAL COMB TOTL

13.0 86.7 99.7 180

98

104

106

91

107

87

88

101

148

138

139

125

133

139

146

11.

.8 82.

CLASS FINAL

16.

14.

14.

11.

15.

15.

16.

o 88.

4 93.

.2

5

4

7

.8

92.8

90.5

96.7

83.1

92.2

85.3

80.9

96.7

comB

110.8

103.9

102.3

99.4

108.7

108.8

105.8

163

156

178

155

79

85

156

184

185

149

90

178

145

ERLY
PACE

BSAD DSLR AVG3 BRIS P EQUIP MLINE CLS TRK DIS TYPE CHNG SPPNT PWR CLASS FINAL COMB TOTL

80

kK

ERR

NA

21 77.0 E

6

BON

6.00 ERR

@ 2.00 187 WO

S>N

26.1 132 14.7 85.3 100.0 188

PAC
LAS

23

22

23

23

23

18!

13

15

25

26

26

244

17

26

24

25

E
T COMMENTS

4 Bmp start;dueled;chase/
Bmp start;passed str/ Led
str;failed to hold

1 Bmp start;4-5w;evn out/
Forced pace;check late/
Swarmed mid str;gv way

1 Stalk;press;duel;tire/
Bmp start;lacked rally/
4-5w;no threat

1 Brk outwd;5-4w;evn out/
Brk out;rebid deep str/
Headed top str;faded

2 Dropped back 3w turn/ Brk
out;spd;chased trn/ Bmp
strt;no late rspns

@ Herded;lost grnd;tired/
Brk in;led turn;faded/
Pinched back;hung

9 Leapt up start;no bid/ /

@ Never in contention/ Bmp
start;no str rspns/ Brk
outwd;steadied

6 3-4w;mild rally/
Rail-3w;gamely/ Off
slw;bmp str;chased

T COMMENTS

1 Headed 1/8 out;gv way/
Stumbled start;evn out/
Led bk str;2w;evn out

5 Set pace;caught late/ Brk
out;all out to hld/
Cruised to lead

7 4w;no closing rspns/
Drove clr;rdn out/ Ins
trip; slow gain

Passed top str;faded/
Opend up;dug in;wkn1/8/
Pace 2p; clear; held

i

2-3w;no late response/
3-5W;9P str;faltered/
Open gap trip;mild run
7 Rail;gamely in vain/
3w;all out str;evn out/
Rail trip;outfinished

1 3p upper; improved/ Press
btw;duel;empty/ 6p
upr;rally;gaining

7 Rail then all out btwn/
Rail;all out stretch/
2wd;5wd 1/8;n0 impact

3 Big lead;headed 16th/ Ran
from whip;in hand/



Finished 3 from post 1 TIW= 62

5.0 55 FEELTHEBEA 7>6 S>S,D>t Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from ERR © ERR © 75 3 87 65152 2.70 3.80 0.70 ERR ERR ERR 95 90 62 61,81,83,0,0 ] 50 75.0 E/P 5 ® 2.50 199 WO 5.5 N N>N 21.7 124 11.8 86.80 97.8 185 247 Brf spd;pressed;tired/
7-hole. Slow last race (14). 1lst off 50 Needed wire;just held/
day layoff.Class Change © Finished 6 Lng drv btw;missed plc
from post 7 TIW= 54

5.0 22 SAN 1>1 $>S,D>t Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from ERR 0 ERR @0 74 1 89 82171 1.70 1.70 1.00 ERR ERR ERR 94 89 78 74,0,0,0,0 2] 26 74.0 E 6 BON 4.00 147 PID 5.5 N S>N 26.1 116 14.0 90.4 104.4 183 261 Pc;lasted;drivg/ /

1-hole.BTL HORSE Clear early.Class
Change 75 Finished 1 from post 1 TIW= 63

5.0 3 3 SILENT 8>1 $>S,T>t Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from ERR 0 73 2 73 3 79 99177 2.50 2.50 3.90 2.80 1.40 82 68 87 68,77,73,0,0 77 17 73.0 E/P 6 @ 3.00 57 WO 6.5 N MO>N  26.1 122 11.4 87.4 98.8 150 237 Clr str;held driving/ Bmp
8-hole.BTL HORSE Invalid last race. start;2-3w;gamely/ Repel
Finished 1 from post 8 TIW= 33 rival;led;passed
ERLY TOTL
SPD SPD AVG LAST FIVE PACE PACE
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE PPOT LAST DS NOTES FROM LAST RACE 110 #110 TDS #TDS SPD #R S1 S2 TOT SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDS1 TDS2 CLOSE P2F PAF PFN SPEED RATINGS BSAD DSLR AVG3 BRIS P EQUIP MLINE CLS TRK DIS TYPE CHNG SPPNT PWR CLASS FINAL COMB TOTL LAST COMMENTS

9/19/21 WO 4 6.5 88 SIR SEAMUS 11>3 S>S,T>T Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 92 2 92 2 8210 90 93 1.30 4.30 0.29 0.80 1.76 .50 91 97 88 92,91,85,72,68 92 28 89.0 E

wo 7.0 A AO>A 12.5 143 16.9 94.7 111.6 188 276 Lead to 16th;game 3rd/
11-hole.BTL HORSE Clear early.Class Set pace;ridden out/ Gave
Change @ Finished 3 from post 11 TIW= 60 way grudgingly
6.5 12 12 MARTEN 9>3 S>S,T>T Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 85 4 82 6 78 16 94 91 184 1.40 4.00 0.34 1.00 3.30 ©.29 97 100 78 86,89,82,86,78 89 23 86.0 E 8 © 10.00 156 WO 6.5 A CO>A  20.0 131 15.8 92.1 107.8 197 275 Caught final 1/8;faded/
9-hole. Clear early.Class Change 45 Caught on wire/ Set
Finished 3 from post 9 TIW= 41 pace;light drive
6.5 44 CLEAR 7>12 R>S,t>T Slow last race (36). 1st off 50 day 74 2 74 2 80 10 77 56 133 4.60 7.60 0.61 5.70 9.00 0.63 92 90 21 44,69,75,93,91 79 50 63.0 P 3 © 30.00 210 WO 8.0 A AO>A 7.5 102 8.6 78.8 87.4 182 203 Stalked;drop back turn/
layoff.Class Change @ Finished 12 from 3-4w;tired top stretch/
post 7 TIW= 36 Inside; faded
6.5 66 ARMISTICE 11>11 R>S,T>T DROP SWITCH *Stretch gain (1). 1st off ERR @ ERR @ 90 10 82 87 168 4.80 5.60 0.85 ERR ERR ERR 87 89 81 84,95,85,99,91 2] 225 88.0 E/P 1 @ 10.00 219 TAM 8.5 A G3>A 2.5 134 11.7 87.80 98.7 176 257 Traffic chute; faded/ Led
225 day layoff.2 races in one top str;headed/ Lacked
pattern.Class Change -9 Finished 11 from closing rspns
post 11 TIW= 65
6.5 55 TOLD IT 4>1 S>S,T>T Made big overall move (7). Fast last 94 1 86 2 76 10 89 101 189 3.80 4.30 ©0.90 5.30 2.90 1.80 83 90 98 94,78,80,68,56 94 23 840 P 3 © 8.00 155 WO 6.5 A CO>A 7.5 134 13.9 92.6 106.5 173 271 Rallied outsd;up late/
race (18).BTL HORSE Class Change 45 Duel;fast pace;tire 8t/
Finished 1 from post 4 TIW= 29 No closing response
6.5 9 9 HONEY 555 S>S,T>T *Stretch gain (.75).BTL HORSE 2 races in 87 4 85 6 84 10 87 93 179 5.90 6.50 ©.91 7.3 5.60 1.32 93 92 89 88,69,87,87,73 89 28 8l1.e P 1 © 30.00 193 WO 6.0 A G1>A 2.5 128 4.9 89.6 94.5 185 274 Take back;mild close/
one pattern.Class Change -15 Finished 5 Headed far turn;faded/
from post 5 TIW= 22 3-5w; gamely
6.5 7 7 SENOR 4>1 $>5,D>T Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from ERR 0 85 1 86 10 94 88 181 4.10 3.96 1.e3 7.10 8.60 ©.83 92 96 84 87,85,75,90,88 85 30 82.0 E/P 5 © 20.00 187 WO 6.0 A A 12.5 135 15.6 89.6 105.2 188 272 Brk out;drifted;drvg/
4-hole.Uncharacteristic race?BTL HORSE Rail-2w;evn out late/
Clear early.Class Change 65 Finished 1 Drifted start;no rally
from post 4 TIW= 68
6.5 11 LOOKINATAM 1>4 S>S,D>T Flashed speed. *Stretch gain (2.75).BTL ERR @ ERR @ 79 10 86 88 174 6.70 5.30 1.27 ERR ERR ERR 88 87 92 86,80,88,89,56 ] 16 85.0 P 2 © 15.00 213 WO 6.0 A AO>A 5.0 129 15.7 89.2 104.9 175 267 Checked;blocked;gamely/
HORSE Class Change @ Finished 4 from Rail run; stalled 1/16/
post 1 TIW= 64 Rail;chased thru str
6.5 11 11 WILD 2>4 S>S,T>T THIRD OFF MAYBE? *Stretch gain (.75).BTL 9@ 2 90 2 90 10 86 61 146 4.30 3.40 1.27 4.80 3.30 1.43 85 90 95 92,96,84,87,92 92 28 91.0 P 2 © 4.00 202 WO 7.0 A AO>A 5.0 155 17.4 92.8 110.2 175 270 Lost path str;miss sho/
HORSE Class Change @ Finished 4 from 2-4w;as he pleased/ 2w;
post 2 TW= 72 had no punch
6.5 10 10 WHITE FLAG 7>6 S>S,D>T DROP SWITCH Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace 93 7 93 7 9110 8 81166 6.50 4.80 1.35 7.60 4.10 1.86 84 89 82 80,92,93,88,87 101 400 88.0 P 2 @ 3.00 221 WO 6.5 A G3>A 5.0 136 15.2 88.1 103.3 173 255 3-4W;6P str;level off/ 3w
from 7-hole. Slow last race (11). 1st upper; outkicked/ Swung
off 400 day layoff.Class Change -5 wide; no factor
Finished 6 from post 7 TIW= 52
6.5 33 MR. 4>1 $>5,t>T Made big overall move (8). Middle move 79 5 80 8 76 10 70 66 136 5.20 3.9 1.35 5.30 3.40 1.54 72 79 102 89,90,79,42,76 90 28 86.0 P 3 © 8.00 200 WO 7.5 A A>A 7.5 141 17.3 89.5 106.8 151 253 6wd top str;resolutely/
(5.25). Very strong move! Take note! Stalked;gaining/ 3-5w;all
Fast last race (13).BTL HORSE Class out to end
Change @ Finished 1 from post 4 TIW= 40
6.5 13 13 SECRET 1>1 $>S,D>T Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from ERR 0 73 1 82 4 87 93180 4.50 2.40 1.88 5.70 7.10 0.80 87 92 97 94,88,73,73,0 73 21 85.0 P 5 © 8.00 144 WO 7.0 A N>A 12.5 139 18.6 90.8 109.4 179 276 Swept to lead;driving/
1-hole. Fast last race (12).BTL HORSE Swept to lead;rdn out/
Class Change -14 Finished 1 from post 1 Bmp start;not a threat
TIW= 55
6.5 22 LAPOCHKA 10>1 R>S,T>T Made big overall move (5).BTL HORSE 88 2 88 2 8 10 93 95188 6.80 2.50 2.75 8.30 4.20 2.00 76 81 83 86,87,92,87,71 88 14 88.80 S ] © 8.00 165 WO 8.0 A OA 0.0 146 16.5 92.3 108.7 157 240 Tip 6P top str;led 8th/
Class Change 60 Finished 1 from post 10 4W turn;6P strimildly/
TIW= 77 Off slw;3-4w;rdn out
ERLY TOTL
SPD SPD AVG LAST FIVE PACE PACE
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG  HORSE PPOT LAST DS NOTES FROM LAST RACE 110 #110 TDS #TDS SPD #R S1 S2 TOT SYS1  SYS2 CLOSE TDS1  TDS2 CLOSE P2F P4F PFN SPEED RATINGS BSAD DSLR AVG3 BRIS P EQUIP MLINE CLS TRK DIS TYPE CHNG SPPNT PWR CLASS FINAL COMB TOTL LAST COMMENTS
9/19/21 WO 5 6.5 7 7  DEMOGORGON 0>0 0>5,>D  1st off 738052 day layoff. FTS.Invalid ERR @ ERR @ ERR @ 57 -9 48 ERR ERR  ERR ERR ERR ERR 0,0,0,0,0 ] Fokkk ERR NA © BON 10.00 ERR 0.0 M >M 0.0 0.0 ERR  ERR ] e/ /
last race. Finished @ from post © TIW=
50
6.5 14 14 BREATHING 0>0 0>5,>D  1st off 738052 day layoff. FTS.Invalid ERR 0 ERR © ERR @ 57 -9 48 ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR 0,0,0,0,0 ] Fokkk NA o BON  5.00 ERR 0.0 M >M 0.0 0.0 ERR ERR ] e/ /
last race. Finished @ from post © TIW=
36
6.5 55 LOAD 0>0 0>5,>D  1st off 738052 day layoff. FTS.Invalid ERR @ ERR @ ERR © 57 -9 48 ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR 0,0,0,0,0 ] Fokkk NA o @ 10.00 ERR 0.0 M >M 0.0 0.0 ERR ERR ] e/ /
last race. Finished @ from post © TIW=
44
6.5 12 12 SOUPER 0>0 0>5,>D  1st off 738052 day layoff. FTS.Invalid ERR @ ERR @ ERR @ 57 -9 48 ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR 0,0,0,0,0 ] Fkkk NA o BON  8.00 ERR 0.0 M >M 0.0 0.0 ERR  ERR ] o/ /
last race. Finished @ from post @ TIW=
72
6.5 4 4  MENAGERIE 0>0 0>5,>D  1st off 738052 day layoff. FTS.Invalid ERR @ ERR @ ERR @ 57 -9 48 ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR 0,0,0,0,0 ] Fokkk NA @ @ 4.00 ERR 0.0 M >M 0.0 0.8 ERR ERR 2] e/ /

last race. Finished @ from post @ TIW=
65
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DATE  TRK #

9/19/21 WO

MAJESTICIM

YA MAR

ESSENTIAL

ALLPAIDUP

ROSIE AMOR

SNEAKY

WE'VE HAD

LOADED

DREAMS AND

FROM ABOVE

PINK

AWESOME

SKYLERVILL

JOIN THE

GORMLEY

JIMMY IS A

HALLANVAAR

PROUD

FOREST B

FULMINATE

MO TOURING

DUFRESNE

DERRYNANE

SWEET

0>0

1>4

10>4

1256

10>0

0>0

55!

o

1>

N

0>S,>D

S$>S,T>D

S$>S,D>D

S$>S,D>D

$5S,T>D

$5S,T>D

$>5,D>D

$5S,D>D

$>S,T>D

LAST DS

0>5,>D

0>5,>D

0>5,>D

R>S,t>D

$>5,T>D

$>5,D>D

$>5,T>D

S$>S,T>D

S$>S,D>D

LAST DS

S>S,D>t

S>S,T>t

S>S,T>t

S>S,T>t

S>S,T>t

S>S, >t

1st off 738052 day layoff. FTS.Invalid
last race. Finished @ from post @ TIW=
60

Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
1-hole. Clear early.Invalid last race.
Finished 4 from post 1 TIW= 65

Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
10-hole. 1st off 43 day layoff.Invalid
last race. Finished 4 from post 10 TIW=
64

Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
12-hole. Clear early.Class Change -85
Finished 6 from post 12 TIW= 62

Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
4-hole. Class Change -50 Finished 7 from
post 4 TIW= 26

Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
3-hole. Invalid last race. Finished 7
from post 3 TIW= 43

Made big overall move (8). *Stretch gain ERR
(1.75).BTL HORSE Invalid last race.

Finished 3 from post 6 TIW= 38

Made big overall move (3). *Stretch gain ERR
(4). Invalid last race. Finished 7 from
post 8 TiW= 41

65

60

ERR

43

Made big overall move (10). Very strong 64
move! Take note! Slow last race (64).
Invalid last race. Finished @ from post
10 TIw= 39
SPD

NOTES FROM LAST RACE 110
1st off 738052 day layoff. FTS.Invalid ERR
last race. Finished @ from post © TIW=
54
1st off 738052 day layoff. FTS.Invalid ERR
last race. Finished @ from post © TIW=
1st off 738052 day layoff. FTS.Invalid ERR
last race. Finished @ from post © TIW=
63
Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from ERR
4-hole. Clear early.lst off 42 day
layoff.Class Change @ Finished 5 from
post 4 TIW= 86
Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from ERR
2-hole. Class Change © Finished 6 from
post 2 TIW= 65
Class Change -35 Finished 9 from post 9 43
TIW= 48
Made big overall move (5). Made a big ERR

move early (3.25).BTL HORSE Invalid last
race. Finished 2 from post 7 TIW= 54

Made big overall move (4). Class Change ERR
@ Finished 4 from post 5 TIW= 19

DROP SWITCH Made big overall move (5).
Class Change -35 Finished 3 from post 1
TIW= 46

66

NOTES FROM LAST RACE

Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
6-hole. Clear early.Class Change ©
Finished 7 from post 6 TIW= 57

Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
8-hole. Slow last race (13). 1st off 32
day layoff.Class Change @ Finished 9
from post 8 TIW= 65

Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
5-hole. Class Change © Finished 5 from
post 5 TIW= 73

Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
1-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed?
WATCH!BTL HORSE Clear early.lst off 38
day layoff.Class Change 45 Finished 1
from post 1 TIW= 65

1st off 32 day layoff.Class Change ©
Finished 5 from post 3 TIW= 78

Made big overall move (4). *Stretch gain

76

76

79

84

77

65

60

ERR

48

52

64

DS

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

a7

72

ERR

66

SPD
DS

76

77

79

84

77

2]

ERR

68

65

64

71

56

53

52

64

ERR

ERR

81

72

a7

73

75

66

76

77

74

84

70

87

83

87

91

86

79

72

87

57

57

84

90

78

84

87

80

93

86

93

88

86

84

77

72

87

84

79

84

90

90

89

70

92

93

83

69

90

86

86

48

170

48

48

173

178

175

173

87

ERR

ERR

1.43

CLOSE

0.40

0.67

1.28

1.92

2.00

3.00

CLOSE

0.30

0.67

1.17

1.33

1.63

ERR

10.00

ERR

ERR

ERR

5.00

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

0.25

ERR

2.00

CLOSE

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

1.70

ERR

0.30

0.67

1.00

93

89

91

85

89

78

63

89

82

88

90

87

79

63

66

72

56

66

65

71

P2F P4F PFN

9

85

83

80

78

84

107

89

91

96

91

92

88

71

84

83

74

88

95

69

69

w
~

80

78

79

49

80

77

73

77

0,0,0,0,0

68,0,0,0,0

65,64,0,0,0

60,68,0,0,0

71,0,0,0,0

66,43,59,0,0

58,67,79,8,0

52,0,0,0,0

0,64,0,0,0

LAST FIVE

SPEED RATINGS

0,0,0,0,0

0,0,0,0,0

0,0,0,0,0

81,0,0,0,0

72,0,0,0,0

43,50,0,0,0

75,71,73,0,0

75,0,0,0,0

66,0,0,0,0

LAST FIVE
SPEED RATINGS
58,86,57,0,0

63,89,0,0,0

78,76,0,0,0

79,68,0,0,0

84,83,0,0,0

77,62,0,0,0

) EEETY
2] 23
65 43
60 21
] 22
59 23
79 9
52 14
64 23
BSAD DSLR
0 kK
0 ok ok
0 ok ok
2] 42
2] 22
50 21
73 23
2] 22
66 21
BSAD DSLR
2] 21
89 32
78 29
79 38
84 32
77 28

65.0

64.0

71.0

68.0

52.0

64.0

AVG3

81.0

72.0

47.0

73.0

75.0

66.0

AVG3

76.0

77.0

74.0

84.0

70.0

NA

NA

NA

BRIS

NA

NA

NA

BRIS

BON

BOFF

BON

BON

BON

BON

BON

o

.00

12.00

20.

00

20.

00

20.

00

20.00

MLINE

.00

20.00

10.00

MLINE

10.00

ERR

56

0.0
Wo 6.5
WO 6.0
WO 6.5
wWo 7.0
Wo 6.5
Wo 5.5
Wo 5.5
WO 6.5
TRK DIS

0.9

0.9

0.9
SAR 8.5
Wwo 7.0
WO 6.5
WO 6.5
Wo 7.0
WO 6.5
TRK DIS
WO 6.5
SAR 5.5
WO 6.5
SAR 5.5
SAR 5.5
Wo 5.0

TYPE

>M

CHNG

S>S

CHNG

S>N

S>N

27.3

18.2

18.2

18.2

SPPNT

20.0

80.0

SPPNT

20.7

20.7

13.8

112

114

117

114

105

110

102

111

PWR

124

119

108

119

116

123

124

128

118

138

118

10.5

10.0

CLASS

15.3

13.7

11.9

13.1

ERR

85.1

82.9

88.4

81.9

86.3

84.0

86.7

ERR

87.2

88.7

85.2

87.2

96.3

95.2

90.9

91.6

88.2

94.9

90.2

87.5

ERR

102.6

102.4

81.1

97.1

87.3

98.5

182

171

179

175

182

173

154

164

161

158

ERLY
PACE

CLASS FINAL COMB TOTL

12.1 83.5 95.6 178

12.3

14.5

13.8

15.7

11.7

82.8

89.0

91.1

86.1

86.9

95.1

103.5

105.0

101.9

98.5

212

177

186

200

91

248

243

235

241

241

228

205

®

251

242

206

244

239

237

261

257

263

273

168

/!

~

Clr upr str;passed 1/8/

Bmp start;even out str/
Stmble start;close str/

Press;clear;led to 8th/
Lug in;wrong lead str/

Slo strt;bid 1/4;faltr/

~

Steadied str;lost path/
Spd;dueled;chased/ Chased
hard;no rally
Hesitate;veer in;closd/
Off slw;rally stalled/
Off slw;2-3w;gamely
Dwelt;closed gamely/ /

Brk to outside fence/
Rail-3w chased str/

COMMENTS

Keen 2p; duel; wknd/ /

Brke slo;bmp strj;stall/ /

3W to rail turn;evenly/
Well back;mild rally/
Rail turn;gamely btwn/ No
response in stretch/
Rail;rallied between
Angled str;inching up/ /

Steady turn;close well/ /

COMMENTS

Clear;stalk;level 8th/
Set pace;held sway drv/
Headed 1/8 out;faded

Outside;3p;6pl/4;faded/
Clear 2-path; driving/

Brk outwd;3w;evn out/
Rail duel; kick clear/

Drifted 1/8p & 1/16p/
3-2path turn;empty/

3w turn;swung 7wl/4/ Ins
turn;mvd out 3/16/
Circled 5w;determined/
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DATE  TRK #

9/19/21 WO

5.6 33

DT

PP

FIFTH

HORSE

CARDIO

ROYAL

GUILEFUL

MRS.

EMINENT

BAKSHEESH

DIABOLIC

READY LADY

PIZZA

ALBAHR

FIRST

DEGREE OF

HEAT

GRAFTON

DRIPPING

SOUPER

LUCKMAN

READY FOR

6>1

PPOT

4>2

6>2

3>3

951

3»>1

251

3>1

7>1

6>2

8>1

6>3

2>1

4>1

3>2

6>2

S>S,D>t

LAST DS
SSR,T>T

SR, t>T

SSR,T>T

SSR,T>T

S>R,T>T

S>R,D>T

S>R,D>T

S>R,T>T

S>R,T>T

RO>R,t>T

LAST DS
R>R,T>T

S>R,T>T

S>R,T>T

S>R,D>T

S>R,D>T

R>R,t>T

S>R,D>T

S>R,D>T

S>R,D>T

(2.75).BTL HORSE Class Change 35
Finished 2 from post 3 TJIW= 55
Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
6-hole.BTL HORSE 1st off 36 day
layoff.Class Change 35 Finished 1 from
post 6 TIW= 64

NOTES FROM LAST RACE

BTL HORSE 1st off 43 day layoff.Class
Change 10 Finished 2 from post @ TIW= 25
Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
4-hole.BTL HORSE Clear early.Class
Change 40 Finished 1 from post 4 TIW= 65
Made big overall move (3).BTL HORSE
Class Change 5 Finished 2 from post 4
TIW= 63

Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
6-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed?
WATCH!BTL HORSE Clear early.Class Change
40 Finished 2 from post 6 TIW= 37

Made big overall move (3). *Stretch gain
(.25).BTL HORSE Class Change 5 Finished
3 from post 3 TIW= 65

Chased Pace. Made big overall move
(4).BTL HORSE 1st off 64 day
layoff.Class Change 80 Finished 1 from
post 9 TIW= 97

Made big overall move (10).BTL HORSE
Class Change 5 Finished 1 from post 3
TIW= 65

THIRD OFF Made big overall move (6).BTL
HORSE Class Change 5 Finished 1 from
post 2 TIW= 73

Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
3-hole.BTL HORSE Class Change 40
Finished 1 from post 3 TIW= 52

Made big overall move (6).BTL HORSE 1st
off 59 day layoff.Class Change 40
Finished 1 from post 7 TIW= 78

NOTES FROM LAST RACE

BTL HORSE Class Change 30 Finished 1
from post @ TIW= 25

Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
5-hole. Fast last race (15).BTL HORSE
Clear early.Class Change 5 Finished 1
from post 5 TIW= 72

Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
6-hole. *Stretch gain (.25).BTL HORSE 2
races in one pattern.Class Change 5
Finished 2 from post 6 TIW= 58

Flashed speed.BTL HORSE 1st off 35 day
layoff.Class Change 40 Finished 1 from
post 8 TIW= 51

1st off 113 day layoff.Class Change 45
Finished 3 from post 6 TIW= 65

Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
2-hole. Made big overall move (3).BTL
HORSE 1st off 43 day layoff.Class Change
40 Finished 1 from post 2 TIW= 81

BTL HORSE Class Change 40 Finished 1
from post 4 TIW= 73

Made big overall move (3). *Stretch gain
(2.25).BTL HORSE Class Change 40
Finished 2 from post 3 TIW= 62

Made big overall move (3). *Stretch gain
(2.5).BTL HORSE Class Change 40 Finished
2 from post 6 TIW= 40

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

87

ERR

ERR

ERR

80

ERR

ERR

ERR

2]

ERR

DS

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

87

ERR

ERR

ERR

80

ERR

ERR

ERR

0 78 2 92 81172

#TDS

AVG
SPD

79

76

80

89

76

83

82

87

81

78

53

80

79

77

77

#R S1 S2

85

91

84

84

83

84

89

60

96

85

86

78

84

80

82

97

94

96

87

99

96

96

86

89

95

85

87

86

83

184

155

4.30

SYS1

10.00

1.40

SYS2

3.00

CLOSE

0.88

1.25

1.67

2.00

2.50

ERR

TDS1

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

10.00

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR 93 97 74 79,76,0,0,0

TDS2 CLOSE P2F PAF PFN

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

7.00

ERR

ERR

2.00

ERR

ERR

ERR

100

88

88

84

9

82

82

85

83

101

98

84

86

100

83

81

81

86

91

83

79

83

88

82

80

94

85

78

82

70

93

79

92

90

87

97

83

89

74

73

58

7

v

81

8!

@

82

LAST FIVE
SPEED RATINGS

79,0,0,0,0

86,83,67,0,0

81,78,70,0,0

83,84,73,0,0

89,0,0,0,0

77,74,77,0,0

88,87,75,0,0

82,0,0,0,0

87,0,0,0,0

LAST FIVE
SPEED RATINGS

0,0,0,0,0

93,84,58,0,0

90,85,68,0,0

78,81,76,0,0

53,0,0,0,0

80,0,0,0,0

79,0,0,0,0

77,0,0,0,0

77,0,0,0,0

2] 36 78.0 P

BSAD DSLR AVG3

] 43
2] 28
0 29
] 22
] 29
[ 64
] 21
] 29
2] 22
87 59
BSAD DSLR
2] 30
2] 29
2] 29
2] 35
2] 113
80 43
2] 21
2] 21
2] 21

79.

76.

80.

89.

76.

83.

82.

87.

81.

78.

2]

2]

2]

4

]

4.00 186 WO

BRIS P EQUIP MLINE CLS

E/P

E/P

53.0 S

80.

79.

2]

]

E/P

77.0 S

77.0 S

4

4

BON

15.

15.

20.

10.

.00

00

00

.00

00

.00

00

.00

MLINE

15.

15.

20.

20.

.00

00

.00

00

00

00

196

198

6.0

N

TRK DIS TYPE CHNG

NKT 7.0
Wo 5.0
WO 6.5
Wo 7.0
WO 6.5
AP 5.0
WO 6.5
WO 6.5
WO 7.0
SAR 8.5
TRK DIS
SLB 8.0
WO 6.5
WO 6.5
Wo 6.0
BEL 5.0
SAR 8.5
Wo 7.e
Wo 7.0
Wo 7.0

Gl

Gl

Gl

Gl

G1

Gl

Gl

Gl

Gl

G1

Gl

Gl

G1

Gl

Gl

N>G1

S$>G1

N>G1

S$>G1

N>G1

N>G1

S$>G1

S$>G1

CHNG

N>G1

S$>G1

S>G1

S$>G1

S>G1

S$>G1

S$>G1

Rail;evened out late/

13.8 132 15.4 89.3 104.7 190 264 3W bid 1/4;clear str/

SPPNT

14.

18.

11.

11.

14

14.

19.

14.

6

6

6

.0

5

PWR CLASS FINAL

135

138

125

137

128

138

148

133

126

145

135

129

106

140

132

130

121

15.1

14.9

14.7

15.1

10.5

15.9

17.5

15.3

16.9

16.5

15.1

11.0

15.8

15.7

15.3

13.9

9e.

88.

89.

90.

88.

91.

90.

85.

91.

89.

88.

88.

89.

88.

89.

6

3

4

5

3

3

3

2

9

1

9

2]

comB

105.4

105.5

103.1

104.5

101.0

104.2

108.8

106.2

102.2

107.7

104.7

99.9

103.9

105.1

104.2

102.9

ERLY
PACE
TOTL

179

167

90

161

165

173

165

209

164

86

194

168

159

163

267

258

259

180

248

26,

N}

256

254

282

254

144

269

249

244

245

4-5w;rallied;hung late/

Spd;held driving/ /

Stalked;rail;gaining/
Dueled;passed;lost 2nd/
Vied;led;held;drvg
Led;repel duelr;caught/
Brk outwd;3-4w;evn out/
Left slowly;3-4w turn

Off slw;traffic str/

Dueled strjoutfinished/
Bit slw st;6p upr;gain
Outside bid5/16;3p;clr/

~

5P str;led 8th;widen/
Flew late widest str/
Jostled start;steadied
Bid upr str;rdn out/ Off
slw;ridden out/ 3wd bid;
duel; prevail

perfect trip;led 16th/ /

4w upper; good kick/ /

COMMENTS

Held sway;rdn out/
Dueled;clr str;rdn out/
Dueled;headed top str

Ducked out start;hung/
3p; led 1/4; drove clr/
Prs;4p trn; tight uppr
2-3w;rallied;up late/
Rallied;just missed/ Brk
in;rail-3w;rallied

5w turn;éw into lane/ /

Tracked ins; edged clr/ /

Bmp strt;led 16th;held/ /

Bid;bmp'd;outfinished/ /

3W;5P top strj;closed/ /
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DATE  TRK #

9/19/21 wo 11

DT PP

PRG

12

13

11

HORSE

COMBATIVE

SILENCE

EXECUTIVE

SOUPER

NASHTRICK

ICOMEFROMD

LAST

ARQUEBUS

EXPO

SPIRAL

LOADED

STAR

MR. DYDYK

FROSTY

BLAST IN

HULLABALOO

BUTTERED

IN ALL

ALPHA

TRUECREST

5>

%

12>3

3>

%

o
v
X

11>7

10>3

10>3

55!

©

LAST DS

S$>S,D>D

$5S,D>D

$>S5,T>D

$5S,D>D

$>S,D>D

$>S,D>D

$>S,D>D

LAST DS

S>R,t>D

S>R,t>D

R>R,D>D

R>R,D>D

S>R,T>D

S>R,D>D

R>R,t>D

R>R,D>D

S>R,D>D

R>R,T>D

S>R,D>D

R>R,D>D

S>R,D>D

NOTES FROM LAST RACE

Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
1-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed?
WATCH!BTL HORSE Clear early.lst off 45
day layoff.Class Change 20 Finished 3

from post 1 TIW= 68

THIRD OFF MAYBE? Made big overall move
(3). Class Change 55 Finished 3 from

post 7 TIW= 65

Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
9-hole.BTL HORSE Clear early.Class
Change 20 Finished 1 from post 9 TIW= 49
Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
5-hole. Made big overall move (3).BTL
HORSE 1st off 36 day layoff.Class Change
20 Finished 1 from post 5 TIW= 34

Made big overall move (9). 1st off 84
day layoff.Class Change 20 Finished 3

from post 12 TIW= 45

THIRD OFF MAYBE? Made big overall move
(4) .BTL HORSE Class Change 65 Finished 1

from post 3 TIW= 53

Flashed speed. Made big overall move
(3). *Stretch gain (1.75).BTL HORSE
Class Change 20 Finished 2 from post 6

TIW= 55

NOTES FROM LAST RACE

Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from

3-hole. Fast last race

(16).Uncharacteristic early speed?
WATCH!BTL HORSE Clear early.Invalid last
race. Finished 5 from post 3 TIW= 32
Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from

2-hole. *Stretch gain

(1) .Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH!
2 races in one pattern.Invalid last
race. Finished 8 from post 2 TIW= 56
Invalid last race. Finished 7 from post

11 TIW= 18

Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
6-hole.BTL HORSE Invalid last race.
Finished 5 from post 6 TIW= 26

Made big overall move (5). *Stretch gain
(.25).BTL HORSE Invalid last race.
Finished 3 from post 10 TJW= 56

1st off 35 day layoff.Invalid last race.
Finished 9 from post 3 TIW= 33

Class Change -50 Finished 7 from post 7

TIW= 72

*Stretch gain (1.75).BTL HORSE Invalid
last race. Finished 3 from post 10 TIW=

33

*Stretch gain (2.25). Invalid last race.
Finished 9 from post 5 TIW= 40

Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
2-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed?
WATCH! Class Change -49 Finished 7 from

post 2 TIW= 40

DROP SWITCH Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace
from 6-hole. 1st off 303 day
layoff.Class Change -50 Finished 3 from

post 6 TIW= 77

THIRD OFF Made big overall move (5).
*Stretch gain (3).BTL HORSE Invalid last
race. Finished 2 from post 4 TIW= 63
THIRD OFF MAYBE? *Stretch gain (4.5).
1st off 35 day layoff.Z pattern.Class
Change -50 Finished 7 from post 8 TIW=
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SPD
110

87

81

72

85

ERR

80

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

74

ERR

77

ERR

#110

SPD
DS

77

87

75

80

72

83

ERR

74

80

ERR

ERR

ERR

81

ERR

74

ERR

77

ERR

#TDS

AVG
SPD

79

72

69

71

79

69

36

67

81

65

72

78

76

70

#R S1 S2

81

90

89

83

78

79

83

92

72

79

80

83

68

90

77

81

82

61

84

82

91

96

84

83

82

95

78

81

88

82

55

75

92

88

TOT

162

168

168

Sys1

.50

.70

.80

.70

.60

.20

Sys1

.30

.60

.70

.70

.70

.80

.30

.50

.90

.70

SYS2  CLOSE

.30

.10

.40

.90

.20

.30

SYS2  CLOSE

10.

.50

.00

.60

.70

.10

.40

.90

.40

.30

TDS1

TDS1

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

TDS2 CLOSE P2F PAF PFN

TDS2 CLOSE

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

0.71

0.67

ERR

ERR

ERR

1.10

ERR

1.68

ERR

ERR

88

84

94

86

78

73

93

85

91

84

71

79

89

89

86

94

84

78

78

96

94

74

70

94

81

86

82

83

82

96

77

72

80

92

o

2

83

)

9

104

66

69

6

o

72

68

60

79

77

80

64

86

87

LAST FIVE
SPEED RATINGS

84,73,78,84,80

78,60,73,80,90

81,78,77,85,90

84,86,82,69,68

84,81,79,78,67

74,75,71,71,65

83,84,82,91,83

LAST FIVE
SPEED RATINGS

78,65,58,46,0

76,78,74,46,0

74,64,71,73,0

78,84,77,76,0

73,72,71,62,68

36,0,0,0,0

65,67,82,53,0

81,84,78,0,0

67,62,0,0,0

76,74,68,76,70

72,84,0,0,0

82,77,76,74,77

69,79,61,0,0

BSAD DSLR AVG3

84 45
% 16
9 15
84 36
84 84
76 30
91 21
BSAD DSLR
] 28
] 28
74 22
84 22
] 17
] 35
] 29
84 22
] 14
76 22
) 303
82 22
] 35

70.

79.

84.

81.

73.

2]

2]

2]

2]

2]

BRIS P EQUIP MLINE

E/P

83.0 S

76.

70.

80.

72.

71.

81.

65.

73.

78.

78.

70.

2]

E/P

NA

NA

E/P

P

10.

20.

00

.00

.00

.00

00

.80

60

EQUIP MLINE CLS

BON

BON

BON

15.

30.

12.

30.

10.

30.

12.

10.

00

00

.00

00

.00

00

.00

.50

00

44

45

45

28

61

TRK DIS
Wo 6.5
Wo 5.5
Wo 7.0
Wo 5.5
WO 6.0
WO 6.5
WO 6.5
TRK DIS
Wo 7.5
Wo 7.5
WO 8.5
WO 8.5
wo 7.
WO 6.0
Wo 8.0
WO 8.5
WO 6.0
WO 10.0
WO 6.5
WO 8.5
WO 6.0

TYPE

CHNG

A

CO>A

CO>A

CO>A

CA

CO>A

CHNG

MO>M

MO>M

S>M

MO>M

S>M

S>M

MO>M

S>M

15.

25.

20.

10.

14.

10.

10.

1.

2]

5

5

PWR

123

127

113

121

117

112

120

114

88

117

122

107

116

123

122

113

CLASS FINAL

15.4 88.8

13.9 88.8

15.0 92.0

15.8 90.5

10.4 89.5

13.6 88.9

15.8

CLASS FINAL

10.4 82.7

80.9

11.6 82.5

11.4 87.4

82.6

11.5 81.9

13.0 83.8

85.0

13.6 82.7

14.5 90.9

13.8 83.6

88.4

ERLY
PACE
COMB  TOTL

104.2 169

102.7

107.0

106.3 190

99.9 180

102.5 152

105.5 143

ERLY
PACE
COMB  TOTL

93.2 187

86.9 166

94.1 176

98.9 170

79.8 123

93.5 161

96.9 172

89.1 169

96.3 168

105.4 190

97.4 161

97.8 150

259

254

272

263

24

iy

247

253

235

242

242

191

221

251

246

248

254

247

237

COMMENTS

Dueled;weakened late/
Bmp;dueled 3w;gv way/
3-4w;no late kick

Brk outwd;rail;rallied/
Dueled;yielded top str/
Rail-3w;closed;no thrt
Stalk;bid str;led 8th/
Bmp start;duel;gv way/
3-4w;evn out late

3-5w;up late;drvg/ Bmp
start;determinedly/ Bmp
start;all out str

7w top strj;rallied/
Steadied start; 2-3wd/ 3p
turn;6p upr; mild

4w;by late;driving/
4-5w;rallied outside/
3-4W;6P str closing

Off slw;4-3w;rallied/
Rail-3w;rallied;missed/
3w;closed a gap

COMMENTS

Led;gave way deep str/
Gave way grdgngly late/
Headed far turn;evenly

Forced pace;evn out/ Bmp
start;2-3w;evn out/
Dueled;headed 1/8

3-4w;chased stretch/ Hut
fence upper str/ Steadied
repeatedly

Staked; forced;evn out/
Pressed;chased;evenly/
Saved ground;gamely
2-4w;traffic;all out/ Tip
top str;inching up/ Mid
pak;4w;even finish

Broke out;brush;no bid/ /

Off slw;3-4w;no threat/
Hop start;4w;fltnd out/
Stalked 3wj;chased str
Closed well late/ 4w;ev
out deep stretch/ Came
in;bmp 16th out

Pinched back at turn/
Pinched back start/

Led top str;passed/
Bobbled start;rallied/
Circle 3-5W;fade 8th

Chased;no late kick/
Stalk;rail-2w;rallied/

2-3w;gained steadily/
Pinched back start/ 2wd
turns; no factor

2-4W turn;mild run/ Off
slw;allout;gaining/
Closed belatedly



