DATE  TRK #

11/7/21 BEL 1

DATE  TRK #

DIAMOND
HATARI

LONGRIDG
IRONIC
My Joy
FOR THE
HARD
OAKHURST
EVER

S>R
S>R
R>R
S>R
O>R
O>R
O>R

MOVING?

F/PP/UN?/Y(6>3) Class Change ©

BOM:4/SG:.75/2 in 1/N(11>6) Class

Change ©

F/PP/Y(7>4) Class Change ©
SG:4/N(2>9) Class Change ©
N(2>12) Class Change ©
N(7>8) Class Change ©
Y(0>0)

Y(0>0)

Y(050)

MOVING?

AVG

74

73
64
58

ERR
ERR
ERR

ERR
ERR

ERR
ERR
ERR
ERR

OCOOORrROO

ASP
110

ERR
ERR

ERR
ERR
ERR
ERR

RD SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDS1 TDS2 CLOSE

TDS2

ERR
ERR

ERR
ERR
ERR
ERR

CLOSE

BROT1 P2F P4F LST

86
87
82
46

Last

236
227
179
210

DSLR

36
15
29

50
Hok Kok

Fkokok
Fokskok

236
227
221
210

LAST FIVE

78,80,0,0,0
74,0,0,0,0

LAST FIVE FIGS

FIGS

TIW%

180
14
86

133

140

156

147

TIW%

181
181
181
181
ERR
ERR
ERR

COMMENT

Bumped 5w 1/4; kept on
3-4w pursuit; no kick

2path turn;no kick
4w upper; no impact
Brush gate; steady st
4-5wide turn;faltered

COMMENT

BEST
OVERAL

BEST
OVERAL

BEST
LAST

695
638
582
555
ERR
ERR
ERR

TOTALS

TOTALS

11/7/21 BEL 2

DATE  TRK #

AFILADA

BELLE
TAP THE
MARYSVAL
KHULUQ

S>R

R>R
o>R
o>R
o>R

™D
>D
>D
>D

BOM:4/N(2>3) Class Change -45

F/PP/UN?/Y(3>5) Class Change @
BTL/BOM:3/SG:2.5/N(7>4) Class

Change 40

N(1>11) Class Change ©

Y(050)

Y(050)

Y(050)

MOVING?

64
ERR
ERR
ERR

OO ON

ERR
ERR
ERR
ERR

[SECRGIN)

ERR
ERR
ERR
ERR

(SOOI

ERR
ERR
ERR
ERR

ERR
ERR
ERR
ERR

ERR
ERR
ERR
ERR

29

Fokskok
Fokskok
sokskok

[ RN )

LAST FIVE FIGS

TIW%

184
ERR
ERR
ERR

Bobbled st; steady 3/8
Ins turn;mvd out 3/16
Chased 5w; belatedly

Carry in st; no impact

COMMENT

575
ERR
ERR
ERR

BEST
OVERAL

842
ERR
ERR
ERR

TOTALS

11/7/21 BEL 3

DATE  TRK #

DT PP PRG
8.5 2 2
8.5 8 8
8.5 7 7
8.5 1 1
8.5 6 6
8.5 5 5
8.5 3 3
8.5 9 9
8.5 4 4
DT PP PRG
8.6 5 5
8.0 6 6
8.0 4 4
8.0 7 7
8.0 1 1
8.0 3 3
8.0 2 2
DT PP PRG
9.6 9 9
9.6 1 1
9.6 8 8
9.6 2 2
9.6 6 6
9.6 4 4
9.6 7 7
9.6 5 5
9.6 3 3
DT PP PRG

0 4 4
12,6 1 1
2.6 5 5
2.6 2 2
12.6 6 6
12.6 3 3
12.6 7 7

CONVICTI
CAROM

JOURNEYM
HIEROGLY
CRYPTO
CURRENT
ATTENTIV
OUTRAGEO

ARTEMUS

ALWAYS

ORGLANDE
BEAUTIFU
LOVELY
GO BIG
CANDY
HUNGRY

R>R
R>R

R>R
R>R
R>R
R>R
R>R
R>R

R>R

R>R
R>R
R>R
R>R
R>R
R>R

tt
>t
tt
™t
>t
>t

tt

©T

F/PP/WATCH/Y(2>7) Class Change -60
F/PP/SP-14/UN?/Y(3>11) Class Change

-60
F/PP/Y(1>4) Class Change -55
CP/BOM:5/Y(5>1) Class Change ©

BTL/SG:2.5/N(2>6) Class Change 15

BOM:5/Y(7>1) Class Change -5
BOM:3/N(3>5) Class Change -55
BTL/BOM:6/SG:1.75/Y(3>2) Class
Change ©

SG:.5/2 in 1/N(3>4) Class Change 15

MOVING?

F/PP/WATCH/ESP/Y(2>3) Class Change

5

BOM:5/SG:.5/N(4>2) Class Change 5

SG:.5/N(6>5) Class Change 5
F/Y(1>7) Class Change 5
F/PP/BTL/Y(11>3) Class Change ©

F/PP/BTL/ESP/Y(6>3) Class Change 70

N(4>4) Class Change 10

87
87
86
85
84
83

81

10

87

92
ERR
92
89
93
94

SYs1

3.8 1.7
5.0 1.7
4.4 1.3
7.5 1.2
10.0 1.0
10.0 0.8
ERR  ERR
ERR  ERR
ERR  ERR
SYS2 CLOSE
3.2 2.5
7.6 1.1
5.0 1.3
8.2 1.2
ERR  ERR
ERR  ERR
ERR  ERR
SYS2 CLOSE
5.2 1.0
4.9 0.7
5.7 0.9
3.8 1.2
5.3 1.3
5.4 1.4
4.2 1.7
3.8 1.7
6.4 1.3
SYS2 CLOSE
3.8 1.1
4.1 1.8
3.7 2.0
5.4 0.9
4.0 1.8
4.3 0.5
5.3 1.7

AP OOO WO

(o)}
w

TDS2

NO® UG N

CLOSE

NuUuNuouwoeo o

91
82
74
72
71
81

73

68
92
96
94
92
95

90

271
254
245
233
244
253

229

249
231

43
31
168
42
17
31

22

391
336
318
300
325
331

306

327
305

POWER MLINE
127.9 2.50
127.2  8.00
124.1 3.00
109.3 30.00
101.9 20.00
94.0 10.00
8.00
6.00
4.00
POWER MLINE
128.4 0.80
117.5 12.00
113.4 10.00
109.8 30.00
3.50
8.00
4.50
POWER MLINE
134.3 4.50
126.6 4.00
138.7 3.50
139.4 5.00
132.7 12.00
132.2 12.00
144.4 4.50
137.3 6.00
133.9 30.00
POWER MLINE
150.8 3.00
156.9 2.50
154.3 6.00
152.4 12.00
150.8 3.00
140.5 12.00
143.8 4.00

82,82,94,90, 89
75,83,92,82,85

96,78,88,88,92
85,87,89,91,80
84,83,85,88,88
78,86,84,88,87
86,86,96,85, 81
85,90,91,82,85

83,80,79,81,84

LAST FIVE FIGS

90, 84,86,88,96

91,92,81,84,92
88,89,89,86,95
88,95,83,92,94
84,92,86,89,90
80,90,77,67,88
88,80,94,90,79

161
150

83

TIW%

190
173
185
188
156
144

169

204
200
187
198

Pace; faded final furl
Pace 1/2; folded up

Ins-2path;3pl/4;tired
4w upper; held on
3-4w;angled out 3/16
3-5wd trip;grind;drvg
5w uppr; by tired foes
Chased 3-2w; missed

3w 2nd turn;4wl/4

COMMENT
Ins;headed3/16;lost2nd

Jstld after brk;tkn up
2-3w turns;mvd out3/16
Keen;rated ins;empty
Inside;no closing kick
Frctious gate;brk thru
4w uppr; improved

279
285
279
272
282
278

269

BEST
OVERAL

363

356
361
348
346

491
492
491
541
736
737

764
732
736
711
748
724

714

TOTALS

854
855
846
902
1084
1083



DATE  TRK #

11/7/21 BEL 5

DATE  TRK #

CITIZEN
UNBRIDLE

TORPEDO
R BOY
NABOKOV
AUTHORIZ
BEYOND
GUNTON

S>R
R>R

S>R
R>R
O>R
O>R
O>R
O>R

MOVING?

N(4>4) Class Change 0
BOM:4/SG:.5/2 in 1/N(5>4) Class
Change ©

N(8>8) Class Change -5
F/SP-27/UN?/Y(9>9) Class Change ©
Y(8>0)

Y(0>0)

Y(0>0)

Y(0>0)

MOVING?

56
47
ERR
ERR
ERR
ERR

ERR

20
ERR
ERR
ERR
ERR

ERR

20
ERR
ERR
ERR
ERR

SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDS1 TDS2 CLOSE

8.9
8.8
ERR
ERR
ERR
ERR

ERR
ERR

CLOSE

ERR
ERR

ERR
10.0
ERR
ERR
ERR
ERR

ERR

ERR
ERR
ERR
ERR

BROT1 P2F P4F LST

96
87

100
86

DSLR

62

Fokskok
Fkokok
Fkokok
Fkokok

POWER MLINE
111.6 6.00
114.8 10.00
113.2 12.00
99.3 50.00
3.00
4.50
2.50
3.50

LAST FIVE FIGS

71,0,0,0,0
75,73,59,0,0

LAST FIVE FIGS

103

165
140
166
147

187
171
ERR
ERR
ERR
ERR

COMMENT

2p turn;mvd out 3/16
2p turn;3pl/4;mvd out

Sw pursuit; tired
Stopped;eased;wlkd off

COMMENT

BEST
OVERAL

616
536
ERR
ERR
ERR
ERR

BEST
OVERAL

BEST
LAST

TOTALS

TOTALS

11/7/21 BEL 6

DATE  TRK #

SPLIT
JUBILEE
EXCEPT

RED HOT
BEAUTIFU
SUFFICE
MOZAY

INVESTME

R>R
R>R

R>R
S>R
O>R
O>R
O>R

ot

>t
>t
>t
>t
>t

F/PP/BTL/Y(3>3) Class Change ©
CP/BTL/Y(8>3) Class Change ©

N(3>7) Class Change 10
BM1:5.5/SG:1.5/SP+13/2 in 1/N(2>4)
Class Change ©

BTL/SG:2.75/Y(7>2) Class Change 25
CP/BTL/BM1:4/Y(6>3) Class Change 15
Y(0>0)

Y(0>0)

Y(0>0)

MOVING?

73
69
ERR
ERR
ERR

73
ERR
ERR
ERR
ERR

73
ERR
ERR
ERR
ERR

CLOSE

TDS2

37
21

sokskok
Fkkk
Fkkk

POWER MLINE
130.6 6.00
140.1 3.00
112.6 12.00
115.8 12.00
119.5 5.00
107.7 15.00
5.00
8.00
3.50

84,84,78,87,83
84,83,83,87,61
81,76,0,0,0

88,76,71,75,76

LAST FIVE FIGS

142

99
147
106
180

168
172
ERR
ERR
ERR

Ins-2p;led past 1/16

2-3w trn;chsd;outkickd
Ins;tipd out;no rally
Chased ins; mild kick

Game finish outside
4wd;steadied 3/16

COMMENT

405
394
ERR
ERR
ERR

BEST
OVERAL

609
609
ERR
ERR
ERR

TOTALS

11/7/21 BEL 7

DT PP PRG
8.0 6 6
8.0 1 1
8.0 3 3
8.0 8 8
8.0 2 2
8.0 5 5
8.0 4 4
8.0 7 7
DT PP PRG
8.5 2 2
8.5 1 1
8.5 3 3
8.5 4 4
8.5 9 9
8.5 5 5
8.5 6 6
8.5 7 7
8.5 8 8
DT PP PRG
8.0 4 4
8.0 5 5
8.0 1 1
8.0 6 6
8.0 3 3
8.0 7 7
8.0 8 8
8.0 2 2
8.0 9 9

GRUMPS

TWISTED
HEAVY
DARK
COUNTER
HAMMERIN
AMERICAN
FOREVER

R>R
R>R
R>R
R>R
R>R
R>R
S>R

D>D
D>D
D>D
D>D
D>D
D>D
D>D

F/PP/BTL/WATCH/ESP/Y(6>2) Class
Change 5

BOM:3/SG:1.25/N(6>4) Class Change
-5

F/SP-16/Y(6>7) Class Change -15
CP/Y(8>3) Class Change 5

N(2>6) Class Change -15
CP/Y(4>7) Class Change 5
F/PP/Y(1>1) Class Change 15
SP-16/N(7>9) Class Change 5
N(10>8) Class Change 25

10

10
10
10
10

10
10

85

81
87
82
86
86
77
72

wvi

0N W~ U

~N
wv

ONPDPNOPN
P OOR MNP

(o)}
N

NNPhPOO U
NOWNR A~

RPRRRRRR
CORRRLRRLW

NNPPOoO A
o PS~DBAND

V]
~N

NNPAPOPU
BPOR R AN

RPRRPRRERRRR
RORWRRE A

.33
.76
.74
.40

.34
.28

63
77
69
74
86
61
66

221
249
224
239
257
190
234

35
29
35
29
17
105
10

301
341
307
328
347
247
234

POWER MLINE

129.6 2.00
125.0 8.00
126.8 10.00
124.4 6.00
122.6 5.00
123.2 6.00
122.4 3.50
113.2 30.00
111.4 30.00

89,82,79,91,82
87,84,87,85,91

69,76,77,93,95
84,90,65,79,87
75,89,82,83,87
81,95,77,86,81
89,81,68,75,68
57,70,73,76,77
68,62,56,80,75

129
41
125
75
141
141
23

192
134
169
153
127
151
178

2p-ins turn;headed3/16
3-4w uppr; by tired

Outside;5w trn;falterd
3-4w turn;bidl/4;wknd
Off slw;2-3w trn;4wl/4
3-4wide turn;empty

Ins trn;wait 5/16-3/16
Chased 4w; eased

Lost action badly 1/8

288

284
279
282
281
281
253
259

419
466
435
459
484
356
413

764

704
745
717
740
765
609
671



AVG ASP ASP BEST  BEST

DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE DST SURF MOVING? SPD R# TDS RT 110 RD SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDS1 TDS2 CLOSE BROT1 P2F P4F LST Last DSLR BTOT POWER MLINE LAST FIVE FIGS TIW% CLS COMMENT OVERAL LAST TOTALS
11/7/21 BEL 8 7.0 8 8 COST S>S D>T F/PP/BTL/ESP/Y(7>2) Class Change © 89 10 ERR © ERR © 3.0 3.6 ©.8 ERR ERR ERR 58.12 94 103 91 288 37 288 146.3 2.00 98,94,92,84,92 180 198 3-2p turn;duel;jostled 216 365 582
7.0 7 7 GUILDSMA S>S t>T F/PP/BTL/WATCH/Y(5>6) Class Change 87 10 88 8 9 1 8.2 5.9 1.4 8.1 6.1 1.358.85 98 95 86 279 36 279 140.8 4.50 87,94,75,93,88 137 217 Prompted 3-2w; wkn lte 213 347 560
-10
7.0 9 9 ARTEMUS S>S t>T BTL/SG:1/Y(8>3) Class Change © 86 10 8 6 8 1 4.3 3.6 1.2 4.2 4.0 1.156.51 85 94 89 268 29 268 142.7 5.00 89,88,81,86,84 125 192 6w upper; just missed 216 332 547
7.6 2 2 DURESS S>S t>T CP/BTL/Y(6>5) Class Change © 86 10 86 9 8 1 5.8 4.1 1.4 5.8 3.9 1.557.24 89 97 85 271 29 271 135.6 10.00 88,81,71,87,87 85 203 5w uppr; outfinished 211 347 558
7.0 11 11 TURN OF S>S T>T F/PP/WATCH/ESP/Y(6>1) Class Change 8510 9 3 99 3 2.7 3.3 0.8 2.6 1.5 1.856.29 86 84 101 271 15 271 142.1 5.00 92,88,85,85,89 160 172 Ins turn;kicked clear 213 337 551
0
7.0 4 4 HOLIDAY S>S T>T N(5>8) Class Change © 8510 8 7 97 1 5.4 6.5 0.8 6.0 5.5 1.157.74 84 83 87 254 16 254 133.2 10.00 77,92,95,90,86 144 211 4-5wd turn; no factor 208 323 530
7.0 1 1 BUY LAND S>S t>T SG:1.25/N(3>7) Class Change -10 85 7 8 5 87 2 5.3 3.4 1.6 4.9 3.7 1.357.32 94 89 92 275 36 275 143.5 4.00 87,84,84,87,91 136 202 4w upper; no response 212 347 559
7.0 12 12 BIG S>S t>T BTL/BM1:3.75/SG:.25/N(4>6) Class 8310 8 8 91 2 8.5 3.9 2.2 8.6 2.8 3.155.91 77 92 86 255 29 255 140.9 6.00 84,85,89,88,91 108 206 Chased 2p; no rally 214 341 555
Change ©
7.0 6 6 FOREVER R>S T>T CP/BTL/Y(2>6) Class Change 55 8210 87 2 8 2 7.9 6.7 1.2 8.6 5.0 1.7 55.32 84 81 82 247 31 329 130.8 15.00 79,79,82,85,85 167 187 2w 1/4p; empty 201 330 531
7.0 10 10 CHOCOLAT S>S t>T BM1:3.5/SP-60/N(7>8) Class Change © 82 10 22 1 ERR © 5.8 3.7 1.6 10.90 10.0 1.0 55.67 77 91 12 180 29 180 108.4 10.00 22,93,95,92,94 125 199 Stumble 3/16; walk off 193 219 411
7.0 3 3 ALCOOLS S>S D>T F/PP/SP+13/WATCH/ESP/Y(1>1) Class 81 9 ERR @ ERR © 3.6 5.0 0.7 ERR ERR ERR 60.08 103 109 80 292 52 292 131.4 30.00 94,81,93,79,82 104 153 In hand 2p; held game 204 362 566
Change 55
7.0 5 5 BALLYDOO S>S t>T F/PP/SP+14/WATCH/ESP/Y(8>1) Class 73 8 77 5 8 1 2.2 4.6 0.5 2.2 3.0 0.757.52 93 96 85 274 38 274 129.8 15.00 87,82,85,74,78 117 160 Ins trnj;askl/4;respond 199 351 549
Change ©
AVG ASP ASP BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE DST SURF MOVING? SPD R# TDS RT 110 RD SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDS1 TDS2 CLOSE BROT1 P2F P4F LST Last DSLR BTOT POWER MLINE LAST FIVE FIGS TIW% CLS COMMENT OVERAL LAST TOTALS
11/7/21 BEL 9 8.0 1 1 ROCKEFEL R>R D>D F/PP/Y(6>4) Class Change -10 91 2 92 1 92 1 1.9 3.1 0.6 2.9 5.7 0.555.74 89 99 76 264 37 371 140.9 1.40 92,89,0,0,0 220 200 Bid outside; weakened 429 672 1100
8.0 3 3 SPEAKING S>R D>D F/PP/ESP/Y(8>1) Class Change -5 99 2 ERR @ ERR © 1.9 1.3 1.5 ERR ERR ERR 59.22 94 94 90 278 42 278 133.0 3.50 90,90,0,0,0 61 197 Pulled away in hand 436 703 1139
8.0 2 2 JUDGE R>R D>D F/PP/Y(6>1) Class Change 35 85 2 8 1 87 1 3.1 3.1 1.0 3.8 1.3 3.056.21 89 89 85 263 44 351 127.7 3.00 87,82,0,0,0 165 185 5-4w turn;lead 3/16 410 674 1085
8.0 6 6 CAIRAMA S>R D>D F/PP/ESP/Y(1>1) Class Change 35 82 1ERR ©@ERR © 1.3 1.3 1.0 ERR ERR ERR 57.39 91 95 78 264 51 264 125.4 10.00 82,0,0,0,0 144 182 In hand 2p; held on 409 665 1074
8.0 5 5 COOKE R>R D>D CP/BOM:3/BM1:3.25/Y(3>1) Class 82 2 79 1 79 1 4.7 1.2 4.0 3.0 1.0 3.053.10 73 61 92 226 22 297 120.3 8.00 79,84,0,0,0 87 175 Stalked; 4w; driving 401 619 1021
Change 20
8.0 4 4 MIDNIGHT S>R t>D CP/BTL/Y(2>4) Class Change © 81 3 8 1 8 1 3.2 3.2 1.0 1.4 4.3 0.358.18 93101 72 266 28 266 130.3 4.50 80,83,81,0,0 166 209 Chased ins; kept on 415 667 1082
AVG ASP ASP BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE DST SURF MOVING? SPD R# TDS RT 110 RD SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDS1 TDS2 CLOSE BROT1 P2F P4F LST Last DSLR BTOT POWER MLINE LAST FIVE FIGS TIW% CLS COMMENT OVERAL LAST TOTALS
11/7/21 BEL 1@ 8.5 6 6 PARATUS R>R t>t BTL/SG:2/Y(5>4) Class Change © 84 1 8 1 8 1 6.3 5.0 1.3 6.3 5.0 1.353.01 85 86 76 247 45 339 120.0 5.00 84,0,0,0,0 106 182 Bumped st; missed 261 408 669
8.5 3 3 MISBEHAV R>R D>t BOM:4/SG:.5/2 in 1/N(2>3) Class 82 2 ERR O ERR © 5.6 4.4 1.3 ERR ERR ERR 55.67 83 83 84 250 44 334 131.0 3.50 84,79,0,0,0 166 185 6-4w turn;5w into lane 260 408 668
Change ©
8.5 5 5 STREET R>R t>t BTL/SG:.75/Y(1>5) Class Change © 80 2 8 2 8 2 7.5 4.4 1.7 7.5 4.4 1.7 53.33 87 89 73 249 45 344 133.4 4.50 84,75,0,0,0 156 185 Inside; outfinished 260 412 672
8.5 4 4 CITY AT R>R T>t N(4>6) Class Change -40 77 2 77 2 77 2 5.3 4.2 1.3 5.3 4.2 1.354.60 86 92 70 248 36 331 128.2 8.00 75,79,0,0,0 125 205 Swd far turn;no bid 253 388 641
8.5 1 1 FLIP THE R>R t>t F/PP/BTL/SG:.5/WATCH/Y(7>6) Class 76 3 78 2 78 2 4.3 6.7 0.6 3.8 6.9 0.553.66 89 92 69 250 45 348 120.0 10.00 83,73,73,0,0 85 184 2p in aim; outfinished 248 408 656
Change ©
8.5 9 9 NYQUEST R>R T>t F/PP/ESP/Y(5>3) Class Change © 76 3 76 3 76 3 2.6 3.7 0.7 2.6 3.7 0.7 55.50 9% 88 70 248 28 335 125.7 8.e0 75,77,77,0,0 126 185 Led 1/4 to near 1/16p 252 400 653
8.5 11 11 RUTHENIA R>R T>t BOM:4/BM1:4/N(7>5) Class Change © 73 1 73 1 73 110.06 5.6 1.8 10.0 5.6 1.8 54.390 75 72 76 223 28 299 121.8 10.00 73,0,0,0,0 140 182 Lunge; steadied start 247 386 633
8.5 10 10 DREAM OF R>R T>t F/PP/BTL/BOM:3/SG:.37/Y(3>2) Class 72 2 72 2 72 2 5.3 4.7 1.1 5.3 4.7 1.153.60 83 70 88 241 35 304 114.4 30.00 75,68,0,0,0 100 165 4w 1/4;led late;nailed 242 393 634
Change 40
8.5 7 7 SMOKIN' S>R T>t SP+12/Y(1>3) Class Change © 70 2 ERR @ ERR © 7.3 6.0 1.2 ERR ERR ERR 54.43 83 88 83 254 50 254 115.9 12.00 82,57,0,0,0 133 172 3w upper; improved 241 409 650
8.5 2 2 INFLATIO R>R T>t BOM:5/Y(4>3) Class Change 25 67 1 67 1 67 1 8.9 3.3 2.7 8.9 3.3 2.753.76 76 67 83 226 30 282 117.0 15.00 67,0,0,0,0 142 157 Swung wide; rallied 236 361 597
8.5 8 8 RIDLEY'S @>R >t  Y(0>0) ERR © ERR @ ERR © ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR Q@ krkk 0 6.00 0,0,0,0,0 179 ERR ERR ERR ERR
AVG ASP ASP BEST  BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE DST SURF MOVING? SPD R# TDS RT 110 RD SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDS1 TDS2 CLOSE BROT1 P2F P4F LST Last DSLR BTOT POWER MLINE LAST FIVE FIGS TIW% CLS COMMENT OVERAL LAST TOTALS
11/7/21 CD 1 6.0 4 4 WILD WES S>S D>D SP-12/N(5>9) Class Change -30 8310 8 7 8 6 5.6 6.2 0.9 5.8 5.6 1.057.34 91 88 73 252 29 252 122.1 1.60 71,85,79,80,73 98 184 3p turn; no response 528 787 1315
6.0 5 5 ULTIMATE S>S D>D BOM:4/Y(1>2) Class Change © 79 9 79 9 79 4 6.6 4.4 1.5 6.6 4.4 1.555.63 82 85 9@ 257 42 257 119.9 1.00 85,69,86,80,80 145 176 Bid; no gain on winner 520 856 1376
6.0 3 3 TOOBADSO S>S D>D BOM:4/N(6>2) Class Change © 7310 73 8 75 7 7.0 6.6 1.1 7.1 6.5 1.156.34 83 87 72 242 21 242 113.7 4.50 71,78,80,73,56 73 159 Moved up; up for place 494 788 1282
6.0 1 1 YES SIR S>S D>D N(4>6) Class Change -23 68 9 67 8 68 7 6.4 6.3 1.0 6.0 6.4 ©0.958.23 83 81 67 231 177 231 109.4 10.00 60,79,82,57,63 56 153 Slow st;4w turn;outrun 479 739 1218
6.0 2 2 AIRWAR S>S D>D F/SP+14/Y(1>4) Class Change -10 67 8 66 6 63 5 6.1 5.2 1.2 7.0 6.3 1.155.56 85 86 88 259 15 259 111.3 10.00 81,64,60,74,71 71 136 2p upper; flattened 479 829 1308



DATE

11/7/21

DATE

TRK #

cb

TRK #

CHAMPAGN
JUSTASTA
HANNAH'S

S>R
S>R
R>R

D>D
D>D
D>D

MOVING? SPD
BOM:4/Y(8>3) Class Change © 71
CP/Y(6>4) Class Change -10 67
SG:.75/2 in 1/N(2>10) Class Change 67
-10
N(5>10) Class Change -10 63
Y(3>6) Class Change -20 60

F/SP-27/UN?/Y(5>8) Class Change -20 37

ERR
ERR
33

110

ERR
ERR
33

RD SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDS1 TDS2 CLOSE

T

ERR
ERR
8.4

DS2

ERR
ERR
0.8

CLOSE

BROT1 P2F P4F LST Last DSLR

54.
57.
54.

230
229
172

23
37
35

230
229
232

POWER MLINE

119.5 1.60
110.4 2.00
108.4 6.00
111.4 6.00
111.06 6.00
99.5 10.00

LAST FIVE FIGS

70,66,78,0,
66,69,66,0,
68,63,65,70,0
63,0,0,0,0

60,60,0,0,0
10,56,45,0,0

LAST FIVE FIGS

TIW%

170
80
134

TIW%

176
186
169

COMMENT

Bid str;bmpd;bothered
2p trns; bid 1/4; wknd
Unprepared at start

Outrun

Bmpd;steadied start
Wknd 3/8;stopped;eased

COMMENT

BEST
OVERAL

427
421
329

BEST
OVERAL

BEST
LAST TOTALS

11/7/21

DATE

TRK #

SUN
SINGSONG
JOPLIN
KITTY'S

138
13
11

83,85,79,84,83
62,76,74,74,82
64,83,80,56,85
80,87,83,68,67
69,74,73,73,75
57,77,69,66,66

LAST FIVE FIGS

TIW%

Bmpd st;ins trip;got3d
Ran evenly

Rail speed 1/2 wknd
Wore down rivals;
Never far back; no bid
Bumped st; no factor

COMMENT

BEST
OVERAL

11/7/21

DATE

< 4

TRK #

SHELL
APART OF
SUPER

57.

87,81,71,0,0
69,82,83,71,63
67,70,75,0,0
68,80,83,73,74
64,0,76,74,74
63,64,67,40,0

LAST FIVE FIGS

TIW%

3w 1/4; no late gain
Ins winner;weakened
Ins pair;no match 1/4
3wd;4p2nd;no impacct
Duel ins pair;faded3/8
Ins upper; no match

COMMENT

BEST
OVERAL

11/7/21

b

DT PP PRG
8.5 1 1
8.5 3 3
8.5 2 2
8.5 6 6
8.5 4 4
8.5 5 5
DT PP PRG
8.5 6 6
8.5 1 1
8.5 3 3
8.5 4 4
8.5 5 5
8.5 2 2
DT PP PRG
6.0 2 2
6.0 6 6
6.0 3 3
6.0 1 1
6.6 5 5
6.0 4 4
DT PP PRG
8.0 5 5
8.0 8 8
8.0 7 7
8.0 4 4
8.0 6 6
8.0 3 3
8.0 1 1
8.0 2 2

PROMPT

I WILL
BLUERIDG
STAY
MOROCCO
FUTILE
CAN'TBET
JAMMERS

R>R
S>R
S>R
S>R
S>R
R>R

D>D

D>D

AVG

MOVING? SPD

BM1:3/N(3>3) Class Change 10 80
SP-13/N(2>5) Class Change 20 75
F/PP/UN?/Y(5>6) Class Change 10 72
BOM:3/Y(4>1) Class Change 25 72
N(3>4) Class Change © 70
N(5>10) Class Change © 67
AVG

MOVING? SPD

F/PP/Y(2>2) Class Change 10 80
F/PP/WATCH/Y(11>8) Class Change -35 74
F/PP/WATCH/Y(8>6) Class Change -25 71
N(8>6) Class Change -10 69
F/UN?/Y(1>7) Class Change -35 66
F/PP/WATCH/Y(4>2) Class Change @ 59
AVG

MOVING? SPD
F/PP/UN?/Y(5>4) Class Change -30 88
N(5>4) Class Change -45 83
BOM:3/N(7>4) Class Change -10 83
BTL/SG:3.5/N(5>5) Class Change -29 82
F/SP-29/Y(5>7) Class Change -55 81
BOM:4/Y(5>2) Class Change -35 81
N(3>4) Class Change 5 76
F/PP/SP-17/UN?/Y(5>7) Class Change 75

-10

10

10

6.4 6.8 0.9 ERR
7.2 5.6 1.3 6.7
7.8 6.0 1.3 ERR
10.0 10.0 1.0 ERR
7.3 6.8 1.1 ERR
7.6 7.9 1.0 6.8
SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDS1
5.2 3.1 1.7 5.2
7.2 4.7 1.5 6.8
3.6 4.8 0.8 4.3
6.3 4.0 1.6 6.6
5.7 4.2 1.3 5.3
4.2 6.6 0.6 1.7
SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDS1
3.8 3.5 1.1 3.8
2.3 4.8 0.5 2.6
4.8 6.6 0.7 3.0
4.4 7.4 0.6 6.0
5.4 5.8 0.9 5.2
3.6 6.4 0.6 3.1
SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDS1
7.4 49 1.5 7.4
3.4 3.8 0.9 3.1
6.0 3.5 1.7 6.0
6.6 4.1 1.6 5.9
5.4 5.3 1.0 ERR
7.3 4.1 1.8 8.0
4.3 4.8 0.9 4.1
5.0 6.5 0.8 5.0

=
OO MmMmWWwWWwWLh

X
=

hoo

@@@gl—‘l—‘@l—l
-

a0 00

POWER MLINE

127.1  1.20
111.1  4.50
115.6 5.00
119.8 2.00
111.4 8.00
109.5 15.00
POWER MLINE

120.3 1.60
117.6  2.00
114.3 12.00
116.2 2.50
114.7 8.00
109.7 12.00
POWER MLINE

120.6 3.50
123.6 3.00
123.3 4.00
111.9 15.00
120.6 6.00
123.4 3.50
115.1 15.00
116.3 8.00

86,86,82,89,78
82,88,84,92,88
80,75,92,87,82
80,82,78,85,82
52,77,86,77,84
87,78,79,80,76
74,75,-16,75,78
58,69,41,90, 90

173
144
136
160

Stalk ins;outpaced upr
2path turns;missed 3rd
Moved up; vanned off
Trailed throughout
Chase 3w;faltered 5/16
Ins;chasd;bid;no match
Came5w; needed bid

Led 2p;gv way far turn

751 1210
698 1131
706 1138
705 1132
703 1124
438 766

BEST

LAST TOTALS
721 1171
626 1045
639 1051
735 1158
662 1068
617 1008

BEST

LAST TOTALS
754 1208
676 1106
661 1077
648 1062
629 1030
632 1016

BEST

LAST TOTALS
530 856
516 834
508 826
522 837
434 745
555 875
500 798
436 729



DATE

11/7/21

DATE

11/7/21

DATE

11/7/21

TRK #

cb

TRK #

cb

TRK #

b

DT PP PRG
6.0 2 2
6.0 1 1
6.0 12 12
6.0 8 8
6.0 4 4
6.0 3 3
6.0 11 11
6.0 6 6
6.0 7 7
6.0 13 13
6.0 10 10
6.0 9 9
6.0 5 5
DT PP PRG
6.5 1 1
6.5 6 6
6.5 3 3
6.5 7 7
6.5 4 4
6.5 5 5
6.5 2 2
DT PP PRG
6.0 9 9
6.0 6 6
6.0 8 8
6.0 1 1
6.0 11 11
6.0 4 4
6.0 10 10
6.0 2 2
6.0 3 3
6.6 5 5
6.0 7 7

CUZZYWUZ
FASTEST
SENTIMEN
AIN'T
PALM
SUNSET
VIETNAM
PURRFECT
FLIRTATI
Joy

AMERICAI
MISS
HOLD ME

MOHAYLAD
LAURA'S
NAUGHTYN

T. K.'S
BLEST
CANDY

SCIENCE
LOCH

SIR
BELFAST
THE
MUTUAL
ROAD

0 DOGG

RUBIGINO

COCHISE
MAJOR

R>S
S>S
S>S
S>S
R>S
S>S
S>S
S>S
S>S
S>S

S>S
S>S
S>S

S>S
R>S
S>S

S$>S
S$>S
S>S

S>S
S>S

S>S
S>S
S>S
S>S
S>S

S>S

S>S

S>S
S>S

D>D
D>D
D>D

D>D

D>D

D>D
D>D
D>D

D>D
D>D
D>D
™D
D>D

D>D

D>D

T>D
T>D

MOVING?

N(2>3) Class Change -15

F/PP/BTL/Y(3>6) Class Change -35
SP-16/N(4>8) Class Change -15
BOM:4/SG:1/N(12>4) Class Change -15
F/PP/Y(2>5) Class Change -25
F/PP/Y(5>2) Class Change 5

N(5>6) Class Change -15

BOM:3/N(4>5) Class Change -15
F/PP/Y(8>6) Class Change @
F/PP/SP-13/WATCH/Y(10>9) Class

Change -40
N(3>9) Class Change ©
N(2>7) Class Change -20

N(5>10) Class Change -25

MOVING?

F/PP/SP+14/ESP/Y(3>1) Class Change

55
N(1>6) Class Change -40

F/PP/Y(2>3) Class Change -20
F/PP/WATCH/ESP/Y(2>1) Class Change

60

F/Y(2>4) Class Change 30
F/SP+16/Y(1>1) Class Change 65
BOM:3/N(7>4) Class Change 45

MOVING?

SG:.75/N(10>10) Class Change -60
BOM:3/SG:1.5/N(4>4) Class Change

-40
N(5>5) Class Change -45
N(3>5) Class Change -30

F/PP/SP-32/Y(5>7) Class Change -45
BM1:4/Y(1>5) Class Change -10
F/PP/WATCH/ESP/Y(5>1) Class Change

30

BTL/BOM:3/SG:1.25/Y(1>2) Class

Change 10

F/PP/BTL/SP+18/WATCH/ESP/Y(3>2)

Class Change 10

F/PP/ESP/Y(2>1) Class Change 22
BTL/BOM:3/SG:.5/SP+16/Y(6>6) Class

Change 5

R#

10

[}
N
NWNUNP_UO S

45
44 1
21 1

=

71 2

62 6

58 2
52 8

ASP
DS

77
76
74
77
75

72

66

49
62

RT

NWNNWPRWARPW

[y

ASP
110

70
ERR
ERR

64
74
64

77
77
73
ERR
80

72

66

ERR
61

RD SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDS1 TDS2 CLOSE

NNNMNNNENPOW

.

=
O 0 ®

ul

AP ONWUVIOWUIWUV

0WOoHOONDDNLOR

\\o)
®

0o

coOuUVTuUINPNONO D
P LOWNNWOWO

SYs2

»w

SYs2

[y
=

OO FRPOORFR OO
AR OND_UOR

[SNSY

®

CLOSE

R oR
® VR

® R R
0 R o

CLOSE

=
®
®

0o
0o

(G}
N

AROLOUUONOO
WO AR DAMONO®OOND

=
© w

=}
®

10.

oV OOy N
P LOWOVLWNUOVUNOLV

w o

%

[y
=

OCORPFRPOORFROOR
ANV NON

SN

BB

IS

BROT1 P2F P4F LST

53.
56.
49.

59.

60.

61.
57.

14
10
o5

.75
.41
.17
.48
.34

06

25

94
97

66
84
49

88

95

96
84

64
79
41

67
50
60

70
81
64

84

76

63
75

Last

214

197
213
150

236

257

242
255
217

258
259
203
240
258

261

268

159
159

DSLR

114
24
109

24
38
22

120
148
64
32
23

43

55

289
31

197
213
150

236

257

242
255
217

258
259
203
240
258

261

268

159
159

POWER MLINE

101

9.
93.
73.

cUoNvaaWeONR O

» oo

POWER

POWER

110.

115.
115.
109.
108.

113

113.

109.

100.
101.

15.
10.
12.

15
15

00
00
00

.00

.00

.00
.00

LAST FIVE FIGS

LAST FIVE FIGS
85,56,0,0,0
70,70,74,0,0
76,77,58,70,0
70,0,0,0,0
64,67,0,0,0

74,47,53,0,0
45,63,65,57,38

LAST FIVE FIGS

76,72,7
81,66,7

O 0
-
0

80,77,78,78,83
79,81,71,58,68
42,76,78,81,83
70,77,0,0,0

80,77,70,60,76

81,67,65,77,65
80,76,53,58,50

67,49,0,0,0
68,68,74,46,56

34
14
23

133
127

64
62
93

133
73
34
55
94

176

157

132
48

168
109
154
130
112
150

115
135
140

178

121

139
163
148

158
160
175
134
145

150

117

123
146

COMMENT

2p;3p up;missed plc
Pressed;bid3w; empty
Rider erratic turn

Sp upr; rallied;gained
Close up outside;faded
Chased 2wd;2nd best
Bothered st; clipped
Brush gate;passd tired
Vied 2wd btw;yield5/16
Brsh gate;slw st;rushd

Outrun
Never menaced
Off slow;forced out5/8

COMMENT
Drew off; ridden out

Tracked 2wd btwn;faded
Stalkd ins;saved show
Brief drv 1/8; clear

2path upr; bid; faded
Bobbled st;drv pst;clr
5-6 p trn;7p lane

COMMENT

3wd btwn;5w5/16;faded
Traield;inside gain

Trailed throughout
Inside;svd gnd;no bid
Bumped st; thru 1/2
Brief lead; faded 5p
2p upper;drew away;drv

3p trn; 5p upr;gaining
Dueled; worn down

Prompted;clear;lasted
Swung 7w; no threat;

BEST
OVERAL

205

199
203
200
176

175
169
130

BEST
OVERAL

369

369

355
340
322

BEST
OVERAL

239
238
227
230
232

229

217

211
200

BEST
LAST TOTALS

364 581
285 493
308 511
357 563
317 522
355 562
310 510
318 522
328 528
267 443
291 466
284 454
215 345

BEST

LAST TOTALS
635 1014
568 937
579 947
582 951
554 909
591 931
491 813

BEST

LAST TOTALS
383 622
392 629
392 631
391 629
298 525
367 597
397 628
395 625
403 620
295 505
287 487



DATE  TRK #

11/7/21 D 9

DATE  TRK #

AMENDMEN

LADY
LADY

BEES AND
STOP
ALYDIVA
SPARKLE
MAYBE
ADMAA

R>R
R>R

S>R
R>R
R>R
S>R
R>R
R>R

D>D
D>D
T>D
T>D
D>D
D>D

MOVING?

BOM:4/BM1:3.75/N(3>3) Class Change
-3

F/PP/UN?/Y(1>4) Class Change ©
F/PP/SP+12/WATCH/ESP/Y(5>1) Class
Change 55

F/PP/BOM:3/Y(3>1) Class Change 60
BOM:5/BM1:3.5/N(4>3) Class Change ©
BOM:5/SG:.25/N(6>5) Class Change ©
BOM:4/SG:.75/N(4>5) Class Change 25
N(1>3) Class Change ©

F/PP/Y(2>2) Class Change 60

MOVING?

920

82

81

78

76

74
72

R#

ASP
DS

ASP

RT

APhOoOONR

ASP
110

80
79
ERR
ERR
77
71

RD SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDS1 TDS2 CLOSE

whoOoOo U R

[
[t}

[V RNV IRV V|
NOWVUNN D

»
N

uhpMDhuUN
N OO 0w WU

[y
w

PR RRRN
PNORON

CLOSE

TDS1

BROT1 P2F P4F LST

69
107

57.22
56.51
56.42
56.68
53.88
.72

78
81
81
86
55

Last

243
255

251
226
236
256
223
227

DSLR

25
49
59
70
35
45

251
303
310
256
313
303

POWER MLINE

.00
.00

122.
123.
122.
118
121.
112

.00
.00
.00
.00
.00
.00

b N L Lee
N
®

LAST FIVE FIGS
92,96,89,81,0

74,92,90,89,74
93,80,83,88,73

79,80,81,0,0
76,70,88,78,78
74,80,82,79,66
82,82,77,79,83
70,79,78,72,76
72,63,85,68,66

LAST FIVE FIGS

128

162
199
192
178
180
157

COMMENT
Rallied; 5w; no menace

Dueled inside; tired
Pace; widened; handily

Strolled pst;geard dwn
2wd;3wd upr;stayed on
4-5wd;needed more
3wd;5wd upr;stayed on
Imprvd 3w2nd;no threat
3wd run 1/4p for 2d

COMMENT

BEST
OVERAL

283
283

280
277
274

264
261

BEST
OVERAL

BEST
LAST

TOTALS

718
765

730
709
715
746
671
677

TOTALS

11/7/21 CD 10

DATE  TRK #

SMARMY
ANNA
ONLY
SOUTH
MINE FOR
LADY
SUMMER
TAP FOR
ASKEW

D>D

N(6>2) Class Change ©
BOM:5/SG:1.5/N(8>3) Class Change ©
F/PP/Y(4>6) Class Change ©
F/UN?/Y(3>4) Class Change 10
BOM:5/N(12>4) Class Change 14
N(8>12) Class Change 14

Y(050)

Y(050)

Y(0>0)

MOVING?

ERR
ERR

OO OWER WNERE D

ERR
ERR

OO ONRFREREPRNREN

OOONOOOO®

SYS2

CLOSE

TDS1

Fokskok
sokskok
Fkkk

.00

.00

POWER MLINE

79,83,81,69,0
78,0,0,0,0
74,79,0,0,0
76,59,77,0,0
67,0,0,0,0
47,61,59,0,0

LAST FIVE FIGS

3wd;no match;chased
Slow st;green upr;drft
Stalk 2wd;yield btwl/8
Stalked inside;no bid
Gain 4p trn;leveld off
Bmpd st;never involved

COMMENT

BEST
OVERAL

TOTALS

11/7/21 DMR 1

DATE  TRK #

RED KING

MIDNIGHT

LURE HIM
KEYSTONE
BIG BUZZ
COUNT OF

R>R
R>R
R>R
R>R

T
T
T
T

BOM:3/SG:2.75/N(10>7) Class Change
-25

F/BTL/SG:.25/Y(1>4) Class Change
-10

F/PP/BOM:3/Y(5>1) Class Change 5
BOM:6/Y(7>1) Class Change 25
F/PP/WATCH/Y(4>5) Class Change -5
N(8>10) Class Change -25

MOVING?

95

91

88
87
84
84

10

10
10
10

89

84
84

ERR

88
ERR
88
ERR

®

OwWonN

o wwwu
w v A oo

NSNS
00 WV W pH

A wwwun
w U1 U100

TDS1

83 82
54.38
53.71
53.59
56.03

80
77
81
57

75
75
84
72

78
82
57
69

233
234
222
198

15

24
36

320
321
222
277

151.2  2.00
140.8 5.00
138.6 4.00
123.7 10.00
135.5 3.50

99,93,107,93,93
91,95,86,94,98
90,86,90,91,84
86,84,83,97,84

80,85,92,74,84
84,90,77,0,0

LAST FIVE FIGS

116
128
70
63

198
181
194
214

Angld in str;no threat
Tracked ins; kept on

Rated;bid 1/8;driving
3w;swng out;determined

Headed upr;gave way
Off slow;lacked rm str

COMMENT

434

421
412
392
404

BEST
OVERAL

685
729
578
628

1168

1106
1141

969
1032

TOTALS

11/7/21 DMR 2

DT PP PRG
8.0 7 7
8.0 6 6
8.0 4 4
8.0 3 3
8.0 8 8
8.0 2 2
8.0 5 5
8.0 9 9
8.0 1 1
DT PP PRG
7.0 2 2
7.6 9 9
7.0 4 4
7.6 5 5
7.0 3 3
7.0 6 6
7.0 1 1
7.0 8 8
7.0 7 7
DT PP PRG
11.0 6 6
1.0 2 2
11.6 5 5
1.6 3 3
11.0 4 4
1.0 1 1
DT PP PRG
5.5 7 7
5.5 2 2
5.5 5 5
5.5 4 4
55 1 1
5.5 3 3
5.5 6 6

QUICK
SPOILED

ARTISAN
BONITA

UNWRITTE
BLONDE
GIRL

S>S

S>S
S>S

S>S
S>S
0>S

D>D
D>D

D>D
D>D
>D

F/PP/ESP/Y(4>4) Class Change ©
F/PP/BTL/SP+12/WATCH/ESP/Y(9>3)
Class Change ©

F/Y(4>6) Class Change ©
F/PP/SP+15/WATCH/ESP/Y(8>2) Class
Change ©

F/Y(6>7) Class Change -25
SG:1/N(1>8) Class Change -30
Y(0>0)

63
61

58
56
ERR

63
59

58
56
ERR

10.0
10.0
ERR

3.1 1.8
4.5 1.1
5.0 0.7
2.2 2.0
5.8 1.0
ERR  ERR
ERR  ERR
4.2 1.3
3.8 1.5
TDS2 CLOSE
2.1 1.0
2.5 2.3
4.7 0.6
4.0 1.5
3.3 1.5
6.0 1.2
ERR  ERR
ERR  ERR
ERR  ERR
TDS2 CLOSE
4.5 1.2
4.4 1.1
4.2 1.4
4.2 0.8
4.9 0.7
7.8 0.8
TDS2 CLOSE
4.0 0.3
5.4 0.4
4.6 1.2
7.0 0.7
10.0 0.7
10.0 1.0
ERR  ERR

91
91

86
94

56
74

97
66

96
67

50
80

233
259

243
213
0

22
22

36
63

koK kk

233
259

243
213

POWER MLINE
110.3 2.00
113.7 2.50
110.7 5.00
113.8 2.50
109.1 8.00
103.6 15.00
15.00

68,0,0,0,0
75,39,63,75,0

55,62,71,0,0
76,66,41,60,0

58,0,0,0,0
56,0,0,0,0
0,0,0,0,0

40
28
64

139
156

166
171
ERR

Pace;clear;weakened
Btwn;2wd;faltered late

Pinblld st;3dp 1/2;wkn
Floatd in early;gamely

Chased 3-4wd; faded
Tossed head; off slow

407
399
ERR

619
714

635
603
ERR



DATE  TRK #

11/7/21 DMR 3

DATE  TRK #

11/7/21 DMR 4

DATE  TRK #

Ul

INTO THE
BEER CAN

BIG
AUGUSTA
SWISS
WARRENS

ALBIZU

DONCIC

S>S

S>S
S>S
R>S
S>S

S>S

D>D

D>D

MOVING?

F/PP/ESP/Y(5>4) Class Change 35
BOM:5/Y(2>1) Class Change 5
F/PP/ESP/Y(2>5) Class Change -8
F/SG:3.25/SP+15/Y(1>2) Class Change
-20

MOVING?

BOM:4/Y(1>3) Class Change 10
F/PP/Y(3>5) Class Change 10
F/PP/WATCH/Y(2>7) Class Change 5
F/PP/BTL/SG:1.44/WATCH/Y(4>2) Class
Change 25
BTL/BOM:6/SG:1/SP+11/Y(8>2) Class
Change 10

F/PP/WATCH/ESP/Y(4>7) Class Change
10

MOVING?

ASP

R# TDS

ERR

75

70

ASP

RT 110

ERR

76

70

RD SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE

SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE

w
ul
w
w
[y

TDS1 TDS2 CLOSE

BROT1 P2F P4F LST

258

POWER MLINE

POWER MLINE

124.9

POWER

.00
.00

.00

.50

LAST FIVE FIGS

82,86,97,96,99
89,92,95,91,90
84,94,86,92,86
95,94,90, 85, 82

LAST FIVE FIGS

87,93,89,86,91
84,92,64,87,88
79,82,81,72,0

77,79,77,78,75

89,79,89,86,88

78,96,28,71,78

LAST FIVE FIGS

TIW%

TIW%

TIW%

COMMENT
Pressed3w;bid7/16;1led
Steady early;clear 1/8

Long drv 1/8;gave way
Angled out; strong bid

COMMENT
Rail bid; not enough
Bid 1/4;1led uppr;flttn
Bp erly;pinch/chck upr
Rally;bpd 1/16;missed
Angled out;rallied btw

Bit rank;clear;weaknd

COMMENT

BEST
OVERAL

BEST
OVERAL

BEST
OVERAL

BEST
LAST TOTALS

691

654

TOTALS

TOTALS

11/7/21 DMR 5

DATE  TRK #

I

0 O

CIRCUMVE
HULK
PRINCE

MONGOL

ROSENQUI
WORLD

THE BOSS
BROTHER
NOTHNGOO

R>R
R>R

S>R
R>R
S>R

T

D>T

™T
™T

D>T
T
D>T

CP/BOM:4/SG:.75/2 in 1/Y(7>2) Class
Change ©

F/PP/ESP/Y(6>3) Class Change ©
SG:.75/N(5>7) Class Change ©
BTL/BOM:3/BM1:3.25/BM++/SG:4/Y(7>3)
Class Change 5
BOM:8/BM1:3/SG:1/N(8>3) Class
Change 25

F/PP/Y(10>5) Class Change ©
BOM:5/SG:1.75/2 in 1/N(9>4) Class
Change 45

F/Y(1>6) Class Change -15
SP-29/N(6>9) Class Change -25
UN?/N(1>4) Class Change -15

MOVING?

74

73
73

67
67
66

V]

ERR

74
73

ERR

ERR

o woe

ERR

74
73

ERR

ERR

w
ohWw
© Ao

@

ERR
1.5
ERR

54.

54

55.
.61
56.

37

.85
54.

40

42

60

65

75
69

87

83

62

74
69

80

79

69
27
77

313

332

281

298
291

236
256
239

106.4

113.8
111.8

102.3

93.1
111.7

POWER

79,66,82,82,85

78,81,78,83,67
71,80,0,0,0
82,82,60,0,0

76,79,82,70,75

71,74,72,77,70
74,78,68,73,0

61,72,0,0,0
38,85,78,68,0
66,0,0,0,0

LAST FIVE FIGS

116

98
120
154

TIW%

Btwn;angld out;rallied
Vied 3dp;duel;no match
Pulled early; no rally
Angld out str;late bid
Off slow/bpd;swung Swd

3deep 1/2;4wd into str
Brk out;steadied 9/16

Chased inside; faded

Tired; eased; walked
2-4wide; no factor

COMMENT

258

251

248

253
252

239
230
247

BEST
OVERAL

403

406
409

384
312
401

685

679

651

659
661

623
542
648

TOTALS

11/7/21 DMR 6

[CV VIV, RV, RV, IV, RV |
[C RV IV IV, IV, RV IV, I |
AP UNOWEREOO®
A UNOWEREOO®

DORITA'S
PHILLY

RED
SUEZAAAN
LUNATIC
O SHUGAH
STARSHIP
LIFE'S
CAL
GOLDEN

S>S
R>S
S>S
S>S
S>S
S>S
S>S
2>S

D>D
D>D
D>D
™D
T>D
D>D
T>D
>D

F/PP/ESP/Y(5>3) Class Change -20
F/PP/BTL/WATCH/ESP/Y(8>2) Class
Change ©

SG:1.25/Y(7>3) Class Change ©
SG:1.25/N(1>2) Class Change ©
F/PP/BTL/ESP/Y(8>2) Class Change ©
N(7>11) Class Change -50
F/Y(10>8) Class Change -50
N(2>6) Class Change ©
SG:3.25/N(3>8) Class Change -20
Y(0>0)

O NO UV U

74
75

ERR
52
56

ERR

ERR

OO, OWUV KL

74
73
76
ERR
52
54
ERR
ERR

OOV OWNEER
moo W wul N Wwu
oo ®ORL
moo vl wuvlhpH
WO NWOOW
MOOOOO®OR

=
=

ERR

77
77
73
66
69
52
70

Last DSLR
255 73
267 36
273 23
187 43

Last DSLR
260 28
263 28
267 7
248 27
262 28
258 28

Last DSLR
231 27
235 27
225 27
237 73
218 9
224 27
221 27
236 133
186 62
239 49

Last DSLR
252 50
264 43
165 134
252 391
261 21
251 37
263 37
226 21
144 7

) kK ok k

165
326
261
251
263
226
144

100
93.

73,78,71,75,0
78,67,73,76,0

74,0,0,0,0
72,67,80,7
78,72,53,7
70,0,0,0,0
76,70,73,75,52
52,51,63,62,65
53,33,0,0,0
0,0,0,0,0

0
7

8)
7,72

116
51
96
41

109
65
23
35

Bpd 3/16;n0 late kick
Led 3/8;overtkn midstr

4-6wide; no late kick
Chased; 2nd best

Bpd st;4dp;duel;edged
4wide; no response
Bmpd st;3wd;faded
2wd;bit off rail;faded
Shifted in;bpd st;ins

299
283
282
281
287
244
235
ERR

379
471
488
451
485
406
313
ERR

678
755
771
731
772
650
547
ERR



DATE  TRK #

11/7/21 DMR 7

DATE  TRK #

11/7/21 DMR 8

DATE  TRK #

11/7/21 DMR 9

DT PP PRG
8.0 3 3
8.0 4 4
8.0 9 9
8.0 8 8
8.0 1 1
8.0 10 10
8.0 6 6
8.0 5 5
8.0 7 7
8.0 2 2
DT PP PRG
7.6 3 3
7.6 5 5
7.0 6 6
7.0 1 1
7.0 4 4
7.0 2 2
DT PP PRG
8.0 10 10
8.0 4 4
8.0 7 7
8.0 1 1
8.0 9 9
8.0 13 13
8.0 8 8
8.0 6 6
8.0 5 5
8.0 12 12
8.0 3 3
8.0 2 2
8.0 11 11

HORSE  DST
FEARLESS R>R
ANONYMOU S>R
ULTIMATE R>R
NICE ICE R>R
ROSE'S  R>R
RESARCIO R>R
ALOHA R>R
BRILLIAN S>R
MET IN R>R
FROSE S>R

HORSE  DST
BIG S>S
BELLA S>S
WARREN'S S>S
FI FI R>S
HARPER'S R>S
SMOOTHLI S>S

HORSE  DST
PICOTA R>R
CABO S>R
WELLSWOR R>R
KING S>R
KHANTARO R>R
KATONAH R>R
SADDLE  S>R
L BEE o>R
MAYBE o>R
M K o>R
LOTTERY ©@>R
MAYNARD @>R
STOTLAND @>R

D>T

D>T

™T

™D

D>D

D>D
D>D

™T

T
T
T
D>T
T
>T
>T
>T
>T
>T

MOVING?

BTL/SG:.25/Y(3>5) Class Change 5
BOM:4/Y(7>2) Class Change 5
CP/Y(9>8) Class Change 5
F/SP-27/Y(4>7) Class Change 5
BTL/SG:1.5/Y(6>6) Class Change 5
N(8>10) Class Change ©
F/PP/SP+12/UN?/Y(3>1) Class Change
35

F/PP/BTL/WATCH/ESP/Y(6>4) Class
Change 25

BOM:3/Z Pattern/Y(2>1) Class Change
35

F/Y(11>12) Class Change 5

MOVING?

F/PP/BTL/SG:1/Y(1>2) Class Change
30

F/PP/Y(5>4) Class Change ©
BOM:4/Y(1>1) Class Change ©
F/PP/BTL/UN?/ESP/Y(2>2) Class
Change 40

F/Y(3>4) Class Change 15
BTL/BOM:4/SG:3.25/Y(5>2) Class
Change 30

MOVING?

CP/SG:.75/2 in 1/Y(3>2) Class
Change 5

F/PP/WATCH/ESP/Y(4>2) Class Change
5

SG:.75/N(6>4) Class Change 5
N(1>8) Class Change 5
F/PP/WATCH/Y(4>3) Class Change 5
N(5>8) Class Change 5
BOM:5/SG:.75/N(3>5) Class Change 6
Y(0>0)

Y(0>0)

Y(0>0)

Y(0>0)

Y(0>0)

Y(0>0)

80

77

73
72
70
69
63
ERR
ERR
ERR
ERR
ERR
ERR

10
10

OO0 WWERR

ERR
85

73
ERR

ERR
ERR
ERR
ERR
ERR
ERR
ERR
ERR

OO0 OR

110

ERR

ERR

77

ERR
87

73
ERR

ERR
ERR
ERR
ERR
ERR
ERR
ERR
ERR

RD SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE

g

OO0 OR

w
N

v
N

OhPhOWO

ERR
ERR

CLOSE

CLOSE

TDS1 TDS2 CLOSE

5.0
ERR

ERR
ERR
ERR
ERR
ERR
ERR
ERR
ERR

TDS2

5.0
ERR

ERR
ERR
ERR
ERR
ERR
ERR
ERR
ERR

CLOSE

1.0
ERR

ERR
ERR
ERR
ERR
ERR
ERR
ERR
ERR

BROT1 P2F P4F LST

.09

.97

84

92

77

90

85

67

77

84
80
78
65

Last

258

262

246

249

275

238
240
241
210

(NSO RGIGR)

DSLR

29

21

327

249

266

343

330
256

275

307
240
317
281

OO0

POWER MLINE

118.

109.

POWER

137.

126.

126
121.

POWER

118.
113
116
112.
105.

20.

.00

00

LAST FIVE FIGS
86,90,0,0,0
86,78,88,81,86
83,89,88,76,83
55,94,81, 86,80
86,86,85,78,74
74,78,80,75,77
88,82,75,76,73
81,86,79, 88,62
81,73,72,0,0

67,71,84,74,74

LAST FIVE FIGS
81,96,92,99,82
85,103,909, 81,99
91,91,94,94,95
99,74, 85,86,84

77,80,85,83,90
83,84,87,80,69

LAST FIVE FIGS
76,87,0,0,0

84,77,80,66,0

138

41

316

82

191
299
200

93
81

159

178

213

196

183
188

170

167
167
165
169
166
ERR
ERR
ERR
ERR
ERR
ERR

COMMENT

Stmbld bit;waited uppr
Fractious;lack rm uppr
Brk out;bit rank early
Mild bid 3/8; tired
Lacked room upper

Brk thru gate;off slow
Bid 2nd;brshd uppr;clr

Pace 3w;gave way
Ins mv 3/8;angl;grind

4dp;3w;bothrd into str

COMMENT
Tug;waitd trn;led 1/16
Rated; 3-4wide; no bid
Split foes 1/8;rallied
Bid 3/16;led;faltered

Bumped;steadied 3/16
Bp early;4-2w;rail str

COMMENT
Ins;angl 3w;fnshd well
Vie btw;duel 2w;caught

Angld 4w;drftd in uppr
Off slow;lacked rm str
Mild bid 2nd; no match
2wd into str;no impact
Off slow;2wd;came out

BEST
OVERAL

264
259
247
254
241
249

247

237

232

374

359
355
351
337
335
ERR
ERR
ERR
ERR
ERR
ERR

BEST
LAST

433

412

404

367

612

569
545
569
496
419
ERR
ERR
ERR
ERR
ERR
ERR

TOTALS

682

659

641

599

TOTALS

TOTALS

986

928
900
920
832
754
ERR
ERR
ERR
ERR
ERR
ERR



