DATE

3/10/22

DATE

TRK #

GP

TRK #

STORMY

BLAME
LETS RUN
MAGNOLIA
ROUGH
DANCE
CENTSATI
BRAIN

R>S
S>S
S>S
S>S
S>S
S>S
R>S

D>D
D>D
D>D
D>D
D>D
D>D
D>D

AVG

10
10

w R A

ERR
63
48
58
60
55
28

ERR
63
48
65
60
55

ERR

RD

AVGSPD
PLUSL3

67
ERR
61
58
57
ERR
51

AVGSPD
PLUSL3

SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDS1 TDS2 CLOSE

10

BROT1 E1 E2 LST

78
88
75
91

86

Last

192

DSLR

BTOT

278

HIGH
BRIS

POWER

104.

MLINE

4.50
3.50
6.00
30.00
4.00
8.00
8.00

MLINE

LAST FIVE FIGS
50,70,62,70,74

61,69,56,65,72
63,0,0,0,0
52,59,60,64,36
57,50,56,60,65
60,72,60,31,0
55,0,0,0,0
48,74,28,0,0

LAST FIVE FIGS

TIW%

10
149
49
12
87
135
63

TIW%

155
135
167

112

COMMENT
2wd; left lead; lug in

Even effort 3wd

3-4w turn;up show rail
Bumped 5/8;2wd;retreat
Chased inside; no bid

Tracked 2p; faded

Off slow; 3wd; lug in

Tug way forward; empty

COMMENT

BEST
OVERAL

358
354

BEST
OVERAL

BEST
LAST

273
301
250
225
293
219
234

TOTALS

660

629
592
663
577
589

TOTALS

3/10/22

DATE

GP

TRK #

KHOZY MY
MAN ON
MISH
NIXON
CHUCKY

EMBRACE

10

10

ERR

81

81

ERR

81

84

AVGSPD
PLUSL3

CLOSE

TDS1

100

257

260

00

1.80

83,82,78,83,81
79,85,76,82,82
89,91,64,96,92
80,89,79,83,77
83,81,90,78,77

91,87,64,85,76

LAST FIVE FIGS

149
167

196

126

TIW%

In range;2wd;evenly
Stalked 3wd; faded
Rebid rail;drew clear
Ins;4w 1/4;along show
Mvd out turn;best rest

2wd; fought on inside

COMMENT

514
491
493

490

BEST
OVERAL

875

826

841

TOTALS

3/10/22

DATE

GP

TRK #

TORETTO
THE RED
VALHALLA
UNIMPEAC

ADMIRAL

HIGH
AWESOME

R>S
R>S
S>S
S>S

S>S

S>S
S>S

D>D

D>D
D>D

66

63
66

66

63
66

67
64
61

AVGSPD
PLUSL3

CLOSE

w
BN

TDS1

84

86
91

86

86
60

255

254
151

26

28
18

255

254
151

109.3

109.7
110.5

POWER

3.00

5.00
.00

76,80,80,75,69
72,71,61,73,68
71,75,78,59,68
63,61,60,61,76

77,65,68,55,69

78,73,0,63,68
61,67,67,69,81

LAST FIVE FIGS

79

49
73

TIW%

117

120
128

Rank into 1st; inside
Vied;no match past 1/4
Ins-2pth; faded str
Rail; pace; weakened

3wd; up 1/4; drew off

2-3wd btwn;flatten out
Finished after 3/8ths

COMMENT

428
424
415

BEST
OVERAL

730

744

741
634

TOTALS

3/10/22

DATE

GP 4

TRK #

MIA
SCHOOL

TAG HER
LUNA
LONDON
AMBAR
TICKET
BIG

LIGEIA
DOWNBURS

R>S

S>S
R>S
S>S
R>S
R>S
R>S

S>S
0>S

D>T
D>T
D>T
D>T
D>T
T

D>T
>T

OO0

o ®

ERR
74
ERR
ERR
ERR
68

ERR
ERR

®

ERR
ERR

AVGSPD
PLUSL3

SYs1

SYs2

TDS1

TDS2

BROT1

76
79
70
74
66
98

67

256
231
252
224
204
204

229
(2]

47
29
20
46
60
26

20

soksk ok

256
311
252
308
279
270

229

8.00
4.00
8.00
2.00
6.00
2.00

78,74,0,0,0
83,80,74,66,0

75,0,0,0,0
76,70,74,68,82
72,76,59,68,73
70,66,0,0,0
62,72,0,0,0
72,68,63,32,0

59,0,0,0,0
0,0,0,0,0

LAST FIVE FIGS

151
136

154
167

101
43

150
150

141

163
ERR

4wd;led;no match late
Sw;rallied;edged out

Chased 3wd; no threat
Track pace;bid 3w;wknd
3wd; no match

Traffic 2nd;4wd uppr
Up clse 1/2;rebid;even
Pulled btw;shifteddw

No factor; 3wd

COMMENT

347
347
338
325
323
312

303
ERR

BEST
OVERAL

239
229
233
216
194
210

201

586
576
571
541
517
521

505
ERR

TOTALS

3/10/22

GP

DT PP PRG
5.0 1 1
5.0 7 7
5.0 4 4
5.0 2 2
5.0 8 8
5.0 6 6
5.6 5 5
5.6 3 3
DT PP PRG
8.0 2 2
8.0 1 1
8.0 6 6
8.0 4 4
8.0 3 3
8.0 5 5
DT PP PRG
5.5 6 6
55 5 5
5.5 2 2
5.5 7 7
5.5 4 4
55 1 1
5.5 3 3
DT PP PRG
7.5 4 4
7.5 7 7
7.5 5 5
7.5 9 9
7.5 2 2
7.510 10
7.5 6 6
7.5 1 1
7.5 8 8
7.5 3 3
DT PP PRG
7.6 1 1
7.0 4 4
7.6 2 2
7.0 6 6
7.6 3 3
7.6 5 5

BELLE OF
SIEMPRE
EQUAL

FIRST TO
PRETTY
EGYPTIAN

S>S
R>S
S>S

0>S
0>S
0>S

MOVING? SPD
F/PP/SP-17/SLR?- 20Y(5>7) Class 67
Change -15
N(9>4) Class Change © 66
FLR+ 63N(5>3) Class Change © 63
Y(6>6) Class Change © 60
Y(4>6) Class Change -15 57
F/SLR?- 12Y(1>4) Class Change -10 56
FLR+ 55N(6>8) Class Change -10 55
F/PP/SLR?- 26WATCH/Y(7>9) Class 50
Change ©

AVG

MOVING? SPD
F/Y(3>4) Class Change -20 83
F/PP/Y(5>5) Class Change -5 80
F/PP/SP+12/Y(4>1) Class Change -20 77
BOM:3/N(2>3) Class Change © 77
F/BOM:3/SG:1.75/Y(1>2) Class Change 74
50
F/PP/BTL/SG: .37/SP+18/WATCH/ESP/2 73
in 1/Y(4>2) Class Change -5

AVG

MOVING? SPD
CP/BTL/Y(1>5) Class Change -15 73
F/PP/WATCH/Y(11>7) Class Change 5 71
N(1>5) Class Change © 70
F/PP/BTL/WATCH/ESP/Y(7>6) Class 67
Change 5
F/PP/SP+11/FLR+ 12Y(5>1) Class 66
Change 20
SP+15/N(7>4) Class Change © 63
F/PP/Y(4>7) Class Change -5 60

AVG

MOVING? SPD
F/PP/ESP/Y(8>3) Class Change 5 76
BTL/BOM:6/SG:2/Y(3>2) Class Change 76
5
F/PP/FLR+ 75Y(3>4) Class Change © 75
CP/UN?/Y(9>6) Class Change 5 74
F/Y(3>2) Class Change -25 70
BOM:3/SG:.25/Y(5>3) Class Change 5 68
F/BTL/SG:1.25/Y(1>5) Class Change 5 67
BTL/SG:1/SP+13/N(7>6) Class Change 59
-5
FLR+ 59N(7>6) Class Change -25 59
Y(050) ERR

AVG

MOVING? SPD
F/PP/UN?/Y(7>3) Class Change 2 76
FLR+ 14N(8>5) Class Change 2 71
F/PP/BTL/SP+26/FLR+ 52ESP/Y(1>2) 69
Class Change -20
Y(050) ERR
Y(050) ERR
Y(050) ERR

ERR
ERR
ERR

ERR
ERR
ERR

ERR
ERR
ERR

ERR
ERR
ERR

ERR
ERR
ERR

ERR
ERR
ERR

ERR
ERR
ERR

98

112

138
217

135
203
144

ERR
ERR
ERR

Stalk 3wd; no match
3wd into lane;no rally
In hand 2p;clr; nailed

957
1043

ERR
ERR
ERR



DATE

3/10/22

DATE

TRK #

GP

TRK #

FACE OF
UNCORK
AEQUOR
DOO WOP

GAME BOY
OHIO
KRAMMY

S>S
S>S
R>S
S>S

S>S
S>S
S>S

D>D
D>D

D>D
D>D
D>D

AVG

R#

10
10
10

ASP
TDS

80
74
74

RT

ASP
110

80
74
74

RD

AVGSPD
PLUSL3

AVGSPD
PLUSL3

SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDS1 TDS2 CLOSE

a O
O O

BROT1 E1 E2 LST

56.
54.
56.

87
81
82

92
79
88

89
83
66

Last

268
243
236

DSLR

42
11
20

BTOT

264

268
243
236

HIGH
BRIS

89
81
84

POWER MLINE

121.
108.
110.

.00
.00
.00

LAST FIVE FIGS

95,92,90,90,91
87,89,92,89,91
83,82,93,70,71
83,81,90,89,91

86,87,76,80,62

72,69,75,78,76
65,67,70,69,63

LAST FIVE FIGS

TIW%

144
27
25

TIW%

COMMENT

Rail; pace; driving

Head turned start; 4wd
Stalk pace;weakend trn
3wd; rally btw; up 2nd

Rail; no closing bid

Bobbled brk; outrun
Wide trip;no response

COMMENT

BEST
OVERAL

429
399
397

BEST
OVERAL

BEST
LAST TOTALS

3/10/22

DATE

3/10/22

DATE

3/10/22

GP

TRK #

GP

TRK #

GP

DT PP PRG
6.0 4 4
6.0 6 6
6.0 7 7
6.6 5 5
6.0 1 1
6.0 3 3
6.0 2 2
DT PP PRG
5.6 5 5
5.0 14 14
5.6 3 3
5.0 1 1
5.6 9 9
5.6 7 7
5.011 11
5.0 12 12
5.013 13
5.0 4 4
5.0 6 6
5.0 10 10
5.0 2 2
5.0 8 8
DT PP PRG
7.6 5 5
7.0 2 2
7.0 8 8
7.0 4 4
7.6 1 1
7.0 7 7
7.0 6 6
7.6 3 3
DT PP PRG
7.5 9 9
7.5 1 1
7.5 5 5
7.5 7 7
7.5 4 4
7.5 2 2
7.5 8 8
7.510 10
7.5 6 6
7.5 3 3

JEANIE B
SENORA

WHIMSICA
VIOLENZA

TIPLE
PHANTOM

REINAGOL
LEXINATO
MYy

HONEY
RICHIES
MILLENNI
FOUZIA
DIRTY

RAPTUROU
AMANI'S
SHE'S SO

STELLAR

JET

CANCEL
FROSTY

MILES OF
HARD

WINNING
KATNISS

KELSEY'S
0OXoMoC
PRETTYKE

FRAGEELA
WARWOMAN
BUILT

S>S
S>S

S$>S
S>S
S$>S

S>S
S>S
S$>S
S$>S
S$>S

S>S
S>S
S>S

S>S

S>S

R>S
S>S

S>S
S>S
R>S
S>S

S>S
S>S
R>S

0>S
0>S
0>S

™T
™T

D>T
D>T

™T
D>T
D>T
T
D>T
D>T

D>T
D>T

D>D

D>D

D>D

D>D

D>D
D>D

MOVING? SPD
F/PP/ESP/Y(5>1) Class Change 20 88
Y(4>4) Class Change 20 86
F/UN?/Y(7>5) Class Change 20 84
BOM:5/SG:1.75/Y(8>2) Class Change 81
40
F/PP/WATCH/Y(1>5) Class Change 20 80
N(4>6) Class Change 45 74
N(2>7) Class Change -5 72

AVG

MOVING? SPD
N(7>7) Class Change -21 86
F/PP/ESP/Y(1>3) Class Change -30 85
F/PP/Y(5>1) Class Change 49 84
SP-14/SLR?- 17N(8>9) Class Change 84
-21
BTL/SG:.75/N(7>6) Class Change @ 83
F/PP/FLR+ 12ESP/Y(8>1) Class Change 82
]

SG:.25/N(1>3) Class Change -30 82
F/PP/BTL/ESP/Y(6>6) Class Change 24 81
F/PP/BTL/WATCH/ESP/Y(5>2) Class 81
Change -5
N(11>9) Class Change -24 81
N(6>2) Class Change 25 81
F/PP/BTL/Y(6>5) Class Change -16 79
N(4>7) Class Change © 78
BTL/Y(1>6) Class Change -16 77
AVG

MOVING? SPD
F/PP/FLR+ 85ESP/Y(5>1) Class Change 85
25
BOM:3/N(6>2) Class Change 5 80
SLR?- 14Y(4>1) Class Change 47 76
F/SP-23/SLR?- 26Y(1>6) Class Change 71
-25
F/PP/FLR+ 19WATCH/ESP/Y(1>1) Class 69
Change 25
F/PP/SP-12/SLR?- 22Y(3>7) Class 68
Change -30
N(3>4) Class Change © 68
F/PP/FLR+ 13WATCH/Y(6>2) Class 68
Change -8

AVG

MOVING? SPD
F/UN?/Y(5>5) Class Change © 74
FLR+ 69N(2>6) Class Change © 69
F/Y(4>5) Class Change 5 67
BOM:3/FLR+ 65N(4>4) Class Change 65
-25
BOM:3/N(4>7) Class Change -48 64
FLR+ 61N(5>6) Class Change -30 61
BOM:3/SG:.5/SP+11/2 in 1/N(2>4) 59
Class Change 5
Y(050) ERR
Y(050) ERR
Y(050) ERR

10
10
10

84
82

83
84
80

84
80
77
83
81

69

68

70
72

ERR
ERR
ERR

w

woaNOO

[

83
82

83
ERR
80

ERR

ERR

56

68
73

ERR
ERR
ERR

0 w s

w o

NV

OON

[\

84
83

82

80
79
78

AVGSPD
PLUSL3

AVGSPD
PLUSL3

65
ERR
60

ERR

S~ w
<3N

uwu Ao
ISR NN

SYs1

N B
N 00 =

ERR
ERR
ERR

A uw wu
w A 0o R 00

v h hwDh
ONNO® N

SYSs2

ERR
ERR
ERR

R o R
(SR

R ORPRR
©NN VA

CLOSE

ERR
ERR
ERR

[
H O

N O Wo
NV VO

ERR

ERR

Vo w N n
®© w N v N

uwu NN
NUTh OO

TDS2

TDS2

ERR

ERR

i
N

o
w

P ORRR

ERR
ERR
ERR

.49
.23
.00

.38
.52

.57
.64

BROT1

59

57

55

.41

.09

.63
.69

BROT1

92
90

71
93

0

93

91

75
100

80
84
62

84
100
89
92
92

93

92

75

76
84
64

81
87

91
82
86
81
82

74
79

77

42

74
63

87
65
80

166
182

172
261
269

236
274
257
166
171

256

211

263

225

224
258

243
233
206

(2]
(2]
(2]

146

57
46

26
143
26

146

60

32

32
98

180
32
21

sk ok
sk ok
sk ok

254

166
182

172
261
269
236
274
257

166
171

256

211

263

225

300
258

233

91
90
88

93
89
89
87
91

78

78

74
73

74
61
70

132.
115.
129.

131.
137.
129.
127.
124.

o »

[V, IT, RV IRV, Y

POWER

118.

119.

118.
121.

)

POWER

115.
1e8.
1e8.

15

12.

10.
.50

.00

.00
.50

.00
.00
.00

.00
.00
12.

ol

®

.00
20.

00

.00

00

00

85,93,81,85,89
84,80,81,90,88
88,84,90,89,84
70,87,89,92,85

76,84,82,84,86
91,79,89,80,78

80,84,83,74,85
77,85,82,84,79
86,88,84,86,85

77,79,85,85,80
86,83,76,80,87
78,84,89,80,82
75,83,83,87,78
81,83,82,53,69

LAST FIVE FIGS
85,0,0,0,0
77,84,79,80,80
69,83,75,77,
48,74,84,82,73
78,59,0,0,0
56,78,70,0,0

71,61,72,63,74
73,60,70,0,0

LAST FIVE FIGS

73,79,69,0,0
69,0,0,0,0
68,65,0,0,0
65,0,0,0,0

74,67,67,47,0
61,0,0,0,0
70,68,69,39,47

75
125

138
169
189
131
166

167
103

TIW%

105

114

143

53

121
135

152
141

123
52
181

205
182

187
213

189
19

ERR
ERR
ERR

Failed to threaten
Bumped st;pressed rail
Took over 3wd 1/4;drvg
3wd;5wd upr;tired

Lagged back; no factor
Slim lead;dug in;game

Bump early; rail trip
Stlk;wknd late
Pace btw;dueled inside

Inside turn;no factor
Steady bid;3wd;2nbest
3-4w;mild rally

Hard bump brk;faded 3w
Stallked;evn out 16th

COMMENT
Pace 2path; driving
Ridden along;rally ins
Trackd2p;tippd3p;split
Brief speed; eased up
Pace;game;held firm

3-4p trn;bmpdl/4;empty

Stumbled st;no bid;2wd
Inside turn;headedl/4

COMMENT

Speed btw; rail turn
Save ground;no kick
In range ins;gavewy
No menace inside

Off pace;2w;no rally
Bump st;stdy 7/16;ins
Inside;3wd;mild imprve

213
218

218
208
213

213
214
210
209
208

BEST
OVERAL

370

362

358
358

BEST
OVERAL

436
410
409

ERR
ERR
ERR

321 782
298 744
288 723
291 724
298 727
260 659
244 641
BEST
LAST TOTALS
160 381
130 356
162 379
143 354
120 334
139 357
126 344
152 360
162 376
144 357
164 378
151 362
119 328
126 335
BEST
LAST TOTALS
290 694
270 665
247 629
195 565
275 645
216 579
243 601
264 622
BEST
LAST TOTALS
312 771
249 688
279 705
286 707
314 749
280 690
281 690
] ERR
2] ERR
(2] ERR



DATE  TRK #

3/10/22 GP

DATE  TRK #

3/10/22 GP

DT PP PRG

HORSE

DANCE FOR

BRAIN

STORMY

BLAME THE

ROUGH

MAGNOLIA

CENTSATION

LETS RUN

HORSE

KHOZY MY

CHUCKY

EMBRACE MY

NIXON JoYy

MAN ON THE

PPOT

7>9

557

9>4

4>6

6>6

6>8

553

PPOT

3>4

1>2

4>2

253

555

LAST DS

$55,D5D

R>S,D>D

$55,D5D

R>S,D>D

$55,D5D

S$>S,D>D

S$>S,D>D

S$>S,D>D

S>R,D>D

R>R,D>D

R>R,D>D

R>R,D>D

R>R,D>D

R>R,D>D

SPD
NOTES FROM LAST RACE 110
**Tracked 2p; faded (60)** DROP SWITCH 60

Flashed speed. Class Change -10 Finished

4 from post 1 TIW= 57

**Tug way forward; empty (48)** Flashed ERR
speed. *Pressed Pace from
7-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed?
WATCH! Class Change © Finished 9 from
post 7 TiW= 31

**2wd; left lead; lug in (50)** DROP
SWITCH Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
5-hole. Slow last race (17). Class
Change -15 Finished 7 from post 5 TIW=
47

**Even effort 3wd (61)** Class Change @ ERR
Finished 4 from post 9 TIW= 10

67

**Chased inside; no bid (57)** Class 65

Change -15 Finished 6 from post 4 TW= 4

**Bumped 5/8;2wd;retreat (52)** Class
Change @ Finished 6 from post 6 TIW= 25

48

**0ff slow; 3wd; lug in (55)** DROP
SWITCH 1st off 32 day layoff.Class
Change -10 Finished 8 from post 6 TIW=
73

**3-4w turn;up show rail (63)** Class
Change @ Finished 3 from post 5 TIW= 69

55

63

NOTES FROM LAST RACE

**Rebid rail;drew clear (89)** Flashed
speed. *Pressed Pace from 4-hole. Fast
last race (12).BTL HORSE 1st off 32 day
layoff.Class Change -20 Finished 1 from
post 4 TIW= 83

**In range;2wd;evenly (83)** Flashed
speed. Class Change -20 Finished 4 from
post 3 TIW= 37

*#Mvd out turn;best rest (83)** Flashed
speed. Made big overall move (3).
*Stretch gain (1.75). 1st off 42 day
layoff.Class Change 5@ Finished 2 from
post 1 TIW= 96

*#2wd; fought on inside (91)**THIRD OFF
Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
4-hole. *Stretch gain (.37). Fast last
race (18).Uncharacteristic early speed?
WATCH!BTL HORSE Clear early.2 races in
one pattern.Class Change -5 Finished 2
from post 4 TIW= 58

**Ins;4w 1/4;along show (80)** Made big
overall move (3). Class Change ©
Finished 3 from post 2 TIW= 24
**Stalked 3wd; faded (79)** Flashed
speed. *Pressed Pace from 5-hole. Class
Change -5 Finished 5 from post 5 TJIW= 69

84

81

84

79

80

#110

10

SPD
DS

28

67

ERR

58

48

55

63

84

81

81

79

80

#TDS

10

AVG
SPD

50

67

66

57

60

55

63

83

74

73

77

80

#R S1 S2 TOT SYS1

10

10

10

10

10

10

72

84

70

84

78

77

77

87

89

84

80

83

64 135

-4 80

77

80

76

70

79

85

82

86

81

77

10.00

6.30

SYS2

7.60

5.60

5.40

7.00

6.50

8.00

3.80

5.10

3.60

7.70

5.00

CLOSE

0.53

0.58

0.67

0.77

1.02

1.25

1.67

CLOSE

0.89

0.93

1.17

1.18

1.19

TDS1

8.60

3.40

ERR

5.40

7.90

10.00

6.30

3.60

8.70

5.90

TDS2

10.00

ERR

8.30

8.00

3.80

5.00

CLOSE

0.86

0.70

ERR

0.83

0.96

1.25

1.67

1.07

1.33

1.05

1.32

1.19

86

90

78

89

75

79

88

79

87

78

67

77

E2

76

72

60

79

84

88

82

74

80

PFN

30

50

57

58

68

66

75

8

o

82

10

kS

9.

i

83

LAST FIVE
SPEED RATINGS
60,72,60,31,0

48,74,28,0,0

50,70,62,70,74

61,69,56,65,72

57,50,56, 60,65

52,59,60,64,36

55,0,0,0,0

63,0,0,0,0

LAST FIVE
SPEED RATINGS

89,91,64,96,92

83,82,78,83,81

83,81,90,78,77

91,87,64,85,76

80,89,79,83,77

79,85,76,82,82

HIGH

BYER DSLR
60 29
28 21
74 11
2] 21
80 11
59 18
55 32
63 26
HIGH

BYER DSLR
2] 32
96 28
92 42
91 29
89 29
87 29

AVG3

50.0

61.0

62.0

57.0

55.0

63.0

81.0

85.0

81.0

83.0

80.0

BRIS P EQUIP MLINE

E/P

E/P

E/P

E/P

E/P

BON

30.00

6.00

8.00

135

TRK DIS

TAM 5.5
GP 8.5
GP 5.0
GP 8.5
GP 5.0
GP 7.0
GP 5.0
GP 5.5
TRK DIS

GP 6.0
GP 8.0
GP 8.0
GP 8.0
GP 8.0
GP 8.0

TYPE CHNG SPPNT

M>M 41.7
M>M 0.0
M>M 33.3
M>M 8.3
M>M 16.7
M>M 0.0
M>M 0.0
M>M 0.0
CHNG  SPPNT
AO>R  28.6
AO>R  14.3
R 21.4
R>R 14.3
R>R 0.0
R>R 21.4

ERLY
PACE

PWR CLASS FINAL COMB TOTL

106 10.6 82.5 93.1 177

108

110

110

101

103

104

1e8

PWR

123

122

123

116

120

11.3

6.4

9.8

8.8

11.3

79.1 87.9 162

84.9 94.1 90

76.5 87.7 150

77.4 83.8 89

81.1 9.9 135

87.1 95.9 79

87.3

98.7 167

ERLY
PACE

CLASS FINAL COMB TOTL

16.8

14.9

15.2

16.2

14.6

14.8

87.7 104.6 195

84.8 99.7 163

86.0 101.1 175

84.9 101.1 160

84.2 98.8 141

83.8 98.6 157

TOTL
PACE
LAST

192

140

207

147

20

w

145

242

TOTL
PACE
LAST

249

257

260

232

240

COMMENTS

Tracked 2p; faded/ Chased
ins; weakened/ Opened
up;2p trn;faded

Tug way forward; empty/
Bid late tn;headed upr/
Off slowly; eased up

2wd; left lead; lug in/
Swd; left lead; lug in/
Pace;headed late turn

Even effort 3wd/ Steadied
1/4; 2-3wd/ Slow pace;
retreated

Chased inside; no bid/
Forward 3w; gave way;/
Saved ground; no avail
Bumped 5/8;2wd;retreat/
Outrun Swd/ Off slow;
2-3wd

Off slow; 3wd; lug in/ /

3-4w turn;up show rail/ /

COMMENTS

Rebid rail;drew clear/
Prolonged pressure/ 5p
into lane; empty

In range;2wd;evenly/
Position 3w;wknd late/
Moved out5w;no menace
Mvd out turn;best rest/
Chased 2wd; tired/
Duel;svd gnd;clr;held

2wd; fought on inside/ Up
4wd late tn;drw clr/
Stumbled start;tired

Ins;4w 1/4;along show/
Swd 3/16p;rallied/
2p;drop back3/4;tired
Stalked 3wd; faded/ Bid
3wl/4p;vied 1/8p/ In
range ins; no kick



DATE  TRK #
3/10/22 GP
DATE  TRK #

3/10/22 GP 4

DT PP PRG

5.5 44

10

77

HORSE

ADMIRAL

AWESOME

UNIMPEACHE

THE RED

HIGH PRESS

VALHALLA

TORETTO

DOWNBURST

MIA CAMILA

TAG HER

LIGEIA

BIG

LONDON

TICKET TO

LUNA

AMBAR

SCHOOL

4>7

7>6

1157

7>4

1>5

1>5

3>4

7>6

7>6

352

1>5

9>6

553

352

LAST DS

$55,D5D

$55,D5D

$55,T>D

R>S, T>D

S$>S,D>D

S$>S,D>D

R>S,T>D

R>S,D>T

S$>S,D>T

S$>S,D>T

R>S, T>T

$>S,D>T

R>S,D>T

R>S,D>T

R>S,D>T

R>S,D>T

NOTES FROM LAST RACE

*#3wd; up 1/4; drew off (77)** Flashed
speed. *Pressed Pace from 5-hole. Fast
last race (11).BTL HORSE Class Change 20
Finished 1 from post 5 TIW= 39
**Finished after 3/8ths (61)** DROP
SWITCH Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
4-hole. Class Change -5 Finished 7 from
post 4 TIW= 47

**Rail; pace; weakened (63)** Flashed
speed. *Pressed Pace from
7-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed?
WATCH!BTL HORSE Clear early.Class Change
5 Finished 6 from post 7 TIW= 23
**vied;no match past 1/4 (72)** Flashed
speed. *Pressed Pace from
11-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed?
WATCH! 1st off 33 day layoff.Class
Change 5 Finished 7 from post 11 TIW= 24
**2-3wd btwn;flatten out (78)**THIRD OFF
MAYBE? Fast last race (15).BTL HORSE
Class Change @ Finished 4 from post 7
TW= 23

**Ins-2pth; faded str (71)** Class
Change @ Finished 5 from post 1 TIW= 64

**Rank into 1st; inside (76)** DROP
SWITCH Chased Pace.BTL HORSE 1st off 34
day layoff.Class Change -15 Finished 5
from post 1 TIW= 30

NOTES FROM LAST RACE

** (@)** 1st off 738224 day layoff.
FTS.Invalid last race. Finished @ from
post @ TiW= 27

**4wd;led;no match late (78)** Flashed
speed. *Pressed Pace from 8-hole. Clear
early.Invalid last race. Finished 3 from
post 8 TIW= 83

**Chased 3wd; no threat (75)** Flashed
speed. *Pressed Pace from 3-hole. 1st
off 47 day layoff.Invalid last race.
Finished 4 from post 3 TiW= 71

*#No factor; 3wd (59)** DROP SWITCH
Class Change -20 Finished 6 from post 7
TIW= 51

**pulled btw;shifteddw (72)** *Stretch
gain (1). Fast last race (13).BTL HORSE
Class Change @ Finished 6 from post 7
TIW= 30

*#3wd; no match (72)** Flashed speed.
Class Change -20 Finished 2 from post 3
TIW= 53

**Up clse 1/2;rebid;even (62)** Flashed
speed. *Stretch gain (1.25).BTL HORSE
1st off 60 day layoff.Invalid last race.
Finished 5 from post 1 TJW= 83

**Track pace;bid 3w;wknd (76)** Chased
Pace.Uncharacteristic race? Invalid last
race. Finished 6 from post 9 TIW= 72
**Traffic 2nd;4wd uppr (7@)** Made big
overall move (3). *Stretch gain (.25).
1st off 46 day layoff.Class Change 10
Finished 3 from post 5 TIW= 74
**5w;rallied;edged out (83)** Made big
overall move (6). *Stretch gain (2).BTL
HORSE Invalid last race. Finished 2 from
post 3 TIW= 51

SPD
110

66

71

63

73

61

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

#110

SPD
DS

66

ERR

71

63

75

61

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

82

ERR

ERR

#TDS

AVG
SPD

60

67

71

63

70

73

76

75

59

59

70

67

74

68

76

#R S1 S2

10

10

82

75

61

78

78

69

87

80

66

86

63

71

63

69

-7

103

46

84

80

54

90

78

70

71

48

89

48

98

TOT

75

161

122

Sys1

5.00

5.80

SYS2 CLOSE

6.20

5.90

6.60

5.50

6.30

5.70

8.60

5.50

6.30

5.00

3.30

Q.

Q.

Q.

0.

0.

1.

68

78

78

92

97

23

CLOSE

0.

71

.75

.83

A1

.20

.22

.50

.09

TDS1

3.10

ERR

10.00

7.20

6.00

10.00

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

TDS2

ERR

6.30

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

CLOSE

0.58

ERR

1.38

1.24

1.15

1.60

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

1.33

ERR

ERR

91

64

84

82

83

78

80

89

81

58

89

73

77

79

73

E2 PFN

84 86

64 74

82 69

86 86

85 78

79 79

78 80

91 76

81 67

48 98

93 70

65 66

75 79

71 74

71 95

LAST FIVE
SPEED RATINGS

77,65,68,55,69

61,67,67,69,81

63,61,60,61,76

72,71,61,73,68

78,73,0,63,68

71,75,78,59,68

76,80,80,75,69

LAST FIVE
SPEED RATINGS

78,74,0,0,0

75,0,0,0,0

59,0,0,0,0

72,68,63,32,0

72,76,59,68,73

62,72,0,0,0

76,70,74,68,82

70,66,0,8,0

83,80,74,66,0

HIGH

BYER DSLR AVG3

77 26
81 18
0 12
71 33
78 28
78 28
61 34
HIGH

BYER DSLR
") Hokokok
0 29
] 47
0 20
0 26
] 20
%) 60
82 29
] 46
] 29

65.

61.

68.

76.

75.

79.

76.

75.

59.

68.

69.

67.

73.

68.

79.

2]

2]

2]

BRIS P EQUIP MLINE

E/P 7
E 7
E/P 3
E o
P 2]
P 4
E/P 1
BRIS P
NA ©
E 1
NA 6
NA @
E/P ©
P 3
NA 1
P 1
P @
s e

BON

10.

20.

20.

5.

1.

15.

12.

12.

00

00

00

00

80

.00

00

00

.00

.00

.00

00

.00

128

93

75

60

TRK DIS
GP 5.5
GP 5.0
GP 7.5
GP 8.0
GP 5.5
GP 5.5
GP 8.0
TRK DIS

0.0
GP 8.5
GP 6.0
GP 6.0
TAM 8.5
GP 6.0
GP 8.3
GP 8.5
GP 8.3
GP 8.5

TYPE

CHNG

oC

C

C

oC

oC

oC

S>M

S>M

S>M

M>M

SPPNT

31.8

13.6

0.0

0.0

18.2

SPPNT

50.0

25.0

PWR

111

102

111

110

117

119

124

117

107

108

115

113

121

112

121

ERLY TOTL
PACE PACE
CLASS FINAL COMB TOTL LAST

13.9 90.0 103.9 169 255

87.8 96.4 91 151

82.5 82.8 128 202

83.3 91.6 166 235

12.9 90.8 103.7 168 254

12.9 88.3 101.2 168 246

14.2 86.0 100.2 157 236

ERLY
PACE

FINAL COMB TOTL

12.6 84.1 96.7 158 238

11.4 86.8 98.1 180 256

10.9 85.8 96.7 162 229

84.9 89.7 106 204

13.1 86.3 99.4 182 252

10.1 81.9 92.0 138 204

11.9 82.9 94.7 152 231

13.1 83.5 96.6 150 224

13.6 84.6 98.2 144 239

COMMENTS

3wd; up 1/4; drew off/
Vied outside;yielded/
Inside;outdueled;wknd

Finished after 3/8ths/
Vied outside; gave way/
Pace;vie;dug in gamely

Rail; pace; weakened/
Stalk pace; retreated/
St'd;c'rrd outlst turn

Vied;no match past 1/4/
S5wd 3/16; no rally/
Btwn;svd gnd;tired

2-3wd btwn;flatten out/
Swung 4w;drew clr late/
Lost rider;apprehended

Ins-2pth; faded str/
Stalked;all out str/
3-4w;led upr str;drvg
Rank into 1st; inside/
Brush&squeeze bck 1/8/ 5w
str;faded final fur

COMMENTS

4wd;led;no match late/
Carried out badly 3/16/

Chased 3wd; no threat/ /

No factor; 3wd/ /

Pulled btw;shifteddw/
Rail advance; 2d best/
Dueled rail; gave out

3wd; no match/ Bobbled
brk; rail trip/ In range
inside;wknd

Up clse 1/2;rebid;even/
Brk slw;showed little/

Track pace;bid 3w;wknd/
Reserved;up 3d 3wd btw/
Insd;came outl/4;split
Traffic 2nd;4wd uppr/

Saved ground;no rally/

Sw;rallied;edged out/
Bid; stayed on gamely/
3wd; just missed 2nd



ERLY TOTL

SPD SPD AVG LAST FIVE HIGH PACE PACE
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG  HORSE PPOT LAST DS NOTES FROM LAST RACE 110 #110 TDS #TDS SPD #R S1 S2 TOT SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDS1 TDS2 CLOSE E1 E2 PFN SPEED RATINGS BYER DSLR AVG3 BRIS P EQUIP MLINE CLS TRK DIS TYPE CHNG SPPNT PWR CLASS FINAL COMB TOTL LAST COMMENTS
3/10/22 GP 5 7.0 33 PRETTY 0>0 0>5,>D  ** (@)** 1st off 738224 day layoff. ERR 0 ERR @ ERR © 57 -9 48 ERR ERR  ERR ERR ERR  ERR 2] 2] 0,0,0,0,0 2] **kx ERR NA O 0 3.50 ERR 0.0 S >S 0.0 0.0 ERR ERR [} e/ /

FTS.Invalid last race. Finished @ from
post @ TIW= 101

7.6 55 EGYPTIAN 0>0 0>S,>D  ** (0)** 1st off 738224 day layoff. ERR 0 ERR @ ERR @ 57 -9 48 ERR ERR ERR ERR  ERR (2] (2] 0,0,0,0,0 2] Fokokk NA o @ 5.00 ERR 0.0 S >S 0.0 0.0 ERR ERR ] e/ /
FTS.Invalid last race. Finished @ from
post @ TIW= 72

7.6 66 FIRST TO 0>0 0>5,>D  ** (0)** 1st off 738224 day layoff. ERR 0 ERR @ ERR @ 57 -9 48 ERR ERR ERR ERR  ERR (2] (2] 0,0,0,0,0 2] Fokokk NA o @ 6.00 ERR 0.0 S >S 0.0 0.0 ERR ERR ] e/ /
FTS.Invalid last race. Finished @ from
post @ TIW= 71

7.0 22 EQUAL PAY 1>2 S$>S,D>D  **In hand 2p;clr; nailed (95)** Flashed 46 3 69 2 69 2 95 79174 1.30 6.70 0.20 1.30 6.70 0.20 98 112 77 95,43,0,0,0 95 185 69.0 E 7 © 1.40 190 SAR 7.0 S S>S 63.6 131 18.1 91.0 109.0 210 287 In hand 2p;clr; nailed/
speed. *Pressed Pace from 1-hole. Fast Coaxed 2p; folded/ Stmble
last race (26).BTL HORSE Clear early.lst 3/16; lost jock
off 185 day layoff.Class Change -20
Finished 2 from post 1 TIW= 111

7.0 44 SIEMPRE 8>5 R>S,D>D  **3wd into lane;no rally (78)** 1st off ERR 0 ERR @ 71 2 75 89163 7.40 6.80 1.08 ERR ERR ERR 71 71 87 78,64,0,0,0 (2] 47 71.0NA 0O © 8.00 168 GP 8.5 S S>S 0.0 114 11.6 81.4 93.0 142 229 3wd into lane;no rally/
47 day layoff.Class Change 2 Finished 5 Slow start;wide uppr/
from post 8 TIW= 64

7.6 11 BELLE OF 7>3 S>S,D>D  **Stalk 3wd; no match (75)** Flashed ERR 0 76 2 76 2 8 76164 4.20 3.20 1.33 4.20 3.20 1.33 90 94 73 75,76,0,0,0 76 32 76.0 E 4 0 4.50 158 GP 6.0 S S>S 36.4 118 13.7 85.9 99.6 184 257 Stalk 3wd; no match/ Bmpd

speed. *Pressed Pace from st;chasd3w;bmp1/8/
7-hole.Uncharacteristic race? 1st off 32
day layoff.Class Change 2 Finished 3
from post 7 TW= 29
ERLY TOTL
SPD SPD AVG LAST FIVE HIGH PACE PACE
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG  HORSE PPOT LAST DS NOTES FROM LAST RACE 110 #110 TDS #TDS SPD #R S1 S2 TOT SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDS1  TDS2 CLOSE E1 E2 PFN SPEED RATINGS BYER DSLR AVG3 BRIS P EQUIP MLINE CLS TRK DIS TYPE CHNG SPPNT PWR CLASS FINAL COMB TOTL LAST COMMENTS
3/10/22 GP 6 6.0 44 FACE OF 5>1 S>S,D>D  **Rail; pace; driving (95)** Flashed 91 5 91 8 8310 89 83 171 1.80 3.20 0.57 2.10 2.70 0.79 90 97 93 95,92,90,90,91 95 42 92.0 E/P 8 2] 0.80 145 GP 5.5 A CO>A  33.3 131 17.2 92.6 109.7 187 280 Rail; pace; driving/ Held
speed. *Pressed Pace from 5-hole.BTL stubbornly inside/
HORSE Clear early.lst off 42 day Rail;2w5/16;drift 1/16
layoff.Class Change 20 Finished 1 from
post 5 TIW= 83
6.0 11 GAME BOY 1>5 $>5,D>D  **Rail; no closing bid (86)**THIRD OFF 80 9 80 9 8010 87 80166 6.10 6.90 0.8 5.60 6.70 0.83 87 92 89 86,87,76,80,62 89 42 83.0 E/P 6 0 8.00 152 GP 5.5A CO>A  25.0 121 14.2 87.9 182.1 179 268 Rail; no closing bid/ 3w
MAYBE? Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from bid 1/4;flattnd out/ Near
1-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? rail; tired

WATCH! 1st off 42 day layoff.Class
Change 20 Finished 5 from post 1 TIW= 68
6.0 3 3 OHIO EAGLE 4>6 S>S,D>D  **Bobbled brk; outrun (72)** Class 74 9 74 9 7410 79 79158 7.30 6.99 1.6 7.106 6.70 1.6 81 79 83 72,69,75,78,76 81 1 72.0 E/P © 0 20.00 171 GP 6.0 A A 0.0 109 10.7 84.6 95.3 160 243 Bobbled brk; outrun/

Change 45 Finished 6 from post 4 TW= 27

Outrun;/ No factor

755 **Stalk pace;weakend trn (83)** Flashed 85 88 76 6.80 88 93 7 8.00 164 GP CO>A 8 Stalk pace;weakend trn/
speed.Uncharacteristic race? Class Stumbled start; inside/
Change 20 Finished 5 from post 7 TW= 87 Pressed winner 2wd

257 *#Wide trip;no response (65)**THIRD OFF 74 84 69 7.70 82 84 20 20.00 163 R>A Wide trip;no response/
MAYBE? DROP SWITCH Class Change -5 4wd 3/16p;no impact/
Finished 7 from post 2 TIW= 25 Steadily lost ground

454 **Head turned start; 4wd (87)** 1st off 87 86 81 6.70 84 92 42 3.50 155 CO>A 5 Head turned start; 4wd/
42 day layoff.Class Change 20 Finished 4 4wd bid turn; evenly/
from post 4 TIW= 81 2&3w;drew off;drvg

8>2 *#3wd; rally btw; up 2nd (83)** Made big 84 81 86 4.80 88 91 35 6.00 126 A 4 3wd; rally btw; up 2nd/

overall move (5). *Stretch gain
(1.75).BTL HORSE 1st off 35 day
layoff.Class Change 40 Finished 2 from
post 8 TIW= 44

3wd turn;no rally/ Took
over turn;driving



DATE  TRK #

3/10/22 GP 7

12

13

11

10

14

12

13

SENORA

PHANTOM

LEXINATOR

FOUZIA

DIRTY

MY DESTINY

JEANIE B

REINAGOL

MILLENNIUM

WHIMSICAL

TIPLE

HONEY

VIOLENZA

RICHIES

8>1

6>6

4>7

1>6

552

757

1>3

6>5

7>6

11>9

8>9

6>2

LAST DS

$55,T>T

$55,D5T

$55,D5T

$55,D5T

$55,D5T

S>S,D>T

S>S,T>T

S>S,T>T

S>S,D>T

R>S,T>T

S$>S,D>T

S>S,T>T

S$>S,T>T

$>S,D>T

SPD
NOTES FROM LAST RACE 110
**Bumped st;pressed rail (84)**THIRD OFF
MAYBE? DROP SWITCH Flashed speed.
*Pressed Pace from 1-hole. Clear
early.Class Change -30 Finished 3 from
post 1 TIW= 86
**Slim lead;dug in;game (91)** Flashed
speed. *Pressed Pace from 8-hole.BTL
HORSE Clear early.lst off 46 day
layoff.Class Change @ Finished 1 from
post 8 TIW= 69
**Stlk;wknd late (77)** Flashed speed
*Pressed Pace from 6-hole.BTL HORSE
Clear early.lst off 143 day layoff.Class
Change 24 Finished 6 from post 6 TIW= 33
**Hard bump brk;faded 3w (75)** 1st off
57 day layoff.Class Change @ Finished 7
from post 4 TIW= 83
**Stallked;evn out 16th (81)**BTL HORSE
1st off 152 day layoff.Class Change -16
Finished 6 from post 1 TIW= 53
**pace btw;dueled inside (86)** Flashed
speed. *Pressed Pace from
5-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed?
WATCH!BTL HORSE Clear early.Class Change
-5 Finished 2 from post 5 TIW= 89
**Failed to threaten (85)** DROP SWITCH
1st off 180 day layoff.Class Change -21
Finished 7 from post 7 TIW= 57
**Bump early; rail trip (80)** DROP
SWITCH *Stretch gain (.25).BTL HORSE
Class Change -30@ Finished 3 from post 1
TIW= 72
**3-4w;mild rally (78)** DROP SWITCH
Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
6-hole.BTL HORSE 1st off 103 day
layoff.Class Change -16 Finished 5 from
post 6 TIW= 80
**Took over 3wd 1/4;drvg (88)** Flashed
speed. *Pressed Pace from 5-hole.BTL
HORSE 1st off 77 day layoff.Class Change
49 Finished 1 from post 5 TIW= 42
**Lagged back; no factor (76)** *Stretch
gain (.75).BTL HORSE 1st off 57 day
layoff.Class Change @ Finished 6 from
post 7 TIW= 47
**Inside turn;no factor (77)** DROP
SWITCH 1st off 146 day layoff.Class
Change -24 Finished 9 from post 11 TIW=
89
**3wd;5wd upr;tired (70)** DROP SWITCH
Slow last race (14). 1st off 146 day
layoff.Class Change -21 Finished 9 from
post 8 TIW= 41
**Steady bid;3wd;2nbest (86)** Class
Change 25 Finished 2 from post 6 TJIW= 79

82

ERR

83

80

80

83

77

81

83

ERR

85

80

SPD
#110 TDS

AVG
#TDS SPD

#R S1 S2 TOT

10

10

10

10

10

10

10

10

10

87

87

88

91

86

82

85

87

57

85

82

85

85

84

80

88

81

42

93

82

80

79

81

88

98

78

Sys1

SYS2 CLOSE

3.10

5.40

5.00

3.80

3.90

5.80

3.00

TDS1

TDS2 CLOSE

95

92

92

92

90

87

81

86

85

85

71

92

93

E2 PFN

87

93

91

89

88

84

87

100

87

82

74

79

86

87

91

82

90

81

81

7

Ul

81

LAST FIVE
SPEED RATINGS

84,80,81,90,88

91,79,89,80,78

77,85,82,84,79

75,83,83,87,78

81,83,82,53,69

86,88,84,86,85

85,93,81,85,89

80,84,83,74,85

78,84,89,80,82

88,84,90,89,84

76,84,82,84,86

77,79,85,85,80

70,87,89,92,85

86,83,76,80,87

HIGH

BYER DSLR AVG3

89

9%

87

91

87

93

91

82

88

92

93

92

87

143

57

152

26

180

26

103

77

57

146

146

20

86.

81.

80.

82.

86.

86.

82.

87.

81.

80.

82.

82.

2]

2]

0

0

0

BRIS P EQUIP MLINE

140 15.6 92.0

E/P 5
E/P 5
E/P 6
E 4
P 2
E/P 6
E/P 5
P 3
P 4
E/P ©
s o
P2
P 1
P2

30.

15.

20.

12.

12.

20.

15.

.50

00

00

00

.00

.50

.00

00

00

00

.00

00

.00

187

213

TRK DIS

TAM 5.0
GP 5.0
PID 6.0
GP 5.0
WO 5.0
TAM 6.0
KD 6.5
GP 5.0
Wo 5.5
GP 8.0
GP 5.0
BEL 7.0
KEE 5.5
GP 5.5

TYPE CHNG
A N>A
A AO0>A
A AO>A
A AO>A
A AO>A
A N>A
A G3>A
A N>A
A AO>A
A A
A AO0>A
A N>A
A G3>A
A R>A

SPPNT

11.1

13.3

13.3

11.1

2.2

PWR CLASS FINAL

132

115

127

124

130

142

133

129

137

121

131

126

137

16.

14.

13.

14.

16.

14.

14

14.

16.

12.

14.

16.

4

9

3

.8

2]

93.

88.

89.

89.

91.

88.

93.

89.

88.

89.

88.

83.

89.

2

5

5

7

1

7

2]

2

9

8

3

1

ERLY TOTL
PACE PACE
COMB  TOTL LAST

107.5 96 175

109.6 95 182

102.9 179 261

103.2 92 166

1e4.6 92 17

a

107.2 183 269

103.0 178 265

107.8 81 17

N

104.0 257

105.8 173 263

102.2 85 166

102.3 155 236

86.1 179 254

105.1 193 274

COMMENTS

Bumped st;pressed rail/
Pace 2path;wknd inside/
Leapt start;duel;flat

Slim lead;dug in;game/
Sound bump 1st turn/
Ins;btw3/16;yield late

Stlk;wknd late/ Inside;no
late gain/ Position;wknd
final fu

Hard bump brk;faded 3w/
2w;mvd inj;lasted place/
Brk in;4wl/4;left lead
Stallked;evn out 16th/
3-4w;rallied outside/
3-4w;gaining late

Pace btw;dueled inside/
Rail; confident handle/
3-4wd bid;flattten out

Failed to threaten/
Caught near wire/ In hand
2p; inched clr

Bump early; rail trip/
Hard bump brk;3w;held/
Solid bump brk;4w3/16p

3-4w;mild rally/ Off
slw;up in deep str/
Stalked;2-3w;rallied

Took over 3wd 1/4;drvg/
3p;outside;late gain/
Tracked;bid1/4;2nbest

Lagged back; no factor/
5w upper; kept on/ 3w
trn;5wl/4;no0 threat

Inside turn;no factor/ 5w
upper; no response/
2-3w;all out stretch

3wd;5wd upr;tired/ 5Sw;
belatedly/ shift
6wd;edged away

Steady bid;3wd;2nbest/
Getting to winner late/
Midpack inside; no bid



DATE  TRK #

3/10/22 GP 8

DATE  TRK #

3/10/22 6P 9

10

PRG

10

HORSE

JET FORCE

CANCEL

STELLAR

FROSTY

DOLL BABY

SHE'S SO

AMANI'S

RAPTUROUS

HORSE

FRAGEELAY

WARWOMAN

WINNING

KELSEY'S

PRETTYKEEN

Ooxomoc

HARD ROCK

MILES OF

KATNISS

PPOT

3>

S

1>1

6>,

[

551

1>6

45

h

6>2

PPOT

0>0

0>0

4>5

4>7

2>4

5>

e

256

555

4>4

LAST DS

$55,D5D

R>S,D>D

$55,D5D

$55,D5D

S$>S,D>D

S$>S,D>D

S$>S,D>D

S$>S,D>D

0>5,>T

0>5,>T

0>5,>T

R>S,D>T

S$>S,T>T

R>S,D>T

$55,D5T

$55,T>T

$55,D5T

$55,D5T

SPD
NOTES FROM LAST RACE 110
**3-4p trn;bmpdl/4;empty (56)** DROP
SWITCH Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
3-hole. Slow last race (12). 1st off 32
day layoff.Class Change -3@ Finished 7
from post 3 TIW= 39
**Stumbled st;no bid;2wd (71)** 1st off
32 day layoff.Class Change @ Finished 4
from post 3 TIW= 57
**pace;game;held firm (78)** Flashed
speed. *Pressed Pace from
1-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed?
WATCH!BTL HORSE Clear early.lst off 60
day layoff.Class Change 25 Finished 1
from post 1 TiW= 71
**Inside turn;headed1/4 (73)** Flashed
speed. *Pressed Pace from
6-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed?
WATCH! 1st off 98 day layoff.Class
Change -8 Finished 2 from post 6 TIW= 71
**pace 2path; driving (85)** Flashed
speed. *Pressed Pace from 5-hole.BTL
HORSE Clear early.lst off 39 day
layoff.Class Change 25 Finished 1 from
post 5 TIW= 83
**Brief speed; eased up (48)** DROP
SWITCH Flashed speed. Slow last race
(23). 1st off 33 day layoff.Class Change
-25 Finished 6 from post 1 TIW= 66
**Trackd2p; tippd3p;split (69)**BTL HORSE
1st off 76 day layoff.Class Change 47
Finished 1 from post 4 TIW= 80
**Ridden along;rally ins (77)** Made big
overall move (3). 1st off 42 day
layoff.Class Change 5 Finished 2 from
post 6 TIW= 53

68

ERR

73

85

65

74

ERR

NOTES FROM LAST RACE

** (@)** 1st off 738224 day layoff.
FTS.Invalid last race. Finished @ from
post @ TIW= 83

** (@)** 1st off 738224 day layoff.
FTS.Invalid last race. Finished @ from
post @ TIW= 65

**k (@)** 1st off 738224 day layoff.
FTS.Invalid last race. Finished @ from
post @ TIW= 32

**In range ins;gavewy (68)** Flashed
speed. Invalid last race. Finished 5
from post 4 TIW= 71

**0ff pace;2w;no rally (74)** DROP
SWITCH Made big overall move (3). 1st
off 180 day layoff.Class Change -43
Finished 7 from post 4 TJIW= 80
**Inside;3wd;mild imprve (70)** Made big
overall move (3). *Stretch gain (.5).
Fast last race (11). 2 races in one
pattern.Invalid last race. Finished 4
from post 2 TIW= 45

**Bump st;stdy 7/16;ins (61)** DROP
SWITCH 1st off 32 day layoff.Class
Change -25 Finished 6 from post 5 TJIW=
77

**Save ground;no kick (69)** Invalid
last race. Finished 6 from post 2 TIW=
57

**Speed btw; rail turn (73)** Flashed
speed.Uncharacteristic race? Invalid
last race. Finished 5 from post 5 TIW=
32

*#No menace inside (65)** DROP SWITCH
Made big overall move (3). Class Change
-20 Finished 4 from post 4 TW= 16

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

#110

SPD
DS

70

69

72

85

72

74

80

ERR

ERR

ERR

69

ERR

ERR

69

ERR

ERR

#TDS

AVG
SPD

68

69

68

85

71

76

80

ERR

ERR

67

64

59

61

69

74

65

#R S1 S2

82

91

89

93

85

92

84

57

57

68

75

66

85

65

86

79

78

80

75

78

58

74

77

85

88

89

72

77

74

TOT SYS1
146 2.80
159 4.1
176  3.50
163 4.60
176  1.40
142 5.30
166 5.90
160 5.80
TOT SYS1
48 ERR
48 ERR
48 ERR
152 7.1
162 4.10
154 8.20
156 7.80
64 6.70
163 6.30
152 10.00

SYS2 CLOSE TDS1

3.60

5.00

ERR

ERR

8.60

7.60

6.70

5.00

5.70

0.78 2.80
0.86 2.80
0.88 3.50
0.92 2.70
1.0 1.40
1.22 5.70
1.46 6.70
2.25 5.80
CLOSE  TDS1
ERR ERR
ERR

ERR

0.83 ERR
1.0 3.40
1.07 ERR
1.17 ERR
1.33  6.70
1.50 ERR
1.75 ERR

TDS2 CLOSE E1

3.40

4.00

2.00

4.30

ERR

ERR

ERR

4.00

ERR

ERR

5.00

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

ERR

0.86

ERR

ERR

1.33

ERR

ERR

75

93

100

91

87

87

87

70

80

62

84

83

85

76

E2

92

75

93

95

98

83

89

90

67

76

64

84

82

78

PFN

42

74

77

63

77

41

63

79

72

87

80

65

77

76

76

LAST FIVE
SPEED RATINGS

56,78,70,0,0

71,61,72,63,74

78,59,0,0,0

73,60,70,0,0

85,0,0,0,0

48,74,84,82,73

69,83,75,77,0

77,84,79,80,80

LAST FIVE

SPEED RATINGS

0,0,0,0,0

0,0,0,0,0

0,0,0,0,0

68,65,0,0,0

74,67,67,47,0

70,68,69,39,47

61,0,0,0,0

69,0,0,0,0

73,79,69,0,0

65,0,0,0,0

HIGH

BYER DSLR
78 32
74 32
78 60
73 98
85 39
84 33
77 76
84 a2
HIGH

BYER DSLR
@ kEx
@ kEx
@ REEx
0 21
74 180
] 21
2 32
69 22
] 13
] 20

AVG3

68.0

69.0

68.0

85.0

69.0

76.0

80.0

67.0

69.0

69.0

61.0

69.0

74.0

65.0

BRIS P EQUIP MLINE

E/P 4
E/P 1
E 4
E/P 4
E 6
P2
P2
P 3
BRIS P
N
N
N
N0
E 4
E ©
N1
N
s 2
N

10.

3.

12.

5

15.

12.

[

15.

»

20.

.00

.00

.00

.50

00 189

167

196

00

168

00 185

171

173

00

00 59

.00 168

0o -7

50 49

00 163

CLS TRK DIS TYPE
177 AQU 7.0 A
G 8.0A
G 6.0A
AU 7.0 A
G 7.0A
G 7.0A
TAM 7.6 A
GP 5.5A
TRK DIS TYPE
0.0 M
0.0 M
0.0 M
G 8.5M
KD 6.5M
GP 8.5M
G 6.0M
G 5.0M
G 7.0M
G 6.0M

CHNG

S>A

S>A

G3>A

S>A

ASA

S>M

S>M

S>M

15.

15.

23.

11.

4

4

1

SPPNT

57.

14.

28.

®

3

6

ERLY
PACE

TOTL
PACE

PWR CLASS FINAL COMB TOTL LAST

11.2 84.1 95.4 183 225

118

119

121

126

120

121

123

13.

13.

14.

16.

13.

4

7

5

2

9

83.6

97.0

88.2 101.9

83.2

97.7

87.2 103.3

82.3

84.7

86.6

98.5

87.8 102.4

150

186

195

189

170

176

177

ERLY
PACE

PWR CLASS FINAL COMB TOTL

110 1e.
116 10.
108
108
105
113 11.
101 8

4

4

5

82.3

86.0

82.1

85.5

88.7

85.2

86.8

92.7

96.4

91.4

94.6

93.5

96.8

95.2

137

156

126

168

83

167

154

224

263

258

26

k)

211

23

©

256

209

243

206

233

160

243

230

COMMENTS

3-4p trn;bmpd1/4;empty/
2p;drew clear; driving/ 4
wide move;edged clr

Stumbled st;no bid;2wd/
Bobbld st;4p upr;tired/
Bmp st; str; inchd clr

Pace;game;held firm/ No
factor; 4wd/

Inside turn;headedl/4/
Lunge st; faltered/
4-3w;floated;rddn out

Pace 2path; driving/ /

Brief speed; eased up/
Mvd in stretch; no bid/
Angled rail; no rally;

Trackd2p;tippd3p;split/
Track pace;3w;2nd best/
Bumped st; weakened
Ridden along;rally ins/
Sw run turn;clear late/
Led;dueled;wknd late

COMMENTS

/7

In range ins;gavewy/ Veer
in strt;no bid/

Off pace;2w;no rally/
Prompted winner; wknd/
Overrun both sides str
Inside;3wd;mild imprve/

3-4wd;steadied top str/
Hit gate;svd gnd;empty

Bump st;stdy 7/16;ins/ /

Save ground;no kick/ /

Speed btw; rail turn/
3-4w turn;went clr plc/
Slw brk;swung5w;mildly

No menace inside/ /



DATE

3/10/22

TRK #

GP

[GRC RGN RVRUNV NV
OO0

WNWONA VR
WNWONAUVR

PRG HORSE NAME DSLR MEDS

STORMY
CENTSATION
LETS RUN
MAGNOLIA
DANCE FOR
BRAIN
BLAME THE
ROUGH

HORSE NAME

DSLR

RRRPERRRRRER

Down 2+ classes
2nd career race
2nd career race
Maiden Clming
1stTimeBlinkers
1st after clm
Rte to Sprint
2nd strt w/trn

STS

982

WIN

10

KEY2 STS
Maiden Clming 204
Maiden Clming 344
1stTimeBlinkers 42
Dirt to AW 28
Shipper 2
Rte to Sprint 43
Maiden Clming 6

2nd off layoff 7

All Weather
All Weather
Maiden Clming
All Weather
2nd strt w/trn
Maiden Clming
All Weather
2nd time Lasix

STS

145

WIN

.36

Sprints

Sprints

All Weather
Sprints

2nd off layoff
All Weather
Sprints

Down 2+ classes

STS

*okok

WIN

Sprints

2nd time Lasix
Sprints

Maiden Clming

STS WIN

407

188 5

-0.30

-2.00
-1.34

-1.90

Maiden Clming

All Weather

7 14

-0.14

-2.00

Sprints
Sprints
Sprints
Sprints
Sprints
Sprints
Sprints
Sprints

136

138
88

ROI T3J% MLINE

WONWONAUVR

3/10/22

CHUCKY
MISH

MAN ON THE
EMBRACE MY
NIXON JOY
KHOZY MY

HORSE NAME

DSLR

1st after clm
Wnr last race
Routes
Routes
Routes
2nd after clm

KEY2 STS
Routes kK
Sprnt-Sprnt-Rte 47
Dirt starts 900
Dirt starts 67
Dirt starts 285

2nd strt w/trn 7

-0.
-0.
-2.

.35

Dirt starts
Sprint to Rte

2nd off layoff

24

-1.64

Routes

Routes

126

-1.04

Dirt starts

Dirt starts

125

-0.90

STS WIN

215

3/10/22

THE RED
ADMIRAL
AWESOME
VALHALLA
TORETTO
UNIMPEACHE
HIGH PRESS

HORSE NAME

DSLR

Sprnt-Rte-Sprnt
Mdn win L/R
Claiming

1st after clm
Rte to Sprint
Claiming

3rd off layoff

.43

.31

Claiming

All Weather
Sprints

Btn favorite
Turf to AW
All Weather
All Weather

Turf to AW
Sprints

Claiming
All Weather
Sprints
Sprints

All Weather

All Weather
Sprints

Sprints

Sprints

15

-0.77

Sprints
Sprints
Sprints
Sprints
Sprints
Sprints
Sprints

3/10/22

[y

)

LUNA
TICKET TO
LONDON
AMBAR

TAG HER
LIGEIA
SCHOOL

MIA CAMILA
BIG
DOWNBURST

HORSE NAME

1st after clm
46-90daysAway
1st on grass

46-90daysAway
46-90daysAway
1st on grass

1st on grass

1st on grass

Shipper

1st time str

KEY2 STS
Rte to Sprint 12
Claiming 182
All Weather 787
2nd off layoff 31
Claiming 102
Turf to AW 4
Claiming 248

KEY2 STS
Turf starts 168
1st on grass 65
Dirt to Turf 209
1st on grass 19
1st on grass 240

2nd career race 166
Turf starts 710
Turf starts 144

2nd time Lasix 1

.62

Rte to Sprint
2nd time Lasix
Turf starts

2nd time Lasix
2nd career race
Dirt to Turf
Rte to Sprint
Rte to Sprint
Turf starts
Turf starts

Sprints

Turf starts
Sprints

Turf starts
Dirt to Turf
Turf starts
Btn favorite
AW to Turf
Sprints
Sprints

AW to Turf

AW to Turf
Turf starts
Sprints
AW to Turf
Sprints

*okok
*okok

184

-0.15

-2.00
-0.42
-0.58
-2.00
-0.67

Sprints

Sprints
Sprints

Sprints

333

kKK

626

-0.25

0.45
-0.46

-0.88

731
420

=y

=y

[y

3

)

3/10/22

BELLE OF
EQUAL PAY
PRETTY
SIEMPRE
FIRST TO
EGYPTIAN

HORSE NAME

1st time lasix
90+ days away
1st time str
46-90daysAway
1st time str
1st time str

Sprints
Btn favorite
Maiden Sp Wt
Sprints
Maiden Sp Wt
Maiden Sp Wt

Dirt starts
Maiden Sp Wt
Sprints
Dirt starts
Sprints
Sprints

421

563

Sprints
Dirt starts

Dirt starts
Dirt starts

850

476
724

STS WIN

-0.49
-0.49

-0.57
-0.09

Dirt starts

*okok

STS WIN

Sprints
Sprints
Sprints
Sprints
Sprints
Sprints

3/10/22

AEQUOR
FACE OF
UNCORK THE
DOO WOP
OHIO EAGLE
KRAMMY BOY
GAME BOY

Rte to Sprint

Wnr last race

Sprints

1st after clm

1st after clm

3rd off layoff
3rd off layoff

46
49

.09

.07

Debut Turf 10

KEY2 STS
Maiden Sp Wt 12
Shipper 867
Debut MdnSpWt 553
Maiden Sp Wt 218
Debut MdnSpWt 165
Debut MdnSpWt 187

KEY2 STS
Sprints 47
Sprints Hokok
Dirt starts 532
AW to Dirt 19
Sprints 450
Sprints 450
Sprints 279

Dirt starts
Dirt starts

Sprints

Dirt starts
Dirt starts
Dirt starts

318
620
620
255

-0.24
-0.46
-0.46

0.76

Dirt starts

313

14 -0.67

Sprints
Sprints
Sprints
Sprints
Sprints
Sprints
Sprints



DATE  TRK #

PRG HORSE NAME

DSLR

MEDS

STS WIN

STS WIN

STS WIN

STS WIN

STS WIN

STS WIN

ROI TJ% MLINE

3/10/22 GP

DATE  TRK #

[y

2 FOUZIA
REINAGOL
MILLENNIUM
3 WHIMSICAL
5 JEANIE B

8  DIRTY

7  PHANTOM

4 HONEY

1  VIOLENZA

9 TIPLE

MY DESTINY
LEXINATOR

HORSE NAME

180

3rd off layoff
Turf starts
46-90daysAway
Turf starts
90+ days away
46-90daysAway
90+ days away
90+ days away
46-90daysAway
90+ days away
90+ days away
46-90daysAway
Dirt to Turf
90+ days away

334

736
736
ok
330
223
98
1 9
35 6

.32

.58
.73
.46
.33
.49
.51

Turf starts
Btn favorite
Turf starts
Allowance
Shipper

1st after clm
Shipper
Shipper

Wnr last race
Shipper
Shipper

Turf starts
Turf starts
1st start w/trn

191

Hokok

432

250

.21
.45
.58
.51
.51
.26
.57
.60
.33
.69
.00

Allowance
Allowance
Btn favorite
Sprints

Turf starts
Wnr last race
Turf starts
Turf starts
Turf starts
Turf starts
Turf starts
Allowance
Allowance
Turf starts

.61

.38

.38

Sprints
AW to Turf
Allowance

Allowance
Turf starts
Allowance
Allowance
Allowance
Allowance
Allowance
AW to Turf
Sprints

Btn favorite

13
15
16
16
15
19
14

13
16

-0.
-0.
-0.
-0.
-0.
-0.
-0.
-2.
.65
.77

56
56
31
39
52
00

Sprints
AW to Turf

AW to Turf
Allowance
Sprints

AW to Turf
AW to Turf
Sprints
Sprints
Sprints

Allowance

118
344
Hokok
378
110
699
850
210

94 5

-0.
-0.
-0.
-0.
-0.
-0.
-0.
-0.

w

(]
8
46
73

Ul

20
59
54

Sprints

Sprints
Sprints

Sprints
Sprints

AW to Turf

653
744

Kok
Hokok

-0.25

-0.26
-0.55

-0.46
-0.48

-2.00

649
822
731
350
513
201
686
780
371
478
265
178

113
118
121

32

27
154
176

68

3/10/22 GP

DATE  TRK #

NNNNNNNN
OO0

AONUVTWNDPR©

AMANI'S
STELLAR
SHE'S SO
RAPTUROUS
FROSTY
DOLL BABY
JET FORCE
CANCEL

AONUVTWNDPR©

HORSE NAME

DSLR

46-90daysAway
46-90daysAway
2nd time Lasix
Allowance

90+ days away
Mdn win L/R
1st time lasix
2nd off layoff

132

.13

.55
.19

1st start w/trn
2nd time Lasix
Allowance
Sprints

1st time lasix
Allowance
Shipper

2nd time Lasix

sokok
61
191
192
39

.19

1st time lasix
Mdn win L/R
Sprints

Dirt starts
Shipper
Sprints
Allowance

Rte to Sprint

407
Hokok
361
817
164 20

73 8

.25
.53
.49
.36

Mdn win L/R
Allowance
Dirt starts

Allowance
Dirt starts
Sprints
Allowance

376
819
412
281

-0.
-0.
.02
-0.

47

66

Allowance
Sprints
Sprints

Dirt starts
Sprints

264

566
491

20
13

-0.37

0.05
-0.65

Sprints
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2nd career race
2nd off layoff
1st on grass
Turf starts

1st time str
1st time str
1st time str
90+ days away
1st on grass
Dirt to Turf
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2nd grass race
2nd time Lasix
2nd career race
Rte to Sprint
Debut Turf
Debut Turf
Debut Turf
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Dirt to Turf
Turf starts
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AW to Turf
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Rte to Sprint
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