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137.5 2.00
113.5 6.00
152.7 2.50
126.3 8.00
125.6 8.00
125.0 6.00
165.6 15.00
107.0 4.00
POWER MLINE
113.5 4.00
114.1  2.50
108.7 8.00
113.7 1.60
110.2 8.00
101.2 10.00
104.0 8.00
POWER MLINE
117.0  1.60
111.0 8.00
115.0  1.80
113.3 5.00
111.7 6.00
107.3 6.00
POWER MLINE
118.6  2.50
107.3 4.00
111.1 6.00
117.9 5.00
97.3 12.00
108.6 10.00
100.5 12.00
119.4 3.00
112.7 8.00
105.9 15.00
100.3 15.00

69,63,80,68,85
73,60,81,78,58
63,71,56,67,71
72,74,58,72,75
0,67,67,68,72
0,0,0,0,0

72,63,54,53,74

LAST FIVE FIGS
68,81,80,77,76
77,74,76,80,77
73,81,68,73,78
69,75,77,88,71
72,85,72,67,78

75,66,68,49,0

LAST FIVE FIGS
79,0,0,0,0

72,76,78,78,73
68,84,72,70,73

74,78,65,0,0
55,77,71,80,81

55,71,71,73,69
66,70,0,0,0
78,76,76,73,60
82,73,76,74,80
61,0,0,0,0
61,0,0,0,0

100

108

27

113

TIW%

108
24

81

TIW%

113
134

85
144

68

60

89

52

121
128

139
139
126

139

132
140

142

3wd;checked near wire
Chased 3-4w;best rest
Chased 4wd; weakened

Bit slow; blocked 3/8
Lack speed;late effort

Vie ins;led late;naild

Crowded bit st;inside

COMMENT
Off bit slow; 4wd trip
Bumped start;no menace
Outside; weakened
Bpd st;5-3wd;no rally
Off bit slow; 3-4wide

4w turns;reeled in foe

COMMENT
Off slw;jmp track erly

2-3wd turns; empty
Chased 2path; no bid

Off slow; checked 3/4
3-4wd;5wd;nvr involved

Bpd st;tght/steady 2nd
Lacked rm/angl in 2nd
Pressed; 2nd best

Hit gate; waited 2nd

Off slw;steadied early
Hit gate/off slow;ins

431

419

402

BEST
OVERAL

505

506
506

462

BEST
OVERAL

289
282

281
274

259

264

277

276

252
252

391

345

337
341

321

190
175

189
150

158

174

200

214

174
168

431

419

793

TOTALS

850

843
847

783

TOTALS

479
457

471
424

416

438

477

490

426
420



3/7/22

MUSICA
AMERICAN

SECRET

L BEE

MARTINI
KIRSTENB

S>S
S>S

S>S

R>S

0>S
0>S

D>D

T>D
>D
>D

MOVING?

F/PP/FLR+ 83Y(6>2) Class Change ©
F/PP/WATCH/ESP/Y(4>3) Class Change

[}

F/PP/FLR+ 67WATCH/Y(7>6) Class

Change ©

FLR+ 59N(6>11) Class Change -2

Y(0>0)
Y(0>0)

MOVING?

67

59
ERR
ERR

67

ERR
ERR
ERR

o ®

67

ERR
ERR
ERR

RD

AVGSPD
PLUSL3

ERR

ERR
ERR

AVGSPD
PLUSL3

SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDS1 TDS2 CLOSE

SYs1

9.2
ERR
ERR

SYs2

0.9
ERR
ERR

CLOSE

ERR
ERR
ERR

ERR
ERR
ERR

ERR
ERR
ERR

BROT1 E1 E2 LST

51.71
ERR
ERR

Last

DSLR

37

120
Hokskok

sokokok

BTOT

HIGH
BRIS

HIGH
BRIS

LAST FIVE FIGS

83,0,0,0,0
80,87,65,76,75

67,0,0,0,0
59,0,0,0,0

0,0,0,0,0
0,0,0,0,0

LAST FIVE FIGS

TIW%

79
178

232
116

TIW%

170

172
ERR
ERR

Off slow;bid 3dp;yield
Duel inside; clear 3rd

Outside;btwn trn;wknd

Inside;never involved

COMMENT

BEST

OVERAL

808

725

652

ERR
ERR

BEST
OVERAL

BEST
LAST

489

400

2]

TOTALS

1052
ERR
ERR

TOTALS

3/7/22

BIG
CHERUBIC

COMMANDE
EXPLOSIV

SWISS
GENERAL

WEARENOT
MYy
THANKS

S$>S

S>S
R>S

R>S
R>S

S>S
S>S
R>S

D>T
™T

T
™T

D>T
T
T

BTL/SG:2.25/N(5>6) Class Change 10
BTL/SG:4.25/UN?/Y(1>3) Class Change

20

F/PP/Y(3>7) Class Change -30
F/PP/WATCH/ESP/Y(2>2) Class Change

10

F/PP/WATCH/Y(5>5) Class Change 20
BTL/BOM:5/BM1:5/BM3:5.44/BM++/SG:5.
44/SP+11/Y(5>2) Class Change 19
CP/BOM:3/Y(5>2) Class Change 35
F/PP/SP+11/Y(4>1) Class Change 40
F/SP+11/Y(4>9) Class Change 20

MOVING?

84
79

80
ERR

ERR
81
79

86
81

79
ERR

ERR
81
79

80

78

62

AVGSPD
PLUSL3

Sys1

SYS2

CLOSE

TDS1

TDS2

58.88
56.82

57
55

.49
.88

59.
59.
.39

81

96
98

106
81

91
94
83

94
95

106
9

90

81

73
78

57
92

263
271

269
263

267
274
235

65
14

17
182

30

52

263
366

371
337

267
274
322

93
88

87
9

77,80,86,87,93
87,88,80,93,82

76,71,69,93,88
85,86,81,86,77

82,87,81,79,82
90,84,81,74,67

83,85,72,63,80

86,84,73,76,62
72,78,82,68,43

LAST FIVE FIGS

143
53

80

192
53

TIW%

207
176

175
162

155

147

2w;angl out;mild rally
2-3wd; late effort

Little left inside
Met bid;clear;yielded

Bpd 2x st;stalk 2w;wkn
Late rally; lost bob

Stlkd;ins;2nd best

Came out;bmpd 2x turn
Stalked inside; tired

COMMENT

336
339

335
334

333
334
291

BEST
OVERAL

215
231

226
234

226
233
198

551
569

561
568

559

567
489

TOTALS

F/PP/FLR+ 84ESP/Y(5>1) Class Change 84

3/7/22

FRANKLIN
MOOSE

ONEPARTI
WHAT IN

BIG PAPA

S>S
S>S
R>S
S>S

S>S

T>D

D>D

D>D

D>D

25

BOM:4/SG:2.5/N(6>3) Class Change ©
F/PP/BTL/ESP/Y(3>2) Class Change ©
BOM:3/FLR+ 11WATCH/Y(5>1) Class

Change 50

SP-11/SLR?- 206N(5>5) Class Change

-30

F/PP/UN?/Y(3>1) Class Change 45

MOVING?

81
79
76
73

71

ERR

ERR

74

72

AVGSPD
PLUSL3

SYs1

SYs2

CLOSE

257

327

238

251

84,0,0,0,0
81,81,80,0,0
86,81,75,83,80
82,71,74,0,0
62,82,75,0,0

74,68,0,0,0

LAST FIVE FIGS

121

135

191

100

TIW%

Vie 3dp;duel;clr;held

Chck early;lack rm trn
Prss;duel;led;2nd best
Off slw;3w;clear;lastd

Angled in turn; tired

2w;asked 1/8;responded

COMMENT

518

466

492

482

BEST
OVERAL

340
361
334

287

858

800

779

803

TOTALS

3/7/22

DT PP PRG
6.5 4 4
6.5 6 6
6.5 3 3
6.5 1 1
6.5 5 5
6.5 2 2
DT PP PRG
6.5 6 6
6.5 5 5
6.5 4 4
6.5 9 9
6.5 7 7
6.5 1 1
6.5 3 3
6.5 2 2
6.5 8 8
DT PP PRG
6.6 6 6
6.6 2 2
6.6 5 5
6.6 1 1
6.6 4 4
6.6 3 3
DT PP PRG
8.0 1 1
8.0 8 8
8.0 7 7
8.6 6 6
8.0 10 10
8.6 4 4
8.6 5 5
8.0 11 11
8.0 2 2
8.0 3 3
8.6 9 9

ANNIE'S
DUVET

BANJO
EXIT
MIDNIGHT
SUNROOF
GRANOLA

ROCK THE
ELEUTHER

SQUILLIO
RHEA

R>R
R>R

S>R
R>R
S>R
S>R
S>R

R>R
R>R

R>R
S>R

T
T
T
T
T

T
T

T
™T

BTL/SG:1.25/Y(4>2) Class Change ©
BTL/BOM:4/SG:2.25/Y(3>2) Class

Change ©

CP/BTL/SG:.25/FLR+ 862 in 1/Y(3>6)

Class Change ©

BTL/FLR+ 11N(9>6) Class Change ©
FLR+ 79N(7>7) Class Change ©
BOM:5/SG:2.25/FLR+ 76N(6>7) Class

Change 0

BTL/BOM:3/SG:2.25/SP+15/FLR+

25Y(9>4) Class Change ©

SG:1.5/FLR+ 12N(2>7) Class Change ©
F/PP/WATCH/ESP/Y(6>7) Class Change

-55

FLR+ 48N(8>9) Class Change ©

Y(0>2) Class Change 6

86
81
79
76
74

73
70

48
ERR

RN

[\

ERR
81
ERR
ERR
68

76
74

48
ERR

[\

ERR
81
ERR
ERR
68

76
74

48
ERR

[y

ERR
82
ERR
ERR
75

74
71

ERR
ERR

10.0
10.0

10.0
ERR

[
w

10.0
ERR

ERR

7.4
ERR
ERR

w 0
o N

10.0
ERR

w
vl w

10.0
ERR

.53
.52
53.72
50.29
54.84
.26

.52
ERR

89
85
81
60
89

88

76

93
89
85
66
90

87

69

85
85
84
100
93

77

267
259
250
226
272

252
258

189
(2]

37
198

267
341
250
226
272

331
350

263

86
86
79
76
89

79

48

POWER MLINE
123.9 2.00
123.6  2.50
115.3 10.00
107.4 20.00
1.60
5.00
POWER MLINE
113.8 6.00
127.9 3.50
116.1 4.00
124.1 4.00
120.5 3.50
117.3 6.00
119.4 12.00
124.7 3.00
105.8 20.00
POWER MLINE
132.5 4.00
125.5 2.50
127.6  2.50
112.1 12.00
127.2  1.60
115.7 12.00
POWER MLINE
145.0  3.50
137.7 3.50
125.2 20.00
127.3 5.00
118.7 12.00
119.4 20.00
125.8 6.00
116.8 6.00
125.5 4.00
88.8 50.00
3.00

91,90,83,0,0
91,82,0,0,0

86,0,0,0,0
86,75,0,0,0
79,0,0,0,0
76,0,0,0,0
89,64,82,67,68

79,67,73,0,0
77,77,56,69,0

48,0,0,0,0
0,0,0,0,0

176

139

151

99

115

100

81
210

168

168
196

16

00

2w;3w;rally;not enough
Tossed head st;2w;3-4w

3deep/4wd; no rally
Checked hard upper

Off slow;stumbld early
Off slw;jmp trck early
Angled 5wd;closed well

Off slow; inside
Brk in;bpd;duel 2w;wkn

Hesitated; off slow

311
303
294
290
297

279
281

216
ERR

213
210
198
185
219

199
199

135

524
513
492
474
516

477
479

350
ERR



ERLY TOTL

SPD SPD AVG LAST FIVE HIGH PACE PACE
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE PPOT LAST DS NOTES FROM LAST RACE 110 #110 TDS #TDS SPD #R S1 S2 TOT SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDS1 TDS2 CLOSE E1 E2 PFN SPEED RATINGS BYER DSLR AVG3 BRIS P EQUIP MLINE CLS TRK DIS TYPE CHNG SPPNT PWR CLASS FINAL COMB TOTL LAST COMMENTS
3/7/22 GG 1 8.0 44 PEACE PIPE 3>6 R>R,D>D **Brshd st;angld out 1st (43)**THIRD OFF 25 2 25 2 6610 64 77 140 6.20 6.30 0.98 10.00 10.00 1.00 56 40 64 43,67,85,75,70 43 31 65.0 E/P © @0 2.00 173 SA 8.0 C oC 0.0 162 8.4 79.9 88.2 96 160 Brshd st;angld out 1st/
DROP SWITCH Slow last race (23). 1st off Shuffled early;3-4wide/
31 day layoff.Class Change -5 Finished 6 Advancd 3-5w;drftd str
from post 3 TIW= 83
8.0 33 DEL MAR 5>5 R>R,D>D **Fractious;3w;weakened (69)** DROP 69 1 69 1 74 8 77 79155 6.70 6.50 1.02 4.00 10.00 0.40 78 80 63 69,76,65,81,81 69 50 70.0 S 3 @ 2.50 165 GG 8.5 C oC 16.7 114 13.2 82.2 95.4 158 221 Fractious;3w;weakened/
SWITCH Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from Fractious;off bit slow/
5-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? Stumbled; pulled early
WATCH! 1st off 50 day layoff.Class
Change -15 Finished 5 from post 5 TIW=
64
8.0 22 CLASS CODE 6>1 R>R,D>D **Middle move;held (74)**THIRD OFF 69 8 69 8 69 9 81 84164 5.50 5.10 1.8 5.70 4.40 1.29 79 85 69 74,71,70,63,63 74 15 72.0 E/P 6 0 3.00 121 GG 8.0 C oC 33.3 114 14.1 86.3 100.5 164 233 Middle move;held/
Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 2-3w;reeled in foe/ Trck
6-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? 3w;outfinished
WATCH!BTL HORSE Clear early.Class Change
@ Finished 1 from post 6 TiW= 94
8.0 55 BORN TO 456 S>R,D>D  **Off slow;ins;mild gain (68)** *Stretch 70 3 70 3 7110 84 83166 6.60 5.99 1.11 7.106 6.50 1.9 81 82 76 68,67,70,67,74 75 17 68.0 P 5 0 8.00 124 GG 6.0 C oC 27.8 188 7.9 87.6 95.5 163 239 Off slow;ins;mild gain/
gain (2.25).BTL HORSE 2 races in one Chsd;ins;tired/ 3w;no
pattern.Class Change @ Finished 6 from final kick
post 4 TIW= 52
8.0 11 FOGGY 2>7 S>R,D>D  **2w;no factor (67)** *Stretch gain 68 5 68 5 6910 82 84165 8.10 5.50 1.47 7.30 3.70 2.00 82 78 79 67,70,70,72,68 75 17 69.0 P 2 0 12.00 120 GG 6.0 C oC 11.1 167 3.1 87.1 98.2 160 239 2w;no factor/ Inside;no
(3.75). Class Change @ Finished 7 from rally/ Tk up 7/8;3w;no
post 2 TIW= 50 bid
8.0 66 SMOKINHOTR 5>1 R>R,D>D **Dwelt start;3w;surged (66)** Made big 70 8 70 8 7010 57 99 156 8.40 4.30 1.97 8.10 3.50 2.32 39 41 99 66,74,77,76,70 77 10 72.0 S 2 © 3.50 118 GG 8.0 C oC 11.1 108 13.4 84.5 98.0 80 179 Dwelt start;3w;surged/
overall move (4).BTL HORSE Class Change 4w;rallied;2nd best/ Bid
@ Finished 1 from post 5 TIW= 60 5w;determinedly
ERLY TOTL
SPD SPD AVG LAST FIVE HIGH PACE PACE
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG  HORSE PPOT LAST DS NOTES FROM LAST RACE 110 #110 TDS #TDS SPD #R S1 S2 TOT SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDS1  TDS2 CLOSE E1 E2 PFN SPEED RATINGS BYER DSLR AVG3 BRIS P EQUIP MLINE CLS TRK DIS TYPE CHNG SPPNT PWR CLASS FINAL COMB TOTL LAST COMMENTS
3/7/22 GG 2 8.8 44 YOU'RE THE 1>2 R>R,D>D  **Pace;caught;2nd best (69)**THIRD OFF 69 1 69 1 61 4 73 84157 2.30 6.10 0.37 1.70 3.30 0.50 74 74 71 69,72,64,39,0 69 16 68.0 E 8 0 1.60 122 GG 8.0 M M>M 27.6 189 13.1 82.6 95.6 148 219 Pace;caught;2nd best/
Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from Stlk 2w;no final bid/ Btw
1-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? 2w;outfinished
WATCH! Clear early.Class Change -5
Finished 2 from post 1 TIW= 48
8.0 55 SPLIT ACES 5>3 S>R,D>D  **Stlkd 2w;outkicked (62)** DROP SWITCH ERR 0 ERR @ 56 7 85 80 164 3.80 6.40 0.59 ERR ERR ERR 86 79 75 62,67,50,63,57 Q0 23 60.0 E 8 0 6.00 105 GG 5.5 M M>M 27.6 164 10.4 85.8 96.3 165 240 Stlkd 2w;outkicked/
Flashed speed. *Stretch gain (2).BTL Pace;ins;outfinished/
HORSE Class Change -5 Finished 3 from Stlk inside;gave way
post 5 TIW= 70
8.0 11 SIERRA 2>4 R>R,D>D  **Stlkd 2w;gave way (65)** Flashed 65 1 65 1 55 6 70 84154 7.99 8.50 ©.93 8.30 6.70 1.25 70 67 72 65,56,50,51,58 65 16 57.0NA 6 0 12.00 131 GG 8.0 M M>M 20.7 101 4.2 80.9 85.1 137 209 Stlkd 2w;gave way/
speed.Uncharacteristic race? Class Unprepared st;4w;tired/
Change -5 Finished 4 from post 2 TW= 32 3w;no threat
8.0 33 WOLF MOON 2>4 R>R,D>D  **In tight 1/4;angl out (7@)** DROP 68 3 68 3 63 9 69 81150 7.60 6.8 1.11 7.60 5.20 1.46 81 74 75 70,69,66,66,65 70 23 68.0 S 1 0 1.40 116 GG 8.0 M M>M 3.4 107 11.9 82.8 94.7 155 230 In tight 1/4;angl out/
SWITCH *Stretch gain (1).BTL HORSE 2 4w;outkick;up 2nd/ Stlk
races in one pattern.Class Change -15 ins;weakened
Finished 4 from post 2 TIW= 42
8.0 66 NORWESTER 4>5 R>R,D>D  **Stlkd 3w;gave way (58)** 1st off 49 57 7 57 7 56 9 74 79153 7.8 6.40 1.21 8.40 6.60 1.27 77 70 58 58,54,61,56,56 61 49 58.0 S 2 © 20.00 106 GG 8.0 M M>M 6.9 99 5.7 80.7 86.4 147 205 Stlkd 3w;gave way/ Stlk
day layoff.Class Change @ Finished 5 3w;gave way/ 2w;rallied
from post 4 TIW= 39 for 2nd
8.0 22 EVEN 356 R>R,D>D  **Stlkd ins;weakened (63)** Class Change 64 7 64 7 64 9 71 82153 6.8 5.40 1.27 6.70 5.30 1.27 70 69 68 63,68,66,67,62 68 16 66.0 E/P 4 0 5.00 118 GG 8.0 M M>M 13.8 165 11.2 81.1 92.3 139 207 Stlkd ins;weakened/ Trck
-5 Finished 6 from post 3 TIW= 39 2w;outfinished/ 5w;no

late rally



DATE

3/7/22

DATE

3/7/22

TRK #

TRK #

6 4

PRG

HORSE

UNTHROTTLE

A MAN'S

COOLCROSS

ECOLOGIST

LORD

FINAL

GENTLEMAN*

DARK

CANYON

KALINE

BIG CITY

BERNALINHO

PPOT

251

2>9

4>4

7>5

5>4

5>4

6>5

3>5

3>4

6>1

1>3

LAST DS

R>R,D>D

S5R,D>D

R>R,D>D

S5R,D>D

R>R,D>D

R>R,D>D

S>R,D>D

R>R,D>D

R>R,D>D

R>R,D>D

R>R,D>D

R>R,D>D

SPD
NOTES FROM LAST RACE

**Stmbl st;held driving (80)** Flashed
speed. *Pressed Pace from
2-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed?
WATCH!BTL HORSE Clear early.Class Change
10 Finished 1 from post 2 TIW= 82

**Lost blinkers;faded (75)** Flashed
speed. *Pressed Pace from
2-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed?
WATCH! Clear early.lst off 31 day
layoff.Class Change -40 Finished 9 from
post 2 TIW= 74

**Stlkd 2w;outfinished (80)** Flashed
speed. *Pressed Pace from 4-hole.
*Stretch gain (.5).Uncharacteristic
early speed? WATCH!BTL HORSE Class
Change 15 Finished 4 from post 4 TIW= 49
**Stlk 3w;evenly (77)** Made big overall
move (3). *Stretch gain (1.5).BTL HORSE
1st off 38 day layoff.2 races in one
pattern.Class Change 15 Finished 5 from
post 7 TIW= 53

**0ff slow;2w;mild gain (83)** *Stretch
gain (1.5). 1st off 45 day layoff.Class
Change @ Finished 4 from post 5 TIW= 54
**0ff slow;4-5w;no rally (80)**THIRD OFF
Made a big move early (3.5). Class
Change @ Finished 4 from post 5 TIW=

ERR

79

39

80

82

78

SPD
NOTES FROM LAST RACE

**Pprss 2w;vied;weakened (77)** Flashed
speed. *Pressed Pace from 1-hole. Clear
early.Class Change 5 Finished 3 from
post 1 TIW= 23

**Tracked inside;tired (8@)**THIRD OFF
DROP SWITCH Chased Pace. Class Change
-15 Finished 5 from post 6 TIW= 96
**Rank;4w;gave way (65)** Class Change ©
Finished 5 from post 3 TIW= 13

82

70

**2w; gained;outkicked (78)** *Stretch
gain (1).Uncharacteristic early speed?
WATCH!BTL HORSE Class Change -5 Finished
4 from post 3 TIW= 52

*#3w;urged; late push (69)** Flashed
speed. *Pressed Pace from 6-hole.BTL
HORSE Class Change @ Finished 1 from
post 6 TIW= 53

**Stlk ins;outfinished (72)** Chased
Pace. *Stretch gain (.25). 2 races in
one pattern.Class Change @ Finished 3
from post 1 TIW= 83

77

76

75

110 #110

SPD

0 ERR ]

SPD
TDS #TDS

AVG

110 #110 TDS #TDS SPD

80

75

72

79

78

80

69

77

74

75

#R S1 S2

10

10

10

10

10

10

10

10

10

92

75

88

78

82

83

68

79

67

69

78

94

85

90

86

85

85

90

%

91

TOT

169

160

Sys1

7.00

SYS2

5.60

7.10

5.20

5.20

8.10

6.70

3.80

5.10

CLOSE

0.97

1.03

1.25

1.35

1.73

CLOSE

0.81

1.00

1.14

1.33

1.45

TDS1

ERR

6.80

10.00

6.80

8.50

3.20

8.00

7.40

6.00

7.70

TDS2

ERR

10.00

4.30

4.00

5.40

CLOSE

ERR

1.00

1.00

1.60

2.14

0.70

1.03

1.11

1.62

1.43

94

74

82

84

80

88

59

78

59

64

E2

PFN

LAST FIVE
SPEED RATINGS

% 74 80,75,73,0,0

95

76

82

84

88

91

62

78

54

63

73

88

88

86

77

74

77

82

92

88

75,82,82,82,86

80,75,67,67,73

77,69,39,80,74

83,84,83,76,77

80,84,85,85,85

LAST FIVE
SPEED RATINGS

77,72,77,73,67

80,78,80,93,85

65,68,69,75,65

78,81,73,75,80

69,78,74,76,77

72,79,79,74,81

HIGH

BYER DSLR AVG3 BRIS P EQUIP MLINE

119 15.4 87.8 1@03.2 179 253

80 29
2] 31
84 10
39 38
84 45
85 17
HIGH

BYER DSLR
2] 16
85 17
76 22
81 29
79 29
81 22

80.0 E/P

74.0 E/P

62.0 S

83.0 S

83.0 S

AVG3  BRIS

79.0 E

67.0 P

77.0 S

74.0 E/P

77.0 S

15.00

15.00

1.80

20.00

TRK DIS

GG 8.0
GG 5.5
GG 8.0
GG 5.5
GG 8.0
GG 8.0
TRK DIS

GG 5.5
GG 8.0
GG 8.0
GG 8.0
GG 8.0
GG 8.0

TYPE CHNG SPPNT

oC 33.3
A>C 20.8
C 29.2
C 16.7
C 0.0
oC 0.0
CHNG  SPPNT
oC 28.6
oC 21.4
C 7.1
C 14.3
C 21.4
oC 7.1

ERLY
PACE

TOTL
PACE

PWR CLASS FINAL COMB TOTL LAST

123

113

111

119

122

PWR

121

106

115

109

113

13.0

13.4

12.2

14.9

14.9

90.0 103.0

85.5 99.0

90.2 102.5

86.8 101.7

86.2 101.1

189

150

164

168

168

ERLY
PACE

CLASS FINAL COMB TOTL

12.0 83.1 95.1 180

14.5

14.4

13.9

13.9

85.5 100.0

83.8 86.4

87.0 101.4

86.6 100.5

86.0 99.9

179

121

156

113

127

262

238

252

254

24!

O

TOTL
PACE
LAST

253

198

23

@

20

Ul

215

COMMENTS

Stmbl st;held driving/
Pace;rated;drew clear/
Chased 2-3wd; evenly

Lost blinkers;faded/ Bmp
st;rank;3w; 7w 3/16/ Stlkd
4w;2nd best

Stlkd 2w;outfinished/
2w;swng widest;outkick/
Prssd 2w;outfinished

Stlk 3w;evenly/ 3-4w
bid;closed;missed/ Dwelt
start;no impact

Off slow;2w;mild gain/
Bid 4w;clsd willingly/
Ins;angl out;clsd;nod
Off slow;4-5w;no rally/
4w;belated rally/ 2-3w;6w
3/16;2nd best

COMMENTS

Prss 2w;vied;weakened/
Bit slw early;2w;empty/
Pace; ins;weakened

Tracked inside;tired/
Ins;closed for 3rd/
Mid-pack;ins;no rally
Rank;4w;gave way/
Stlkd;inside;faded/
Stlk;2w;gave way
2w;gained;outkicked/
2w;boxed 1/4;clsd;mssd/
Stlkd;3w;evenly

3w;urged; late push/
2w;gained;outfinished/
Prssd 2w;outfinished

Stlk ins;outfinished/
Stmbl st;6w 3/16;clear/
2w;closed willingly



ERLY TOTL

SPD SPD AVG LAST FIVE HIGH PACE PACE
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE PPOT LAST DS NOTES FROM LAST RACE 110 #110 TDS #TDS SPD #R S1 S2 TOT SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDS1 TDS2 CLOSE E1 E2 PFN SPEED RATINGS BYER DSLR AVG3 BRIS P EQUIP MLINE CLS TRK DIS TYPE CHNG SPPNT PWR CLASS FINAL COMB TOTL LAST COMMENTS
3/7/22 GG 5 6.0 33 ALQWANI 0>0 0>S,>D  ** (0)** 1st off 738221 day layoff. ERR 0 ERR @ ERR @ 57 -9 48 ERR ERR  ERR ERR ERR  ERR (2] (2] 0,0,0,0,0 2] *¥*%k  ERR NA @ @ 3.50 ERR 0.0 S >S 0.0 0.0 ERR ERR ] e/ /
FTS.Invalid last race. Finished @ from
post @ TIW= 74
6.0 55 MINER'S 0>0 0>S,>D  ** (0)** 1st off 738221 day layoff. ERR 0 ERR @ ERR @ 57 -9 48 ERR ERR ERR ERR  ERR (2] (2] 0,0,0,0,0 2] Fokokk NA o @ 8.00 ERR 0.0 S >S 0.0 0.0 ERR ERR ] e/ /
FTS.Invalid last race. Finished @ from
post @ TIW= 44
6.0 2 2 GOVERNOR 2>10 S>S,D>D  **Bmp st;2w;no factor (53)**THIRD OFF 62 5 62 5 62 5 87 70156 6.10 8.20 0.74 6.10 8.20 ©.74 81 77 66 53,65,52,71,71 71 22 57.0 E/P 3 @ 20.00 153 GG 5.5 S S>S 20.0 167 4.4 85.1 89.4 158 224 Bmp st;2w;no factor/
Slow last race (9). Class Change © Prssd 2w;faded/ Chsd
Finished 10 from post 2 TIW= 35 2w; faded
6.0 11 CONNIE'S 2>5 R>S,D>D  **Pace;faded (59)** Flashed speed. 74 3 72 4 67 8 70 80150 5.99 6.80 0.87 5.80 5.00 1.15 71 63 67 59,74,72,76,66 76 9 68.0 P 3 © 4.50 152 GG 8.0 S S>S 20.0 111 11.8 83.1 94.9 134 201 Pace;faded/ Prssd
*Pressed Pace from 2w;evenly/ Chased 3w; no
2-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? rally
WATCH! Class Change 4 Finished 5 from
post 2 TIW= 66
6.0 6 6 ACCORDING 4>3 S>S,D>D  **Trck 2w;outfinished (73)** Flashed 68 3 68 3 68 3 91 78 168 5.40 5.00 1.8 5.40 5.00 1.08 89 91 75 73,60,70,0,0 73 22 68.0 P 4 @ 2.50 155 GG 5.5S S>S 26.7 114 12.8 90.3 103.0 180 255 Trck 2w;outfinished/

speed. *Pressed Pace from 4-hole. Class

speed. *Pressed Pace from 4-hole. Made
big overall move (4).BTL HORSE 1st off
36 day layoff.Class Change -25 Finished
1 from post 4 TIW= 93

Green;lugged;6w turn/

Change @ Finished 3 from post 4 TIW= 64 3w;outkicked
AFTERDINNE 8 S$>S,D>D  **Chsd 3w;weakened (65)** *Stretch gain 69 69 89 75163 7.60 6.50 1.18 7.60 6.50 1.18 85 76 81 65,73,0,0,0 73 22 S S>S 110 89.2 161 Chsd 3w;weakened/ 2w;swng
(4.25). 2 races in one pattern.Class widest;rallied/
Change @ Finished 8 from post 8 TIW= 43
CITY 5 $>5,D>D **Reluctant;tk up 3/8 (69)** Made big 72 72 87 80 166 6.50 5.20 1.25 6.50 5.20 1.25 80 78 83 69,70,77,0,0 77 22 E S$>S 114 89.7 158 Reluctant;tk up 3/8/ Chsd
overall move (4). *Stretch gain (4.25). 2w;weakened/
2 races in one pattern.Class Change @ Pace;inside;bested
Finished 5 from post 7 TIW= 62
ERLY TOTL
SPD SPD AVG LAST FIVE HIGH PACE PACE
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG  HORSE PPOT LAST DS NOTES FROM LAST RACE 110 #110 TDS #TDS SPD #R S1 S2 TOT SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDS1  TDS2 CLOSE E1 E2 PFN SPEED RATINGS BYER DSLR AVG3 BRIS P EQUIP MLINE CLS TRK DIS TYPE CHNG SPPNT PWR CLASS FINAL COMB TOTL LAST COMMENTS
3/7/22 GG 6 5.5 33 HONG KONG 3>5 R>S,D>D  **Pace;gave way (76)** Flashed speed. 57 1 57 1 7310 76 89 165 2.10 8.20 0.25 1.40 10.00 0.14 75 78 80 76,57,65,73,74 57 10 66.0 E 3 0 50.00 137 GG 8.0 C oC 15.0 105 10.0 79.1 89.1 153 233 Pace;gave way/
*Pressed Pace from Sent;ins;faded/
3-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? Pace;2w;gave way
WATCH! Clear early.Class Change ©
Finished 5 from post 3 TIW= 12
ELUSIVE 6 R>S,D>D  **Btwn 3w;shffld 1/4 (60)** Chased Pace. 73 72 69 81 149 5.40 6.20 0.86 5.40 5.80 0.92 64 64 68 60,77,75,77,75 78 22 E/P oC 108 83.9 128 Btwn 3w;shffld 1/4/
Slow last race (12). Class Change © Ins;angl out;closed/ Stlk
Finished 6 from post 4 TIW= 44 3w;tired
EMERALD 1 S>5,D>D  **Trck 2w;bid;kick clear (83)**THIRD OFF 75 75 89 87 175 6.30 6.80 ©.92 6.30 6.80 0.92 86 90 87 83,70,60,80,83 89 16 E/P oC 115 90.8 176 Trck 2w;bid;kick clear/
Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from No early speed;no bid/
4-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? Chsd 4w;faded
WATCH!BTL HORSE Class Change 5 Finished
1 from post 4 TIW= 59
BIGFOOT 6 R>S,D>D  **Btwn 3w;gave way (78)** DROP SWITCH 77 81 81 84 165 5.00 4.50 1.11 8.50 4.60 1.83 84 88 73 78,78,82,76,80 78 17 E/P oC 121 85.8 172 Btwn 3w;gave way/
Class Change -15 Finished 6 from post 3 2w;tight 5/16;drft 1/4/
TIW= 100 Stlkd 3w;gaining
PAPPY 5 S>5,D>D  **Bid 4w;flattened out (78)**THIRD OFF 79 78 88 82169 8.0 5.70 1.40 8.00 5.50 1.47 88 92 78 78,79,74,85,82 85 16 P oC 120 88.9 180 Bid 4w;flattened out/
Chased Pace. *Stretch gain (1.25).BTL Fractious gate;no bid/
HORSE 2 races in one pattern.Class Bid 3w;flattened out
Change -15 Finished 5 from post 4 TIW=
72
CONTINENTA 5 S>5,D>D  **Trck 2w;outfinished (73)** Flashed 71 71 88 82169 6.70 4.80 1.41 6.70 4.80 1.41 93 89 75 73,74,75,76,74 82 17 E/P oC 115 89.8 182 Trck 2w;outfinished/
speed. *Pressed Pace from Speed;pulled away/ Prss
8-hole.Uncharacteristic race?BTL HORSE 2w;closed;2nd bst
Class Change @ Finished 5 from post 8
TIW= 82
GOBSMACK 3 S>5,D>D  **2w;swng out;rallied (75)** Made big 76 76 84 87 170 6.50 4.40 1.48 6.40 4.30 1.50 81 81 85 75,82,78,73,74 82 17 .0 P oC 114 90.2 162 2w;swng out;rallied/
overall move (6). *Stretch gain (3).BTL 2w;ins rally;denied/
HORSE Class Change @ Finished 3 from Ins;in tight 1/16;clsd
post 3 TIW= 59
SATANTA 1 5>5,D>D  **2w;tight 5/16;surged (80)** Flashed 77 77 92 85177 7.18 4.70 1.52 7.5 4.3 1.73 88 92 82 80,77,80,74,83 83 36 0s R>C 118 92.9 180 262 2w;tight 5/16;surged/ Bpd

st;2-3wd;tippd out/ Gain
4w;evenly



ERLY TOTL

SPD SPD AVG LAST FIVE HIGH PACE PACE
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE PPOT LAST DS NOTES FROM LAST RACE 110 #110 TDS #TDS SPD #R S1 S2 TOT SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDS1 TDS2 CLOSE E1 E2 PFN SPEED RATINGS BYER DSLR AVG3 BRIS P EQUIP MLINE CLS TRK DIS TYPE CHNG SPPNT PWR CLASS FINAL COMB TOTL LAST COMMENTS
3/7/22 GG 7 6.6 55 RHODIUM 2>4 S>S,D>D  **Sent;ins;weakened (71)** Flashed 74 3 74 3 74 4 9 79168 2.50 5.40 0.47 1.40 5.00 0.27 9 89 75 71,80,71,74,0 80 24 740 E 8 BON 5.00 142 GG 5.5 R R>R 32.0 119 13.3 88.0 101.3 179 254 Sent;ins;weakened/
speed. *Pressed Pace from Sent;ins;clear;held/ Pace
2-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? ins;tired
WATCH! Clear early.Class Change @
Finished 4 from post 2 TIW= 75
6.0 11 COWBOY 3>4 S$>S,D>D  **Sent;ins;outfinished (74)** Flashed 69 4 69 4 69 4 9 78 167 2.10 4.30 0.50 2.10 4.30 0.50 96 95 69 74,79,67,57,0 79 50 73.0 E 8 © 6.00 156 GG 6.0 R R>R 32.0 120 13.7 86.6 100.3 191 260 Sent;ins;outfinished/
speed. *Pressed Pace from Pace;outkicked;2nd bst/
3-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? Pace;ins;held driving
WATCH!BTL HORSE Clear early.lst off 50
day layoff.Class Change @ Finished 4
from post 3 TIW= 59
6.0 6 6 HEAVEN 4>2 S>S,D>D  **Prss 2w;outkick;2d bst (77)** Flashed 67 3 68 5 68 5 90 83172 4.50 6.99 0.65 4.50 6.99 .65 88 91 79 77,73,52,60,76 77 24 67.0 E 5 © 3.0 178 GG 5.5R R>R 20.0 120 14.1 86.7 100.9 179 258 Prss 2w;outkick;2d bst/
speed. *Pressed Pace from Prssd 3w;weakened/ Bbld
4-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? st;2w;empty
WATCH!BTL HORSE Clear early.Class Change
@ Finished 2 from post 4 TIW= 85
6.0 3 3 AFFECTIONT 6>4 R>S,D>D  **Bid 4w;flattened out (79)** Chased 73 4 73 4 74 5 81 87168 5.50 5.20 1.06 6.00 4.80 1.25 84 89 75 79,73,78,72,68 78 10 77.0 P 2] © 4.50 138 GG 8.0 R R>R 0.0 119 14.2 83.9 98.1 173 248 Bid 4w;flattened out/ Off
Pace. Class Change @ Finished 4 from slow;2w;rallied 3d/
post 6 TIW= 80 2w;split 1/16;nailed
6.0 44 DOUBLE THE 3>6 R>S,D>D  **Stlk 2w;gave way (78)** Flashed speed. 74 2 73 3 73 8 8 82167 5.80 4.9 1.19 5.20 3.30 1.57 89 95 67 78,70,72,73,68 79 31 73.0 E/P 1 © 8.00 151 GG 8.0 R R>R 4.0 120 14.5 82.8 97.3 184 251 Stlk 2w;gave way/ Rank
*Pressed Pace from 3-hole. 1st off 31 3/4;3w;outclosed/
day layoff.Class Change @ Finished 6 3w;closed for 2nd
from post 3 TIW= 64
6.0 22 ARTEMUS 2>1 $>5,D>D  **Inside;strong late run (82)** Flashed 80 3 80 3 78 4 89 84172 4.80 3.10 1.5 5.50 2.30 2.40 93 91 85 82,71,82,77,0 82 22 78.0 P 3 0 1.40 143 GG 5.5R S>R 12.0 124 15.2 90.9 106.1 184 269 Inside;strong late run/
speed. *Pressed Pace from 2-hole. Made Pace;weakened/ Bid
big overall move (3).BTL HORSE Class 2w;battled gamely
Change -5 Finished 1 from post 2 TJW= 86
ERLY TOTL
SPD SPD AVG LAST FIVE HIGH PACE PACE
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG  HORSE PPOT LAST DS NOTES FROM LAST RACE 110 #110 TDS #TDS SPD #R S1 S2 TOT SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDS1  TDS2 CLOSE E1 E2 PFN SPEED RATINGS BYER DSLR AVG3 BRIS P EQUIP MLINE CLS TRK DIS TYPE CHNG SPPNT PWR CLASS FINAL COMB TOTL LAST COMMENTS
3/7/22 GG 8 8.5 66 JIMMY BLUE 3>5 R>R,D>D **Pace;ins;weakened (83)** Flashed 81 4 81 4 8 9 85 83167 2.60 4.80 0.54 1.30 5.30 ©.25 106 106 58 83,77,90,82,83 83 45 83.0 E/P 6 © 5.00 188 GG 9.0 A AO>A  26.1 126 15.8 80.8 96.7 212 270 Pace;ins;weakened/ Bumped
speed. *Pressed Pace from start; faded/ Rank early
3-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? & 9/16
WATCH! Clear early.lst off 45 day
layoff.Class Change @ Finished 5 from
post 3 TIW= 74
8.5 11 WINE AND 557 R>R,D>D  **3w;swung widest;tired (76)** Class 86 7 86 7 8310 69 88 157 6.50 6.10 1.06 6.50 4.60 1.40 61 69 89 76,89,93,79,91 93 23 86.0 P 3 0 8.00 183 GG 8.0 A AO>A  13.0 122 13.2 83.8 97.0 130 219 3w;swung widest;tired/
Change @ Finished 7 from post 5 TIW= 47 Bid 3w;held safely/ Bmp
st;3w;willingly
8.5 77 READY SAY 3>5 R>R,D>D  **Attended pace;wknd (79)** Flashed 83 7 83 7 8 10 72 87 159 5.60 5.0 1.12 5.80 5.50 1.6 65 75 87 79,89,86,90,82 89 23 82.0 E/P 7 0 15.00 178 GG 8.0 A AO>A  30.4 122 9.9 81.9 91.8 140 227 Attended pace;wknd/ Trck
speed. *Pressed Pace from 2w;vied;faded/ Bid
3-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? 2w;battled;2d best
WATCH! Clear early.Class Change @
Finished 5 from post 3 TIW= 59
8.5 22 DULAS 4>4 R>R,D>D  **Shffld st;ins;no bid (79)** Made big 86 3 86 3 86 3 68 91159 5.20 3.99 1.33 5.20 3.99 1.33 57 68 94 79,87,93,0,0 93 23 86.0 P 4 © 6.00 179 GG 8.0 A AO>A  17.4 124 15.2 83.3 98.5 125 219 Shffld st;ins;no bid/

TESORO

SHADRACK

TOM'S

[

L)

ha

R>R,D>D

R>R,T>D

R>R,D>D

overall move (3). Class Change ©
Finished 4 from post 4 TJIW= 38
**Ins;angl out;closed (86)** Flashed
speed. *Pressed Pace from 2-hole.
*Stretch gain (1.75).BTL HORSE Class
Change © Finished 2 from post 2 TW= 70
**4w;late gain (86)** DROP SWITCH
*Stretch gain (1.25).BTL HORSE 1st off
182 day layoff.Class Change -21 Finished
6 from post 1 TIW= 75

*#2w;strong late run (86)** Made big
overall move (5).BTL HORSE Class Change
@ Finished 1 from post 7 TIW= 100

w

86,95,78,85,76

86,88,90,83,87

86,88,93,89,75

95 23
92 182
93 23

128 16.4 84.7 101.1 134

124 15.8 83.6 99.4 160

132 17.1 88.8 105.8 126

Boxed 1/8;closed well/
Stlk 3w;outfinished
Ins;angl out;closed/ Bmp
st;pinch 3/8;4w/ No
match; 2nd best

4w;late gain/ Bobbled
brk; inside/
5-6w;gained;late kick

2w;strong late run/
Ins;angl out;riddn out/
4w;7w 3/16;0utfinished



DATE

3/7/22

DATE

TRK #

TRK #

PRG

10

LAST DS

055, 5D

05,>D

055, 5D

R>S,D>D

$55,D5D

S$>S,D>D

S$>S,D>D

R>S,D>D

S$>S,D>D

S$>S,D>D

S$>S,D>D

NOTES FROM LAST RACE

** (0)** 1st off
FTS.Invalid last
post @ TIW= 90
** (0)** 1st off
FTS.Invalid last
post @ TIW= 74
*k (@)** 1st off
FTS.Invalid last
post @ TIW= 82
**Lunged st;prssd;faded (48)** DROP
SWITCH Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
4-hole. Slow last race

(12) .Uncharacteristic early speed?
WATCH! Class Change -10@ Finished 7 from
post 4 TIW= 29

**Bbld st;inside;evenly (60)** *Stretch
gain (2).BTL HORSE Class Change ©
Finished 4 from post 2 TIW= 33

**0ff slow;bmpd 1/2 (51)** DROP SWITCH
Chased Pace. Class Change -45 Finished 7
from post 1 TIW= 96

**0ff slow;2w;late gain (54)** *Stretch
gain (4.75). Class Change @ Finished 5
from post 7 TIW= 49

**Stlkd;2w; faded (67)** Flashed speed
*Pressed Pace from
5-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed?
WATCH! Class Change -40 Finished 4 from
post 5 TIW= 48

**#3w;rallied for 2nd (62)** *Stretch
gain (4).Uncharacteristic race? Class
Change @ Finished 2 from post 3 TJW= 58
**Hopped st;mild rally (49)** *Stretch
gain (4.5). Class Change @ Finished 6
from post 1 TIW= 58

**Ins;green 1/8;late bid (65)** *Stretch ERR
gain (1).BTL HORSE 1st off 49 day
layoff.Class Change @ Finished 4 from

post 1 TIW= 75

738221 day layoff.
race. Finished @ from

738221 day layoff.
race. Finished @ from

ERR

738221 day layoff.
race. Finished @ from

ERR

63

60

51

55

70

62

49

NOTES FROM LAST RACE

ERR

ERR

63

59

51

56

67

65

49

65

ERR ©

ERR @

60 4

59 2

51 1

59 9

67 9

64 4

49 1

65 1

57

57

72

84

88

74

75

83

70

82

#R S1 S2 TOT

-9 48

-9 48

59

80

67

87

78

82

88

79

Sys1

ERR

ERR

8.60

10.00

10.00

SYS2 CLOSE TDS1

ERR

ERR

7.00

6.90

10.00

7.30

5.10

6.50

1.17

1.50

CLOSE

ERR

ERR

5.30

5.40

8.60

5.60

5.00

10.00

10.00

TDS2 CLOSE E1

ERR

ERR

10.00

ERR

ERR

1.00

0.86

9%

81

90

70

76

81

62

81

E2

81

77

83

62

77

75

55

PFN

31

75

58

83

66

7

©

84

75

LAST FIVE

SPEED RATINGS

0,0,0,0,0

0,0,0,0,0

0,0,0,0,0

48,62,65,63,0

60,58,0,0,0

51,0,0,0,0

54,68,56,70,59

67,76,74,75,73

62,68,62,63,0

49,0,0,0,0

65,0,0,0,0

LAST FIVE
SPEED RATINGS

58.

59.

51.

59.

72.

49.

65.

2]

BRIS P EQUIP MLINE

E/P

BON

BON

BON

12.00

15.

00

20.

00

15.00

50.00

CLs

TYPE

CHNG

M>M

M>M

S>M

M>M

S>M

M>M

M>M

M>M

ERLY
PACE

TOTL
PACE

SPPNT PWR CLASS FINAL COMB TOTL LAST

0.0

0.0

20.0

10.0

0.0

0.0

30.0

40.0

0.0

0.0

105

101

107

98

116

107

106

PWR

12.1

11.7

11.6

CLASS

79.6

86.5

86.5

84.1

83.2

86.4

85.5

88.7

FINAL

88.5

94.9

94.3

93.4

95.3

98.1

90.6

100.3

comB

171

158

173

132

153

156

117

81

ERLY
PACE
TOTL

202

233

231

215

219

235

201

156

TOTL
PACE
LAST

COMMENTS

Lunged st;prssd;faded/
2w;closed;led;nipped/
Stmbl st;chck 7/8;4w

Bbld st;inside;evenly/
Chsd 3w;weakened/

Off slow;bmpd 1/2/ /

Off slow;2w;late gain/
Off pace;ins;no rally/
Prssd 2w;dropped back
Stlkd;2w;faded/ Chsd
4w;no final bid/ Stlk
3w;outfinished

3w;rallied for 2nd/ Stlk
ins;closed 2nd/ Lug out

3/4;4w;gve way

Hopped st;mild rally/ /

Ins;green 1/8;late bid/ /

COMMENTS

3/7/22

HORSE PPOT
TAM'S TIME 0>0
WHISPER 0>0
WORD OF 0>0
THECHIEFHA 4>7
UNCLE 2>4
MORPHY 1>7
FANTASTIC 7>5
NORTH SEA 5>4
THE 352
TRIBUTE TO 1>6
INTO 1>4

HORSE PPOT
MIDNIGHT 1>1
LETSGETLUC 6>3
CAERULEAN 6>9
HAIL 352
JOE DON 256
MAJESTIC 1>1
SUZIE Qzz 4>3
BANG FOR 11>4

S$>S,D>T

$>S,D>T

S$>S,T>T

$55,T>T

$55,D5T

$55,T>T

R>S,D>T

$55,T>T

**Cleared; romped (@)** Flashed speed.
*Pressed Pace from 1-hole. Slow last
race (64).Uncharacteristic early speed?
WATCH!BTL HORSE 1st off 43 day
layoff.Class Change 40 Finished 1 from
post 1 TIW= 39

**3-2wd;no bid;held 3rd (92)** Flashed
speed. *Pressed Pace from 6-hole. 1st
off 51 day layoff.Class Change -34
Finished 3 from post 6 TIW= 39
**6-5dp;brushd 3/8;faded (74)** Flashed
speed. Slow last race (9). 1st off 127
day layoff.Class Change 30 Finished 9
from post 6 TIW= 47
**Pprssd;led;clear;caught (87)**THIRD OFF
Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
3-hole.BTL HORSE Clear early.Class
Change -4 Finished 2 from post 3 TJW= 91
**Inside-2wd; no threat (86)** *Stretch
gain (.5).BTL HORSE Class Change 16
Finished 6 from post 2 TIW= 63

**#0ff slw;waitd;swng out (77)** Chased
Pace. Made big overall move (3). Made a
big move early (4).BTL HORSE 1st off 38
day layoff.Class Change 52 Finished 1
from post 1 TIW= 34

**Bpd st;3w;angld in 2nd (79)** DROP
SWITCH 1st off 36 day layoff.Class
Change -4 Finished 3 from post 4 TIW= 66
**Reservd;3-4w;angld out (84)**THIRD OFF 79
DROP SWITCH Made big overall move (5).
*Stretch gain (3.75).BTL HORSE 2 races

in one pattern.Class Change -4 Finished

4 from post 11 TIW= 52

85

82

91

92

77

ERR

85

83

91

89

77

ERR

79

89 8

83 10

83 10

83 10

70 2

82 8

77 10

98

90

86

93

91

85

80

81

76

el

83

85

79

94

3.10

3.70

2.60

5.70

3.90

1.30

3.10

2.10

8.20

ERR

7.60

3.40

1.40

ERR

4.40

0.50

0.90

1.20

1.75

3.00

ERR

1.72

96

95

95

94

81

91

79

105

29

98

el

91

91

86

82

66

81

83

78

72

89

0,0,74,53,0

92,94,91,85,88

74,84,79,85,84

87,92,79,80,95

86,92,81,85,88

77,63,0,8,0

79,82,85,87,89

84,82,78,66,87

HIGH
BYER DSLR AVG3
") *okokk
") *okokk
") *okokk
63 23
60 23
51 22
60 23
76 30
68 23
49 23
65 49
HIGH
BYER DSLR
0 43
85 51
92 127
95 30
92 29
77 38
0 36
87 30

92.

79.

86.

86.

70.

82.

8l.

2]

2]

2]

2]

2]

2]

E/P

E/P

E/P

E/P

E/P

S

5

BOFF

15.00

TRK DIS

0.0

0.0

0.0
GG 8.0
GG 5.5
GG 5.5
GG 5.5
GG 8.0
GG 5.5
GG 5.5
GG 5.0
TRK DIS
LA 4.6
SA 6.0
SA 6.0
SA 6.5
SA 6.5
SA 6.0
SA 8.0
SA 6.5

N>A

R>A

R>A

M>A

20.6

14.7

14.7

5.9

2.9

14.7

8.8

138

114

153

126

106

126

125

17.5

11.4

16.9

12.3

13.1

15.8

12.6

94.2

92.1

95.2

91.3

87.8

86.6

93.8

111.7

103.5

112.1

103.6

100.9

102.4

106.4

201

194

193

1%

172

182

165

283

260

274

273

250

254

254

Cleared; romped/ Drift
into str;romped/ Duel
inside; weakened

3-2wd;no bid;held 3rd/ Bp
st;prss btw;hld 3rd/ Bit
slow;bid 2wd;clear

6-5dp;brushd 3/8;faded/
Stalked;2-3wd;faltered/
Angl in/out trn;flattn

Prssd;led;clear;caught/
Outside;led uppr;clear/
Bpd brk;led upr;held3d

Inside-2wd; no threat/
Bpd;chck st;angld 1/8/
Tracked 5w;no response
Off slw;waitd;swng out/
Bmpd/lost pth st;2-6wd/

Bpd st;3w;angld in 2nd/
Bit tght trn;lost path/
Vied 3deep; gamely
Reservd;3-4w;angld out/
Stlk 2w;outfinished/ 4-5w
into str;improved



DATE

3/7/22

DATE

TRK #

SA

TRK #

6.0 4

6.0 6

6.0 3

PRG

HORSE

SCREAM AND

KEEP YOUR

FLAG

SEASON TO

CHROME OF

RUTHIES

WARREN'S

PPOT

5>4

452

352

2>4

1>4

757

LAST DS

$55,D5D

$55,D5D

$55,D5D

$55,D5D

R>S,D>D

S$>S,D>D

S$>S,D>D

NOTES FROM LAST RACE

**Chased 3-4w;best rest (73)** Flashed
speed. Class Change -5 Finished 2 from
post 4 TIW= 23

**3wd;checked near wire (69)** DROP
SWITCH Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
5-hole. *Stretch gain (1).BTL HORSE
Class Change -5 Finished 4 from post 5
TIW= 34

**vie ins;led late;naild (@)** Flashed
speed. *Pressed Pace from 4-hole. Slow
last race (67).Uncharacteristic early
speed? WATCH!BTL HORSE 1st off 43 day
layoff.Class Change 5 Finished 2 from
post 4 TIW= 27

**Bit slow; blocked 3/8 (72)** DROP
SWITCH Flashed speed. Made big overall
move (3). *Stretch gain (3.75).BTL HORSE
Class Change -5 Finished 2 from post 3
TIW= 70

**Crowded bit st;inside (72)** DROP
SWITCH *Stretch gain (.5). 1st off 70
day layoff.Class Change -5 Finished 4
from post 2 TIW= 55

**Lack speed;late effort (@)** *Stretch
gain (.5). Slow last race (67).BTL HORSE
1st off 43 day layoff.2 races in one
pattern.Class Change 5 Finished 4 from
post 1 TIW= 68

**Chased 4wd; weakened (63)** DROP
SWITCH 1st off 64 day layoff.Class
Change -4 Finished 7 from post 7 TIW= 41

NOTES FROM LAST RACE

SPD
110

73

65

69

66

70

68

#110

SPD
DS

73

66

69

66

67

68

#TDS

AVG
SPD

74

67

69

63

67

70

#R S1 S2 TOT SYS1

10

10

88

57

86

77

57

86

79 166

48

82

84 160

48

76

SYS2

5.90

6.60

5.80

6.20

CLOSE

0.66

0.81

1.02

1.14

1.16

1.19

CLOSE

TDS1

6.30

5.90

8.50

5.80

7.20

TDS2 CLOSE E1

0.89

0.83

1.05

1.28

1.33

91

90

75

86

E2

89

85

69

82

PFN

73

79

82

70

LAST FIVE
SPEED RATINGS

73,60,81,78,58

69,63,80,68,85

0,0,0,0,0

72,74,58,72,75

72,63,54,53,74

0,67,67,68,72

63,71,56,67,71

LAST FIVE
SPEED RATINGS

HIGH

BYER DSLR AVG3 BRIS P EQUIP MLINE

71.0

E/P 7

68.0 E/P 4

63.0 S 2]

45.0 P 3

63.0 S 1

10.00

8.00

8.00

8.00

TYPE CHNG SPPNT

PWR

101

114

104

110

109

PWR

ERLY
PACE
CLASS FINAL COMB TOTL

13.0 91.5 1e4.5 173

12.7 85.2 97.9 180

91.4 93.0 ]

13.3 90.9 104.2 175

11.7 85.2 96.9 144

90.9 92.9 ]

87.2 95.4 168

ERLY
PACE
CLASS FINAL COMB TOTL

TOTL
PACE
LAST

253

®

254

226

®

238

TOTL
PACE
LAST

COMMENTS

Chased 3-4w;best rest/
Bit slow;duel ins;wknd/
Angled 3-4w;led;caught
3wd;checked near wire/
Dueled inside;weakened/
Stalked 4-3wd;weakened

Vie ins;led late;naild/
Tossed head; off slow/
Vied ins;steadied 1/4

Bit slow; blocked 3/8/
Duel outside; 2nd best/
Threw head;crowded brk

Crowded bit st;inside/
Svd ground; no threat/ Bp
btw st;chck 2x erly

Lack speed;late effort/
Angled in trn;no rally/
Chased inside; no bid

Chased 4wd; weakened/
Angled 6wd;mild rally/
4-5wide turn;no menace

COMMENTS

3/7/22

PERFECTO

MONGOLIAN

GRANADA

MONGOL

ME MACHO

SIR

455

551

555

8>8

6>5

R>R,D>D

R>R,D>D

R>R,D>D

R>R,T>D

S>R,T>D

S5R,D>D

**Qutside; weakened (73)** DROP SWITCH
Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
2-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed?
WATCH! 1st off 31 day layoff.Class
Change -29 Finished 4 from post 2 TIW=
47

**0ff bit slow; 4wd trip (68)** DROP
SWITCH Slow last race (13). 1st off 31
day layoff.Class Change -29 Finished 5
from post 4 TIW= 55

**#4w turns;reeled in foe (75)**THIRD OFF
MAYBE? Made big overall move

(3) .Uncharacteristic race?BTL HORSE 1st
off 37 day layoff.Class Change 10
Finished 1 from post 5 TIW= 43

**Bumped start;no menace (77)** *Stretch
gain (1). Class Change -14 Finished 5
from post 5 TIW= 47

**#0ff bit slow; 3-4wide (72)** *Stretch
gain (1.25). 1st off 43 day layoff.Class
Change -14 Finished 8 from post 8 TIW=
18

*#Bpd st;5-3wd;no rally (69)** *Stretch
gain (.75). Class Change @ Finished 5
from post 6 TIW= 68

80

71

77

85

72

80

71

77

85

72

81

65

77

73

74

10

10

10

10

82

72

80

82

89

78

95

95

88

78

7.10

7.30

5.80

5.00

0.98

1.21

1.31

1.42

1.48

6.80

9.10

7.30

1.40

7.30

1.40

0.93

2.00

1.73

1.00

1.00

79

54

81

82

87

78

56

84

79

88

67

96

69

83

73

73,81,68,73,78

68,81,80,77,76

75,66,68,49,0

77,74,76,80,77

72,85,72,67,78

69,75,77,88,71

81 22
80 22
68 43
80 22
74 70
82 43
75 64
HIGH

BYER DSLR
78 31
94 31
75 37
82 24
85 43
77 23

76.0 E/P 4

70.0 S 2

76.0 S 2

76.0 E/P 4

74.0 P 3

TRK DIS
SA 5.5
SA 5.5
LA 4.6
SA 5.5
SA 8.0
LA 4.6
SA 6.0
TRK DIS
SA 8.0
SA 8.0
SA 8.5
SA 9.0
SA 6.0
SA 5.5

oC 24.1
oC 24.1
oC 24.1
C 13.8
oC 0.0
oC 10.3
oC 3.4
CHNG  SPPNT
>C  34.8
>Cc  17.4
M>C 8.7
C 8.7
C 17.4
C 13.0

117

107

111

112

113

12.4 85.9 98.3 166

13.5 82.2 95.7 157

13.3 85.6 98.9 110

11.9 88.9 100.8 165

92.1 99.2 161

11.7 89.0 100.7 175

224

206

234

244

248

Outside; weakened/ Set
prssrd pace;flttnd/
Stalked;duel;led;faded

Off bit slow; 4wd trip/
Asked 3-4wd;edged 2nd/
Bobbld/bpd st;3-2w 2nd

4w turns;reeled in foe/
Chased btwn;tight 5/16/
Off bit slow; inside

Bumped start;no menace/
Off slow/brushed;3-5wd/
Ins-2wd;angld 5w;drftd
Off bit slow; 3-4wide/
Bid 1/2;clear 3/8;held/
Chased 2-3wd; no rally

Bpd st;5-3wd;no rally/
Brk in;bumped;2-3wide/
4-5wd;2-5wd;no factor



ERLY TOTL

SPD SPD AVG LAST FIVE HIGH PACE PACE
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE PPOT LAST DS NOTES FROM LAST RACE 110 #110 TDS #TDS SPD #R S1 S2 TOT SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDS1 TDS2 CLOSE E1 E2 PFN SPEED RATINGS BYER DSLR AVG3 BRIS P EQUIP MLINE CLS TRK DIS TYPE CHNG SPPNT PWR CLASS FINAL COMB TOTL LAST COMMENTS
3/7/22 SA 4 8.6 11 COOL 2>5 S>R,T>T **Off slw;jmp track erly (79)** Chased ERR 0 ERR @ 79 1 85 84169 5.00 8.30 0.60 ERR ERR ERR 83 98 71 79,0,0,0,0 (2] 37 79.86 S 4 @ 2.50 169 SA 6.5 S S>S 11.4 119 14.2 86.2 100.4 186 257 Off slw;jmp track erly/ /

Pace. Made a big move early (3.5).BTL
HORSE 1st off 37 day layoff.Class Change
2 Finished 5 from post 2 TIW= 104

8.0 77 BRAVESTONE 2>2 R>R,D>T  **Hit gate; waited 2nd (82)** Flashed ERR 0 ERR © 6410 84 83166 4.99 6.80 0.72 ERR ERR ERR 90 86 81 82,73,76,74,80 (2] 45 77.0 E/P 5 0 8.00 140 SA 8.0 S M>S 14.3 113 13.8 87.6 101.4 176 257 Hit gate; waited 2nd/
speed. *Pressed Pace from 2-hole. Vied btwn 2nd;no match/
*Stretch gain (1.87). Fast last race Off bit slow;saved 2nd
(18) .BTL HORSE 1st off 45 day layoff.2
races in one pattern.Class Change 21
Finished 2 from post 2 TIW= 38

8.0 33 EREBUS 6>2 R>R,T>T **Pressed; 2nd best (78)** Flashed 76 3 76 3 6710 82 9 177 5.30 6.10 0.87 4.80 3.80 1.25 75 79 81 78,76,76,73,60 78 29 77.0 E/P 8 © 3.00 169 SA 8.0 S S>S 22.9 119 14.8 84.8 99.6 154 235 Pressed; 2nd best/
speed. *Pressed Pace from 6-hole. Fast Pace;duel 2nd;gamely/
last race (11).Uncharacteristic early Chased inside;weakened
speed? WATCH! Class Change 2 Finished 2
from post 6 TIW= 45

8.0 22 SIPPIN N 255 R>R,D>T  **Bpd st;tght/steady 2nd (55)** DROP 71 2 71 2 68 8 77 61138 6.40 6.70 0.95 6.70 6.70 1.00 88 80 39 55,71,71,73,69 71 51 66.0 P 4 0 10.00 175 SA 8.5 S N>S 11.4 169 5.0 73.6 78.6 168 207 Bpd st;tght/steady 2nd/
SWITCH Flashed speed. Slow last race Rough beginning;2-3wd/
(13) .Uncharacteristic race? 1st off 51 Waitd 2nd;bpd past 1/8
day layoff.Class Change -53 Finished 5
from post 2 TIW= 38

8.0 44 OVER 1>6 S>R,D>T **Off slw;steadied early (61)** Class ERR 0 ERR © 61 1 8 73158 8.60 8.60 1.00 ERR ERR ERR 78 83 66 61,0,0,0,0 0 29 61.0NA 1 0 15.00 169 SA 6.0 S S$>S 2.9 106 10.7 83.6 94.3 161 227 Off slw;steadied early/ /
Change 2 Finished 6 from post 1 TJW= 61

8.0 11 11 STRAUS'S 3>3 R>R,D>T **Chased 2path; no bid (68)** Flashed ERR 0 ERR © 73 5 74 87160 5.80 5.60 1.05 ERR ERR ERR 66 60 80 68,84,72,70,73 0 37 75.0 E/P 5 © 6.00 129 SA 8.5S M>S 14.3 111 13.4 82.2 95.6 126 206 Chased 2path; no bid/
speed.Uncharacteristic early speed? Shftd out7/16;1late bid/
WATCH! 1st off 37 day layoff.Class 3w into str;missed 3rd
Change 50 Finished 3 from post 3 TJW= 68

8.0 55  STEMWINDER 7>6 S>R,T>T **Hit gate/off slow;ins (61)** 1st off ERR 0 ERR @ 61 1 81 86 166 10.00 8.60 1.17 ERR ERR ERR 63 70 79 61,0,0,0,0 0 38 61.0 NA 1 0 15.00 144 SA 6.0 S M>S 2.9 160 9.4 85.7 95.1 133 212 Hit gate/off slow;ins/ /
38 day layoff.Class Change 27 Finished 6
from post 7 TIW= 60

8.0 99 JUST ABOUT 6>6 R>R,T>T **2-3wd turns; empty (72)** 1st off 50 75 5 75 5 75 6 8 88173 8.10 6.60 1.23 8.0 6.30 1.27 79 82 70 72,76,78,78,73 78 50 75.0 E/P 3 BON 4.00 171 SA 8.0 S S$>S 8.6 107 10.9 90.6 101.4 161 231 2-3wd turns; empty/
day layoff.Class Change -4 Finished 6 3w;1/8bid;2nd best/ Bpd
from post 6 TIW= 63 2x start; kept on

8.0 66 DARK 255 R>R,T>T **Off slow; checked 3/4 (74)** *Stretch 74 1 74 1 72 3 78 97174 7.30 5.40 1.36 7.10 7.10 1.00 68 71 83 74,78,65,0,0 74 29 72.0S 2 © 5.00 167 SA 8.0 S S>S 5.7 118 14.2 83.5 97.7 139 222 Off slow; checked 3/4/
gain (1.5). Class Change 2 Finished 5 Off slow; mild rally/
from post 2 TIW= 49 4-5wide; no threat

8.0 10 10 BLUE STAR 8>8 R>R,D>T  **3-4wd;5wd;nvr involved (55)** Slow 77 6 77 8 7210 70 75145 8.50 5.30 1.60 8.20 4.9 1.66 63 59 65 55,77,71,80,81 81 226 68.0 S 2] 0 12.00 157 DMR 8.0 S M>S 0.0 97 10.7 83.8 93.7 122 187 3-4wd;5wd;nvr involved/
last race (17). 1st off 226 day Brushed st;angled 4wd/
layoff.Class Change 50 Finished 8 from Ins;came out;no impact
post 8 TIW= 70

8.0 88 ITS BIG 555 R>R,T>T **Lacked rm/angl in 2nd (66)** Made big 66 1 66 1 68 2 78 102 179 8.706 5.30 1.63 10.00 6.30 1.60 69 58 83 66,70,0,0,0 66 44 68.0 S 2 BOFF 12.00 137 SA 8.0 S m>S 5.7 101 10.4 83.6 94.80 127 210 Lacked rm/angl in 2nd/
overall move (3). *Stretch gain (5.5). Bpd st;ins;angled out/

Big late move (5.5).BTL HORSE 1st off 44
day layoff.zZ pattern.Class Change 32
Finished 5 from post 5 TIW= 38

ERLY TOTL
SPD SPD AVG LAST FIVE HIGH PACE PACE
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG  HORSE PPOT LAST DS NOTES FROM LAST RACE 110 #110 TDS #TDS SPD #R S1 S2 TOT SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDS1 TDS2 CLOSE E1 E2 PFN SPEED RATINGS BYER DSLR AVG3 BRIS P EQUIP MLINE CLS TRK DIS TYPE CHNG SPPNT PWR CLASS FINAL COMB TOTL LAST COMMENTS
3/7/22 SA 5 6.5 55 MARTINI 050 0>5,>D  ** (@)** 1st off 738221 day layoff. ERR 0 ERR @ ERR © 57 -9 48 ERR ERR  ERR ERR ERR  ERR ] ] 0,0,0,0,0 ] *¥*kX ERR NA 0 0 1.60 ERR 0.0 S >S 0.0 0.0 ERR ERR ] e/ /

FTS.Invalid last race. Finished @ from
post @ TIW= 106
6.5 2 2  KIRSTENBOS 0>0 0>S,>D  ** (0)** 1st off 738221 day layoff. ERR @ ERR @ ERR © 57 -9 48 ERR ERR ERR ERR  ERR 2] 2] 0,0,0,0,0 (2] Frxk NA @ @ 5.00 ERR 0.0 S >S 0.0 0.0 ERR ERR ] e/ /
FTS.Invalid last race. Finished @ from
post @ TIW= 60
6.5 44 MUSICA 6>2 S>S,D>D  **Off slow;bid 3dp;yield (83)** Flashed 83 1 83 1 8 1 9 80170 1.40 2.99 ©.50 1.40 2.99 0.50 88 93 83 83,0,0,0,0 83 37 83.0P 4 © 2.00 170 SA 6.0 S S>S 26.7 124 12.5 89.7 102.2 181 264 Off slow;bid 3dp;yield/ /
speed. *Pressed Pace from 6-hole.BTL
HORSE 1st off 37 day layoff.Class Change
0 Finished 2 from post 6 TIW= 59
6.5 3 3 SECRET FIX 7>6 S>S,D>D  **Qutside;btwn trn;wknd (67)** Flashed 67 1 67 1 67 1 8 70159 4.30 8.60 4.30 8.60 0.50 91 92 65 67,0,0,0,0 67 37 67.0NA 6 @ 10.00 170 SA 6.0 S S>S 40.0 115 10.7 90.4 101.1 183 248 Outside;btwn trn;wknd/ /
speed. *Pressed Pace from
7-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed?
WATCH! 1st off 37 day layoff.Class
Change © Finished 6 from post 7 TIW= 43
6.5 11 L BEE 6>11 R>S,T>D **Inside;never involved (59)** DROP ERR @ ERR @ 59 1 68 89 156 8.30 9.20 0.91 ERR ERR ERR 59 57 73 59,0,0,0,0 [’} 120 59.0 NA 0@ @ 20.00 172 DMR 8.0 S S>S 0.0 107 6.4 82.0 88.4 116 189 Inside;never involved/ /
SWITCH 1st off 120 day layoff.Class
Change -2 Finished 11 from post 6 TJIW=

78

6.5 66 AMERICAN 453 S>S,D>D  **Duel inside; clear 3rd (80)** Flashed 84 2 84 2 77 5 8 78167 4.20 4.20 1.00 3.60 3.60 1.00 92 93 80 80,87,65,76,75 87 37 77.0 E/P 5 @ 2.50 167 SA 6.0 S S>S 33.3 124 14.6 92.1 106.7 185 265 Duel inside; clear 3rd/
speed. *Pressed Pace from 3dp;led pst 1/8;nailed/
4-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? Pulled 1st; clear 2nd

WATCH! Clear early.lst off 37 day
layoff.Class Change @ Finished 3 from
post 4 TIW= 72



DATE

3/7/22

DATE

TRK #

SA 6

TRK #

DT PP

PRG

HORSE

COMMANDER

EXPLOSIVE

THANKS

SWISS SWOO

MY SUMMER

CHERUBIC

WEARENOTBA

BIG SCOTT

GENERAL

PPOT

252

4>9

555

4>1

1>3

552

5>6

552

LAST DS

$55,D5T

R>S, T>T

R>S, T>T

R>S, T>T

S>S,T>T

S>S,T>T

S>S,D>T

S>S,T>T

R>S,T>T

SPD
NOTES FROM LAST RACE 110
**Little left inside (76)** DROP SWITCH
Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
3-hole. 1st off 65 day layoff.Class
Change -30 Finished 7 from post 3 TIW=
52
**Met bid;clear;yielded (85)**THIRD OFF
Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
2-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed?
WATCH!BTL HORSE Clear early.Class Change
10 Finished 2 from post 2 TIW= 70
**Stalked inside; tired (72)** Flashed
speed. Fast last race (11). 1st off 52
day layoff.Class Change 20 Finished 9
from post 4 TIW= 31
**#Bpd 2x st;stalk 2w;wkn (82)**THIRD OFF
Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
5-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed?
WATCH! Class Change 20 Finished 5 from
post 5 TIW= 63
**Came out;bmpd 2x turn (86)** Flashed
speed. *Pressed Pace from 4-hole. Fast
last race (11).BTL HORSE 1st off 50 day
layoff.Class Change 40 Finished 1 from
post 4 TIW= 92
**2-3wd; late effort (87)** *Stretch
gain (4.25).Uncharacteristic race?BTL
HORSE 1st off 38 day layoff.Class Change
20 Finished 3 from post 1 TIW= 59
**Stlkd;ins;2nd best (83)** Chased Pace. ERR
Made big overall move (3).BTL HORSE
Class Change 35 Finished 2 from post 5
TIW= 56
**%2w;angl out;mild rally (77)** *Stretch 77
gain (2.25). Slow last race (9).BTL
HORSE 1st off 59 day layoff.Class Change
10 Finished 6 from post 5 TIW= 62
**Late rally; lost bob (90)** Made big
overall move (5). Made a big move early
(5). *Stretch gain (5.44). Big late move
(5.44). Very strong move! Take note!
Fast last race (11).BTL HORSE 1st off
182 day layoff.Class Change 19 Finished
2 from post 5 TIW= 37

86

81

79

79

81

87

ERR

NOTES FROM LAST RACE

#110

SPD
DS

79

79

80

81

87

ERR

77

ERR

#TDS

AVG
SPD

81

61

81

75

85

77

86

79

#R S1 S2

10

9%

86

94

91

93

89

89

85

93

92

88

91

90

86

90

99

TOT

Sys1

SYS2 CLOSE

6.40 0.73

7.00 0.78

6.40 0.83

5.80 0.93

6.50 1.

26

.28

6.00 1.

.69

CLOSE

TDS1

4.20

2.90

4.20

6.20

8.10

ERR

10.00

ERR

TDS2

4.30

ERR

ERR

CLOSE

0.56

0.40

0.82

1.45

1.42

ERR

1.17

ERR

98

83

106

94

81

91

75

81

E2

94

95

81

106

93

93

90

83

90

PFN

73

78

71

57

87

87

86

86

92

LAST FIVE
SPEED RATINGS

76,71,69,93,88

85,86,81,86,77

72,78,82,68,43

82,87,81,79,82

86,84,73,76,62

87,88,80,93,82

83,85,72,63,80

77,80,86,87,93

90,84,81,74,67

LAST FIVE
SPEED RATINGS

CHNG

R>A

CO>A

CO>A

M>A

CO>A

R>A

R>A

R>A

CHNG

SPPNT

9.1

13.6

4.5

13.6

0.0

0.0

SPPNT

ERLY
PACE

PWR CLASS FINAL COMB TOTL

124

106

120

125

128

119

114

117

PWR

12.0

15.9

15.1

15.7

16.2

15.1

16.4

CLASS FINAL

87.2 99.2 190

90.5 106.4 193

84.9 88.6 164

89.7 104.8 212

94.1 109.8 187

93.0 109.2 174

93.9 108.9 181

102.8 158

90.4 106.8 171

ERLY
PACE
coMB  TOTL

TOTL
PACE
LAST

271

235

269

274

261

267

244

26

w

TOTL
PACE
LAST

COMMENTS

Little left inside/ Ins
foe;headed 1/4;wkn/
Duel2w;4p upr;gave way

Met bid;clear;yielded/
Checkd early;willingly/
Stlk 3w;weakened

Stalked inside; tired/
Pace;edged clear/ Bobbld
st;boxed in str

Bpd 2x st;stalk 2w;wkn/
Lost pth early;gaining/
Off bit slow;duel;wknd

Came out;bmpd 2x turn/ Bk
slw;crwd3/8;lack rm/
Ins;tipd out;no respns

2-3wd; late effort/
Bumped st;2-3w;closed/
Threw head; hopped brk

Stlkd;ins;2nd best/ Bbl
st;angl out;dug in/ Sttl
4w;outfinished

2w;angl out;mild rally/
Off rail;btw;no threat/
Swide turn; along 3rd

Late rally; lost bob/

Angled out; outclosed/
Swung 7w;1ggd in upper

COMMENTS

3/7/22

WHAT IN

BIG PAPA

FRANKLIN

ONEPARTICU

QUICK BUCK

555

351

6>3

551

551

$>S,T>D

$>S,D>D

$55,D5D

$55,T>D

R>S,D>D

$55,D5D

**prss;duel;led;2nd best (86)** Flashed
speed. *Pressed Pace from 3-hole.BTL
HORSE Clear early.Class Change @
Finished 2 from post 3 TJIW= 50

**Angled in turn; tired (62)** DROP
SWITCH Slow last race (11). 1st off 37
day layoff.Class Change -30 Finished 5
from post 5 TIW= 97

**2w;asked 1/8;responded (74)** Flashed
speed. *Pressed Pace from
3-hole.Uncharacteristic race?BTL HORSE
1st off 36 day layoff.Class Change 45
Finished 1 from post 3 TIW= 76

**Chck early;lack rm trn (81)**THIRD OFF 8@
Made big overall move (4). *Stretch gain
(2.5). Class Change @ Finished 3 from

post 6 TIW= 63

**#0ff slw;3w;clear;lastd (82)** Made big ERR
overall move (3).Uncharacteristic early
speed? WATCH!BTL HORSE 1st off 43 day
layoff.Class Change 50 Finished 1 from
post 5 TIW= 51

**Vie 3dp;duel;clr;held (84)** Flashed
speed. *Pressed Pace from 5-hole.BTL
HORSE Clear early.Class Change 25
Finished 1 from post 5 TW= 73

ERR

74

84

73

74

80

74

84

73

71

81

76

84

91

88

88

77

95

64

85

90

84

78

161

4.20 1.00

5.80

3.9 1.22

7.106 1.25

1.40 2.00

4.20

6.00

2.90

10.00

2.90

2.00

1.40

1.40

1.00

3.00

2.00

1.38

2.00

94

84

83

78

97

96

83

88

84

100

48

84

86

83

77

86,81,75,83,80

62,82,75,0,0

74,68,0,8,0

81,81,80,0,0

82,71,74,0,0

84,0,0,0,0

HIGH

BYER DSLR
93 65
86 14
82 52
87 17
86 50
93 38
[ 30
77 59
0 182
HIGH

BYER DSLR
83 24
82 37
74 36
80 24
74 43
84 29

AVG3 BRIS P EQUIP MLINE
72.0 E BON  4.00
84.0 E/P 0 4.00
77.0 E 0 20.00
83.0 E 0 3.50
81.0 P 0 3.00
85.0 P 0 3.50
80.0 P 0 12.00
81.0 S 0 6.00
85.0 S 0 6.00

AVG3 BRIS P EQUIP MLINE
81.0 E/P 0 2.50
73.0 E/P 0 1.60
71.0 E/P 0 12.00
81.0 E/P 0 2.50
76.0 S 0 12.00
84.0 E 0 4.00

TRK DIS TYPE
OP 6.0A
SA 8.0 A
SA 8.0A
SA 9.0A
SA 6.0 A
SA 6.0 A
GG 5.5A
SA 6.0A
DMR 8.0 A
TRK DIS TYPE
SA 6.0 A
SA 7.0 A
GG 5.5A
SA 6.0 A
SA 8.0 A
SA 6.0 A

G2>A

S>A

M>A

S>A

17.4

21.7

0.0

26.1

127

116

126

112

133

14.7

13.9

14.5

15.7

16.0

85.7 100.4 194

84.4 94.0 190

89.6 103.5 167

90.0 104.5 171

72.9 88.6 162

89.2 105.2 197

238

25

-

257

245

274

Prss;duel;led;2nd best/
Rated;duel inside;wknd/
Bumped foe; vied;faded

Angled in turn; tired/
Ranged up 4w;pwrd away/
Duel inside; game 2nd

2w;asked 1/8;responded/
Hit gt/off slw;stdylst/

Chck early;lack rm trn/
Prssd;duel turn;wknd/ Bid
turn;dueled;dug in

Off slw;3w;clear;lastd/

Never a menace/ Hopped
st; no factor

Vie 3dp;duel;clr;held/ /



DATE

3/7/22

TRK #

SA 8

10

11

PRG

10

11

HORSE

RHEA MOON

BANJO

SQUILLIONS

ELEUTHERA

GRANOLA

MIDNIGHT

ROCK THE

EXIT SOUL

ANNIE'S

SUNROOF

DUVET DAY

PPOT

356

8>9

6>7

9>4

757

2>7

956

6>7

3>2

LAST DS

SR, T>T

SR, T>T

R>R, T>T

R>R, T>T

SR, T>T

SR, T>T

RSR, T>T

RSR, T>T

RSR, T>T

SR, T>T

R>R, T>T

SPD

NOTES FROM LAST RACE 110
*% (@)**BTL HORSE 1st off 198 day ERR
layoff.Class Change 6 Finished 2 from
post @ TIW= 104
**3deep/4wd; no rally (86)** Chased ERR
Pace. *Stretch gain (.25).BTL HORSE 1st
off 37 day layoff.2 races in one
pattern.Class Change @ Finished 6 from
post 3 TIW= 66
**Hesitated; off slow (48)** 1st off 37 48
day layoff.Class Change @ Finished 9
from post 8 TIW= 43
**#Brk in;bpd;duel 2w;wkn (77)** Flashed 74

speed. *Pressed Pace from
6-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed?

WATCH! Clear early.lst off 51 day
layoff.Class Change -55 Finished 7 from

post 6 TIW= 47

**Angled 5wd;closed well (89)** Made big 68
overall move (3). *Stretch gain (2.25).

Fast last race (15).BTL HORSE 1st off 37

day layoff.Class Change @ Finished 4

from post 9 TIW= 61

**0ff slow;stumbld early (79)** 1st off ERR
37 day layoff.Class Change @ Finished 7
from post 7 TIW= 75

**0ff slow; inside (79)** *Stretch gain
(1.5). Class Change @ Finished 7 from
post 2 TIW= 50

**Checked hard upper (86)**BTL HORSE 1st 81
off 37 day layoff.Class Change @

Finished 6 from post 9 TIW= 63
*%2w;3w;rally;not enough (91)** *Stretch 87
gain (1.25).BTL HORSE 1st off 37 day
layoff.Class Change @ Finished 2 from

post 4 TIW= 58

**0ff slw;jmp trck early (76)** Made big ERR
overall move (5). *Stretch gain (2.25).

1st off 58 day layoff.Class Change @
Finished 7 from post 6 TIW= 51

**Tossed head st;2w;3-4w (91)**THIRD OFF 87
MAYBE? Made big overall move (4).

*Stretch gain (2.25).BTL HORSE 1st off

37 day layoff.Class Change @ Finished 2

from post 3 TIW= 64

76

ERR

48

74

68

ERR

76

81

87

ERR

87

AVG
#TDS SPD

#R S1 S2

91

77

86

95

91

94

98

99

58

2 86 101

TOT

SY:

10.

10.

10.

S1

.60

00

.70

.90

00

.10

.40

.90

00

.60

SYS2 CLOSE
ERR  ERR
6.70 0.83

10.00

.06

.15

.29

.30

.63

.71

.67

TDS1

ERR

10.00

3.9

1.00

ERR

8.20

3.80

ERR

7.60

TDS2 CLOSE

ERR

10.00

5.00

ERR

7.30

5.30

ERR

ERR

1.00

1.09

0.20

ERR

1.13

1.40

1.60

ERR

2.67

89

76

98

89

81

88

85

92

60

89

E2

93

69

98

9%

85

87

89

95

66

92

LAST FIVE

PFN SPEED RATINGS

0,0,0,0,0

85 86,0,0,0,0

44 48,0,0,0,0
62 77,77,56,69,0

93 89,64,82,67,68

84 79,0,0,0,0
77 79,67,73,0,0
85 86,75,0,0,0

86 91,990,83,0,0

100

76,0,0,0,0

90 91,82,0,0,0

HIGH

BYER DSLR AVG3

48

77

68

79

86

91

91

37

37

51

37

37

23

37

37

58

37

86.

70.

78.

79.

73.

81.

88.

76.

87.

2]

2]

2]

BRIS P EQUIP MLINE

E/P

E/P

BOFF

BON

BON

BON

50.

12.

20.

.00

00

.00

.00

00

.00

.00

.50

00

.50

TRK DIS
CGH 6.0
SA 6.5
SA 8.0
SA 8.0
SA 6.5
SA 6.5
SA 8.0
SA 8.0
SA 8.0
SA 6.5
SA 8.0

TYPE CHNG
S N>S
S S$>S
S S$>S
S N>S
S S$>S
S S$>S
S S$>S
S S$>S
S S$>S
S S$>S
S S$>S

SPPNT

20.0

0.0

30.0

25.0

5.0

0.0

0.0

15.0

5.0

0.0

PWR CLASS FINAL

125

89

125

126

119

117

127

145

119

138

12.

14.

15.

15.

17.

10.

16.

7

89.

83.

86.

89.

88.

82.

87.

88.

90.

88.

9

2]

3

2

7

7

7

ERLY TOTL
PACE PACE
COMB  TOTL LAST

102.0 182 267

88.5 145 189

101.0 196 258

104.9 179 272

97.0 166 250

89.4 175 252

103.1 174

©

25

187 27

w

100.9 126 226

105.6 181 271

COMMENTS

3deep/4wd; no rally/ /

Hesitated; off slow/ /

Brk in;bpd;duel 2w;wkn/
Brk in;bmpd;willingly/
Angled in turn;weaknd

Angled 5wd;closed well/
Chased 3wide;flattened/
Ins-2wd;angld out str

Off slow;stumbld early/

off slow; inside/
Fractious;awkwrd start/
Fracts;frcd out;bpd st
Checked hard upper/ Off
slw/bmpd;shftd 3/8/

2w;3w;rally;not enough/
Bid upper;led past 1/8/
Bid 3deep; edged 2nd

Off slw;jmp trck early/

Tossed head st;2w;3-4w/
Pnblld st;brf stdy 2nd/

~

~



