

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	DST	SURF	MOVING?	AVG				HIGH				LAST FIVE FIGS	TJW% CLS	COMMENT	BEST OVERAL	BEST LAST	TOTALS																		
									SPD	R#	TDS	RT	ASP	RT	110	RD							PLUSL3	SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	TDS1	TDS2	CLOSE	BROT1	E1	E2	LATE	CLOSE	TOTL	Last	DSL	BTOT	BRIS	POWER
6/23/22	CD	7	8.5	6	6	MASQUEPA	R>R D>D	F/PP/BTL/SG:1.37/Y(3>2) Class Change 0	93	9	94	8	94	7	94	4.4	3.5	1.3	3.8	3.5	1.1	55.74	91	98	94	0.96	189	283	41	367	102	140.2	1.00	98,97,97,102,102	76	197	4p upr; rally; gaining	389	279	668
			8.5	1	1	SILVER	R>R D>D	F/PP/SP-15/Y(4>4) Class Change 0	92	10	93	9	93	9	93	5.4	5.6	1.0	5.3	5.3	1.0	54.51	75	80	76	0.95	155	231	28	315	104	135.2	4.00	77,86,98,82,88	92	224	Chased; empty late	380	223	603
			8.5	8	8	SPA CITY	R>R D>D	F/PP/BTL/UN?/ESP/Y(5>2) Class Change 31	92	10	92	9	92	9	92	4.7	3.1	1.5	4.5	3.1	1.5	54.23	74	82	94	1.15	156	250	62	326	103	134.6	10.00	88,92,103,90,93	88	197	Drifted late; caught	384	248	632
			8.5	2	2	INTREPID	R>R D>D	CP/BOM:3/BM1:8/Y(3>2) Class Change 5	91	10	91	10	91	9	92	7.1	4.1	1.7	7.1	4.1	1.7	55.93	88	94	85	0.90	182	267	54	348	100	135.7	3.00	90,100,97,93,88	167	184	2-3wd; bid 4wd 5/16	375	259	635
			8.5	3	3	MY SIXTH	R>R D>D	FLR+16_N(5>5) Class Change 0	89	10	89	10	88	9	90	6.0	5.5	1.1	6.0	5.5	1.1	54.76	86	90	89	0.99	176	265	41	344	98	127.8	15.00	90,74,82,89,98	97	218	3path upper; moved up	371	258	630
			8.5	5	5	YOU'RE	R>R D>D	N(2>4) Class Change 51	87	10	87	10	89	7	88	7.7	5.7	1.3	7.7	5.7	1.3	53.47	79	83	83	1.00	162	245	55	324	102	124.6	30.00	83,77,88,84,87	22	215	Bmpd st; 5p upr;faded	366	239	605
			8.5	4	4	WHISKEY	R>R T>D	BTL/SG:.75/N(5>5) Class Change 0	86	10	81	2	81	2	87	6.3	4.6	1.4	4.5	4.1	1.1	53.94	82	91	83	0.91	173	256	33	337	93	130.6	12.00	85,80,82,93,88	141	212	2w;5p upr;no rally	367	247	614
			8.5	7	7	FENWICK	R>R T>D	F/PP/FLR+12_WATCH/ESP/Y(7>1) Class Change -4	85	10	ERR	0	ERR	0	86	5.6	4.4	1.3	ERR	ERR	ERR	52.12	65	68	96	1.41	133	229	62	236	94	135.9	10.00	94,82,86,82,93	106	207	Repelled foe;held firm	368	246	614

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	DST	SURF	MOVING?	AVG				HIGH				LAST FIVE FIGS	TJW% CLS	COMMENT	BEST OVERAL	BEST LAST	TOTALS																		
									SPD	R#	TDS	RT	ASP	RT	110	RD							PLUSL3	SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	TDS1	TDS2	CLOSE	BROT1	E1	E2	LATE	CLOSE	TOTL	Last	DSL	BTOT	BRIS	POWER
6/23/22	CD	8	9.5	10	10	INSIGNIA	S>R D>D	BOM:7/BM1:5.75/SG:2.75/FLR+90_* 2 in 1 *N(2>2) Class Change 5	90	1	ERR	0	ERR	0	ERR	6.7	2.2	3.0	ERR	ERR	ERR	57.49	74	88	96	1.09	162	258	53	258	90	125.1	1.60	90,0,0,0,0	183	185	Off step slw;rail trip	346	244	590
			9.5	9	9	FIVE	R>R D>D	SP-11/SLR?- 13N(8>10) Class Change 0	76	6	77	5	ERR	0	77	4.9	6.0	0.8	4.5	5.5	0.8	52.39	65	64	72	1.13	129	201	27	269	89	120.8	4.50	65,78,89,79,73	156	170	7-wd upper stretch	313	183	496
			9.5	2	2	SHE'S	R>R D>D	N(9>5) Class Change 0	76	3	77	2	ERR	0	76	6.5	4.4	1.5	5.0	4.1	1.2	52.92	68	69	81	1.17	137	218	27	295	80	120.3	6.00	74,80,75,0,0	127	189	5wd 7/8; 6wd 3/16	309	203	512
			9.5	5	5	SOUTH	R>R D>D	F/PP/BTL/WATCH/ESP/Y(6>2) Class Change 40	73	7	72	5	ERR	0	74	6.4	5.5	1.2	6.4	6.0	1.1	53.51	64	70	87	1.24	134	221	28	294	79	116.5	20.00	76,79,68,77,76	126	173	Stlk3p;bid3/8;caught	309	207	517
			9.5	8	8	AMENSET	R>R D>D	F/PP/BOM:3/SG:1/* 2 in 1 *Y(4>2) Class Change 0	72	5	79	1	ERR	0	73	5.0	5.8	0.9	4.0	2.0	2.0	53.13	69	71	88	1.24	140	228	27	304	79	116.6	4.00	79,69,79,72,62	90	173	Stlkd;4w uppr;2nd best	302	215	516
			9.5	6	6	MUSIC	R>R D>D	BOM:4/SG:.5/N(10>4) Class Change 0	71	2	74	1	ERR	0	72	8.3	4.4	1.9	7.0	4.0	1.7	52.60	66	66	84	1.27	132	216	27	288	74	114.3	12.00	74,67,0,0,0	48	189	4-3 wide bid;moved up	297	202	499
			9.5	1	1	HIGH	R>R D>D	BOM:3/N(9>9) Class Change 0	68	2	68	2	ERR	0	69	8.4	7.4	1.1	8.4	7.4	1.1	56.22	84	78	73	0.94	162	235	48	312	71	112.2	20.00	71,65,0,0,0	130	179	Numped st; no threat	290	207	497
			9.5	3	3	FOREVER	R>R D>D	FLR+66_N(1>9) Class Change 0	66	1	66	1	ERR	0	ERR	10.0	9.0	1.1	10.0	9.0	1.1	51.77	63	58	80	1.38	121	201	27	269	66	107.7	20.00	66,0,0,0,0	76	190	Slow early; no bid	281	184	465
			9.5	7	7	FINE	R>R D>D	F/PP/SP+16/Y(6>3) Class Change 0	61	9	80	2	ERR	0	62	4.7	7.2	0.7	2.1	2.6	0.8	53.34	71	73	82	1.12	144	226	27	304	83	119.2	6.00	77,83,55,69,25	94	174	5wd 3/16; kept on	290	211	501
			9.5	4	4	CINQ	R>R T>D	SLR?- 17N(7>9) Class Change 0	57	3	60	2	ERR	0	58	9.5	8.1	1.2	10.0	7.3	1.4	52.65	72	64	23	0.36	136	159	25	240	68	103.1	20.00	51,68,51,0,0	88	164	Never a factor	262	144	407

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	PPOT	AEPS	LAST DS	NOTES FROM LAST RACE	SPD			AVG			SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	TDS1	TDS2	CLOSE	E1	E2	LP	LAST FIVE SPEED RATINGS	HIGH BYER			PWR	CLASS	FINAL	COMB	ERLY TOTL		COMMENTS												
										110	#110	TDS	#TDS	SPD	#R											S1	S2	TOT					ATDS	DSL		AVG3	BRIS	P	EQUIP	MLINE	CLS	TRK	DIS	TYPE	CHNG	TOTL	LAST
6/23/22	BEL	1	8.5	1.1	ON PALM	7>5	1800	S>R,T>t	**3w pursuit; wknd late (69)** Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 7-hole.BTL HORSE 1st off 41 day layoff.Class Change 0 Finished 5 from post 7 TJW= 75	ERR	0	ERR	0	69	1	88	90	177	3.00	5.00	0.60	ERR	ERR	ERR	88	85	73	69,0,0,0,0	0	41	69.0	P	6	BON	2.00	141	BEL	6.0	M	M>M	104	12.0	88.1	100.1	173	246	3w pursuit; wknd late/ /
			8.5	7.7	DISENGAGE	1>5	3069	S>R,D>t	**Ins turn;no response (50)** Slow last race (11). 1st off 32 day layoff.Class Change 15 Finished 5 from post 1 TJW= 21	ERR	0	ERR	0	61	9	80	71	150	5.40	6.20	0.87	ERR	ERR	ERR	78	75	56	50,49,-,5,45,53	0	32	31.0	E	4	0	20.00	154	BEL	6.5	M	M>M	81	5.4	79.6	85.1	153	209	Ins turn;no response/ Chased 4-3w; tired/ Stumbled st; eased
			8.5	4.4	CAGNEY	3>5	2170	R>R,T>t	**In hand 2p; wknd late (71)** Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 3-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH! 1st off 34 day layoff.Class Change 0 Finished 5 from post 3 TJW= 39	65	4	65	4	65	7	78	93	170	6.00	6.00	1.00	5.70	6.50	0.87	89	80	66	71,67,69,61,66	71	34	69.0	E	4	0	6.00	154	BEL	8.5	M	M>M	98	6.3	80.8	87.0	169	235	In hand 2p; wknd late/ 2p turn;4p1/4;empty/ 7w upper; improved
			8.5	8.8	OUT THE	1>5	1545	R>R,D>t	**2-3w; never involved (18)** Class Change 0 Finished 5 from post 1 TJW= 24	ERR	0	ERR	0	23	2	69	56	124	9.20	9.20	1.00	ERR	ERR	ERR	54	34	19	18,28,0,0,0	0	21	23.0	NA	0	0	30.00	143	BEL	8.5	M	M>M	68	3.3	79.5	82.8	88	107	2-3w; never involved/ 3w; trailed throughout/
			8.5	6.6	RUSH TO	2>2	4612	R>R,D>t	**Led 6w upper; ran on (67)** Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 2-hole.SLR?-11Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH! Clear early.Class Change 0 Finished 2 from post 2 TJW= 60	ERR	0	ERR	0	67	5	86	78	163	6.00	5.40	1.11	ERR	ERR	ERR	75	68	70	67,78,62,58,69	0	21	69.0	E/P	4	0	2.50	147	BEL	8.5	M	M>M	108	13.8	85.5	99.3	143	213	Led 6w upper; ran on/ Ins trn;4w3/16;outckcd/ Broke in;3-4wide turn
			8.5	3.3	SELL	8>9	320	S>R,t>t	**5w upper; no impact (50)**THIRD OFF SLR?- 16 Slow last race (9). Class Change 0 Finished 9 from post 8 TJW= 46	ERR	0	ERR	0	59	6	80	86	166	8.40	7.60	1.11	ERR	ERR	ERR	74	71	65	50,66,64,60,52	0	26	60.0	NA	3	0	15.00	143	BEL	6.0	M	M>M	90	3.8	82.9	86.6	145	210	5w upper; no impact/ Leand in st;3-4p;nobid/ Chased 2p; tired
			8.5	2.2	CRAWFORD	5>3	2031	S>R,D>t	**Chased 4-3w; improved (70)** 1st off 60 day layoff.Class Change 0 Finished 3 from post 5 TJW= 56	ERR	0	ERR	0	63	3	72	81	153	7.40	5.90	1.25	ERR	ERR	ERR	78	69	85	70,60,60,0,0	0	60	63.0	S	4	0	6.00	163	AQU	7.0	M	M>M	101	11.9	76.5	88.5	147	232	Chased 4-3w; improved/ Bmpd brk;ins-2p turn/ Bumped st; tired
			8.5	5.5	TOGA	4>6	340	R>R,T>t	**Chased 3-2w; improved (67)** Made big overall move (5). *Stretch gain (2).BTL HORSE 1st off 62 day layoff.2 races in one pattern.Class Change 0 Finished 6 from post 4 TJW= 67	66	4	66	4	66	4	71	101	171	7.70	6.10	1.26	7.70	6.10	1.26	69	55	83	67,69,64,63,0	69	62	67.0	NA	2	0	3.50	158	AQU	8.5	M	M>M	102	12.4	80.6	93.0	124	207	Chased 3-2w; improved/ 5w upper; wknd late/ Ins turns;no response
			8.5	9.9	LUCKY	7>3	5029	R>R,D>t	**5p turn;chased;wknd (81)** DROP SWITCH Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 7-hole. 1st off 48 day layoff.Class Change -35 Finished 3 from post 7 TJW= 27	49	1	49	1	74	10	87	81	168	6.80	5.20	1.32	10.00	9.20	1.09	93	91	76	81,79,78,79,76	49	48	79.0	P	4	0	1.00	160	BEL	8.0	M	S>M	120	16.0	88.6	104.6	184	260	5p turn;chased;wknd/ 3w turn;5w1/4;willing/ 3-4w upper; ran on

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	PPOT	AEPS	LAST DS	NOTES FROM LAST RACE	SPD			AVG			SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	TDS1	TDS2	CLOSE	E1	E2	LP	LAST FIVE SPEED RATINGS	HIGH BYER			PWR	CLASS	FINAL	COMB	ERLY TOTL		COMMENTS												
										110	#110	TDS	#TDS	SPD	#R											S1	S2	TOT					ATDS	DSL		AVG3	BRIS	P	EQUIP	MLINE	CLS	TRK	DIS	TYPE	CHNG	TOTL	LAST
6/23/22	BEL	2	6.0	4.4	ROUGH	3>1	10766	S>S,D>D	**2-3p turn;lead3/16;clr (81)** Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 3-hole. Fast last race (13).BTL HORSE Clear early.1st off 33 day layoff.Class Change -5 Finished 1 from post 3 TJW= 79	68	5	68	5	68	5	87	82	168	2.90	5.20	0.55	2.90	5.20	0.55	96	94	80	81,54,70,75,60	81	33	68.0	E	7	0	1.80	157	BEL	6.0	C	C>C	117	13.9	86.7	100.5	190	270	2-3p turn;lead3/16;clr/ 3-deep;stdy 3/8;1/4/ Long lead; stayed safe
			6.0	1.1	GRIS	9>1	4446	S>S,D>D	**3-4p;rally;bid ins 1/8 (77)**THIRD OFF Fast last race (13).BTL HORSE Class Change 3 Finished 1 from post 9 TJW= 50	69	2	69	5	64	8	84	84	168	4.50	4.80	0.94	4.00	3.20	1.27	92	88	81	77,65,61,61,39	82	18	68.0	S	2	0	3.00	159	BEL	6.0	C	C>C	114	13.6	79.6	93.2	180	261	3-4p;rally;bid ins 1/8/ Rated;3-4w turn;empty/ Stalked ins;tired btwn
			6.0	3.3	THE	8>3	7199	S>S,D>D	**2-3w turn;willingly (72)** Made big overall move (9). Made a big move early (4.5). Class Change 3 Finished 3 from post 8 TJW= 40	67	9	67	9	67	9	81	84	165	4.00	3.90	1.03	4.00	3.90	1.03	79	82	81	72,59,71,50,72	75	18	67.0	E/P	2	0	8.00	151	BEL	6.0	C	C>C	110	9.6	82.4	92.0	161	242	2-3w turn;willingly/ 2w btw;checkd 1/2;4-5p/ Chased 3w; wknd late
			6.0	2.2	LONDON	3>6	4508	S>S,D>D	**2w 1/4p; faltered (23)** SLR?- 20 Slow last race (27). Class Change 7 Finished 6 from post 3 TJW= 28	43	5	49	8	50	9	81	59	139	7.30	7.00	1.05	7.10	6.70	1.06	75	70	27	23,43,70,56,69	70	19	45.0	E/P	3	0	20.00	140	BEL	6.5	C	C>C	99	3.8	79.0	82.9	145	172	2w 1/4p; faltered/ Stumbled st; no impact/ In hand ins; held on
			6.0	5.5	TACTICAL	3>4	3528	S>S,D>D	**Broke through gate (62)** DROP SWITCH Made big overall move (3).SLR?- 15 1st off 40 day layoff.Class Change -12 Finished 4 from post 3 TJW= 53	62	4	68	7	65	10	85	76	161	6.60	5.30	1.26	6.80	4.40	1.54	82	81	69	62,77,70,79,68	79	40	70.0	P	0	0	5.00	149	MTH	6.0	C	C>C	110	11.4	84.0	95.3	163	232	Broke through gate/ Tracked 3w; willingly/ Tight btw st; no rally
			6.0	6.6	DAWNLAND	5>2	9545	S>S,D>D	**3-5wide turn;willingly (78)** Made big overall move (3). *Stretch gain (1.25).BTL HORSE 1st off 33 day layoff.2 races in one pattern.Class Change -5 Finished 2 from post 5 TJW= 67	76	3	78	4	75	5	85	82	166	6.40	4.80	1.31	6.30	4.40	1.42	92	90	80	78,81,84,61,69	84	33	81.0	P	2	0	2.00	160	BEL	6.0	C	C>C	120	14.6	85.4	100.0	182	262	3-5wide turn;willingly/ 3wd 1/4; no threat/ Rail bid; driving

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	PPOT	AEPS	LAST DS	NOTES FROM LAST RACE	SPD 110	SPD #110	SPD TDS	AVG #TDS	SPD #R	S1	S2	TOT	SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	TDS1	TDS2	CLOSE	E1	E2	LP	LAST FIVE SPEED RATINGS	HIGH BYER ATDS	DSL R	AVG3	BRIS	P	EQUIP	MLINE	CLS	TRK	DIS	TYPE	CHNG	PWR	CLASS	FINAL	COMB	ERLY TOTL PACE	TOTL PACE	COMMENTS	
6/23/22	BEL	9	6.0	2 2	SHADOW BOX	0>0	1	0>S,>D	** (0)** 1st off 738329 day layoff. FTS.Invalid last race. Finished 0 from post 0 TJW= 70	ERR	0	ERR	0	ERR	0	57	-9	48	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	0	0	0,0,0,0,0	0	****	ERR	NA	0	0	10.00	ERR	0.0	M	>M	0.0	ERR	ERR	0	0	/ /			
			6.0	3 3	WARALO	0>0	1	0>S,>D	** (0)** 1st off 738329 day layoff. FTS.Invalid last race. Finished 0 from post 0 TJW= 60	ERR	0	ERR	0	ERR	0	57	-9	48	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	0	0	0,0,0,0,0	0	****	NA	0	0	15.00	ERR	0.0	M	>M	0.0	ERR	ERR	0	0	/ /				
			6.0	8 8	PERFECT	5>4	885	S>S,D>D	**Stumbled bad brk;bmpd (61)**THIRD OFF MAYBE? Chased Pace. 1st off 32 day layoff.Class Change 0 Finished 4 from post 5 TJW= 47	57	2	57	2	63	10	82	76	157	3.80	6.50	0.59	5.60	7.50	0.75	83	79	67	61,59,62,67,52	61	32	61.0	E/P	1	0	20.00	138	BEL	6.5	M	M>M	104	9.6	81.5	91.1	162	229	Stumbled bad brk;bmpd/ Bump start;2p;wknd/ Forward; brief bid btw
			6.0	6 6	LIMIT UP	3>2	3035	S>S,D>D	**2p turn;led past 1/8 (63)** Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 3-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH! Clear early.1st off 32 day layoff.Class Change 0 Finished 2 from post 3 TJW= 55	64	5	64	5	64	6	84	76	159	3.50	5.90	0.60	2.90	5.40	0.55	88	83	65	63,72,63,51,66	72	32	66.0	E/P	5	0	6.00	145	BEL	6.5	M	M>M	110	12.1	82.7	94.8	171	236	2p turn;led past 1/8/ In hand ins; caught/ Bmpd brk;bmpd early;2p
			6.0	7 7	SUIT OF	8>4	3069	S>S,D>D	**4w bid turn; weakened (74)** DROP SWITCH Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 8-hole. Class Change -15 Finished 4 from post 8 TJW= 35	69	2	61	4	67	8	90	75	165	4.10	5.90	0.69	2.60	6.30	0.41	94	95	71	74,68,77,29,63	77	25	73.0	P	4	0	5.00	155	MTH	6.0	M	M>M	114	12.9	88.1	101.0	189	260	4w bid turn; weakened/ 4w upper; wknd late/ 3p trn;bid;just missd
			6.0	4 4	HE'SGOTTAS	7>3	2960	S>S,D>D	**Outside;3p turn;wknd (62)** Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 7-hole. 1st off 32 day layoff.Class Change 0 Finished 3 from post 7 TJW= 52	65	5	65	5	65	6	83	76	158	3.60	5.10	0.70	3.90	5.40	0.73	85	81	66	62,66,65,75,60	75	32	64.0	E/P	5	0	6.00	139	BEL	6.5	M	M>M	109	12.0	82.4	94.3	166	232	Outside;3p turn;wknd/ Ins-2p;chad up;faded/ 2-3p turn;led3/16;wknd
			6.0	5 5	RAW	10>10	5146	S>S,t>D	**Stumbled badly start (47)** DROP SWITCH Flashed speed.SLR?- 22 Slow last race (22). 1st off 41 day layoff.Class Change -15 Finished 10 from post 10 TJW= 56	73	4	73	7	69	10	86	71	157	4.20	5.20	0.79	4.30	4.60	0.94	99	88	45	47,69,66,59,81	82	41	61.0	E	4	BON	15.00	161	BEL	6.0	M	M>M	103	7.3	83.7	91.0	187	232	Stumbled badly start/ Inside winner;wknd 1/8/ Chased ins; weakened
			6.0	9 9	MARTINI	1>10	204	S>S,t>D	**Ins turn;came out 1/4 (23)** DROP SWITCHSLR?- 28 Slow last race (14). 1st off 61 day layoff.Class Change -15 Finished 10 from post 1 TJW= 76	51	1	51	1	37	2	77	65	142	6.80	8.20	0.83	4.20	6.70	0.63	82	75	28	23,51,0,0,0	51	61	37.0	NA	1	0	15.00	133	AQU	6.0	M	M>M	88	4.8	78.8	83.5	157	185	Ins turn;came out 1/4/ 4-3wide turn;no threat/
			6.0	12 12	DEVIL OR	1>7	6450	S>S,T>D	**Chased 2p; no response (63)** DROP SWITCHSLR?- 11 Slow last race (10). 1st off 33 day layoff.Class Change -50 Finished 7 from post 1 TJW= 64	74	1	74	1	73	5	86	82	167	4.40	4.40	1.00	6.70	5.60	1.20	88	92	53	63,74,74,72,83	74	33	70.0	E/P	1	0	3.50	174	BEL	7.0	M	S>M	111	11.1	80.4	91.5	180	233	Chased 2p; no response/ 4 wide turn; no rally/ 2p turn;3pl/4;no rally
			6.0	10 10	BISERNO	9>10	450	S>S,T>D	**Showed little (52)** DROP SWITCH 1st off 56 day layoff.Class Change -50 Finished 10 from post 9 TJW= 32	ERR	0	ERR	0	52	1	71	88	158	10.00	10.00	1.00	ERR	ERR	ERR	61	62	76	52,0,0,0,0	0	56	52.0	NA	0	0	30.00	176	BEL	6.0	M	S>M	98	3.1	82.3	85.5	123	199	Showed little/ /
			6.0	11 11	BARONE	9>5	3400	S>S,D>D	**8w uppr; by tired foes (53)** *Stretch gain (.75).SLR?- 20 Slow last race (12). 1st off 48 day layoff.Class Change 0 Finished 5 from post 9 TJW= 77	65	3	65	3	65	3	80	77	156	5.00	4.30	1.17	5.00	4.30	1.17	85	74	66	53,73,69,0,0	73	48	65.0	E	3	0	4.50	130	BEL	6.0	M	M>M	111	10.4	81.5	91.9	159	225	8w uppr; by tired foes/ Crowded5/8;3-2p turn/ 2p turn;4p into lane
			6.0	1 1	EL	7>3	2303	S>S,D>D	**7w upper; best of rest (58)** Made big overall move (3). *Stretch gain (.5). 1st off 48 day layoff.Class Change 0 Finished 3 from post 7 TJW= 80	64	4	63	5	60	9	82	78	159	6.90	5.70	1.21	6.50	4.50	1.46	86	78	68	58,62,57,48,59	71	48	59.0	S	0	0	15.00	136	BEL	6.0	M	M>M	104	8.5	82.2	90.7	164	232	7w upper; best of rest/ Bmp brk;2-4p trn;6p1/4/ Chased 2-3w; tired

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	PPOT	AEPS	LAST DS	NOTES FROM LAST RACE	SPD 110	SPD #110	SPD TDS	AVG #TDS	SPD #R	S1	S2	TOT	SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	TDS1	TDS2	CLOSE	E1	E2	LP	LAST FIVE SPEED RATINGS	HIGH BYER ATDS	DSL R	AVG3	BRIS	P	EQUIP	MLINE	CLS	TRK	DIS	TYPE	CHNG	PWR	CLASS	FINAL	COMB	ERLY TOTL PACE	TOTL PACE	COMMENTS	
6/23/22	CBY	1	6.5	4 4	GLASS	11>12	1860	R>S,T>D	**Chased btw;no response (63)** DROP SWITCH 1st off 280 day layoff.Class Change -10 Finished 12 from post 11 TJW= 29	ERR	0	ERR	0	71	10	78	77	155	3.40	5.00	0.67	ERR	ERR	ERR	80	69	62	63,72,75,71,74	0	280	70.0	E/P	1	0	10.00	134	CBY	8.5	C	C>C	100	6.8	85.7	92.5	149	211	Chased btw;no response/ 4wd trip; faded/ Rail5/8;bid3w;hung lte
			6.5	6 6	SIDE	5>3	2386	R>S,D>D	**Pressed;inherited lead (69)** Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 5-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH! Class Change 0 Finished 3 from post 5 TJW= 39	66	4	66	4	68	10	88	73	161	4.50	5.80	0.77	4.60	5.40	0.87	94	85	61	69,65,76,66,50	76	12	70.0	E	5	0	8.00	124	CBY	8.0	C	C>C	110	11.7	87.1	98.8	179	240	Pressed;inherited lead/ Prompted 3w; gave way/ Inside;held clear lane
			6.5	1 1	EL	7>7	1601	S>S,D>D	**5wd early; retreated (56)** Slow last race (9). Class Change 0 Finished 7 from post 7 TJW= 52	68	6	66	9	65	10	86	72	157	6.30	6.40	0.98	6.30	6.40	0.98	90	81	66	56,61,73,67,71	79	7	63.0	S	2	0	5.00	125	CBY	5.5	C	C>C	103	7.1	87.4	94.5	171	237	5wd early; retreated/ Inside;bit tight 3/16/ Svd gnd;gain btwn1/8
			6.5	2 2	YESTERYEAR	3>2	2295	S>S,D>D	**Pressd into str;edgd2d (78)** Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 3-hole.Uncharacteristic race?BTL HORSE Class Change -5 Finished 2 from post 3 TJW= 50	71	6	69	9	69	10	91	80	170	4.10	3.90	1.07	4.30	4.00	1.07	88	91	77	78,58,66,69,72	78	26	67.0	E/P	5	0	4.00	131	CBY	6.5	C	C>C	110	14.3	89.3	103.6	179	256	Pressd into str;edgd2d/ Settled btw; no menace/ Dueled 3w; gave way
			6.5	5 5	DAYS OF	6>7	2109	R>S,T>D	**Stalk 2-3w;shft in 2nd (74)** Class Change -10 Finished 7 from post 6 TJW= 57	75	3	75	3	73	10	93	81	173	5.10	4.70	1.08	7.10	3.80	1.88	87	94	60	74,76,72,71,61	83	21	74.0	S	0	0	2.00	139	CBY	8.0	C	C>C	113	12.3	90.3	102.6	181	241	Stalk 2-3w;shft in 2nd/ 2p;angled in;no kick/ 5wd rally; edged clear
			6.5	3 3	FREIBURG	4>4	2496	S>S,D>D	**Chase;3p;evenly (72)** *Stretch gain (.25). BTL HORSE Class Change 0 Finished 4 from post 4 TJW= 68	77	5	76	8	74	10	87	80	167	5.10	4.40	1.14	4.90	4.00	1.23	87	86	79	72,76,79,53,80	83	28	76.0	E/P	2	0	1.80	128	CBY	5.5	C	C>C	111	13.0	91.3	104.2	173	252	Chase;3p;evenly/ 6wd upper; late rally/ Closed fast; up wire

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	PPOT	AEPS	LAST DS	NOTES FROM LAST RACE	SPD		SPD		AVG		LAST FIVE										HIGH		ERLY TOTL		COMMENTS																	
										110	#110	TDS	#TDS	SPD	#R	S1	S2	TOT	SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	TDS1	TDS2	CLOSE	E1	E2	LP	SPEED	RATINGS		BYER	ATDS	DSL	AVG3	BRIS	P	EQUIP	MLINE	CLS	TRK	DIS	TYPE	CHNG	PWR	CLASS	FINAL	COMB
6/23/22	CBY	2	6.5	1.1	UNLEASH	7>7	2999	S>S,D>D	**Bid3/16;not urged late (70)** Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 7-hole. 1st off 113 day layoff.Class Change 1 Finished 7 from post 7 TJW= 90	80	4	80	4	77	10	90	79	168	3.80	5.00	0.75	3.70	5.30	0.69	85	89	68	70,75,33,94,79	94	113	59.0	E	3	0	5.00	154	TUP	6.5	A	A>A	120	11.8	87.6	99.4	174	242	Bid3/16;not urged late/Boxed in turn;stretch/Pursuit 2p;emptied out
			6.5	2.2	R MERCEDES	4>3	8800	S>S,D>D	**Cut off/stumb1;mild gn (79)** Made a big move early (4.5).SLR?- 11 Class Change 0 Finished 3 from post 4 TJW= 74	85	9	85	9	84	10	90	80	170	3.90	5.10	0.78	3.80	4.90	0.77	81	89	82	79,90,78,76,82	95	28	82.0	E/P	4	0	4.50	189	CBY	6.0	A	AO>A	123	15.0	91.4	106.3	170	252	Cut off/stumb1;mild gn/Prompted foe; yielded/Prompted rail;weakened/Boxed 3w;c'rrd out3/16/Unprepared st; trailed/6-8w;led 1/16;held
			6.5	4.4	TIGER DAD	1>4	16175	R>S,D>D	**Swthcd3w;c'rrd out3/16 (80)**THIRD OFF Flashed speed. Class Change -25 Finished 4 from post 1 TJW= 83	79	4	79	4	83	10	86	74	159	4.30	5.30	0.82	6.20	6.60	0.95	91	93	72	80,61,91,84,91	91	29	77.0	E/P	2	0	3.00	207	CBY	8.0	A	N>A	127	15.8	86.4	102.2	184	256	Swthcd3w;c'rrd out3/16/Unprepared st; trailed/6-8w;led 1/16;held
			6.5	3.3	CENTRAL	2>2	7316	R>S,D>D	**Pace inside; resisted (89)**THIRD OFF MAYBE? Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 2-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH!BTL HORSE Clear early.Class Change 0 Finished 2 from post 2 TJW= 50	91	4	91	4	84	10	91	86	176	4.00	4.20	0.96	3.60	1.60	2.25	88	92	87	89,93,61,92,77	97	19	81.0	E/P	2	0	2.00	168	CBY	8.0	A	AO>A	130	17.2	88.9	106.0	180	267	Pace inside; resisted/4w-trn;bid3/16;vied/up/Outside; no threat;
			6.5	6.6	NORTHCUT	6>4	3486	R>S,T>D	**Swung 5w; no kick (80)** Made big overall move (4). Made a big move early (3.75). 1st off 287 day layoff.Class Change 0 Finished 4 from post 6 TJW= 37	74	3	74	3	77	10	85	94	178	7.80	5.80	1.33	7.50	6.50	1.15	77	79	85	80,80,79,77,80	87	287	80.0	S	3	0	10.00	174	CBY	8.0	A	AO>A	117	13.3	88.8	102.1	156	241	Swung 5w; no kick/ Pace ins;shiftd2p;game/ Angled 5p; even late
			6.5	5.5	TONY'S	1>1	9725	R>S,D>D	**Stalked inside;tippd3p (89)**THIRD OFF MAYBE? Flashed speed. Made big overall move (3).BTL HORSE Class Change 0 Finished 1 from post 1 TJW= 84	86	5	86	5	82	10	88	88	175	5.00	3.50	1.42	5.00	2.50	2.00	85	87	93	89,84,62,85,80	88	19	78.0	P	3	0	4.00	185	CBY	8.0	A	AO>A	125	16.6	89.3	105.9	172	265	Stalked inside;tippd3p/Vied 3w; gamely/ Off slow; 3w2ndturn

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	PPOT	AEPS	LAST DS	NOTES FROM LAST RACE	SPD		SPD		AVG		LAST FIVE										HIGH		ERLY TOTL		COMMENTS																		
										110	#110	TDS	#TDS	SPD	#R	S1	S2	TOT	SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	TDS1	TDS2	CLOSE	E1	E2	LP	SPEED	RATINGS		BYER	ATDS	DSL	AVG3	BRIS	P	EQUIP	MLINE	CLS	TRK	DIS	TYPE	CHNG	PWR	CLASS	FINAL	COMB	TOTL
6/23/22	CBY	3	5.0	6.6	RAY'S	5>4	5706	S>S,T>T	**Prompted 3w; gave way; (70)** Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 5-hole. 1st off 36 day layoff.Class Change -20 Finished 4 from post 5 TJW= 52	65	3	65	3	68	10	96	-2	94	4.20	6.80	0.62	6.50	8.30	0.79	91	0	70	70,57,58,80,79	77	36	62.0	E	5	0	3.00	171	CBY	5.0	C	CO>C	100	10.6	93.2	103.7	91	161	Prompted 3w; gave way;/Hustled along; tired;/Slow early; no bid	
			5.0	4.4	JILOTEPEC	4>6	1499	S>S,D>T	**Brief pursuit 3wd btw (68)** *Stretch gain (.5).Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH! Class Change 5 Finished 6 from post 4 TJW= 41	ERR	ERR	0	ERR	0	68	1	86	78	164	8.30	10.00	0.83	ERR	ERR	ERR	90	81	78	68,0,0,0,0	0	14	68.0	E	5	0	8.00	116	CBY	5.5	C	C>C	99	10.0	90.0	100.0	171	249	Brief pursuit 3wd btw/ /
			5.0	1.1	BOURBON	9>8	1706	R>S,T>T	**Prompted foe; gave way (70)** Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 9-hole. *Stretch gain (1).Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH! 1st off 35 day layoff.Class Change 0 Finished 8 from post 9 TJW= 52	77	3	77	3	71	10	90	81	171	5.40	6.30	0.86	7.30	5.80	1.26	88	88	60	70,77,76,71,81	81	35	74.0	E/P	1	0	4.00	132	CBY	8.0	C	C>C	106	11.7	87.6	99.3	176	236	Prompted foe; gave way/4p;shy 10p1/4;no impct/Headed 5/16;gave way	
			5.0	3.3	CLIMB AND	2>3	4211	S>S,D>T	**Pace 2p; dueled inside (77)** Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 2-hole. Fast last race (18).Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH!BTL HORSE Clear early.Class Change 0 Finished 3 from post 2 TJW= 14	61	1	61	1	59	9	93	78	170	5.40	6.00	0.91	10.00	10.00	1.00	91	94	73	77,68,67,68,57	61	26	71.0	E	8	BOFF	5.00	150	CBY	6.5	C	C>C	100	13.8	87.6	101.3	185	258	Pace 2p; dueled inside/Couldn't match strides/Pressed; kept to task	
			5.0	5.5	PALACE	8>8	3612	R>S,T>T	**3w2ndturn; weakened (71)** DROP SWITCH 1st off 199 day layoff.Class Change -50 Finished 8 from post 8 TJW= 66	ERR	0	ERR	0	76	9	73	90	162	7.40	7.50	0.98	ERR	ERR	ERR	70	63	87	71,79,0,74,62	0	199	75.0	S	1	0	2.50	142	TUP	8.0	C	AO>C	113	12.5	88.0	100.5	133	220	3w2ndturn; weakened/Pace;drvg insd;held on/Stumbled; lost rider	
			5.0	7.7	HOLY VOW	3>10	5843	R>S,T>T	**Outrun (12)** DROP SWITCHSLR?- 51 Slow last race (58). Class Change -5 Finished 10 from post 3 TJW= 68	ERR	0	63	1	70	10	81	46	126	7.40	7.50	0.99	8.90	8.90	1.00	71	69	12	63,77,80,78	63	21	51.0	E/P	0	0	6.00	172	CBY	8.0	C	C>C	76	2.7	79.7	82.5	140	140	Outrun/ Near back; never fired/ Failed to menace	
			5.0	2.2	P CLUB	3>4	3215	S>S,T>T	**Insd;st'd btw;alterd4w (74)** Made a big move early (3.5).BTL HORSE 1st off 281 day layoff.Class Change -30 Finished 4 from post 3 TJW= 32	76	6	77	7	74	10	91	-5	86	6.00	4.70	1.28	6.80	3.80	1.78	81	0	84	74,77,78,79,74	80	281	76.0	P	0	0	10.00	126	CBY	5.0	C	R>C	93	10.9	96.1	107.0	81	165	Insd;st'd btw;alterd4w/Split 3wd; willingly/ 4wd upper; closing in	

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	PPOT	AEPS	LAST DS	NOTES FROM LAST RACE	SPD			AVG			SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	TDS1	TDS2	CLOSE	E1	E2	LP	LAST FIVE			HIGH BYER	ATDS	DSL	AVG3	BRIS	P	EQUIP	MLINE	CLS	TRK	DIS	TYPE	CHNG	PWR	CLASS	FINAL	COMB	ERLY TOTL		COMMENTS
										110	#110	TDS	#TDS	SPD	#R										S1	S2	TOT																		SPEED	RATINGS	
6/23/22	CBY	6	8.0	2.2	CERULEAN	7>3	6725	R>R,T>T	**Weakened; lost place (72)** DROP SWITCH 1st off 382 day layoff.Class Change -40 Finished 3 from post 7 TJW= 72	73	2	73	2	73	2	74	91	164	1.70	3.30	0.50	1.70	3.30	0.50	85	84	67	72,74,0,0,0	74	382	73.0	E	6	0	2.00	190	CD	8.0	S	S>S	115	14.7	87.4	102.1	169	236	Weakened; lost place/ 4path upper; weakened/
			8.0	8.8	FORTUNATA	9>3	1385	S>R,T>T	**Bmpd brk;4-3w;duel 2w (71)** Fast last race (12).Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH!BTL HORSE Class Change 0 Finished 3 from post 9 TJW= 37	71	1	ERR	0	59	2	83	88	170	4.70	5.90	0.80	ERR	ERR	ERR	91	92	60	71,46,0,0,0	0	22	59.0	E	4	0	5.00	150	CBY	7.5	S	S>S	95	6.9	89.8	96.7	183	243	Bmpd brk;4-3w;duel 2w/ Forced in st; trailed;/
			8.0	3.3	WINTER	10>5	1370	S>R,T>T	**4wd turns;no late kick (68)** Chased Pace. Made big overall move (3). Made a big move early (5).BTL HORSE Class Change 0 Finished 5 from post 10 TJW= 67	74	2	73	3	72	4	81	87	167	5.90	7.00	0.84	6.80	7.60	0.89	84	89	58	68,67,72,79,0	79	22	69.0	NA	2	0	3.00	174	CBY	7.5	S	S>S	105	12.2	82.6	94.8	173	231	4wd turns;no late kick/ 3p;btw2nd;gave way/ Step slow st;no factor
			8.0	7.7	RATTLEME	6>5	625	S>R,T>T	**Pressed btw; gave way; (56)** Flashed speed. Fast last race (15).Uncharacteristic race? Class Change 0 Finished 5 from post 6 TJW= 38	ERR	0	ERR	0	41	2	89	-5	84	6.70	7.80	0.86	ERR	ERR	ERR	94	0	52	56,25,0,0,0	0	15	41.0	NA	6	BOFF	15.00	148	CBY	5.0	S	S>S	75	6.6	87.8	94.4	94	146	Pressed btw; gave way;/ Chased;rail; stopped/
			8.0	1.1	PRINCESS	5>6	756	S>R,T>T	**Bump st;6w2ndturn (59)** Chased Pace. Made a big move early (3). 1st off 91 day layoff.Invalid last race. Finished 6 from post 5 TJW= 61	61	2	63	1	56	4	84	80	164	8.10	7.40	1.09	4.30	4.30	1.00	79	78	54	59,63,46,54,0	63	91	56.0	E	5	0	15.00	-7	TUP	7.5	S	M0>S	87	9.1	82.8	91.9	157	211	Bump st;6w2ndturn/ 4w;press;secured show/ Bumped start
			8.0	5.5	U SO MONEY	4>2	3346	R>R,D>T	**Bid str; outkicked (63)** Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 4-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH!BTL HORSE 1st off 120 day layoff.Class Change 37 Finished 2 from post 4 TJW= 60	68	1	68	1	64	10	73	85	157	6.70	5.30	1.26	9.20	8.30	1.10	70	60	75	63,58,58,61,64	68	120	60.0	P	3	0	10.00	156	TP	8.0	S	M>S	91	11.6	81.1	92.7	130	205	Bid str; outkicked/ Never a real menace/ Angled in; improved
			8.0	6.6	WAR MUSIC	5>4	3048	S>R,T>T	**Unhurried;3-4w trns;7w (68)** Made big overall move (6). Made a big move early (3.5). *Stretch gain (6). Big late move (6).BTL HORSE 2 races in one pattern.Class Change 0 Finished 4 from post 5 TJW= 63	68	1	ERR	0	63	8	76	92	167	4.70	3.50	1.33	ERR	ERR	ERR	76	78	69	68,68,67,51,63	0	22	68.0	E/P	7	0	8.00	137	CBY	7.5	S	S>S	105	11.5	86.1	97.6	154	223	Unhurried;3-4w trns;7w/ 4w turn;coming again/ Traffic 1/4; slow gain
			8.0	4.4	BONES AND	4>7	1585	S>R,T>T	**Tracked 2-3w;no rally (66)** *Stretch gain (.5).Uncharacteristic race? Class Change 0 Finished 7 from post 4 TJW= 48	68	6	67	3	65	10	78	89	166	6.20	4.50	1.38	6.70	5.20	1.27	88	81	63	66,68,72,67,72	72	22	69.0	E/P	6	BOFF	4.00	68	CBY	7.5	S	S>S	104	12.5	89.0	101.5	169	232	Tracked 2-3w;no rally/ Checked1/4;angled in/ Inse bid1/8;vied;mssd

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	PPOT	AEPS	LAST DS	NOTES FROM LAST RACE	SPD			AVG			SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	TDS1	TDS2	CLOSE	E1	E2	LP	LAST FIVE			HIGH BYER	ATDS	DSL	AVG3	BRIS	P	EQUIP	MLINE	CLS	TRK	DIS	TYPE	CHNG	PWR	CLASS	FINAL	COMB	ERLY TOTL		COMMENTS
										110	#110	TDS	#TDS	SPD	#R										S1	S2	TOT																		SPEED	RATINGS	
6/23/22	CBY	7	1.6	2.2	BV I AM A	5>3	2299	S>S,D>D	**On heels of lead duo (88)** DROP SWITCH *Pressed Pace from 5-hole.BTL HORSE 1st off 34 day layoff.Class Change -9 Finished 3 from post 5 TJW= 0	82	5	82	5	82	5	57	-9	48	0.00	3.70	ERR	0.00	3.70	ERR	0	0	88,79,80,83,78	88	34	82.0	NA	0	0	4.00	130	RP	1.6	S	S>S	13.4	98.0	111.4	0	0	0	On heels of lead duo/ No match for runaway/ Clean trip; DH 3rd	
			1.6	1.1	ILLTAKEITF	8>3	1210	S>S,D>D	**Duled; outfinished (85)** *Pressed Pace from 8-hole. Fast last race (14).BTL HORSE 1st off 242 day layoff.Class Change 9 Finished 3 from post 8 TJW= 0	71	5	71	5	71	5	57	-9	48	0.00	4.80	ERR	0.00	4.80	ERR	0	0	85,80,65,72,55	85	242	77.0	NA	0	0	3.50	139	WRD	1.4	S	S>S	13.0	93.4	106.4	0	0	0	Duled; outfinished/ Winner too tough/ Bobbled in brk	
			1.6	6.6	CANDY AT	2>6	770	S>S,D>D	**Restless gate;veer brk (80)** *Pressed Pace from 2-hole.BTL HORSE Class Change 0 Finished 6 from post 2 TJW= 0	78	7	78	7	78	7	64	-2	62	0.00	6.40	ERR	0.00	6.40	ERR	0	0	80,69,80,80,78	87	21	76.0	NA	0	BON	8.00	147	CBY	1.5	S	S>S	12.3	91.1	103.4	0	0	0	Restless gate;veer brk/ In tight early/ Veered in early	
			1.6	8.8	VOODOO	1>6	170	S>S,D>D	**Bid; faded (82)** DROP SWITCH *Pressed Pace from 1-hole.BTL HORSE 1st off 34 day layoff.Class Change -9 Finished 6 from post 1 TJW= 0	72	3	72	3	72	3	57	-9	48	0.00	7.10	ERR	0.00	7.10	ERR	0	0	82,66,67,0,0	82	34	72.0	NA	0	0	5.00	141	RP	1.6	S	S>S	12.0	94.4	106.4	0	0	0	Bid; faded/ No late kick/ Brk in;bump;no bid	
			1.6	3.3	CHEQUER	3>2	2692	S>S,D>D	**Duel; outkicked (95)** THIRD OFF *Pressed Pace from 3-hole. Fast last race (16).BTL HORSE Class Change 0 Finished 2 from post 3 TJW= 0	69	8	79	7	79	7	64	-2	62	0.00	4.60	ERR	0.00	4.60	ERR	0	0	95,78,0,75,88	95	21	58.0	NA	0	0	2.50	144	CBY	1.5	S	S>S	15.4	95.6	111.1	0	0	0	Duel; outkicked/ Mid pack duel/ Chased winner	
			1.6	4.4	KISSTHESEL	6>8	779	S>S,D>D	**Fractious parade;bumps (54)** *Pressed Pace from 6-hole. Class Change 0 Finished 8 from post 6 TJW= 23	57	3	57	3	57	3	66	1	66	0.00	8.80	ERR	0.00	8.80	ERR	0	0	54,60,57,0,0	60	22	57.0	NA	0	0	15.00	133	CBY	1.5	S	S>S	5.8	85.6	91.5	0	0	0	Fractious parade;bumps/ Off slow;no menace/ Drifted in late	
			1.6	5.5	WELCOMETAT	0>0	1	0>S,>D	** (0)** 1st off 738329 day layoff. FTS.Invalid last race. Finished 0 from post 0 TJW= 38	ERR	0	ERR	0	ERR	0	57	-9	48	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	0	0	0,0,0,0,0	0	****	ERR	NA	0	0	10.00	ERR	0.0	S	>S	0.0	ERR	ERR	0	0	0	/ /		
			1.6	7.7	JESS OUR	0>0	1	0>S,>D	** (0)** 1st off 738329 day layoff. FTS.Invalid last race. Finished 0 from post 0 TJW= 20	ERR	0	ERR	0	ERR	0	57	-9	48	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	0	0	0,0,0,0,0	0	****	ERR	NA	0	0	8.00	ERR	0.0	S	>S	0.0	ERR	ERR	0	0	0	/ /		

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	PPOT	AEPS	LAST DS	NOTES FROM LAST RACE	SPD		SPD		AVG		S1	S2	TOT	SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	TDS1	TDS2	CLOSE	E1	E2	LP	LAST FIVE SPEED RATINGS	HIGH BYER		AVG3	BRIS	P	EQUIP	MLINE	CLS	TRK	DIS	TYPE	CHNG	PWR	CLASS	FINAL	COMB	ERLY TOTL PACE PACE		COMMENTS
										#110	#110	TDS	#TDS	SPD	#R														ATDS	DSL															TOTL	LAST	
6/23/22	CBY	8	1.6	2 2	JETTIN	1>4	705	S>S,D>D	**Bumped brk (81)** *Pressed Pace from 1-hole. *Stretch gain (.25).BTL HORSE Class Change 15 Finished 4 from post 1 TJW= 10	75	3	75	3	75	3	64	-2	62	0.00	4.70	ERR	0.00	4.70	ERR	0	0		81,82,62,0,0	82	21	75.0	NA	0	0	4.00	135	CBY	1.5	N	S>N		13.1	91.5	104.6	0	0	Bumped brk/ Step slow; evenly/ Broke slowly; chased
			1.6	1 1	MAKIN IT	6>2	860	S>S,D>D	**Broke out finish well (70)** *Pressed Pace from 6-hole. *Stretch gain (.25).BTL HORSE 1st off 32 day layoff.Class Change 30 Finished 2 from post 6 TJW= 20	70	1	70	1	70	1	62	-3	59	0.00	3.30	ERR	0.00	3.30	ERR	0	0		70,0,0,0,0	70	32	70.0	NA	0	0	2.50	117	EDR	1.1	N	S>N		11.3	89.2	100.5	0	0	Broke out finish well/ /
			1.6	4 4	NAUGHTEE	1>5	814	S>S,D>D	**Antsy; broke in (68)** *Pressed Pace from 1-hole.BTL HORSE 1st off 35 day layoff.Class Change 15 Finished 5 from post 1 TJW= 13	68	1	68	1	68	1	57	-9	48	0.00	5.00	ERR	0.00	5.00	ERR	0	0		68,0,0,0,0	68	35	68.0	NA	0	0	6.00	132	RP	1.5	N	S>N		10.5	92.7	103.2	0	0	Antsy; broke in/ /
			1.6	7 7	RELENTLESS	4>2	2825	S>S,D>D	**Winner too tough (83)** DROP SWITCH *Pressed Pace from 4-hole. Fast last race (19).BTL HORSE Class Change -30 Finished 2 from post 4 TJW= 20	64	2	64	2	64	2	66	1	66	0.00	6.30	ERR	0.00	6.30	ERR	0	0		83,44,0,0,0	83	22	64.0	NA	0	0	3.00	155	CBY	1.4	N	N>N		11.7	92.1	103.8	0	0	Winner too tough/ Veered out midway/
			1.6	3 3	RELENTLESS	7>8	210	S>S,D>D	**No late bid (75)** *Pressed Pace from 7-hole. Fast last race (11). 1st off 40 day layoff.Class Change 5 Finished 8 from post 7 TJW= 0	64	2	64	2	64	2	57	-9	48	0.00	8.40	ERR	0.00	8.40	ERR	0	0		75,53,0,0,0	75	40	NA	0	0	4.50	152	RP	1.5	N	S>N		10.5	92.0	102.5	0	0	No late bid/ Broke in air/	
			1.6	6 6	MS	3>9	250	S>S,D>D	**Bump foe brk (64)** *Pressed Pace from 3-hole. Class Change 15 Finished 9 from post 3 TJW= 0	64	1	64	1	64	1	64	-2	62	0.00	9.00	ERR	0.00	9.00	ERR	0	0		64,0,0,0,0	64	21	NA	0	0	12.00	132	CBY	1.5	N	S>N		7.8	89.1	96.9	0	0	Bump foe brk/ /	
			1.6	5 5	LOVE THIS	3>7	210	S>S,D>D	**Void of response (55)** *Pressed Pace from 3-hole.SLR?- 11 1st off 55 day layoff.Class Change 15 Finished 7 from post 3 TJW= 0	61	2	61	2	61	2	57	-9	48	0.00	7.40	ERR	0.00	7.40	ERR	0	0		55,66,0,0,0	66	55	61.0	NA	0	0	8.00	132	RP	1.4	N	S>N		3.2	88.1	91.3	0	0	Void of response/ Crowded;altrd path/

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	PPOT	AEPS	LAST DS	NOTES FROM LAST RACE	SPD		SPD		AVG		S1	S2	TOT	SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	TDS1	TDS2	CLOSE	E1	E2	LP	LAST FIVE SPEED RATINGS	HIGH BYER		AVG3	BRIS	P	EQUIP	MLINE	CLS	TRK	DIS	TYPE	CHNG	PWR	CLASS	FINAL	COMB	ERLY TOTL PACE PACE		COMMENTS
										#110	#110	TDS	#TDS	SPD	#R														ATDS	DSL															TOTL	LAST	
6/23/22	CBY	9	1.6	3 3	BEEP BEEP	6>1	12445	S>S,D>D	**Came in brk;much best (89)** *Pressed Pace from 6-hole.BTL HORSE Class Change -30 Finished 1 from post 6 TJW= 0	86	2	86	2	86	2	66	1	66	0.00	1.30	ERR	0.00	1.30	ERR	0	0		89,82,0,0,0	89	22	86.0	NA	0	0	1.60	155	CBY	1.4	N	N>N		15.5	94.7	110.3	0	0	Came in brk;much best/ Antsy;engaged;prevaild/
			1.6	6 6	MY CANDYS	4>2	4351	S>S,D>D	**Bored in; outdueled (75)** *Pressed Pace from 4-hole.BTL HORSE 1st off 42 day layoff.Class Change 15 Finished 2 from post 4 TJW= 20	76	2	76	2	76	2	57	-9	48	0.00	2.50	ERR	0.00	2.50	ERR	0	0		75,76,0,0,0	76	42	76.0	NA	0	0	3.50	147	RP	1.5	N	S>N		12.4	94.3	106.7	0	0	Bored in; outdueled/ No match for runaway/
			1.6	1 1	ALOTTA OH	9>3	1423	S>S,D>D	**No troubles (76)** *Pressed Pace from 9-hole. *Stretch gain (.25).BTL HORSE Class Change 15 Finished 3 from post 9 TJW= 0	73	2	73	2	73	2	57	-9	48	0.00	4.00	ERR	0.00	4.00	ERR	0	0		76,70,0,0,0	76	27	73.0	NA	0	0	4.50	132	RP	1.5	N	S>N		11.8	93.7	105.5	0	0	No troubles/ Head high at break/
			1.6	5 5	WICHEE	4>2	1815	S>S,D>D	**Off slow; edged 2d (79)** *Pressed Pace from 4-hole. *Stretch gain (1). Fast last race (12).BTL HORSE Class Change 15 Finished 2 from post 4 TJW= 13	67	2	67	2	67	2	62	-3	59	0.00	8.60	ERR	0.00	8.60	ERR	0	0		79,54,0,0,0	79	14	67.0	NA	0	BON	6.00	132	CBY	1.5	N	S>N		12.9	91.5	104.5	0	0	Off slow; edged 2d/ Shutoff;tripd by rival/
			1.6	4 4	RELENTLESS	3>7	330	S>S,D>D	**Void of response (65)** *Pressed Pace from 3-hole. 1st off 35 day layoff.Class Change 15 Finished 7 from post 3 TJW= 0	65	1	65	1	65	1	57	-9	48	0.00	7.00	ERR	0.00	7.00	ERR	0	0		65,0,0,0,0	65	35	65.0	NA	0	0	10.00	132	RP	1.5	N	S>N		7.2	91.9	99.1	0	0	Void of response/ /
			1.6	2 2	BV IM	3>1	8610	S>S,D>D	**Refused to lose (67)** *Pressed Pace from 3-hole.BTL HORSE 1st off 47 day layoff.Class Change 40 Finished 1 from post 3 TJW= 10	60	2	60	2	60	2	57	-9	48	0.00	1.60	ERR	0.00	1.60	ERR	0	0		67,53,0,0,0	67	47	60.0	NA	0	0	5.00	107	RP	1.1	N	M>N		10.9	89.1	100.0	0	0	Refused to lose/ Grt trip;hookd tuff/
			1.6	7 7	FIRST	0>0	1	0>S,>D	** (0)** 1st off 738329 day layoff. FTS.Invalid last race. Finished 0 from post 0 TJW= 30	ERR	0	ERR	0	ERR	0	57	-9	48	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	0	0		0,0,0,0,0	0	****	ERR	NA	0	0	12.00	ERR	0.0	N	>N		0.0	ERR	ERR	0	0	/ /	

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	PPOT	AEPS	LAST DS	NOTES FROM LAST RACE	SPD		SPD		AVG		S1	S2	TOT	SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	TDS1	TDS2	CLOSE	E1	E2	LP	LAST FIVE SPEED RATINGS	HIGH BYER			CL5	TRK	DIS	TYPE	CHNG	PWR	CLASS	FINAL	COMB	ERLY TOTL		COMMENTS				
										#110	#110	TDS	#TDS	SPD	#R														ATDS	DSL	AVG3										BRIS	P		PACE	PACE		
6/23/22	CBY	10	1.6	5	5	RELENTLESS	8>2	9770	S>S,D>D	**Off best; caught (90)** *Pressed Pace from 8-hole.BTL HORSE 1st off 40 day layoff.Class Change -10 Finished 2 from post 8 TJW= 0	82	2	82	2	82	2	57	-9	48	0.00	1.50	ERR	0.00	1.50	ERR	0	0	0	90,73,0,0,0	90	40	82.0	NA	0	0	1.80	145	RP	1.5	N	A>N	14.6	97.4	112.0	0	0	Off best; caught/ Spdy;due1d;won bob/
			1.6	3	3	NUNOTHAT	1>2	3666	S>S,D>D	**Side by side w/ winner (86)** *Pressed Pace from 1-hole.BTL HORSE 1st off 40 day layoff.Class Change 5 Finished 2 from post 1 TJW= 20	81	2	81	2	81	2	57	-9	48	0.00	2.60	ERR	0.00	2.60	ERR	0	0	0	86,75,0,0,0	86	40	81.0	NA	0	0	4.00	152	RP	1.5	N	S>N	13.8	96.3	110.1	0	0	Side by side w/ winner/ Gd response to urging/
			1.6	4	4	HOT SPLASH	8>1	4369	S>S,D>D	**Driving; edged away (93)** *Pressed Pace from 8-hole. Fast last race (18).BTL HORSE Class Change 15 Finished 1 from post 8 TJW= 10	75	3	75	3	75	3	64	-2	62	0.00	4.50	ERR	0.00	4.50	ERR	0	0	0	93,69,62,0,0	93	21	75.0	NA	0	0	2.50	130	CBY	1.5	N	S>N	14.5	93.7	108.2	0	0	Driving; edged away/ Veered in partway/ Gave a good chase
			1.6	1	1	SHAKALAH	9>4	1137	S>S,D>D	**Stumbled break (71)** *Pressed Pace from 9-hole.BTL HORSE 1st off 53 day layoff.Class Change 5 Finished 4 from post 9 TJW= 0	73	2	73	2	73	2	57	-9	48	0.00	4.40	ERR	0.00	4.40	ERR	0	0	0	71,75,0,0,0	75	53	73.0	NA	0	0	5.00	152	RP	1.5	N	S>N	11.5	92.5	104.0	0	0	Stumbled break/ Brushed; evenly/
			1.6	7	7	SEIS IT	9>6	250	S>S,D>D	**Off slowly (72)** *Pressed Pace from 9-hole.BTL HORSE Class Change 15 Finished 6 from post 9 TJW= 0	72	1	72	1	72	1	64	-2	62	0.00	6.00	ERR	0.00	6.00	ERR	0	0	0	72,0,0,0,0	72	21	72.0	NA	0	0	12.00	132	CBY	1.5	N	S>N	6.5	91.3	97.8	0	0	Off slowly/ /
			1.6	2	2	ROCKING	5>6	1680	S>S,D>D	**Hesitated start (61)** *Pressed Pace from 5-hole.BTL HORSE Class Change -30 Finished 6 from post 5 TJW= 38	61	1	61	1	61	1	66	1	66	0.00	10.00	ERR	0.00	10.00	ERR	0	0	0	61,0,0,0,0	61	22	61.0	NA	0	0	15.00	177	CBY	1.4	N	N>N	7.2	89.0	96.3	0	0	Hesitated start/ /
			1.6	6	6	L GALLITO	0>0	1	0>S,>D	** (0)** 1st off 738329 day layoff. FTS.Invalid last race. Finished 0 from post 0 TJW= 39	ERR	0	ERR	0	ERR	0	57	-9	48	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	0	0	0	0,0,0,0,0	0	****	ERR	NA	0	0	8.00	ERR	0.0	N	>N	0.0	ERR	ERR	0	0	/ /	

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	PPOT	AEPS	LAST DS	NOTES FROM LAST RACE	SPD		SPD		AVG		S1	S2	TOT	SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	TDS1	TDS2	CLOSE	E1	E2	LP	LAST FIVE SPEED RATINGS	HIGH BYER			CL5	TRK	DIS	TYPE	CHNG	PWR	CLASS	FINAL	COMB	ERLY TOTL		COMMENTS					
										#110	#110	TDS	#TDS	SPD	#R														ATDS	DSL	AVG3										BRIS	P		PACE	PACE			
6/23/22	CD	1	6.0	6	6	ECLIPSED	3>4	4933	S>S,D>D	**Altered out;moved up (64)** 1st off 39 day layoff.Class Change 2 Finished 4 from post 3 TJW= 41	66	5	66	5	67	8	85	77	161	5.60	7.10	0.78	6.80	6.30	1.08	80	82	71	64,54,73,76,62	76	39	64.0	P	2	0	4.00	160	CD	6.0	C	C>C	106	11.6	82.9	94.6	162	233	Altered out;moved up/ Chased ins; faded 3/8/ Nudged start;4p;7p1/4
			6.0	5	5	LATTE	10>5	4617	S>S,D>D	**Vie 3w;btw5/16;yielded (77)** Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 10-hole. Fast last race (14).Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH!BTL HORSE Clear early.1st off 74 day layoff.Class Change 0 Finished 5 from post 10 TJW= 46	72	6	72	6	63	10	87	78	164	6.10	7.30	0.83	4.80	6.60	0.73	95	99	70	77,67,10,61,80	85	74	51.0	E/P	4	0	3.00	168	KEE	6.0	C	C>C	114	12.2	85.7	98.0	194	264	Vie 3w;btw5/16;yielded/ 5p trn;vied shw;flattn/ Showed little
			6.0	4	4	SUPERTALEO	4>5	2656	S>S,D>D	**Sp upper; weakened (60)** Chased Pace. 1st off 51 day layoff.Class Change 0 Finished 5 from post 4 TJW= 51	66	6	66	6	65	10	90	66	156	5.10	5.00	1.03	5.90	5.70	1.04	93	99	45	60,61,68,72,59	78	51	63.0	E	3	0	3.50	136	CD	6.5	C	C>C	108	11.1	79.5	90.6	192	237	5p upper; weakened/ 2wd btwn;no threat/ Close up ins;kept on
			6.0	3	3	T. K.'S	6>6	2441	S>S,D>D	**Done early (48)** 1st off 39 day layoff.Class Change 2 Finished 6 from post 6 TJW= 33	49	7	49	7	49	7	84	69	152	8.10	7.30	1.11	8.10	7.30	1.11	83	81	53	48,50,44,32,41	67	39	47.0	P	0	0	15.00	147	CD	6.0	C	C>C	97	6.6	81.9	88.5	164	217	Done early/ Inside turn; no threat/ 2w used up; faltered
			6.0	1	1	SUPER	2>4	4381	S>S,D>D	**Inside turn; evenly (68)** Class Change 0 Finished 4 from post 2 TJW= 36	71	9	71	10	71	10	87	73	160	6.60	5.90	1.12	6.60	5.90	1.12	88	90	61	68,68,79,67,64	85	27	72.0	P	3	0	2.50	157	CD	7.0	C	C>C	114	12.4	87.1	99.5	178	239	Inside turn; evenly/ Duel; 3p up; lng drv/ Slow st;gain 4w;chased
			6.0	2	2	MIZBEHAVIN	2>2	7837	S>S,D>D	**3p upper;rally for plc (67)** Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 2-hole. *Stretch gain (.5).Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH! 1st off 32 day layoff.Class Change 10 Finished 2 from post 2 TJW= 61	63	3	63	3	63	3	86	78	164	6.10	5.00	1.22	6.10	5.00	1.22	85	83	73	67,57,66,0,0	67	32	63.0	E/P	6	0	3.50	136	CD	6.0	C	C>C	107	12.8	85.1	97.9	168	241	3p upper;rally for plc/ Step slw;bid3w;clear

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	PPOT	AEPS	LAST DS	NOTES FROM LAST RACE	SPD		SPD		AVG		S1	S2	TOT	SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	TDS1	TDS2	CLOSE	E1	E2	LP	LAST FIVE SPEED RATINGS	HIGH BYER		AVG3	BRIS	P	EQUIP	MLINE	CLS	TRK	DIS	TYPE	CHNG	PWR	CLASS	FINAL	COMB	ERLY TOTL		COMMENTS
										#110	#110	TDS	#TDS	SPD	#R														ATDS	DSL															TOTL	PACE	
6/23/22	CD	2	8.5	7 7	BEAR ALLEY	10>1	10285	R>R,D>D	**Spd;well c1r;driving (95)** Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 10-hole. Fast last race (14).Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH!BTL HORSE Clear early.Class Change 5 Finished 1 from post 10 TJW= 68	60	8	81	7	81	8	88	90	178	4.20	5.30	0.79	3.50	4.70	0.73	92	100	87	95,78,0,80,55	95	27	87.0	E	6	0	1.00	178	CD	8.5	C	C>C	130	17.5	84.9	102.4	192	279	Spd;well c1r;driving/ Off slow;thru early/ Stopped; jogged in
			8.5	4 4	JURISDICTI	4>8	3871	S>R,D>D	**Stalkd;weakened;3-wide (77)**THIRD OFF DROP SWITCH Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 4-hole.Uncharacteristic race? Class Change -50 Finished 8 from post 4 TJW= 39	71	5	71	5	74	10	88	78	166	5.30	6.20	0.85	4.00	4.60	0.88	95	92	72	77,79,51,76,74	79	27	69.0	E/P	4	0	20.00	146	CD	7.0	C	R>C	116	10.7	83.2	93.9	187	259	Stalkd;weakened;3-wide/ Bid;lng drv;prevailed/ Midpack 3p;tired 2nd
			8.5	2 2	RIVER ECHO	1>8	7268	R>R,D>D	**Inside; no response (55)** SLR?- 21 Slow last race (22). Class Change 5 Finished 8 from post 1 TJW= 53	77	9	77	9	77	10	77	67	144	4.90	4.90	1.00	4.90	4.80	1.03	78	78	41	55,76,80,88,75	91	27	70.0	P	4	0	8.00	149	CD	8.5	C	C>C	118	10.8	78.9	89.8	156	197	Inside; no response/ Traffic 1/4; angled 4w/ 4w1st;stalk3w;weakened
			8.5	1 1	MAJORS	3>1	3420	R>R,D>D	**Came wide;xploed late (78)** Made big overall move (8). Made a big move early (4.5). Very strong move! Take note!BTL HORSE 1st off 381 day layoff.Class Change 4 Finished 1 from post 3 TJW= 31	63	8	72	7	73	9	71	84	155	6.10	5.40	1.13	6.30	6.00	1.06	62	68	93	78,55,72,0,77	84	381	68.0	P	3	0	15.00	136	LS	8.0	C	C>C	102	13.4	81.1	94.4	130	223	Came wide;xploed late/ 5 wide first turn;/ Vied 3w; no reponse
			8.5	3 3	UNIDENTIFI	7>0	5019	R>R,D>D	**4w;stopped;jogged in (0)** DROP SWITCH Made big overall move (7).SLR?-66 Slow last race (72). 1st off 54 day layoff.Class Change -46 Finished 0 from post 7 TJW= 72	64	9	72	8	72	9	71	96	167	6.80	5.30	1.27	6.30	5.00	1.26	0	0	0	66,89,83,67	89	54	78.0	P	0	0	12.00	148	OP	8.5	C	R>C	113	2.7	83.3	86.0	0	0	4w;stopped;jogged in/ Angled in; lacked bid/ Rated; strong 3w run
			8.5	5 5	RYE HUMOR	4>5	4565	S>R,D>D	**Step slw;ins;stayd btw (81)** Made big overall move (4). *Stretch gain (1.5).BTL HORSE Class Change 0 Finished 5 from post 4 TJW= 50	76	5	76	5	73	10	82	85	166	7.80	5.90	1.31	6.00	4.30	1.39	78	83	89	81,60,88,70,85	88	13	76.0	S	3	0	3.50	141	CD	6.5	C	C>C	117	13.5	84.9	98.4	161	250	Step slw;ins;stayd btw/ Finished early/ Improvd rail;no match
			8.5	6 6	EGO	8>9	5330	R>R,T>D	**No factor (71)** DROP SWITCH Slow last race (10). Class Change -21 Finished 9 from post 8 TJW= 61	82	9	82	9	81	10	67	91	157	7.90	5.90	1.35	7.80	5.40	1.44	64	66	84	71,73,71,84,75	94	30	72.0	S	0	0	3.00	181	IND	8.0	C	CO>C	122	11.9	78.8	90.7	130	214	No factor/ Off step slow;4w 7/8/ Off step slow;4w turns

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	PPOT	AEPS	LAST DS	NOTES FROM LAST RACE	SPD		SPD		AVG		S1	S2	TOT	SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	TDS1	TDS2	CLOSE	E1	E2	LP	LAST FIVE SPEED RATINGS	HIGH BYER		AVG3	BRIS	P	EQUIP	MLINE	CLS	TRK	DIS	TYPE	CHNG	PWR	CLASS	FINAL	COMB	ERLY TOTL		COMMENTS
										#110	#110	TDS	#TDS	SPD	#R														ATDS	DSL															TOTL	PACE	
6/23/22	CD	3	5.0	9 8	TELL ME	0>0	1	0>S,>D	** (0)** 1st off 738329 day layoff. FTS.Invalid last race. Finished 0 from post 0 TJW= 66	ERR	0	ERR	0	ERR	0	57	-9	48	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	0	0	0	0,0,0,0,0	0	****	ERR	NA	0	0	8.00	ERR	0.0	M	>M	0.0	ERR	ERR	0	0	/ /		
			5.0	8 1A	CORVINA	0>0	1	0>S,>D	** (0)** 1st off 738329 day layoff. FTS.Invalid last race. Finished 0 from post 0 TJW= 53	ERR	0	ERR	0	ERR	0	57	-9	48	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	0	0	0	0,0,0,0,0	0	****	NA	0	0	8.00	ERR	0.0	M	>M	0.0	ERR	ERR	0	0	/ /			
			5.0	7 7	MISS ADDIE	0>0	1	0>S,>D	** (0)** 1st off 738329 day layoff. FTS.Invalid last race. Finished 0 from post 0 TJW= 40	ERR	0	ERR	0	ERR	0	57	-9	48	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	0	0	0	0,0,0,0,0	0	****	NA	0	0	6.00	ERR	0.0	M	>M	0.0	ERR	ERR	0	0	/ /			
			5.0	6 6	DICE ARM	0>0	1	0>S,>D	** (0)** 1st off 738329 day layoff. FTS.Invalid last race. Finished 0 from post 0 TJW= 78	ERR	0	ERR	0	ERR	0	57	-9	48	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	0	0	0	0,0,0,0,0	0	****	NA	0	0	3.00	ERR	0.0	M	>M	0.0	ERR	ERR	0	0	/ /			
			5.0	3 4	GO ON GIRL	0>0	1	0>S,>D	** (0)** 1st off 738329 day layoff. FTS.Invalid last race. Finished 0 from post 0 TJW= 100	ERR	0	ERR	0	ERR	0	57	-9	48	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	0	0	0	0,0,0,0,0	0	****	NA	0	0	3.50	ERR	0.0	M	>M	0.0	ERR	ERR	0	0	/ /			
			5.0	5 1	HAPPY	0>0	1	0>S,>D	** (0)** 1st off 738329 day layoff. FTS.Invalid last race. Finished 0 from post 0 TJW= 52	ERR	0	ERR	0	ERR	0	57	-9	48	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	0	0	0	0,0,0,0,0	0	****	NA	0	0	8.00	ERR	0.0	M	>M	0.0	ERR	ERR	0	0	/ /			
			5.0	2 3	AYY LADIES	0>0	1	0>S,>D	** (0)** 1st off 738329 day layoff. FTS.Invalid last race. Finished 0 from post 0 TJW= 63	ERR	0	ERR	0	ERR	0	57	-9	48	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	0	0	0	0,0,0,0,0	0	****	NA	0	0	12.00	ERR	0.0	M	>M	0.0	ERR	ERR	0	0	/ /			
			5.0	1 2	SPECIALIZI	0>0	1	0>S,>D	** (0)** 1st off 738329 day layoff. FTS.Invalid last race. Finished 0 from post 0 TJW= 75	ERR	0	ERR	0	ERR	0	57	-9	48	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	0	0	0	0,0,0,0,0	0	****	NA	0	0	2.50	ERR	0.0	M	>M	0.0	ERR	ERR	0	0	/ /			
			5.0	4 5	THATSHOWSH	3>6	1440	S>S,T>D	**Never a threat (64)** DROP SWITCH 1st off 55 day layoff.Class Change -35 Finished 6 from post 3 TJW= 27	57	1	57	1	61	2	81	80	161	2.90	4.80	0.60	0.00	4.40	ERR	84	78	76	64,57,0,0,0	57	55	61.0	E	4	0	12.00	176	KEE	5.5	M	S>M	109	10.2	87.2	97.5	162	238	Never a threat/ Ins pair turn;gave way/

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	PPOT	AEPS	LAST DS	NOTES FROM LAST RACE	SPD		SPD		AVG		LAST FIVE SPEED RATINGS					HIGH BYER					ERLY TOTL PACE PACE		COMMENTS																				
										110	#110	TDS	#TDS	SPD	#R	S1	S2	TOT	SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	TDS1	TDS2	CLOSE	E1	E2	LP		ATDS	DSL	AVG3	BRIS	P	EQUIP	MLINE	CLS	TRK	DIS	TYPE	CHNG	PWR	CLASS	FINAL	COMB	TOTL	LAST		
6/23/22	CD	6	8.0	5	5	STELLAR	2>1	6539	S>R,D>D	**Lng drv upr;drew away (81)** Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 2-hole.BTL HORSE 1st off 42 day layoff.Class Change 80 Finished 1 from post 2 Tjw= 71	72	3	72	3	73	10	88	84	172	4.90	5.20	0.93	5.70	6.30	0.90	88	91	82	81,85,75,74,75	78	42	80.0	E/P	6	0	10.00	164	CD	6.0	A	C>A	121	15.1	91.2	106.3	179	261	Lng drv upr;drew away/ 3p;4w1/4;bid1/16;clear/ Stalked 2p 3/4 empty
			8.0	1	1	SMARMY	7>3	11700	S>R,D>D	**3wd; lost whip 1/16 (81)** Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 7-hole.BTL HORSE 1st off 47 day layoff.Class Change 30 Finished 3 from post 7 Tjw= 47	83	3	83	3	81	8	93	78	171	3.00	3.10	0.95	2.00	4.50	0.44	99	100	74	81,85,82,89,79	85	47	83.0	E/P	6	BOFF	2.00	183	GP	6.0	A	A>A	130	15.4	89.4	104.8	199	273	3wd; lost whip 1/16/ Set pace;all out late/ Shuffled back early
			8.0	4	4	WICKED	1>5	3999	R>R,D>D	**Ins;restrained back 5/8 (69)** 1st off 99 day layoff.Class Change 57 Finished 5 from post 1 Tjw= 43	69	3	69	3	63	4	68	80	147	7.50	7.80	0.96	7.40	7.00	1.06	71	72	71	69,75,64,44,0	75	99	69.0	P	5	0	12.00	164	FG	8.5	A	R>A	107	13.6	79.9	93.5	143	214	Ins;restrained back 5/8/ Ins;bid 2wupr;drew off/ Forward 1/2;gave way
			8.0	7	7	ROOKERY	3>5	6955	S>R,D>D	**6w1/4;stayed on;shft in (80)** BTL HORSE 1st off 33 day layoff.Class Change 0 Finished 5 from post 3 Tjw= 59	71	1	71	1	75	10	89	81	170	6.90	6.70	1.04	2.20	5.60	0.40	86	94	78	80,69,78,76,63	71	33	76.0	P	4	0	8.00	209	CD	6.0	A	A>A	120	11.8	89.6	101.4	180	258	6w1/4;stayed on;shft in/ 2-3p;never involved/ 5p;bumpd 6p1/8;kept on
			8.0	2	2	LADY	6>5	14111	R>R,D>D	**3p upper; flattened (81)** Flashed speed. 1st off 207 day layoff.Class Change 0 Finished 5 from post 6 Tjw= 70	80	5	82	6	83	10	88	85	173	5.10	4.70	1.08	4.60	4.40	1.04	92	85	82	81,84,74,92,90	90	207	80.0	E	6	0	1.80	214	CD	8.0	A	A>A	126	16.0	88.5	104.6	177	259	3p upper; flattened/ Gave in; lost plc late/ Dueled inside; tired
			8.0	6	6	DUPLICITOU	8>5	7332	R>R,D>D	**One paced 3w (70)** SLR?- 13 1st off 55 day layoff.Class Change 0 Finished 5 from post 8 Tjw= 49	81	5	81	5	78	10	80	74	153	6.60	4.10	1.63	5.40	3.70	1.47	79	82	63	70,83,84,88,82	88	55	79.0	P	2	0	6.00	187	OP	8.5	A	AO>A	121	13.6	84.0	97.6	161	224	One paced 3w/ 3-4w 1/4;bid; clear/ Lacked response drive
			8.0	3	3	CODE FOR	10>6	10872	S>R,D>D	**5p upper; improved (70)** Made big overall move (4). Class Change 2 Finished 6 from post 10 Tjw= 53	77	3	77	3	75	5	83	79	162	8.00	4.80	1.67	7.70	5.40	1.43	84	83	77	70,80,75,77,74	80	26	75.0	S	0	0	6.00	202	CD	6.0	A	A>A	123	11.8	83.7	95.5	167	244	5p upper; improved/ Bit slow st; moved up/ 3pth turns;moved up

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	PPOT	AEPS	LAST DS	NOTES FROM LAST RACE	SPD		SPD		AVG		LAST FIVE SPEED RATINGS					HIGH BYER					ERLY TOTL PACE PACE		COMMENTS																				
										110	#110	TDS	#TDS	SPD	#R	S1	S2	TOT	SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	TDS1	TDS2	CLOSE	E1	E2	LP		ATDS	DSL	AVG3	BRIS	P	EQUIP	MLINE	CLS	TRK	DIS	TYPE	CHNG	PWR	CLASS	FINAL	COMB	TOTL	LAST		
6/23/22	CD	7	8.5	1	1	SILVER	4>4	28259	R>R,D>D	**Chased; empty late (77)** Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 4-hole. Slow last race (15). Class Change 0 Finished 4 from post 4 Tjw= 68	93	9	93	9	92	10	82	79	160	5.40	5.60	0.96	5.30	5.30	1.00	75	80	76	77,86,98,82,88	104	28	87.0	E/P	5	0	4.00	224	CD	8.5	A	A>A	135	15.9	83.7	99.6	155	231	Chased; empty late/ Bothered early;4p trns/ Slow st;2wd;resillient
			8.5	3	3	MY SIXTH	5>5	13199	R>R,D>D	**3path upper; moved up (90)** 1st off 41 day layoff.Class Change 0 Finished 5 from post 5 Tjw= 37	88	9	89	10	89	10	85	92	176	6.00	5.50	1.10	6.00	5.50	1.10	86	90	89	90,74,82,89,98	98	41	82.0	E/P	2	0	15.00	218	CD	8.5	A	AO>A	128	10.3	85.8	96.1	176	265	3path upper; moved up/ Broke back; outrun/ 3w trip; no rally
			8.5	6	6	MASQUEPARA	3>2	61934	R>R,D>D	**4p upr; rally; gaining (98)** Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 3-hole. *Stretch gain (1.37).BTL HORSE 1st off 41 day layoff.Class Change 0 Finished 2 from post 3 Tjw= 58	94	7	94	8	93	9	89	94	182	4.40	3.50	1.25	3.80	3.50	1.08	91	98	94	98,97,97,102,102	102	41	97.0	E/P	4	0	1.00	197	CD	8.5	A	AO>A	140	19.0	88.4	107.4	189	283	4p upr; rally; gaining/ 2-3w;4w1/4;drift in1/8/ 3w upper; led; kept on
			8.5	7	7	FENWICK	7>1	22305	R>R,T>D	**Repelled foe;held firm (94)** DROP SWITCH Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 7-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH!BTL HORSE Clear early.1st off 62 day layoff.Class Change -4 Finished 1 from post 7 Tjw= 56	ERR	0	ERR	0	85	10	64	0	64	5.60	4.40	1.29	ERR	ERR	ERR	65	68	96	94,82,86,82,93	0	62	87.0	E/P	5	0	10.00	207	KEE	12.0	A	A>A	136	19.6	86.2	105.9	133	229	Repelled foe;held firm/ Track 2-3w;4p upr;chsd/ 2-3w;bid1/16;outfinshd
			8.5	5	5	YOU'RE TO	2>4	19572	R>R,D>D	**Bmpd st; 5p upr;faded (83)** 1st off 55 day layoff.Class Change 51 Finished 4 from post 2 Tjw= 22	89	7	87	10	87	10	78	86	164	7.70	5.70	1.35	7.70	5.70	1.35	79	83	83	83,77,88,84,87	102	55	83.0	S	2	0	30.00	215	KEE	8.5	A	C>A	125	15.9	83.4	99.3	162	245	Bmpd st; 5p upr;faded/ Last away;4w 2nd;empty/ Saved ground no avail
			8.5	4	4	WHISKEY	5>5	23649	R>R,T>D	**2w;5p upr;no rally (85)** *Stretch gain (.75).BTL HORSE 1st off 33 day layoff.Class Change 0 Finished 5 from post 5 Tjw= 67	81	2	81	2	86	10	83	98	181	6.30	4.60	1.36	4.50	4.10	1.11	82	91	83	85,80,82,93,88	88	33	82.0	S	3	0	12.00	212	CD	8.0	A	AO>A	131	16.3	86.8	103.1	173	256	2w;5p upr;no rally/ Fell back;not involved/ Passed tiring rivals
			8.5	8	8	SPA CITY	5>2	13340	R>R,D>D	**Drifted late; caught (88)** Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 5-hole.Uncharacteristic race?BTL HORSE Clear early.1st off 62 day layoff.Class Change 31 Finished 2 from post 5 Tjw= 62	92	9	92	9	92	10	81	89	170	4.70	3.10	1.50	4.50	3.10	1.47	74	82	94	88,92,103,90,93	103	62	94.0	E/P	5	0	10.00	197	OP	8.5	A	R>A	135	17.3	86.9	104.3	156	250	Drifted late; caught/ Gain;outfinished for 2/ Pulled away; handily
			8.5	2	2	INTREPID	3>2	17683	R>R,D>D	**2-3wd; bid 4wd 5/16 (90)** Chased Pace. Made big overall move (3). Made a big move early (8). 1st off 54 day layoff.Class Change 5 Finished 2 from post 3 Tjw= 75	91	9	91	10	91	10	72	73	145	7.10	4.10	1.71	7.10	4.10	1.71	88	94	85	90,100,97,93,88	100	54	96.0	S	3	0	3.00	184	FON	8.5	A	N>A	136	18.1	83.3	101.4	182	267	2-3wd; bid 4wd 5/16/ Gain 3w2nd;aim 6p upr/ Ins;3w1/4;drew off1/8

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	PPOT	AEPS	LAST DS	NOTES FROM LAST RACE	SPD		AVG		LAST FIVE										HIGH		ERLY TOTL				COMMENTS																	
										110	#110	TDS	#TDS	SPD	#R	S1	S2	TOT	SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	TDS1	TDS2	CLOSE	E1	E2	LP	SPEED	RATINGS		ATDS	DSL	AVG3	BRIS	P	EQUIP	MLINE	CLS	TRK	DIS	TYPE	CHNG	PWR	CLASS	FINAL	COMB	TOTL
6/23/22	CD	8	9.5	7 7	FINE	6>3	4333	R>R,D>D	**5wd 3/16; kept on (77)**THIRD OFF MAYBE? Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 6-hole. Fast last race (16). Class Change 0 Finished 3 from post 6 TJW= 52	ERR	0	80	2	61	9	75	87	162	4.70	7.20	0.65	2.10	2.60	0.80	71	73	82	77,83,55,69,25	83	27	72.0	E	8	0	6.00	174	CD	8.5	S	S>S	119	14.5	81.8	96.3	144	226	5wd 3/16; kept on/ Lost momentum;yielded/ Trackd 2wd;faded turn
			9.5	9 9	FIVE	8>10	4238	R>R,D>D	**7-wd upper stretch (65)** SLR?- 13 Slow last race (11). Class Change 0 Finished 10 from post 8 TJW= 84	ERR	0	77	5	76	6	70	82	152	4.90	6.00	0.82	4.50	5.50	0.81	65	64	72	65,78,89,79,73	89	27	77.0	E	5	0	4.50	170	CD	8.5	S	S>S	121	12.5	79.7	92.3	129	201	7-wd upper stretch/ Prompted winner 2wd/ Forward 3w;pressed btw
			9.5	8 8	AMENSET	4>2	7622	R>R,D>D	**Stlk3;4w uppr;2nd best (79)** Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 4-hole. Made big overall move (3). *Stretch gain (1).BTL HORSE 2 races in one pattern.Class Change 0 Finished 2 from post 4 TJW= 60	ERR	0	79	1	72	5	74	90	164	5.00	5.80	0.86	4.00	2.00	2.00	69	71	88	79,69,79,72,62	79	27	76.0	E/P	5	0	4.00	173	CD	8.5	S	S>S	117	12.2	81.5	93.8	140	228	Stlk3;4w uppr;2nd best/ Forwrd 4-5p;nobid;tire/ Ins foe-2p;btw;dueled
			9.5	3 3	FOREVER	1>9	1178	R>R,D>D	**Slow early; no bid (66)** Class Change 0 Finished 9 from post 1 TJW= 58	ERR	0	66	1	66	1	67	86	153	10.00	9.00	1.11	10.00	9.00	1.11	63	58	80	66,0,0,0,0	66	27	66.0	NA	0	BOFF	20.00	190	CD	8.5	S	S>S	108	10.1	81.1	91.2	121	201	Slow early; no bid/ /
			9.5	1 1	HIGH	9>9	823	R>R,D>D	**Numped st; no threat (71)** Made big overall move (3). 1st off 48 day layoff.Class Change 0 Finished 9 from post 9 TJW= 60	ERR	0	68	2	68	2	82	78	159	8.40	7.40	1.14	8.40	7.40	1.14	84	78	73	71,65,0,0,0	71	48	68.0	NA	0	0	20.00	179	CD	8.0	S	S>S	112	2.9	82.6	85.6	162	235	Numped st; no threat/ 5wd early;3wd 3/16p/
			9.5	5 5	SOUTH	6>2	3066	R>R,D>D	**Stlk3;bid3/8;caught (76)**THIRD OFF Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 6-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH!BTL HORSE Clear early.Class Change 40 Finished 2 from post 6 TJW= 54	ERR	0	72	5	73	7	78	88	166	6.40	5.50	1.17	6.40	6.00	1.07	64	70	87	76,79,68,77,76	79	28	74.0	E	3	0	20.00	173	IND	8.0	S	S>S	117	14.9	86.7	101.6	134	221	Stlk3p;bid3/8;caught/ 6p upper; improved/ Fractious; off slow
			9.5	4 4	CINQ	7>9	1866	R>R,T>D	**Never a factor (51)**THIRD OFF SLR?- 17 Class Change 0 Finished 9 from post 7 TJW= 44	ERR	0	60	2	57	3	59	-3	56	9.50	8.10	1.18	10.00	7.30	1.38	72	64	23	51,68,51,0,0	68	25	57.0	S	2	0	20.00	164	CD	11.0	S	S>S	103	7.9	77.3	85.1	136	159	Never a factor/ 3p;unrushed;no bid/ Inside trip; no factor
			9.5	2 2	SHE'S KEEN	9>5	3617	R>R,D>D	**5wd 7/8; 6wd 3/16 (74)** Class Change 0 Finished 5 from post 9 TJW= 51	ERR	0	77	2	76	3	73	87	160	6.50	4.40	1.47	5.00	4.10	1.22	68	69	81	74,80,75,0,0	80	27	76.0	P	2	0	6.00	189	CD	8.5	S	S>S	120	14.4	80.9	95.3	137	218	5wd 7/8; 6wd 3/16/ Hopped st; moved up/ Broke slow; came in
			9.5	6 6	MUSIC	10>4	5407	R>R,D>D	**4-3 wide bid;moved up (74)** Made big overall move (4). *Stretch gain (.5). Class Change 0 Finished 4 from post 10 TJW= 48	ERR	0	74	1	71	2	71	89	160	8.30	4.40	1.88	7.00	4.00	1.75	66	66	84	74,67,0,0,0	74	27	71.0	NA	2	0	12.00	189	CD	8.5	S	S>S	114	10.0	82.2	92.1	132	216	4-3 wide bid;moved up/ Shuffled wide;moved up/
			9.5	10 10	INSIGNIA	2>2	18000	S>R,D>D	**Off step slw;rail trip (90)** Made big overall move (7). Made a big move early (5.75). *Stretch gain (2.75). 1st off 53 day layoff.2 races in one pattern.Class Change 5 Finished 2 from post 2 TJW= 89	ERR	0	ERR	0	90	1	87	88	175	6.70	2.20	3.00	ERR	ERR	ERR	74	88	96	90,0,0,0,0	0	53	90.0	S	1	0	1.60	185	OP	6.0	S	S>S	125	16.1	88.4	104.5	162	258	Off step slw;rail trip/ /