









DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	DST	SURF	MOVING?	Avg	ASP	ASP	Avg	EARLY										avg race				LAST FIVE FIGS	TJW% CLS	COMMENT	BEST	BEST	TOTALS										
									SPD	R#	TDS	RT	110	RD	LAST5	SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	TDS1	TDS2	CLOSE	BROT1	BROT2	E1	E2	LATE				CLOSE	TOTAL		Last	DSL	BTOT	rtng	LRR	POWER	MLINE	OVERAL	LAST	
1/28/23	GP 13	9.0	6	6	ART	R>R	D>D	F/PP/WATCH/ESP/Y(2>5) Class Change 9	99	9	100	8	101	6	96	3.2	4.2	0.8	2.5	3.8	0.7	55.07	52.09	98	108	73	0.68	206	279	119	372	229	226	145.6	10.00	92,96,101,0,95	116	229	Ins winner;headed upr	158	145	303
		9.0	12	12	O'CONNOR	R>R	D>D	CP/Y(1>4) Class Change 14	98	2	98	2	98	2	98	3.3	3.3	1.0	3.3	3.3	1.0	55.53	54.46	88	100	94	0.94	188	282	28	363	198	221	141.3	10.00	98,98,0,0,0	147	206	Ins1st;5p str;1pace	155	151	306
		9.0	11	11	STILLETTO	R>R	D>D	F/PP/FLR+14_WATCH/Y(2>2) Class Change 9	97	10	97	9	100	5	88	4.3	4.6	0.9	4.2	4.7	0.9	57.19	53.03	100	107	75	0.70	207	282	33	373	231	226	143.0	30.00	92,78,95,98,110	79	231	Prssd;led5/16;no match	155	146	302
		9.0	5	5	DEFUNDED	R>R	D>D	F/PP/Y(5>1) Class Change 14	97	10	97	9	97	6	101	2.3	3.7	0.6	2.2	3.3	0.7	56.85	50.09	102	114	83	0.73	216	299	62	388	220	221	147.0	6.00	101,103,98,92,103	152	220	Bobbled;duel outsd;clr	156	158	313
		9.0	1	1	PROXY	R>R	D>D	F/PP/UN?/Y(1>1) Class Change 4	97	10	97	10	97	10	102	5.8	3.1	1.9	5.8	3.1	1.9	54.20	55.14	85	91	107	1.18	176	283	64	368	223	231	145.3	4.50	102,103,100,98,103	128	223	Drifted; up late	157	154	311
		9.0	2	2	SIMPLIFI	R>R	D>D	F/PP/FLR+12_Y(4>3) Class Change 14	96	10	96	10	97	7	98	4.4	3.4	1.3	4.4	3.4	1.3	55.77	55.14	92	102	96	0.94	194	290	28	374	225	221	143.4	15.00	101,89,105,94,96	117	225	4p;rdn5p str;hung4show	154	155	309
		9.0	9	9	LAST	R>R	D>D	BTL/SG:2.75/* 2 in 1 *Y(1>2) Class Change 9	95	10	95	10	94	8	97	6.0	5.2	1.1	6.0	5.2	1.1	54.99	52.24	84	92	108	1.17	176	284	42	363	226	226	140.0	20.00	102,94,96,83,100	56	226	Off bit slw;3w;willing	153	154	308
		9.0	7	7	SKIPPYLO	R>R	D>D	F/PP/ESP/Y(7>1) Class Change 14	95	10	95	10	100	6	100	3.8	4.6	0.8	3.8	4.6	0.8	56.00	55.14	94	104	99	0.95	198	297	28	385	216	221	145.6	5.00	103,96,101,105,96	169	216	3p;bid far turn;clear	154	159	312
		9.0	8	8	GET HER	R>R	D>D	CP/BTL/UN?/Y(4>2) Class Change 4	94	9	104	1	ERR	0	100	6.9	5.1	1.3	5.0	3.3	1.5	56.65	53.59	90	105	100	0.95	195	295	56	379	219	231	142.3	15.00	104,100,96,102,97	123	218	4w;bid5w1/4;out duo	154	159	313
		9.0	3	3	RIDIN	R>R	D>D	F/PP/BOM:3/SLR?- 11ESP/* 2 in 1 *Y(5>1) Class Change 20	93	10	93	8	96	3	91	2.6	2.9	0.9	2.6	2.8	0.9	56.07	50.61	95	97	79	0.81	192	271	24	357	210	215	143.9	20.00	88,99,87,96,88	88	210	Very wide; led; lasted	151	140	291
		9.0	10	10	CYBERKNI	R>R	D>D	BTL/SP+12/Y(7>2) Class Change 4	93	10	93	10	94	7	105	3.3	3.6	0.9	3.3	3.6	0.9	57.76	53.59	105	115	91	0.79	220	311	84	404	216	231	152.1	2.50	105,105,105,104,97	171	216	Came in 1/8; long drv	155	164	319
		9.0	14	14	ENDORSED	S>R	D>D	F/PP/BOM:3/Y(1>1) Class Change 34	92	10	91	5	92	2	95	5.3	4.7	1.1	4.4	5.6	0.8	58.25	59.35	92	103	95	0.92	195	290	37	290	221	201	138.8	15.00	101,100,84,86,93	105	221	Ins;shft6p str;up1/16p	146	155	301
		9.0	4	4	WHITE	R>R	D>D	CP/BTL/SP+12/Y(3>3) Class Change 4	92	10	92	9	92	6	91	3.8	4.0	1.0	4.1	4.4	0.9	56.53	53.59	89	104	100	0.96	193	293	56	377	216	231	146.3	10.00	104,104,65,96,80	163	216	2p;rail1/4;bid;ins duo	153	158	312





DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	PPOT	AEPS	LAST DS	NOTES FROM LAST RACE	SPD		AVG		LAST FIVE SPEED RATINGS											HIGH BYER		ERLY TOTL PACE PACE										COMMENTS											
										110	#110	TDS	#TDS	SPD	#R	S1	S2	TOT	SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	TDS1	TDS2	CLOSE	E1	E2	LP	ATDS	DSL	AVG3	BRIS	P	EQUIP	MLINE	CLS	TRK		DIS	TYPE	CHNG	PWR	CLASS	FINAL	COMB	TOTL	LAST		
1/28/23	GP	4	8.3	8	8	DAKOTA	4>7	5073	S>R,T>D	**Clear pace ins; tired (79)**   Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 4-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH! Clear early.Class Change 55 Finished 7 from post 4 TJW= 35	78	8	78	8	78	10	85	89	173	2.20	4.90	0.45	2.30	3.90	0.59	102	104	61	79,76,79,79,86	90	17	78.0	E/P	8	0	30.00	172	GP	7.5	A	CO>A	118	12.4	83.4	95.8	206	267	Clear pace ins; tired/ Led insd;2-3p;gave way/ Brk out;3p str;yld1/8p
			8.3	4	4	JUNGLE	1>4	4690	R>R,D>D	**Off slow; tired (64)**   1st off 64 day layoff.Class Change 4 Finished 4 from post 1 TJW= 60	75	3	79	4	70	10	81	71	152	3.20	6.50	0.49	3.00	6.10	0.50	87	85	48	64,73,92,87,82	92	64	76.0	E	7	0	20.00	201	CD	8.5	A	AO>A	122	13.5	80.7	94.1	172	220	Off slow; tired/ Ins foe;wknd btw5/16/ Loose;repelld rival1/8
			8.3	9	9	OUT OF	2>8	14360	R>R,D>D	**Faltered; eased (43)**  SLR?- 49 Slow last race (37). Class Change -6 Finished 8 from post 2 TJW= 80	93	2	76	3	80	10	69	56	125	6.70	6.10	1.10	4.10	4.50	0.90	90	83	9	43,92,93,90,72	93	29	76.0	E/P	5	0	5.00	207	LRL	9.0	A	N>A	128	10.8	75.5	86.3	173	182	Faltered; eased/ Stalk 2w;vied;drew off/ Repelled foe; clear
			8.3	1	1	KAHIKO	5>8	9997	R>R,T>D	**Bump btw into 1st turn (79)**THIRD OFF   DROP SWITCH Class Change -1 Finished 8 from post 5 TJW= 63	84	3	84	3	84	10	88	86	174	4.50	3.50	1.31	3.00	3.90	0.78	90	96	66	79,85,83,83,84	86	28	82.0	E/P	5	0	5.00	194	GP	8.0	A	G3>A	130	13.7	87.1	100.8	186	252	Bump btw into 1st turn/ Rail; 3wd 1/4; drvng/ Rally; 2wd 3/16; rally
			8.3	6	6	KEEPER OF	4>5	10074	R>R,T>D	**Failed to menace; 2wd (85)**   Made big overall move (3). Class Change -1 Finished 5 from post 4 TJW= 59	89	1	89	1	85	10	85	94	179	6.00	4.30	1.38	6.30	1.30	5.00	84	90	83	85,77,82,77,83	89	28	81.0	P	3	0	3.50	218	GP	8.0	A	G3>A	132	15.2	90.4	105.7	174	257	Failed to menace; 2wd/ 3-2w turn; 4w upper/ 3w upper; closed well
			8.3	2	2	LOVE HER	6>1	12218	R>R,D>D	**4-3wd; up 1/8; drvng (84)**   Chased Pace. Made big overall move (5).BTL HORSE 1st off 36 day layoff.Class Change 54 Finished 1 from post 6 TJW= 61	80	6	80	6	82	10	73	89	161	5.80	3.60	1.59	5.70	3.70	1.56	68	77	90	84,71,83,78,80	86	36	79.0	E/P	4	0	10.00	189	GP	8.5	A	CO>A	125	16.5	86.1	102.5	145	235	4-3wd; up 1/8; drvng/ Bumped start; 3-4wd/ Tracked 3wd; driving
			8.3	5	5	ILLIOGAMI	6>2	20253	R>R,D>D	**3-wide; strong finish (85)**   Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 6-hole. Made big overall move (3). *Stretch gain (.75).BTL HORSE 1st off 65 day layoff.Class Change 4 Finished 2 from post 6 TJW= 62	87	8	87	8	86	10	82	87	169	6.00	3.30	1.79	6.20	3.10	2.05	82	85	84	85,86,81,87,83	92	65	84.0	P	2	0	6.00	206	CD	8.5	A	AO>A	131	17.0	85.5	102.5	167	251	3-wide; strong finish/ Tracked 3p;held show/ In bit;5p3/16;stayd on
			8.3	7	7	MOZAY	8>2	13971	R>R,T>D	**2-3wd; rallied (84)**THIRD OFF MAYBE?   Made big overall move (4). *Stretch gain (.75). 2 races in one pattern.Class Change 14 Finished 2 from post 8 TJW= 65	85	2	85	2	82	10	80	98	178	5.40	3.00	1.81	4.40	3.10	1.40	76	77	91	84,81,77,88,84	86	28	81.0	P	0	0	6.00	183	GP	8.5	A	AO>A	129	16.7	85.5	102.2	153	244	2-3wd; rallied/ Jst1d early;3-4p2nd;5p/ Bmp brk;wd uppr;lt gn
			8.3	3	3	CAFE	1>2	19134	R>R,D>D	**Bmp brk;3p;kept on (89)**   Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 1-hole.Uncharacteristic race?BTL HORSE 1st off 42 day layoff.Class Change 49 Finished 2 from post 1 TJW= 53	88	5	88	6	86	10	85	78	162	8.20	4.20	1.93	7.10	4.40	1.61	85	87	91	89,88,82,77,82	94	42	86.0	E/P	5	0	3.00	204	TAM	8.1	A	AO>A	129	17.1	87.2	104.3	172	263	Bmp brk;3p;kept on/ Inside;clsd for plc/ Angled out;missed



DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	PPOT	AEPS	LAST DS	NOTES FROM LAST RACE	SPD	SPD	AVG	LAST FIVE											HIGH	ERLY TOTL										COMMENTS												
										110	#110	TDS	#TDS	SPD	#R	S1	S2	TOT	SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	TDS1	TDS2	CLOSE	E1	E2	LP	SPEED	RATINGS	BYER	ATDS	DSL	AVG3	BRIS		P	EQUIP	MLINE	CLS	TRK	DIS	TYPE	CHNG	PWR	CLASS	FINAL	COMB
1/28/23	GP	5	8.0	8 8	MALEX	2>8	2250	R>R,T>T	**Pace2p;yielded1/8 (78)**   Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 2-hole. Clear early.Class Change 0 Finished 8 from post 2 TJW= 70	0	3	78	1	78	1	66	1	67	1.10	8.90	0.13	1.10	8.90	0.13	68	68	71	78,0,0,0,0	78	27	78.0	E	6	BON	20.00	210	GP	12.0	A	AO>A	125	16.1	77.4	93.5	136	207	Pace2p;yielded1/8/ /
			8.0	15 15	NOT PHAR	10>1	12143	R>R,T>T	**Pace 2p; drew off; drv (93)**   Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 10-hole. Fast last race (11).BTL HORSE Clear early.Class Change 35 Finished 1 from post 10 TJW= 59	90	2	90	2	82	10	89	97	186	1.60	4.10	0.38	1.10	2.10	0.50	100	96	88	93,87,83,76,85	93	15	88.0	E	8	0	4.00	186	GP	8.5	A	R>A	143	17.7	89.8	107.6	196	284	Pace 2p; drew off; drv/ 2-3wd; bit tight str/ Bmp st;outside;2p;wknd
			8.0	10 10	NERVES OF	8>8	7249	R>R,T>T	**Off rail; weakened (86)**   1st off 182 day layoff.Class Change 4 Finished 8 from post 8 TJW= 60	86	9	84	10	84	10	91	88	179	3.50	6.00	0.58	3.50	6.00	0.58	100	103	72	86,80,70,81,87	92	182	79.0	E/P	4	0	20.00	192	DMR	8.0	A	AO>A	123	12.5	84.6	97.0	203	275	Off rail; weakened/ 3wd into str; weakened/ Rail spd;overtaken5/16
			8.0	16 16	LAKER	5>1	7808	R>R,T>T	**Pace 2path; driving (88)**   Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 5-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH!BTL HORSE Clear early.Class Change 70 Finished 1 from post 5 TJW= 60	80	4	80	4	82	10	85	98	183	4.10	4.90	0.84	2.80	4.80	0.58	87	87	89	88,78,80,85,77	88	24	82.0	E/P	8	0	15.00	178	GP	8.5	A	C>A	121	14.0	86.4	100.4	174	263	Pace 2path; driving/ Rail; pace; tired/ Brk in;prmt3p;ylid upr
			8.0	7 7	HUSBAND	5>4	8238	R>R,D>T	**Middle move; evenly (74)**   Flashed speed.Uncharacteristic race? 1st off 469 day layoff.Class Change 13 Finished 4 from post 5 TJW= 94	ERR	0	ERR	0	72	4	73	87	160	4.70	5.30	0.88	ERR	ERR	ERR	67	66	88	74,66,87,59,0	0	469	76.0	E/P	5	0	20.00	181	DEL	8.0	A	N>A	111	14.8	82.5	97.2	133	221	Middle move; evenly/ Stalk 4-301st; faded/ Drew off; in hand late
			8.0	6 6	UP TO THE	6>4	16680	R>R,D>T	**4w pursuit; weakened (87)**   DROP SWITCH Flashed speed. 1st off 41 day layoff.Class Change -1 Finished 4 from post 6 TJW= 86	ERR	0	ERR	0	86	5	82	89	170	4.90	5.10	0.94	ERR	ERR	ERR	80	87	89	87,85,71,92,95	0	41	81.0	E/P	5	0	4.50	209	AQU	8.0	A	A>A	135	16.7	82.5	99.1	167	256	4w pursuit; weakened/ 4-5w turn;6w into lane/ 6w upper; weakened
			8.0	9 9	TIZ A	3>1	5716	R>R,T>T	**Rail; pace; driving (84)**   Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 3-hole. Fast last race (12).Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH!BTL HORSE Clear early.1st off 43 day layoff.Class Change 49 Finished 1 from post 3 TJW= 49	78	6	78	7	72	10	86	102	188	3.80	3.80	1.00	2.00	3.00	0.68	85	82	89	84,80,70,78,83	84	43	78.0	E/P	5	0	10.00	147	GP	8.0	A	CO>A	128	16.0	89.6	105.5	167	256	Rail; pace; driving/ 2wd bid; late duel/ Angled out; gaining
			8.0	12 12	GLIDER	6>7	8449	R>R,D>T	**Rail; retreated (86)**   Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 6-hole. 1st off 36 day layoff.Class Change 9 Finished 7 from post 6 TJW= 76	ERR	0	ERR	0	81	7	84	71	154	5.30	5.00	1.06	ERR	ERR	ERR	94	99	76	86,94,68,80,91	0	36	83.0	P	3	0	20.00	196	GP	8.0	A	AO>A	137	12.7	83.4	96.0	193	269	Rail; retreated/ Advanced turn;clear3rd/ 3w; no factor
			8.0	1 1	DOUBLE	7>8	16895	R>R,T>T	**2wd btwn;no bid (89)**   DROP SWITCH 1st off 91 day layoff.Class Change -9 Finished 8 from post 7 TJW= 53	87	5	86	6	86	6	82	97	178	4.80	4.30	1.11	4.80	4.30	1.11	94	94	84	88,83,89,90,84	90	91	87.0	P	3	0	8.00	207	KEE	8.0	A	G3>A	142	14.6	84.7	99.4	188	272	2wd btwn;no bid/ Dawdled along;gave way/ Bumped st; outkicked
			8.0	2 2	CHASING	10>1	26943	R>R,T>T	**Edged past 1/8;cleared (85)**   Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 10-hole.BTL HORSE Clear early.1st off 258 day layoff.Class Change 19 Finished 1 from post 10 TJW= 74	83	3	83	3	83	3	78	100	177	2.50	2.20	1.13	2.50	2.20	1.13	88	87	84	85,80,83,0,0	85	258	83.0	E/P	3	0	8.00	183	CD	8.0	A	S>A	131	16.8	86.0	102.8	175	259	Edged past 1/8;cleared/ 3wd;ranged up;outkicked/ 4wd bid;edgd for show
			8.0	4 4	AXTHELM	6>6	27489	R>R,D>T	**Rail; weakened (87)**   Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 6-hole.BTL HORSE 1st off 33 day layoff.Class Change -14 Finished 6 from post 6 TJW= 75	84	3	84	3	85	5	81	91	171	3.10	2.70	1.13	2.50	1.90	1.29	84	84	90	87,92,80,81,85	92	33	86.0	E/P	4	0	4.00	203	GP	8.5	A	N>A	142	16.3	87.4	103.7	168	258	Rail; weakened/ Ins;bid 1/8;fought oon/ Trck 2-3w;chs;save shw
			8.0	5 5	PARATUS	3>1	16617	R>R,t>t	**2-3p;bid3/16;prvd best (89)**   Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 3-hole.Uncharacteristic race?BTL HORSE 1st off 426 day layoff.Class Change 33 Finished 1 from post 3 TJW= 56	79	2	82	3	82	3	66	107	172	6.80	5.40	1.27	6.80	5.40	1.27	70	71	103	89,74,84,0,0	89	426	82.0	P	3	0	8.00	180	AQU	9.0	A	S>A	129	17.6	83.6	101.3	141	244	2-3p;bid3/16;prvd best/ Saved ground no avail/ Bumped st; missed
			8.0	11 11	JOURNEYMAN	7>2	7825	R>R,T>T	**4p;6p str;rallied plc (90)**   Made big overall move (6). *Stretch gain (3.25).BTL HORSE 1st off 37 day layoff.Class Change 59 Finished 2 from post 7 TJW= 81	88	5	89	4	87	10	92	100	191	6.00	4.60	1.32	7.50	4.40	1.72	75	87	94	90,93,77,80,83	90	37	87.0	S	0	0	3.00	188	GP	8.0	A	C>A	138	15.2	89.2	104.5	162	256	4p;6p str;rallied plc/ Rail; 4wd 3/8; mildly/ 5wd; up 1/16; prevail
			8.0	14 14	ATTENTIVE	3>7	7830	S>R,T>T	**Bump early;no path str (78)**THIRD OFF   *Stretch gain (1.75). 2 races in one pattern.Class Change 45 Finished 7 from post 3 TJW= 26	84	4	87	6	84	10	71	61	132	8.10	5.20	1.55	7.60	3.90	1.95	81	77	87	78,88,63,85,89	90	16	76.0	S	3	0	20.00	174	GP	7.5	A	CO>A	126	14.6	86.2	100.8	158	245	Bump early;no path str/ Ins;rdn4p str;flatten/ Outrun; faltered
			8.0	3 3	WINSTON	6>3	14148	R>R,D>T	**3-5w turns;kept on (83)**   DROP SWITCH Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 6-hole. *Stretch gain (.25).BTL HORSE 1st off 76 day layoff.Class Change -6 Finished 3 from post 6 TJW= 40	ERR	0	ERR	0	77	5	82	81	162	5.30	3.40	1.56	ERR	ERR	ERR	92	99	68	83,84,76,69,72	0	76	81.0	E/P	7	0	20.00	191	WO	8.5	A	AO>A	128	16.3	85.5	101.8	191	259	3-5w turns;kept on/ Drifted out;held sway/ Bmpd st;2-3w;willingly
			8.0	13 13	HOKU	10>1	14500	R>R,T>T	**Bid3/8;3-4p;gn;clear (82)**   Chased Pace. Made big overall move (4). Made a big move early (3).BTL HORSE 1st off 31 day layoff.Class Change 64 Finished 1 from post 10 TJW= 51	82	1	82	1	82	1	80	103	182	3.00	1.00	3.00	3.00	1.00	3.00	74	70	97	82,0,0,0,0	82	31	82.0	P	1	0	10.00	146	TAM	8.0	A	S>A	125	13.5	87.4	100.9	144	241	Bid3/8;3-4p;gn;clear/ /

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	PPOT	AEPS	LAST DS	NOTES FROM LAST RACE	SPD		AVG		LAST FIVE											HIGH		ERLY TOTL		COMMENTS																			
										110	#110	TDS	#TDS	SPD	#R	S1	S2	TOT	SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	TDS1	TDS2	CLOSE	E1	E2	LP	SPEED		RATINGS	BYER	ATDS	DSL	AVG3	BRIS	P	EQUIP	MLINE	CLS	TRK	DIS	TYPE	CHNG	PWR	CLASS	FINAL	COMB	TOTL
1/28/23	GP	6	12.0	4	4	BESIDE	1>4	23125	R>R,D>T	**2p;3p str;faded (88)**   Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 1-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH! 1st off 42 day layoff.Class Change -1 Finished 4 from post 1 TJW= 83	96	2	85	9	86	10	70	-9	61	2.80	4.00	0.71	3.00	3.90	0.77	86	93	69	88,89,82,102,82	102	42	86.0	E	8	0	5.00	205	GP	12.0	G3	N>G3	153	18.8	81.7	100.5	179	248	2p;3p str;faded/ Duel 2w;clrd;gave way/ 2p;ins3rd;2p1/4;tired
		12.0	5	5	ADVENTURIN	6>3	63880	R>R,T>T	**Stlkd; lacked response (92)**   Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 6-hole. 1st off 65 day layoff.Class Change 4 Finished 3 from post 6 TJW= 78	ERR	0	90	7	85	10	74	94	168	3.30	4.30	0.78	3.50	3.20	1.10	90	98	83	92,97,99,92,81	99	65	96.0	E/P	7	0	1.40	222	CD	9.0	G3	G3>G3	156	18.4	86.6	105.0	188	271	Stlkd; lacked response/ Pace inside;off rail/ Pace;4p 1/4;driving	
		12.0	3	3	BOW DRAW	2>6	3671	R>R,D>T	**Inside;svd gnd;empty (75)**   Class Change 20 Finished 6 from post 2 TJW= 13	ERR	0	77	1	74	7	81	76	156	4.60	4.60	1.00	2.50	2.50	1.00	89	85	69	75,78,82,75,77	77	14	78.0	E/P	6	0	30.00	173	TAM	8.5	G3	N>G3	117	12.3	80.7	93.0	174	243	Inside;svd gnd;empty/ Chase;2p;duel;weakn/ Clsd fast for plc	
		12.0	8	8	MY CANDY	4>4	9161	R>R,T>T	**Bump st; 2w; rail 3/16 (88)**   Made big overall move (3). Class Change 19 Finished 4 from post 4 TJW= 56	ERR	0	84	9	81	10	92	94	185	5.50	4.00	1.37	5.20	3.70	1.43	99	97	78	88,84,88,84,85	91	30	87.0	P	1	0	12.00	187	GP	8.5	G3	A0>G3	136	16.0	86.6	102.6	196	274	Bump st; 2w; rail 3/16/ 2-3wd; gamely btw/ 4wd 1/4; driving	
		12.0	7	7	SOUL OF AN	2>6	5153	R>R,D>T	**3p;never menaced (80)**  SLR?- 16 Class Change -1 Finished 6 from post 2 TJW= 30	ERR	0	ERR	0	82	10	84	78	162	6.90	4.70	1.49	ERR	ERR	ERR	73	86	79	80,96,88,79,71	0	28	88.0	S	0	0	30.00	174	GP	8.0	G3	N>G3	124	14.6	82.6	97.2	159	238	3p;never menaced/ Circled 5wd; driving/ Bump both sides start	
		12.0	2	2	PERSONAL	8>3	25465	R>R,D>T	**Bid3w;led5p str;driftd (91)**   Chased Pace.BTL HORSE 1st off 33 day layoff.Class Change 1 Finished 3 from post 8 TJW= 72	ERR	0	85	6	85	8	81	91	171	3.80	2.50	1.53	3.00	2.10	1.42	80	89	92	91,99,84,94,78	99	33	91.0	P	2	0	3.50	194	GP	8.5	G3	N>G3	154	18.1	86.9	105.0	169	261	Bid3w;led5p str;driftd/ Ins-2p;drifted in 1/8/ 2w btw;5p1/4;outkicked	
		12.0	6	6	TRANSIENT	11>3	15291	R>R,D>T	**Gave way grudgingly (93)**   Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 11-hole. Fast last race (11).Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH!BTL HORSE Clear early.1st off 77 day layoff.Class Change 4 Finished 3 from post 11 TJW= 79	ERR	0	81	7	82	10	86	50	135	5.80	3.30	1.73	7.00	3.50	2.00	96	98	77	93,83,91,76,89	91	77	89.0	S	3	0	4.00	195	WO	10.0	G3	G3>G3	149	18.9	84.1	102.9	194	271	Gave way grudgingly/ Ins;2p3rd;3p1/4;rally/ Ins-2p;rallied;bid1/16	
		12.0	1	1	LISHEEN	6>2	9957	R>R,D>T	**3p;5p str;chase winner (91)**   Chased Pace. Made big overall move (6). 1st off 42 day layoff.Class Change -1 Finished 2 from post 6 TJW= 65	ERR	0	83	9	84	10	69	-9	60	6.40	3.70	1.76	6.50	3.80	1.71	76	84	78	91,87,82,80,88	89	42	87.0	P	3	0	8.00	203	GP	12.0	G3	N>G3	139	17.8	83.4	101.3	160	238	3p;5p str;chase winner/ Ins;shift 4wd;willing/ Tracked ins; kept on	

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	PPOT	AEPS	LAST DS	NOTES FROM LAST RACE	SPD	SPD	AVG	LAST FIVE											HIGH	ERLY TOTL										COMMENTS												
										110	#110	TDS	#TDS	SPD	#R	S1	S2	TOT	SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	TDS1	TDS2	CLOSE	E1	E2	LP	SPEED	RATINGS	BYER	ATDS	DSL	AVG3	BRIS		P	EQUIP	MLINE	CLS	TRK	DIS	TYPE	CHNG	PWR	CLASS	FINAL	COMB
1/28/23	GP	7	8.3	6 6	INTO THE	6>1	13792	R>R,T>D	**Rail; pace; driving (92)**   Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 6-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH!BTL HORSE Clear early.Class Change 10 Finished 1 from post 6 TJW= 75	ERR	0	ERR	0	82	10	90	101	191	2.50	6.70	0.37	ERR	ERR	ERR	88	94	91	92,77,82,68,91	0	27	84.0	E	8	0	10.00	216	GP	8.0	A	AO>A	127	14.4	86.6	100.9	182	273	Rail; pace; driving/ Pace insd-2path;empty/ Vied ins; gave way
			8.3	5 5	WOLFIE'S	5>3	20530	R>R,D>D	**Led inside; weekend (90)**   DROP SWITCH Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 5-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH! Clear early.1st off 117 day layoff.Class Change -6 Finished 3 from post 5 TJW= 96	94	2	93	3	89	10	87	78	164	2.50	3.80	0.64	1.20	3.60	0.33	98	104	73	90,92,94,87,70	96	117	92.0	E	6	0	4.50	216	PRX	9.0	A	N>A	140	18.2	85.1	103.3	202	275	Led inside; weekend/ Led2p;ins up;rdrew off/ 3w upper; wknd late
			8.3	15 15	PARKLAND	3>1	8985	R>R,D>D	**2p;6p str;drw past1/16 (92)**   Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 3-hole.BTL HORSE 1st off 45 day layoff.Class Change 59 Finished 1 from post 3 TJW= 75	85	5	85	5	85	10	78	88	165	3.30	4.80	0.68	4.50	4.50	1.00	90	92	92	92,85,76,84,86	92	45	84.0	E/P	6	0	20.00	181	GP	8.3	A	CO>A	127	17.5	83.1	100.6	182	274	2p;6p str;drw past1/16/ Chased inside; faded/ Trackd 4-3w;not enough
			8.3	4 4	CARPENTERS	8>12	12229	R>R,T>D	**No factor; 4wd (89)**   Class Change -6 Finished 12 from post 8 TJW= 56	91	3	91	3	89	10	88	94	182	3.50	5.10	0.69	3.30	3.30	1.00	96	105	70	89,68,87,96,89	96	28	81.0	E/P	4	0	30.00	209	GP	9.0	A	G2>A	131	14.1	83.9	97.9	201	271	No factor; 4wd/ Stumbled badly start;/ Pc;wknd final furl
			8.3	14 14	LIKE THE	6>4	18409	R>R,D>D	**Bid 1/4p faltered late (91)**   Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 6-hole.BTL HORSE 1st off 58 day layoff.Class Change 14 Finished 4 from post 6 TJW= 75	87	2	87	2	88	10	85	88	173	3.60	4.90	0.73	2.10	5.80	0.36	92	95	87	91,90,83,97,87	91	58	88.0	E	6	0	15.00	220	TP	8.0	A	AO>A	133	17.3	84.2	101.5	187	274	Bid 1/4p faltered late/ Head1/4;battled;tired/ Pressed lead;faltered
			8.3	16 16	RED LINE	11>10	9228	R>R,T>D	**No factor; 3wd (76)**   1st off 56 day layoff.Class Change 19 Finished 10 from post 11 TJW= 86	78	1	79	2	78	5	86	96	182	4.30	5.20	0.82	2.50	3.80	0.67	79	76	82	76,78,79,81,74	79	56	78.0	E/P	4	0	20.00	179	GP	8.0	A	AO>A	121	12.1	81.7	93.8	155	237	No factor; 3wd/ Stumble st; 4-3w; game/ 2p-ins1st;ins2nd;tired
			8.3	9 9	TANGO	4>8	20289	R>R,T>D	**Hit gate;pinched start (93)**   Made big overall move (4). Made a big move early (4.75). Class Change -6 Finished 8 from post 4 TJW= 45	87	2	87	2	89	10	84	101	185	4.80	5.30	0.89	2.90	5.00	0.57	80	98	85	93,89,84,85,90	89	28	89.0	E/P	4	0	15.00	215	GP	9.0	A	G2>A	134	12.6	85.1	97.8	178	263	Hit gate;pinched start/ Press 2wd;led;held 3rd/ Rail; 2w gain; no kick
			8.3	1 1	KING CAUSE	9>9	17742	R>R,T>D	**Light bump early; 2wd (91)**   DROP SWITCH Class Change -6 Finished 9 from post 9 TJW= 75	90	1	96	2	86	10	86	98	184	4.70	4.80	0.98	3.50	1.80	2.00	91	102	78	91,87,92,97,79	101	28	90.0	E/P	5	0	4.00	220	GP	9.0	A	G2>A	141	15.6	90.6	106.2	193	271	Light bump early; 2wd/ In hand ins; held well/ Tracked 3wd; gamely
			8.3	10 10	STEADY ON	8>2	31210	R>R,D>D	**2p; drift out; nailed (90)**   Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 8-hole.BTL HORSE Clear early.1st off 33 day layoff.Class Change -4 Finished 2 from post 8 TJW= 86	90	1	90	1	85	5	82	92	173	2.90	2.50	1.15	0.80	1.70	0.50	86	87	93	90,88,85,84,76	90	33	88.0	E/P	6	0	8.00	208	GP	8.5	A	N>A	138	18.2	89.9	108.1	173	266	2p; drift out; nailed/ Bmpd hard brk;3p turns/ 2p-ins;3pl/4;rally;clr
			8.3	13 13	SMOKIN' T	6>7	12657	R>R,T>D	**Rated;ins turn;ask1/4 (86)**   DROP SWITCH Chased Pace. 1st off 208 day layoff.Class Change -4 Finished 7 from post 6 TJW= 61	89	1	89	1	82	10	91	90	181	5.80	4.80	1.20	1.70	1.70	1.00	93	97	78	86,92,89,86,89	89	208	89.0	E/P	2	0	12.00	202	BEL	8.0	A	N>A	130	15.7	86.8	102.5	190	268	Rated;ins turn;ask1/4/ Gain 4w;bid;tenacious/ Rallied between horses
			8.3	3 3	RAMSEY	1>6	36543	R>R,T>D	**Inside; no final bid (90)**   DROP SWITCHBTL HORSE 1st off 149 day layoff.Class Change -6 Finished 6 from post 1 TJW= 79	96	3	96	3	93	10	96	87	183	3.80	3.10	1.21	5.30	2.10	2.50	84	89	90	90,93,88,92,97	98	149	90.0	E/P	4	0	5.00	212	KD	8.3	A	N>A	138	17.3	90.0	107.3	173	263	Inside; no final bid/ Bump btw st; 4wd move/ Hooked from ins;game
			8.3	2 2	SKYRO	2>1	18167	R>R,D>D	**3wd;up 1/4;drove clear (96)**   Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 2-hole.BTL HORSE 1st off 44 day layoff.Class Change 19 Finished 1 from post 2 TJW= 71	97	2	97	2	90	10	86	85	170	3.90	3.20	1.22	2.50	1.30	2.00	98	105	85	96,92,83,97,91	97	44	90.0	E/P	6	0	8.00	209	GP	8.3	A	AO>A	139	18.6	87.7	106.3	203	288	3wd;up 1/4;drove clear/ 4p into lane;weakened/ Stalked; weakened;
			8.3	8 8	GREYES	1>1	16499	R>R,D>D	**All out; in time (94)**   Made big overall move (8).BTL HORSE 1st off 58 day layoff.Class Change 14 Finished 1 from post 1 TJW= 59	94	1	94	1	91	10	83	93	176	5.70	4.00	1.43	6.40	0.90	7.00	87	92	96	94,93,89,87,94	94	58	92.0	S	0	BOFF	6.00	212	TP	8.0	A	AO>A	137	18.5	87.4	105.8	179	275	All out; in time/ Step slw;7pupr;left 1d/ Rallied; late bid; up
			8.3	7 7	SUMMER	9>2	11379	R>R,D>D	**4-3w;rail 3/16;bid 1/8 (94)**THIRD OFF MAYBE?   Made big overall move (4). Fast last race (11). 1st off 44 day layoff.Class Change 19 Finished 2 from post 9 TJW= 62	84	5	84	5	83	10	83	86	168	6.80	4.10	1.68	6.90	3.30	2.08	92	100	86	94,91,81,87,75	94	44	89.0	S	2	0	12.00	190	GP	8.3	A	AO>A	133	18.1	86.2	104.3	192	278	4-3w;rail 3/16;bid 1/8/ 3-4w;drift in;up late/ Brk awkward;5wd upper
			8.3	12 12	BUSINESS	1>6	20091	R>R,D>D	**Ins;4wbw upr;no bid (89)**   DROP SWITCH Made big overall move (4). Made a big move early (3). 1st off 33 day layoff.Class Change -6 Finished 6 from post 1 TJW= 49	87	8	86	10	86	10	72	83	155	6.30	3.50	1.79	6.30	3.50	1.79	80	89	88	89,94,93,89,88	94	33	92.0	P	0	0	12.00	204	FG	8.5	A	N>A	132	16.6	82.5	99.1	169	257	Ins;4wbw upr;no bid/ 2wd;4wd upr;rallied;up/ 4w;rangd up;place duel
			8.3	11 11	CALIFORNIA	4>2	25272	R>R,T>D	**Rtd3p;drv8p ln;rallied (91)**   Made big overall move (6). *Stretch gain (.25). 1st off 144 day layoff.Class Change 1 Finished 2 from post 4 TJW= 32	80	7	80	7	82	9	78	98	175	5.10	2.40	2.11	4.20	2.60	1.60	84	90	89	91,87,83,84,79	87	144	87.0	P	2	0	20.00	184	CNL	9.0	A	G3>A	133	13.2	87.5	100.7	174	263	Rtd3p;drv8p ln;rallied/ Shuffled early; 4wd/ 3wd; clear; lated

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	PPOT	AEPS	LAST DS	NOTES FROM LAST RACE	SPD		SPD		AVG		S1	S2	TOT	SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	TDS1	TDS2	CLOSE	E1	E2	LP	LAST FIVE SPEED RATINGS	HIGH BYER		AVG3	BRIS	P	EQUIP	MLINE	CLS	TRK	DIS	TYPE	CHNG	PWR	CLASS	FINAL	COMB	ERLY TOTL		COMMENTS	
										110	#110	TDS	#TDS	SPD	#R														ATDS	DSL															TOTL	PACE		
1/28/23	GP	8	7.0	10	10	R	ADIOS	5>1	30028 S>S,D>D	**Led;2p;dug in;held (84)**   Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 5-hole.BTL HORSE Clear early.1st off 49 day layoff.Class Change 4 Finished 1 from post 5 TJW= 79	90	6	90	9	90	9	92	79	171	1.40	2.10	0.67	1.40	2.10	0.67	92	98	75	84,82,91,96,93	96	49	86.0	E	8	0	8.00	196	TAM	7.0	G2	N>G2	137	17.1	87.5	104.6	190	265	Led;2p;dug in;held/ No match 3/16; tired/ Pace 2p; left lead
			7.0	5	5	FIRE ON	9>10	33464 S>S,D>D	**4w bid 1/4; hung late (76)**   Chased Pace.SLR?- 15 1st off 56 day layoff.Class Change 4 Finished 10 from post 9 TJW= 65	85	3	83	6	83	8	83	77	160	2.20	2.80	0.81	2.40	2.90	0.82	92	91	77	76,91,86,88,83	91	56	84.0	E/P	5	0	20.00	194	TP	6.0	G2	N>G2	132	13.8	85.0	98.8	183	260	4w bid 1/4; hung late/ Track 3w; drew clear/ Long drv btw;prevailed	
			7.0	2	2	MISS	6>1	25539 S>S,D>D	**Duel;clear;kept task (87)**   Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 6-hole.BTL HORSE Clear early.1st off 49 day layoff.Class Change 14 Finished 1 from post 6 TJW= 75	88	3	87	5	87	8	91	89	180	3.20	3.50	0.91	3.60	3.20	1.13	96	98	82	87,83,83,85,92	92	49	84.0	E	6	0	20.00	186	WO	6.5	G2	AO>G2	135	17.3	86.1	103.4	194	276	Duel;clear;kept task/ Bid4w3/16;levelled off/ Lead1/4;stalled late	
			7.0	6	6	JAG	8>5	14877 R>S,D>D	**6-w; lacked response (76)**  SLR?- 18 1st off 65 day layoff.Class Change 14 Finished 5 from post 8 TJW= 58	77	5	77	7	76	10	81	81	162	4.40	4.70	0.94	4.40	5.10	0.87	80	83	71	76,94,90,79,74	94	65	87.0	E/P	3	0	20.00	188	CD	8.5	G2	AO>G2	130	15.5	83.3	98.7	163	234	6-w; lacked response/ Floatd 7p1/4;tipin;bid/ Vied 3-2wd;held gamely	
			7.0	8	8	DIAMOND	1>2	17118 S>S,D>D	**Veer in st;rail;4w 1/4 (89)**THIRD OFF   Made big overall move (3). *Stretch gain (1.75). Class Change 20 Finished 2 from post 1 TJW= 89	84	2	85	4	84	8	89	82	171	4.50	4.30	1.04	6.30	5.00	1.25	89	95	88	89,83,81,84,82	89	6	84.0	E/P	0	0	15.00	205	GP	6.0	G2	AO>G2	130	16.9	85.3	102.1	184	272	Veer in st;rail;4w 1/4/ Hit rail;bump into 1st/ Off slowly; inside 1/4	
			7.0	3	3	COLORFUL	3>2	30541 R>S,D>D	**Sp;ins turn;stymied1/4 (92)**   Class Change 4 Finished 2 from post 3 TJW= 86	85	4	84	5	85	7	86	85	171	4.90	3.30	1.50	5.30	3.30	1.60	79	90	95	92,72,87,95,87	95	28	84.0	E/P	2	0	6.00	211	GP	8.0	G2	N>G2	133	18.3	83.9	102.2	169	264	Sp;ins turn;stymied1/4/ Off pace 2p;no impact/ Pressd 2wbtw;held show	
			7.0	1	1	FAMED	1>1	34459 R>S,D>D	**Stalk;bid 3w;drew away (94)**   Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 1-hole. Made big overall move (3).BTL HORSE Clear early.1st off 42 day layoff.Class Change 4 Finished 1 from post 1 TJW= 91	88	4	88	6	87	9	80	84	163	4.20	2.30	1.83	4.30	1.90	2.30	94	95	91	94,91,92,87,88	92	42	92.0	P	2	0	5.00	207	RP	8.3	G2	N>G2	139	19.0	85.3	104.2	189	280	Stalk;bid 3w;drew away/ 6p1/4;rally;left lead/ Wait 3/8;swng 5w;bid	
			7.0	9	9	LAST LEAF	7>2	21125 S>S,D>D	**Ran on wide for 2nd (87)**   Made big overall move (5). 1st off 56 day layoff.Class Change 4 Finished 2 from post 7 TJW= 62	88	6	88	7	86	10	81	86	167	6.70	3.30	2.00	6.40	3.10	2.06	92	85	95	87,84,86,91,95	95	56	86.0	P	0	0	12.00	216	TP	6.0	G2	N>G2	131	15.7	88.1	103.7	177	272	Ran on wide for 2nd/ 4-3p;6p1/4;gave way/ Trck 5p;plc bid;flatnd	
			7.0	4	4	OBLIGATORY	7>5	98471 S>S,D>D	**Fanned wide; gaining (99)**   Made big overall move (6). Made a big move early (3). *Stretch gain (2). 1st off 84 day layoff.Class Change -1 Finished 5 from post 7 TJW= 65	96	7	96	7	96	10	80	92	171	8.40	3.70	2.25	9.30	4.20	2.22	69	85	111	99,101,105,100,90	105	84	102.0	S	2	0	1.40	227	KEE	7.0	G2	G1>G2	143	18.1	88.3	106.4	154	265	Fanned wide; gaining/ 3-4p trn;checked1/4;7w/ Ins;mvd out1/8;gaining	
			7.0	7	7	MARYQUITEC	6>1	36797 R>S,D>D	**Bmp;5w turn;bid6p;c1r (96)**   Chased Pace. Made big overall move (4). Made a big move early (4.5).BTL HORSE Class Change 4 Finished 1 from post 6 TJW= 41	88	5	88	5	89	6	88	86	174	5.90	1.60	3.72	6.20	1.60	3.83	77	95	97	96,89,91,86,90	91	28	92.0	P	0	0	5.00	169	GP	8.0	G2	N>G2	134	19.0	87.6	106.6	172	269	Bmp;5w turn;bid6p;c1r/ Rtd6p;bid5p str;cleadr/ Chased 5wd;surged;up	

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	PPOT	AEPS	LAST DS	NOTES FROM LAST RACE	SPD	SPD	AVG	LAST FIVE											HIGH		ERLY TOTL		PACE		COMMENTS																		
										110	#110	TDS	#TDS	SPD	#R	S1	S2	TOT	SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	TDS1	TDS2	CLOSE	E1	E2	LP	SPEED	RATINGS		BYER	ATDS	DSL	AVG3	BRIS	P	EQUIP	MLINE	CLS	TRK	DIS	TYPE	CHNG	PWR	CLASS	FINAL	COMB	TOTL
1/28/23	GP	9	12.0	7	7	CHANNEL	6>7	76112	R>R,T>T	**Vied 2wd;wknd btwn 1/8 (102)**   DROP SWITCH Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 6-hole. Clear early.1st off 84 day layoff.Class Change -6 Finished 7 from post 6 TJW= 63	103	8	102	10	102	10	67	-8	59	3.10	5.70	0.54	3.10	5.70	0.54	85	113	82	102,98,94,112,97	112	84	98.0	E	7	0	3.00	231	KEE	12.0	G3	G1>G3	160	14.2	83.4	97.6	198	280	Vied 2wd;wknd btwn 1/8/ Press 2w;chasd;faltered/ 2p in aim; tired
			12.0	4	4	ABAAN	4>7	29073	R>R,T>T	**3-2wd; led; faded (86)**   Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 4-hole. 1st off 55 day layoff.Class Change 24 Finished 7 from post 4 TJW= 83	98	3	92	10	92	10	98	86	183	1.90	3.50	0.55	1.90	3.50	0.55	109	110	61	86,88,92,108,85	108	55	89.0	E/P	8	0	5.00	219	GP	8.5	G3	AO>G3	146	16.5	86.8	103.4	219	280	3-2wd; led; faded/ Rated inside; tired/ Rated ins; weakened
			12.0	5	5	AGITARE	8>7	4164	R>R,D>T	**Reared start; 3-4wd (81)**THIRD OFF MAYBE?  SLR?- 11 1st off 42 day layoff.Class Change -1 Finished 7 from post 8 TJW= 38	0	1	92	1	87	2	42	-9	33	3.00	3.50	0.88	1.40	0.70	2.00	80	91	50	81,92,0,0,0	92	42	87.0	E/P	5	0	20.00	228	GP	13.0	G3	N>G3	143	17.5	81.4	98.8	171	221	Reared start; 3-4wd/ checked;pulled;drw off/
			12.0	6	6	TEMPLE	8>10	18831	R>R,T>T	**Chased 2-3w; weakened (87)**   DROP SWITCHSLR?- 11 1st off 63 day layoff.Class Change -1 Finished 10 from post 8 TJW= 75	90	4	91	10	91	10	55	-13	42	4.30	4.00	1.07	4.30	4.00	1.07	65	82	84	87,98,64,92,104	104	63	83.0	P	3	0	4.50	222	AQU	11.0	G3	G2>G3	159	16.5	82.7	99.3	147	231	Chased 2-3w; weakened/ 2w btw;5w upr;up place/ Tracked inside; tired
			12.0	3	3	PAO ALTO	2>7	16378	R>R,T>T	**No menace inside (94)**   DROP SWITCH Made big overall move (4). Made a big move early (4.25). Class Change -1 Finished 7 from post 2 TJW= 65	ERR	0	91	4	91	4	87	100	187	6.80	5.90	1.15	6.80	5.90	1.15	86	103	83	94,90,82,97,0	97	28	89.0	P	3	0	8.00	224	GP	9.0	G3	G2>G3	151	15.9	86.8	102.7	189	272	No menace inside/ 3p;bid5/16;outfinished/ 2-3w pursuit; no kick
			12.0	8	8	HARLAN	1>5	20954	R>R,D>T	**Inside;2-3w str;evenly (91)**   DROP SWITCH Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 1-hole.BTL HORSE 1st off 83 day layoff.Class Change -1 Finished 5 from post 1 TJW= 43	85	1	91	3	89	10	88	86	174	4.40	3.60	1.25	3.90	2.50	1.57	99	104	78	91,90,97,89,92	97	83	93.0	E/P	4	0	20.00	221	WO	8.5	G3	G2>G3	140	16.2	87.9	104.1	203	281	Inside;2-3w str;evenly/ Svd grnd;held plc/ Insd;stdy gain;2nd bst
			12.0	11	11	RED KNIGHT	10>11	39146	R>R,T>T	**Off pace 4-3wd;faded (99)**   DROP SWITCH Flashed speed. 1st off 63 day layoff.Class Change -6 Finished 11 from post 10 TJW= 77	95	7	94	10	94	10	64	-8	56	6.10	4.60	1.32	6.10	4.60	1.32	77	109	81	99,98,94,92,83	99	84	97.0	S	2	0	4.50	227	KEE	12.0	G3	G1>G3	170	14.8	85.3	100.1	186	267	Off pace 4-3wd;faded/ Steady 7/8;7w1/4;level/ 5w1/4;bid;held gamely
			12.0	2	2	SHAWDYSHAW	5>8	16148	R>R,T>T	**2-3w upper; empty (89)**   DROP SWITCH 1st off 63 day layoff.Class Change -1 Finished 8 from post 5 TJW= 100	ERR	0	85	8	84	10	54	-13	41	7.30	4.90	1.47	7.20	5.00	1.44	61	78	90	89,80,80,89,91	91	63	83.0	P	2	0	15.00	214	AQU	11.0	G3	G2>G3	141	8.1	83.7	91.8	139	229	2-3w upper; empty/ Ins;clear rail 3/16pl/ 2-3p;6p3/16;rallied;up
			12.0	1	1	TIME FOR	6>1	12561	R>R,D>T	**Stalk 3wd;bid 3/8;clrd (95)**   Chased Pace.BTL HORSE 1st off 77 day layoff.Class Change 19 Finished 1 from post 6 TJW= 55	101	1	87	6	87	10	89	84	173	5.70	3.70	1.52	5.30	4.00	1.35	91	106	81	95,85,85,92,87	101	77	88.0	P	6	0	20.00	166	CD	8.5	G3	R>G3	135	17.9	83.1	101.0	197	278	Stalk 3wd;bid 3/8;clrd/ 2w;chs btw;bmp foe1/16/ Perfect trip; clear
			12.0	9	9	VALUE	6>1	19174	R>R,D>T	**3wd;up 1/4;drove clear (93)**THIRD OFF MAYBE?   Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 6-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH!BTL HORSE 1st off 42 day layoff.Class Change -1 Finished 1 from post 6 TJW= 67	ERR	0	93	9	93	10	42	-9	33	6.30	4.00	1.57	6.70	4.30	1.56	81	93	75	93,89,91,99,89	99	42	91.0	S	3	0	8.00	215	GP	13.0	G3	N>G3	153	19.7	83.7	103.5	174	249	3wd;up 1/4;drove clear/ 5-6w uppr; no impact/ 4w upper; outkicked
			12.0	12	12	WICKED	4>2	14825	R>R,D>T	**3-4wd; bid; 2nd best (92)**   Chased Pace. Made big overall move (5).BTL HORSE 1st off 42 day layoff.Class Change -1 Finished 2 from post 4 TJW= 67	76	1	84	9	85	10	42	-9	33	7.30	4.10	1.78	7.70	4.30	1.80	82	88	76	92,83,85,76,84	98	42	87.0	S	1	0	20.00	202	GP	13.0	G3	N>G3	142	17.6	82.1	99.7	170	246	3-4wd; bid; 2nd best/ Bmpd btwn brk;pinched/ Ins turns;good energy
			12.0	10	10	REIGNING	7>11	15866	R>R,T>T	**8w upper; no impact (86)**   DROP SWITCH Made a big move early (3.25). *Stretch gain (.25). 1st off 63 day layoff.2 races in one pattern.Class Change -1 Finished 11 from post 7 TJW= 63	88	4	86	9	84	10	49	-13	36	7.30	3.80	1.92	7.60	3.60	2.11	44	68	95	86,90,90,94,78	94	63	89.0	S	0	0	20.00	205	AQU	11.0	G3	G2>G3	146	14.3	82.0	96.3	112	207	8w upper; no impact/ Tight st;8w1/4;strong/ 6 wide 1/4; late rally
			12.0	13	13	BARBERINI	7>3	13075	R>R,D>T	**2w; ins bid1/8;outkick (91)**   Made big overall move (5). Fast last race (12).BTL HORSE 1st off 42 day layoff.Class Change -1 Finished 3 from post 7 TJW= 91	ERR	0	79	7	79	10	42	-9	33	5.70	2.50	2.25	6.20	2.50	2.53	78	87	79	91,89,86,81,83	89	42	89.0	S	0	0	15.00	166	GP	13.0	G3	N>G3	143	18.7	83.2	102.0	165	244	2w; ins bid1/8;outkick/ Rail;angled 1/4;drvng/ Rail 1/4;5wd 1/8;drvng

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	PPOT	AEPS	LAST DS	NOTES FROM LAST RACE	SPD		AVG		LAST FIVE											HIGH		ERLY TOTL		COMMENTS																			
										110	#110	TDS	#TDS	SPD	#R	S1	S2	TOT	SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	TDS1	TDS2	CLOSE	E1	E2	LP	SPEED		RATINGS	ATDS	DSL	AVG3	BRIS	P	EQUIP	MLINE	CLS	TRK	DIS	TYPE	CHNG	PWR	CLASS	FINAL	COMB	TOTL	LAST
1/28/23	GP	10	8.0	3	3	MISH	1>3	14540	R>R,D>D	**Ins;opnd2pfar turn;yld (93)**   Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 1-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH!BTL HORSE Clear early.1st off 51 day layoff.Class Change 24 Finished 3 from post 1 TJW= 75	95	5	95	5	91	10	87	81	168	2.50	4.10	0.61	1.80	3.80	0.46	92	100	84	93,84,99,100,97	100	51	92.0	E	8	0	6.00	159	GP	8.5	G3	AO>G3	136	18.0	83.6	101.6	192	276	Ins;opnd2pfar turn;yld/ Ins pair-2p;wkn btwl/4/ Lead;drifted;gave way
			8.0	8	8	DOC AMSTER	6>3	9390	S>R,D>D	**Step slow; wide trip (72)**   DROP SWITCHSLR?- 15 Slow last race (18). 1st off 158 day layoff.Class Change -1 Finished 3 from post 6 TJW= 30	ERR	0	ERR	0	90	10	86	-2	84	2.70	4.20	0.64	ERR	ERR	ERR	88	0	74	72,87,95,89,88	0	158	85.0	E	8	0	20.00	200	PRX	5.0	G3	N>G3	130	14.5	86.4	100.9	88	162	Step slow; wide trip/ Ins foe1/2;2path;tired/ Sharp break;ridden out
			8.0	7	7	PICKING UP	7>1	16186	R>R,D>D	**Sp;opnd6p upr;held (95)**   Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 7-hole.BTL HORSE Clear early.Class Change 15 Finished 1 from post 7 TJW= 81	98	3	98	3	91	10	87	86	173	1.90	2.80	0.68	1.40	1.40	1.00	91	93	96	95,102,96,80,86	102	21	98.0	E	8	0	8.00	178	GP	8.0	G3	AO>G3	138	18.4	85.9	104.2	184	280	Sp;opnd6p upr;held/ Rail; drift; drew off/ Pace 2p; drift; drvng
			8.0	4	4	OCTANE	1>1	57609	S>R,D>D	**Duel;2p;wd upper;held (89)**   DROP SWITCH Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 1-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH!BTL HORSE Clear early.1st off 49 day layoff.Class Change -5 Finished 1 from post 1 TJW= 102	98	2	98	2	86	9	86	88	174	2.00	2.60	0.79	1.80	1.80	1.00	87	88	94	89,91,92,84,65	105	49	91.0	E/P	8	0	20.00	200	TAM	7.0	G3	N>G3	134	17.3	89.0	106.3	175	269	Duel;2p;wd upper;held/ Brk out; bump st; 3wd/ Rated; 3wd bid; game
			8.0	11	11	DEAN	8>2	21500	S>R,D>D	**2p;rdn4p str;chased (95)**   Class Change 4 Finished 2 from post 8 TJW= 66	95	2	95	2	94	10	92	80	171	2.60	3.20	0.83	1.10	3.70	0.29	94	104	86	95,92,101,89,101	101	28	96.0	E	8	0	10.00	210	GP	7.0	G3	G3>G3	138	17.4	86.6	104.0	198	284	2p;rdn4p str;chased/ Off step slow; 3wd/ Dueled 3wd;outfinished
			8.0	6	6	BLACK BELT	8>1	7978	R>R,D>D	**3wd; up 1/4; drift out (108)**   Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 8-hole. Fast last race (23).BTL HORSE Clear early.1st off 36 day layoff.Class Change 24 Finished 1 from post 8 TJW= 74	90	5	90	5	85	10	86	87	172	3.90	4.30	0.90	2.40	3.50	0.67	95	103	108	108,94,89,80,86	108	36	97.0	E/P	7	0	6.00	155	GP	8.0	G3	AO>G3	136	19.8	87.2	107.0	198	306	3wd; up 1/4; drift out/ 3p up 1/4; drift; held/ Rail turn; drift; drvg
			8.0	9	9	ENDORSED	1>1	23472	S>R,D>D	**Ins;shft6p str;up1/16p (101)**THIRD OFF MAYBE?   Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 1-hole. Made big overall move (3).BTL HORSE 1st off 37 day layoff.Class Change 24 Finished 1 from post 1 TJW= 74	89	4	91	5	92	10	96	88	183	5.30	4.70	1.12	4.40	5.60	0.79	92	103	95	101,100,84,86,93	98	37	95.0	E/P	6	0	5.00	221	GP	7.0	G3	AO>G3	139	19.1	88.6	107.7	195	290	Ins;shft6p str;up1/16p/ 4p upr; rally; gaining/ St.lkd outside;weakened
			8.0	12	12	PREVALENCE	6>7	30398	S>R,D>D	**Husld ins;no threat (83)**THIRD OFF MAYBE?   Class Change 4 Finished 7 from post 6 TJW= 59	86	3	86	4	85	10	87	77	163	5.20	4.60	1.15	4.90	4.60	1.06	93	94	80	83,85,48,104,100	100	28	72.0	E/P	8	0	15.00	210	GP	7.0	G3	G3>G3	136	15.6	85.9	101.5	187	267	Husld ins;no threat/ Pressd 2w;led;wkd 1/8/ 4p turn; through 1/2
			8.0	13	13	TWELVE	2>2	17384	R>R,D>D	**3p;8p str;kept on 4plc (93)**THIRD OFF MAYBE?   *Stretch gain (.5).BTL HORSE Class Change 15 Finished 2 from post 2 TJW= 80	87	5	87	9	86	10	85	87	172	6.00	4.50	1.34	5.90	4.20	1.40	84	88	98	93,82,96,84,89	96	21	90.0	S	2	0	8.00	206	GP	8.0	G3	AO>G3	136	17.8	84.2	102.0	172	270	3p;8p str;kept on 4plc/ Saved grnd;no bid;stdy/ 5w move; duel; prevail
			8.0	10	10	THE REDS	7>4	20284	R>R,D>D	**4-5p;brushd 6w1/8;stay (94)**   Made big overall move (3). Made a big move early (5.75). *Stretch gain (4). Very strong move! Take note!BTL HORSE 1st off 76 day layoff.Class Change 9 Finished 4 from post 7 TJW= 72	92	3	88	10	88	10	80	95	175	6.70	4.80	1.40	6.70	4.80	1.40	77	88	97	94,58,93,97,87	97	76	82.0	E/P	5	0	12.00	216	CD	8.5	G3	AO>G3	133	15.3	83.1	98.4	165	262	4-5p;brushd 6w1/8;stay/ Close up; stopped/ 4-5w uppr; inched away
			8.0	1	1	MILES D	4>3	51483	R>R,D>D	**3w;outpcd upr;held shw (93)**   Chased Pace. 1st off 343 day layoff.Class Change 0 Finished 3 from post 4 TJW= 84	93	3	97	6	96	7	75	90	164	5.40	3.30	1.67	5.50	2.90	1.91	78	84	101	93,99,94,103,100	103	343	95.0	S	3	0	3.00	209	FG	8.5	G3	G3>G3	135	18.3	85.9	104.2	162	263	3w;outpcd upr;held shw/ 3-4w turns;rallied;up/ 5w uppr; got the nod
			8.0	2	2	NOBLE	7>4	22859	S>R,D>D	**3p;bid1/4;mild gain (85)**   DROP SWITCH Made big overall move (3). *Stretch gain (1).SLR?- 14BTL HORSE 1st off 49 day layoff.Class Change -5 Finished 4 from post 7 TJW= 62	94	8	94	9	93	10	79	92	171	8.30	4.40	1.91	8.20	4.20	1.93	75	73	103	85,99,97,89,92	99	49	94.0	S	2	0	20.00	207	TAM	7.0	G3	N>G3	127	16.3	87.6	104.0	148	251	3p;bid1/4;mild gain/ Bck ins;8p upr;rallied/ Rail trip; rallied

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	PPOT	AEPS	LAST DS	NOTES FROM LAST RACE	SPD		SPD		AVG		S1	S2	TOT	SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	TDS1	TDS2	CLOSE	E1	E2	LP	LAST FIVE SPEED RATINGS	HIGH BYER		ATDS	DSL	AVG3	BRIS	P	EQUIP	MLINE	CLS	TRK	DIS	TYPE	CHNG	PWR	CLASS	FINAL	COMB	ERLY TOTL		COMMENTS
										#110	#110	TDS	#TDS	SPD	#R														ATDS	DSL																	PACE	PACE	
1/28/23	GP	11	8.5	4 4	SWEET	3>1	10198	R>R,T>T	**Settle ins;2w 3/16;clr (93)**THIRD OFF MAYBE?   Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 3-hole.BTL HORSE Class Change 19 Finished 1 from post 3 TJW= 44	55	3	83	2	84	3	95	95	189	3.10	6.20	0.50	4.00	5.50	0.73	103	103	80	93,88,72,0,0	93	30	84.0	P	6	0	20.00	216	GP	8.5	G3	A0>G3	142	17.3	86.0	103.3	206	286	Settle ins;2w 3/16;clr/ Forced pace insd;wknd/ Fought restraint early		
			8.5	2 2	DALIKA	5>1	46502	R>R,T>T	**In hand; held edge (96)**   Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 5-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH!BTL HORSE Clear early.1st off 65 day layoff.Class Change 4 Finished 1 from post 5 TJW= 68	91	8	92	10	92	10	76	95	171	3.00	4.10	0.73	3.00	4.10	0.73	94	102	85	96,84,92,101,87	101	65	91.0	E	7	0	2.50	225	CD	9.0	G3	G3>G3	156	19.3	87.4	106.7	196	281	In hand; held edge/ Prompted pace; tired/ Inside;dug in; held		
			8.5	1 1	ARTIE'S	1>6	42933	S>R,D>T	**Off rail; no menace (88)**   1st off 77 day layoff.Class Change -1 Finished 6 from post 1 TJW= 81	ERR	0	ERR	0	90	10	84	92	176	3.70	3.60	1.03	ERR	ERR	ERR	83	88	92	88,91,83,92,86	0	77	87.0	E/P	6	0	20.00	223	WO	7.0	G3	G2>G3	145	16.8	87.7	104.5	171	263	Off rail; no menace/ 4w str;drv clear/ Urged forward;insd-2w		
			8.5	6 6	QUEEN	9>1	47058	R>R,T>T	**Cleared; mild urging (98)**   Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 9-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH!BTL HORSE Clear early.Class Change 4 Finished 1 from post 9 TJW= 75	86	6	88	8	89	10	80	99	179	3.50	2.50	1.41	3.70	2.20	1.69	87	100	91	98,91,95,87,100	98	28	95.0	E/P	6	0	4.50	209	SA	9.0	G3	G3>G3	165	19.5	88.5	108.0	187	278	Cleared; mild urging/ Pace ins;yielded late/ Reeled in foe;clr upr		
			8.5	3 3	WAKANAKA	2>1	42826	R>R,T>T	**6w; wore down rivals (90)**   Made big overall move (5).BTL HORSE 1st off 84 day layoff.Class Change -1 Finished 1 from post 2 TJW= 60	92	7	92	7	92	7	74	58	131	6.50	4.00	1.64	6.50	4.00	1.64	83	89	92	90,97,87,99,88	99	84	91.0	S	2	0	5.00	227	KEE	8.0	G3	N>G3	155	17.9	88.4	106.2	172	264	6w; wore down rivals/ Saved ground; no rally/ Quick move to lead 1/4		
			8.5	9 9	SHANTISARA	5>5	79334	R>R,T>T	**Mild bid 5w; weakened (85)**   DROP SWITCH Chased Pace.SLR? - 15BTL HORSE 1st off 84 day layoff.Class Change -1 Finished 5 from post 5 TJW= 99	91	5	91	6	91	6	77	89	165	5.50	3.00	1.83	5.50	3.00	1.83	88	95	77	85,100,99,93,93	100	84	95.0	E/P	4	0	1.80	223	KEE	8.0	G3	N>G3	156	17.0	86.3	103.4	183	260	Mild bid 5w; weakened/ Kept at bay;vanned off/ 2-3w;bidupr;strong kck		
			8.5	8 8	JUSTIFY MY	4>1	7804	R>R,T>T	**Long drive; prevailed (90)**   Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 4-hole.Uncharacteristic race?BTL HORSE 1st off 70 day layoff.Class Change 9 Finished 1 from post 4 TJW= 59	87	3	87	3	87	3	77	97	173	7.10	3.80	1.85	7.10	3.80	1.85	89	95	85	90,81,89,0,0	90	70	87.0	P	3	0	30.00	218	CD	8.5	G3	A0>G3	144	18.0	82.4	100.4	184	269	Long drive; prevailed/ 3wd;8p3/16;willingly/ Widest str;not enough		
			8.5	7 7	LADY	9>2	12081	R>R,T>T	**3-4w;bid btw;outkicked (91)**   Made big overall move (4). *Stretch gain (1.5).BTL HORSE Class Change 4 Finished 2 from post 9 TJW= 59	54	5	89	4	89	4	89	95	184	5.80	2.90	2.00	5.80	2.90	2.00	90	97	85	91,88,84,91,0	91	28	88.0	S	2	0	6.00	216	GP	8.0	G3	G3>G3	151	17.8	87.9	105.7	187	272	3-4w;bid btw;outkicked/ Inside; btwn; no rally/ 3w upper; edged clear		

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	PPOT	AEPS	LAST DS	NOTES FROM LAST RACE	SPD	SPD	AVG	LAST FIVE											HIGH	ERLY TOTL																							
										110	#110	TDS	#TDS	SPD	#R	S1	S2	TOT	SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	TDS1	TDS2	CLOSE	E1	E2	LP	SPEED	RATINGS	BYER	ATDS	DSL	AVG3	BRIS	P	EQUIP	MLINE	CLS	TRK	DIS	TYPE	CHNG	PWR	CLASS	FINAL	COMB	TOTL	PACE
1/28/23	GP	12	9.0	4 4	HURRICANE	0>7	9987	R>R,T>T	** (0)**   1st off 119 day layoff.Class Change 9 Finished 7 from post 0 TJW= 65	ERR	0	ERR	0	ERR	0	57	-9	48	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	0	0	0,0,0,0,0	0	119	ERR	NA	0	0	15.00	ERR	LCH	9.7	G1	G2>G1	5.3	80.7	86.0	0	0	/ /
			9.0	13 13	KING CAUSE	9>9	17742	R>R,T>T	**Light bump early; 2wd (91)**   Class Change 9 Finished 9 from post 9 TJW= 75	78	5	83	8	86	10	86	98	184	4.70	4.80	0.98	4.90	5.50	0.91	91	102	78	91,87,92,97,79	97	28	90.0	E/P	5	0	30.00	220	GP	9.0	G1	G2>G1	154	15.6	89.1	104.7	193	271	Light bump early; 2wd/ In hand ins; held well/ Tracked 3wd; gamely	
			9.0	6 6	LADY	1>3	58550	R>R,T>T	**Got thru; kept at bay (111)**   *Stretch gain (1). Fast last race (17).BTL HORSE 1st off 84 day layoff.Class Change 5 Finished 3 from post 1 TJW= 60	95	5	94	7	94	10	83	58	140	2.90	2.50	1.13	3.10	3.20	0.95	104	119	99	111,96,88,101,84	111	84	98.0	E/P	6	0	6.00	226	KEE	9.5	G1	G1>G1	168	17.1	87.8	104.9	223	322	Got thru; kept at bay/ Game inside str run/ Always close; game str	
			9.0	3 3	ATONE	5>1	28234	R>R,t>T	**In hand ins; held c1r (97)**   Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 5-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH!BTL HORSE Clear early.1st off 79 day layoff.Class Change 19 Finished 1 from post 5 TJW= 77	96	4	94	10	94	10	70	56	125	3.70	3.20	1.13	3.70	3.20	1.13	79	91	98	97,92,89,100,96	100	79	93.0	E/P	7	0	12.00	224	AQU	9.0	G1	A0>G1	159	19.5	89.7	109.1	170	268	In hand ins; held c1r/ Stalk 2w;chsd;yield1/8/ Stalked;bid3w;held 2nd	
			9.0	14 14	STEADY ON	8>2	31210	R>R,D>T	**2p; drift out; nailed (90)**   Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 8-hole.BTL HORSE Clear early.1st off 33 day layoff.Class Change 11 Finished 2 from post 8 TJW= 86	88	1	86	3	85	5	82	92	173	2.90	2.50	1.15	2.60	1.50	1.75	86	87	93	90,88,85,84,76	88	33	88.0	E/P	6	0	30.00	208	GP	8.5	G1	N>G1	151	18.2	91.4	109.5	173	266	2p; drift out; nailed/ Bmpd hard brk;3p turns/ 2p-ins;3p1/4;rally;clr	
			9.0	7 7	SPEAKING	9>1	35762	R>R,T>T	**Bit slow;2w;angled out (89)**   Made big overall move (8).BTL HORSE 1st off 56 day layoff.Class Change 6 Finished 1 from post 9 TJW= 67	85	7	85	8	85	10	68	63	131	4.80	3.80	1.25	4.50	3.90	1.17	69	75	100	89,89,85,83,81	89	56	88.0	P	3	0	8.00	220	DMR	9.0	G1	G1>G1	149	17.5	89.1	106.6	144	244	Bit slow;2w;angled out/ Stp slw;bid 3p;caught/ ins rally; mild drive	
			9.0	9 9	DECORATED	12>2	38614	R>R,T>T	**2wd in clear; 2nd best (98)**   Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 12-hole.Uncharacteristic race?BTL HORSE Class Change 9 Finished 2 from post 12 TJW= 78	94	5	91	10	91	10	92	98	190	4.80	3.60	1.33	4.80	3.60	1.33	103	113	79	98,89,93,89,85	98	28	93.0	E/P	4	0	15.00	223	GP	9.0	G1	G2>G1	156	16.6	91.0	107.6	216	295	2wd in clear; 2nd best/ 2-3p turns;out-kicked/ Burst thru 1/8 to lead	
			9.0	11 11	MASTER	8>8	22721	R>R,T>T	**Tracked ins;no bid (102)**   1st off 84 day layoff.Class Change 4 Finished 8 from post 8 TJW= 79	97	2	95	9	95	10	63	-8	55	6.00	4.20	1.41	6.30	4.30	1.47	78	106	90	102,94,100,91,93	102	84	99.0	S	1	0	10.00	227	KEE	12.0	G1	G1>G1	170	16.8	86.9	103.7	184	274	Tracked ins;no bid/ Rallied 5deep;led late/ Came in;bp st;tight2nd	
			9.0	12 12	CITY MAN	6>1	37966	R>R,T>T	**Bmp early;stdy1/4;rall (100)**   Chased Pace.BTL HORSE Class Change 9 Finished 1 from post 6 TJW= 82	89	8	91	10	91	10	91	101	192	4.20	2.90	1.44	4.20	2.90	1.44	100	111	84	100,89,85,94,99	100	28	91.0	P	7	0	4.00	225	GP	9.0	G1	G2>G1	165	19.8	92.0	111.8	211	295	Bmp early;stdy1/4;rall/ Checkd early;ins;rally/ Restless gate;3p turns	
			9.0	5 5	ONE MORE	2>1	26071	R>R,T>T	**Aim 2w;btw str;dug in (93)**   Chased Pace.Uncharacteristic race?BTL HORSE 1st off 33 day layoff.Class Change 11 Finished 1 from post 2 TJW= 74	ERR	0	90	3	87	9	91	97	187	5.00	3.00	1.67	4.30	1.90	2.25	91	96	90	93,91,86,88,88	93	33	90.0	E/P	6	0	20.00	179	SA	8.0	G1	G2>G1	145	16.4	92.4	108.8	187	277	Aim 2w;btw str;dug in/ Bpd/chck;wait;altr out/ Bid 3deep; led; nailed	
			9.0	2 2	GOOD	10>4	26618	R>R,T>T	**Bump early;rall;7w3/16 (98)**   Made big overall move (4). *Stretch gain (.25).BTL HORSE Class Change 9 Finished 4 from post 10 TJW= 60	90	5	91	10	91	10	88	102	190	5.80	2.90	2.00	5.80	2.90	2.00	93	105	87	98,91,85,103,88	103	28	91.0	P	2	0	15.00	209	GP	9.0	G1	G2>G1	152	10.2	90.4	100.6	198	285	Bump early;rall;7w3/16/ Bmpd brk;2p;5p1/4;chsd/ 4w into lane; mildly	
			9.0	10 10	IVAR	6>4	93354	R>R,T>T	**2wbtw;split;led;outkck (99)**  BTL HORSE 1st off 84 day layoff.Class Change 4 Finished 4 from post 6 TJW= 59	100	2	99	10	99	10	81	58	138	5.80	2.70	2.13	5.80	2.70	2.13	99	105	90	99,99,104,105,99	105	84	101.0	S	2	0	2.50	231	KEE	8.0	G1	G1>G1	170	18.0	91.1	109.1	204	294	2wbtw;split;led;outkck/ 3p;6p upr;up place btw/ Bmpd st;8w3/16;got 2nd	
			9.0	8 8	WHO'S THE	12>1	22114	R>R,D>T	**Sustain run3/8 to win (97)**   Made big overall move (9).BTL HORSE 1st off 55 day layoff.Class Change 14 Finished 1 from post 12 TJW= 58	ERR	0	85	3	88	10	58	-6	52	8.30	3.80	2.22	8.70	3.30	2.60	63	99	82	97,95,97,81,98	98	55	96.0	S	0	0	20.00	215	WO	12.0	G1	G3>G1	153	20.4	86.4	106.7	162	244	Sustain run3/8 to win/ Off slo;6w1/8;drove by/ Full of run last 1/8th	
			9.0	1 1	WIT	8>3	60300	R>R,T>T	**3deep;angled5w;miss2nd (88)**   Made big overall move (3). *Stretch gain (2.75).BTL HORSE 1st off 56 day layoff.2 races in one pattern.Class Change 6 Finished 3 from post 8 TJW= 76	88	1	91	4	90	10	70	105	175	5.50	2.30	2.35	5.60	2.20	2.50	72	80	93	88,92,93,91,89	93	56	91.0	P	2	0	8.00	220	DMR	9.0	G1	G1>G1	155	18.0	88.6	106.6	152	245	3deep;angled5w;miss2nd/ 2w;5w upr;bid;led;hung/ 2-3w pursuit; edged cl	



DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	PPOT	AEPS	LAST DS	NOTES FROM LAST RACE	SPD		SPD		AVG		LAST FIVE										HIGH BYER		ERLY TOTL		COMMENTS																		
										110	#110	TDS	#TDS	SPD	#R	S1	S2	TOT	SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	TDS1	TDS2	CLOSE	E1	E2	LP	SPEED	RATINGS		ATDS	DSL	AVG3	BRIS	P	EQUIP	MLINE	CLS	TRK	DIS	TYPE	CHNG	PWR	CLASS	FINAL	COMB	TOTL	LAST
1/28/23	GP	13	9.0	5	5	DEFUNDED	5>1	46777	R>R,D>D	**Bobbled;duel outsd;c/r (101)**   Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 5-hole.BTL HORSE Clear early.1st off 62 day layoff.Class Change 14 Finished 1 from post 5 TJW= 100	97	6	97	9	97	10	91	80	170	2.30	3.70	0.63	2.20	3.30	0.67	102	114	83	101,103,98,92,103	104	62	101.0	E	8	0	6.00	220	DMR	9.0	G1	G3>G1	147	20.1	87.7	107.9	216	299	Bobbled;duel outsd;c/r/ Met bid; kicked clear/ 3deep;5w;lost path 1/8
			9.0	6	6	ART	2>5	116625	R>R,D>D	**Ins winner;headed upr (92)**   Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 2-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH! Clear early.1st off 119 day layoff.Class Change 9 Finished 5 from post 2 TJW= 56	87	7	100	8	99	9	86	85	170	3.20	4.20	0.77	2.50	3.80	0.67	98	108	73	92,96,101,0,95	110	119	96.0	E	8	0	10.00	229	CD	9.0	G1	G2>G1	146	18.1	87.2	105.3	206	279	Ins winner;headed upr/ Pace;clear;kept alert/ 3-2p1st;ins2nd;handily
			9.0	7	7	SKIPPYLONG	7>1	55558	R>R,D>D	**3p;bid far turn;clear (103)**   Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 7-hole.BTL HORSE Clear early.Class Change 14 Finished 1 from post 7 TJW= 81	100	6	95	10	95	10	89	88	177	3.80	4.60	0.83	3.80	4.60	0.83	94	104	99	103,96,101,105,96	107	28	100.0	E/P	6	0	5.00	216	GP	8.5	G1	G3>G1	146	20.0	88.2	108.2	198	297	3p;bid far turn;clear/ Brief wide bid; faded/ Got trip; up abreast
			9.0	3	3	RIDIN WITH	5>1	23750	R>R,D>D	**Very wide; led; lasted (88)**   Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 5-hole. Made big overall move (3).SLR?-11BTL HORSE Clear early.Class Change 20 Finished 1 from post 5 TJW= 68	96	3	93	8	93	10	85	79	164	2.60	2.90	0.91	2.60	2.80	0.94	95	97	79	88,99,87,96,88	100	24	91.0	E/P	6	0	20.00	210	PRX	8.3	G1	N>G1	144	17.8	84.7	102.5	192	271	Very wide; led; lasted/ Vied btwn; edged off/ Pressued pace; wknd
			9.0	10	10	CYBERKNIFE	7>2	173960	R>R,D>D	**Came in 1/8; long drv (105)**   Fast last race (12).BTL HORSE 1st off 84 day layoff.Class Change 4 Finished 2 from post 7 TJW= 91	94	7	93	10	93	10	88	84	172	3.30	3.60	0.92	3.30	3.60	0.92	105	115	91	105,105,105,104,97	105	84	105.0	E/P	5	0	2.50	216	KEE	8.0	G1	G1>G1	152	20.1	90.2	110.3	220	311	Came in 1/8; long drv/ Reserved; wide lane/ Ins-2path;headed1/4
			9.0	11	11	STILLETTO	2>2	59562	R>R,D>D	**Prssd;led5/16;no match (92)**   Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 2-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH! 1st off 33 day layoff.Class Change 9 Finished 2 from post 2 TJW= 79	100	5	97	9	97	10	91	75	166	4.30	4.60	0.94	4.20	4.70	0.90	100	107	75	92,78,95,98,110	110	33	88.0	E	6	0	30.00	231	SA	8.5	G1	G2>G1	143	18.0	86.9	105.0	207	282	Prssd;led5/16;no match/ Bpd st;wide trip;empty/ Outsd;btwn;svd 3rd
			9.0	4	4	WHITE	3>3	106255	R>R,D>D	**2p;raill1/4;bid;ins duo (104)**   Chased Pace. Fast last race (12).BTL HORSE 1st off 56 day layoff.Class Change 4 Finished 3 from post 3 TJW= 79	92	6	92	9	92	10	84	90	173	3.80	4.00	0.95	4.10	4.40	0.92	89	104	100	104,104,65,96,80	104	56	91.0	E/P	4	0	10.00	216	AQU	8.0	G1	G1>G1	146	19.7	88.4	108.1	193	293	2p;raill1/4;bid;ins duo/ Clear; vied; yielded/ 4w early; gave way
			9.0	12	12	O'CONNOR	1>4	11277	R>R,D>D	**Ins1st;5p;8p str;1pace (98)**   Chased Pace. Class Change 14 Finished 4 from post 1 TJW= 73	39	5	98	2	98	2	87	86	173	3.30	3.30	1.00	3.30	3.30	1.00	88	100	94	98,98,0,0,0	98	28	98.0	S	0	0	10.00	206	GP	8.5	G1	G3>G1	141	19.1	88.3	107.4	188	282	Ins1st;5p;8p str;1pace/ Rail; 3w 3/4; drew off/
			9.0	14	14	ENDORSED	1>1	23472	S>R,D>D	**Ins;shft6p str;up1/16p (101)**THIRD OFF MAYBE?   Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 1-hole. Made big overall move (3).BTL HORSE 1st off 37 day layoff.Class Change 34 Finished 1 from post 1 TJW= 51	92	2	91	5	92	10	96	88	183	5.30	4.70	1.12	4.40	5.60	0.79	92	103	95	101,100,84,86,93	98	37	95.0	E/P	6	0	15.00	221	GP	7.0	G1	A0>G1	139	19.1	90.8	109.9	195	290	Ins;shft6p str;up1/16p/ 4p upr; rally; gaining/ Stlkd outside;weakened
			9.0	9	9	LAST	1>2	52430	R>R,D>D	**Off bit slw;3w;willing (102)**   *Stretch gain (2.75).BTL HORSE 1st off 42 day layoff.2 races in one pattern.Class Change 9 Finished 2 from post 1 TJW= 56	94	8	95	10	95	10	81	91	172	6.00	5.20	1.14	6.00	5.20	1.14	84	92	108	102,94,96,83,100	102	42	97.0	E/P	4	0	20.00	226	OP	9.0	G1	N>G1	140	19.9	87.9	107.8	176	284	Off bit slw;3w;willing/ 2-wide bid; flattened/ Bmp st;4p;insupr;tired
			9.0	2	2	SIMPLIFICA	4>3	61115	R>R,D>D	**4p;rdn5p str;hung4show (101)**   Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 4-hole.BTL HORSE Class Change 14 Finished 3 from post 4 TJW= 61	97	7	96	10	96	10	88	87	175	4.40	3.40	1.30	4.40	3.40	1.30	92	102	96	101,89,105,94,96	105	28	98.0	E/P	4	0	15.00	225	GP	8.5	G1	G3>G1	143	19.5	87.3	106.9	194	290	4p;rdn5p str;hung4show/ Bmp st;in tight early/ Forced pace; weakened
			9.0	8	8	GET HER	4>2	46711	R>R,D>D	**4w;bid5w1/4;out duo (104)**   Chased Pace.Uncharacteristic race?BTL HORSE 1st off 56 day layoff.Class Change 4 Finished 2 from post 4 TJW= 79	0	1	104	1	94	9	85	90	174	6.90	5.10	1.34	5.00	3.30	1.50	90	105	100	104,100,96,102,97	104	56	100.0	E/P	5	0	15.00	218	AQU	8.0	G1	G1>G1	142	19.1	89.4	108.5	195	295	4w;bid5w1/4;out duo/ Gained btw;4w;up wire/ Climbed;3-5w;no threat
			9.0	1	1	PROXY	1>1	74709	R>R,D>D	**Drifted; up late (102)**   Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 1-hole.Uncharacteristic race?BTL HORSE 1st off 64 day layoff.Class Change 4 Finished 1 from post 1 TJW= 84	97	10	97	10	97	10	80	102	182	5.80	3.10	1.88	5.80	3.10	1.88	85	91	107	102,103,100,98,103	103	64	102.0	P	3	0	4.50	223	CD	9.0	G1	G1>G1	145	20.1	89.1	109.2	176	283	Drifted; up late/ 2p;7p1/8;good late kck/ Ins;outmvd;altrd;rally