

BY PROJECTED SPEED

Table with columns: DATE, TRK #, DT, PP, PRG, HORSE, DST, SURF, MOVING?, AVG SPD, ASP TDS, ASP RT, ASP 110 RD, AVG LAST5, SYS1, SYS2, CLOSURE, TDS1, TDS2, CLOSURE, BROTT1, BROTT2, E1, E2, LATE, CLOSURE, EARLY TOTAL, Last, DSLR, BTOT, avg race rtng, LRR, POWER, MLINE, LAST FIVE FIGS, TJW% CLS, COMMENT, BEST OVERALL, BEST LAST, TOTALS.

6.4.2 \$6.60

Table with columns: DATE, TRK #, DT, PP, PRG, HORSE, DST, SURF, MOVING?, AVG SPD, ASP TDS, ASP RT, ASP 110 RD, AVG LAST5, SYS1, SYS2, CLOSURE, TDS1, TDS2, CLOSURE, BROTT1, BROTT2, E1, E2, LATE, CLOSURE, EARLY TOTAL, Last, DSLR, BTOT, avg race rtng, LRR, POWER, MLINE, LAST FIVE FIGS, TJW% CLS, COMMENT, BEST OVERALL, BEST LAST, TOTALS.

5.3.6 \$4.20

Table with columns: DATE, TRK #, DT, PP, PRG, HORSE, DST, SURF, MOVING?, AVG SPD, ASP TDS, ASP RT, ASP 110 RD, AVG LAST5, SYS1, SYS2, CLOSURE, TDS1, TDS2, CLOSURE, BROTT1, BROTT2, E1, E2, LATE, CLOSURE, EARLY TOTAL, Last, DSLR, BTOT, avg race rtng, LRR, POWER, MLINE, LAST FIVE FIGS, TJW% CLS, COMMENT, BEST OVERALL, BEST LAST, TOTALS.

7.1.6 \$6.00 .50 P3=\$15

Table with columns: DATE, TRK #, DT, PP, PRG, HORSE, DST, SURF, MOVING?, AVG SPD, ASP TDS, ASP RT, ASP 110 RD, AVG LAST5, SYS1, SYS2, CLOSURE, TDS1, TDS2, CLOSURE, BROTT1, BROTT2, E1, E2, LATE, CLOSURE, EARLY TOTAL, Last, DSLR, BTOT, avg race rtng, LRR, POWER, MLINE, LAST FIVE FIGS, TJW% CLS, COMMENT, BEST OVERALL, BEST LAST, TOTALS.

#7 gets the lead and #5 and #6 best closers? but have no early speed. Short race, #7 can wire. Easy wire win for #7

7.4.5

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	DST	SURF	MOVING?	AVG SPD	ASP R#	ASP TDS	ASP RT	ASP 110	RD	AVG LASTS	SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	TDS1	TDS2	CLOSE	BROT1	BROT2	E1	E2	LATE	CLOSE	EARLY TOTAL	Last	DSL	BTOT	avg race rtng	LRR	POWER	MLINE	LAST FIVE FIGS	TJW% CLS	COMMENT	BEST OVERAL	BEST LAST	TOTALS	
1/2/23	SA	5	6.0	7	7 MISS	S>S	D>D	F/FLR+69_Y(7>2) Class Change 2	69	1	69	1	69	1	69	2.9	2.9	1.0	2.9	2.9	1.0	58.64	57.67	89	90	69	0.77	179	248	22	248	141	141	116.5	3.00	69,0,0,0,0	95	141	Bpd st;3-4w;lug 2x str	328	328	656
			6.0	4	4 MISS	R>S	T>D	SLR?- 13N(3>6) Class Change -23	60	4	59	2	66	1	63	8.9	7.1	1.3	7.9	6.4	1.2	53.14	52.91	63	63	58	0.92	126	184	71	260	161	166	104.8	8.00	53,66,69,52,0	41	161	Pulled;green early&str	310	247	558
			6.0	3	3 MAGIC	S>S	D>D	FLR+55_N(5>5) Class Change 2	55	1	55	1	55	1	55	8.6	7.1	1.2	8.6	7.1	1.2	56.39	55.49	80	72	71	0.99	152	223	22	223	141	141	104.4	20.00	55,0,0,0,0	22	141	Stp slw;4-5w;no menace	284	277	561
			6.0	6	6 SHORT	S>S	D>D	SLR?- 22N(6>9) Class Change 17	54	3	54	3	54	3	54	8.2	8.2	1.0	8.2	8.2	1.0	56.27	54.21	82	72	57	0.79	154	211	29	211	129	126	100.8	15.00	44,66,52,0,0	21	129	3wide; no menace	271	242	514
			6.0	10	10 LUCKY	S>S	D>D	FLR+53_N(9>8) Class Change 2	53	1	53	1	53	1	53	7.8	8.9	0.9	7.8	8.9	0.9	57.02	53.08	83	66	76	1.15	149	225	136	225	141	141	101.0	20.00	53,0,0,0,0	26	141	4-5wd; gave way	277	273	550
			6.0	5	5 SWEET	S>S	D>D	F/PP/BTL/SP+19/WATCH/ESP/Y(9>2) Class Change 17	52	4	45	3	45	3	61	4.3	7.0	0.6	5.5	6.4	0.9	58.18	56.77	90	91	70	0.77	181	251	29	251	150	126	112.2	4.00	71,72,41,22,0	88	150	Duel outside;2nd best	274	334	608
			6.0	8	8 TIME	S>S	D>D	F/SP+16/WATCH/Y(2>4) Class Change 2	43	3	43	3	43	3	43	6.3	7.1	0.9	6.3	7.1	0.9	59.95	55.21	90	82	68	0.83	172	240	43	240	153	141	108.0	5.00	59,67,3,0,0	136	153	Inside; weakened	255	298	553
			6.0	11	11 SONG OF	0>S	>D	Y(0>0)	ERR	0	ERR	0	ERR	0	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	0	0	ERR	0	0	****	0	ERR	0	12.00	0,0,0,0,0	154	ERR		ERR	0	ERR	
			6.0	9	9 TOOTUFFT	0>S	>D	Y(0>0)	ERR	0	ERR	0	ERR	0	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	0	0	ERR	0	0	****	0	ERR	0	20.00	0,0,0,0,0	19	ERR		ERR	0	ERR	
			6.0	12	12 ONE MO	0>S	>D	Y(0>0)	ERR	0	ERR	0	ERR	0	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	0	0	ERR	0	0	****	0	ERR	0	8.00	0,0,0,0,0	94	ERR		ERR	0	ERR	
			6.0	2	2 SHES	0>S	>D	Y(0>0)	ERR	0	ERR	0	ERR	0	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	0	0	ERR	0	0	****	0	ERR	0	6.00	0,0,0,0,0	28	ERR		ERR	0	ERR	
			6.0	1	1 JACQUELI	0>S	>D	Y(0>0)	ERR	0	ERR	0	ERR	0	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	0	0	ERR	0	0	****	0	ERR	0	12.00	0,0,0,0,0	31	ERR		ERR	0	ERR	

9.5.2
\$77.00

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	DST	SURF	MOVING?	AVG SPD	ASP R#	ASP TDS	ASP RT	ASP 110	RD	AVG LASTS	SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	TDS1	TDS2	CLOSE	BROT1	BROT2	E1	E2	LATE	CLOSE	EARLY TOTAL	Last	DSL	BTOT	avg race rtng	LRR	POWER	MLINE	LAST FIVE FIGS	TJW% CLS	COMMENT	BEST OVERAL	BEST LAST	TOTALS	
1/2/23	SA	6	6.5	4	4 CUBAN	S>S	T>T	F/PP/UN?/Y(1>5) Class Change -1	82	4	82	4	84	3	80	4.5	4.7	0.9	4.5	4.7	0.9	58.59	57.42	0	96	72	0.75	96	168	50	168	164	175	123.9	2.50	77,79,83,90,0	112	171	Inside;drifted1/16;wkn	299	287	586
			6.5	3	3 DENIM IN	S>S	T>T	BTL/BOM:6/SG:4/FLR+82_* 2 in 1 *Y(2>3) Class Change -1	82	1	82	1	ERR	0	82	10.0	3.3	3.0	10.0	3.3	3.0	55.98	58.43	0	87	86	0.99	87	173	50	173	175	175	119.5	4.00	82,0,0,0,0	30	175	Off slow;4-5w;bpd uppr	296	301	597
			6.5	7	7 INFINITE	R>S	T>T	PP/SP-79/SLR?- 90WATCH/Y(6>0) Class Change -1	79	5	90	1	90	1	79	6.6	4.7	1.4	8.8	3.8	2.3	55.88	55.37	0	0	ERR	0	0	0	52	0	176	175	128.8	6.00	0,90,68,82,77	85	176	Hop;stumbld;lost rider	296	0	296
			6.5	8	8 REBEL	S>S	T>T	SG:..5/SP+13/N(5>2) Class Change 4	78	4	79	2	79	2	81	6.1	6.1	1.0	7.2	6.7	1.1	56.05	57.39	92	94	91	0.97	186	277	64	277	164	170	125.5	8.00	91,83,70,67,0	125	164	Bit tight 5/16;up 2nd	290	399	689
			6.5	5	5 SOCIALLY	S>S	T>T	BOM:6/SG:3.5/* 2 in 1 *Y(5>2) Class Change -1	74	6	67	3	59	2	82	6.2	6.2	1.0	7.4	6.8	1.1	56.95	57.67	0	90	83	0.92	90	173	50	173	171	175	120.3	4.00	82,81,83,79,47	67	171	Angld out 1/4;bpd uppr	282	301	583
			6.5	2	2 SINNERS	S>S	T>T	F/SP+14/FLR+28_UN?/Y(1>6) Class Change 4	70	2	70	2	70	2	70	7.3	8.7	0.8	7.3	8.7	0.8	56.29	57.39	93	95	82	0.86	188	270	64	270	172	170	112.3	20.00	84,56,0,0,0	34	172	Stalkd ins;no response	268	379	646
			6.5	6	6 LOOKS	0>S	>T	Y(0>0)	ERR	0	ERR	0	ERR	0	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	0	0	ERR	0	0	****	0	ERR	0	8.00	0,0,0,0,0	114	ERR		ERR	0	ERR	
			6.5	1	1 LUCKY	0>S	>T	Y(0>0)	ERR	0	ERR	0	ERR	0	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	0	0	ERR	0	0	****	0	ERR	0	4.00	0,0,0,0,0	165	ERR		ERR	0	ERR	

8.1.6
\$24.20

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	DST	SURF	MOVING?	AVG SPD	ASP R#	ASP TDS	ASP RT	ASP 110	RD	AVG LASTS	SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	TDS1	TDS2	CLOSE	BROT1	BROT2	E1	E2	LATE	CLOSE	EARLY TOTAL	Last	DSL	BTOT	avg race rtng	LRR	POWER	MLINE	LAST FIVE FIGS	TJW% CLS	COMMENT	BEST OVERAL	BEST LAST	TOTALS	
1/2/23	SA	7	6.5	1	1 NICE GUY	S>S	D>D	F/PP/WATCH/Y(3>1) Class Change 9	85	7	85	7	85	5	82	2.9	4.0	0.7	2.9	4.0	0.7	59.76	57.24	100	103	75	0.73	203	278	23	278	169	131	126.0	6.00	86,76,85,89,84	89	169	Brk in;prssd btw;clear	251	277	528
			6.5	7	7 ITALIANO	S>S	D>D	N(1>6) Class Change 9	84	10	84	10	85	8	82	7.0	5.5	1.3	7.0	5.5	1.3	55.35	56.51	74	70	93	1.33	144	237	50	237	166	131	118.6	2.50	75,82,89,93,86	96	166	Ins;swung 4w;no menace	245	239	484
			6.5	3	3 TED	S>S	T>D	F/PP/BTL/ESP/Y(6>5) Class Change -1	84	10	ERR	0	ERR	0	85	2.9	5.4	0.5	ERR	ERR	ERR	57.07	56.60	94	97	83	0.86	191	274	59	274	152	141	122.4	6.00	88,86,80,84,82	101	152	Pressed outsd;kept on	251	279	530
			6.5	2	2 ESTABLIS	S>S	D>D	F/PP/WATCH/ESP/Y(1>3) Class Change 4	83	10	88	8	88	8	85	5.6	5.3	1.1	4.7	4.0	1.2	58.41	58.95	87	93	85	0.91	180	265	87	265	170	136	126.0	2.00	86,88,81,95,88	155	170	Bpd st;duel ins;faltrd	250	271	521
			6.5	6	6 NEXT	S>S	D>D	F/PP/WATCH/Y(7>1) Class Change 9	81	10	82	5	83	4	82	6.3	4.7	1.3	6.7	3.3	2.0	56.53	57.74	79	81	99	1.22	160	259	50	259	145	131	121.5	2.50	87,77,81,75,91	111	145	Outside;clear;drew away	242	270	512
			6.5	4	4 HEARTFUL	S>S	D>D	N(6>6) Class Change -21	80	10	80	10	79	9	76	9.0	6.8	1.3	9.0	6.8	1.3	55.67	56.12	77	71	96	1.35	148	244	22	244	145	161	111.9	20.00	76,71,80,83,89	21	145	4-6wd; no response	248	244	492
			6.5	8	8 BRACE	S>S	D>D	F/PP/Y(6>5) Class Change -61	80	10	82	8	82	8	80	3.5	5.4	0.6	3.2	4.9	0.6	59.33	56.82	93	95	68	0.72	188	256	29	256	186	201	121.2	12.00	73,75,91,87,66	11	186	Prss btw;chsd2w;faded	270	245	515

2.6.7
\$4.80

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	DST	SURF	MOVING?	AVG SPD	ASP R#	ASP RT	ASP 110	AVG RD	AVG LAST5	SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	TDS1	TDS2	CLOSE	BROT1	BROT2	E1	E2	LATE	CLOSE	EARLY TOTAL	Last	DSL	R	BTOT	avg race			LAST FIVE FIGS	TJW% CLS	COMMENT	BEST OVERAL	BEST LAST	BEST TOTALS	
																																rtng	LRR	POWER							MLINE
1/2/23	SA	8	6.0	1	1	COULTHAR	S>S T>T	BTL/SG:1.75/* 2 in 1 *N(7>5) Class Change -21	90	10	90	9	89	6	93	6.4	4.4	1.4	6.5	4.5	1.4	57.37	59.03	0	91	91	1.00	91	182	30	182	211	226	146.0	4.00	92,92,94,91,87	113 211	Checked early; 2-3wd	150	135	285
			6.0	7	7	ZOFFAREL	R>S T>T	BTL/SG:.5/Y(8>4) Class Change 4	89	10	89	4	92	2	89	6.6	4.8	1.4	5.7	4.9	1.2	54.69	55.25	86	90	90	1.00	176	266	29	343	211	201	137.1	10.00	90,86,92,86,91	71 211	2wd;angled out;evenly	143	160	303
			6.0	6	6	MAGLEV	S>S T>T	BOM:6/Y(1>1) Class Change -4	89	2	90	1	90	1	89	7.6	1.8	4.3	7.5	1.3	6.0	54.73	57.17	84	87	97	1.11	171	268	337	268	189	209	139.5	3.00	90,87,0,0,0	114 217	Bit slow;3-4wd;clear	145	161	305
			6.0	4	4	MOTORIOU	S>S T>T	BOM:6/Y(10>1) Class Change 4	86	3	86	3	85	2	86	6.5	2.3	2.8	6.5	2.3	2.8	56.95	58.74	0	87	94	1.08	87	181	36	181	161	201	143.2	2.50	89,79,90,0,0	79 199	Step slow;3-4w;surged	142	132	274
			6.0	3	3	GIVE ME	S>S T>T	F/PP/FLR+29_Y(1>2) Class Change 4	86	10	85	8	74	2	78	1.5	3.9	0.4	1.6	4.2	0.4	58.85	59.41	0	95	83	0.87	95	178	36	178	197	201	130.3	5.00	88,59,88,90,89	36 197	Rail speed;caught late	139	130	269
			6.0	8	8	HOT BOX	S>S T>T	N(6>8) Class Change -21	85	10	89	8	89	3	88	2.7	5.1	0.5	2.2	4.4	0.5	58.64	58.51	0	96	82	0.85	96	178	30	178	195	226	134.5	12.00	87,86,90,85,93	26 195	3-4wd;pinched midstr	143	129	273
			6.0	2	2	RESPECT	S>S T>T	F/PP/Y(3>7) Class Change -21	83	9	88	5	88	3	89	4.9	4.9	1.0	3.9	3.9	1.0	59.17	58.25	0	97	84	0.87	97	181	30	181	192	226	134.5	12.00	90,91,86,87,86	56 192	Bmpd st;2-3w;drftd str	142	133	274
			6.0	5	5	CLASSIER	R>S D>T	F/PP/SP-29/SLR?- 38Y(3>5) Class Change 0	82	6	ERR	0	ERR	0	78	3.4	4.9	0.7	ERR	ERR	ERR	56.23	48.87	99	98	23	0.23	197	220	353	312	211	205	126.4	5.00	53,91,90,78,87	165 211	Duel outside tired	135	114	250

4.6.1
\$4.80

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	DST	SURF	MOVING?	AVG SPD	ASP R#	ASP TDS	ASP RT	ASP 110	ASP RD	AVG LAST5	SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	TDS1	TDS2	CLOSE	BROT1	BROT2	E1	E2	LATE	CLOSE	EARLY TOTAL	Last	DSL	BTOT	avg race			LAST FIVE FIGS	TJW% CLS	COMMENT	BEST OVERAL	BEST LAST	TOTALS
																																rtnng	LRR	POWER						
1/2/23	SA 9	8.0	6	6	NAVY MAN	S>R	D>D	F/PP/BTL/SG:2.75/Y(7>2) Class Change -3	85	2	ERR	0	ERR	0	85	4.3	3.6	1.2	ERR	ERR	ERR	59.01	57.77	90	93	88	0.95	183	271	50	271	170	172	125.2	3.50	87,83,0,0,0	81 170 3w;drifted str;gaining	217	218	435
		8.0	4	4	HARLOCAP	S>R	D>D	F/SG:.5/FLR+85_Y(9>2) Class Change -3	85	1	ERR	0	ERR	0	85	4.4	2.2	2.0	ERR	ERR	ERR	59.73	57.89	94	98	80	0.82	192	272	37	272	172	172	130.0	3.50	85,0,0,0,0	115 172 Off slw;5-4dp;angld in	219	216	435
		8.0	8	8	RIVERSID	R>R	D>D	F/PP/BTL/SG:.75/* 2 in 1 *Y(4>3) Class Change -3	82	4	84	3	84	3	84	5.0	3.9	1.3	3.3	3.3	1.0	55.94	53.25	78	87	88	1.01	165	253	38	333	173	172	125.3	3.50	87,83,81,76,0	81 173 3wd;willingly;edged2nd	213	211	424
		8.0	3	3	ODONATA	R>R	D>D	F/PP/UN?/Y(2>4) Class Change -3	79	6	78	4	78	4	77	4.3	5.2	0.8	4.4	5.3	0.8	55.86	53.18	79	86	85	0.99	165	250	38	331	178	172	124.5	15.00	84,90,57,81,80	84 178 Pressed 2w;btw;flattnd	208	206	414
		8.0	9	9	EXCEL	R>R	D>D	BOM:5/BM3:5/SG:5/FLR+77_N(6>4) Class Change 12	77	1	77	1	77	1	77	7.8	4.4	1.8	7.8	4.4	1.8	53.92	54.28	66	59	100	1.69	125	225	23	287	157	157	112.8	12.00	77,0,0,0,0	56 157 Bk slw;2w;5-4w;drifted	196	187	383
		8.0	1	1	MR FISK	R>R	D>D	F/BTL/SG:3.25/SP+11/FLR+23_Y(6>2) Class Change -3	76	2	87	1	87	1	76	5.6	5.0	1.1	5.0	2.5	2.0	55.39	53.18	77	82	93	1.13	159	252	38	329	170	172	122.5	3.00	87,64,0,0,0	165 170 4-2wd 1st; up for 2nd	203	211	414
		8.0	7	7	BOLT	R>R	T>D	CP/SP+14/FLR+29_Y(5>5) Class Change -3	70	2	ERR	0	ERR	0	70	5.8	6.8	0.8	ERR	ERR	ERR	56.24	52.55	92	96	76	0.79	188	264	29	355	170	172	116.3	15.00	84,55,0,0,0	29 170 2-3w;shftd out/bpd upr	193	212	405
		8.0	10	10	FLAT ON	S>R	D>D	SG:2.5/FLR+64_N(1>7) Class Change -3	64	1	ERR	0	ERR	0	64	10.0	10.0	1.0	ERR	ERR	ERR	52.24	56.53	60	58	94	1.62	118	212	50	212	172	172	102.6	20.00	64,0,0,0,0	22 172 Off slw/brk in;climbed	179	166	345
		8.0	5	5	HABEAS	S>R	D>D	FLR+61_N(8>7) Class Change 2	61	1	ERR	0	ERR	0	61	7.5	8.8	0.9	ERR	ERR	ERR	59.19	56.29	89	83	63	0.76	172	235	64	235	167	167	112.2	12.00	61,0,0,0,0	61 167 4-5wide; no impact	178	171	349

1.4.10
\$7.40

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	DST	SURF	MOVING?	AVG SPD	ASP R#	ASP TDS	ASP RT	ASP 110	ASP RD	AVG LAST5	SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	TDS1	TDS2	CLOSE	BROT1	BROT2	E1	E2	LATE	CLOSE	EARLY TOTAL	Last	DSL	BTOT	avg race			LAST FIVE FIGS	TJW% CLS	COMMENT	BEST OVERAL	BEST LAST	TOTALS
																																rtnng	LRR	POWER						
1/2/23	SA 10	8.0	10	10	EXAULTED	R>R	D>T	F/Y(4>4) Class Change 9	91	10	ERR	0	ERR	0	91	5.3	4.1	1.3	ERR	ERR	ERR	54.64	55.16	82	88	92	1.05	170	262	57	340	203	196	132.9	6.00	89,92,93,93,90	90 203 Bpd btw st;bid 3dp;wkn	204	210	414
		8.0	5	5	AGATINO	R>R	T>T	BTL/BOM:4/SG:1/Y(3>3) Class Change 4	86	2	86	2	86	2	86	7.1	4.7	1.5	7.1	4.7	1.5	54.40	56.82	82	90	87	0.97	172	259	37	335	157	201	136.3	4.00	89,82,0,0,0	79 199 Stdy early;lack rm2nd	200	209	409
		8.0	6	6	DEGREE	R>R	T>T	F/PP/Y(9>7) Class Change -4	85	10	87	6	86	5	85	4.8	4.6	1.0	4.5	5.0	0.9	53.18	54.08	69	73	92	1.26	142	234	52	312	209	209	134.4	6.00	81,87,88,83,72	82 209 Stdy1st;bpd2x/chck str	200	189	390
		8.0	9	9	SEVEN	R>R	T>T	BTL/BOM:5/SG:3.5/* 2 in 1 *N(10>5) Class Change 4	84	5	84	5	84	4	86	8.8	4.9	1.8	8.8	4.9	1.8	53.84	55.86	76	85	88	1.04	161	249	37	322	198	201	133.0	12.00	86,85,86,86,78	26 198 Off slow;2-3w;angl out	197	201	398
		8.0	1	1	TIO	R>R	T>T	BOM:4/SG:3/Y(9>2) Class Change 4	84	10	81	3	81	3	88	5.1	5.1	1.0	5.8	5.4	1.1	54.40	56.10	84	90	88	0.98	174	262	37	343	204	201	139.0	6.00	89,90,86,85,83	52 204 3deep;3-5w;closed well	199	210	409
		8.0	8	8	EVAN	R>R	T>T	F/PP/WATCH/ESP/Y(6>7) Class Change -24	82	6	82	4	81	3	82	2.7	3.0	0.9	2.6	3.1	0.8	52.95	55.65	80	85	83	0.98	165	248	30	336	187	229	138.6	4.00	85,82,80,80,82	73 187 Pace;vied inside;weakn	203	200	403
		8.0	2	2	BALLADEE	R>R	T>T	F/PP/WATCH/ESP/Y(5>4) Class Change 9	82	9	82	6	80	5	86	4.4	5.6	0.8	4.2	5.8	0.7	57.32	54.21	94	93	77	0.83	187	264	59	358	185	196	129.5	12.00	83,91,85,79,90	26 185 Sent;headed 1/4;wknd	192	204	396
		8.0	3	3	BEEF	R>R	D>T	F/PP/ESP/Y(3>2) Class Change 19	82	10	84	4	85	2	87	3.0	4.1	0.7	1.4	3.8	0.4	57.18	54.59	93	95	88	0.93	188	276	16	370	184	186	134.4	8.00	91,86,85,83,84	45 184 Outsd;btwn;clear;yield	192	218	410
		8.0	4	4	WEEGEE	R>R	T>T	BOM:4/Y(1>1) Class Change 39	80	10	82	6	81	5	89	7.4	4.4	1.7	7.6	3.8	2.0	52.23	57.67	71	73	100	1.37	144	244	57	320	148	166	136.8	3.00	88,90,90,79,79	32 148 Swung 4w;going away	185	202	387

10.4.8
\$19.00

BY CLOSING FACTOR

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	PPOT	AEPS	LAST DS	NOTES FROM LAST RACE	SPD	SPD	AVG	LAST FIVE					HIGH					ERLY		TOTL		COMMENTS																				
										#110	TDS	#TDS	SPD	#R	S1	S2	TOT	SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	TDS1	TDS2	CLOSE	E1	E2	LP		SPEED	RATINGS	ATDS	DSL	AVG3	BRIS	P	EQUIP	MLINE	CLS	TRK	DIS	TYPE	CHNG	PMR	CLASS	FINAL	COMB	PACE	PACE
1/2/23	SA	1	6.5	2 2	FREEDOM	1>6	10533	S>S,T>T	**Steadied trn;drftd upr (87)** DROP SWITCH *Stretch gain (3.5).BTL HORSE 1st off 65 day layoff.Class Change -1 Finished 6 from post 1 TJW= 36	89	2	89	2	86	10	88	60	148	4.60	5.50	0.84	7.30	4.70	1.57	86	89	91	87,91,86,83,91	91	65	88.0	P	3	0	8.00	207	SA	6.5	G3	N>G3	142	15.8	93.2	109.0	175	266	Steadied trn;drftd upr/3w;floatd out xing;clr/Attn pace;outkicked
			6.5	1 1	BURGOO	5>5	13666	R>S,T>T	**3wd into str; no bid (80)** *Stretch gain (.75).BTL HORSE 1st off 51 day layoff.2 races in one pattern.Class Change 14 Finished 5 from post 5 TJW= 43	85	1	85	1	84	10	71	66	136	4.10	4.80	0.85	7.10	4.30	1.67	77	68	96	80,87,94,88,80	85	51	87.0	E/P	1	0	4.00	216	DMR	8.0	G3	N>G3	138	15.9	87.6	103.6	145	241	3wd into str; no bid/Ins;headed 1/4;weaknd/Closest; no response
			6.5	7 7	ROYAL	1>3	9417	R>S,T>T	**Bid outsd;led;edged2nd (82)** Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 1-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH!BTL HORSE 1st off 51 day layoff.Class Change 14 Finished 3 from post 1 TJW= 25	88	7	86	8	85	10	74	101	174	4.70	5.10	0.92	5.30	4.90	1.07	85	74	93	82,88,77,90,85	91	51	82.0	P	0	0	8.00	212	DMR	8.0	G3	N>G3	130	15.1	86.3	101.4	159	252	Bid outsd;led;edged2nd/Bpd st;brshd rail turn/Brushd;chck5/16;ang14w
			6.5	6 6	AMY C	9>1	20856	S>S,T>T	**2-4wd; closed well (92)** Made big overall move (4).BTL HORSE 1st off 65 day layoff.Class Change -1 Finished 1 from post 9 TJW= 35	92	2	92	2	88	7	92	60	152	5.20	4.30	1.19	5.00	1.30	4.00	92	97	89	92,85,92,90,83	92	65	90.0	P	2	0	2.50	217	SA	6.5	G3	N>G3	143	17.7	95.3	112.9	189	278	2-4wd; closed well/Chased inside;weakened/Forcd out xing;drw clr
			6.5	5 5	BROOKE	10>7	25271	S>S,T>T	**4w;5w1/4;lackd punch (84)** *Stretch gain (.5). 1st off 78 day layoff.Class Change 4 Finished 7 from post 10 TJW= 39	90	2	88	9	87	10	86	84	170	4.40	3.30	1.33	4.40	3.10	1.42	94	95	83	84,89,85,85,91	92	78	86.0	E/P	0	0	4.00	214	KEE	5.5	G3	G3>G3	149	14.9	92.7	107.6	189	272	4w;5w1/4;lackd punch/5w1/4;bid;even late/Gaining; prevailed plc Off bit slw;3w turn;5w/Tracked ins; edged clr/4w 1/4; out-finished
			6.5	3 3	LADY EDITH	6>3	20675	S>S,T>T	**Off bit slw;3w turn;5w (91)** DROP SWITCH Chased Pace. Made big overall move (3).BTL HORSE 1st off 36 day layoff.Class Change -1 Finished 3 from post 6 TJW= 36	89	3	90	6	85	10	87	88	174	6.70	4.50	1.49	6.70	3.90	1.70	91	101	85	91,86,90,95,91	95	36	89.0	S	3	0	3.00	220	AQU	6.0	G3	N>G3	152	17.4	88.3	105.6	192	277	Off bit slw;3w turn;5w/Tracked ins; edged clr/4w 1/4; out-finished
			6.5	4 4	LADY JAE	1>7	7312	R>S,T>T	**Chck/pull1st;steady3/8 (69)** Made a big move early (3.25).SLR?- 20 Slow last race (9). 1st off 39 day layoff.Class Change 4 Finished 7 from post 1 TJW= 26	89	1	89	1	78	10	65	0	65	7.00	4.50	1.57	7.00	3.00	2.33	57	77	49	69,89,81,87,80	89	39	80.0	S	0	0	12.00	185	DMR	11.0	G3	G3>G3	126	13.0	80.8	93.8	134	183	Chck/pull1st;steady3/8/Bpd bth sides st;rally/Bpd btw/stdy1st;3-4dp
			6.5	8 8	COUNTESS	1>1	21844	S>S,T>T	**Settled ins; flew late (91)** THIRD OFF MAYBE? Made big overall move (5).BTL HORSE 1st off 44 day layoff.Class Change 24 Finished 1 from post 1 TJW= 32	66	4	88	4	88	6	85	-5	80	5.70	2.80	2.00	6.70	2.10	3.14	86	0	96	91,91,85,87,88	91	44	89.0	S	1	0	12.00	199	DMR	5.0	G3	A0>G3	138	16.9	92.3	109.1	86	182	Settled ins; flew late/Ins;tippd;lack rm late/Brk in;bpd;shffld erly

6.4.2
\$6.60

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	PPOT	AEPS	LAST DS	NOTES FROM LAST RACE	SPD	SPD	AVG	LAST FIVE					HIGH					ERLY		TOTL		COMMENTS																				
										#110	TDS	#TDS	SPD	#R	S1	S2	TOT	SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	TDS1	TDS2	CLOSE	E1	E2	LP		SPEED	RATINGS	ATDS	DSL	AVG3	BRIS	P	EQUIP	MLINE	CLS	TRK	DIS	TYPE	CHNG	PMR	CLASS	FINAL	COMB	PACE	PACE
1/2/23	SA	2	8.0	7 7	CHERRY	1>8	2607	S>R,D>T	**Bpd st;ins-2w;no factr (50)** Class Change 42 Finished 8 from post 1 TJW= 27	66	2	66	2	57	7	81	73	153	5.50	8.50	0.64	1.40	8.60	0.17	81	73	63	50,60,52,60,71	71	29	54.0	E/P	5	BON	12.00	163	DMR	6.0	S	M>S	93	8.5	82.8	91.3	154	217	Bpd st;ins-2w;no factr/Steady 2x;lack rm 1/4/Keen erly;ins-3w;empty
			8.0	8 8	TURQUOISE	3>9	500	S>R,D>T	**Off slow/took up start (55)** DROP SWITCH 1st off 31 day layoff.Class Change -3 Finished 9 from post 3 TJW= 23	ERR	0	ERR	0	55	1	83	69	152	7.80	10.00	0.78	ERR	ERR	ERR	84	84	58	55,0,0,0,0	0	31	55.0	NA	1	0	30.00	171	DMR	6.0	S	S>S	103	0.3	85.0	85.3	168	226	Off slow/took up start/ /
			8.0	4 4	SMOOVE AS	8>8	2828	R>R,T>T	**Traffic/tight/chck str (64)** Made a big move early (4). 1st off 43 day layoff.Class Change -3 Finished 8 from post 8 TJW= 23	67	3	67	3	66	5	80	81	161	6.20	6.80	0.92	6.40	7.30	0.88	77	82	56	64,63,71,75,57	75	43	66.0	S	2	0	6.00	167	DMR	8.0	S	S>S	99	11.7	84.5	96.2	159	215	Traffic/tight/chck str/Brshd;shftd early;2-3w/Bid 3w;outfinished
			8.0	6 6	GOLDEN	3>6	2080	S>R,T>T	**2w; bpd midstr;no rally (71)** DROP SWITCH 1st off 39 day layoff.Class Change -3 Finished 6 from post 3 TJW= 39	ERR	0	ERR	0	69	2	83	-5	78	5.30	5.30	1.00	ERR	ERR	ERR	92	0	70	71,67,0,0,0	0	39	69.0	NA	6	BON	3.00	169	DMR	5.0	S	S>S	115	11.6	89.8	101.4	92	162	2w; bpd midstr;no rally/Chased 2wd;improved/
			8.0	1 1	VIOLET	3>2	2904	R>R,D>T	**Cleared 2nd;drift str (65)** Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 3-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH!BTL HORSE Clear early.Class Change 41 Finished 2 from post 3 TJW= 37	71	2	71	2	65	5	86	76	162	7.20	6.40	1.13	6.40	5.70	1.13	73	78	62	65,74,68,69,48	74	17	69.0	E	5	0	3.50	153	LRC	8.0	S	M>S	111	12.6	84.4	97.0	151	213	Cleared 2nd;drift str/2-3wd;moved out str/Tight early;svd ground
			8.0	5 5	NYVAN	1>3	9133	S>R,D>T	**Gained 2-4wd;bmpd3/16 (81)** THIRD OFF Chased Pace. 1st off 31 day layoff.Class Change -3 Finished 3 from post 1 TJW= 28	ERR	0	ERR	0	73	3	90	78	168	2.80	2.40	1.14	ERR	ERR	ERR	96	97	76	81,70,69,0,0	0	31	73.0	E	8	0	2.50	161	DMR	6.0	S	S>S	124	14.5	88.8	103.2	193	269	Gained 2-4wd;bmpd3/16/ Up Close;2wd;held 2nd/Vie2w; steadied3/8
			8.0	3 3	LOVE OUR	7>4	4800	S>R,D>T	**4-5wd; no response (76)** 1st off 31 day layoff.Class Change -3 Finished 4 from post 7 TJW= 11	ERR	0	ERR	0	75	2	87	78	165	4.70	4.00	1.17	ERR	ERR	ERR	94	92	76	76,74,0,0,0	0	31	75.0	E	6	0	8.00	149	DMR	6.0	S	S>S	114	11.9	88.4	100.3	186	262	4-5wd; no response/Closest 2wd; 2nd best/
			8.0	2 2	SPEAKING	6>7	2733	S>R,D>T	**Hit gt;4-2w;no menace (58)** DROP SWITCH 1st off 31 day layoff.Class Change -3 Finished 7 from post 6 TJW= 23	ERR	0	ERR	0	61	3	78	77	155	8.40	6.80	1.24	ERR	ERR	ERR	73	73	73	58,68,58,0,0	0	31	61.0	S	3	BOFF	12.00	159	DMR	6.0	S	S>S	102	9.6	79.1	88.7	146	219	Hit gt;4-2w;no menace/4-3wd; rallied for 2nd/Bit fract; bpd st;2-3w
			8.0	9 9	POINT AND	4>4	4200	R>R,T>T	**Bit slw/crwed;2-4w2nd (77)** Made big overall move (3). Made a big move early (3.5). *Stretch gain (1). 1st off 43 day layoff.Class Change -3 Finished 4 from post 4 TJW= 23	77	1	77	1	77	1	80	92	172	10.00	5.00	2.00	10.00	5.00	2.00	77	81	79	77,0,0,0,0	77	43	77.0	NA	0	0	8.00	171	DMR	8.0	S	S>S	111	7.7	88.3	96.0	158	237	Bit slw/crwed;2-4w2nd/ /

5.3.6
\$4.20

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	PPOT	AEPS	LAST DS	NOTES FROM LAST RACE	SPD	SPD	AVG	LAST FIVE											HIGH			ERLY TOTL		COMMENTS																		
										#110	#110	#R	S1	S2	TOT	SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	TDS1	TDS2	CLOSE	E1	E2	LP	SPEED	RATINGS	ATDS	DSL		AVG3	BRIS	P	EQUIP	MLINE	CLS	TRK	DIS	TYPE	CHNG	PMR	CLASS	FINAL	COMB	TOTL	LAST		
1/2/23	SA	3	6.0	1 1	FILTHY	0>0	1 0>S,>D		** (0)** 1st off 738522 day layoff. FTS.Invalid last race. Finished 0 from post 0 TJW= 25	ERR	0	ERR	0	ERR	0	57	-9	48	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	0	0	0,0,0,0,0	0	****	ERR	NA	0	0	2.00	ERR	0.0	M	>M		0.0	ERR	ERR	0	0	/ /	
			6.0	5 5	LIBERAL	0>0	1 0>S,>D		** (0)** 1st off 738522 day layoff. FTS.Invalid last race. Finished 0 from post 0 TJW= 40	ERR	0	ERR	0	ERR	0	57	-9	48	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	0	0	0,0,0,0,0	0	****	NA	0	0	2.50	ERR	0.0	M	>M		0.0	ERR	ERR	0	0	/ /		
			6.0	7 7	GOOD AS	4>9	500 R>S,T>D		**Chased 2w;ins;wkn btw (69)** Flashed speed. 1st off 71 day layoff.Class Change -18 Finished 9 from post 4 TJW= 23	67	1	69	2	71	4	85	86	170	4.80	6.80	0.70	2.00	6.00	0.33	96	83	63	69,76,67,70,0	70	71	71.0	E	3	0	12.00	171	SA	8.0	M	S>M	114	11.0	85.4	96.5	179	242	Chased 2w;ins;wkn btw/ Trackd 3deep;no respns/ Dueled btw; fade
			6.0	3 3	HALF	7>8	4270 R>S,T>D		**Up close 4-3wd; tired (42)** DROP SWITCH Flashed speed. Slow last race (22). 1st off 92 day layoff.Class Change -18 Finished 8 from post 7 TJW= 20	50	1	71	3	64	4	75	73	148	5.90	7.80	0.76	4.20	6.80	0.62	83	65	37	42,50,81,82,0	82	92	58.0	E	6	BOFF	5.00	169	SA	8.0	M	S>M	104	6.5	79.3	85.7	148	185	Up close 4-3wd; tired/ Brsh/crwded bit;ins-3w/ Step slw;vie ins;flttn
			6.0	4 4	BALENCIAGA	8>10	6240 R>S,T>D		**Pull;bpd both sides2nd (74)** DROP SWITCH Class Change -23 Finished 10 from post 8 TJW= 30	ERR	0	ERR	0	72	4	81	85	166	5.70	6.00	0.95	ERR	ERR	ERR	92	91	64	74,74,67,72,0	0	30	72.0	E/P	0	0	5.00	172	DMR	8.0	M	S>M	116	12.7	77.3	90.0	183	247	Pull;bpd both sides2nd/ Awkward step xing;2-3w/ Bobbid;tight;drftd/bpd
			6.0	6 6	ANYBODY'S	6>4	4200 S>S,T>D		**Off slow;2-3wd;no bid (68)** *Stretch gain (1.25). 1st off 45 day layoff.Class Change -23 Finished 4 from post 6 TJW= 23	ERR	0	ERR	0	68	1	85	-3	82	5.70	5.70	1.00	ERR	ERR	ERR	90	0	68	68,0,0,0,0	0	45	68.0	NA	0	0	4.00	171	DMR	5.0	M	S>M	110	11.3	91.9	103.2	90	158	Off slow;2-3wd;no bid/ /
			6.0	2 2	MIDNIGHT	6>5	1400 S>S,D>D		**Step slow; inside-3wd (69)** 1st off 31 day layoff.Class Change -23 Finished 5 from post 6 TJW= 21	69	1	69	1	69	1	84	78	162	10.00	8.30	1.20	10.00	8.30	1.20	81	79	78	69,0,0,0,0	69	31	69.0	NA	0	0	12.00	171	DMR	6.5	M	S>M	112	7.1	84.5	91.6	160	238	Step slow; inside-3wd/ /

7.1.6
\$6.00

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	PPOT	AEPS	LAST DS	NOTES FROM LAST RACE	SPD	SPD	AVG	LAST FIVE											HIGH			ERLY TOTL		COMMENTS																		
										#110	#110	#R	S1	S2	TOT	SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	TDS1	TDS2	CLOSE	E1	E2	LP	SPEED	RATINGS	ATDS	DSL		AVG3	BRIS	P	EQUIP	MLINE	CLS	TRK	DIS	TYPE	CHNG	PMR	CLASS	FINAL	COMB	TOTL	LAST		
1/2/23	SA	4	6.0	7 7	CONCH	4>1	3693 S>S,D>T		**Cleared;2wd;prevailed (78)** Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 4-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH!BTL HORSE Clear early.1st off 43 day layoff.Class Change 29 Finished 1 from post 4 TJW= 26	79	3	79	3	75	8	87	78	165	2.40	6.30	0.38	1.30	6.30	0.20	91	92	80	78,70,74,83,86	86	43	74.0	E	7	0	8.00	156	DMR	5.5	C	M>C	108	14.2	91.6	105.7	183	263	Cleared;2wd;prevailed/ Duel inside; weakened/ Mild bid3w/16;drft in
			6.0	4 4	CONSTANT	10>3	5774 R>S,D>T		**Outside;btw;no match (78)** Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 10-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH! 1st off 43 day layoff.Class Change 19 Finished 3 from post 10 TJW= 46	79	4	79	4	77	10	86	82	167	4.40	5.90	0.76	4.40	4.40	1.00	79	82	80	78,84,75,80,75	81	43	79.0	E	3	0	4.00	159	DMR	8.0	C	C>C	121	14.7	87.3	101.9	161	241	Outside;btw;no match/ Stmbl;3deep;btw;no bid/ Rate ins;duel;weakened
			6.0	3 3	THANKS	9>11	2741 R>S,T>T		**Rank;stdy1st;4deep2nd (74)** 1st off 36 day layoff.Class Change 4 Finished 11 from post 9 TJW= 19	69	3	72	4	70	10	78	90	168	5.50	7.10	0.77	5.30	6.30	0.84	80	78	72	74,80,78,79,46	82	36	77.0	P	2	0	5.00	148	DMR	8.5	C	C>C	111	11.0	84.9	95.9	158	230	Rank;stdy1st;4deep2nd/ Tight 3/8;4wd into str/ Off slw;angld out;mssd
			6.0	8 8	BLAME	4>8	4038 S>S,T>T		**Steadied5/16;swung out (72)** DROP SWITCH Flashed speed. *Stretch gain (1). 1st off 43 day layoff.Class Change -21 Finished 8 from post 4 TJW= 26	73	1	73	2	73	10	83	-5	78	5.60	6.20	0.90	5.30	8.80	0.60	90	0	73	72,73,66,66,84	73	43	70.0	P	4	0	20.00	146	DMR	5.0	C	R>C	106	8.2	90.2	98.3	90	163	Steadied5/16;swung out/ Vie btw;ins-2w;weaknd/ Off slow; 4wd into str
			6.0	6 6	MISSED	6>4	4900 S>S,D>T		**Bpd st;3w;drftd in 1/4 (83)** DROP SWITCH Class Change -11 Finished 4 from post 6 TJW= 43	77	3	77	3	78	6	91	80	170	5.20	5.40	0.97	4.80	4.80	1.00	85	92	85	83,78,83,72,79	79	22	81.0	P	3	0	5.00	164	LRC	5.5	C	R>C	124	14.2	91.5	105.6	177	262	Bpd st;3w;drftd in 1/4/ Brush early;3w;btw;wkn/ Vied inside; flattened
			6.0	2 2	TOFINO BAY	6>9	4738 R>S,T>T		**Inside; no impact (75)** *Stretch gain (1.5). 1st off 36 day layoff.Class Change 4 Finished 9 from post 6 TJW= 29	77	2	77	2	74	6	77	93	170	7.20	7.00	1.03	8.80	3.50	2.50	80	76	76	75,69,69,75,76	79	36	71.0	E/P	0	0	12.00	160	DMR	8.5	C	C>C	106	6.9	81.5	88.4	156	232	Inside; no impact/ Left rein broke start/ 2-3w;no factor
			6.0	5 5	KIMMER	5>5	2424 S>S,D>T		**Bpd both sides st;btwn (81)** DROP SWITCH Class Change -11 Finished 5 from post 5 TJW= 21	85	2	84	3	79	9	90	80	169	8.20	6.90	1.19	8.20	6.10	1.35	84	90	85	81,0,86,83,81	86	22	56.0	S	0	BOFF	10.00	165	LRC	5.5	C	R>C	117	12.6	91.1	103.7	174	259	Bpd both sides st;btwn/ Bpd st;2wd;mildly 3p/ Brsh st;ins-2w;btw str

7.4.5
\$9.00

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	PPOT	AEPS	LAST DS	NOTES FROM LAST RACE	SPD 110	SPD #110	TDS #TDS	AVG SPD #R	S1	S2	TOT	SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	TDS1	TDS2	CLOSE	E1	E2	LP	LAST FIVE SPEED RATINGS	HIGH BYER			MLINE	CLS	TRK	DIS	TYPE	CHNG	PMR	CLASS	FINAL	COMB	ERLY TOTL PACE		COMMENTS			
																											ATDS	DSL	AVG3											P	EQUIP		TOTL	LAST	
1/2/23	SA	5	6.0	1 1	JACQUELINE	0>0	1 0>S,>D	** (0)** 1st off 738522 day layoff. FTS.Invalid last race. Finished 0 from post 0 TJW= 31	ERR	0	ERR	0	ERR	0	57	-9	48	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	0	0	0,0,0,0,0	0	****	ERR	NA	0	0	12.00	ERR	0.0	M	>M		0.0	ERR	ERR	0	0	/ /	
			6.0	2 2	SHES JUST	0>0	1 0>S,>D	** (0)** 1st off 738522 day layoff. FTS.Invalid last race. Finished 0 from post 0 TJW= 28	ERR	0	ERR	0	ERR	0	57	-9	48	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	0	0	0,0,0,0,0	0	****	NA	0	0	6.00	ERR	0.0	M	>M		0.0	ERR	ERR	0	0	/ /		
			6.0	12 12	ONE MO	0>0	1 0>S,>D	** (0)** 1st off 738522 day layoff. FTS.Invalid last race. Finished 0 from post 0 TJW= 28	ERR	0	ERR	0	ERR	0	57	-9	48	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	0	0	0,0,0,0,0	0	****	NA	0	0	8.00	ERR	0.0	M	>M		0.0	ERR	ERR	0	0	/ /		
			6.0	11 11	SONG OF	0>0	1 0>S,>D	** (0)** 1st off 738522 day layoff. FTS.Invalid last race. Finished 0 from post 0 TJW= 26	ERR	0	ERR	0	ERR	0	57	-9	48	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	0	0	0,0,0,0,0	0	****	NA	0	0	12.00	ERR	0.0	M	>M		0.0	ERR	ERR	0	0	/ /		
			6.0	9 9	TOOTUFFTOS	0>0	1 0>S,>D	** (0)** 1st off 738522 day layoff. FTS.Invalid last race. Finished 0 from post 0 TJW= 19	ERR	0	ERR	0	ERR	0	57	-9	48	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	0	0	0,0,0,0,0	0	****	NA	0	0	20.00	ERR	0.0	M	>M		0.0	ERR	ERR	0	0	/ /		
			6.0	5 5	SWEET	9>2	1725 S>S,D>D	**Duel outside;2nd best (71)** Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 9-hole. Fast last race (19).Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH!BTL HORSE Clear early.Class Change 17 Finished 2 from post 9 TJW= 34	45	3	45	3	52	4	90	77	166	4.30	7.00	0.62	5.50	6.40	0.86	90	91	70 71,72,41,22,0	71	29	61.0	E	7	0	4.00	150	DMR	6.0	M	M>M	112	13.1	86.9	100.0	181	251	Duel outside;2nd best/Bmpd st;collared 3/16/Bpd erly;shftd 3wd trm
			6.0	10 10	LUCKY	9>8	500 S>S,D>D	**4-5wd; gave way (53)** 1st off 136 day layoff.Class Change 2 Finished 8 from post 9 TJW= 26	53	1	53	1	53	1	78	73	150	7.80	8.90	0.88	7.80	8.90	0.88	83	66	76 53,0,0,0,0	53	136	53.0	NA	0	0	20.00	141	DMR	5.5	M	M>M	101	7.9	85.6	93.4	149	225	4-5wd; gave way/ /
			6.0	8 8	TIME	2>4	2167 S>S,D>D	**Inside; weakened (59)** Flashed speed. Fast last race (16).Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH! 1st off 43 day layoff.Class Change 2 Finished 4 from post 2 TJW= 40	43	3	43	3	43	3	85	70	155	6.30	7.10	0.88	6.30	7.10	0.88	90	82	68 59,67,3,0,0	67	43	43.0	E	4	0	5.00	153	DMR	5.5	M	M>M	108	10.2	86.7	96.8	172	240	Inside; weakened/ Bid 3deep upper;faltrd/Keen;btwn;2w;eased
			6.0	7 7	MISS	7>2	6000 S>S,D>D	**Bpd st;3-4w;lug 2x str (69)** Flashed speed. Class Change 2 Finished 2 from post 7 TJW= 33	69	1	69	1	69	1	89	74	162	2.90	2.90	1.00	2.90	2.90	1.00	89	90	69 69,0,0,0,0	69	22	69.0	E	6	0	3.00	141	LRC	6.0	M	M>M	116	13.2	90.1	103.3	179	248	Bpd st;3-4w;lug 2x str/ /
			6.0	6 6	SHORT	6>9	913 S>S,D>D	**3wide; no menace (44)** SLR?- 22 Slow last race (10). Class Change 17 Finished 9 from post 6 TJW= 21	54	3	54	3	54	3	80	70	149	8.20	8.20	1.00	8.20	8.20	1.00	82	72	57 44,66,52,0,0	66	29	54.0	NA	0	0	15.00	129	DMR	6.0	M	M>M	101	6.7	81.5	88.2	154	211	3wide; no menace/ 3-2wide; no threat/ Hit gate; 3deep 5/16
			6.0	3 3	MAGIC	5>5	600 S>S,D>D	**Stp slw;4-5w;no menace (55)** Class Change 2 Finished 5 from post 5 TJW= 22	55	1	55	1	55	1	80	75	154	8.60	7.10	1.20	8.60	7.10	1.20	80	72	71 55,0,0,0,0	55	22	55.0	NA	0	0	20.00	141	LRC	6.0	M	M>M	104	6.0	86.3	92.3	152	223	Stp slw;4-5w;no menace/ /
			6.0	4 4	MISS	3>6	2150 R>S,T>D	**Pulled;green early&str (53)** DROP SWITCHSLR?- 13 1st off 71 day layoff.Class Change -23 Finished 6 from post 3 TJW= 11	66	1	59	2	60	4	76	84	159	8.90	7.10	1.25	7.90	6.40	1.22	63	63	58 53,66,69,52,0	66	71	63.0	P	0	BQN	8.00	161	SA	8.0	M	S>M	105	9.9	82.6	92.5	126	184	Pulled;green early&str/ 3-5wide; flattened/ Off slow;swung widest

9.5.2
\$77.00

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	PPOT	AEPS	LAST DS	NOTES FROM LAST RACE	SPD	SPD	AVG	LAST FIVE															HIGH			ERLY TOTL		COMMENTS																
										110	#110	TDS	#TDS	SPD	#R	S1	S2	TOT	SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	TDS1	TDS2	CLOSE	E1	E2	LP	SPEED	RATINGS	ATDS	DSL	AVG3		BRIS	P	EQUIP	MLINE	CLS	TRK	DIS	TYPE	CHNG	PMR	CLASS	FINAL	COMB	PACE	TOTL	PACE
1/2/23	SA	6	6.5	1 1	LUCKY FOR	0>0	1 0>S,>T		** (0)** 1st off 738522 day layoff. FTS.Invalid last race. Finished 0 from post 0 TJW= 53	ERR	0	ERR	0	ERR	0	57	-9	48	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	0	0	0	0	0	0,0,0,0,0	0	****	ERR	NA	0	0	0	4.00	ERR	0.0	S	>S		0.0	ERR	ERR	0	0	/ /
			6.5	6 6	LOOKS LIKE	0>0	1 0>S,>T		** (0)** 1st off 738522 day layoff. FTS.Invalid last race. Finished 0 from post 0 TJW= 42	ERR	0	ERR	0	ERR	0	57	-9	48	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	0	0	0	0	0,0,0,0,0	0	****	NA	0	0	0	8.00	ERR	0.0	S	>S		0.0	ERR	ERR	0	0	/ /		
			6.5	2 2	SINNERS	1>6	500 S>S,T>T		**Stalkd ins;no response (84)** Flashed speed. Fast last race (14).Uncharacteristic race? 1st off 64 day layoff.Class Change 4 Finished 6 from post 1 TJW= 34	70	2	70	2	70	2	83	89	172	7.30	8.70	0.85	7.30	8.70	0.85	93	95	82	84,56,0,0,0	84	64	70.0	NA	6	0	0	20.00	172	SA	6.5	S	S>S	112	12.3	91.6	103.9	188	270	Stalkd ins;no response/ 3deep;dropped back trn/	
			6.5	4 4	CUBAN	1>5	3901 S>S,T>T		**Inside;drifted1/16;wkn (77)** DROP SWITCH Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 1-hole.Uncharacteristic race?BTL HORSE 1st off 50 day layoff.Class Change -1 Finished 5 from post 1 TJW= 42	84	3	82	4	82	4	89	-4	85	4.50	4.70	0.95	4.50	4.70	0.95	96	0	72	77,79,83,90,0	90	50	80.0	E/P	5	0	0	2.50	171	DMR	5.0	S	S>S	124	14.1	92.0	106.1	96	168	Inside;drifted1/16;wkn/ Bid 3dp 1/16;outfnshd/ Stalked 2path;weaknd	
			6.5	5 5	SOCIALLY	5>2	7153 S>S,T>T		**Angld out 1/4;bpd uppr (82)** Made big overall move (6). *Stretch gain (3.5).BTL HORSE 1st off 50 day layoff.2 races in one pattern.Class Change -1 Finished 2 from post 5 TJW= 31	59	2	67	3	74	6	86	-4	82	6.20	6.20	1.00	7.40	6.80	1.10	90	0	83	82,81,83,79,47	82	50	82.0	E/P	5	0	0	4.00	171	DMR	5.0	S	S>S	120	13.9	94.1	108.1	90	173	Angld out 1/4;bpd uppr/ Gamely to wire/ Lost path uppr;kept on	
			6.5	8 8	REBEL GIRL	5>2	4600 S>S,T>T		**Bit tight 5/16;up 2nd (91)** *Stretch gain (.5). Fast last race (13). 1st off 64 day layoff.Class Change 4 Finished 2 from post 5 TJW= 33	79	2	79	2	78	4	82	94	176	6.10	6.10	1.00	7.20	6.70	1.08	92	94	91	91,83,70,67,0	91	64	81.0	E	1	0	0	8.00	164	SA	6.5	S	S>S	125	11.9	93.1	105.0	186	277	Bit tight 5/16;up 2nd/ 2-3wide; flattened/ Attnnd pace;ltd;nipped	
			6.5	7 7	INFINITE	6>0	5320 R>S,T>T		**Hop;stumbld;lost rider (0)** DROP SWITCH *Pressed Pace from 6-hole.SLR?-90 Slow last race (79).Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH! 1st off 52 day layoff.Class Change -1 Finished 0 from post 6 TJW= 31	90	1	90	1	79	5	89	93	181	6.60	4.70	1.41	8.80	3.80	2.33	0	0	0	0,90,68,82,77	90	52	79.0	P	0	0	0	6.00	176	DMR	8.5	S	S>S	129	3.7	89.9	93.7	0	0	Hop;stumbld;lost rider/ Turn hd/bpd;traffc trn/ Brk in;checked early	
			6.5	3 3	DENIM IN	2>3	8400 S>S,T>T		**Off slow;4-5w;bpd uppr (82)** Made big overall move (6). *Stretch gain (4).BTL HORSE 1st off 50 day layoff.2 races in one pattern.Class Change -1 Finished 3 from post 2 TJW= 30	ERR	0	82	1	82	1	85	-4	81	10.00	3.30	3.00	10.00	3.30	3.00	87	0	86	82,0,0,0,0	82	50	82.0	S	0	0	0	4.00	175	DMR	5.0	S	S>S	120	14.2	95.1	109.3	87	173	Off slow;4-5w;bpd uppr/ /	

8.1.6
\$24.20

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	PPOT	AEPS	LAST DS	NOTES FROM LAST RACE	SPD	SPD	AVG	LAST FIVE										HIGH			ERLY TOTL				COMMENTS																	
										110	#110	TDS	#TDS	SPD	#R	S1	S2	TOT	SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	TDS1	TDS2	CLOSE	E1	E2	LP	SPEED	RATINGS		ATDS	DSL	AVG3	BRIS	P	EQUIP	MLINE	CLS	TRK	DIS	TYPE	CHNG	PMR	CLASS	FINAL	COMB	TOTL
1/2/23	SA	7	6.5	3 3	TED	6>5	3708	S>S,T>D	**Pressed outsd;kept on (88)** DROP SWITCH Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 6-hole.BTL HORSE Clear early.1st off 59 day layoff.Class Change -1 Finished 5 from post 6 TJW= 21	ERR	0	ERR	0	84	10	84	92	175	2.90	5.40	0.53	ERR	ERR	ERR	94	97	83	88,86,80,84,82	0	59	85.0	E	5	0	6.00	152	SA	6.5	C	C>C	122	15.1	89.6	104.7	191	274	Pressed outsd;kept on/Pressed;drft in/bpd1/8/Pulled;stalk;2-3w;wknd
			6.5	8 8	BRACE FOR	6>5	7718	S>S,D>D	**Prss btw;chsd2w;faded (73)**THIRD OFF DROP SWITCH Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 6-hole. Class Change -61 Finished 5 from post 6 TJW= 11	82	8	82	8	80	10	92	76	167	3.50	5.40	0.65	3.20	4.90	0.65	93	95	68	73,75,91,87,66	91	29	80.0	E	4	BOFF	12.00	186	DMR	6.0	C	AO>C	121	13.8	86.9	100.6	188	256	Prss btw;chsd2w;faded/Bit slow/stdy;check3/8/Bid 4deep;led;outkickd
			6.5	1 1	NICE GUY	3>1	9034	S>S,D>D	**Brk in;prssd btw;clear (86)** Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 3-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH!BTL HORSE Clear early.Class Change 9 Finished 1 from post 3 TJW= 31	85	5	85	7	85	7	93	88	180	2.90	4.00	0.74	2.90	4.00	0.74	100	103	75	86,76,85,89,84	89	23	82.0	E/P	5	0	6.00	169	LRC	6.5	C	C>C	126	15.8	84.9	100.7	203	278	Brk in;prssd btw;clear/Inside;2-3wd;no rally/Sent; inside; weakened
			6.5	2 2	ESTABLISHE	1>3	12187	S>S,D>D	**Bpd st;duel ins;faltrd (86)** Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 1-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH!BTL HORSE Clear early.1st off 87 day layoff.Class Change 4 Finished 3 from post 1 TJW= 39	88	8	88	8	83	10	94	81	174	5.60	5.30	1.06	4.70	4.00	1.19	87	93	85	86,88,81,95,88	97	87	85.0	E/P	4	0	2.00	170	SA	6.5	C	C>C	126	15.7	88.6	104.3	180	265	Bpd st;duel ins;faltrd/Bid 4deep; 2nd best/Brush st;2-4w;no rally
			6.5	7 7	ITALIANO	1>6	5934	S>S,D>D	**Ins;swung 4w;no menace (75)** Slow last race (9). 1st off 50 day layoff.Class Change 9 Finished 6 from post 1 TJW= 42	85	8	84	10	84	10	79	85	164	7.00	5.50	1.26	7.00	5.50	1.26	74	70	93	75,82,89,93,86	93	50	82.0	P	0	0	2.50	166	DMR	6.5	C	C>C	119	13.5	88.5	102.0	144	237	Ins;swung 4w;no menace/Swung out;rally;faltrd/Bid 5-deep;duel;drvng
			6.5	4 4	HEARTFULLO	6>6	5327	S>S,D>D	**4-6wd; no response (76)** Class Change -21 Finished 6 from post 6 TJW= 21	79	9	80	10	80	10	80	87	166	9.00	6.80	1.33	9.00	6.80	1.33	77	71	96	76,71,80,83,89	89	22	76.0	S	0	0	20.00	145	LRC	6.0	C	R>C	112	6.3	88.3	94.7	148	244	4-6wd; no response/Bpd;lost pth erly;3-4w/2-3wide; no menace
			6.5	6 6	NEXT	7>1	4061	S>S,D>D	**Outside;clear;drew awy (87)** Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 7-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH!BTL HORSE Clear early.1st off 50 day layoff.Class Change 9 Finished 1 from post 7 TJW= 29	83	4	82	5	81	10	84	88	172	6.30	4.70	1.34	6.70	3.30	2.00	79	81	99	87,77,81,75,91	91	50	82.0	P	3	0	2.50	145	DMR	6.5	C	C>C	121	15.1	90.7	105.8	160	259	Outside;clear;drew awy/4-5w;rally;not enough/Inside; no late kick

2.6.7
\$4.80

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	PPOT	AEPS	LAST DS	NOTES FROM LAST RACE	SPD	SPD	AVG	LAST FIVE										HIGH	ERLY TOTL										COMMENTS													
										#110	#110	#TDS	SPD	#R	S1	S2	TOT	SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	TDS1	TDS2	CLOSE	E1	E2	LP	SPEED	RATINGS	BYER	ATDS	DSL	AVG3	BRIS		P	EQUIP	MLINE	CLS	TRK	DIS	TYPE	CHNG	PMR	CLASS	FINAL	COMB	PACE
1/2/23	SA	8	6.0	3 3	GIVE ME	1>2	14025	S>S,T>T	**Rail speed;caught late (88)** Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 1-hole.BTL HORSE Clear early.1st off 36 day layoff.Class Change 4 Finished 2 from post 1 TJW= 36	74	2	85	8	86	10	91	-7	84	1.50	3.90	0.39	1.60	4.20	0.37	95	0	83	88,59,88,90,89	90	36	78.0	E	8	0	5.00	197	DMR	5.0	A	AO>A	130	16.3	94.9	111.2	95	178	Rail speed;caught late/Vied between; tired/ Duel pace;yielded
			6.0	11 11	GET BACK	1>6	8113	S>S,T>T	**Step slow;sent ins;wkn (91)** DROP SWITCH Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 1-hole. Fast last race (12).Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH!BTL HORSE Clear early.Class Change -21 Finished 6 from post 1 TJW= 37	ERR	0	91	1	79	5	90	-8	82	3.10	6.00	0.52	1.30	7.50	0.17	101	0	81	91,0,0,0,82	91	30	91.0	E/P	3	0	12.00	185	DMR	5.0	A	N>A	135	10.8	90.4	101.2	101	182	Step slow;sent ins;wkn/ /
			6.0	8 8	HOT BOX	6>8	17576	S>S,T>T	**3-4wd;pinched midstr (87)** Class Change -21 Finished 8 from post 6 TJW= 26	89	3	89	8	85	10	88	-8	80	2.70	5.10	0.54	2.20	4.40	0.50	96	0	82	87,86,90,85,93	93	30	88.0	E	5	0	12.00	195	DMR	5.0	A	N>A	135	14.4	93.6	108.0	96	178	3-4wd;pinched midstr/ Set pace 2-3wd;weaknd/ Brk out/bpd;speed;held
			6.0	5 5	CLASSIER	3>5	26740	R>S,D>T	**Duel outside tired (53)** Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 3-hole.SLR?-38 Slow last race (29). 1st off 353 day layoff.Class Change 0 Finished 5 from post 3 TJW= 53	ERR	0	ERR	0	82	6	86	52	138	3.40	4.90	0.70	ERR	ERR	ERR	99	98	23	53,91,90,78,87	0	353	78.0	E	1	0	5.00	211	SA	8.0	A	AO>A	126	12.2	80.9	93.1	197	220	Duel outside tired/ 3wd;mvmd out; no rally/ Set pace; held gamely
			6.0	10 10	JETOVATOR	5>9	11838	S>S,T>T	**Bk slw/bpd;awkwrld xing (82)** Made a big move early (4). 1st off 78 day layoff.Class Change -21 Finished 9 from post 5 TJW= 25	89	7	89	7	89	10	94	91	184	4.40	4.50	0.98	3.70	4.40	0.82	88	101	72	82,90,86,89,96	96	78	86.0	E/P	4	0	5.00	206	SA	6.5	A	N>A	133	14.1	93.1	107.2	189	261	Bk slw/bpd;awkwrld xing/ Step slow;bid 3dp;held/ Slight hop;jumped dirt
			6.0	2 2	RESPECT	3>7	10114	S>S,T>T	**Bmpd st;2-3w;drftd str (90)** Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 3-hole. Class Change -21 Finished 7 from post 3 TJW= 26	88	3	88	5	83	9	88	-8	80	4.90	4.90	1.00	3.90	3.90	1.00	97	0	84	90,91,86,87,86	91	30	89.0	E/P	7	0	12.00	192	DMR	5.0	A	N>A	135	15.1	93.6	108.7	97	181	Bmpd st;2-3w;drftd str/ Bpd st;vied 3dp;dug in/ Outside;luggd out xing
			6.0	12 12	FIGURETI	1>5	4492	R>S,D>T	**Toss hd st;3w into str (84)** Made big overall move (4). *Stretch gain (.25). 1st off 38 day layoff.2 races in one pattern.Class Change 4 Finished 5 from post 1 TJW= 33	ERR	0	ERR	0	84	5	81	88	168	8.00	6.90	1.17	ERR	ERR	ERR	70	77	95	84,91,89,74,84	0	38	88.0	P	0	0	15.00	202	DMR	8.0	A	AO>A	127	15.7	88.2	103.8	147	242	Toss hd st;3w into str/ Stalked 3deep;no match/ Stp slw;lost path erly
			6.0	7 7	ZOFFARELLI	8>4	7818	R>S,T>T	**2wd;angled out;evenly (90)** *Stretch gain (.5).BTL HORSE Class Change 4 Finished 4 from post 8 TJW= 35	92	2	89	4	89	10	80	99	179	6.60	4.80	1.37	5.70	4.90	1.17	86	90	90	90,86,92,86,91	92	29	89.0	P	0	0	10.00	211	DMR	8.5	A	AO>A	137	15.8	89.9	105.7	176	266	2wd;angled out;evenly/ Lacked room uppr81/16/ Fanned 7-8d into str
			6.0	1 1	COULTHARD	7>5	12687	S>S,T>T	**Checked early; 2-3wd (92)** DROP SWITCH *Stretch gain (1.75).BTL HORSE 2 races in one pattern.Class Change -21 Finished 5 from post 7 TJW= 39	89	6	90	9	90	10	86	-8	78	6.40	4.40	1.45	6.50	4.50	1.43	91	0	91	92,92,94,91,87	94	30	93.0	P	0	0	4.00	211	DMR	5.0	A	N>A	146	16.4	95.0	111.3	91	182	Checked early; 2-3wd/ Bmpd/forced out xing/ Settled;3dp;4w;edgd2nd
			6.0	13 13	COMMANDER	6>4	10215	S>S,T>T	**2-3wd;angled out str (88)** Made big overall move (4). *Stretch gain (.25).BTL HORSE 1st off 57 day layoff.Class Change 9 Finished 4 from post 6 TJW= 21	89	7	89	10	89	10	91	60	151	7.20	4.90	1.49	7.20	4.90	1.49	82	93	87	88,93,89,88,83	95	57	90.0	P	0	0	10.00	208	SA	6.5	A	AO>A	140	15.1	96.4	111.6	175	262	2-3wd;angled out str/ Bobbled brk;forced out/ Ins-2wd;traffic upper
			6.0	9 9	YENG AGAIN	5>1	20540	S>S,T>T	**Carried wide;drove clr (89)** Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 5-hole.BTL HORSE 1st off 85 day layoff.Class Change 9 Finished 1 from post 5 TJW= 29	89	1	90	3	89	5	95	59	154	3.40	2.30	1.50	3.30	1.30	2.50	93	98	84	89,94,87,85,92	94	85	90.0	E/P	5	0	4.00	180	SA	6.5	A	A>A	140	17.1	97.2	114.4	191	275	Carried wide;drove clr/ Bumped early; late run/ Bid outside; drove clr
			6.0	14 14	HEMBREE	6>5	22668	R>S,T>T	**Inside;2wd;no threat (89)** DROP SWITCH *Stretch gain (2). 1st off 695 day layoff.2 races in one pattern.Class Change -20 Finished 5 from post 6 TJW= 33	95	1	95	1	95	10	81	61	142	7.20	4.00	1.79	10.00	1.40	7.00	74	85	94	89,95,93,100,97	95	695	92.0	S	0	0	4.00	223	SA	8.0	A	G3>A	146	17.2	91.7	108.9	159	253	Inside;2wd;no threat/ Svd ground; rail rally/ 3wd turn;bid/drift out
			6.0	4 4	MOTORIOUS	10>1	7996	S>S,T>T	**Step slow;3-4w;surgd (89)** Made big overall move (6).BTL HORSE 1st off 36 day layoff.Class Change 4 Finished 1 from post 10 TJW= 43	34	5	86	3	86	3	86	-7	79	6.50	2.30	2.84	6.50	2.30	2.84	87	0	94	89,79,90,0,0	90	36	86.0	S	0	0	2.50	199	DMR	5.0	A	AO>A	143	16.6	96.6	113.2	87	181	Step slow;3-4w;surgd/ Bpd/lost path st;3-6wd/ Off slow;3deep;tip out
			6.0	6 6	MAGLEV	1>1	14589	S>S,T>T	**Bit slow;3-4wd;clear (90)** Made big overall move (6).BTL HORSE 1st off 337 day layoff.Class Change -4 Finished 1 from post 1 TJW= 34	23	4	90	1	89	2	80	61	140	7.60	1.80	4.33	7.50	1.30	6.00	84	87	97	90,87,0,0,0	90	337	89.0	S	0	0	3.00	217	SA	6.5	A	N>A	139	17.6	93.0	110.6	171	268	Bit slow;3-4wd;clear/ Off slow;lack room 2nd/

4.6.1
\$4.80

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	PPOT	AEPS	LAST DS	NOTES FROM LAST RACE	SPD	SPD	AVG	LAST FIVE											HIGH		ERLY		TOTL	TOTL	COMMENTS																	
										110	#110	TDS	#TDS	SPD	#R	S1	S2	TOT	SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	TDS1	TDS2	CLOSE	E1	E2	LP	SPEED	RATINGS		ATDS	DSL	AVG3	BRIS	P	EQUIP	MLINE	CLS	TRK	DIS	TYPE	CHNG	PMR	CLASS	FINAL	COMB	PACE
1/2/23	SA	9	8.0	3 3	ODONATA	2>4	5470	R>R,D>D	**Pressed 2w;btw;flatnd (84)** DROP SWITCH Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 2-hole.Uncharacteristic race?BTL HORSE 1st off 38 day layoff.Class Change -3 Finished 4 from post 2 TJW= 30	78	4	78	4	79	6	85	83	167	4.30	5.20	0.83	4.40	5.30	0.82	79	86	85	84,90,57,81,80	90	38	77.0	E	5	0	15.00	178	DMR	8.0	S	S>S	125	15.0	86.4	101.4	165	250	Pressed 2w;btw;flatnd/Bid midstr;turned away/Brk in;bpd;2-3w;faded
			8.0	7 7	BOLT	5>5	950	R>R,T>D	**2-3w;shftd out/bpd upr (84)** Chased Pace. Fast last race (14).BTL HORSE Class Change -3 Finished 5 from post 5 TJW= 29	ERR	0	ERR	0	70	2	83	90	173	5.80	6.80	0.85	ERR	ERR	ERR	92	96	76	84,55,0,0,0	0	29	70.0	P	5	0	15.00	170	DMR	8.0	S	S>S	116	10.7	88.3	99.0	188	264	2-3w;shftd out/bpd upr/Brushed st;ins;weaknd/
			8.0	5 5	HABEAS	8>7	500	S>R,D>D	**4-5wide; no impact (61)** 1st off 64 day layoff.Class Change 2 Finished 7 from post 8 TJW= 35	ERR	0	ERR	0	61	1	88	70	158	7.50	8.80	0.86	ERR	ERR	ERR	89	83	63	61,0,0,0,0	0	64	61.0	NA	6	0	12.00	167	SA	6.5	S	S>S	112	10.7	87.7	98.5	172	235	4-5wide; no impact/ /
			8.0	10 10	FLAT ON	1>7	500	S>R,D>D	**Off slw/brk in;climbed (64)** DROP SWITCH *Stretch gain (2.5). 1st off 50 day layoff.Class Change -3 Finished 7 from post 1 TJW= 22	ERR	0	ERR	0	64	1	72	85	157	10.00	10.00	1.00	ERR	ERR	ERR	60	58	94	64,0,0,0,0	0	50	64.0	NA	1	BON	20.00	172	DMR	6.0	S	S>S	103	7.2	89.0	96.2	118	212	Off slw/brk in;climbed/ /
			8.0	1 1	MR FISK	6>2	7250	R>R,D>D	**4-2wd 1st; up for 2nd (87)** Flashed speed. *Stretch gain (3.25). Fast last race (11).BTL HORSE 1st off 38 day layoff.Class Change -3 Finished 2 from post 6 TJW= 53	87	1	87	1	76	2	83	87	169	5.60	5.00	1.13	5.00	2.50	2.00	77	82	93	87,64,0,0,0	87	38	76.0	P	5	0	3.00	170	DMR	8.0	S	S>S	123	14.5	88.0	102.6	159	252	4-2wd 1st; up for 2nd/Chased 3-2wd; faded/
			8.0	6 6	NAVY MAN	7>2	10660	S>R,D>D	**3w;drifted str;gaining (87)** DROP SWITCH Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 7-hole. *Stretch gain (2.75).BTL HORSE 1st off 50 day layoff.Class Change -3 Finished 2 from post 7 TJW= 33	ERR	0	ERR	0	85	2	89	83	172	4.30	3.60	1.20	ERR	ERR	ERR	90	93	88	87,83,0,0,0	0	50	85.0	P	6	0	3.50	170	DMR	6.0	S	S>S	125	16.1	92.7	108.8	183	271	3w;drifted str;gaining/Chased inside;clear3rd/
			8.0	8 8	RIVERSIDE	4>3	7415	R>R,D>D	**3wd;willingly;edged2nd (87)** Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 4-hole. *Stretch gain (.75).BTL HORSE 1st off 38 day layoff.2 races in one pattern.Class Change -3 Finished 3 from post 4 TJW= 39	84	3	84	3	82	4	86	85	170	5.00	3.90	1.29	3.30	3.30	1.00	78	87	88	87,83,81,76,0	87	38	84.0	E	4	0	3.50	173	DMR	8.0	S	S>S	125	16.3	87.9	104.1	165	253	3wd;willingly;edged2nd/Ins;2wd;drifted str/ Off slw;steady;ins;3w
			8.0	9 9	EXCEL	6>4	2820	R>R,D>D	**Bk slw;2w;5-4w;drifted (77)** Made big overall move (5). *Stretch gain (5). Big late move (5). Class Change 12 Finished 4 from post 6 TJW= 26	77	1	77	1	77	1	77	88	164	7.80	4.40	1.75	7.80	4.40	1.75	66	59	100	77,0,0,0,0	77	23	77.0	NA	0	0	12.00	157	LRC	8.0	S	S>S	113	7.5	87.7	95.2	125	225	Bk slw;2w;5-4w;drifted/ /
			8.0	4 4	HARLOCAP	9>2	14000	S>R,D>D	**Off slw;5-4dp;angld in (85)** Flashed speed. *Stretch gain (.5). 1st off 37 day layoff.Class Change -3 Finished 2 from post 9 TJW= 45	ERR	0	ERR	0	85	1	90	76	166	4.40	2.20	2.00	ERR	ERR	ERR	94	98	80	85,0,0,0,0	0	37	85.0	E	6	0	3.50	172	DMR	6.5	S	S>S	130	15.8	91.6	107.4	192	272	Off slw;5-4dp;angld in/ /

1.4.10
\$7.40

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	PPOT	AEPS	LAST DS	NOTES FROM LAST RACE	SPD	SPD	AVG											HIGH					ERLY TOTL		COMMENTS																		
										110	#110	TDS	#TDS	SPD	#R	S1	S2	TOT	SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	TDS1	TDS2	CLOSE	E1	E2	LP	SPEED	RATINGS		ATDS	DSL	AVG3	BRIS	P	EQUIP	MLINE	CLS	TRK	DIS	TYPE	CHNG	PMR	CLASS	FINAL	COMB	TOTL	LAST
1/2/23	SA	10	8.0	3	3	BEEF	3>2	9358	R>R,D>T	**Outsd;btwn;clear;yield (91)** Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 3-hole. Clear early.Class Change 19 Finished 2 from post 3 TJW= 33	85	2	84	4	82	10	89	82	170	3.00	4.10	0.72	1.40	3.80	0.36	93	95	88	91,86,85,83,84	86	16	87.0	E	6	0	8.00	184	LRC	8.0	A	AO>A	134	17.2	88.2	105.3	188	276	Outsd;btwn;clear;yield/2wd;drifted out midstr/4-3w;de;moved out str
			8.0	2	2	BALLADEER	5>4	9128	R>R,T>T	**Sent;headed 1/4;wknd (83)** Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 5-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH!BTL HORSE Clear early.1st off 59 day layoff.Class Change 9 Finished 4 from post 5 TJW= 26	80	5	82	6	82	9	96	94	189	4.40	5.60	0.79	4.20	5.80	0.74	94	93	77	83,91,85,79,90	91	59	86.0	E	8	0	12.00	185	SA	8.0	A	AO>A	129	16.2	89.2	105.4	187	264	Sent;headed 1/4;wknd/Ins;gve way grudgingly/Opened up; run down
			8.0	8	8	EVAN	6>7	17158	R>R,T>T	**Pace;vied inside;weakn (85)**THIRD OFF MAYBE? Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 6-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH! Clear early.Class Change -24 Finished 7 from post 6 TJW= 31	81	3	82	4	82	6	73	100	173	2.70	3.00	0.88	2.60	3.10	0.83	80	85	83	85,82,80,80,82	85	30	82.0	E/P	6	0	4.00	187	DMR	9.0	A	G1>A	139	11.7	86.9	98.6	165	248	Pace;vied inside;weakn/In hand ins; held clr/4wd bid3/8;caught late
			8.0	1	1	TIO MAGICO	9>2	14118	R>R,T>T	**3deep;3-5w;closed well (89)** Made big overall move (4). *Stretch gain (3).BTL HORSE 1st off 37 day layoff.Class Change 4 Finished 2 from post 9 TJW= 32	81	3	81	3	84	10	78	94	171	5.10	5.10	1.00	5.80	5.40	1.07	84	90	88	89,90,86,85,83	89	37	88.0	E/P	5	0	6.00	204	DMR	8.5	A	AO>A	139	17.3	89.2	106.5	174	262	3deep;3-5w;closed well/Step slw;4-3w;traffc1/8/Step slw;tight1/2-7/16
			8.0	6	6	DEGREE OF	9>7	10550	R>R,T>T	**Stdy1st;bpd2x/chck str (81)** DROP SWITCH Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 9-hole. 1st off 52 day layoff.Class Change -4 Finished 7 from post 9 TJW= 28	86	5	87	6	85	10	74	97	170	4.80	4.60	1.03	4.50	5.00	0.89	69	73	92	81,87,88,83,72	93	52	85.0	P	3	0	6.00	209	DMR	8.0	A	N>A	134	13.9	86.0	99.9	142	234	Stdy1st;bpd2x/chck str/2wd;3-4wd;no late kick/2w;3w;rally;outclosed
			8.0	10	10	EXALTED	4>4	14133	R>R,D>T	**Bpd btw st;bid 3dp;wkn (89)** Flashed speed. 1st off 57 day layoff.Class Change 9 Finished 4 from post 4 TJW= 36	ERR	0	ERR	0	91	10	83	84	166	5.30	4.10	1.30	ERR	ERR	ERR	82	88	92	89,92,93,93,90	0	57	91.0	E/P	6	0	6.00	203	SA	8.0	A	AO>A	133	17.0	86.9	103.9	170	262	Bpd btw st;bid 3dp;wkn/Boxd in 3/8;lug in upr/4-5wd; needed more
			8.0	5	5	AGATINO	3>3	3056	R>R,T>T	**Stdy early;lack rm2nd (89)**THIRD OFF MAYBE? Made big overall move (4). *Stretch gain (1).BTL HORSE 1st off 37 day layoff.Class Change 4 Finished 3 from post 3 TJW= 43	43	4	86	2	86	2	78	93	170	7.10	4.70	1.50	7.10	4.70	1.50	82	90	87	89,82,0,0,0	89	37	86.0	S	0	BON	4.00	199	DMR	8.5	A	AO>A	136	17.1	89.1	106.3	172	259	Stdy early;lack rm2nd/Off slow;2w;ins;kpt on/
			8.0	4	4	WEEGEE	1>1	7598	R>R,T>T	**Swung 4w;going away (88)** Made big overall move (4).BTL HORSE 1st off 57 day layoff.Class Change 39 Finished 1 from post 1 TJW= 32	81	5	82	6	80	10	70	65	134	7.40	4.40	1.70	7.60	3.80	2.00	71	73	100	88,90,90,79,79	90	57	89.0	S	0	0	3.00	148	SA	9.0	A	R>A	137	17.5	88.5	106.0	144	244	Swung 4w;going away/Rallied 5deep; missed/Bpd st;3-4w 2nd;best
			8.0	9	9	SEVEN	10>5	10416	R>R,T>T	**Off slow;2-3w;angl out (86)** Made big overall move (5). *Stretch gain (3.5).BTL HORSE 1st off 37 day layoff.2 races in one pattern.Class Change 4 Finished 5 from post 10 TJW= 26	84	4	84	5	84	5	76	94	169	8.80	4.90	1.80	8.80	4.90	1.80	76	85	88	86,85,86,86,78	86	37	86.0	S	0	BON	12.00	198	DMR	8.5	A	AO>A	133	15.4	87.2	102.6	161	249	Off slow;2-3w;angl out/Scrambled st;pausd3/16/Bp/bit rank;ins;imprvd

10.4.8
\$19.00