avg

AVG ASP ASP AVG EARLY race BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE DST SURF MOVING? SPD R# TDS RT 110 RD LASTS5 SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDS1 TDS2 CLOSE BROT1 BROT2 E1 E2 LATE CLOSE TOTAL Last DSLR BTOT rtng LRR POWER MLINE LAST FIVE FIGS TIW% CLS COMMENT OVERAL LAST TOTALS
1/16/23 FG 1 6.0 4 4 GILDED S>S D>D PP/WATCH/Y(7>7) Class Change 4 63 10 6310 63 6 62 7.1 6.1 1.2 7.1 6.1 1.256.8054.14 8 85 64 ©.75 171 235 43 235 120 120 100.4 12.00 60,65,62,50,64 38 120 Fog; no impact 249 257 506
6.0 8 8 COMMERCI S>S D>D BTL/BOM:6/BM1:3/BM2:8/BM++/SG:3.75/ 63 106 64 8 64 8 61 6.0 49 1.2 6.6 4.5 1.5 52.97 55.30 71 75 81 1.8 146 227 18 227 141 120 110.7 2.50 66,71,47,72,68 140 141 Clip behnd;surged;miss 255 266 521
Y(5>2) Class Change 4
6.0 6 6 ENDURING S>S D>D CP/WATCH/Y(7>2) Class Change 4 63 10 6310 63 4 70 4.8 5.2 0.9 4.8 5.2 0.957.9253.72 94 92 70 ©.76 186 256 18 256 141 120 112.5 4.00 71,71,69,66,62 167 141 Stalk 2-3p;led;outkckd 256 292 548
6.0 1 1BET ON S>S D>D F/PP/UN?/Y(1>1) Class Change @ 61 5 61 5 61 5 61 2.3 1.8 1.3 2.3 1.8 1.357.5953.44 99 82 75 ©.91 172 247 11 247 115 124 107.5 3.50 68,64,51,67,56 165 115 Clrd/shft out upr;drft 251 281 532
6.0 7 7 KASEN'S S>S D>D BOM:3/N(4>4) Class Change 4 5910 59 16 59 5 50 4.8 5.6 0.9 4.8 5.6 ©.953.4054.39 73 74 64 0.86 147 211 18 211 129 120 98.1 8.00 51,46,52,67,59 57 129 Pinched/clipd heels st 239 224 464
6.0 3 3 CHARLIE' S>S D>D F/PP/WATCH/Y(6>4) Class Change 4 58 8 55 5 61 2 50 2.7 5.5 0.5 3.2 5.5 0.659.76 53.08 101 96 50 .52 197 247 18 247 135 120 105.9 12.00 58,48,43,75,68 107 135 Cleard;headed 1/8;wknd 242 259 501
6.0 2 2 CANDY'S S>S D>D SP-21/SLR?- 38N(9>9) Class Change 56 10 60 8 60 8 54 4.4 6.0 0.7 4.3 5.2 0.855.7454.28 8 71 52 0©.73 156 208 21 208 145 195 105.6 3.00 35,73,54,74,41 146 145 Slight bobble;4w;faded 273 188 462
-71
6.0 5 5 AMERICAN S>S D>D F/Y(7>8) Class Change 4 56 106 56 10 57 5 49 6.0 7.9 0.8 6.0 7.9 0.853.9953.31 8 76 59 0.78 160 219 30 219 122 120 101.1 20.00 53,56,39,40,53 62 122 Steadied early;wknd 235 233 468
avg
AVG AsP AsP AVG EARLY race BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE DST SURF MOVING? SPD R# TDS RT 110 RD LASTS5 SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDS1 TDS2 CLOSE BROT1 BROT2 E1 E2 LATE CLOSE TOTAL Last DSLR BTOT rtng LRR POWER MLINE LAST FIVE FIGS TIW% CLS COMMENT OVERAL LAST TOTALS
1/16/23 FG 2 6.0 2 2 LITTLE R>S D>D F/PP/FLR+12_WATCH/Y(1>6) Class 59 4 55 2 55 2 57 8.2 8.2 1.0 9.3 7.9 1.254.04 47.48 85 73 48 0.66 158 206 28 294 151 165 101.9 3.50 57,45,69,64,0 62 151 Antsy gt;ins;gave way 309 292 601
Change -55
6.0 1 1 HIGHER S>S D>D UN?/N(3>3) Class Change © 5 6 59 6 59 6 55 4.8 5.4 0.9 4.8 5.4 0.957.3754.10 8 86 63 0.73 175 238 45 238 113 110 98.9 6.00 61,57,46,66,60 29 113 Stalk 2w;yield;left 1d 279 324 603
6.0 4 4 MARIA R>S D>D N(1>7) Class Change -50 56 7 55 4 58 2 35 9.2 6.8 1.4 8.7 5.0 1.751.1451.00 68 58 60 1.03 126 186 9 263 146 160 96.7 4.00 51,58,-3,66,62 249 143 Trailed throughout 295 262 557
6.0 6 6 KEEP S>S D>D  F/Y(2>3) Class Change -1 56 5 53 2 53 2 56 2.4 5.6 0.4 4.3 5.0 0.957.7453.106 91 82 59 ©.72 173 232 24 232 130 111 100.6 6.00 54,51,63,51,59 126 130 Brk out;ins;vied place 273 3e1 574
6.0 7 7 SHE'S R>S D>D F/SLR?- 14WATCH/Y(4>9) Class Change 55 10 53 5 53 5 59 8.9 85 1.1 9.8 8.3 1.253.6345.79 94 82 33 0.40 176 209 16 300 175 161 106.0 3.00 53,67,58,59,53 101 175 Press 2w;yield7/16;wkn 300 283 582
-51
6.0 3 3 SWEETASB S>S D>D N(5>9) Class Change -55 53 2 53 1 53 1 53 8.8 9.4 0.9 8.910.0 0.955.4952.09 8 66 73 1.11 146 219 25 219 150 165 94.5 6.00 53,53,0,0,0 3 150 Bumped btw/crowded stu 288 289 577
6.0 5 5 CORONA S>S D>D UN?/N(2>7) Class Change -16 48 7 46 6 48 3 46 4.2 6.7 ©.6 4.9 7.6 0.657.4452.67 8 78 46 ©0.59 167 213 44 213 134 126 94.6 6.00 40,37,61,62,44 41 134 2w;wknd 3wbtwl/4;drift 256 250 506
avg
AVG ASP ASP AVG EARLY race BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE DST SURF MOVING? SPD R# TDS RT 110 RD LAST5 SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDS1 TDS2 CLOSE BROT1 BROT2 E1 E2 LATE CLOSE TOTAL Last DSLR BTOT rtng LRR POWER MLINE LAST FIVE FIGS TIW% CLS COMMENT OVERAL LAST TOTALS
1/16/23 FG 3 6.0 5 5 CHROME R>S D>D F/Y(1>6) Class Change -33 75 5 77 4 77 3 74 5.3 4.7 1.1 4.8 3.8 1.353.4851.38 83 78 66 0.85 161 227 312 310 159 163 111.9 3.00 70,78,74,78,76 165 159 Stalk ins;gave way3/8 274 253 528
6.0 2 2 BALI S>S D>D  F/PP/Y(3>7) Class Change -35 71 4 63 1 63 1 79 2.0 6.0 0.3 3.3 7.8 0.457.5453.57 8 81 71 0.88 170 241 25 241 177 165 110.8 6.00 63,73,75,74,0 150 177 Stalkd ins;chasd;faded 267 247 514
6.0 1 1 ONE MORE S>S D>D F/PP/WATCH/Y(4>2) Class Change -35 70 4 73 2 75 1 67 3.6 3.8 ©.9 1.2 2.4 0.558.3053.79 92 8 81 ©.94 178 259 25 259 156 165 111.7 3.50 75,70,56,77,0 42 156 Brk out;2p;no match1l/8 266 280 545
6.0 4 4 CARNELIA S>S D>D BTL/WATCH/* 2 in 1 *Y(4>2) Class 66 4 66 4 66 4 69 4.5 5.2 0.9 4.5 5.2 0.958.3856.15 94 87 70 ©.80 181 251 180 251 149 125 112.4 4.00 67,65,76,57,0 171 149 Stk3p;3p trn;caught 242 260 502
Change 5
6.0 3 3 WAR S>S D>D  SG:1.5/N(8>3) Class Change © 65 5 65 5 65 4 69 7.1 46 1.6 7.1 4.6 1.655.16 57.29 78 79 85 1.8 157 242 312 242 128 130 105.3 6.00 74,67,66,56,63 88 128 Late run for 3rd spot 238 269 507
6.0 8 8 TERRANOV S>S D>D F/PP/Y(9>8) Class Change -35 64 8 62 6 62 6 55 3.8 6.6 0.6 3.2 6.5 0.557.5453.57 8 82 61 0.74 171 232 25 232 173 165 109.6 12.00 56,50,60,76,61 54 173 Chsd 2w-3p;wkn btw upr 253 229 482
6.0 7 7 JACKIE R>S D>D F/PP/WATCH/Y(4>3) Class Change 20 63 8 65 4 66 3 62 4.6 5.8 0.8 5.2 5.2 1.054.3850.79 85 77 59 ©.77 162 221 10 307 139 110 107.2 8.00 63,61,62,60,64 282 139 Vied 2w;clrd;yield btw 227 237 463
6.0 6 6 DUXONTHE S>S D>D FLR+55_WATCH/N(5>5) Class Change 55 1 55 1 55 1 55 10.0 10.0 1.0 10.0 10.0 1.0 57.72 54.05 88 80 62 0.78 168 230 344 230 168 168 101.8 8.00 55,0,0,0,0 140 168 3-2wide; tired 233 226 459
-38
avg
AVG AsSP ASP AVG EARLY race BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE DST SURF MOVING? SPD R# TDS RT 110 RD LAST5 SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDS1 TDS2 CLOSE BROT1 BROT2 E1 E2 LATE CLOSE TOTAL Last DSLR BTOT rtng LRR POWER MLINE LAST FIVE FIGS TIW% CLS COMMENT OVERAL LAST TOTALS
1/16/23 FG 4 8.5 3 3 ROYAL S>R D>D F/PP/FLR+97_ESP/Y(5>1) Class Change 97 1 ERR © ERR © 97 1.1 1.1 1.0 ERR ERR ERR 55.39 56.43 84 89 104 1.17 173 277 52 277 190 190 129.1 3.00 97,0,0,0,0 97 190 Inside; held edge 384 385 769
4
8.5 2 2 NON S>R D>D BOM:4/FLR+84_Y(7>1) Class Change 29 84 1 ERR © ERR © 84 4.4 1.1 4.0 ERR ERR ERR 56.80 54.12 86 81 96 1.19 167 263 25 263 165 165 123.2 2.50 84,0,0,0,0 198 165 Pinchd st;4-5p;clrdl/8 340 349 689
8.5 4 4 3JUDY'S R>R D>D CP/FLR+21_UN?/Y(2>3) Class Change 4 76 106 77 7 77 7 73 6.2 49 1.3 6.0 5.3 1.152.3153.03 69 75 83 1.11 144 227 25 305 170 190 119.3 4.50 78,57,85,74,75 139 170 Ins;3w3/4;chsd;outkckd 333 313 645
8.5 5 5 CHAMPAGN S>R D>D BOM:5/N(5>2) Class Change @ 76 10 81 3 81 3 71 5.4 5.1 1.1 4.1 3.6 1.157.1254.75 89 99 70 0.78 179 249 15 249 174 194 116.3 4.50 70,71,71,79,65 95 174 3p;shiftd out;stayd on 332 311 643
8.5 6 6 ZING S>R D>D BOM:7/SG:4.25/FLR+12_N(7>3) Class 74 9 75 6 75 6 70 5.7 4.2 1.4 5.0 3.9 1.352.6957.34 71 78 91 1.17 149 240 74 240 172 153 115.9 6.00 81,69,61,76,77 123 172 8p upr;rally;missd plc 309 328 636
Change 41
8.5 1 1 FINE R>R D>D F/PP/FLR+14_Y(2>1) Class Change 29 68 10 76 7 75 6 71 3.6 5.4 0.7 2.9 3.8 0.853.6951.00 8 70 84 1.20 152 236 28 322 177 165 116.8 4.50 76,62,76,73,84 164 177 Snug ins;split 2wl/4 302 315 617
avg
AVG ASP ASP AVG EARLY race
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE DST SURF MOVING? SPD R# TDS RT 110 RD LASTS5 SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDS1 TDS2 CLOSE BROT1 BROT2 E1 E2 LATE CLOSE TOTAL Last DSLR BTOT rtng LRR POWER MLINE LAST FIVE FIGS TOTALS
1/16/23 FG 5 6.0 2 2 BM1:4/N(3>2) Class Change 4 8 10 81 9 81 8 78 3.6 3.6 1.0 3.6 3.6 1.057.9558.18 89 99 70 ©.71 188 258 46 258 176 190 125.2 3.00 77,72,84,83,81 134 176 Ins;4pl/4;5p upr;chasd 266 261 527
6.0 7 7 BASALT S>S D>D Y(8>1) Class Change -1 79 16 78 8 78 8 79 3.9 3.3 1.2 4.5 3.6 1.357.4456.12 92 97 82 0.85 189 271 21 271 190 195 124.1 3.50 84,76,78,79,83 127 190 Aim 3wl/4;bid;duel;edg 266 279 545
6.0 6 6 SHE'S R>S D>D F/Y(5>7) Class Change -31 76 16 76 4 77 3 72 6.3 44 1.4 7.1 3.2 2.253.18 49.79 77 79 62 0.78 156 218 37 296 204 225 122.3 4.50 68,74,74,74,79 198 204 Stalk 4pbtw;faded 5/16 270 225 495
6.0 8 8 HALF KOO S>S D>D F/PP/Y(6>8) Class Change © 7416 75 9 75 8 72 2.7 5.0 0.5 2.6 4.7 0.659.22 53.81 97 93 63 ©0.68 190 253 15 253 182 194 117.1 12.00 67,72,77,78,75 81 182 Press 2w;wknd btw;shy 253 241 494
6.0 5 5 SPECIAL S>S D>D BM1:3.5/SG:.25/N(5>5) Class Change 7310 71 2 71 2 71 6.5 4.6 1.4 8.7 6.7 1.355.2857.92 77 87 77 ©.89 164 241 46 241 170 190 114.5 6.00 73,72,67,79,79 62 170 Lagged ins;stayed on 249 245 494
4
6.0 3 3 LAKE S>S D>D F/SLR?- 11Y(5>7) Class Change -16 70 16 62 6 54 3 78 1.7 3.6 0.5 1.8 4.5 0.460.5253.72 102 97 58 0.60 199 257 59 257 155 210 117.2 8.00 65,76,92,85,74 68 155 Chsd ins;wkn/drfit out 252 239 491
6.0 4 4 IRONIT S>S D>D F/PP/UN?/Y(4>4) Class Change 59 68 10 66 7 62 4 71 4.6 5.1 0.9 4.3 4.8 0.958.36 55.67 96 91 66 ©.73 187 253 43 253 149 135 112.2 12.00 65,73,74,72,66 102 149 3wd;floatd 7p1/4;wknd 221 238 458
6.0 1 1BOX OF S>S D>D F/PP/SP+12/FLR+13_Y(1>1) Class 68 8 68 7 66 6 75 4.6 5.3 0.9 4.3 4.7 0.958.3655.91 96 98 75 ©.77 194 269 43 269 168 135 116.8 4.50 80,67,78,47,59 165 168 Ins;rail bid;shft5pl/4 223 271 494

Change 59



AVG ASP ASP AVG EARLY race BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE DST SURF MOVING? SPD R# TDS RT 110 RD LASTS5 SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDS1 TDS2 CLOSE BROT1 BROT2 E1 E2 LATE CLOSE TOTAL Last DSLR BTOT rtng LRR POWER MLINE LAST FIVE FIGS TIW% CLS COMMENT OVERAL LAST TOTALS
1/16/23 FG 6 6.0 3 3 UPHOLD S>S D>D F/PP/BTL/SLR?- 11WATCH/ESP/Y(1>6) 91 4 91 4 9% 3 91 2.0 3.0 0.7 2.0 3.0 0.7 59.9257.72 101 160 77 ©.77 201 278 152 278 188 206 133.0 2.50 84,95,94,92,0 156 188 Duel;svd gnd;folded 315 293 608
Class Change -11
6.0 2 2 HIGHER S>S D>D F/PP/WATCH/Y(4>3) Class Change 4 86 10 86 10 86 10 87 4.5 5.8 0.8 4.5 5.8 0.859.4956.43 96 101 80 ©.79 197 277 25 277 207 191 130.3 3.00 88,85,89,88,96 174 207 Press winnr;no mtchl/4 299 299 598
6.0 5 5 OMAHA S>S D>D F/FLR+22_Y(2>2) Class Change 4 85 10 85 10 85 10 81 4.3 3.9 1.1 4.3 3.9 1.159.2255.49 95 9 90 ©0.94 191 281 25 281 181 191 126.4 4.00 91,69,82,81,96 168 181 Chasd 2p;3w3/16;stayed 295 306 602
6.0 7 7 AWE S>S T>D F/PP/Y(6>4) Class Change 34 810 75 1 75 1 83 3.5 5.1 0.7 3.8 7.5 0.555.11 57.92 94 98 79 0.81 192 271 134 271 169 161 120.3 8.00 87,87,75,86,78 143 169 4wd upper;btwn;kept on 272 294 566
6.0 6 6 BROKEN S>S D>D BTL/BOM:4/BM1:3/N(3>6) Class Change 80 9 84 5 84 4 8 4.8 5.1 1.0 5.0 3.9 1.354.6156.24 81 89 91 1.02 170 261 37 261 184 216 125.3 4.00 86,84,85,87,84 185 184 Swung 5w 1/4; improved 295 287 582
-21
6.0 1 1 HUNTER S>S T>D F/PP/WATCH/Y(5>1) Class Change -1 76 7 73 4 77 3 76 4.0 3.8 1.0 4.1 4.1 1.059.19 56.24 91 92 88 ©.96 183 271 157 271 165 196 121.4 6.00 86,81,62,77,76 125 165 Led;2p str;held gamely 278 292 571
6.0 4 4 RUSSIAN R>S D>D F/WATCH/Y(3>5) Class Change 29 68 10 68 3 68 3 68 5.9 6.7 ©.9 7.5 7.0 1.154.03 50.06 94 80 55 ©.69 174 229 83 317 175 166 107.0 20.00 62,70,72,62,66 31 175 Pressed pace; faded 245 229 473
avg
AVG AsP AsP AVG EARLY race BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE DST SURF MOVING? SPD R# TDS RT 110 RD LASTS5 SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDS1 TDS2 CLOSE BROT1 BROT2 E1 E2 LATE CLOSE TOTAL Last DSLR BTOT rtng LRR POWER MLINE LAST FIVE FIGS TIW% CLS COMMENT OVERAL LAST TOTALS
1/16/23 FG 7 8.5 13 13 DESERT R>R D>T F/PP/WATCH/ESP/Y(1>3) Class Change 76 2 ERR © ERR © 76 3.1 3.8 0.8 ERR ERR ERR 55.00 51.12 76 75 74 .99 151 225 93 304 184 181 119.5 6.00 71,80,0,0,0 181 184 3-2w under pressure 137 133 270
-18
8.5 1 1 LA PERLA S>R D>T N(5>8) Class Change -23 73 2 ERR O ERR © 73 3.9 5.2 0.8 ERR ERR ERR 56.10 55.18 82 77 79 1.e3 159 238 73 238 186 186 109.8 6.00 71,74,0,0,0 140 186 Failed to make headway 132 137 270
8.5 2 2 AUDACIOU R>R T>T F/PP/UN?/Y(10>8) Class Change -23 71 4 71 2 71 2 70 4.8 4.1 1.2 4.6 4.6 1.053.9750.36 8 72 72 1.00 158 230 92 317 181 186 113.4 5.00 70,71,69,72,0 97 181 2-3w;bid upr;faltrdl/8 132 134 265
8.5 4 4 GOLDEN S>R T>T CP/SG:1/FLR+71_Y(3>2) Class Change 71 1 ERR © ERR © 71 4.0 2.0 2.0 ERR ERR ERR56.9256.31 © 8 73 0.82 89 162 65 162 146 146 107.3 6.00 71,0,0,0,0 185 146 Stalked rail; st'd3/8 123 115 238
17
8.5 14 14 BOLTORO R>R D>T F/PP/BTL/SG:.25/* 2 in 1 *Y(1>5) 70 4 74 2 74 2 71 5.9 43 1.4 5.7 2.2 2.652.4250.79 65 59 78 1.32 124 202 33 278 182 171 123.4 3.00 67,72,75,65,0 193 182 Angled out evenly late 131 123 254
Class Change -8
8.5 6 6 DON'T GO R>R T>T N(2>7) Class Change -23 79 2 706 2 70 2 70 5.9 45 1.3 5.9 4.5 1.354.8351.22 76 69 74 1.07 145 219 130 296 176 186 109.9 6.00 67,73,0,0,0 79 176 Inside; lacked rally 130 128 257
8.5 7 7 BEST R>R D>T N(5>5) Class Change 2 69 2 73 1 73 1 69 4.2 6.3 0.7 3.3 5.8 0.653.6549.79 75 75 60 0.80 150 210 38 288 174 161 113.9 4.00 65,73,0,0,0 112 174 4p;trackd;chasd;no bid 125 123 249
8.5 11 11 CUSHEE R>R D>T FLR+68_N(3>3) Class Change 2 68 1 ERR O ERR © 68 7.1 4.3 1.7 ERR ERR ERR 52.79 50.95 74 67 73 1.09 141 214 38 291 161 161 109.2 8.00 68,0,0,0,0 112 161 2-3p;5pl/4;green upper 123 127 250
8.5 12 12 FLOWERDE R>R D>T N(8>4) Class Change 2 68 5 ERR O ERR 0 69 5.8 6.0 1.0 ERR ERR ERR 54.79 51.44 82 83 66 0.80 165 231 46 312 173 161 110.9 8.00 72,69,67,71,61 172 173 2p-ins;show bid;missed 124 136 260
8.5 8 8 JUST SAY S>R T>T BOM:7/BM1:4.5/SG:.5/N(1>5) Class 66 2 ERR O ERR 0 66 7.6 3.8 2.0 ERR ERR ERR 54.77 57.42 74 78 75 ©.96 152 227 124 227 176 186 110.7 8.00 67,64,0,0,0 197 176 Hit gate brk; 6wd 1/4 126 130 256
Change -23
8.5 16 16 CERCHI R>R D>T F/PP/FLR+16_Y(6>2) Class Change 2 66 2 ERR O ERR 0 66 3.6 2.9 1.3 ERR ERR ERR 54.09 51.54 79 79 71 ©.90 158 229 38 313 154 161 118.0 3.00 74,58,0,0,0 244 154 Press 2wd;outpaced 1/4 124 137 261
8.5 10 10 SOULTITL R>R D>T WATCH/N(7>4) Class Change 2 65 2 ERR O ERR 0 65 7.8 7.8 1.0 ERR ERR ERR 53.65 50.56 76 75 64 ©.85 151 215 38 295 174 161 107.0 10.00 67,62,0,0,0 84 174 3p;ins3/8;chs;nail shw 120 127 246
8.5 9 9 BEAUTIFU R>R D>T SP-14/SLR?- 27N(4>6) Class Change 2 63 2 76 1 76 1 63 5.3 5.9 0.9 3.0 4.0 0.850.8 50.75 62 47 61 1.30 109 170 38 243 174 161 104.0 10.00 49,76,0,0,0 105 174 Never involved 117 9% 213
8.5 15 15 ACTING S>R T>T BM2:5/SG:.5/SLR?- 15N(1>11) Class 62 2 ERR O ERR © 62 8.6 7.1 1.2 ERR ERR ERR 53.94 54.59 72 60 80 1.33 132 212 128 212 174 186 98.7 10.00 54,69,0,0,0 123 174 Step slow;no menace 119 113 232
Change -23
8.5 5 5 GIRL S>R D>T SP-14/SLR?- 28N(8>9) Class Change 61 3 ERR O ERR © 61 5.8 4.8 1.2 ERR ERR ERR 58.30 52.11 87 75 57 ©.76 162 219 78 219 173 186 105.6 4.50 47,75,62,0,0 174 173 Brkin/bmp;urgd 2w;fade 120 109 229
-23
8.5 3 3 PAINT ME R>R T>T BTL/SG:3.25/FLR+21_* 2 in 1 *Y(5>4) 61 2 71 1 71 1 61 7.4 7.6 1.1 5.5 3.6 1.552.78 49.91 70 62 84 1.35 132 216 94 299 186 186 101.9 5.00 71,50,0,0,0 124 186 Trck 2w;4w2nd;chsd btw 119 131 250
Class Change -23
avg
AVG ASP ASP AVG EARLY race BEST BEST
DATE TRK # DT PP PRG HORSE DST SURF MOVING? SPD R# TDS RT 110 RD LAST5 SYS1 SYS2 CLOSE TDS1 TDS2 CLOSE BROT1 BROT2 E1 E2 LATE CLOSE TOTAL Last DSLR BTOT rtng LRR POWER MLINE LAST FIVE FIGS TIW% CLS COMMENT OVERAL LAST TOTALS
1/16/23 FG 8 5.5 2 2 RISKTAKE S>S D>D F/Y(7>4) Class Change -59 57 7 56 6 51 4 37 6.3 6.1 1.0 5.6 5.9 1.058.2353.57 93 88 62 0.70 181 243 15 243 150 170 99.4 2.00 62,59,-11,65,67 42 150 Bobbled st;4p;no bid 326 344 670
5.5 1 1LITA S>S D>D F/FLR+47_Y(1>3) Class Change © 51 9 52 8 53 7 50 4.6 6.9 0.7 4.6 6.5 0.757.0252.42 8 76 56 0.74 164 220 24 220 107 111 87.4 6.00 47,0,52,55,49 91 107 Chasd ins-2p;no menace 270 285 554
5.5 3 3 LANDRY S>S D>D F/SP-22/SLR?- 20Y(7>10) Class 48 8 48 8 51 5 37 4.2 7.6 0.6 4.2 7.6 0.654.79 52.34 99 8 19 0.24 170 189 27 189 108 106 88.0 12.00 26,46,38,55,56 60 108 Forwardly;3p;stopped 259 202 461
Change 5
5.5 4 4 OAK HILL S>S D>D BOM:4/BM2:6.25/SG:.25/N(7>4) Class 48 3 49 2 49 2 48 9.6 6.9 1.4 9.5 5.8 1.653.5351.66 © 69 76 1.10 69 145 12 145 126 110 91.0 6.00 53,48,44,0,0 249 126 Nospeed;4wupr;rallied 263 252 515
Change 1
5.5 6 6 DIGNIFIE S>S D>D BM1:6/N(5>4) Class Change © 4110 41 9 47 7 41 5.7 6.7 ©.9 6.2 6.8 0.954.2555.14 73 73 62 ©0.85 146 208 31 208 109 111 86.6 12.00 49,51,22,44,60 105 109 Pinch/lost irons early 240 282 522
5.5 8 8 IRON R>S D>D N(1>6) Class Change -33 34 3 35 2 35 2 34 9.2 8.8 1.0 8.8 8.8 1.051.6452.80 67 55 31 0.56 122 153 278 227 158 144 81.5 12.00 31,41,29,0,0 4 158 Inside;4wd;no response 233 193 426
5.5 10 10 MINE S>S D>D BM1:3.5/SP+11/N(4>5) Class Change © 34 3 34 3 34 3 34 8.5 81 1.0 8.5 8.1 1.053.3854.01 69 64 66 1.03 133 199 31 199 109 111 80.7 20.00 45,43,15,0,0 38 109 Bump start;2w;moved up 215 265 480
5.5 9 9 WILD R>S D>D SLR?- 12N(2>8) Class Change © 28 6 25 4 39 2 37 9.0 9.0 1.0 8.5 8.9 1.051.5548.55 58 37 43 1.16 95 138 9 210 122 111 76.5 20.00 29,41,42,4,17 7 122 Botherd/shied in start 194 177 372
5.5 5 5 MR. 0>S >D  Y(0>0) ERR @ ERR ©@ ERR © ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR © © ERR o @ ikk © ERR © 3.00 0,0,0,0,0 79 ERR ERR ] ERR
5.5 7 7 PARTY 0>S >D  Y(0>0) ERR @ ERR @ ERR © ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR ERR © © ERR o @ ikk © ERR © 12.00 0,0,0,0,0 24 ERR ERR ) ERR



DATE TRK #
1/16/23 FG
DATE  TRK #

6.0

6.0

6.0

PRG

HORSE

CHARLIE'S

CANDY'S

AMERICAN

KASEN'S

ENDURING

GILDED

COMMERCIAL

BET ON

PPOT

9>9

7>8

4>4

752

7>7

552

AEPS

3431

3156

2087

2508

2367

2184

5880

$55,D5D

$55,D5D

$>S,D5D

$>S,D5D

$>S,D5D

$>S,D>D

$>S,D>D

$>S,D>D

NOTES FROM LAST RACE

**Cleard;headed 1/8;wknd (58)**| Flashed
speed. *Pressed Pace from
6-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed?
WATCH! Clear early.Class Change 4
Finished 4 from post 6 TIW= 43
**Slight bobble;4w;faded (35)**THIRD
OFF| DROP SWITCHSLR?- 38 Slow last race
(21). Class Change -71 Finished 9 from
post 9 TIW= 78

**Steadied early;wknd (53)**| Flashed
speed. Class Change 4 Finished 8 from
post 7 TIW= 42

**pinched/clipd heels st (51)**| Made
big overall move (3). Class Change 4
Finished 4 from post 4 TIW= 19

**Stalk 2-3p;led;outkckd (71)**| Chased
Pace.Uncharacteristic early speed?
WATCH!BTL HORSE Class Change 4 Finished
2 from post 7 TIW= 81

**Fog; no impact (60)**| *Pressed Pace
from 7-hole.Uncharacteristic early
speed? WATCH! 1st off 43 day
layoff.Class Change 4 Finished 7 from
post 7 TiW= 20

*%Clip behnd;surged;miss (66)**THIRD
OFF| Made big overall move (6). Made a
big move early (3). Middle move (8).
*Stretch gain (3.75). Very strong move!
Take note!BTL HORSE Class Change 4
Finished 2 from post 5 TIW= 54
**Clrd/shft out upr;drft (68)**| Flashed
speed. *Pressed Pace from
1-hole.Uncharacteristic race?BTL HORSE
Clear early.Class Change @ Finished 1
from post 1 TIW= 83

NOTES FROM LAST RACE

61

60

57

59

63

63

64

61

#110

SPD
DS

59

63

63

61

#TDS

10

10

10

10

AVG
SPD

59

63

63

63

61

#R S1 S2

10

10

10

10

10

10

78

71

78

86

82

79

83

63

63

76

78

74

84

80

TOT

140

133

154

164

156

163

163

SYs1

7.10

6.00

SYs2

7.9

5.60

4.9

CLOSE

0.73

0.75

0.86

0.93

1.16

1.23

TDS1

6.00

4.80

4.80

6.60

2.30

TDS2 CLOSE

5.50 0.58

0.82

0.75

0.86

0.93

1.16

4.50 1.46

1.29

TDS2 CLOSE

E1l

85

73

86

71

E2

71

76

74

92

85

75

82

LP

52

59

64

70

64

81

75

LAST FIVE
SPEED RATINGS

58,48,43,75,68

35,73,54,74,41

53,56,39,40,53

51,46,52,67,59

71,71,69,66,62

60,65,62,50,64

66,71,47,72,68

68,64,51,67,56

LAST FIVE
SPEED RATINGS

AVG3 BRIS P EQUIP MLINE CLS

87.3 197 247

54.0

49.0

50.0

70.0

62.0

61.0

61.0

E

p

E

E/P

BRIS

BON

BOFF

12.00

3.50

145

122

129

141

120

141

115

TRK DIS TYPE CHNG

CLASS

13.0

8.0

12.3

12.9

CLASS

81.3

78.7

81.3

85.3

79.7

84.2

88.7

ERLY
PACE

TOTL
PACE

COMB TOTL LAST

85.5

75.2

87.7

98.3

87.7

96.5

101.6

156

160

147

186

171

146

172

208

219

21

=y

256

235

22

N

24

S

COMMENTS

Cleard;headed 1/8;wknd/
Bmp;midpack;retreat/
Pressed; 2w; stopped

Slight bobble;4w;faded/
Clear 3p turn; driving/
Duel;2-3p;tired1/8

Steadied early;wknd/
Never close/ Speed;
finished early
Pinched/clipd heels st/
In middle;retreated/
Contention; faded
Stalk 2-3p;led;outkckd/
Tracked;4w; evenly/
Outfinished for second

Fog; no impact/ Wide
gain; no factor/ Improved
position

Clip behnd;surged;miss/
Fog;outkickd for place/
4p turn; outrun

Clrd/shft out upr;drft/
2w-ins;shook free;held/
Loom 3w;clrd;worn down

COMMENTS

1/16/23 FG 2

KEEP LEFT

CORONA DEL

HIGHER

SWEETASBAI

LITTLE

SHE'S

MARIA GONE

257

353

559

156

4>9

1>7

1254

1173

[

553

1343

859

$>S,D>D

$>S,D>D

$55,D5D

$55,D5D

R>S,D>D

R>S,D>D

R>S,D>D

**Brk out;ins;vied place (54)**| Flashed
speed. Class Change -1 Finished 3 from
post 2 TIW= 66

**2w;wknd 3wbtwl/4;drift (40)**| DROP
SWITCHUncharacteristic race? 1st off 44
day layoff.Class Change -16 Finished 7
from post 2 TiW= 23

**Stalk 2w;yield;left 1d
(61)**|Uncharacteristic race? 1st off 45
day layoff.Class Change © Finished 3
from post 3 TiW= 19

**Bumped btw/crowded stu (53)**| Class
Change -55 Finished 9 from post 5 TIW= 3
**Antsy gt;ins;gave way (57)**THIRD OFF|
DROP SWITCH Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace
from 1-hole.Uncharacteristic early
speed? WATCH! Class Change -55 Finished
6 from post 1 TIW= 38

**press 2w;yield7/16;wkn (53)**| DROP
SWITCH Flashed speed.SLR?-
14Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH!
Class Change -51 Finished 9 from post 4
TIW= 57

**Trailed throughout (51)**THIRD OFF|
DROP SWITCH Class Change -50 Finished 7
from post 1 TIW= 49

48

59

53

55

53

58

59

53

55

53

55

59

53

59

55

10

79

85

75

71

69

62

63

75

79

69

58

73

141

159

153

140

126

135

8.80

8.20

8.90

0.62

0.89

0.94

1.00

1.65

1.36

8.90

9.30

5.00 0.86

7.60

0.65

0.89

0.89

1.18

1.18

1.74

85

78

86

66

73

82

58

46

63

73

48

33

60

54,51,63,51,59

40,37,61,62,44

61,57,46,66,60

53,53,0,0,0

57,45,69,64,0

53,67,58,59,53

51,58,-3,66,62

BYER

ATDS DSLR
63 18
80 21
76 30
69 18
71 18
72 43
72 18
68 11
HIGH

BYER

ATDS DSLR
54 24
61 44
66 45
53 25
64 28
67 16
62 9

46.0

55.0

53.0

57.0

59.0

35.0

NA

134

113

150

80

175

143

FG 6.0 C
FG 5.5C
DED 6.5 C
FG 6.0 C
FG 6.0 C
FG 6.0 C
FG 6.0 C
FG 6.0 C
TRK DIS TYPE
FG 6.0 M
FG 6.0 M
FG 6.0 M
FG 6.0 M
FG 8.5M
FG 8.5M
HOU 8.0 M

PWR
C>C 106
A>C 106
CGC 101
CC 98
GC 112
C>C 100
GC 111
C>C  1e8
CHNG  PWR
MM 101
M>M 95
M>M 29
S>M e
S>M 102
S>M 106
S>M 97

10.5

77.7

86.4

85.8

82.6

75.0

80.7

81.4

96.8

88.0

89.9

74.5

90.4

167

175

146

158

176

126

213

238

219

206

209

186

Brk out;ins;vied place/
Ins;plc bid2pl/4;yield/
Forced pace; gave way;
2w;wknd 3wbtwl/4;drift/
Pressed; done/ Set pace;
weakened;

Stalk 2w;yield;left 1d/
Stalked inside; no bid/
Press 2w-3p;wkn btwl/4

Bumped btw/crowded stu/
Showed little/

Antsy gt;ins;gave way/
Outrun/ Bumped start; 2wd

Press 2w;yield7/16;wkn/
No impact/ Steadied;
willingly

Trailed throughout/
Voidspd;3w2nd;up3rd/
Forwrd 3w;wkn7/16;stop



DATE TRK #
1/16/23 FG
DATE  TRK #

6.0

6.0

6.0

6.0

PRG

HORSE

BALI DOVE

TERRANOVA

JACKIE

CARNELIAN

ONE MORE

DUXONTHEPO

CHROME

WAR ENSIGN

PPOT AEPS LAST DS

9>8

453

452

452

555

1>6

8>3

2658

2363

5138

5508

1020

4888

2360

$55,D5D

$55,D5D

R>S,D>D

$>S,D5D

$>S,D>D

$>S,D>D

R>S,D>D

$>S,D>D

NOTES FROM LAST RACE

**Stalkd ins;chasd;faded (63)**| Flashed
speed. *Pressed Pace from 3-hole. Class
Change -35 Finished 7 from post 3 TIW=
92

**Chsd 2w-3p;wkn btw upr (56)**THIRD OFF
MAYBE?| Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace
from 9-hole. Class Change -35 Finished 8
from post 9 TIW= 18

**Vied 2w;clrd;yield btw (63)**THIRD
OFF| Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
4-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed?
WATCH! Clear early.Class Change 20
Finished 3 from post 4 TIW= 64
**Stk3p;3p trn;caught
(67)**|Uncharacteristic early speed?
WATCH!BTL HORSE 1st off 180 day
layoff.Class Change 5 Finished 2 from
post 4 TIW= 77

**Brk out;2p;no matchl/8 (75)**| Flashed
speed. *Pressed Pace from
4-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed?
WATCH! Clear early.Class Change -35
Finished 2 from post 4 TIW= 16
**3-2wide; tired (55)**| DROP
SWITCHUncharacteristic early speed?
WATCH! 1st off 344 day layoff.Class
Change -38 Finished 5 from post 5 TIW=
64

**Stalk ins;gave way3/8 (70)**| DROP
SWITCH Flashed speed. 1st off 312 day
layoff.Class Change -33 Finished 6 from
post 1 TIW= 99

**Late run for 3rd spot (74)**| *Stretch
gain (1.5). 1st off 312 day layoff.Class
Change @ Finished 3 from post 8 TIW= 46

62

66

66

75

55

77

65

NOTES FROM LAST RACE

SPD
#110 TDS

#TDS

AVG
SPD

63 8

55 1

75 5

65 5

82

81

90

84

84

71

81

#R S1 S2

73

81

83

83

70

77

84

TOT

154

161

172

166

153

148

165

SYs1

3.80

3.60

10.00

5.30

SYs2

5.80

3.80

10.00

CLOSE

0.58

0.79

0.87

0.93

1.00

1.12

1.56

TDS1

4.50

10.00

4.80

TDS2 CLOSE

7.80 0.43

6.50

0.49

5.20 1.00

5.20

0.87

2.40

0.50

10.00

1.00

3.80 1.27

1.56

TDS2 CLOSE

E1l

85

92

88

83

78

E2

82

77

87

86

80

78

79

LP

61

59

70

81

62

66

85

LAST FIVE
SPEED RATINGS

63,73,75,74,0

56,50,60,76,61

63,61,62,60,64

67,65,76,57,0

75,70,56,77,0

55,0,0,0,0

70,78,74,78,76

74,67,66,56,63

LAST FIVE
SPEED RATINGS

55.0 E

62.0 P

69.0 E

67.0 E

55.0 NA

74.0 S

69.0 S

AVG3 BRIS

7

1

P

12.00

8.00

3.00

6.00

173

139

149

156

168

159

128

TRK DIS TYPE CHNG

S>M

M>M

M>M

S>M

S>M

PWR

107

112

112

102

112

105

CLASS

12.4

12.8

13.1

13.4

coms

87.3 98.3

84.8

93.1

84.7 97.1

90.6 103.4

85.8 98.9

87.9 96.0

85.7 99.1

91.3 103.8

ERLY
PACE
TOTL

170

171

162

181

178

168

161

157

TOTL
PACE
LAST

232

221

251

259

230

227

242

COMMENTS

Stalkd ins;chasd;faded/
Ins;headed into lane/
Pace; clear; yielded

Chsd 2w-3p;wkn btw upr/
Fast pace; caved str/
Dueled turn 2p; faded

Vied 2w;clrd;yield btw/
3p;no match;shift;wknd/
Pace inside;weakened

Stk3p;3p trn;caught/ 2wd
btw;fade 5/16;wknd/ Bump
foe start;5wd upr

Brk out;2p;no match1/8/
Clear;duel;outfinished/
Bobbl st;btwn;no factr

3-2wide; tired/ /

Stalk ins;gave way3/8/
Bump foe st;ins;3p upr/
Getting to winner late

Late run for 3rd spot/

Evenly; best of rest/
Bobbled st; 3p upper

COMMENTS

1/16/23 FG 4

ROYAL TAKE

CHAMPAGNE

JUDY'S WAY

ZING

NON

551

552

253

7>3

7>1

69000

6631

4987

6585

30000

R>R,D>D

S>R,D>D

S>R,D>D

R>R,D>D

S>R,D>D

S>R,D>D

**Snug ins;split 2wl/4 (76)**| Flashed
speed. *Pressed Pace from 2-hole.BTL
HORSE Class Change 29 Finished 1 from
post 2 TIW= 70

**Inside; held edge (97)**| Flashed
speed. *Pressed Pace from 5-hole.BTL
HORSE Clear early.1st off 52 day
layoff.Class Change 4 Finished 1 from
post 5 TIW= 47

**3p:shiftd out;stayd on (70)**| Made
big overall move (5). Class Change @
Finished 2 from post 5 TIW= 57
**Ins;3w3/4;chsd;outkckd (78)**| Chased
Pace.Uncharacteristic race? Class Change
4 Finished 3 from post 2 TIW= 35

**8p upr;rally;missd plc (81)**| Made
big overall move (7). *Stretch gain
(4.25). 1st off 74 day layoff.Class
Change 41 Finished 3 from post 7 TIW= 45
**pinchd st;4-5p;clrdl/8 (84)**| Made
big overall move (4).BTL HORSE Class
Change 29 Finished 1 from post 7 TIW= 82

75

ERR

81

77

75

ERR

© ERR

76 10

76 10

74 9

82

84

71

81

82

90

76

87

91

90

172

160

157

171

171

1.10

5.40

6.20

5.70

1.06

1.27

1.36

4.00

4.10

6.00

5.00

ERR

3.80 0.77

ERR  ERR

3.60 1.13

5.30 1.13

3.90 1.29

ERR  ERR

69

71

86

89

90

75

78

81

104

7

)

83

91

96

76,62,76,73,84

97,0,0,0,0

70,71,71,79,65

78,57,85,74,75

81,69,61,76,77

84,0,0,0,0

63 25
76 25
81 10
76 180
75 25
55 344
78 312
74 312
HIGH

BYER

ATDS DSLR
84 28
) 52
82 15
85 25
81 74
) 25

71.0 E/P

97.0 E

71.0 E

73.0 P

70.0 E/P

84.0 P

4

4.50

190

174

170

172

165

FG 6.0 M
FG 6.0 M
FG 8.0 M
CNL 6.0 M
FG 6.0 M
SA 6.0M
FG 8.5M
P 6.0M
TRK DIS TYPE
FG 8.5A
a 7.5A
FG 6.0 A
FG 8.5A
¢ 7.0A
FG 6.0 A

S>A

AO>A

AO>A

C>A

S>A

129

116

119

116

123

18.2

10.2

15.0

13.1

15.7

88.0 106.2

84.3 94.6

82.0 97.0

84.9 98.0

88.8 104.5

173

179

144

149

167

277

24

©

227

240

263

Snug ins;split 2wl/4/
Stalk 2w-3p;wknd 3/8/
2wd;led;ins pair;yield

Inside; held edge/ /

3p;shiftd out;stayd on/
Trail 4p;6p upr;imprvd/
Pressed pace; tired
Ins;3w3/4;chsd;outkckd/
3-4p;6p1/4;no0 factor/
Trck 3-4p;bid upr;clrd
8p upr;rally;missd plc/
5p;6wl/4;moved up btwn/
Inside;gave way str

Pinchd st;4-5p;clrdl/8/ /



DATE TRK #
1/16/23 FG
DATE TRK #

1/16/23 FG 6

6.0

6.0

6.0

LAKE MARIE

HALF KOO

BOX OF

IRONIT

BASALT

SPECIAL

SHE'S GONE

UPHOLD THE

AWE

HIGHER

RUSSIAN

BROKEN RIB

HUNTER

OMAHA RED

PPOT

6>8

151

4>4

352

8>1

555

557

6>4

4>3

355

356

551

252

AEPS

9282

8906

4582

8671

9742

6931

8606

4240

16890

3624

6845

12400

8876

$55,D5D

$55,D5D

$>S,D5D

$>S,D5D

$>S,D5D

$>S,D>D

$>S,D>D

R>S,D>D

$>S,D>D

$>S,T>D

$55,D5D

R>S,D>D

$55,D5D

$55,T>D

$55,D5D

NOTES FROM LAST RACE

**Chsd ins;wkn/drfit out (65)**| DROP
SWITCH Flashed speed.SLR?- 11 1st off 59
day layoff.Class Change -16 Finished 7
from post 5 TIW= 44

**press 2w;wknd btw;shy (67)**| Flashed
speed. *Pressed Pace from 6-hole. Class
Change © Finished 8 from post 6 TiW= 41
**Ins;rail bid;shft5p1/4 (80)**| Flashed
speed. *Pressed Pace from 1-hole. Fast
last race (12).BTL HORSE Clear early.lst
off 43 day layoff.Class Change 59
Finished 1 from post 1 TIW= 83

**3wd; floatd 7pl/4;wknd (65)**THIRD OFF
MAYBE?| Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace
from 4-hole.Uncharacteristic race? 1st
off 43 day layoff.Class Change 59
Finished 4 from post 4 TIW= 48
**Ins;4p1/4;5p upr;chasd (77)**| Made a
big move early (4). 1st off 46 day
layoff.Class Change 4 Finished 2 from
post 3 TIW= 70

**Aim 3wl/4;bid;duel;edg (84)**| DROP
SWITCHBTL HORSE Class Change -1 Finished
1 from post 8 TIW= 69

**Lagged ins;stayed on (73)**| Made a
big move early (3.5). *Stretch gain
(.25). 1st off 46 day layoff.Class
Change 4 Finished 5 from post 5 TIW= 28
**Stalk 4pbtw;faded 5/16 (68)**| Flashed
speed. 1st off 37 day layoff.Class
Change -31 Finished 7 from post 5 TIW=
82

75

66

62

81

78

71

77

NOTES FROM LAST RACE

**Duel;svd gnd;folded (84)**| DROP
SWITCH Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
1-hole.SLR?- 11lUncharacteristic early
speed? WATCH!BTL HORSE Clear early.lst
off 152 day layoff.Class Change -11
Finished 6 from post 1 TIW= 72

**4wd upper;btwn;kept on (87)**| Flashed
speed. *Pressed Pace from 6-hole.BTL
HORSE 1st off 134 day layoff.Class
Change 34 Finished 4 from post 6 TIW= 85
**ppress winnr;no mtchl/4 (88)**| Flashed
speed. *Pressed Pace from
4-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed?
WATCH! Class Change 4 Finished 3 from
post 4 TIW= 82

**pressed pace; faded (62)**| Flashed
speed.Uncharacteristic early speed?
WATCH! 1st off 83 day layoff.Class
Change 29 Finished 5 from post 3 TIW=
**Swung 5w 1/4; improved (86)**| DROP
SWITCH Made big overall move (4). Made a
big move early (3).BTL HORSE 1st off 37
day layoff.Class Change -21 Finished 6
from post 3 TIW= 81

**Led;2p str;held gamely (86)**| Flashed
speed. *Pressed Pace from
5-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed?
WATCH!BTL HORSE Clear early.lst off 157
day layoff.Class Change -1 Finished 1
from post 5 TIW= 61

**Chasd 2p;3w3/16;stayed (91)**| Flashed
speed. Class Change 4 Finished 2 from
post 2 TIW= 74

75

86

68

21
84

77

85

#110

10

10

SPD
DS

75

81

78

71

76

75

73

85

#TDS

10

10

AVG
SPD

74 10

10

10

10

73 10

76 10

10

10

10

7 7

85 10

86

89

89

93

86

87

69

87

92

73

82

90

90

#R S1 S2

72

80

72

78

83

81

72

92

83

65

85

91

88

TOT

158

169

161

17e

168

167

141

179

174

138

167

180

177

SYs1

2.70

3.60

3.90

6.50

6.30

3.50

5.90

SYs2

5.30

3.60

3.30

4.60

4.40

CLOSE

0.55

0.87

0.90

1.00

1.19

1.41

1.42

.70

0.78

0.88

0.96

1.04

1.12

TDS1

4.30

4.30

3.60

TDS2 CLOSE E1

4.70

4.70

3.60

3.20

0.55

0.92

0.90

1.00

1.26

1.30

2.22

TDS2 CLOSE

3.00

7.50

5.80

3.90

0.67

0.50

0.78

1.07

1.28

1.00

1.12

97

96

96

92

77

77

96

81

a1

95

E2

93

98

91

99

97

87

79

98

1e1

80

89

92

96

LP

63

75

66

70

82

77

62

79

80

55

91

88

%9

LAST FIVE
SPEED RATINGS

65,76,92,85,74

67,72,77,78,75

80,67,78,47,59

65,73,74,72,66

77,72,84,83,81

84,76,78,79,83

73,72,67,79,79

68,74,74,74,79

LAST FIVE
SPEED RATINGS

84,95,94,92,0

87,87,75,86,78

88,85,89,88,96

62,70,72,62,66

86,84,85,87,84

86,81,62,77,76

91,69,82,81,96

HIGH
BYER

ATDS DSLR AVG3 BRIS P EQUIP MLINE CLS

4.50 0.40 102

77 59
83 15
83 43
74 43
88 46
86 21
73 46
81 37
HIGH

BYER

ATDS DSLR
95 152
75 134
96 25
70 83
86 37
77 157
96 25

72.0

75.0

71.0

78.0

79.0

71.0

72.0

83.0

87.0

68.0

85.0

76.0

81.0

E 5

E/P 5

E/P 5

E/P ©

E/P 5

BRIS P

E/P 2

E/P 3

0 8.00
0 12.00
0 4.50
0 12.00
0 3.00
0 3.50
0 6.00
BON  4.50

EQUIP MLINE

BOFF

20.00

4.00

182

168

149

176

190

170

204

CLs

169

207

175

184

165

181

TRK DIS TYPE CHNG

FG

FG

FG

FG

FG

FG

FG

TRK DIS TYPE

CNL

LAD

FG

MNR

oP

ELP

FG

6.0 A

7.5A

6.0 A

8.0 A

6.0 A

5.5A

6.0 A

A>A

CA

CA

AO>A

AO>A

N>A

AO>A

AO>A

ASA

A>A

A>A

AO>A

117

117

112

125

124

115

122

120

130

107

125

121

126

10.9

14.7

11.8

15.0

16.2

13.0

12.5

14.9

16.2

11.0

15.1

16.4

14.6

83.6 94.6

89.0 103.6

85.4 97.2

86.2 101.3

90.5 106.8

85.6 98.6

80.7 93.1

87.5 102.4

87.6 103.8

80.4 91.5

85.2 100.3

91.1 107.5

88.3 103.0

ERLY
PACE

190

194

187

188

189

164

156

192

197

174

170

183

191

TOTL
PACE

COMB TOTL LAST

91.7 199 257

253

269

253

258

271

241

218

271

277

229

261

271

281

COMMENTS

Chsd ins;wkn/drfit out/
Bmp brk;led btwn;held/
Drw out;firm hand ride

Press 2w;wknd btw;shy/
Raced back; 1il impact/
Clear; finished well
Ins;rail bid;shft5p1/4/
Shoe rpr; du; gave way/
Duel btwn;2p;kick clr

3wd;floatd 7p1/4;wknd/
Late bid; willingly/ Vied
4-3w;clr; caught

Ins;4pl/4;5p upr;chasd/
Bhnd;stdy erly;bck out/
4w bid; edged clear

Aim 3w1/4;bid;duel;edg/
Stalked 2wd;2nd best/
Held 2nd;best of rest
Lagged ins;stayed on/
Advanced inside;willng/
Forward; thru early

Stalk 4pbtw;faded 5/16/
Never involved/ Late
interest

COMMENTS

Duel;svd gnd;folded/ 2wd;
left lead; drvng/
Stlk;drew off late

4wd upper;btwn;kept on/
Rail out mid str best/
Rail bid; no final bid

Press winnr;no mtchl/4/
2p;4-5p upr;tired/ Dueled
ins;saved show

Pressed pace; faded/
Hustled wide weakened;/
Patient; angled 4deep

Swung 5w 1/4; improved/
Prompted 3-w; tired/
In;block3/16-1/8;enegy

Led;2p str;held gamely/
Dug in; inched clear/
Inside-3wd;no menace

Chasd 2p;3w3/16;stayed/
2-3p turn;flat from3/8/
Inside;splitl/8;edgd2d
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8.5

8.5

8.5

13

12

10

15

16

14

1

13

12

10

15

16

14

11

LA PERLA

DESERT

BEAUTIFULN

FLOWERDEW

SOULTITLES

PAINT ME

AUDACIOUSN

ACTING

GIRL NAMED

CERCHI

DON'T GO

BOLTORO

CUSHEE

GOLDEN

JUST SAY

PPOT AEPS LAST DS

558

1>3

4>6

8>4

7>4

5>4

1058

1>11

8>9

6>2

2>7

155

353

352

155

3938

13200

3150

2685

2125

2938

7813

1600

5418

8400

3600

10267

5500

6400

5650

R>R,D>T

S>R,D>T

R>R,D>T

R>R,D>T

R>R,D>T

R>R,D>T

R>R, T>T

R>R, T>T

S>R,T>T

S>R,D>T

R>R,D>T

RO>R, T>T

R>R,D>T

R>R,D>T

S>R, T>T

S>R, T>T

SPD
NOTES FROM LAST RACE 110
**4p:trackd;chasd;no bid (65)**| 1st off 73
38 day layoff.Class Change 2 Finished 5
from post 5 TIW= 52
**Failed to make headway (71)**| DROP
SWITCH 1st off 73 day layoff.Class
Change -23 Finished 8 from post 5 TIW=
52
**3.2w under pressure (71)**| DROP
SWITCH Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
1-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed?
WATCH! Clear early.lst off 93 day
layoff.Class Change -18 Finished 3 from
post 1 TIW= 79
**Never involved (49)**|SLR?- 27 Slow
last race (14). 1st off 38 day
layoff.Class Change 2 Finished 6 from
post 4 TIW= 49
**¥2p-ins;show bid;missed (72)**| 1st off ERR
46 day layoff.Class Change 2 Finished 4
from post 8 TIW= 90
**3p;ins3/8;chs;nail shw
(67)**|Uncharacteristic early speed?
WATCH! 1st off 38 day layoff.Class
Change 2 Finished 4 from post 7 TIW= 64
**Tpck 2w;4w2nd;chsd btw (71)%*|
*Stretch gain (3.25).BTL HORSE 1st off
94 day layoff.2 races in one
pattern.Class Change -23 Finished 4 from
post 5 TIW= 68
**2-3w;bid upr;faltrdl/8 (70)**| DROP
SWITCH Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
10-hole.Uncharacteristic race? 1st off
92 day layoff.Class Change -23 Finished
8 from post 10 TIW= 47
**Step slow;no menace (54)**| Middle
move (5). *Stretch gain (.5).SLR?- 15
1st off 128 day layoff.Class Change -23
Finished 11 from post 1 TiW= 51
**Brkin/bmp;urgd 2w;fade (47)**| DROP
SWITCHSLR?- 28 Slow last race (14). 1st
off 78 day layoff.Class Change -23
Finished 9 from post 8 TIW= 82
**press 2wd;outpaced 1/4 (74)**| Flashed ERR
speed. *Pressed Pace from 6-hole. 1st
off 38 day layoff.Class Change 2
Finished 2 from post 6 TIW= 92

ERR

ERR

76

ERR

71

71

ERR

ERR

**Inside; lacked rally (67)**| 1st off 70
130 day layoff.Class Change -23 Finished

7 from post 2 TIW= 41

**Angled out evenly late (67)**| DROP 74

SWITCH Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from
1-hole. *Stretch gain (.25).BTL HORSE

1st off 33 day layoff.2 races in one
pattern.Class Change -8 Finished 5 from
post 1 TIW= 89

**2-3p;5pl/4;green upper (68)**| 1st off ERR
38 day layoff.Class Change 2 Finished 3
from post 3 TIW= 48

**Stalked rail; st'd3/8 (71)**| Chased ERR
Pace. *Stretch gain (1).BTL HORSE 1st

off 65 day layoff.Class Change 17

Finished 2 from post 3 TIW= 81

**Hit gate brk; 6wd 1/4 (67)**| DROP ERR

SWITCH Made big overall move (7). Made a
big move early (4.5). *Stretch gain
(.5). 1st off 124 day layoff.Class
Change -23 Finished 5 from post 1 TIW=
73

ERR

ERR

76

ERR

ERR

71

71

ERR

ERR

ERR

74

ERR

ERR

ERR

AVG
#TDS SPD

#R S1 S2

80

77

72

71

74

99

98

87

64

78

91

84

78

86

TOT

160

156

129

148

144

164

173

157

144

150

169

150

144

83

166

SYs1

3.90

3.10

5.30

5.80

7.80

7.40

5.80

3.60

5.90

5.90

7.10

7.60

SYS2 CLOSE

3.80

5.90

6.00

7.80

7.00

.75

0.83

0.90

0.97

1.00

1.06

1.17

1.20

1.20

1.25

1.30

1.37

1.67

2.00

2.00

TDS1

ERR

ERR

3.00

ERR

ERR

5.50

4.60

ERR

ERR

ERR

5.9

5.7

ERR

ERR

ERR

TDS2 CLOSE E1

5.80

ERR

ERR

4.00

ERR

ERR

3.60

4.60

ERR

ERR

ERR

4.50

2.20

ERR

ERR

ERR

.57

ERR

ERR

0.75

ERR

ERR

1.50

1.00

ERR

ERR

1.30

2.60

ERR

ERR

ERR

82

76

62

82

76

70

86

72

87

76

65

74

74

E2 LP

77

75

47

83

75

62

72

60

75

79

69

59

67

78

79

74

61

66

64

84

72

80

57

71

74

78

73

73

75

LAST FIVE
SPEED RATINGS

65,73,0,0,0

71,74,0,0,0

71,80,0,0,0

49,76,0,0,0

72,69,67,71,61

67,62,0,0,0

71,50,0,0,0

70,71,69,72,0

54,69,0,0,0

47,75,62,0,0

74,58,0,0,0

67,73,0,0,0

67,72,75,65,0

68,0,0,0,0

71,0,0,0,0

67,64,0,0,0

HIGH

BYER

ATDS DSLR
73 38
) 73
] 93
76 38
) 46
] 38
71 94
71 92
] 128
) 78
) 38
73 130
75 33
) 38
) 65
) 124

AVG3 BRIS P EQUIP MLINE CLS

94.5 150 210 4p;trackd;chasd;no bid/

73.0

76.0

63.0

69.0

65.0

61.0

70.0

62.0

61.0

66.0

70.0

71.0

68.0

71.0

66.0

E/P

NA

BON

5.00

186

184

174

173

174

186

181

174

173

154

176

182

161

146

176

TRK DIS
FG 8.5
KEE 7.0
BAQ 8.0
FG 8.5
FG 8.3
FG 8.5
KEE 8.5
KEE 8.5
KD 6.0
o 6.0
FG 8.5
kD 8.0
™ 8.5
FG 8.5
HAW 5.0
KD 6.5

TYPE CHNG
S S>S
S S>S
S S>S
S S>S
S S>S
S S>S
S S>S
S S>S
S S>S
S S>S
S S>S
S S>S
S S>S
S S>S
S S>S
S S>S

PWR CLASS

119

104

111

107

102

113

106

118

110

123

109

107

111

14.4

10.3

12.3

13.3

8.7

15.0

13.0

13.8

13.8

12.9

13.1

84.5

82.9

79.9

81.0

81.3

82.6

82.4

86.1

80.2

83.9

83.9

81.7

83.3

90.2

87.7

94.3

97.3

90.2

89.1

93.6

91.2

95.7

88.9

98.9

96.9

95.5

97.1

103.1

100.8

ERLY TOTL
PACE PACE
COMB TOTL LAST

159

151

109

165

151

132

158

132

162

158

145

124

141

89

152

238

225

170

231

215

216

230

212

219

229

219

202

214

162

227

COMMENTS

Ins;wait;stymied late/

Failed to make headway/
Track 3w-4p;5p1/4;chsd/

3-2w under pressure/
Chased;4w 1/4;kept on/

Never involved/
Ins-2p;3p1/4;chsd;wknd/

2p-ins;show bid;missed/
Trackd 3w;yield 4w5/16/
3w;4p1/4;n0 menace
3p;ins3/8;chs;nail shw/
Never involved/

Trck 2w;4w2nd;chsd btw/
Far back 4p;outrun/

2-3w;bid upr;faltrd1/8/
Settld; 6w uppr;rallied/
2p upper; flattened

Step slow;no menace/ Rail
trip; left lead/

Brkin/bmp;urgd 2w;fade/
Ins;split 2wupr;surged/
2w;5p3/16;moderate kik

Press 2wd;outpaced 1/4/
Trk 3p; 4p str;ran on/

Inside; lacked rally/
Bck2p;drvndw str;rally/

Angled out evenly late/
3-5wl/4;rally;miss plc/
Rated;6wd upper;missed

~

2-3p;5p1/4;green upper/

Stalked rail; st'd3/8/ /

Hit gate brk; 6wd 1/4/
Ins;split upr;held shw/
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DT PP PRG

5.5 66

5.5 10 10

5.5 88

5.5 44

HORSE

MR.

LANDRY AND

LIT A

DIGNIFIED

WILD FIST

RISKTAKER

MINE YOUR

IRON

OAK HILL

PPOT AEPS LAST DS

0>0

7>10

1>3

554

258

7>4

455

1>6

[

578

809

265

1923

300

[

9>S,>D

0>S,>D

$55,D5D

$>S,D5D

$>S,D5D

R>S,D>D

$>S,D>D

$>S,D>D

R>S,D>D

$>S,D>D

NOTES FROM LAST RACE

** (9)**| 1st off 738536 day layoff.
FTS.Invalid last race. Finished @ from
post @ TIW= 14

** (@)**| 1st off 738536 day layoff.
FTS.Invalid last race. Finished @ from
post @ TIW= 41

**Forwardly;3p;stopped (26)**| Flashed
speed.SLR?- 20 Slow last race (22).
Class Change 5 Finished 10 from post 7
TIW= 36

**Chasd ins-2p;no menace (47)**| Flashed
speed. Class Change @ Finished 3 from
post 1 TIW= 59

**pinch/lost irons early (49)**| Made a
big move early (6). 1st off 31 day
layoff.Class Change @ Finished 4 from
post 5 TIW= 21

**Botherd/shied in start (29)**|SLR?- 12
Class Change @ Finished 8 from post 2
TIW= 7

**Bobbled st;4p;no bid (62)**THIRD OFF|
Flashed speed. Class Change -59 Finished
4 from post 7 TIW= 16

**Bump start;2w;moved up (45)**THIRD
OFF| Made a big move early (3.5). Fast
last race (11). 1st off 31 day
layoff.Class Change © Finished 5 from
post 4 TIW= 20

**Inside;4wd;no response (31)**| DROP
SWITCH 1st off 278 day layoff.Class
Change -33 Finished 6 from post 1 TIW= 4
**Nospeed;4wupr;rallied (53)**| Made big
overall move (4). Middle move (6.25).
*Stretch gain (.25). Class Change 1
Finished 4 from post 7 TIW= 49

ERR

51

47

39

41

34

35

49

ERR

52

41

25

35

49

ERR

51

41

28

57

#R S1 S2 TOT

10

57

78

81

79

59

84

74

64

69

54 131

73 154

74 152

71 130

72 156

76 149

56 120

-1 68

SYs1

ERR

5.70

9.00

6.30

8.50

SYS2 CLOSE TDS1

ERR

6.90

6.70

9.00

8.80

6.90

ERR

0.55

0.67

0.86

1.00

1.04

1.85

1.05

1.39

ERR

8.50

5.60

8.50

8.80

9.50

TDS2 CLOSE E1

ERR

8.80

5.80

ERR

0.55

.70

0.92

0.96

0.96

1.05

1.00

1.64

88

73

58

93

69

67

69

E2 LP

80

76

73

37

88

64

55

1

©

5

a

62

a3

62

66

31

76

LAST FIVE
SPEED RATINGS
0,0,0,0,0

0,0,0,0,0

26,46,38,55,56

47,0,52,55,49

49,51,22,44,60

29,41,42,4,17

62,59,-11,65,67

45,43,15,0,0

31,41,29,0,0

53,48,44,0,0

64

56

60

42

65

45

41

53

Aok

Aok

27

24

31

15

31

278

12

NA

37.0 E

50.0 E

41.0 P

37.0 NA

37.0 E

34.0 NA

34.0 NA

48.0 NA

@ 12.00 ERR

@ 3.00 ERR

0 12.00 108

0 6.00 107

0 12.00 109

0 20.00 122

0 2.00 150

0 20.00 109

0 12.00 158

@ 6.00 126

TRK DIS TYPE CHNG PWR CLASS

FG 6.0 M S>M 99 10.6

EVD 8.0 M S>M 82 0.9

ERR

73.7

86.4

85.6

79.5

83.1

80.7

79.0

85.8

ERR

78.6

94.0

93.9

79.0

93.7

86.2

79.9

94.8

ERLY TOTL
PACE PACE
COMB TOTL LAST

170

164

146

95

181

133

122

69

189

220

208

138

24

w

19

©°

153

145

COMMENTS
//
//
Forwardly;3p;stopped/

Dueled; 3w; tired/
Contention; done

Chasd ins-2p;no menace/
Jumpd shadow;lost rdr/
Alert; gamely; wknd
Pinch/lost irons early/
Bmp btwst;gain3w;flatn/
Contention; done

Botherd/shied in start/
Never involved/ Bump
start;lag;cut gap
Bobbled st;4p;no bid/
Bumpd btw st;chasd ins/
Far back; no bid

Bump start;2w;moved up/
2wd btw;steadily faded/
Finished early 4w

Inside;4wd;no response/
Hoppd in start;ép turn/
5p turn;outrun;eased
Nospeed;4wupr;rallied/ In
back; outrun/ Passed
tired ones



