

Table with columns: DATE, TRK #, DT, PP, PRG, HORSE, DST, SURF, MOVING?, AVG SPD, ASP, ASP, ASP, AVG LAST5, SYS1, SYS2, CLOSE, TDS1, TDS2, CLOSE, BROTT1, BROTT2, E1, E2, LATE, CLOSE, EARLY TOTAL, Last, DSLR, BTOT, avg race rtng, LRR, POWER, MLINE, LAST FIVE FIGS, TJW% CLS, COMMENT, BEST OVERAL, BEST LAST, TOTALS. Row 1: 1/26/23 AQU 1 6.5 4 4 MOSTLY S>S D>D F/PP/SP-13/SLR?- 18WATCH/ESP/Y(1>5) Class Change 0...

Table with columns: DATE, TRK #, DT, PP, PRG, HORSE, DST, SURF, MOVING?, AVG SPD, ASP, ASP, ASP, AVG LAST5, SYS1, SYS2, CLOSE, TDS1, TDS2, CLOSE, BROTT1, BROTT2, E1, E2, LATE, CLOSE, EARLY TOTAL, Last, DSLR, BTOT, avg race rtng, LRR, POWER, MLINE, LAST FIVE FIGS, TJW% CLS, COMMENT, BEST OVERAL, BEST LAST, TOTALS. Row 1: 1/26/23 AQU 2 7.0 6 6 BUCKINGH S>S D>D F/PP/SG:1.5/Y(3>3) Class Change 1...

Table with columns: DATE, TRK #, DT, PP, PRG, HORSE, DST, SURF, MOVING?, AVG SPD, ASP, ASP, ASP, AVG LAST5, SYS1, SYS2, CLOSE, TDS1, TDS2, CLOSE, BROTT1, BROTT2, E1, E2, LATE, CLOSE, EARLY TOTAL, Last, DSLR, BTOT, avg race rtng, LRR, POWER, MLINE, LAST FIVE FIGS, TJW% CLS, COMMENT, BEST OVERAL, BEST LAST, TOTALS. Row 1: 1/26/23 AQU 3 6.0 1 1 CURLINS S>S D>D F/PP/FLR+82\_Y(4>1) Class Change 32...

Table with columns: DATE, TRK #, DT, PP, PRG, HORSE, DST, SURF, MOVING?, AVG SPD, ASP, ASP, ASP, AVG LAST5, SYS1, SYS2, CLOSE, TDS1, TDS2, CLOSE, BROTT1, BROTT2, E1, E2, LATE, CLOSE, EARLY TOTAL, Last, DSLR, BTOT, avg race rtng, LRR, POWER, MLINE, LAST FIVE FIGS, TJW% CLS, COMMENT, BEST OVERAL, BEST LAST, TOTALS. Row 1: 1/26/23 AQU 4 7.0 4 4 MAJESTIC S>S D>D BOM:4/N(9>2) Class Change 0...



Table with columns: DATE, TRK #, DT, PP, PRG, HORSE, DST, SURF, MOVING?, AVG SPD, ASP, ASP, ASP, AVG LAST5, SYS1, SYS2, CLOS, TDS1, TDS2, CLOS, BROTT, BROTT, E1, E2, LATE, CLOS, EARLY TOTAL, Last, DSLR, BTOT, avg race rtng, LRR, POWER, MLINE, LAST FIVE FIGS, TJW% CLS, COMMENT, BEST OVERALL, BEST LAST, BEST TOTALS. Row 1: 1/26/23 FG 1 6.0 4 4 MALIBU S R>S D>D N(2>4) Class Change -66...

Table with columns: DATE, TRK #, DT, PP, PRG, HORSE, DST, SURF, MOVING?, AVG SPD, ASP, ASP, ASP, AVG LAST5, SYS1, SYS2, CLOS, TDS1, TDS2, CLOS, BROTT, BROTT, E1, E2, LATE, CLOS, EARLY TOTAL, Last, DSLR, BTOT, avg race rtng, LRR, POWER, MLINE, LAST FIVE FIGS, TJW% CLS, COMMENT, BEST OVERALL, BEST LAST, BEST TOTALS. Row 1: 1/26/23 FG 2 8.5 2 2 SERMONON R>R D>D F/PP/FLR+21 WATCH/ESP/Y(4>1) Class Change 0...

Table with columns: DATE, TRK #, DT, PP, PRG, HORSE, DST, SURF, MOVING?, AVG SPD, ASP, ASP, ASP, AVG LAST5, SYS1, SYS2, CLOS, TDS1, TDS2, CLOS, BROTT, BROTT, E1, E2, LATE, CLOS, EARLY TOTAL, Last, DSLR, BTOT, avg race rtng, LRR, POWER, MLINE, LAST FIVE FIGS, TJW% CLS, COMMENT, BEST OVERALL, BEST LAST, BEST TOTALS. Row 1: 1/26/23 FG 3 6.0 2 2 TRADER S>S D>D F/BTL/SG:1.75/Y(3>3) Class Change 49...

Table with columns: DATE, TRK #, DT, PP, PRG, HORSE, DST, SURF, MOVING?, AVG SPD, ASP, ASP, ASP, AVG LAST5, SYS1, SYS2, CLOS, TDS1, TDS2, CLOS, BROTT, BROTT, E1, E2, LATE, CLOS, EARLY TOTAL, Last, DSLR, BTOT, avg race rtng, LRR, POWER, MLINE, LAST FIVE FIGS, TJW% CLS, COMMENT, BEST OVERALL, BEST LAST, BEST TOTALS. Row 1: 1/26/23 FG 4 6.0 2 2 WIN YA S>S D>D N(1>6) Class Change -20...

Table with columns: DATE, TRK #, DT, PP, PRG, HORSE, DST, SURF, MOVING?, AVG SPD, ASP, ASP, ASP, AVG LAST5, SYS1, SYS2, CLOS, TDS1, TDS2, CLOS, BROTT, BROTT, E1, E2, LATE, CLOS, EARLY TOTAL, Last, DSLR, BTOT, avg race rtng, LRR, POWER, MLINE, LAST FIVE FIGS, TJW% CLS, COMMENT, BEST OVERALL, BEST LAST, BEST TOTALS. Row 1: 1/26/23 FG 5 8.3 2 2 WARRANT R>R D>D BOM:3/SG:.25/Y(5>3) Class Change -26...







DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	PPOT	AEPS	LAST DS	NOTES FROM LAST RACE	SPD			AVG			LAST FIVE										HIGH			ERLY TOTL		COMMENTS																	
										110	#110	TDS	#TDS	SPD	#R	S1	S2	TOT	SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	TDS1	TDS2	CLOSE	E1	E2	LP	SPEED	RATINGS	ATDS		DSL	AVG3	BRIS	P	EQUIP	MLINE	CLS	TRK	DIS	TYPE	CHNG	PMR	CLASS	FINAL	COMB	TOTL	PACE
1/26/23	AQU	1	6.5	5	5	GRACEFULLY	2>7	4150	S>S,D>D	**Chased 2p; tired (50)**   Flashed speed. Slow last race (15). Class Change 0 Finished 7 from post 2 TJW= 23	63	8	63	8	65	10	80	67	146	3.80	4.60	0.83	4.20	5.70	0.73	90	82	54	50,57,60,63,75	73	25	56.0	E/P	7	0	6.00	138	AQU	6.0	M	M>M	103	8.9	77.8	86.7	172	226	Chased 2p; tired/ Lost footing st;ins-2p/ 2path trn;headed1/4
			6.5	6	6	BECAUSEOFT	2>9	4025	S>S,D>D	**Hoppd st;rail; tired (30)**   DROP SWITCH Flashed speed.SLR?- 30 Slow last race (30). 1st off 192 day layoff.Class Change -26 Finished 9 from post 2 TJW= 24	67	5	61	6	60	7	80	56	136	4.40	4.90	0.89	4.40	5.00	0.88	85	58	58	30,60,78,69,56	78	192	56.0	E	6	BON	10.00	140	FL	5.5	M	S>M	96	5.9	80.7	86.6	143	201	Hoppd st;rail; tired/ 2p trn;headed1/4;wknd/ Outside;2p trn;willing
			6.5	4	4	MOSTLY	1>5	4362	S>S,D>D	**Vied; dueled; weakened (61)**   Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 1-hole.SLR?- 18 Slow last race (13).Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH! Clear early.Class Change 0 Finished 5 from post 1 TJW= 53	72	4	72	4	74	10	83	71	153	5.10	4.70	1.10	3.50	4.70	0.75	91	87	62	61,79,70,71,69	80	25	70.0	E/P	5	0	2.00	143	AQU	6.0	M	M>M	111	11.5	84.4	95.9	178	240	Vied; dueled; weakened/ 3-2path;led 5/16-1/4/ Ins trn;2p1/4;weakened
			6.5	1	1	CAIAROSSA	3>4	1270	S>S,D>D	**Chased 2p; flattened (61)**   Made big overall move (4). Made a big move early (3.75). Class Change 0 Finished 4 from post 3 TJW= 25	56	3	56	3	56	3	80	74	153	7.90	7.10	1.10	7.90	7.10	1.10	77	82	68	61,46,60,0,0	61	25	56.0	S	0	0	4.00	125	AQU	6.0	M	M>M	99	10.4	75.8	86.2	159	227	Chased 2p; flattened/ Chased inside; tired/ Awkward; shied out st
			6.5	2	2	SARAH'S	4>2	3500	S>S,D>D	**Bmpd brk;tkn up badly (60)**   Made big overall move (4). Fast last race (13). Class Change -5 Finished 2 from post 4 TJW= 33	60	1	47	2	47	2	77	76	153	10.00	7.50	1.33	10.00	7.50	1.33	67	65	75	60,34,0,0,0	60	6	47.0	S	0	0	6.00	140	AQU	7.0	M	M>M	96	8.6	77.0	85.7	132	207	Bmpd brk;tkn up badly/ Slgsh st;2p trn;outrun/
			6.5	3	3	AFILADA	4>3	4810	S>S,D>D	**Chased 3-2w; mild kick (65)**   Made big overall move (3). *Stretch gain (.75). 2 races in one pattern.Class Change 0 Finished 3 from post 4 TJW= 73	69	10	69	10	69	10	79	78	156	7.20	3.80	1.87	7.20	3.80	1.87	79	80	75	65,67,73,68,74	75	25	68.0	P	1	0	1.80	137	AQU	6.0	M	M>M	110	11.9	84.9	96.8	159	234	Chased 3-2w; mild kick/ 4w trn;wide stretch/ 5w upper; no response

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	PPOT	AEPS	LAST DS	NOTES FROM LAST RACE	SPD			AVG			LAST FIVE										HIGH			ERLY TOTL		COMMENTS																	
										110	#110	TDS	#TDS	SPD	#R	S1	S2	TOT	SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	TDS1	TDS2	CLOSE	E1	E2	LP	SPEED	RATINGS	ATDS		DSL	AVG3	BRIS	P	EQUIP	MLINE	CLS	TRK	DIS	TYPE	CHNG	PMR	CLASS	FINAL	COMB	TOTL	PACE
1/26/23	AQU	2	7.0	5	5	BASIS RISK	7>11	5227	R>S,D>D	**Chased 2p; folded (56)**   DROP SWITCH 1st off 48 day layoff.Class Change -41 Finished 11 from post 7 TJW= 20	64	3	63	4	62	5	73	70	143	5.70	8.10	0.71	5.20	7.40	0.70	84	70	56	56,61,59,83,50	83	48	59.0	E	4	0	15.00	178	AQU	8.0	C	A>C	110	5.2	79.6	84.9	154	210	Chased 2p; folded/ Brk out; bumped start/ Bumped betw st; tired
			7.0	3	3	HATCH	8>6	4404	S>S,D>D	**5w upper; wknd late (79)**   Class Change 4 Finished 6 from post 8 TJW= 53	79	1	77	6	75	10	88	80	168	6.80	7.20	0.95	6.30	5.70	1.12	92	97	74	79,74,82,79,76	82	28	78.0	P	3	BON	4.50	176	AQU	6.0	C	C>C	120	14.1	84.3	98.4	189	263	5w upper; wknd late/ 2-3p trn;4p1/4;tired/ 3-5w trn;good courage
			7.0	6	6	BUCKINGHAM	3>3	12448	S>S,D>D	**Chased 2-3w; mild kick (83)**   Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 3-hole. *Stretch gain (1.5). 1st off 176 day layoff.Class Change 1 Finished 3 from post 3 TJW= 73	81	4	82	10	82	10	92	82	173	4.00	3.90	1.03	4.00	3.90	1.03	89	95	79	83,84,78,76,86	86	176	82.0	E/P	3	BON	1.80	185	SAR	7.0	C	C>C	121	15.5	85.0	100.5	184	263	Chased 2-3w; mild kick/ 3w;bid;duel;game;denid/ Tracked 5-6p;faded upr
			7.0	2	2	BERT BERT	5>5	5203	R>S,D>D	**Chased 3-2w; tired (68)**   DROP SWITCHSLR?- 16 1st off 39 day layoff.Class Change -21 Finished 5 from post 5 TJW= 49	69	1	69	2	71	7	78	68	145	6.60	6.10	1.07	8.20	6.40	1.29	94	94	44	68,84,75,63,72	69	39	76.0	P	1	0	8.00	167	AQU	9.0	C	R>C	121	12.6	77.4	90.0	188	232	Chased 3-2w; tired/ 4p trn;eased up late/ 4-3p trn;led3/16-1/16
			7.0	4	4	MAURITIUS	2>6	12493	S>S,D>D	**Bmp brk;tight;3p turn (74)**THIRD OFF MAYBE?   1st off 40 day layoff.Class Change -51 Finished 6 from post 2 TJW= 84	ERR	0	80	3	78	4	85	76	160	5.20	4.80	1.08	4.80	4.30	1.11	91	94	71	74,79,69,88,0	88	40	74.0	E	3	0	1.40	180	AQU	6.0	C	A>C	122	11.5	86.0	97.4	185	256	Bmp brk;tight;3p turn/ Pace 2wd; driving;/ 3-2wd;inside;faded
			7.0	1	1	MACH ONE	2>2	4747	S>S,D>D	**Chased 2p; up for 2nd (87)**   Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 2-hole. Fast last race (14).BTL HORSE Class Change 4 Finished 2 from post 2 TJW= 18	60	1	77	5	73	10	89	84	173	5.70	4.90	1.16	3.90	3.90	1.00	95	99	81	87,60,83,66,71	87	28	77.0	P	3	0	6.00	134	AQU	6.0	C	C>C	116	14.0	85.8	99.8	194	275	Chased 2p; up for 2nd/ Chased inside; tired/ Came wide; missed 3d

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	PPOT	AEPS	LAST DS	NOTES FROM LAST RACE	SPD	SPD	AVG	LAST FIVE												HIGH			ERLY TOTL		COMMENTS																			
										#110	#110	#R	S1	S2	TOT	SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	TDS1	TDS2	CLOSE	E1	E2	LP	SPEED	RATINGS	ATDS	DSL	AVG3		BRIS	P	EQUIP	MLINE	CLS	TRK	DIS	TYPE	CHNG	PMR	CLASS	FINAL	COMB	TOTL	PACE				
1/26/23	AQU	3	6.0	2	2	LADY QUINN	1>1	5851	S>S,D>D	**Bmpd brk;2p;kept task (66)**   Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 1-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH!BTL HORSE Clear early.1st off 39 day layoff.Class Change 22 Finished 1 from post 1 TJW= 61	53	3	53	3	59	4	84	79	163	3.20	5.30	0.61	2.90	5.00	0.58	92	87	69	66,56,74,38,0	66	39	65.0	E	4	0	0	6.00	152	AQU	6.0	C	M>C	113	12.6	82.5	95.1	179	248	Bmpd brk;2p;kept task/ Chased 5-4w; tired/ 5w upper; outkicked
			6.0	3	3	SICILIAN	1>7	7695	S>S,D>D	**Stp slw;chase ins;wknd (63)**   DROP SWITCHUncharacteristic early speed? WATCH! 1st off 39 day layoff.Class Change -8 Finished 7 from post 1 TJW= 84	68	3	64	4	67	5	82	79	160	6.00	6.30	0.96	4.80	5.50	0.88	86	82	70	63,58,81,84,50	84	39	67.0	P	3	0	0	4.50	173	LRL	6.0	C	C>C	115	11.6	82.9	94.5	168	238	Stp slw;chase ins;wknd/ Hide; flattened out/ Chased inside; outrun
			6.0	1	1	CURLINS	4>1	12600	S>S,D>D	**2w;bid trn;took over3p (82)**   Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 4-hole.BTL HORSE Clear early.1st off 47 day layoff.Class Change 32 Finished 1 from post 4 TJW= 62	82	1	82	1	82	1	89	82	171	1.70	1.70	1.00	1.70	1.70	1.00	94	96	80	82,0,0,0,0	82	47	82.0	E	6	0	0	1.60	111	GP	5.5	C	M>C	117	13.5	87.2	100.6	190	270	2w;bid trn;took over3p/ /
			6.0	7	7	AUDIT	1>1	14075	S>S,D>D	**Cut pace 2p; held well (76)**   Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 1-hole. Fast last race (14).Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH!BTL HORSE Clear early.Class Change 5 Finished 1 from post 1 TJW= 63	62	2	62	2	62	2	86	79	164	5.00	5.00	1.00	5.00	5.00	1.00	95	94	73	76,47,0,0,0	76	13	62.0	E	4	0	0	6.00	157	AQU	6.0	C	M>C	112	13.7	85.4	99.1	189	262	Cut pace 2p; held well/ Bmpd brk;2path turn/
			6.0	5	5	MAGIC MISS	2>5	9825	S>S,D>D	**Drop back fast5/8;2p (50)**   DROP SWITCHSLR?- 30 Class Change -25 Finished 5 from post 2 TJW= 28	50	3	50	3	50	3	65	83	147	7.40	6.80	1.08	7.40	6.80	1.08	74	52	84	50,80,21,0,0	80	20	50.0	E	3	BON	12.00	162	AQU	6.0	C	CO>C	105	9.3	76.8	86.0	126	210	Drop back fast5/8;2p/ Chased 2p; safe/ 4-5path turn;no factor	
			6.0	4	4	JESSICA'S	6>1	5365	R>S,D>D	**5w 1/4; up 3/16; safe (64)**THIRD OFF   Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 6-hole. Made big overall move (3).BTL HORSE Class Change 20 Finished 1 from post 6 TJW= 33	63	4	63	5	64	6	71	82	152	5.30	4.40	1.20	5.70	5.10	1.11	71	62	75	64,52,64,73,64	73	20	60.0	E/P	2	0	0	10.00	119	AQU	8.0	C	M>C	105	12.6	74.5	87.1	133	208	5w 1/4; up 3/16; safe/ Stdied1/2;3-5wide turn/ Slw st; inside; no bid
			6.0	6	6	OUR ROSIE	4>4	6422	S>S,D>D	**Bmpd btwn brk;pinched (73)**   DROP SWITCH Fast last race (12). Class Change -25 Finished 4 from post 4 TJW= 39	64	4	63	7	61	9	79	83	161	6.40	5.10	1.25	6.90	5.10	1.36	81	80	83	73,75,59,73,62	75	20	69.0	P	3	0	0	3.00	161	AQU	6.0	C	CO>C	115	13.7	85.3	99.0	161	244	Bmpd btwn brk;pinched/ Awkward brk;4p trn;clr/ Bobbled st; wknd late

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	PPOT	AEPS	LAST DS	NOTES FROM LAST RACE	SPD	SPD	AVG	LAST FIVE												HIGH			ERLY TOTL		COMMENTS																			
										#110	#110	#R	S1	S2	TOT	SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	TDS1	TDS2	CLOSE	E1	E2	LP	SPEED	RATINGS	ATDS	DSL	AVG3		BRIS	P	EQUIP	MLINE	CLS	TRK	DIS	TYPE	CHNG	PMR	CLASS	FINAL	COMB	TOTL	PACE				
1/26/23	AQU	4	7.0	3	3	ENFORCER	4>1	4129	S>S,D>D	**Pull away;in hand late (84)**   Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 4-hole. Fast last race (12).Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH!BTL HORSE Clear early.Class Change 0 Finished 1 from post 4 TJW= 81	72	3	72	10	72	10	89	80	168	2.60	4.30	0.62	2.60	4.30	0.62	90	91	84	84,64,73,82,68	84	16	74.0	E	6	0	0	2.50	135	PRX	7.0	C	C>C	121	15.6	85.2	100.8	181	265	Pull away;in hand late/ Std turn and stretch/ Vied outside; wknd
			7.0	5	5	PRINCE OF	7>1	2863	R>S,D>D	**7w upper; edged clear (85)**   Made big overall move (6). Fast last race (25).BTL HORSE Class Change -5 Finished 1 from post 7 TJW= 76	59	1	61	2	60	10	84	83	167	5.30	6.20	0.85	2.90	7.90	0.36	87	91	81	85,57,54,44,78	62	25	65.0	E/P	0	0	0	6.00	134	AQU	8.0	C	C>C	112	11.9	85.3	97.2	178	259	7w upper; edged clear/ Bmpd brk;4w;retreated/ Chased 6w; no impact
			7.0	2	2	EXXTOP	3>8	1975	S>S,D>D	**4w pursuit; no impact (69)**   Class Change 0 Finished 8 from post 3 TJW= 81	56	3	60	6	63	10	78	79	157	6.90	8.00	0.87	7.00	7.60	0.92	86	81	78	69,53,56,47,69	69	14	59.0	P	0	0	0	20.00	129	AQU	6.0	C	C>C	104	-0.4	81.7	81.3	167	245	4w pursuit; no impact/ Chased 3-2w; no impact/ Ins turn;no response
			7.0	6	6	EL MAYOR	4>5	3695	S>S,D>D	**Inside turn; weakened (76)**THIRD OFF   Class Change 0 Finished 5 from post 4 TJW= 17	77	1	77	2	72	10	83	78	161	5.40	6.20	0.88	4.70	5.90	0.80	90	91	76	76,71,57,62,73	77	14	68.0	P	1	9	12.00	141	AQU	6.0	C	C>C	115	12.6	77.0	89.6	181	257	Inside turn; weakened/ Outside;5p turn;tired/ Brshd brk;ins trn;wknd	
			7.0	1	1	ONE MORE	3>5	6488	S>S,D>D	**Chased 3-4w; tired (61)**   DROP SWITCHSLR?- 13 Slow last race (15). Class Change -25 Finished 5 from post 3 TJW= 29	70	3	73	7	76	9	82	67	149	5.50	5.80	0.95	5.70	6.30	0.91	86	85	56	61,74,97,77,86	86	14	77.0	E/P	0	0	0	6.00	175	AQU	7.0	C	C>C	116	10.3	81.8	92.1	171	227	Chased 3-4w; tired/ Tossed head;awkward st/ Stalked; bid;edged off
			7.0	4	4	MAJESTIC	9>2	4480	S>S,D>D	**6w upper; ran on (84)**   Made big overall move (4). Class Change 0 Finished 2 from post 9 TJW= 52	84	3	84	4	76	10	84	83	167	5.90	5.70	1.05	5.80	3.70	1.57	90	92	85	84,85,64,73,79	88	14	78.0	S	0	0	0	1.80	140	AQU	6.0	C	C>C	119	14.7	86.4	101.2	182	267	6w upper; ran on/ 5w turn;4w1/4;chased/ Outside;4w turn;empty
			7.0	7	7	JADE'S	6>4	5322	R>S,D>D	**4w turns;chased;tired (81)**   Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 6-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH! Class Change 0 Finished 4 from post 6 TJW= 54	79	3	73	4	72	10	66	94	160	7.70	6.40	1.19	8.90	5.90	1.50	71	69	92	81,72,81,79,71	86	12	78.0	P	0	0	0	3.50	144	AQU	9.0	C	C>C	116	15.4	75.6	91.0	140	232	4w turns;chased;tired/ Pinched back after brk/ 3-4w turn;7w into lane







DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	PPOT	AEPS	LAST DS	NOTES FROM LAST RACE	SPD		SPD		AVG		S1	S2	TOT	SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	TDS1	TDS2	CLOSE	E1	E2	LP	LAST FIVE SPEED RATINGS	HIGH BYER			MLINE	CLS	TRK	DIS	TYPE	CHNG	PMR	CLASS	FINAL	COMB	ERLY TOTL		COMMENTS			
										#110	#110	TDS	#TDS	SPD	#R														ATDS	DSL	AVG3											BRIS	P		EQUIP	TOTL	LAST
1/26/23	FG	1	6.0	2 2	GORMLEYS	1>6	4791	S>S,D>D	**Bumpd st;ins;left lead (78)**   Flashed speed.SLR?- 13 Class Change -25 Finished 6 from post 1 TJW= 76	75	9	75	10	75	10	85	80	164	4.90	6.50	0.76	4.90	6.50	0.76	84	87	82	78,91,78,75,83	91	14	82.0	E/P	6	0	3.50	167	FG	6.0	C	R>C	120	14.0	86.9	100.8	171	253	Bumpd st;ins;left lead/2w;btw1/8;shft out1/16/3p trn; 5p upr;bid;wkn
			6.0	5 5	TEE BURNS	2>3	3744	S>S,D>D	**Hopped st;insd;angld3w (74)**   1st off 47 day layoff.Class Change 9 Finished 3 from post 2 TJW= 74	71	9	71	9	69	10	89	81	169	4.60	5.10	0.90	4.20	4.50	0.94	89	87	78	74,77,54,82,77	82	47	68.0	E	4	0	6.00	143	HAW	6.0	C	C>C	113	13.6	87.8	101.4	176	254	Hopped st;insd;angld3w/ Pressed btw; weakened;/ Ran out turn;9p;empty
			6.0	4 4	MALIBU S S	2>4	10881	R>S,D>D	**Empty inside (79)**   DROP SWITCH 1st off 40 day layoff.Class Change -66 Finished 4 from post 2 TJW= 76	77	3	80	4	78	7	82	72	154	4.70	4.20	1.13	5.00	3.30	1.50	91	93	68	79,75,87,75,74	87	40	80.0	E/P	2	0	1.20	183	OP	8.5	C	A>C	125	13.5	84.9	98.4	184	252	Empty inside/ vied btw;3p upr;clear/
			6.0	3 3	MILLARD'S	4>2	2874	R>S,D>D	**3-4w gain; dueled btw (76)**   Chased Pace. Made big overall move (3).BTL HORSE 1st off 75 day layoff.Class Change 9 Finished 2 from post 4 TJW= 39	70	2	70	2	76	9	81	80	161	5.80	4.60	1.27	6.30	4.20	1.50	86	82	73	76,75,80,85,73	73	75	77.0	P	1	0	5.00	148	HAW	8.3	C	C>C	111	14.9	84.9	99.8	168	241	Ins;3w1/4;chased;missd 3-4w gain; dueled btw/ Forwd;bid btw;2d best/ Outsld;dueled;2nd best
			6.0	1 1	CLASSIC	2>2	5348	S>S,D>D	**Ins;4p1/4;kept at bay (77)**   Flashed speed. 1st off 40 day layoff.Class Change 19 Finished 2 from post 2 TJW= 97	82	5	81	6	77	10	85	88	172	6.30	3.80	1.65	7.60	3.30	2.29	87	82	87	77,79,76,82,84	87	40	77.0	P	2	0	3.00	145	FG	6.0	C	C>C	117	14.2	88.0	102.2	169	256	Ins;4p1/4;kept at bay/ Range up 3w2nd;left ld/ Trail 5-6p;mvd up late

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	PPOT	AEPS	LAST DS	NOTES FROM LAST RACE	SPD		SPD		AVG		S1	S2	TOT	SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	TDS1	TDS2	CLOSE	E1	E2	LP	LAST FIVE SPEED RATINGS	HIGH BYER			MLINE	CLS	TRK	DIS	TYPE	CHNG	PMR	CLASS	FINAL	COMB	ERLY TOTL		COMMENTS			
										#110	#110	TDS	#TDS	SPD	#R														ATDS	DSL	AVG3											BRIS	P		EQUIP	TOTL	LAST
1/26/23	FG	2	8.5	7 7	CAP ROCK	1>6	2917	R>R,D>D	**5p;headd 5/8;caved 1/4 (55)**THIRD OFF MAYBE?   Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 1-hole.SLR?- 23 Slow last race (18). 1st off 42 day layoff.Class Change 4 Finished 6 from post 1 TJW= 58	73	9	73	9	73	10	83	59	142	1.90	5.00	0.38	1.90	5.20	0.36	95	94	24	55,78,67,70,81	81	42	67.0	E	8	0	2.00	126	FG	8.5	C	C>C	115	11.1	80.7	91.8	189	213	5p;headd 5/8;caved 1/4/ Clear 3-4p;held sway/ Led;2-3p;weakened
			8.5	1 1	MUSCADINE	8>9	2034	S>R,D>D	**Bump st;4-6p;faded (46)**  SLR?- 22 Slow last race (23). Class Change 0 Finished 9 from post 8 TJW= 24	72	7	72	7	69	10	77	73	150	6.50	7.20	0.90	5.90	7.00	0.85	77	69	62	46,68,75,54,67	87	19	63.0	E	5	0	12.00	146	FG	6.0	C	C>C	103	2.7	81.9	84.6	146	208	Bump st;4-6p;faded/ Evenly to str; empty/ Dueled; led; gave way
			8.5	6 6	THE GRAY	7>8	2914	R>R,D>D	**Track 3pbtw;faded 5/16 (52)**  SLR?- 25 Slow last race (19). Class Change 0 Finished 8 from post 7 TJW= 30	65	3	65	3	71	10	74	69	142	6.80	6.50	1.05	5.70	6.20	0.92	79	72	41	52,77,78,65,60	77	21	69.0	P	6	0	8.00	126	FG	8.5	C	C>C	109	10.0	76.1	86.2	151	192	Track 3pbtw;faded 5/16/ Ins;drift out;bid;clrd/ Savd ground;rail chase
			8.5	3 3	MISHKO	8>3	4151	R>R,D>D	**Track 4p;chased evenly (74)**   Class Change 0 Finished 3 from post 8 TJW= 50	73	2	73	2	75	10	75	87	161	7.90	7.40	1.06	4.00	4.00	1.00	78	74	76	74,72,54,68,80	74	21	67.0	P	4	0	5.00	156	FG	8.5	C	C>C	112	13.6	81.2	94.8	152	228	Track 4p;chased evenly/ Stalk 3p;chasd;left ld/ Trailed throughout
			8.5	2 2	SERMONONTH	4>1	9864	R>R,D>D	**Duel 2w;drove clear1/8 (82)**   Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 4-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH!BTL HORSE Clear early.Class Change 0 Finished 1 from post 4 TJW= 52	76	9	76	10	76	10	78	91	168	7.10	6.00	1.17	7.10	6.00	1.17	83	80	84	82,61,77,61,76	85	21	73.0	E	6	0	1.60	177	FG	8.5	C	C>C	117	15.0	86.2	101.2	163	247	Duel 2w;drove clear1/8/ Brsh btw;4-6p;eased up/ Stalk ins;kept at bay
			8.5	4 4	COLOR FAST	3>3	1804	R>R,T>D	**Bid1/4;2p;late gain (73)**   Chased Pace. Made big overall move (3). Made a big move early (4.75). 1st off 128 day layoff.Class Change 4 Finished 3 from post 3 TJW= 38	70	4	70	4	71	10	81	76	157	6.80	4.30	1.59	6.80	4.50	1.50	79	85	69	73,73,73,74,75	76	128	73.0	P	3	0	6.00	126	LAD	8.0	C	C>C	105	14.0	84.4	98.4	164	233	Bid1/4;2p;late gain/ Inside turn; kept on/ Angled out; up for 3rd
			8.5	5 5	EAST LEX	1>5	2894	R>R,D>D	**Ins;improved btw 1/8 (67)**   Made big overall move (3). Made a big move early (5). Class Change 0 Finished 5 from post 1 TJW= 49	69	3	69	3	72	10	71	85	155	7.90	4.50	1.76	9.00	5.70	1.58	59	66	72	67,71,69,75,72	71	21	69.0	S	0	0	10.00	134	FG	8.5	C	C>C	109	11.3	81.4	92.7	125	197	Ins;improved btw 1/8/ 3-2p;8p upr;stayed on/ Off pace 2p;no menace



DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	PPOT	AEPS	LAST DS	NOTES FROM LAST RACE	SPD		SPD		AVG		LAST FIVE										HIGH			ERLY TOTL		COMMENTS																		
										110	#110	TDS	#TDS	SPD	#R	S1	S2	TOT	SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	TDS1	TDS2	CLOSE	E1	E2	LP	SPEED	RATINGS	ATDS		DSL	AVG3	BRIS	P	EQUIP	MLINE	CLS	TRK	DIS	TYPE	CHNG	PMR	CLASS	FINAL	COMB	TOTL	PACE	
1/26/23	FG	5	8.3	5	5	RIGHTANDJU	10>8	11845	R>R,D>D	**Press 2w;bid btw;wknd (86)**THIRD OFF MAYBE   DROP SWITCH Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 10-hole. 1st off 31 day layoff.Class Change -31 Finished 8 from post 10 TJW= 57	83	8	83	8	83	10	76	76	152	3.70	4.40	0.85	3.90	4.50	0.86	94	99	75	86,78,87,91,85	91	31	84.0	E	7	0	0	6.00	196	FG	8.5	A	N>A	132	5.8	82.5	88.3	193	268	Press 2w;bid btw;wknd/ Pressed; tired/ Dug in rail; missed
			8.3	1	1	MAILMAN	9>7	17883	R>R,D>D	**2-wide; tired (82)**   DROP SWITCH 1st off 60 day layoff.Class Change -21 Finished 7 from post 9 TJW= 71	86	9	86	9	86	10	94	81	175	5.40	5.30	1.02	5.20	5.20	1.00	85	90	79	82,74,82,88,87	97	60	79.0	E/P	6	0	0	4.00	213	CD	8.0	A	A0>A	128	14.2	82.5	96.7	175	254	2-wide; tired/ Stalk 2w-ins;tired 2nd/ 4p into lane; faded
			8.3	3	3	CASH	2>7	21419	R>R,T>D	**Tracked inside; faded (87)**   1st off 320 day layoff.Class Change 5 Finished 7 from post 2 TJW= 45	86	6	86	6	86	10	66	95	161	4.20	4.00	1.06	3.80	3.20	1.20	78	86	88	87,92,86,91,86	93	320	88.0	E/P	4	0	0	6.00	198	FG	8.5	A	A0>A	131	15.2	81.3	96.6	164	252	Tracked inside; faded/ 3wd;4-6p1/4;rallied;up/ Off slow;chased; faded 4w1st;prssd;gaveway/ 3w;spar 2w2nd;lng due1/ Best of others
			8.3	4	4	DUST EM	4>4	9002	S>R,D>D	**4w1st;prssd;gaveway (65)**   Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 4-hole.SLR?- 27 Slow last race (18). Class Change 25 Finished 4 from post 4 TJW= 35	89	4	89	4	83	10	80	71	150	4.80	3.90	1.24	3.90	2.90	1.33	88	85	67	65,92,89,83,87	92	20	82.0	E/P	5	0	0	4.50	198	DED	6.5	A	R>A	127	13.0	83.5	96.6	173	240	4w1st;prssd;gaveway/ 3w;spar 2w2nd;lng due1/ Best of others
			8.3	2	2	WARRANT	5>3	75360	R>R,D>D	**Track pace;4w;kept on (96)**   DROP SWITCH Made big overall move (3). *Stretch gain (.25).BTL HORSE 1st off 201 day layoff.Class Change -26 Finished 3 from post 5 TJW= 91	93	2	95	9	95	10	70	94	164	4.10	2.90	1.41	4.50	3.10	1.45	74	80	109	96,99,98,104,93	104	201	98.0	E/P	4	0	0	0.80	223	PRM	9.0	A	G3>A	139	19.1	85.2	104.3	154	263	Track pace;4w;kept on/ Bobbled st; mild kick/ 3p1st;ins upr;weakened

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	PPOT	AEPS	LAST DS	NOTES FROM LAST RACE	SPD		SPD		AVG		LAST FIVE										HIGH			ERLY TOTL		COMMENTS																		
										110	#110	TDS	#TDS	SPD	#R	S1	S2	TOT	SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	TDS1	TDS2	CLOSE	E1	E2	LP	SPEED	RATINGS	ATDS		DSL	AVG3	BRIS	P	EQUIP	MLINE	CLS	TRK	DIS	TYPE	CHNG	PMR	CLASS	FINAL	COMB	TOTL	PACE	
1/26/23	FG	6	6.0	2	2	ZIPPIN	10>9	8723	S>S,D>D	**Set pace; tired (71)**   DROP SWITCH Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 10-hole.SLR?- 11 Slow last race (10). 1st off 62 day layoff.Class Change -21 Finished 9 from post 10 TJW= 87	ERR	0	82	3	81	10	89	72	161	1.40	4.80	0.30	1.20	4.40	0.27	93	97	59	71,82,87,79,77	89	62	80.0	E	5	0	0	5.00	186	CD	7.0	A	A>A	124	11.0	84.7	95.7	190	249	Set pace; tired/ Ins pair;yielded 1/8/ Long due1 2wd;lsted
			6.0	1	1	GREYS THE	8>1	6842	S>S,D>D	**4p;rally;drove clr1/8 (86)**   Made big overall move (5). Fast last race (12).BTL HORSE 1st off 38 day layoff.Class Change 29 Finished 1 from post 8 TJW= 42	82	2	82	2	74	6	88	85	172	4.50	5.80	0.78	4.50	3.00	1.50	90	93	86	86,75,76,70,59	86	38	79.0	E/P	0	0	0	4.50	180	FG	6.0	A	S>A	119	15.3	88.4	103.6	183	269	4p;rally;drove clr1/8/ Track 4w;6p1/4;no bid/ 2p turn; evenly late
			6.0	7	7	BOYFRIEND	6>3	6031	S>S,D>D	**Track 4w;6p upr;kepton (72)**   1st off 40 day layoff.Class Change 64 Finished 3 from post 6 TJW= 43	72	1	75	2	76	10	85	84	168	5.80	7.40	0.78	5.30	6.70	0.80	85	82	81	72,67,65,77,78	77	40	68.0	E	0	0	0	20.00	179	FG	6.0	A	C>A	113	12.0	85.3	97.3	167	248	Track 4w;6p upr;kepton/ Little left drive/ Due1 inside;2p;tired
			6.0	4	4	UNDERHILL	6>2	11042	S>S,D>D	**3wd;bid1/4;led;outkckd (102)**   Chased Pace. Fast last race (16).BTL HORSE Class Change 4 Finished 2 from post 6 TJW= 53	90	4	90	4	86	5	94	90	184	4.50	4.00	1.13	4.80	3.00	1.60	97	107	92	102,80,72,92,84	102	28	85.0	E/P	4	0	0	2.00	192	FG	6.0	A	A0>A	132	18.2	88.2	106.4	204	296	3wd;bid1/4;led;outkckd/ Chasd 3-4p turn;no bid/ 2w-3p;wkn/jstld btw1/4
			6.0	5	5	BADGEBALL	2>9	13471	R>S,D>D	**Inside; weakend (49)**   DROP SWITCHSLR?- 32 Slow last race (25). 1st off 85 day layoff.Class Change -21 Finished 9 from post 2 TJW= 47	79	4	79	4	74	6	87	63	150	6.80	5.80	1.17	6.30	4.80	1.32	88	79	35	49,81,81,92,80	92	85	70.0	P	0	0	0	12.00	202	CD	8.0	A	A>A	115	9.5	79.2	88.7	167	202	Inside; weakend/ ChckS/8;2w;no thrt btw/ Bump btw st;3p;7p upr
			6.0	6	6	TWIRLING	3>3	4664	S>S,D>D	**Prss 2w;oukckd;kept on (94)**   Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 3-hole.Uncharacteristic race? Class Change 4 Finished 3 from post 3 TJW= 53	87	7	87	7	85	10	94	85	179	4.30	3.70	1.18	4.80	2.90	1.64	101	107	82	94,89,84,84,84	94	28	89.0	E/P	4	0	0	4.00	176	FG	6.0	A	A0>A	127	16.8	88.3	105.1	208	290	Prss 2w;oukckd;kept on/ Tracked 4-5wd;rallied/ Tracked 4w;late surge
			6.0	3	3	MINNESOTA	1>3	9564	R>S,D>D	**Ins;6p upr;stayed on (87)**   Made big overall move (4). *Stretch gain (.25).BTL HORSE 1st off 46 day layoff.Class Change 4 Finished 3 from post 1 TJW= 62	91	1	91	1	81	10	79	87	166	7.10	4.90	1.46	5.00	1.00	5.00	90	92	82	87,86,81,82,91	91	46	85.0	S	0	0	0	3.50	189	FG	8.5	A	A0>A	125	16.8	83.3	100.1	182	264	Ins;6p upr;stayed on/ 3p;5p1/4;chased/ Angled out; late rally









DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	PPOT	AEPS	LAST DS	NOTES FROM LAST RACE	SPD	SPD	AVG	LAST FIVE										HIGH			ERLY TOTL		COMMENTS																			
										#110	#110	TDS	#TDS	SPD	#R	S1	S2	TOT	SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	TDS1	TDS2	CLOSE	E1	E2	LP		SPEED	RATINGS	ATDS	DSL	AVG3	BRIS	P	EQUIP	MLINE	CLS	TRK	DIS	TYPE	CHNG	PMR	CLASS	FINAL	COMB	TOTL
1/26/23	GP	5	7.0	3 3	ROGER	10>12	19696	S>S,D>D	**Dropped back readily (61)**THIRD OFF MAYBE?   DROP SWITCHSLR?- 18 Slow last race (11). 1st off 40 day layoff.Class Change -71 Finished 12 from post 10 TJW=69	71	2	74	5	72	6	84	71	155	4.00	6.20	0.65	4.20	5.60	0.76	87	87	60	61,79,62,81,73	81	40	67.0	E	3	0	6.00	202	TP	6.5	C	A>C	124	10.2	82.5	92.7	174	234	Dropped back readily/ Mid pack; no threat;/ Dueld ins;gave way5/16
			7.0	5 5	SOVEREIGN	2>1	2527	R>S,D>D	**3p;openup ins;much bst (80)**   Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 2-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH!BTL HORSE Clear early.1st off 56 day layoff.Class Change 9 Finished 1 from post 2 TJW= 71	ERR	0	71	8	72	10	84	89	172	4.40	4.90	0.89	5.10	5.70	0.89	70	68	96	80,76,67,65,69	80	56	74.0	E	5	0	5.00	132	GP	8.0	C	C>C	111	15.2	85.2	100.5	138	234	3p;openup ins;much bst/ 3p str;ran on;caught/ Duell btwn;1paced lane
			7.0	6 6	LORD	6>7	3276	R>S,D>D	**Pace;tired after a 1/2 (35)**   DROP SWITCH Flashed speed.SLR?- 39 Slow last race (27).Uncharacteristic race? 1st off 69 day layoff.Class Change -56 Finished 7 from post 6 TJW= 27	66	2	63	3	62	10	80	50	129	6.70	7.10	0.94	8.50	8.50	1.00	85	72	20	35,74,81,62,52	73	69	63.0	E/P	1	0	12.00	108	GP	8.0	C	AO>C	109	7.7	79.2	86.9	157	177	Pace;tired after a 1/2/ Clear pace; faltered/ Set pace; clear
			7.0	2 2	CAMINERO	7>4	5042	S>S,D>D	**4p;bid3/8;flatnd3p/16 (83)**   DROP SWITCH Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 7-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH!BTL HORSE Clear early.Class Change -10 Finished 4 from post 7 TJW= 61	79	7	78	10	78	10	89	77	165	5.30	5.40	0.98	5.30	5.40	0.98	92	95	80	83,66,74,85,56	91	25	74.0	E/P	4	0	4.00	148	GP	6.5	C	C>C	119	13.2	87.5	100.7	187	267	4p;bid3/8;flatnd3p/16/ Never factored/ 3p trn;4p upr;bid;fade
			7.0	7 7	HIGH YIELD	4>6	2288	S>S,D>D	**Trail8p upr;no threat (80)**   *Stretch gain (.25).BTL HORSE Class Change -10 Finished 6 from post 4 TJW= 34	78	2	80	5	81	10	84	80	163	6.30	6.30	1.00	7.30	7.30	1.00	83	85	86	80,87,75,75,89	87	25	81.0	E/P	2	0	3.50	151	GP	6.5	C	C>C	118	14.2	87.4	101.6	168	254	Trail8p upr;no threat/ 3p;4p upr;bid1/8;hung/ Pressed 2wd; tired
			7.0	1 1	HEY PORTER	7>8	4328	R>S,T>D	**Steady st; 3w mid move (74)**   DROP SWITCH Chased Pace. Made a big move early (5.5). Class Change -6 Finished 8 from post 7 TJW= 40	77	2	71	4	74	10	74	93	167	7.30	6.80	1.06	8.10	7.30	1.11	58	68	82	74,76,77,76,80	80	26	76.0	P	0	0	12.00	142	GP	8.5	C	C>C	114	6.6	85.0	91.6	126	208	Steady st; 3w mid move/ 3w1st;5p;4p2nd;kept on/ Wellbck btwn;no menace
			7.0	4 4	ASHAAB	3>7	5463	R>S,T>D	**Outside;2-3p;no bid (62)**   DROP SWITCH Slow last race (12). Class Change -41 Finished 7 from post 3 TJW= 60	79	5	79	5	74	10	84	83	167	7.10	6.30	1.12	6.10	3.90	1.56	83	77	58	62,71,76,72,60	89	27	70.0	S	0	0	10.00	187	TAM	8.0	C	AO>C	115	8.2	85.5	93.7	160	218	Outside;2-3p;no bid/ Pulled early;no threat/ 3p;up1/8;kpt alert
			7.0	9 9	APPRAISAL	1>3	3488	R>S,D>D	**2p;4w 3/16;kept trying (77)**   Flashed speed.Uncharacteristic race? 1st off 36 day layoff.Class Change 9 Finished 3 from post 1 TJW= 71	84	1	78	6	78	10	88	80	168	5.40	4.70	1.16	6.40	4.20	1.53	88	82	77	77,81,84,81,72	84	36	81.0	P	2	0	4.50	134	GP	8.0	C	C>C	118	14.7	86.7	101.4	170	247	2p;4w 3/16;kept trying/ Ins;drftd out str;even/ 3-deep;duel;led;game
			7.0	8 8	GLORIOUS	7>1	4879	R>S,D>D	**3wd; up 1/16; drvng (76)**   Chased Pace. Made big overall move (3).SLR?- 11BTL HORSE Class Change 5 Finished 1 from post 7 TJW= 63	77	1	77	1	77	10	82	91	173	4.50	3.60	1.25	5.40	2.30	2.33	80	77	77	76,87,68,77,75	77	19	77.0	P	1	0	8.00	135	GP	8.5	C	C>C	122	15.0	88.9	103.9	157	234	3wd; up 1/16; drvng/ 3-5w;clear;just caught/ Off rail; best of rest

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	PPOT	AEPS	LAST DS	NOTES FROM LAST RACE	SPD	SPD	AVG	LAST FIVE										HIGH			ERLY TOTL		COMMENTS																			
										#110	#110	TDS	#TDS	SPD	#R	S1	S2	TOT	SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	TDS1	TDS2	CLOSE	E1	E2	LP		SPEED	RATINGS	ATDS	DSL	AVG3	BRIS	P	EQUIP	MLINE	CLS	TRK	DIS	TYPE	CHNG	PMR	CLASS	FINAL	COMB	TOTL
1/26/23	GP	6	8.0	5 5	IT CAN	3>7	5632	S>R,D>D	**Pursued; gave way (54)**  SLR?- 19 Slow last race (20). 1st off 92 day layoff.Class Change 29 Finished 7 from post 3 TJW= 39	ERR	0	ERR	0	74	10	93	65	158	5.00	5.20	0.97	ERR	ERR	ERR	96	94	44	54,73,67,74,77	0	92	65.0	E/P	8	BON	15.00	161	PRX	6.5	A	CO>A	113	6.3	80.9	87.1	190	234	Pursued; gave way/ Shrp 2p;2p;wkn insde/ Forward 3w;faded turn
			8.0	7 7	OUR	6>8	7387	R>R,D>D	**Bmp st;6p;no menace (48)**  SLR?- 31 Slow last race (32). 1st off 46 day layoff.Class Change 34 Finished 8 from post 6 TJW= 71	78	5	78	5	80	10	82	55	136	4.50	4.40	1.03	3.50	5.00	0.71	88	82	32	48,79,86,86,81	89	46	71.0	E	5	0	5.00	177	GP	8.0	A	CO>A	115	9.4	79.2	88.6	170	202	Bmp st;6p;no menace/ Rtd ins;swng6p ln;even/ 2w;led3/8-1/4;1ft lead
			8.0	2 2	SHEZA	2>1	3570	S>R,D>D	**3p;btwn trn;bid4p;helld (77)**   Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 2-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH!BTL HORSE Clear early.1st off 41 day layoff.Class Change 59 Finished 1 from post 2 TJW= 31	74	1	74	1	73	10	89	77	165	6.90	6.00	1.15	7.50	10.00	0.75	88	90	74	77,79,81,74,81	74	41	79.0	E/P	6	0	20.00	141	GP	7.0	A	C>A	116	12.3	80.4	92.6	178	252	3p;btwn trn;bid4p;helld/ Failed to menace; 3-4w/ 5w trn;6p str;kept on
			8.0	3 3	AMERICAN	5>3	6670	S>R,D>D	**5p;angle7p str;evenly (78)**THIRD OFF   Made big overall move (3). Class Change -21 Finished 3 from post 5 TJW= 32	ERR	0	ERR	0	79	10	89	83	172	4.60	3.60	1.27	ERR	ERR	ERR	85	86	85	78,83,82,82,80	0	28	81.0	E/P	6	0	4.00	140	GP	6.0	A	AO>A	121	13.8	87.8	101.6	171	256	5p;angle7p str;evenly/ Ins;3w trn;drvn6p str/ Pace 2p; yielded 1/16
			8.0	1 1	ROSE E	3>3	5241	R>R,D>D	**Up close inside;evenly (69)**   Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 3-hole.SLR?- 16Uncharacteristic race?BTL HORSE 1st off 31 day layoff.Class Change 59 Finished 3 from post 3 TJW= 54	72	6	72	6	73	10	60	92	151	7.40	4.90	1.53	6.90	4.00	1.74	71	69	73	69,85,86,78,65	78	31	80.0	P	5	0	5.00	135	GP	8.3	A	C>A	115	13.1	85.1	98.3	140	213	Up close inside;evenly/ Rallied for place/ Late rally; gaining
			8.0	4 4	MORE GLORY	7>7	3873	S>R,D>D	**Rated3p;no menace (69)**   1st off 36 day layoff.Class Change -6 Finished 7 from post 7 TJW= 35	75	2	75	2	74	10	84	78	161	9.30	5.30	1.76	8.80	5.00	1.75	80	78	75	69,77,73,61,79	76	36	73.0	S	4	0	20.00	158	GP	7.0	A	AO>A	112	10.5	84.3	94.8	158	233	Rated3p;no menace/ Chs4p;ins upr;ran on/ Outrun inside
			8.0	6 6	BATTLE CRY	2>1	9321	R>R,D>D	**2p;open3p str;much bst (93)**   Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 2-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH!BTL HORSE Clear early.1st off 46 day layoff.Class Change 34 Finished 1 from post 2 TJW= 78	87	9	87	9	87	10	87	85	171	5.00	2.60	1.94	4.30	2.60	1.67	94	93	92	93,87,89,84,84	93	46	90.0	E/P	7	0	0.80	174	GP	8.0	A	CO>A	133	17.7	88.2	105.9	187	279	2p;open3p str;much bst/ 3-4p;duel;edged clear/ Stalked 3w; driving

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	PPOT	AEPS	LAST DS	NOTES FROM LAST RACE	SPD	SPD	AVG	LAST FIVE										HIGH		ERLY TOTL										COMMENTS												
										#110	#110	#R	S1	S2	TOT	SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	TDS1	TDS2	CLOSE	E1	E2	LP	SPEED	RATINGS	ATDS	DSL	AVG3	BRIS	P	EQUIP	MLINE	CLS		TRK	DIS	TYPE	CHNG	PMR	CLASS	FINAL	COMB	TOTL	LAST		
1/26/23	GP	7	8.0	3 3	PARIS	6>6	8885	R>R,T>T	**Ins trio upr;wknd 1/8 (87)**   DROP SWITCH Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 6-hole. Clear early.1st off 103 day layoff.Class Change -19 Finished 6 from post 6 TJW= 41	0	4	87	1	87	1	80	97	177	1.70	10.00	0.17	1.70	10.00	0.17	89	95	78	87,0,0,0,0	87	103	87.0	E	6	0	6.00	228	KEE	9.0	A	G1>A	140	16.5	87.8	104.3	184	262	Ins trio upr;wknd 1/8/ /
			8.0	12 12	ZELDA	2>6	9242	S>R,T>T	**Pinch st;keen;inside (61)**   DROP SWITCH Flashed speed. 1st off 83 day layoff.Class Change -6 Finished 6 from post 2 TJW= 86	0	2	ERR	0	61	1	86	78	164	4.30	8.60	0.50	ERR	ERR	ERR	89	92	58	61,0,0,0,0	0	83	61.0	NA	6	0	4.50	215	AQU	6.0	A	A0>A	122	12.5	87.6	100.2	181	239	Pinch st;keen;inside/ /
			8.0	16 16	TRAFFIC	10>2	9473	R>R,T>T	**Hit gate; 3wd to lead (89)**   Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 10-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH! Clear early.Class Change 4 Finished 2 from post 10 TJW= 94	82	8	81	9	79	10	97	90	186	3.30	4.60	0.72	3.10	4.40	0.70	107	107	70	89,74,78,92,86	92	28	80.0	E	5	0	6.00	196	GP	8.5	A	A0>A	130	16.5	85.9	102.4	214	284	Hit gate; 3wd to lead/ Extended battle ins/ Saved ground;no gain
			8.0	7 7	MISS	9>1	10910	R>R,T>T	**Stalk;2p;drew off (92)**   Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 9-hole. Fast last race (11).Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH!BTL HORSE Clear early.1st off 119 day layoff.Class Change 24 Finished 1 from post 9 TJW= 47	85	6	85	6	81	10	82	85	166	4.40	4.70	0.94	3.30	3.60	0.94	81	93	90	92,88,80,79,80	92	119	87.0	E/P	5	0	15.00	180	DEL	8.3	A	A>A	131	17.8	87.3	105.1	174	264	Stalk;2p;drew off/ Inside; angl; driving/ Tracked ins; rebuffed
			8.0	2 2	ARM CANDY	6>9	12163	R>R,D>T	**Bumped start; 3-4wd (81)**   1st off 42 day layoff.Class Change 8 Finished 9 from post 6 TJW= 71	84	8	84	8	84	10	81	77	157	5.40	5.20	1.04	4.50	4.80	0.93	89	96	68	81,87,84,76,88	89	42	84.0	P	3	0	5.00	209	GP	8.3	A	A0>A	135	14.6	86.0	100.6	185	253	Bumped start; 3-4wd/ Ins;7w1/8;stayd on btw/ Settled; bid 2w; empty
			8.0	10 10	TREASURE	3>8	9686	R>R,D>T	**Tracked ins;empty lane (80)**   DROP SWITCH Flashed speed. 1st off 40 day layoff.Class Change -16 Finished 8 from post 3 TJW= 73	73	2	77	4	77	7	68	-9	59	6.30	6.00	1.05	5.90	6.60	0.89	81	88	57	80,75,80,83,76	83	40	78.0	S	2	0	20.00	185	GP	12.0	A	N>A	130	16.0	81.2	97.2	169	226	Tracked ins;empty lane/ Rallied4w3/8;closed/ Inside;svd gnd;tired
			8.0	11 11	SWEET	2>6	9379	R>R,T>T	**3-4 wide; lacked rally (84)**   1st off 96 day layoff.Class Change -6 Finished 6 from post 2 TJW= 43	85	4	85	6	84	10	81	93	174	5.60	5.20	1.07	4.90	6.30	0.77	60	77	91	84,84,83,84,81	89	96	84.0	E/P	3	0	20.00	214	WD	8.5	A	A0>A	131	15.7	85.1	100.9	137	228	3-4 wide; lacked rally/ Contend3/16;stalled1/8/ Asked3/8;had no finish
			8.0	4 4	BRAMBLE	5>4	13938	S>R,T>T	**Bump st;2-3w;left lead (79)**   Made big overall move (3). Made a big move early (3). 1st off 55 day layoff.Class Change 9 Finished 4 from post 5 TJW= 65	83	7	83	6	80	10	74	57	130	4.50	4.00	1.13	4.20	4.00	1.06	82	87	78	79,85,80,83,79	89	55	81.0	E/P	5	0	10.00	203	GP	7.5	A	A0>A	142	15.4	90.3	105.7	169	247	Bump st;2-3w;left lead/ 2-3p;led ins1/8;denied/ Angled out; rallied
			8.0	13 13	FAST AS	1>2	17315	S>R,T>T	**2w; led; fought on ins (84)**   Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 1-hole.BTL HORSE 1st off 55 day layoff.Class Change 9 Finished 2 from post 1 TJW= 69	82	5	79	5	82	10	77	57	133	3.30	2.70	1.22	2.70	2.90	0.93	94	93	80	84,85,83,87,90	85	55	84.0	E/P	5	0	6.00	190	GP	7.5	A	A0>A	139	16.6	89.6	106.2	187	267	2w; led; fought on ins/ Bmpbtw;ins;rail bid1/8/ Ins;bmp 3-5wupr;onepcd
			8.0	14 14	LOVE IN	1>5	24102	R>R,D>T	**8w upper; weakened (88)**   1st off 54 day layoff.Class Change -11 Finished 5 from post 1 TJW= 74	83	5	85	4	87	10	86	76	161	3.20	2.50	1.29	3.50	2.70	1.30	99	107	72	88,98,93,80,103	103	54	93.0	E	5	0	8.00	200	AQU	8.0	A	G3>A	146	16.1	85.7	101.8	206	278	8w upper; weakened/ Repelled foe; clear/ Measured lead; clear
			8.0	15 15	MY CANDY	4>4	9161	R>R,T>T	**Bump st; 2w; rail 3/16 (88)**   Made big overall move (3). Class Change 4 Finished 4 from post 4 TJW= 37	84	9	84	9	81	10	92	94	185	5.50	4.00	1.37	5.20	3.70	1.43	99	97	78	88,84,88,84,85	91	28	87.0	P	1	0	15.00	187	GP	8.5	A	A0>A	135	16.0	89.8	105.8	196	274	Bump st; 2w; rail 3/16/ 2-3wd; gamely btw/ 4wd 1/4; driving
			8.0	1 1	MISS MARIE	3>1	13707	R>R,T>T	**8wstr;best stride late (88)**   DROP SWITCH Made big overall move (6).BTL HORSE 1st off 89 day layoff.2 races in one pattern.Class Change -6 Finished 1 from post 3 TJW= 41	79	4	81	6	82	10	84	98	182	7.10	5.10	1.38	7.00	4.20	1.67	90	89	87	88,78,88,79,70	88	89	85.0	S	0	0	15.00	215	WD	8.5	A	A0>A	130	15.6	85.3	100.9	179	266	8wstr;best stride late/ Late interest rail str/ 2w;5-6w str;evened out
			8.0	8 8	LOVE HER	6>1	12218	R>R,D>T	**4-3wd; up 1/8; drvng (84)**   Chased Pace. Made big overall move (5).BTL HORSE 1st off 34 day layoff.Class Change 44 Finished 1 from post 6 TJW= 62	84	4	85	3	82	10	73	89	161	5.80	3.60	1.59	5.70	3.90	1.45	68	77	90	84,71,83,78,80	86	34	79.0	E/P	4	0	12.00	189	GP	8.5	A	CO>A	129	16.5	86.1	102.6	145	235	4-3wd; up 1/8; drvng/ Bumped start; 3-4wd/ Tracked 3wd; driving
			8.0	6 6	MISS	1>6	11603	S>R,D>T	**Outrun inside (73)**   *Stretch gain (1).BTL HORSE 1st off 56 day layoff.Class Change 9 Finished 6 from post 1 TJW= 63	ERR	0	ERR	0	80	10	80	-9	71	7.80	4.80	1.63	ERR	ERR	ERR	73	0	90	73,78,86,81,85	0	56	79.0	S	4	0	30.00	199	GP	5.0	A	A0>A	124	12.3	89.8	102.0	73	163	Outrun inside/ Ins turn;7p1/8;no fctr/ 3w turn;4w1/4;no rally
			8.0	5 5	TALBEYAH	2>4	6089	R>R,D>T	**Weaved through foes (82)**   DROP SWITCH Made big overall move (5). 1st off 166 day layoff.Class Change -11 Finished 4 from post 2 TJW= 75	ERR	0	ERR	0	82	3	62	100	162	8.50	4.40	1.92	ERR	ERR	ERR	71	61	104	82,78,87,0,0	0	166	82.0	S	0	0	6.00	220	WD	8.5	A	G3>A	128	15.7	84.2	99.9	132	236	Weaved through foes/ Awkward brk;off rail/ Off slow;4w;surgd clr
			8.0	9 9	WHITE	5>2	30784	R>R,T>T	**Ins-2p;drop in ins3/16 (85)**   Made big overall move (4). *Stretch gain (2.25).BTL HORSE 1st off 438 day layoff.Class Change -14 Finished 2 from post 5 TJW= 56	82	3	82	3	77	5	65	99	164	4.90	2.30	2.10	4.80	1.30	3.75	83	74	95	85,85,76,69,70	85	438	82.0	P	5	0	3.00	192	AQU	8.5	A	N>A	135	17.3	85.3	102.6	157	252	Ins-2p;drop in ins3/16/ 3w btw top str;kick in/ Ins;3w upr;alter 4w1/8

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	PPOT	AEPS	LAST DS	NOTES FROM LAST RACE	SPD	SPD	AVG	LAST FIVE											HIGH			ERLY		TOTL	COMMENTS																		
										#110	#110	TDS	#TDS	SPD	#R	S1	S2	TOT	SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	TDS1	TDS2	CLOSE	E1	E2	LP	SPEED	RATINGS		ATDS	DSL	AVG3	BRIS	P	EQUIP	MLINE	CLS	TRK	DIS	TYPE	CHNG	PMR	CLASS	FINAL	COMB	PACE	PACE
1/26/23	GP	8	5.0	1	1	WILMA	9>1	6990	S>S,D>D	**Ran clear ridden out (75)**THIRD OFF MAYBE?   Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 9-hole. Fast last race (16).BTL HORSE Clear early.1st off 40 day layoff.Class Change 62 Finished 1 from post 9 TJW= 79	ERR	0	63	3	59	4	82	82	164	2.50	3.60	0.69	2.40	3.10	0.78	86	84	83	75,56,47,59,0	75	40	59.0	E/P	5	0	8.00	151	TP	6.0	A	M>A	115	14.0	85.4	99.4	170	253	Ran clear ridden out/ Pressed;led;weakened;/ Chase;2p;faded
			5.0	3	3	HOAX	6>2	13336	S>S,D>D	**Chased winner 2wd (82)**   DROP SWITCH Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 6-hole. 1st off 49 day layoff.Class Change -8 Finished 2 from post 6 TJW= 86 **5p;6w trn;7p upr;1pace (83)**   Chased Pace. Made big overall move (3). 1st off 55 day layoff.Class Change 2 Finished 4 from post 4 TJW= 71	79	2	72	4	72	4	87	-9	78	2.90	3.90	0.73	2.90	3.90	0.73	98	0	75	82,65,76,65,0	82	49	74.0	E/P	7	0	2.50	180	GP	5.0	A	AO>A	123	15.4	91.2	106.6	98	173	Chased winner 2wd/ Rail; gave way 1/4/ 3p; up 1/16; game btw
			5.0	6	6	ALTERNATE	4>4	10496	S>S,D>D	**3w;ridden6p str;tired (74)**   Flashed speed. 1st off 55 day layoff.Class Change 2 Finished 6 from post 6 TJW= 55 **Bmp;2p;opn trn;ylt/16 (77)**   Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 5-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH! Clear early.1st off 39 day layoff.Class Change 32 Finished 2 from post 5 TJW= 53	72	2	76	4	78	6	86	82	167	4.10	4.70	0.87	4.50	4.10	1.08	83	87	89	83,77,79,85,77	83	55	80.0	E	3	0	3.00	193	GP	6.0	A	A>A	122	14.3	86.3	100.6	170	259	5p;6w trn;7p upr;1pace/ Tight ins;4wd 3/8;fade/ Outside;5w turn;weaken
			5.0	2	2	OH DARLIN	6>6	13325	S>S,D>D	**4p;bid btw;ins upr;evn (80)**   Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 5-hole.BTL HORSE Clear early.Class Change -15 Finished 3 from post 5 TJW= 31	77	2	76	3	73	4	86	77	162	3.20	3.20	1.00	3.70	3.30	1.11	86	87	78	74,64,78,76,0	78	55	72.0	E/P	5	0	8.00	177	GP	6.0	A	A>A	118	13.3	86.6	99.8	173	251	3w;ridden6p str;tired/ Pace2p;3p str;held plc/ Rail; 3w 3/8; drew off Bmp;2p;opn trn;ylt/16/ Pace 2path; mild urge/ Off bit slow; evenly
			5.0	5	5	MY LADY	5>2	9787	S>S,D>D	**3w;riden6p str;tired (74)**   Flashed speed. 1st off 55 day layoff.Class Change 2 Finished 6 from post 6 TJW= 55 **Bmp;2p;opn trn;ylt/16 (77)**   Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 5-hole.Uncharacteristic early speed? WATCH! Clear early.1st off 39 day layoff.Class Change 32 Finished 2 from post 5 TJW= 53	74	3	74	3	74	3	89	-9	80	3.80	3.30	1.13	3.80	3.30	1.13	94	0	74	77,76,68,0,0	77	39	74.0	E/P	5	0	6.00	148	GP	5.0	A	CO>A	118	13.9	84.1	98.1	94	168	4p;bid btw;ins upr;evn/ Ins;5p ln;drw past1/16/ Trk2w;bid upr;drew clr
			5.0	7	7	CLAY	5>3	16973	S>S,D>D	**3wd; 5wd 1/4; up late (78)**   Flashed speed. Made big overall move (5). Fast last race (14).BTL HORSE 1st off 50 day layoff.Invalid last race. Finished 1 from post 9 TJW= 45	77	3	77	3	77	3	94	-6	88	3.20	2.30	1.40	3.20	2.30	1.40	95	0	76	80,80,72,0,0	80	22	77.0	E/P	6	0	4.00	160	GP	5.0	A	AO>A	123	14.9	92.9	107.8	95	171	4p;bid btw;ins upr;evn/ Ins;5p ln;drw past1/16/ Trk2w;bid upr;drew clr
			5.0	4	4	REVEILLE	9>1	11620	S>S,T>D	**3wd; 5wd 1/4; up late (78)**   Flashed speed. Made big overall move (5). Fast last race (14).BTL HORSE 1st off 50 day layoff.Invalid last race. Finished 1 from post 9 TJW= 45	57	2	57	2	64	3	93	-2	91	5.60	4.00	1.40	6.40	6.40	1.00	95	0	74	78,47,67,0,0	67	50	64.0	P	2	0	6.00	104	GP	5.0	A	MO>A	111	10.3	92.0	102.3	95	169	3wd; 5wd 1/4; up late/ Rail turn; no factor/ Rail turn;4wd 3/16

DATE	TRK #	DT	PP	PRG	HORSE	PPOT	AEPS	LAST DS	NOTES FROM LAST RACE	SPD	SPD	AVG	LAST FIVE											HIGH			ERLY		TOTL	COMMENTS																		
										#110	#110	TDS	#TDS	SPD	#R	S1	S2	TOT	SYS1	SYS2	CLOSE	TDS1	TDS2	CLOSE	E1	E2	LP	SPEED	RATINGS		ATDS	DSL	AVG3	BRIS	P	EQUIP	MLINE	CLS	TRK	DIS	TYPE	CHNG	PMR	CLASS	FINAL	COMB	PACE	PACE
1/26/23	GP	9	8.0	2	2	APPLE	0>0	1 0>R,>T	** (0)**   1st off 738546 day layoff. FTS.Invalid last race. Finished 0 from post 0 TJW= 52	ERR	0	ERR	0	ERR	0	57	-9	48	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	0	0	0,0,0,0,0	0	****	ERR	NA	0	0	20.00	ERR	0.0	M	>M	0.0	ERR	ERR	0	0	/ /				
			8.0	3	3	PLANET	0>0	1 0>R,>T	** (0)**   1st off 738546 day layoff. FTS.Invalid last race. Finished 0 from post 0 TJW= 81	ERR	0	ERR	0	ERR	0	57	-9	48	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	0	0	0,0,0,0,0	0	****	NA	0	0	6.00	ERR	0.0	M	>M	0.0	ERR	ERR	0	0	/ /					
			8.0	4	4	CONNECTING	0>0	1 0>R,>T	** (0)**   1st off 738546 day layoff. FTS.Invalid last race. Finished 0 from post 0 TJW= 61	ERR	0	ERR	0	ERR	0	57	-9	48	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	ERR	0	0	0,0,0,0,0	0	****	NA	0	0	12.00	ERR	0.0	M	>M	0.0	ERR	ERR	0	0	/ /					
			8.0	6	6	MONETIZE	7>8	500	R>R,T>T	**3w early; gave way (50)**   DROP SWITCHUncharacteristic race? 1st off 124 day layoff.Class Change -13 Finished 8 from post 7 TJW= 84	50	1	50	1	50	1	70	77	147	8.80	10.00	0.88	8.80	10.00	0.88	76	64	51	50,0,0,0,0	50	124	50.0	NA	4	0	5.00	156	MED	8.0	M	S>M	90	10.0	79.9	89.9	140	191	3w early; gave way/ /
			8.0	10	10	R ROSE'	4>6	4260	R>R,D>T	**Bmp btwn;5p str;1paced (76)**   DROP SWITCH *Stretch gain (1).BTL HORSE 1st off 31 day layoff.Class Change -33 Finished 6 from post 4 TJW= 79	78	1	78	1	71	5	61	96	156	6.00	6.00	1.00	3.30	3.30	1.00	59	51	103	76,64,78,70,66	78	31	73.0	E	4	0	8.00	168	GP	8.5	M	S>M	117	13.5	82.8	96.2	110	213	Bmp btwn;5p str;1paced/ Ins;gaveway far turn/ 3w trns;4w1/4;willing
			8.0	8	8	PROVOKE ME	9>7	530	S>R,D>T	**No factor; 4wd (61)**   DROP SWITCH 1st off 56 day layoff.Class Change -18 Finished 7 from post 9 TJW= 79	ERR	0	ERR	0	61	1	81	78	158	7.80	7.80	1.00	ERR	ERR	ERR	78	75	78	61,0,0,0,0	0	56	61.0	NA	4	0	15.00	161	GP	5.5	M	S>M	104	9.2	84.5	93.7	153	231	No factor; 4wd/ /
			8.0	5	5	NAA	7>4	1370	R>R,D>T	**3w1st;7p;3p str;evned (71)**THIRD OFF   Flashed speed. *Pressed Pace from 7-hole.BTL HORSE Invalid last race. Finished 4 from post 7 TJW= 66	ERR	0	ERR	0	67	4	68	88	155	5.80	4.70	1.22	ERR	ERR	ERR	61	59	87	71,68,60,67,0	0	29	66.0	P	3	0	4.50	94	GP	8.3	M	MO>M	111	10.8	83.7	94.4	120	207	3w1st;7p;3p str;evned/ 2p;opening ins;kept on/ Broke out; bump st; 3w
			8.0	9	9	EVIE DOES	6>7	4620	R>R,D>T	**Bmpd;stdy1st;no factor (73)**   DROP SWITCH Made big overall move (3). *Stretch gain (.75). 1st off 31 day layoff.Class Change -33 Finished 7 from post 6 TJW= 43	ERR	0	ERR	0	74	5	60	94	153	5.00	3.80	1.33	ERR	ERR	ERR	57	51	99	73,76,77,6,69	0	31	75.0	P	3	0	8.00	164	GP	8.5	M	S>M	115	13.8	83.2	96.9	108	207	Bmpd;stdy1st;no factor/ Ins;shift6p str;ran on/ 2wd bid btw; bump 1/8
			8.0	11	11	TAKE IT	4>2	3400	R>R,T>T	**Stdy'd st;4w far;rally (70)**   Made big overall move (6). Made a big move early (3). *Stretch gain (1.75). 2 races in one pattern.Class Change 20 Finished 2 from post 4 TJW= 55	63	2	63	2	63	2	80	93	173	8.30	6.10	1.36	8.30	6.10	1.36	73	70	74	70,55,0,0,0	70	21	63.0	S	0	0	12.00	155	GP	8.5	M	M>M	104	13.1	83.2	96.3	143	217	Stdy'd st;4w far;rally/ Off slowly; trailed/
			8.0	7	7	STORM	3>3	6915	S>R,D>T	**3p;1paced 6p stretch (72)**   Chased Pace.SLR?- 12 1st off 33 day layoff.Class Change -18 Finished 3 from post 3 TJW= 53	ERR	0	ERR	0	78	2	86	76	162	5.00	3.10	1.60	ERR	ERR	ERR	86	88	72	72,84,0,0,0	0	33	78.0	P	5	0	8.00	159	GP	6.5	M	S>M	121	13.9	82.8	96.7	174	246	3p;1paced 6p stretch/ Awkward start; 4wd/
			8.0	1	1	APPLE	9>3	2700	S>R,T>T	**Pinched st;rall;5w3/16 (66)**   Made big overall move (7). Made a big move early (3.75). *Stretch gain (1.5). 2 races in one pattern.Class Change 10 Finished 3 from post 9 TJW= 62	66	1	ERR	0	66	1	70	96	166	7.50	2.50	3.00	ERR	ERR	ERR	68	69	75	66,0,0,0,0	0	20	66.0	S	1	0	4.00	133	GP	7.5	M	M>M	110	12.0	85.4	97.4	137	212	Pinched st;rall;5w3/16/ /